# Exhibit 4

(Part 1 of 2)

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page2 of 125

## Joseph Saveri Law Firm, Inc.

505 Montgomery Street Suite 625 San Francisco, CA 94111 Telephone: 415-500-6800

Fax:

5/7/2015 Invoice No. 24

#### Siddharth Hariharan

Client Number: 1010-3 Siddharth Hariharan

Matter Number: 1004-1 In re: High-Tech Employee Antitrust Litigation

For Services Rendered Through 4/30/2015.

		Fees		
<u>Date</u>	<u>Tmkpr</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
1/24/2012	JPD	Prepare for meeting re motion to dismiss hearing.	6.60	\$5,280.00
1/25/2012	JPD	Meeting with co-counsel re motion to dismiss hearing.	3.60	\$2,880.00
2/2/2012	JPD	Review request for production, outline of data.	2.10	\$1,680.00
2/2/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with co-counsel re experts.	0.60	\$480.00
2/3/2012	JPD	Preparation and telephone call with co-counsel for Meet and confer.	1.70	\$1,360.00
2/27/2012	JPD	Meeting re discovery.	3.60	\$2,880.00
3/8/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey re Steve Jobs evidence.	0.50	\$400.00
4/19/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with co-counsel re class certification.	1.00	\$800.00
4/25/2012	JPD	Preparation for and participation in meeting with co-counsel class certification meeting.	5.50	\$4,400.00
5/10/2012	JPD	Telephone conference and review e-mail re class certification.	1.20	\$960.00
5/17/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey, Eric Cramer, experts re class certification.	1.00	\$800.00
5/28/2012	JRS	Organize file; notice of appearance; conference with G. Saveri; organize document review.	6.50	\$6,240.00
5/30/2012	GS	Notice of Appearance prep	2.00	\$600.00
6/1/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/1/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with Lieff re case organization.	0.80	\$768.00
6/4/2012	GS	Copying Court Docs	0.50	\$150.00

Continued On Next Page

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page3 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 2

6/4/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/5/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/5/2012	JRS	Review file; case organization.	0.80	\$768.00
6/6/2012	JRS	Telephone calls with experts. Telephone calls with co-counsel.	2.00	\$1,920.00
6/6/2012	GS	ECF Filings	2.00	\$600.00
6/6/2012	GS	HTCC Document Review Training	2.00	\$600.00
6/6/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/6/2012	GS	ECF Filings	1.00	\$300.00
6/7/2012	JRS	Conference with co-counsel. Review status of Plaintiffs' production. Telephone call with defendants re data.	3.10	\$2,976.00
6/7/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/8/2012	JRS	Telephone calls with Hinman. Review status of production. E-mails with co-counsel re Intel production. Discovery correspondence.	2.00	\$1,920.00
6/8/2012	JRS	Case management.	0.50	\$480.00
6/8/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/11/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/12/2012	JRS	Document coding planning. Draft memorandum. Telephone conference with Hinman re privilege log. Discovery correspondence.	2.00	\$1,920.00
6/12/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/13/2012	JRS	Review and revise document review protocol. Telephone conference re Hinman. Draft e-mail to co-counsel re privilege.	1.30	\$1,248.00
6/13/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/14/2012	JRS	Case management.	1.00	\$960.00
6/14/2012	JRS	Organize discovery. Telephone call with defense counsel re privilege issues; E-mail with co-counsel re privilege issues. Organize document review.	2.40	\$2,304.00
6/14/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.25	\$75.00
6/14/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.20	\$60.00
6/14/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/14/2012	GS	Doc Review/Training Michael Fuchs	0.25	\$75.00
		Continued On Newt Page		

**Continued On Next Page** 

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page4 of 125

Client Number:

5/7/2015 1010-3 Page: 3 Matter Number: 1004-1

6/14/2012	GS	Calendaring	0.17	\$51.00
6/15/2012	JRS	Privilege issues. Telephone call with Kiernan. Review and revise coding sheet. Organize document review. Review discovery correspondence.	1.20	\$1,152.00
6/15/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/18/2012	KR	Conference call with J. Saveri, Dean Harvey and Kelly Dermody re document review strategy.	0.50	\$245.00
6/18/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/18/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with K. Rayhill.	0.50	\$480.00
6/19/2012	JRS	Draft notice of Appearance.	0.50	\$480.00
6/19/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/20/2012	KR	Confer with Dean Harvey re depositions. Begin research in preparation for depositions.	1.00	\$490.00
6/20/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/21/2012	KR	Second chair Lucas 30(b)(6) deposition.	7.00	\$3,430.00
6/21/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/22/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/24/2012	JRS	Read complaint. Review Lucasfilm 30(b)6) for pledges by witness to produce further information.	2.00	\$1,920.00
6/25/2012	KR	Draft letter for opposing counsel, David Kiernan re questions for Adobe deposition.	4.00	\$1,960.00
6/25/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.25	\$75.00
6/25/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/26/2012	KR	Prepare for intuit deposition. Print documents. Confer with co-counsel Pete Barlie and Anne Shaver re document assembly/. Second chair intuit 30(b)(6) deposition.	9.50	\$4,655.00
6/26/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/27/2012	KR	Conference call with co-counsel Dean Harvey, Kelly Dermody and others re case deadlines and strategy.	0.50	\$245.00
6/27/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
6/28/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page5 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 4

6/29/2012	KR	Review letter re extension of class certification deadline. Confer with co-counsel Dean Harvey.	1.00	\$490.00
6/29/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/2/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/2/2012	JPD	Reivew expert draft and telephone conference.	2.40	\$1,920.00
7/3/2012	KR	Phone call with co-counsel Joe Forderer re letterhead policy. Phone call with co-counsel Pete Barlie re follow-up letters for intuit and Adobe depositions. Register for ECF Northern District California; Begin drafting deposition summary for intuit deposition.	6.00	\$2,940.00
7/3/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/5/2012	KR	Reviewed Adobe & Intuit 30(b)(6) deposition transcripts.	3.00	\$1,470.00
7/6/2012	JRS	Case organization and management. Telephone calls with co-counsel.	2.00	\$1,920.00
7/6/2012	JRS	Organize discovery. Organize document review. Organize calls with defendant's.	2.90	\$2,784.00
7/6/2012	KR	Conf. call re expert report.	1.33	\$651.70
7/6/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/6/2012	JPD	Telephone conference re experts.	1.40	\$1,120.00
7/7/2012	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove; e-mails to L. Leebove re discovery.	0.90	\$864.00
7/9/2012	KR	Conference call re Palm CEO declaration.	0.50	\$245.00
7/9/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/9/2012	LJL	Conference call re scheduling order; multiple telephone calls, correspondence with J. Saveri, K. Dermody re scheduling stipulation; drafting language for scheduling stipulation.	2.70	\$1,620.00
7/9/2012	LJL	Correspondence re deposition scheduling, case management.	0.30	\$180.00
7/9/2012	LJL	Review file; review operative compliant; orders.	1.50	\$900.00
7/9/2012	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove; e-mails to L. Leebove re discovery.	0.90	\$864.00
7/10/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/10/2012	LJL	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re status, case management.	0.80	\$480.00
7/10/2012	LJL	Review court order re scheduling; correspondence with K. Dermody, J. Saveri re same.	0.10	\$60.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page6 of 125

5/7/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 5 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.80 \$768.00 7/10/2012 JRS E-mails to L. Leebove re case management and discovery. KR Draft 30(b)(6) follow-up letters to Adobe and Intuit re document 5.00 \$2,450.00 7/11/2012 production. 8.00 \$3,720.00 7/11/2012 AADocument review. \$660.00 1.10 7/11/2012 LJL Conference call. \$120.00 Review expert documents; correspond with co-counsel, J. Saveri 0.20 7/11/2012 LJL re depositions. 3.40 \$2,720.00 7/11/2012 JPD Review expert documents; telephone conference re experts. 8.00 \$3,720.00 7/12/2012 AADocument review. 0.60 \$360.00 7/12/2012 LJL Review B. Glackin's McAdams outline; review correspondence re same. 0.20 \$120.00 7/12/2012 LJL Communicate with J. Saveri, K. Rayhill re staffing issues. 0.20 \$120.00 LJL Correspond with K. Dermody, J. Saveri re depositions. 7/12/2012 0.50 \$480.00 7/12/2012 **JRS** E-mails to L. Leebove. 7/13/2012 8.00 \$3,720.00 AA Document review. \$180.00 7/13/2012 LJL Correspond with D. Harvey, K. Dermody, J. Saveri re depositions 0.30 and scheduling depositions. 0.50 \$480.00 7/13/2012 **JRS** Case management. 8.00 \$3,720.00 7/16/2012 Document review. AA 7/17/2012 8.00 \$3,720.00 AA Document review. \$120.00 7/17/2012 LJL Telephone call and correspondence with J. Dallal and Dean 0.20 Harvey re document review. Correspondence with D. Kiernan re Adobe/Vijungco. 0.10 \$60.00 7/17/2012 LJL 7/18/2012 AADocument review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 2.20 \$1,078.00 7/18/2012 JD Confer with D. Harvey, L. Leebove and I. Bagger; request and training for HTCC Relativity production database; commence reviewing documents. LJL 1.00 \$600.00 Correspond with Dean Harvey, Dan Ratner re document review 7/18/2012 issues; communicate with J. Dallal re document review. 0.80 \$480.00 7/18/2012 LJL Review Manning draft. 7/18/2012 Telephone conference with L. Leebove; organize discovery. 0.90 \$864.00 **JRS** 

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page7 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 6

7/18/2012	LJL	Correspond with D. Harvey and co-counsel re Manning assignment; correspond with D. Purcell and telephone conference with J. Saveri re depositions	1.00	\$600.00
7/19/2012	KR	Edit & revise 30(b)(6) follow-up letters to Adobe & Intuit.	1.00	\$490.00
7/19/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/19/2012	JD	Review Adobe production documents.	5.00	\$2,450.00
7/19/2012	LJL	Correspond with Kelly Dermody, J. Saveri re Lucas potential settlement overture.	0.20	\$120.00
7/19/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with L. Leebove; case management.	0.80	\$768.00
7/20/2012	KR	Edit & revise 30(b)(6) follow-up letters to Adobe & Intuit.	2.00	\$980.00
7/20/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/20/2012	JD	Review Adobe production documents.	3.00	\$1,470.00
7/21/2012	LJL	Review revised draft of Colligan declaration and propose reasons; correspond with Kelly Dermody, Dean Harvey re same.	0.40	\$240.00
7/23/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/23/2012	LJL	Telephone conference and correspondence with J. Saveri re status/strategy.	0.30	\$180.00
7/23/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with L. Leebove re discovery.	0.50	\$480.00
7/24/2012	KR	Conference call re document review, draft depo notices for defs. Vijunco & Bentley.	3.00	\$1,470.00
7/24/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/25/2012	LJL	meeting at LCHB re case status/strategy	1.00	\$600.00
7/25/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/25/2012	JPD	Review Edward Leamer draft.	2.80	\$2,240.00
7/26/2012	KR	Draft deposition notices for Apple's Mark Bentley and Adobe's Jeff Vijunco.	2.00	\$980.00
7/26/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/26/2012	JRS	E-mails with K. Rayhill.	0.80	\$768.00
7/26/2012	JRS	Prepare for Bentley and Vijungco deposition.	2.00	\$1,920.00
7/26/2012	JPD	Review Edward Leamer report; telephone conference with co-counsel; prepare outline.	6.20	\$4,960.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page8 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 7

7/27/2012	KR	Send notices for Bentley and Vijunco depositions. Confer with	1.50	\$735.00
112112012	KK	co-counsel Dean Harvey re Adobe document production.	1.50	4,55,00
7/27/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/27/2012	JPD	Prepare expert outline.	1.70	\$1,360.00
7/29/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer, Dean Harvey re class certification experts.	0.50	\$400.00
7/30/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/30/2012	JD	Research and prepare draft amended case management order per request of L. Leebove.	2.00	\$980.00
7/30/2012	JD	Review Adobe production documents.	2.00	\$980.00
7/31/2012	KR	Conference call w co-counsel.	0.50	\$245.00
7/31/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
7/31/2012	JD	Review Adobe production documents; identify and email D. Harvey re potential hot documents.	1.00	\$490.00
7/31/2012	JD	Review pleadings and cases cited and conduct online research into umbrella liability and civil conspiracy in antitrust per request and instructions of L. Leebove.	4.00	\$1,960.00
7/31/2012	JD	Review Adobe and Google production documents.	1.00	\$490.00
8/1/2012	JRS	Settlement.	1.00	\$960.00
8/1/2012	JRS	Case management; conference with L. Leebove.	0.70	\$672.00
8/1/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/1/2012	JD	Review Adobe and Google documents.	2.50	\$1,225.00
8/1/2012	JD	Review pleadings and cases cited and conduct online research into	5.00	\$2,450.00
		umbrella liability and civil conspiracy in antitrust per request and instructions of L. Leebove.		
8/2/2012	JRS	*	0.50	\$480.00
8/2/2012 8/2/2012	JRS JRS	instructions of L. Leebove.	0.50 1.00	\$480.00 \$960.00
		instructions of L. Leebove.  Case management.  Prepare for settlement call; telephone conference with Lucas		
8/2/2012	JRS	instructions of L. Leebove.  Case management.  Prepare for settlement call; telephone conference with Lucas Films.	1.00	\$960.00
8/2/2012 8/2/2012	JRS AA	instructions of L. Leebove.  Case management.  Prepare for settlement call; telephone conference with Lucas Films.  Document Review.  Attend deposition of L. McAdams; compose summary of	1.00 8.00	\$960.00 \$3,720.00
8/2/2012 8/2/2012 8/2/2012	JRS AA JD	instructions of L. Leebove.  Case management.  Prepare for settlement call; telephone conference with Lucas Films.  Document Review.  Attend deposition of L. McAdams; compose summary of testimony per request of L. Leebove.	1.00 8.00 7.50	\$960.00 \$3,720.00 \$3,675.00

# 

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 8

8/3/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/3/2012	JD	Attend deposition of J. Morris; summarize testimony per request of L. Leebove.	8.50	\$4,165.00
8/6/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence; conference with J. Dallal; case management.	1.30	\$1,248.00
8/6/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/6/2012	JD	Prepare and hand off revised amended case management order per request of L. Leebove.	1.00	\$490.00
8/6/2012	JD	Review Google production documents.	2.00	\$980.00
8/7/2012	LJL	Telephone call w/ Dean Harvey, A. Shaver, J. Dallal re depositions and documents	0.40	\$240.00
8/7/2012	LJL	Telephone calls (2) w/ D. Harvey re status, strategy, documents	0.60	\$360.00
8/7/2012	LJL	Telephone conference w/ J. Keker, D. Purcell, K. Dermody, JRS re potential settlement; follow-up TC JRS, K. Dermody re same	0.42	\$252.00
8/7/2012	JRS	Settlement.	0.50	\$480.00
8/7/2012	JRS	Schedule depositions; case management.	1.10	\$1,056.00
8/7/2012	KR	Conference call w co-counsel, analyze Adobe response to production request.	1.00	\$490.00
8/7/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/7/2012	LJL	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey re status/strategy re experts/documents.	0.40	\$240.00
8/7/2012	LJL	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey, Anne Shaver, J. Dallal, S. Schalman re depositions and documents.	0.40	\$240.00
8/8/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/8/2012	JD	Further review Intel and Pixar privilege logs and compile list of problematic entries; legal research into bases for challenging privilege log entries.	5.00	\$2,450.00
8/9/2012	KR	Analyze Intuit response to discovery requests.	0.75	\$367.50
8/9/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/9/2012	JD	Legal research into bases for challenging privilege log entries; compose letters to Intel and Pixar challenging privilege logs.	3.00	\$1,470.00
8/9/2012	JD	Review Lucasfilm production documents.	4.00	\$1,960.00
8/10/2012	JRS	Privilege log issues.	0.50	\$480.00
		Continued On Next Page		

**Continued On Next Page** 

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page10 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 9

8/10/2012	KR	Reivew & analyze Adobe & Intuit responses to discovery requests, email expert Econ One re adequacy of response,	5.00	\$2,450.00
8/10/2012	JRS	Privilege log issues.	0.50	\$480.00
8/10/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/10/2012	JD	Legal research into bases for challenging privilege log entries; revise and distribute letters to Intel and Pixar challenging privilege logs.	3.00	\$1,470.00
8/10/2012	JD	Review Lucasfilm production documents; identify and email D. Harvey re potential hot docs.	4.00	\$1,960.00
8/13/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/13/2012	JD	Document review review Lucasfilm documents; identify hot documents and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanations.	3.50	\$1,715.00
8/13/2012	JD	Confer with A. Shaver, L. Leebove and D. Clevenger; integrate edits and finalize privilege challenge letters to Intel and Pixar and circulate.	2.50	\$1,225.00
8/13/2012	JD	Confer with L. Leebove and review Teris database; confer with I. Bagger and request M. Bentley hit pulls in advance of deposition of M. Bentley.	1.00	\$490.00
8/14/2012	KR	Conference call w Dean Harvey re document review, email to Dean Harvey re response to Adobe & Intuit document production.	0.67	\$328.30
8/14/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence; review discovery responses.	1.00	\$960.00
8/14/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/14/2012	JD	Weekly doc review call.	0.50	\$245.00
8/14/2012	JD	Doc review review Intuit production documents.	4.00	\$1,960.00
8/15/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/15/2012	JD	Review document pulls sent by Teris in advance of Bentley depo; organize, upload to system and circulate.	2.50	\$1,225.00
8/15/2012	JD	Doc review review Intuit production documents.	4.00	\$1,960.00
8/16/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.60	\$576.00
8/16/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/16/2012	JD	Review Bentley documents for deposition; schedule court reporter; send print order and leave instructions for shipment of documents to J. Saveri; compose instructions to L. Leebove for locating documents on database.	7.00	\$3,430.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page11 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 10

8/16/2012 JPD Review Alan Manning draft; telephone conference with 2.70 \$2,160.00 co-counsel. 0.80 \$392.00 8/16/2012 JD Request DOJ findings per request of J. Saveri. 8.00 8/17/2012 \$3,720.00 AADocument Review. 8/17/2012 JD Attend and observe deposition of A. Geshuri; prepare summary 10.30 \$5,047.00 memo per request of J. Saveri. 0.30 \$180.00 8/17/2012 LJL Correspond with Eric Cramer and Kelly Dermody re damages analysis. \$60.00 0.10 8/17/2012 LJL Review and correspond with J. Dallal re Geshuri deposition. \$1,760.00 8/17/2012 JPD Review Alan Manning report; telephone conference re expert 2.20 report with Eric Cramer, et al. 8/19/2012 JPD Telephone conference with Eric Cramer, Dean Harvey re experts. 0.90 \$720.00 3.50 \$3,360.00 8/20/2012 **JRS** Prepare for Bentley deposition. 8.00 \$3,720.00 8/20/2012 AA Document Review. 8/20/2012 Review Bentley deposition document pulls to identify potential 8.50 \$4,165.00 JD exhibits and prepare outline; confer with D. Clevenger and FedEx re missing shipment per request of J. Saveri; answer J. Saveri email questions. 0.20 \$120.00 8/20/2012 LJL Correspond with Dan Purcell, Kelly Dermody, J. Saveri re call re Lucas. 8/20/2012 LJL Conference with J. Dallal re additional Bentley documents. 0.20 \$120.00 8/21/2012 LJL Correspondence w/ E.Cramer re Morris deposition 0.05 \$30.00 8/21/2012 **JRS** Settlement issues. 0.70 \$672.00 8/21/2012 **JRS** Prepare for Bentley deposition. 6.50 \$6,240.00 8/21/2012 AADocument Review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 8/21/2012 JD Compose depo outline for deposition of M. Bentley and identify 10.50 \$5,145.00 potential depo exhibits per requests of J. Saveri; send out depo exhibit print order; check exhibit list against prior exhibits on Kramm website. Correspond with Kelly Dermody, J. Saveri re status; telephone 8/21/2012 LJL 0.40 \$240.00 conference with Kelly Dermody, Dan Purcell re Lucas. 0.30 \$180.00 8/21/2012 LJL Conference with J. Dallal re scheduling, deposition preparation,

#### Continued On Next Page

2.33

\$1,398.00

Bentley, Adobe.

Review Donna Morris transcript.

8/22/2012

LJL

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page12 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 11

8/22/2012	JRS	Prepare for Bentley deposition; conference with J. Dallal; discovery correspondence.	10.30	\$9,888.00
8/22/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/22/2012	JD	Finalize potential Bentley deposition exhibits; confer w/J. Saveri re depo narrative/outline/strategy; answer questions re potential exhibits; identify, review & circulate S. Jobs documents.	9.00	\$4,410.00
8/23/2012	LJL	Multiple correspondence. & phone calls w/ K. Dermody, J. Saveri re Lucasfilm; call w/ K. Dermody, D. Purcell re same.	1.00	\$600.00
8/23/2012	JRS	Settlement issues; conference with Levine.	0.60	\$576.00
8/23/2012	JRS	Prepare for and take Bentley deposition.	12.70	\$12,192.00
8/23/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/23/2012	JD	Confer w/I. Bagger and request D. Lambert and T. Cook custodian documents; request login for L. Leebove; place order for J. Vijungo Hot documents.	0.50	\$245.00
8/23/2012	JD	Assist J. Saveri at deposition of M. Bentley.	11.00	\$5,390.00
8/23/2012	JPD	Review expert report; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.90	\$1,520.00
8/23/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with expert re class certification.	0.60	\$480.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Review J. Dallal correspondence to C. Brown and correspond with J. Dallal re same.	0.17	\$102.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Correspond with D. Clevenger re scheduling Vijungco deposition	0.08	\$48.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Conference call w/ co-counsel and experts; follow-up comm w/ JRS.	1.25	\$750.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Review/analyze draft Leamer declaration; multiple correspondence with co-counsel, Joseph Saveri re same.	2.08	\$1,248.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Review Bentley rough transcript.	1.58	\$948.00
8/24/2012	LJL	Review early draft class certification brief from Lieff Cabraser, et al; communicate with J. Saveri re briefing assignment; correspond with D. Harvey re same.	0.67	\$402.00
8/24/2012	JRS	Review memorandum re Lucas Films; settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
8/24/2012	JRS	Schedule Vijungco; telephone conference with L. Leebove.	0.90	\$864.00
8/24/2012	JRS	Class certification issues; conference with expert; telephone conference with B. Glackin re Econ One bill.	4.80	\$4,608.00
8/24/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page13 of 125

5/7/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 12 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$490.00 8/24/2012 JD Training on Teris HTCC Relativity database to expedite searches 1.00 and depo pull requests. \$2,695.00 5.50 8/24/2012 JD Review Lucasfilm insurance agreement produced with responses to Rule 26 disclosure requests; compose detailed memorandum to J. Saveri and L. Leebove re applicability and effect of policy. JD Confer with L. Leebove and D. Clevenger, check firm calendar, 0.80 \$392.00 8/24/2012 and compose email to O/C C. Brown to request depo dates for D. Lambert. 8/25/2012 **JRS** Settlement issues. 0.80 \$768.00 8/26/2012 LJL Correspond with D. Harvey re Tuesday conference call. 0.05 \$30.00 0.60 \$576.00 8/26/2012 **JRS** Review subpoena; settlement issues. 0.08 \$48.00 8/27/2012 LJL Correspond with B.Glackin, J. Saveri re case management, cost-sharing. 0.08 \$48.00 8/27/2012 LJL Correspond with J. Saveri re class cert briefing project. \$1,536.00 8/27/2012 **JRS** Review and revise CMC statement; telephone conference with L. 1.60 Leebove. 1.80 \$1,728.00 8/27/2012 **JRS** Prepare for Lambert. 8.00 \$3,720.00 8/27/2012 AA Document Review. 3.00 \$1,470.00 8/27/2012 JD Complete detailed memorandum on impact and applicability of Lucasfilm insurance policy per request of L. Leebove. \$1,225.00 8/27/2012 JD Review deposition schedule; review class rep backgrounds and 2.50 filings; request confirmation from LCHB on depo schedule status. 0.08 \$48.00 8/28/2012 LJL Correspondence with J. Saveri re D. Purcell/Lucas. 8/28/2012 LJL Review ECFs and calendaring. 0.17 \$102.00 0.25 \$150.00 8/28/2012 LJL Telephone call and correspondence with J. Forderer re dividing class certification briefing. Telephone call and correspondence with D. Kiernan re deposition 0.17 \$102.00 8/28/2012 LJL scheduling. 0.17 \$102.00 8/28/2012 LJL Correspondence with J. Saveri, J. Dallal re Lambert subpoena. 0.08 \$48.00 8/28/2012 LJL Correspondence with J. Saveri re class certification assignment. 0.30 \$288.00 8/28/2012 **JRS** Review filings. **JRS** Case management; prepare for Lambert. 2.50 \$2,400.00 8/28/2012 8/28/2012 **JRS** Review expert report. 1.00 \$960.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page14 of 125

5/7/2015

Page: 13

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

8/28/2012 AA 8.00 Document Review. \$3,720.00 8/28/2012 JD Review, organize, upload and circulate T. Cook and D. Lambert 7.50 \$3,675.00 custodian documents; confer with O/C Brown re dates for D. Lambert deposition; confer w/L. Leebove; compose letter to C. Brown requesting deposition dates; online search for D. Lambert; consult with Lexis re people search functionality. JD 8/28/2012 Review Intel and Pixar privilege logs and identify deficiencies and 1.50 \$735.00 possible avenues for challenge. 8/28/2012 JPD Edits to Edward Leamer draft. 4.60 \$3,680.00 8/29/2012 LJL Correpondence/communication with J. Saveri, B. Glackin re order 2.08 \$1,248.00 to show cause hearing in tag-along case; review docket, file; call J. Garay with J. Saveri, correspondence with J. Garay; phone call with J. Garay and follow-up communication with B. Glackin, J. Saveri re same. 8/29/2012 LJL Correpondence with D. Harvey re class certification briefing; 3.08 \$1,848.00 preliminary research. 8/29/2012 LJL Review redlined Leamer report; multiple correspondence among 2.08 \$1,248.00 co-counsel re same and re expert strategy. 8/29/2012 LJL Correpsondence/ communication with J. Dallal, J. Saveri re case 0.25 \$150.00 management conference statement project. 8/29/2012 LJL Correspondence D. Purcell, J. Saveri re Lucas discussions. 0.17 \$102.00 8/29/2012 **JRS** Expert issues; telephone conference with L. Leebove re case 1.00 \$960.00 management conference. 8/29/2012 **JRS** Settlement telephone conference with Pixar; telephone conference 1.00 \$960.00 with B. Glackin; schedule depositions. 8/29/2012 AADocument Review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 8/29/2012 JD Prepare draft subpoena to D. Lambert. 2.50 \$1,225.00 8/29/2012 JD Collect, review, organize and upload past CMC statements, draft 5.00 \$2,450.00 statements, scheduling orders and discovery orders; create CMC draft shell; confer with L. Leebove and D. Harvey and make plans for coordinating CMC statement preparation per request of B. Glackin. 8/29/2012 LJL Review expert drafts/revisions/memoranda from co-counsel; 120.00 \$72,000.00 communications with co-counsel re same. 8/30/2012 LJL Multiple correspondence with co-counsel, J. Dallal re Google 0.40 \$240.00 documents and documents relating to 10%. 8/30/2012 LJL Correspondence with D. Harvey, D. Ratner re Lucas document. 0.17 \$102.00

Continued On Next Page

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page15 of 125

5/7/2015

Page: 14

Client Number: 1010-3
Matter Number: 1004-1

8/30/2012	LJL	Correspondence with D. Harvey re CMC statement and conferences with J. Dallal re same; review J. Dallal draft and comment.	0.83	\$498.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Correspondence with J. Saveri re Pixar.	0.08	\$48.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Communication with J. Saveri re case management conference statement; call with M. Tubach re defendants' suggestion not to do a statement / have a conference; correspondence with co-counsel re same.	1.25	\$750.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Legal research re class certification.	4.00	\$2,400.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Correpondence with J. Davis, D. Harvey re expert meeting.	0.08	\$48.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Review/analyze expert drafts; communication with co-counsel re same and re documents, etc.	2.50	\$1,500.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Correpondence with D. Harvey, B. Glackin, J. Saveri re hearing canceled on Santiago OSC.	0.17	\$102.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Review/comments re Lambert subpoena, communication with J. Dallal and J. Saveri re same.	0.33	\$198.00
8/30/2012	LJL	Work on case management conference. statement, meet with J. Dallal re same; correspond with J. Saveri, J. Dallal re same.	0.42	\$252.00
8/30/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
8/30/2012	JD	Review correspondence and send follow-up emails to O/C C. Brown re depo date for D. Lambert and O/C D. Purcell re depo date for S. Coker.	0.80	\$392.00
8/30/2012	JD	Search correspondence, compile depo transcripts and confer w/D. Harvey to find status of outstanding request to Apple for production of Avature data.	0.80	\$392.00
8/30/2012	JD	Review Google documents and search online to locate Big Bang announcement and related data per requests of D. Harvey.	0.50	\$245.00
8/30/2012	JD	Call O/C C. Brown to establish schedule for exchange of CMC drafts; research Avature and trial date situations, supplement CMC draft, and circulate to team.	4.50	\$2,205.00
8/30/2012	JPD	Review Edward Leamer redline, etc.	1.80	\$1,440.00
8/31/2012	LJL	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Davis, B. Glackin, E. Leamer, P. Johnson re expert analysis.	5.30	\$3,180.00
8/31/2012	JRS	Expert issues.	1.60	\$1,536.00
8/31/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

# 

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 15

8/31/2012	JD	Incorporate edits from various team members into CMC draft and recirculate in rounds; edit for content & clarity; correspond with C. Brown re schedule for exchange of drafts.	6.00	\$2,940.00
8/31/2012	JPD	Meeting with co-counsel re class certification at Lieff Cabraser, et al.	6.10	\$4,880.00
9/2/2012	LJL	Review correspondence from E. Leamer; correspondence with co-counsel re same.	0.10	\$60.00
9/2/2012	JPD	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer re class certification.	0.50	\$400.00
9/3/2012	LJL	Correpsondence with E.Cramer, co-counsel re Rail Freight, review/analyze Rail Freight.	1.00	\$600.00
9/3/2012	JD	Review and respond to team correspondence re preparation of CMC statement and strategy for handling CMC.	0.50	\$245.00
9/3/2012	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.60	\$576.00
9/3/2012	JRS	Expert issues.	0.50	\$480.00
9/4/2012	LJL	Review hot documents from Z. Caplan, D. Ratner.	0.17	\$102.00
9/4/2012	LJL	Correspondence re revisions to CMC statement.	0.17	\$102.00
9/4/2012	LJL	Conference call re class definition issues.	0.92	\$552.00
9/4/2012	LJL	Review latest draft report from P. Johnson.	1.42	\$852.00
9/4/2012	LJL	Work on CMC statement; correpondence/conferences with co-counsel, J. Saveri, J. Dallal re same.	1.00	\$600.00
9/4/2012	KR	Conference call re document review.	0.08	\$39.20
9/4/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/4/2012	JD	Edit CMC draft for content & clarity; incorporate and integrate changes requested by various team members; review history of depositions; prepare language requesting new trial date; correspond w/O/C C. Brown re exchange of drafts; submit draft.	8.00	\$3,920.00
9/4/2012	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.80	\$768.00
9/4/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
9/4/2012	JRS	Settlement issues.	1.00	\$960.00
9/5/2012	LJL	Review draft class cert brief from D. Harvey.	0.25	\$150.00
9/5/2012	LJL	Correpsondence with co-counsel re class certification page limitations, strategy.	0.17	\$102.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page17 of 125

5/7/2015

**Client Number:** 

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 16 Matter Number: 0.25 \$150.00 Correspondence with co-counsel, J. Saveri re Lucas call; call with 9/5/2012 LJL D. Purcell re Lucas. \$1,500.00 2.50 9/5/2012 LJL Multiple conferences/correspondence with J. Dallal, D. Harvey, J. Saveri and drafting/revisions to case management conference statement and coordinating same. 2.00 \$980.00 9/5/2012 KR Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/5/2012 AA Document Review. 12.00 \$5,880.00 Edit CMC draft for content & clarity; incorporate and integrate 9/5/2012 JD changes requested by various team members; review history of depositions; correspond w/D. Harvey and O/C C. Brown re exchange of drafts; negotiate last-minute changes and additions; file final CMC in NDCAL via ECF. \$960.00 1.00 9/5/2012 **JRS** Review and revise case management conference statement. \$576.00 0.60 9/5/2012 **JRS** Expert call. 0.30 \$288.00 9/5/2012 **JRS** Settlement issues. 0.50 \$480.00 9/5/2012 **JRS** Expert issues. \$1,760.00 9/5/2012 Review expert report re class certification; comments to J. Saveri. 2.20 JPD Correspondence with co-counsel re Big Bang documents and letter 0.17 \$102.00 9/6/2012 LJL to Google re same. Correspondence with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re class representative 0.10 \$60.00 9/6/2012 LJL declarations. 2.00 \$1,200.00 Review multiple drafts/revisions to expert reports and 9/6/2012 LJL corresondence re same; phone call re same. \$78.00 9/6/2012 LJL Review hot documents from A. Andreoli, D. Ratner. 0.13 \$450.00 0.75 9/6/2012 LJL Review E. Cramer comments to Leamer report, correspondence re same. 9/6/2012 LJL Review J.Davis comments to Leamer report, correspondence re 1.08 \$648.00 report, strategy. Correpsondence with E.Cramer re class certification 0.33 \$198.00 9/6/2012 LJL briefing/issues \$360.00 0.60 Phone call with Linda Nussbaum re Big Bang documents and 9/6/2012 LJL correspondence from P. Barile and with co-counsel re same. 4.17 \$2,043.30 9/6/2012 KR Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/6/2012 AA Document Review.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page18 of 125

5/7/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 17 1004-1 Matter Number: \$98.00 0.20 Call/email C. Brown re scheduling deposition of D. Lambert. 9/6/2012 JD \$98.00 9/6/2012 Call/email O/C C. Brown re delivery of hard courtesy copy of 0.20 JD CMC to Court. \$245.00 0.50 Review letter re privilege log issues from O/C F. Busch and 9/6/2012 JD circulate to team. Collect and send key Apple documents per request of D. Harvey. 0.40 \$196.00 JD 9/6/2012 \$2,842.00 Doc review -- review Intel production documents; identify hot 5.80 9/6/2012 JD docs and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanation. 0.30 \$180.00 Communications with J. Dallal, D. Harvey re finalizing/filing joint 9/6/2012 LJL case management conference statement. communications w/ J. Dallal, D. Harvey re finalizing/filing joint 0.18 \$108.00 9/6/2012 LJL case mgt. conf. statement \$1,920.00 9/6/2012 **JRS** Prepare for case management conference; review and revise case 2.00 management conference statement. 3.50 \$3,360.00 9/6/2012 **JRS** Review class certification papers. \$672.00 0.70 Review and revise discovery correspondence. 9/6/2012 **JRS** \$1,360.00 1.70 9/6/2012 JPD Review expert report; comments. 1.60 \$1,280.00 JPD Edits to L. Leebove draft class certification brief. 9/6/2012 \$600.00 Multiple correspondence with D. Harvey, co-counsel re Google 1.00 9/7/2012 LJL production issues and class certification facts. 0.10 \$60.00 9/7/2012 Review hot documents from D. Ratner. LJL 0.25 \$150.00 9/7/2012 LJL Review supplemental interrogatory responses and correspondence/redline from E. Cramer re same. \$60.00 Correspondence with D. Harvey re Colligan declaration, review 0.10 9/7/2012 LJL 0.10 \$60.00 9/7/2012 LJL Phone call with K. Dermody re staffing class representation declarations. Phone conference with G. Saveri and D. Harvey re class 0.20 \$120.00 9/7/2012 LJL representation declarations. 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/7/2012 AA Document Review. 4.20 \$2,058.00 JD Doc review -- review Intel production documents; identify hot 9/7/2012 docs and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanation. \$441.00 Review Intel privilege claims, confer with and compose email re 0.90 9/7/2012 JD privilege log dispute to S. Shah.

# 

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 18

9/7/2012	JD	Review hot documents and deposition exhibits and set up shell for Master Deponent Spreadsheet per request of J. Saveri.	2.80	\$1,372.00
9/7/2012	JRS	Prepare for case management conference.	0.80	\$768.00
9/7/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.60	\$576.00
9/7/2012	JRS	Review Colligan declaration.	0.50	\$480.00
9/10/2012	LJL	Review/consider memo from E. Cramer re expert report, review current draft of report.	2.25	\$1,350.00
9/10/2012	LJL	Correspondence with J. Saveri re staffing class representation declarations.	0.10	\$60.00
9/10/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/10/2012	JD	Confer with D. Harvey, review privilege log correspondence, and place calls to F. Busch and S. Shah.	0.70	\$343.00
9/10/2012	JD	Collect and forward privilege log review letters to J. Forderer.	0.20	\$98.00
9/10/2012	JD	Document review; review Intel production documents; identify hot docs and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanation.	4.00	\$1,960.00
9/10/2012	JRS	Prepare for case management conference.	2.00	\$1,920.00
9/10/2012	JRS	Discovery issues.	1.50	\$1,440.00
9/11/2012	LJL	Work on class certification brief; correspondence with co-counsel re same.	0.92	\$552.00
9/11/2012	LJL	Multiple correpsondence with co-counsel re CMC statement.	0.30	\$180.00
9/11/2012	LJL	Revise predominance section based on new Leamer draft; correspondence with B. Glackin re same, and with J. Saveri, J. Davis re same.	4.00	\$2,400.00
9/11/2012	LJL	Review draft class representation declarations from D. Harvey and correspondence re same.	0.13	\$78.00
9/11/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/11/2012	JD	Document review; review Intel production documents; identify hot documentss and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanation.	3.50	\$1,715.00
9/11/2012	JRS	Prepare for case management conference.	2.80	\$2,688.00
9/11/2012	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.80	\$3,648.00
9/11/2012	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. Davis, re Order of Proof; conference call w/ J. Dallal, J. Davis, re same.	1.00	\$600.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page20 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 19 Matter Number: 1004-1 4.20 \$3,360.00 Review Edward Leamer report; telephone conference with 9/11/2012 JPD co-counsel. 5.00 \$3,000.00 9/12/2012 LJL Travel to San Jose for case management conference; meet with J. Saveri, K. Dermody, B. Glackin, D. Harvey prior to conference; meetings with opposing counsel re case management conference; return travel. Document Review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/12/2012 AA \$1,960.00 9/12/2012 JD Document review; review Intel production documents; identify hot 4.00 documentss and print and forward to D. Harvey with explanation. \$1,470.00 Review case management and scheduling orders, docket in TiO2 3.00 9/12/2012 JD litigation, firm calendar, and applicable statutory and court rules to identify available alternative trial dates to suggest at CMC per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and L. Leebove. 7.00 \$6,720.00 9/12/2012 **JRS** Prepare for case management conference; case management conference. \$960.00 1.00 9/12/2012 Prepare for depositions. **JRS** 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/13/2012 AADocument Review. \$735.00 1.50 9/13/2012 Review all calendar dates, eliminate erroneous dates, update JD deposition dates and confer w/D. Clevenger re discrepancies per request of J. Saveri. Case team conference w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re litigation 2.00 \$980.00 9/13/2012 JD strategy, calendaring, and outstanding discovery issues. 2.00 \$980.00 9/13/2012 JD Review discovery correspondence and summaries by D. Harvey and D. Ratner, confer with D. Harvey, compile documents and compose detailed email to O/C F. Busch re Intel document production issues. \$768.00 Discovery issues; prepare for discovery. 0.80 9/13/2012 **JRS** 0.80 \$768.00 9/13/2012 **JRS** Case management. 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/14/2012 Document Review. AA 1.50 \$735.00 9/14/2012 Confer with D. Harvey, A. Shaver and J. Alpert and review case JD law submitted by J. Alpert re discovery of communications of executives serving as directors at other companies. 1.50 \$735.00 9/14/2012 JD Online research regarding compensation consultancy FWCook and review of references thereto by M. Bentley per request of J. Saveri.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page21 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 20

Matter Number: 1004-1 0.60 \$294.00 Call and email D. Purcell re deposition date for S. Coker; call and 9/14/2012 JD email O/C C. Brown and confer with D. Clevenger to fix deposition date for D. Lambert. 9/14/2012 JD Review hot documents, deposition exhibits and deposition 3.70 \$1,813.00 transcripts to revise, update and expand Master Deponent List. Discovery issues; conference with L. Leebove. 0.50 \$480.00 9/14/2012 **JRS** 0.80 \$768.00 **JRS** 9/14/2012 Settlement issues. Review/revise Plaintiff's supplemental discovery responses; 0.67 \$402.00 9/17/2012 LJL correspondence with J. Saveri, A. Shaver re same. \$1,536.00 9/17/2012 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 1.60 Review and revise class certification brief. 0.80 \$768.00 9/17/2012 **JRS** 8.00 \$3,720.00 9/17/2012 AA Document Review. \$1,470.00 9/17/2012 JD Review discovery record, review case law, and review summaries 3.00 provided by D. Harvey, D. Ratner and J. Alpert and compose draft letter to F. Hinman summarizing various outstanding Intel production and privilege log issues; edit draft letter and circulate. 0.50 \$245.00 9/17/2012 JD Confer with J. Saveri and send various inquiries re status of discovery requests and case information to D. Harvey. 1.50 \$735.00 9/17/2012 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 1.40 \$686.00 Revise, update, and circulate proposed final draft of subpoena of 9/17/2012 JD D. Lambert. \$102.00 0.17 Correpsondence re conference call re Leamer. 9/18/2012 LJL 9/18/2012 **JRS** 3.70 \$3,552.00 Prepare for deposition. \$3,720.00 8.00 9/18/2012 AADocument Review. 4.50 \$2,205.00 9/18/2012 Doc review -- review Intel production documents; confer w/I. JD Bagger at Teris re saved searches functionality. Begin review of documents for D. Lambert deposition. 2.00 \$980.00 9/18/2012 JD Revise draft discovery letter to F. Hinman per suggestions of A. 0.50 \$245.00 9/18/2012 JD Shaver and circulate revised draft. 0.25 \$150.00 9/19/2012 LJL Discussion/correspondence with J. Saveri and correspondence with K. Dermody, J. Saveri re Lucas. 0.10 \$60.00 9/19/2012 LJL Telephone conference with K. Dermody, J. Saveri, D. Purcell re Lucas. 0.90 \$864.00 **JRS** Case management; telephone conference with B. Glackin. 9/19/2012

Continued On Next Page

# 

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 21

9/19/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/19/2012	JD	Draft, edit and file Notice of Appearance on NDCAL ECF system.	1.00	\$490.00
9/19/2012	JD	Pick up hard drive of case information and documents from LCHB and commence uploading and organizing files on JSLF system.	3.00	\$1,470.00
9/19/2012	JD	Review comments of J. Alpert and P. Barile and incorporate suggestions into draft discovery dispute letter; edit and finalize letter and send to O/C F. Hinman.	1.20	\$588.00
9/19/2012	JD	Review D. Morris materials and exhibits and compose email inquiry to E. Cramer in preparation for deposition of J. Vijungco.	1.50	\$735.00
9/20/2012	LJL	Correspondence with D. Kiernan re rescheduling Vijungco deposition / late production of documents and with J. Dallal re same.	0.42	\$252.00
9/20/2012	JRS	Review expert reports; expert issues.	0.90	\$864.00
9/20/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	5.20	\$4,992.00
9/20/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/20/2012	JD	Revise, update, and circulate further proposed final draft of subpoena of D. Lambert.	0.50	\$245.00
9/20/2012	JD	Call w/O/C D. Kiernan and confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re late last-minute production by Adobe; compose letters to D. Kiernan to memorialize conversation and postpone J. Vijungco deposition.	2.00	\$980.00
9/20/2012	JD	Compile and review J. Vijungco and Adobe documents and documents sent by S. Schalman-Bergen in preparation for deposition of J. Vijungco.	2.50	\$1,225.00
9/20/2012	JD	Compile, organize and review documents for use as potential exhibits in deposition of D. Lambert.	2.00	\$980.00
9/20/2012	JPD	Review materials; telephone conference re class certification.	4.10	\$3,280.00
9/21/2012	LJL	Conference with J. Saveri re status/strategy.	0.30	\$180.00
9/21/2012	LJL	Review Donna Morris deposition transcript; correspondence with J. Saveri, J. Dallal re same.	0.33	\$198.00
9/21/2012	LJL	Calendaring	0.17	\$102.00
9/21/2012	JRS	Review expert materials.	0.50	\$480.00
9/21/2012	JRS	Prepare for Jeff Vijnungco deposition; conference with J. Dallal.	2.70	\$2,592.00
9/21/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page23 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 22

9/21/2012	JD	Compile, organize and review documents for use as potential exhibits in deposition of D. Lambert; batch export of D. Lambert hot documents and all documents with D. Lambert as source; place order with CopyMat for print set of selected documents.	4.00	\$1,960.00
9/21/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re case strategy, assignments and discovery progress.	0.80	\$392.00
9/21/2012	JD	Review High-Level Hot Docs and revise, update and expand Master Deponent List per request of J. Saveri.	1.70	\$833.00
9/21/2012	JD	Call O/C D. Kiernan to postpone deposition of J. Vijungco; confer further re response and revise draft letters per requests of J. Saveri.	1.20	\$588.00
9/22/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	2.10	\$2,016.00
9/22/2012	JRS	Review expert reports.	2.00	\$1,920.00
9/23/2012	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.50	\$3,360.00
9/23/2012	JRS	Review and revise class certification papers.	1.00	\$960.00
9/24/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition; settlement.	0.80	\$768.00
9/24/2012	JRS	Review and revise class certification brief.	3.10	\$2,976.00
9/24/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/24/2012	JD	Review letter re and destroy snapback documents and files per request of D. Kiernan.	0.50	\$245.00
9/24/2012	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	2.00	\$980.00
9/24/2012	JD	Organize and integrate additional discovery and correspondence files from LCHB drive into JSLF shared drive case file.	2.00	\$980.00
9/24/2012	JD	Review, update and finalize first version of Master Deponent List spreadsheet per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and circulate to team members.	2.50	\$1,225.00
9/25/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	3.80	\$3,648.00
9/25/2012	JRS	Review and revise class certification papers.	1.10	\$1,056.00
9/25/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/25/2012	JD	Doc review - review Intel production documents.	3.00	\$1,470.00
9/25/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re case strategy, assignments and discovery progress.	0.60	\$294.00
9/25/2012	JD	Team conference call re selection of deponents and sending of notices.	0.70	\$343.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page24 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

9/25/2012	JPD	Review damage numbers re class certification and telephone conference with J. Saveri.	2.20	\$1,760.00
9/26/2012	LJL	Correspondence with E. Evans, A. Shaver, K. Dermody re Google production issues.	0.50	\$300.00
9/26/2012	LJL	Correspondence with J.Saveri re proposed order on class certification.	0.08	\$48.00
9/26/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	3.00	\$2,880.00
9/26/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
9/26/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/26/2012	JD	Compose and edit deposition request letters to O/C F. Hinman and C. Zeng.	1.20	\$588.00
9/26/2012	JD	Finalize and send D. Lambert subpoena to O/C; order court reporter; review M. Bentley deposition exhibits and S. Jobs documents; review D. Lambert documents in preparation for deposition.	6.00	\$2,940.00
9/27/2012	GS	ECF Filing.	0.50	\$150.00
9/27/2012	LJL	Telephone conference with L. Rubin, K. Dermody re Google document/discovery issues.	0.50	\$300.00
9/27/2012	LJL	Review/revise letter to L. Rubin; correspondence with A. Shaver, K. Dermody re same.	0.30	\$180.00
9/27/2012	LJL	Review/revise class certification brief; correspondence with B. Glackin re same; review new draft of expert report and correspondence re same.	4.42	\$2,652.00
9/27/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	1.00	\$960.00
9/27/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/27/2012	JD	Edit, finalize and send deposition request letters to O/C F. Hinman and C. Zeng.	0.80	\$392.00
9/27/2012	JD	Further review of D. Lambert documents in preparation for deposition; compile and organize on system and prepare for review by J. Saveri.	6.50	\$3,185.00
9/28/2012	GS	ECF Filing	0.50	\$150.00
9/28/2012	LJL	Review correspondence from L. Rubin re Google.	0.08	\$48.00
9/28/2012	LJL	Review/comment on revised class certification brief.	0.75	\$450.00
9/28/2012	LJL	Correspondence with co-counsel re expert report; analysis re same.	1.17	\$702.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page25 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

9/28/2012	LJL	Review document from J. Zaul.	0.08	\$48.00
9/28/2012	LJL	Review revised draft expert reports redline from E. Cramer, K. Dermody; correspondence re same.	2.58	\$1,548.00
9/28/2012	LJL	Review documents from D. Ratner.	0.10	\$60.00
9/28/2012	JRS	Prepare for D. Lambert deposition; conference with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$960.00
9/28/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
9/28/2012	JD	Review correspondence re outstanding discovery/privilege issues from O/C F. Busch and L. Kahn.	0.50	\$245.00
9/28/2012	JD	Prepare, edit and submit 4th Amended Notice of Deposition of J. Vijungco.	0.50	\$245.00
9/28/2012	JD	Review D. Lambert documents in preparation for deposition; confer w/J. Saveri and place order w/CopyMat for potential depo exhibit copies.	8.50	\$4,165.00
9/29/2012	LJL	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Lucas issues; correspondence with J. Saveri, K. Dermody re same; conference call with co-counsel.	1.50	\$900.00
9/29/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.50	\$480.00
9/29/2012	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	1.00	\$960.00
9/29/2012	JRS	Settlement.	1.00	\$960.00
9/29/2012	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	1.50	\$1,440.00
9/30/2012	LJL	Draft MOU for Lucas; communication with J. Saveri re same.	1.00	\$600.00
9/30/2012	LJL	Review and redline proposed order; correspondence with J. Forderer re same.	0.92	\$552.00
9/30/2012	JRS	Prepare for depositons.	7.00	\$6,720.00
9/30/2012	JRS	Settlement.	1.00	\$960.00
10/1/2012	GS	ECF Filing	1.00	\$300.00
10/1/2012	LJL	Correpsondence with J. Dallal, J. Saveri re Pixar document to show to Lambert.	0.10	\$60.00
10/1/2012	LJL	Review final class certification brief and correspondence with co-lead counsel re same.	1.58	\$948.00
10/1/2012	LJL	Multiple correspondence with B. Glackin, K. Dermody re proposed order; phone conference re same.	0.60	\$360.00
10/1/2012	LJL	Communication with K. Dermody, J. Saveri re Lucas.	0.17	\$102.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page26 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

10/1/2012	JRS	Deposition preparation.	12.00	\$11,520.00
10/1/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/1/2012	JD	Review and organize D. Lambert documents in preparation for deposition; find additional exhibits requested by J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri re strategy; finalize exhibits; finalize travel arrangements.	9.00	\$4,410.00
10/1/2012	JRS	Review brief.	0.60	\$576.00
10/2/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.25	\$75.00
10/2/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00
10/2/2012	JRS	Lambert deposition.	14.50	\$13,920.00
10/2/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/2/2012	JD	Assist J. Saveri at deposition of D. Lambert.	11.00	\$5,390.00
10/3/2012	LJL	Preparation for privilege log call; conference call with J. Dallal, K. Dermody, A. Shaver re privilege log issues, discovery management.	1.17	\$702.00
10/3/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/3/2012	JD	Review and compile all operative priv logs and priv log correspondence and forward to team; priv log dispute status conference call.	2.30	\$1,127.00
10/3/2012	JD	Request print set of entire J. Vijungco and Adobe hot doc hits; review J. Vijungco documents; compile selected documents and exhibits and transcripts from D. Morris deposition for J. Saveri in advance of J. Vijungco deposition; review entire supplemental Adobe production and print selected documents for review by J. Saveri.	10.00	\$4,900.00
10/4/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00
10/4/2012	LJL	Correspondence with J. Saveri, A. Shaver re Colligan declaration,	0.08	\$48.00
10/4/2012	LJL	Conference call re deposition defense brainstorming; prep for same.	1.00	\$600.00
10/4/2012	JRS	Prepare for J. Vijungco deposition; conference with J. Dallal.	12.30	\$11,808.00
10/4/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page27 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

10/4/2012	JD	Compile and organize potential depo exhibit printouts, prepare labels and index and direct G. Saveri in assembling exhibit folders; supplement set with additional documents requested by J. Saveri; compose, finalize and send letter from J. Saveri to D. Kiernan re errors in production; schedule and confirm court reporter.	10.50	\$5,145.00
10/5/2012	GS	ECF Filing	1.00	\$300.00
10/5/2012	GS	Scanning Project	3.00	\$900.00
10/5/2012	GS	Deposition Document Preparation.	5.00	\$1,500.00
10/5/2012	JRS	Prepare for J. Vijungco deposition; take J. Vijungco deposition.	14.50	\$13,920.00
10/5/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/5/2012	JD	Assist J. Saveri at deposition of J. Vijungco.	12.00	\$5,880.00
10/5/2012	JRS	Expert materials.	0.30	\$288.00
10/7/2012	GS	Prepared Depo Exhibits Binders	7.50	\$2,250.00
10/8/2012	GS	ECF Filing/Scanning	1.00	\$300.00
10/8/2012	GS	Scanning Project	3.00	\$900.00
10/8/2012	JRS	Schedule Lucas deposition	0.25	\$240.00
10/8/2012	JRS	Schedule Leemer	0.50	\$480.00
10/8/2012	JRS	Deposition Scheduling; Conference with Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
10/8/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/8/2012	JD	Collect and organize deposition exhibits and create master deposition exhibit spreadsheet.	3.00	\$1,470.00
10/8/2012	JD	Confer w/A. Shaver and J. Saveri re deposition schedule and specific dates for S. Coker.	0.70	\$343.00
10/8/2012	JD	Email D. Purcell to request final dates for S. Coker deposition.	0.20	\$98.00
10/8/2012	JD	Compose memorandum summarizing main points of J. Vijungco deposition.	2.50	\$1,225.00
10/8/2012	GS	Prepared Depo Exhibits Binders	5.00	\$1,500.00
10/9/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00
10/9/2012	LJL	Review/analyze deposition defense outline, correspond with co-counsel re same.	0.92	\$552.00
10/9/2012	LJL	Telephone call with D. Harvey re Leamer deposition scheduling; correspond/phone conference with J. Saveri re same.	0.25	\$150.00

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page28 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 27

10/9/2012	LJL	Conference call re document review.	0.40	\$240.00
10/9/2012	JRS	Case management. Discovery planning	0.83	\$796.80
10/9/2012	JRS	Prepare for Coker deposition. Conference with Dallal	2.00	\$1,920.00
10/9/2012	KR	Conference call re document review.	0.25	\$122.50
10/9/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/9/2012	JD	Confer w/A. Shaver, review case record, identify and compose email summaries listing potential Apple deponent targets; revise and circulate Master Deponent List.	2.50	\$1,225.00
10/9/2012	JD	Review class rep M. Devine production documents in preparation for class rep depositions per request of D. Harvey.	4.50	\$2,205.00
10/10/2012	GS	ECF Filings; High Tech Cold Calling.	1.00	\$300.00
10/10/2012	LJL	Multiple calls, conferences, etc. with J. Saveri re staffing assignments, case management.	0.50	\$300.00
10/10/2012	JRS	Telephone call with Court. Conference with L. Leebove; e-mail to counsel; telephone call with E. Cramer.	1.00	\$960.00
10/10/2012	LJL	Review ECF filings.	0.25	\$150.00
10/10/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/10/2012	JD	Review class rep M. Devine production documents in preparation for class rep depositions per request of D. Harvey.	6.00	\$2,940.00
10/11/2012	LJL	Conference with D. Harvey, S. Hariharan; prepare for deposition of S. Hariharan; conference call with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, J. Saveri, J. Dallal re deposition planning.	7.50	\$4,500.00
10/11/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/11/2012	JD	Review Apple deponent suggestions and case record; conference call re Apple deponents and designation of additional custodians; compose follow-up emails re consensus on Apple deponents.	2.50	\$1,225.00
10/11/2012	JD	Review all Intuit hot docs; identify and compose email summarizing potential target custodians and deponents and update deponent spreadsheet.	3.50	\$1,715.00
10/12/2012	JRS	Review and revise Shaver letter. Review and revise list of deponents	1.00	\$960.00
10/12/2012	JRS	Case management.	0.33	\$316.80
10/12/2012	LJL	Second-chair/defend deposition of S. Hariharan.	9.30	\$5,580.00
10/12/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page29 of 125

5/7/2015

Page: 28

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Matter Number: 0.50 \$245.00 Review draft letters re additional custodian requests and compose 10/12/2012 JD emails re Apple custodian requests. 0.20 \$120.00 10/13/2012 LJL Multiple correspondence with co-lead counsel re deposition scheduling. 0.12 \$72.00 Correspondence w/ co-lead counsel re discovery issues, 10/13/2012 LJL depositions & expert discovery Correspondence w/ co-lead counsel re discovery issues, 0.17 \$102.00 10/14/2012 LJL depositions & expert discovery \$2,400.00 8.00 10/15/2012 GS Scanning/Management of Cases. 1.00 \$300.00 Preparation of media and administration materials. 10/15/2012 GS 4.58 \$2,748.00 Review Leamer draft report; conference call re same; 10/15/2012 LJL correspondence with J. Saveri, D. Purcell re Lucas; correspondence with K. Dermody, D. Purcell, J. Saveri re insurance issue and settlement; conference call re damages issues. \$450.00 0.75 10/15/2012 LJL Conference call re privilege logs. \$3,720.00 8.00 10/15/2012 AA Document Review. 1.00 \$490.00 Review and email conference re O/C F. Hinman letter declining to 10/15/2012 JD provide deposition dates; send email summary re status of depo request negotiations. 10/15/2012 JD Attend and assist at deposition of M. Fichtner. 7.30 \$3,577.00 \$840.00 Phone call with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, L. Rubin re Google 1.40 10/16/2012 LJL document production. 0.20 \$60.00 10/16/2012 GS ECF Filings. 10/16/2012 AA Document Review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 \$245.00 10/16/2012 JD Research, compile and distribute list of outstanding depo requests 0.50 and status per request of A. Shaver. Compose email request for shared drive requirements and price 0.50 \$245.00 10/16/2012 JD quote to create FTP site or other shared environment for cross-firm databases; confer with IT staff. 1.00 \$490.00 10/16/2012 JD Review Google production and hot documents to identify email addresses of requested Google custodians per request of A. Shaver. \$1,960.00 4.00 Review and update backlog of correspondence for case 10/16/2012 JD correspondence file. \$600.00 10/17/2012 GS Prepare deposition exhibit binders. 2.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page30 of 125

Client Number:

10/19/2012 JD

1010-3

5/7/2015

\$392.00

0.80

Page: 29 1004-1 Matter Number: \$3,720.00 8.00 10/17/2012 AA Document Review. 0.50 \$245.00 10/17/2012 JD Conference call re depo scheduling. Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re assignments, scheduling, 1.00 \$490.00 10/17/2012 JD strategy & discovery progress. Call and email O/C F. Hinman re depo scheduling; call and email 0.50 \$245.00 10/17/2012 JD O/C D. Purcell re dates for S. Coker depo. \$980.00 2.00 Compose detailed instructions for G. Saveri re downloading of 10/17/2012 JD deposition exhibits, uploading and organizing on system, and creation of depo exhibit binders; answer questions re same. \$168.00 0.28 Phone conference with J. Saveri, K. Dermody, et al. re Intel 10/18/2012 LJL potential settlement discussions. \$300.00 1.00 Prepare deposition exhibit binders. 10/18/2012 GS 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document Review. 10/18/2012 AA Call w/O/C F. Hinman to discuss progress on scheduling of depo 1.00 \$490.00 10/18/2012 JD dates; compose and distribute email summary. Review documents re requested Pixar custodians; collect and send 0.70 \$343.00 10/18/2012 JD documents re same per requests of A. Shaver. \$735.00 Phone conference with IT staff regarding request to create FTP 1.50 10/18/2012 JD site or other shared environment for cross-firm databases; compose email outlining options to J. Saveri. 1.00 \$490.00 Review, collect and send set of best Intel-Google documents per 10/18/2012 JD request of J. Saveri. 1.00 \$490.00 Review email from O/C D. Purcell, review S. Coker doc volumes, 10/18/2012 JD check calendars, and draft, edit and circulate email to D. Purcell; incorporate suggestions and send email re additional time. 0.70 Phone conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, J. \$420.00 10/19/2012 LJL Davis, E. Cramer, P. Barile re Leamer deposition. 1.10 \$539.00 Review and update correspondence file. 10/19/2012 JD \$343.00 0.70 Review email from F. Hinman; draft email response to F. Hinman; 10/19/2012 JD draft advisory email to case team re deposition dates for Intel deponents. Review deposition spreadsheet. 0.20 \$98.00 Review production on system and call O/C C. Brown to request 10/19/2012 JD electronic copies of D. Lambert production documents.

#### Continued On Next Page

Confer with CopyMat re class cert brief printouts and provided

briefing into binder per request of J. Saveri.

delivery instructions, prepared labels/cover/custom tabs, organize

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page31 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 30 1004-1 Matter Number: Converted Lucas DOJ and post-DOJ documents to PDF from Teris 1.10 \$539.00 10/19/2012 JD database in preparation for Coker deposition document review and organized on system. Review D. Stover depo defense documents at LCHB office per 3.00 \$1,470.00 10/19/2012 JD request of L. Leebove. Identify subset of documents to be shown to client prior to deposition. Confer with D. Harvey re documents to be reviewed. Request and collect copyset for L. Leebove from T. Desouza. \$600.00 2.00 10/19/2012 GS Prepare deposition exhibit binders. 8.00 \$3,720.00 10/19/2012 AA Document Review. \$999.00 3.33 Prepared Depo Exhibits Binders 10/21/2012 GS \$702.00 1.17 10/22/2012 LJL Review Stover documents; correspondence with A. Shaver, co-counsel re depositions. \$450.00 1.50 Prepare deposition exhibits binders. 10/22/2012 GS 8.00 \$3,720.00 10/22/2012 AA Document Review. Review Apple case record and prepare list of main points of 2.00 \$980.00 10/22/2012 JD interest re requested custodians in advance of call w/O/C. 3.00 \$1,470.00 Review and batch print S. Coker and Lucasfilm hot documents and 10/22/2012 JD begin compiling on system for review by J. Saveri. 0.30 Call O/C C. Brown to request electronic copies of D. Lambert \$147.00 10/22/2012 JD production documents. 7.00 \$2,100.00 10/23/2012 GS Prepare exhibit binders. \$3,720.00 8.00 10/23/2012 AA Document Review. \$784.00 10/23/2012 JD Email exchange w/D. Purcell and confer w/J. Saveri re final dates 1.60 for S. Coker deposition and doc request subpoena; email F. Hinman to request status on Intel depo dates. Review Intel case record and hot documents to identify bases for 0.80 \$392.00 10/23/2012 JD interest in requested custodians in advance of conference call w/S. Shah per request of A. Shaver. Prepare for conference call; conference call w/A. Shaver and O/C \$588.00 1.20 10/23/2012 JD C. Brown re Apple custodian requests. 0.50 \$245.00 Additional instructions to G. Saveri re compilation of depo 10/23/2012 JD exhibits and preparation of depo exhibit binders. \$245.00 Review and update case correspondence file. 0.50 10/23/2012 JD 8.00 \$3,720.00 10/24/2012 AA Document Review.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page32 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 31

1004-1 Matter Number: 9.50 \$4,655.00 Attend and assist at deposition of M. Devine. 10/24/2012 JD 5.00 \$3,000.00 Read Marshall transcript; locate and print out documents to show 10/24/2012 LJL Stover for prep; phone call w/ A. Shaver re prep; conf. J. Dallal re prep. 7.00 \$2,100.00 Prepare exhibit binders. 10/25/2012 GS 8.00 \$3,720.00 10/25/2012 AA Document Review. 0.80\$392.00 10/25/2012 JD Weekly conference call. Compile and email deposition schedule information per request of 0.50 \$245.00 10/25/2012 JD P. Barile. 1.00 \$490.00 Compile and complete online research and compose summary 10/25/2012 JD email re S. Buran per request of K. Dermody. Draft, edit, circulate, further edit, finalize and serve deposition and \$735.00 1.50 10/25/2012 JD document request subpoena of S. Coker. 3.00 \$1,470.00 Review S. Coker and Lucasfilm documents and compile final 10/25/2012 JD version of initial print set; place order w/CopyMat for review of J. Saveri. \$2,802.00 4.67 10/25/2012 LJL Conference w/ B. Glackin, E. Cramer, E. Leamer, P. Johnson re depo prep; conference call/meeting w/ K. Dermody, A. Shaver, D. Harvey, J. Dallal re deposition scheduling/discovery issues. 0.50 \$300.00 Review J. Dallal draft subpoena and communication with J. Dallal 10/25/2012 LJL re same; correspondence with Dean Harvey, Anne Shaver, D. Stover re deposition preparation scheduling; confer with J. Dallal re Coker documents. 7.75 \$2,325.00 10/26/2012 GS Prepare deposition exhibit binders. \$9,600.00 10.00 Prepare for and attend Leemer Depostion. 10/26/2012 JRS 8.00 \$3,720.00 10/26/2012 AA Document Review. \$5,390.00 Attend deposition of E. Leamer. Assist during breaks w/witness 11.00 10/26/2012 JD questions and evaluation of defendants' claims re expert report. \$1,548.00 10/26/2012 LJL Correspondence with Dean Harvey re Stover preparation and with 2.58 D. Stover re same; review Stover documents for preparation; review Coker documents; correspondence with co-counsel re Leamer deposition status; correspondence with Dean Harvey, Dan Ratner re hot documents. \$4,800.00 5.00 Prepare for Coker deposition. 10/28/2012 JRS \$735.00 1.50 Commence preparation for S. Coker deposition; confer with J. 10/28/2012 JD Saveri re dates, doc volumes, time needed and live issues.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page33 of 125

**Client Number:** 

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 32 1004-1 Matter Number: 7.50 \$4,500.00 Deposition preparation re Daniel Stover. 10/28/2012 LJL 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document Review. 10/29/2012 AA \$5,280.00 5.50 Prepare for Coker Deposition. 10/29/2012 JRS \$480.00 0.50 10/29/2012 JRS Expert issues. \$98.00 0.20 Call with A. Shaver to discuss strategy re designation of Apple 10/29/2012 JD and Pixar custodians and coverage on call w/C. Brown 10/30. Review Apple production for exemplar documents pertaining to A. 0.70 \$343.00 10/29/2012 JD Fadell and R. Mansfield and compose email to C. Brown in advance of Apple custodian call 10/30. 4.73 \$2,317.70 Review non-Lucas document hits for S. Coker search to find 10/29/2012 JD potential exhibits for deposition of S. Coker 11/1. Select files from collected PDFs, compare against prior pulls from hot documents, and print for J. Saveri review. Call w/J. Saveri to discuss review of earlier S. Coker exhibit set. Email exchange w/D. Harvey re Intel privilege logs, review Intel 0.40 \$196.00 10/29/2012 JD discovery correspondence and verify production claims by F. Hinman/F. Busch. Review Apple production for S. Forstall hits for possible 0.60 \$294.00 10/29/2012 JD additional custodian request in advance of C. Brown call. Upon discovery of additional M. Stachowiak reference, review Apple production for M. Stachowiak hits. 0.90 \$864.00 Organize discovery; schedule depositions; organize document 10/29/2012 JRS review. conference with J. Dallal. \$450.00 1.50 10/30/2012 GS Prepare deposition exhibit binders. \$90.00 0.30 Lunch meeting with Firm. 10/30/2012 GS \$3,720.00 8.00 Document Review. 10/30/2012 AA Schedule depositions; organize document review. \$384.00 0.40 10/30/2012 JRS Call w/A.Shaver re custodian list call with O/C; call with O/C C. \$784.00 1.60 10/30/2012 JD Brown re Apple recruiter and executive custodians. \$441.00 Review emails from F. Hinman; confer with J. Saveri and L. 0.90 10/30/2012 JD Leebove re deposition dates for Intel defendants; compose emails to F. Hinman re deposition dates.

# Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page34 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

10/30/2012	JD	Review, order and de-dupe initial print set for Coker deposition; per request of J. Saveri review production for references to internal equity and salary structure and integrate into print set; compile and prepare documents for printing as final deposition exhibits; print out backup set of initial print run and prepare for J. Saveri per request.	6.00	\$2,940.00
10/30/2012	LJL	Stover Deposition	10.50	\$6,300.00
10/30/2012	LJL	Phone call with Brendan Glackin re experts and class representatives.	0.28	\$168.00
10/30/2012	LJL	In-person meet and confer with Kelly Dermody, Anne Shaver, L. Rubin and follow-up with Kelly Dermody and Anne Shaver re Google production and discovery issues.	1.30	\$780.00
10/31/2012	GS	Prepare deposition exhibit binders.	6.67	\$2,001.00
10/31/2012	GS	Prepare Coker deposition exhibits.	1.50	\$450.00
10/31/2012	AA	Document Review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
10/31/2012	JRS	Prepare for Coker deposition	10.50	\$10,080.00
10/31/2012	JRS	Review testimony; expert issues; review resume; conference with L. Leebove.	0.50	\$480.00
10/31/2012	JRS	Organize depositions.	0.40	\$384.00
10/31/2012	JD	Review Intel privilege log correspondence; call D. Harvey per request to discuss status of Intel priv log disputes.	0.50	\$245.00
10/31/2012	JD	Arrange court reporter; confer w/J. Saveri re inclusion or exclusion of documents as depo exhibits; compile print run for CopyMat and place order; prepare labels and direct final preparation of exhibits; print additional documents for inclusion in set per request of J. Saveri in preparation for deposition of S. Coker.	9.00	\$4,410.00
11/1/2012	GS	Prepare deposition exhibit binders.	5.00	\$1,500.00
11/1/2012	JRS	Prepare for and take Coker Deposition.	11.87	\$11,395.20
11/1/2012	JD	Assist at deposition of S. Coker; debrief.	10.50	\$5,145.00
11/1/2012	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/2/2012	JRS	Expert issues.	0.50	\$480.00
11/2/2012	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal; organize depositions; conference with L. Leebove.	1.00	\$960.00
11/2/2012	GS	Prepare deposition exhibit binders.	7.00	\$2,100.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page35 of 125

**Client Number:** 

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 34 1004-1 Matter Number: 0.50 \$245.00 Place request for additional class cert binders and assemble per 11/2/2012 JD request of L. Leebove. 1.00 \$490.00 Review hot docs and Intel production to identify documents 11/2/2012 JD forming bases for interest in requested custodians; submit to O/C S. Shah. \$3,720.00 8.00 11/2/2012 AAReview documents. 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/5/2012 AA Review documents. \$480.00 0.50 11/5/2012 **JRS** Discovery issues. Organize depositions \$930.00 11/5/2012 MH Document review. 2.00 \$735.00 1.50 11/5/2012 JD Review notes from S. Coker deposition and start rough draft of internal summary memo. Preparation for and conference call with O/C C. Brown re Apple \$980.00 2.00 11/5/2012 JD production and custodians. Writeup for JSLF team, writeup and confer w/A.Shaver. 2.00 \$980.00 Review letter from O/C J. Sessions and collect and isolate 11/5/2012 JD requested clawback documents per request of J. Saveri. 2.00 \$600.00 Prepare deposition exhibit binders. 11/6/2012 GS Insert index tabs into deposition exhibit binders; prepare 0.50 \$150.00 11/6/2012 GS deposition exhibit binders. 0.60 \$360.00 Correspondence and phone calls w/ D. Harvey and JRS re HTCC 11/6/2012 LJL deposition scheduling and staffing; discussions w/ J. Dallal re same. \$60.00 0.10 11/6/2012 LJL Review correspondence D. Harvey, D. Ratner re hot documents. 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/6/2012 AAReview documents. \$576.00 0.60 11/6/2012 **JRS** Case Management 1.20 \$1,152.00 Review Lucasfilm clawback documents. Telephone call with 11/6/2012 **JRS** Dallal. Organize and schedule depositions 1.00 \$490.00 11/6/2012 JD Review case docket and review local rules and protective order to evaluate snapback procedure. 1.20 \$588.00 11/6/2012 Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re upcoming depositions, JD depositions to be noticed, case strategy and division of labor with co-counsel. 1.30 \$637.00 11/6/2012 JD Discovery review conference call with A. Shaver, D. Harvey, and O/C for Intel; prepare and distribute summary of discussion and agreements.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page36 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 35 Matter Number: 1004-1 3.50 \$1,715.00 Review notes from S. Coker deposition and complete and edit 11/6/2012 JD draft of internal summary memo. 2.00 \$600.00 11/7/2012 Prepare exhibit documents and binders. GS 4.00 \$1,200.00 11/7/2012 GS Prepare deposition document exhibit binders. \$3,720.00 8.00 11/7/2012 Review documents. AA0.40 \$384.00 11/7/2012 **JRS** Case Management Confer w/D. Clevenger, J. Saveri and E. Cramer re scheduling for 0.50 \$245.00 11/7/2012 JD deposition of B. Chizen; update case calendar. 1.00 \$490.00 Review case progress, confer with J. Saveri and prepare and 11/7/2012 JD distribute casewide task list per request of J. Saveri \$1,470.00 3.00 11/7/2012 JD Review J. Sessions clawback review letter and all prior Lucasfilm discovery correspondence, review S. Coker deposition record and identify clawback dispute, confer with J. Forderer re status of Lucasfilm privilege issues. \$735.00 Review case correspondence; update master deponent spreadsheet 1.50 11/7/2012 JD and correspondence file. \$300.00 1.00 GS 11/8/2012 File Coding 4.00 \$1,200.00 Prepared depo exhibits binders 11/8/2012 GS 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/8/2012 AA Review documents. 11/8/2012 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** Case Management \$480.00 0.50 11/8/2012 **JRS** Discovery correspondence. Review deposition schedule. \$980.00 Review, update and organize correspondence file. 2.00 11/8/2012 JD \$1,225.00 2.50 JD Confer w/L. Leebove; online case research into financial 11/8/2012 performance of defendant companies and review EDGAR filings for references to litigation. 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/9/2012 Review documents. AA Case management. Conferences with Leebove and Dallal. 0.50 \$480.00 11/9/2012 **JRS** \$960.00 Organize discovery. Review discovery plan. Review discovery 1.00 11/9/2012 **JRS** correspondence. Conferences with Dallal and Leebove. \$960.00 Case Management. Conference with Leebove and Dallal 1.00 **JRS** 11/9/2012 Organize depositions. Review discovery plan with Dallal. 0.90 \$864.00 **JRS** 11/9/2012 Conference with Leebove

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page37 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 36 Matter Number: 1004-1 1.00 \$490.00 Further call with ECI staff to discuss and develop externally 11/9/2012 JD accessible database for correspondence, filings etc. \$980.00 2.00 Confer w/L. Leebove and M. Heinrich and advise M. Heinrich on 11/9/2012 JD proper procedures for coding documents and case background; request new login from I. Bagger; collect and send key case documents to M. Heinrich; confer w/D. Clevenger. \$480.00 0.50 11/12/2012 JRS Case management 0.90 \$864.00 11/12/2012 JRS Review class certification opposition \$3,720.00 8.00 11/12/2012 AA Review documents. \$3,487.50 7.50 11/12/2012 MH Document review. Further advise new doc reviewer M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc 0.50 \$245.00 11/12/2012 JD review procedures and case background; confer w/L. Leebove. 0.30 \$90.00 11/13/2012 GS **ECF Filings** \$480.00 0.50 11/13/2012 JRS Case Management 2.00 \$1,920.00 11/13/2012 JRS Review class certification opposition 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/13/2012 AA Review Documents. \$360.00 Document review conference call; follow-up call w/ M. Heinrich 0.60 11/13/2012 LJL re document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/13/2012 MH Document review. Assist D. Harvey at deposition of P. Zissimos. 7.50 \$3,675.00 11/13/2012 JD \$196.00 Further advise new doc reviewer M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc 0.40 11/13/2012 JD review procedures and case background. 0.70 \$210.00 11/14/2012 GS **ECF Filings** 0.40 \$384.00 11/14/2012 JRS Case Management \$5,184.00 5.40 11/14/2012 JRS Review class certification brief. Conference with Leebove. Organize briefing. Telephone call with Glackin and Harvey. 0.50 \$480.00 Discovery issues. Conference with Dallal. 11/14/2012 JRS 0.50 \$480.00 11/14/2012 JRS Case Management 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 11/14/2012 AA 7.00 \$3,255.00 Document review. 11/14/2012 MH \$980.00 Collect, organize, print and distribute defendants' opposition to 2.00 11/14/2012 JD class certification briefing, sealed exhibits, and supporting reports and declarations.

Continued On Next Page

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page38 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

11/14/2012	JD	Further advise new doc reviewer M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures and case background; confer w/L. Leebove.	0.50	\$245.00
11/15/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/15/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/15/2012	LJL	Conference calls with Co-Lead counsel regarding strategy on class certification opposition and motion to strike Leamer's report; calls with B. Glackin, F. Hinman, M. Tubach re same; correspondence w/ co-counsel re same; review administrative motion to strike.	1.67	\$1,002.00
11/15/2012	LJL	Phone calls and correspondence with D. Harvey re document review staffing.	0.10	\$60.00
11/15/2012	JD	Call w/E. Cramer to discuss scheduling of Adobe depositions.	0.30	\$147.00
11/15/2012	JD	Conference call re class certification reply; confer w/L. Leebove; read and review defendants' class certification briefing.	4.50	\$2,205.00
11/15/2012	JD	Identify, review and organize documents referring to D. Conrad in advance of deposition.	5.00	\$2,450.00
11/16/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/16/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/16/2012	LJL	Expert phone call with co-counsel, E. Leamer, P. JOhnson, J. Saveri.	1.00	\$600.00
11/16/2012	JD	Review and identify Intel hot documents as potential exhibits for deposition of D. Conrad. Commence collection, printing and organization.	4.00	\$1,960.00
11/16/2012	JD	Review correspondence, confer w/D. Harvey and A. Shaver, and confer w/F. Hinman and J. Saveri re arrangements for deposition of D. Conrad and date for deposition of P. Murray.	0.50	\$245.00
11/16/2012	JD	Participate via conference call on behalf of JSLF on global in-person meet & confer w/LCHB and all defendants. Prepare Apple and Intel discovery dispute points and review and distribute recent discovery correspondence. Prepare and distribute writeup of decisions reached.	2.50	\$1,225.00
11/16/2012	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove to discuss brief assignments; review MTD denial order and plaintiffs' class cert motion.	1.00	\$490.00
11/16/2012	JPD	Comments re class certification reply.	1.70	\$1,360.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page39 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

11/17/2012	JD	Review, identify, collect, print and organize documents as potential exhibits for deposition of D. Conrad; draft summary of document contents, strategy and possible deposition themes for J. Saveri.	5.50	\$2,695.00
11/19/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.80	\$240.00
11/19/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/19/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/19/2012	JD	Review Intel documents and conduct iterative searches for hot Intel documents and other intel documents related to compensation, internal equity, pay structures and other requests of J. Saveri; identify best documents and send print order.	2.00	\$980.00
11/19/2012	JD	Review protective order, FRCP, FRE and previous discovery correspondence; review transcript of S. Coker deposition and deposition exhibits; review comments by J. Saveri and D. Harvey.	4.00	\$1,960.00
11/20/2012	GS	Case Research re Defs' Motion to Strike Report of Dr. Edward E. Leamer	4.00	\$1,200.00
11/20/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/20/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/20/2012	LJL	Meeting with E. Leamer, P. Johnson, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, J. Forderer re expert analysis and Murphy report/deposition.	4.50	\$2,700.00
11/20/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re strategy and additional documents required for deposition of D. Conrad; Finalize, print and organize deposition exhibits for deposition of D. Conrad.	4.50	\$2,205.00
11/20/2012	JD	Edit, finalize, sign and send out letter to J. Sessions challenging Lucasfilm's attempted clawbacks.	0.80	\$392.00
11/21/2012	JRS	Prepare for Deposition. Take Deposition	13.40	\$12,864.00
11/21/2012	JRS	Expert issues; TC Leebove.	0.50	\$480.00
11/21/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/21/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/21/2012	JD	Assist J. Saveri at deposition of D. Conrad.	10.50	\$5,145.00
11/22/2012	МН	Document review.	4.50	\$2,092.50
11/23/2012	JRS	Case management.	0.20	\$192.00
11/23/2012	JRS	Expert issues	0.90	\$864.00

# 

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

11/23/2012	JRS	Discovery planning. Organize depositions	0.80	\$768.00
11/23/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/23/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/26/2012	JRS	Expert issues. Telephone call with Expert. Conference with Leebove.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/26/2012	JRS	Discovery planning. Emails with Dallal and Co-Counsel.	0.60	\$576.00
11/26/2012	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/26/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/26/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/26/2012	LJL	Prepare for conference call and conference call w/ D. Walker, E. Cramer, D. Harvey, J. Dallal re briefing on class certification and motion to strike.	1.50	\$900.00
11/26/2012	LJL	Legal research and analysis re Daubert and economic experts in antitrust matters	5.00	\$3,000.00
11/26/2012	JD	Confer w/LCHB attorneys and call F. Hinman re deposition date for P. Murray.	0.50	\$245.00
11/26/2012	JD	Confer w/A. Shaver, P. Julian and J. Saveri re deposition date for B. Chizen; place calls to D. Kiernan and L. Kahn re same. Review case facts and depo transcripts and propose additional potential Adobe deponents.	1.50	\$735.00
11/26/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and review S. Coker deposition to identify additional potential Lucasfilm deponents and propose to co-counsel.	0.50	\$245.00
11/26/2012	JD	Read and review expert report of E. Leamer and exhibits.	2.00	\$980.00
11/26/2012	JD	Review and update filings and correspondence file.	1.00	\$490.00
11/27/2012	JRS	Review draft of expert report. Telephone call with experts. Conference with leebove	4.20	\$4,032.00
11/27/2012	JRS	Discovery issues. Organize depositions. Email to J. Dallal.	0.80	\$768.00
11/27/2012	GS	Mailing of Admin Mot docs	1.00	\$300.00
11/27/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/27/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page41 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

11/27/2012	JD	Review all documents authored by J. Jenkins and M. Stubblefield and identify and review all presentations and other documents related to internal equity practices at Intuit; draft detailed summary and proposed next steps per requests of J. Saveri.	4.00	\$1,960.00
11/27/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and D. Kiernan to confirm revised date for deposition of B. Chizen.	0.50	\$245.00
11/27/2012	JD	Call w/A. Shaver and confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re Lucasfilm and Adobe depositions to notice.	1.00	\$490.00
11/27/2012	JD	Talk with Kramm and email Hinman with information re retrieving transcript of D. Conrad deposition.	0.50	\$245.00
11/28/2012	GS	ECF Filings	1.00	\$300.00
11/28/2012	JRS	Expert issues. Conference with L. Leebove.	0.50	\$480.00
11/28/2012	JRS	Organize depositions. Conference with Dallal. Review Shaver letter.	1.00	\$960.00
11/28/2012	GS	Pulled cases from Lexis for James Dallal	2.00	\$600.00
11/28/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/28/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
11/28/2012	LJL	conference call w/ E. Leamer, P. Johnson, E. Cramer, D. Walker re motion to strike.	1.40	\$840.00
11/28/2012	LJL	Conference call E. Cramer, D. Walker re motion to strike.	0.80	\$480.00
11/28/2012	JD	Review draft discovery letter re new declarants against document custodian and source information, deposition transcripts and R26 disclosures and provide comments.	1.20	\$588.00
11/28/2012	JD	Review R26 disclosures and update master deponent list; review document custodians and pull fresh source and custodian reports, prepare fresh custodian hit spreadsheet, draft summary and submit to team.	3.00	\$1,470.00
11/29/2012	GS	Case research for James Dallal	1.00	\$300.00
11/29/2012	GS	Lexis case research for Lisa Leebove	1.00	\$300.00
11/29/2012	GS	Tabbed and indexed HTCC Depo Exhibits Binder	3.00	\$900.00
11/29/2012	JRS	Review expert outline. Conference with Leebove.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/29/2012	JRS	Organize depositions. Telephone call with Dallal. Review and revise correspondence re depositions. Review discovery correspondence.	1.40	\$1,344.00
11/29/2012	JRS	Prepare for CMC. Emails with Dallal. Case management.	0.50	\$480.00
		Continued On Next Page		

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page42 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number:

1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 41

\$3,720.00 8.00 Document review. 11/29/2012 MH 1.50 \$735.00 11/29/2012 JD Review and update filings and correspondence file. \$686.00 Confer w/A. Shaver, review correspondence and case facts, and 1.40 11/29/2012 JD write up account of efforts to secure deposition date for P. Murray; confer w/J. Saveri. 2.30 \$1,127.00 11/29/2012 JD Review deposition notice; identify and review Adobe and Intuit internal equity documents and submit proposed deposition exhibits per request of B. Glackin; review background of K. Murphy. 0.50 Review and update case calendar and deposition calendar. \$245.00 11/29/2012 JD \$637.00 Review discovery correspondence, disclosures, and email history 1.30 11/29/2012 JD and confer w/J. Saveri, prepare and circulate draft letter to F. Hinman re efforts to secure deposition date for P. Murray. 0.70 \$343.00 Prepare, edit and circulate draft letters requesting dates for 11/29/2012 JD additional Lucasfilm and Adobe deponents. 0.60 \$294.00 11/29/2012 JD Draft email proposals to J. Saveri re additional proposed depositions from Apple, Intel, Intuit and Google; confer w/J. Saveri. 2.00 \$600.00 Case research for Lisa Leebove, TextMap training, downloaded 11/30/2012 GS cases to TextMap 1.00 \$300.00 Tabbed and indexed HTCC Depo Exhibits Binders 11/30/2012 GS 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 11/30/2012 AA 8.00 \$3,720.00 11/30/2012 MH Document review. 1.00 \$490.00 Edit, incorporate comments re, finalize and send out letters re 11/30/2012 JD deponent date requests to F. Hinman, D. Kiernan and D. Purcell. 0.50 \$245.00 11/30/2012 JD Confer w/G. Saveri and advise re guidelines for storing depo transcripts and exhibits, discovery documents, and filings on shared system. \$1,960.00 Review D. Lambert, M. Bentley, J. Vijungco, D. Morris, D. 4.00 11/30/2012 JD Conrad, and S. Coker transcripts and exhibits, key hot documents, Shaver declaration, and prior depo pulls and incorporate excerpts into redline evidence summary table prepared by D. Harvey per requests of L. Leebove and D. Harvey. 2.00 \$980.00 Download, read and review cases re wage suppression for class 11/30/2012 JD certification reply brief. 2.50 \$1,225.00 Review and summarize additional wage suppression cases and 12/1/2012 JD cases re Rules Enabling Act for class certification reply brief.

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page43 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 42 1004-1 Matter Number: Review draft CMC statement sent by J. Forderer and provide 0.70 \$343.00 12/2/2012 JD comments clarifying status of Intel and Apple discovery disputes; confer w/L. Leebove. 1.50 \$735.00 Review wage suppression cases and collect and review cases re JD 12/2/2012 class certification in labor context generally for class certification reply brief. Legal research, analysis, drafting legal standards re motion to 4.23 \$2,538.00 12/2/2012 LJL strike. Attend deposition of K. Murphy, suggest additional questions to 11.00 \$5,390.00 12/3/2012 JD pose and provide feedback re lines of questioning to pursue and responses to clarify; provide updates per requests of D. Harvey and J. Saveri; report results to JSLF team. 7.40 \$4,440.00 Legal research, analysis, drafting re motion to strike opposition. LJL 12/3/2012 8.00 \$3,720.00 12/3/2012 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 12/3/2012 AA Document review. 8.00 \$2,400.00 12/4/2012 GS Rename files, Case Research for J. Dallal 1.00 \$490.00 Distribute draft CMC statement, confer w/L. Leebove and J. 12/4/2012 JD Saveri; review and sign off. 2.00 \$980.00 Distribute filing protocol and advise G. Saveri re filing guidelines 12/4/2012 JD to create complete set of case filings and integrate LCHB info; provide examples. \$196.00 0.40Review and sign off on draft letter by A. Shaver to Google re F. 12/4/2012 JD Wagner and late-disclosed declarants. 4.00 \$1,960.00 Request additional case pulls from G. Saveri; review additional 12/4/2012 JD class certification cases and cases criticizing wage suppression cases relied upon by defendants; distinguish wage suppression cases and review draft wage suppression section in draft reply brief. \$3,960.00 LJL Legal research, analysis, drafting re opp. to motion to strike 6.60 12/4/2012 Leamer. 8.00 \$3,720.00 12/4/2012 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 12/4/2012 Document review. AA\$5,118.00 8.53 12/5/2012 LJL Legal research, analysis, drafting, revising re motion to strike Leamer's report; discussions/correspondence w/ D. Harvey, D. Walker re same. 8.00 \$3,720.00 12/5/2012 MH Document review.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page44 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 43

12/5/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/6/2012	JRS	Review and revise brief. Review expert materials. Telephone call with Leebove	1.50	\$1,440.00
12/6/2012	JRS	Discovery planning. Organize depostions. Emails with Dallal	0.60	\$576.00
12/6/2012	JRS	Case management. Review and revise Case Management Conference Statement. Email with Dallal.	1.10	\$1,056.00
12/6/2012	JRS	Settlement issues	1.10	\$1,056.00
12/6/2012	JD	Review rules, edit draft stipulation, and file stipulation in CAND per instructions of L. Leebove.	1.50	\$735.00
12/6/2012	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and review J. Vijungco & M. Bentley transcripts and exhibits per request of L. Leebove to identify material potentially at odds with declarations.	1.50	\$735.00
12/6/2012	JD	Confer additionally w/G. Saveri re protocol for filings and orders; revise documents and provide examples; assign additional LCHB documents to integrate into complete set; advise re handling of sealed/unredacted/sensitive materials.	2.00	\$980.00
12/6/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/7/2012	JRS	Review and revise reply brief. Review Leemer declaration	4.50	\$4,320.00
12/7/2012	GS	Deposition review for Lisa Leebove	4.00	\$1,200.00
12/7/2012	GS	Case filing.	3.00	\$900.00
12/7/2012	МН	Document review.	5.00	\$2,325.00
12/7/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/8/2012	JRS	Review Leemer report. Review and revise reply brief.	6.10	\$5,856.00
12/9/2012	JRS	Review and revise class certification reply. Review expert report.	6.80	\$6,528.00
12/10/2012	JRS	Review and revise brief. Conference with Leebove.	4.60	\$4,416.00
12/10/2012	JRS	Prepare for call with Pixar/Lucasfilm. Call with Pixar/Lucasfilm. Call with Dermody and Leebove	1.30	\$1,248.00
12/10/2012	JRS	Discovery issues. Review discovery responses. Organize depositions	0.80	\$768.00
12/10/2012	JRS	Case Management	0.20	\$192.00
12/10/2012	JD	Review transcripts and declarations of late-deposed declarants to identify possible inaccuracies; write up misrepresentations in J. Vijungco and M. Bentley testimony and provide exemplar excerpts per request of B. Glackin.	2.00	\$980.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page45 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

12/10/2012	LJL	Work on class cert reply / opp. to mot. to strike.	8.20	\$4,920.00
12/10/2012	LJL	Review and line edit/proof class certification brief.	2.00	\$1,200.00
12/10/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/10/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/11/2012	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00
12/11/2012	GS	Case filing.	6.00	\$1,800.00
12/11/2012	JD	Review discovery correspondence and confer w/J. Saveri re scheduling of Adobe depositions.	0.30	\$147.00
12/11/2012	JD	Review Rutter guide, protective order, FRCP 26 and 30, CAND local rules and Judge Grewal's rules and prepare summary of findings per request and instruction of J. Saveri; prepare draft letter to F. Hinman requesting Intel's position re deposition of P. Murray.	4.50	\$2,205.00
12/11/2012	JD	Review discovery correspondence and chart of privilege issue responses; review master deponent list; discovery meeting w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove.	1.50	\$735.00
12/11/2012	LJL	Review Daniel Stover transcript for corrections; correspondence to D. Stover re same.	3.10	\$1,860.00
12/11/2012	LJL	Confer with J. Saveri and K. Dermody re Lucas/Pixar; call w/ E. Henn, D. Garza, D. Purcell; follow up call with J. Saveri, K. Dermody re same.	0.40	\$240.00
12/11/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/11/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/12/2012	GS	Case filing.	8.00	\$2,400.00
12/12/2012	JD	Identify, collect, review and print potential exhibits for deposition of P. Murray.	4.00	\$1,960.00
12/12/2012	JD	Review and update depo calendar; provide email summaries to and answer questions by A. Shaver and P. Barile re depo schedules and negotiations.	0.80	\$392.00
12/12/2012	JD	Prepare and send Notice of Deposition of P. Otellini.	0.40	\$196.00
12/12/2012	JD	Email O/C L. Kahn; prepare and send Notice of deposition of D. Streeter.	0.50	\$245.00
12/12/2012	JD	Circulate, edit, finalize and send out letter to F. Hinman requesting Intel's position on P. Murray deposition.	1.00	\$490.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page46 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

12/12/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/12/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/13/2012	GS	Murray Doc Prep for Upcoming Deposition	0.75	\$225.00
12/13/2012	GS	Case filing.	5.00	\$1,500.00
12/13/2012	JD	Revise and update deponent spreadsheet, review discovery correspondence, review custodian counts, identify outstanding deposition requests, identify additional target deponents, and prepare list of ongoing disputes and research topics in advance of scheduled team-wide discovery call.	2.50	\$1,225.00
12/13/2012	JD	Review and update correspondence file, review discovery correspondence, and eliminate duplicates; forward unaddressed correspondence and identify open discovery issues in advance of JSLF discovery review meeting.	3.50	\$1,715.00
12/13/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/13/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/14/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/14/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/17/2012	JD	Review deposition errata sheet from D. Lambert forwarded by C. Brown.	0.50	\$245.00
12/17/2012	JD	Review potential hot documents forwarded by M. Heinrich and advise re relevance to case.	0.40	\$196.00
12/17/2012	JD	Correspond w/J. Saveri, E. Cramer and L. Kahn re Adobe deposition scheduling.	0.70	\$343.00
12/17/2012	JD	Check local rules, review Rutter guides, call Court clerk and review discovery correspondence in preparation for drafting motion to compel; prepare outline for motion to compel per request of J. Saveri; confer further w/F. Hinman re scheduling deposition for P. Murray.	5.00	\$2,450.00
12/17/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/17/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/17/2012	JRS	Discovery issues.	0.70	\$672.00
12/17/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman.	0.50	\$480.00
12/17/2012	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.60	\$576.00
12/17/2012	JRS	Danielle Lambert Errata.	0.20	\$192.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page47 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

12/17/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with Deborah Garza.	0.80	\$768.00
12/18/2012	JD	Review local rules, FRCP and case discovery orders and draft motion to compel deposition of Patricia Murray per request of J. Saveri.	4.00	\$1,960.00
12/18/2012	JD	Review and update master deponent list and case calendar per requests and inquiries of J. Saveri and D. Clevenger.	0.50	\$245.00
12/18/2012	JD	Weekly doc review conference call	0.30	\$147.00
12/18/2012	JD	Review and file defendants' various motions to seal class certification record.	0.80	\$392.00
12/18/2012	JD	Call F. Hinman, review judge's docket and online schedule, and confer w/J. Saveri re hearing schedule and strategy for motion to compel.	1.00	\$490.00
12/18/2012	LJL	Document review conference call	0.30	\$180.00
12/18/2012	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/18/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/18/2012	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal; schedule depositions.	0.90	\$864.00
12/18/2012	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Daniel Purcell.	0.80	\$768.00
12/18/2012	JRS	Settlement issues; conference with L. Leebove; telephone conference with J. Dallal; telephone conference with Pixar.	0.80	\$768.00
12/19/2012	GS	Case filing.	3.00	\$900.00
12/19/2012	JD	Review Intel hot documents, prior Google exhibits, and Conrad deposition exhibits in preparation for P. Murray deposition.	4.00	\$1,960.00
12/19/2012	JD	Review, edit and update motion to compel deposition of P. Murray per review and instructions of J. Saveri.	1.50	\$735.00
12/19/2012	JD	Review and update Filings folder per request of D. Clevenger.	0.20	\$98.00
12/19/2012	JD	Confer further w/E. Cramer and J. Saveri re scheduling of Adobe depositions; review case calendar.	0.60	\$294.00
12/19/2012	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/19/2012	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/19/2012	JRS	Schedule depositions.	0.30	\$288.00
12/19/2012	JRS	Expert issues.	0.50	\$480.00
12/19/2012	JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.10	\$1,056.00

# 

5/7/2015

Page: 47

Client Number: 1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

12/20/2012 GS	Case filing.	3.00	\$900.00
12/20/2012 JD	Call F. Hinman and confer w/J. Saveri to finalize scheduling for deposition of P. Murray.	0.70	\$343.00
12/20/2012 JD	Confer E. Cramer and w/O/C L. Kahn re scheduling of Adobe depositions.	0.40	\$196.00
12/20/2012 MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/20/2012 AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/20/2012 JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
12/20/2012 JRS	Review and revise search terms.	0.80	\$768.00
12/20/2012 JRS	Prepare for depositions.	1.90	\$1,824.00
12/20/2012 JRS	Discovery correspondence.	1.00	\$960.00
12/20/2012 JRS	Schedule depositions; conference with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$960.00
12/21/2012 JD	Review and update case correspondence files.	2.00	\$980.00
12/21/2012 JD	Calls and emails with team members to schedule all hands co-lead counsel meeting.	0.80	\$392.00
12/21/2012 MH	Review documents.	3.00	\$1,395.00
12/21/2012 AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/21/2012 JRS	Prepare for depositions.	6.50	\$6,240.00
12/21/2012 JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
12/22/2012 MH	Document review.	5.00	\$2,325.00
12/24/2012 MH	Document review.	5.00	\$2,325.00
12/24/2012 AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/26/2012 MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/26/2012 AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/27/2012 MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/28/2012 MH	Document review.	7.00	\$3,255.00
12/29/2012 MH	Document review.	5.00	\$2,325.00
12/31/2012 MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
12/31/2012 AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/2/2013 JD	Review new Google production documents.	1.00	\$490.00
	C. C. A. A. Ov. Navid Dame		

Continued On Next Page

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page49 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

1/2/2013	JD	Review notes and draft memo of key background facts concerning operation of Defendant Apple Inc., HR practices, etc.	5.00	\$2,450.00
1/2/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/2/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/3/2013	JD	Review correspondence and record notes in preparation for JSLF and all hands discovery meeting.	0.50	\$245.00
1/3/2013	JD	Review notes and draft memo re evidence regarding operation of Google, HR practices etc.	5.00	\$2,450.00
1/3/2013	JD	Review Google production documents.	2.00	\$980.00
1/3/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/3/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/4/2013	JRS	Prepare for class certification argument; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	2.00	\$1,920.00
1/4/2013	JD	Review and update master deponent list and online case calendar; review scheduling orders.	1.00	\$490.00
1/4/2013	JD	Review Google production documents	1.50	\$735.00
1/4/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re document review procedures.	0.50	\$245.00
1/4/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence files.	3.00	\$1,470.00
1/4/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/4/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/5/2013	МН	Document review.	1.00	\$465.00
1/7/2013	JD	Search online, review exemplars, and prepare first draft of notice of change of firm address.	1.00	\$490.00
1/7/2013	JD	Review deposition schedule and contact vendor Kramm to ensure orders canceled for reschedule depositions.	0.50	\$245.00
1/7/2013	JD	Confer w/A. Shaver and J. Saveri re new production documents and coordination of Adobe deposition and discovery schedule.	0.80	\$392.00
1/7/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/7/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/7/2013	JRS	Case management; conference with J. Dallal; review Intel discovery.	0.30	\$288.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page50 of 125

1010-3 Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1/8/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
1/8/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument.	4.50	\$4,320.00
1/8/2013	JD	Weekly doc review call.	0.30	\$147.00
1/8/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.50	\$245.00
1/8/2013	JD	Review Google production documents.	3.50	\$1,715.00
1/8/2013	JD	Distribute draft notice of change of address and edit per instructions of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/8/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/8/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/9/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
1/9/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument.	3.10	\$2,976.00
1/9/2013	JD	Review and distribute Intel discovery responses and correspondence; confer w/L. Leebove and A. Shaver, and conduct discovery call w/O/C S. Welch re progress on Intel production and depositions.	1.70	\$833.00
1/9/2013	JD	Confer further w/ECI re setting up shared web presence accessible to all class counsel firms.	0.30	\$147.00
1/9/2013	JD	Call O/C D. Purcell to confer re and reschedule Lucas deposition dates and circulate results.	0.50	\$245.00
1/9/2013	JD	Call w/D. Harvey to coordinate and provide updates re co-leads' progress on scheduling depositions and provide.	0.40	\$196.00
1/9/2013	JD	Confer w/E. Cramer and O/C for Adobe re scheduling Adobe depositions.	0.40	\$196.00
1/9/2013	JD	Review past CMC statements, CMC draft and discovery history per requests of J. Saveri and L. Leebove and recommend suggested changes to draft per request of J. Saveri.	2.00	\$980.00
1/9/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence; pdate master deponent list and case calendar and forward requested changes to D. Clevenger per request of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/9/2013	JD	Edit notice of change of address per instructions of J. Saveri and file via ECF system.	1.00	\$490.00
1/9/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/10/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page51 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 50

Matter Number: 1004-1 \$480.00 0.50 **JRS** Case management. 1/10/2013 \$288.00 0.30 1/10/2013 **JRS** Discovery correspondence. 1.40 \$686.00 Review various iterations of draft CMC statement, confer w/D. 1/10/2013 JD Harvey, answer questions and offer recommendations re revisions per requests of J. Saveri. 0.40 \$196.00 Download and circulate sealed filings and confer w/G. Saveri re 1/10/2013 JD uploading and distribution \$196.00 Review emails and confer w/A. Peraza re various options for 0.40 1/10/2013 JD shared web presence accessible to all co-lead class counsel. Confer w/B. Glackin, D. Harvey, and T. D'Souza re factual 5.00 \$2,450.00 1/10/2013 JD background of Defendants' administrative motion to supplement record; review correspondence and filings; draft language re tangential and repetitive nature of filing for opposition brief per requests and instructions of L. Leebove and B. Glackin. \$3,720.00 8.00 1/10/2013 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 1/10/2013 AADocument review. 0.30 \$288.00 Review and revise case management conference statement; 1/10/2013 **JRS** conference with J. Dallal. \$768.00 0.80 1/11/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$576.00 0.60 Organize depositions; conference with J. Dallal. **JRS** 1/11/2013 \$960.00 1.00 Review and revise opposition. 1/11/2013 **JRS** \$147.00 0.30 Further correspondence with Adobe O/C and E. Cramer re 1/11/2013 JD scheduling Adobe depositions. 1.50 \$735.00 JD Confer w/O/C C. Harris re scheduling of Lucas deposition; review 1/11/2013 Lucas discovery correspondence and responses and follow up re document production including clawback issues in advance of next week's discovery call. 2.00 \$980.00 Write, review, edit, and serve three deposition notices and a 1/11/2013 JD deposition subpoena for four additional Lucas and Intel deponents. 0.80 \$392.00 Review further draft of opposition to defendants' admin motion to JD1/11/2013 supplement record and circulate additional thoughts per request of J. Saveri. \$490.00 1.00 Compile unsealed versions of all materials for Reply Brief ISO 1/11/2013 JD Class Certification and place order for hard-copy binders w/vendor CopyMat. 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 1/11/2013 MH

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page52 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

1/11/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/11/2013	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal re discovery status.	0.20	\$192.00
1/12/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument.	3.50	\$3,360.00
1/12/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/13/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument.	5.20	\$4,992.00
1/14/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	5.80	\$5,568.00
1/14/2013	JRS	Discovery planning; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.80	\$768.00
1/14/2013	JRS	Review correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
1/14/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
1/14/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.40	\$196.00
1/14/2013	JD	Review Apple discovery correspondence and confer w/A. Shaver and L. Leebove re status of requests re T. Fadell, J. Podolny, G. Montesino, T. Moyer and others in advance of discovery call w/Apple and upcoming CMC.	3.00	\$1,470.00
1/14/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	2.50	\$1,225.00
1/14/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove, review discovery correspondence, run doc production metrics, and conduct conference call w/O/C C. Harris.	2.00	\$980.00
1/14/2013	JD	Prepare and serve amended notice of deposition of P. Murray per request of F. Hinman.	0.30	\$147.00
1/14/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/14/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/15/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.40	\$120.00
1/15/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	4.90	\$4,704.00
1/15/2013	JRS	Discovery planning; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.60	\$576.00
1/15/2013	JRS	case management.	1.00	\$960.00
1/15/2013	JRS	Review order; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00

# 

1010-3 Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1/15/2013	JD	Review new supplemental initial disclosures by Apple and prepare and circulate chart comparing previous and new witnesses; conduct discovery call w/O/C; review discovery correspondence forwarded by co-counsel; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re possible approaches to Apple discovery disputes at upcoming CMC.	4.00	\$1,960.00
1/15/2013	JD	Review class certification and motion to dismiss briefing and prepare list of possible questions for mooting of class cert hearing per requests of A. Shaver and B. Glackin.	1.50	\$735.00
1/15/2013	JD	Discovery call w/Pixar conducted by A. Shaver.	0.40	\$196.00
1/15/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.40	\$196.00
1/15/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/15/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/16/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	6.50	\$6,240.00
1/16/2013	JD	Review, update and edit discovery letter to Lucas to memorialize positions and follow up on discovery call w/C. Harris on Monday.	1.00	\$490.00
1/16/2013	JD	Draft discovery letter to Lucas to memorialize positions and follow up on discovery call w/C. Harris on Monday.	1.50	\$735.00
1/16/2013	JD	Compile all demonstratives, organize on shared drive and circulate per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/16/2013	JD	Review motion to compel re Google-Campbell docs per and offer suggestions per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
1/16/2013	JD	Confer w/case team re plan for submitting revised redacted copies of class certification complying w/court order on motions to seal per instructions of J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00
1/16/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.40	\$196.00
1/16/2013	JD	Review notes and emails and confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re class counsel meeting w/S. Buran.	0.80	\$392.00
1/16/2013	JD	Further investigate background of Apple employee T. Moyer, role in conspiracy and possiblity for deposing him per request of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/16/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/16/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

# 

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

1/16/2013	JRS	Discovery planning; conference with J. Dallal.	0.20	\$192.00
1/17/2013	LJL	Travel to/from class certification hearing; Attend class certification hearing.	7.73	\$4,638.00
1/17/2013	JRS	Prepare for argument; argument; telephone conference with co-counsel.	7.80	\$7,488.00
1/17/2013	JRS	Discovery issues; review and revise letter to Michael Tubach.	1.00	\$960.00
1/17/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.30	\$147.00
1/17/2013	JD	Review all T. Fadell documents and draft letter to M. Tubach outlining bases for T. Fadell discovery requests per court order.	4.50	\$2,205.00
1/17/2013	JD	Travel to/from class certification hearing; Attend class certification hearing.	7.50	\$3,675.00
1/17/2013	МН	Document review.	5.00	\$2,325.00
1/17/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/18/2013	JRS	Organize discovery; telephone conference with Frank Hinman; review and revise letter to Michael Tubach.	1.30	\$1,248.00
1/18/2013	JRS	Case management; telephone conference with Dean Harvey.	0.80	\$768.00
1/18/2013	JRS	Settlement call with Robert Mittelstaedt; e-mail to K. Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
1/18/2013	JD	Run several searches and review and pull relevant documents from deposition of S. Coker in advance of J. Van der Voort deposition.	1.20	\$588.00
1/18/2013	JD	Review and update master deponent list and case calendar and confer w/full case team re all hands meeting scheduling.	1.50	\$735.00
1/18/2013	JD	Review documents submitted by Intel from files of P. Otellini in advance of P. Otellini deposition; confer w/J. Saveri and Intel counsel.	1.00	\$490.00
1/18/2013	JD	Prepare revised redacted version of motion for class certification per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/18/2013	JD	Call w/A. Peraza to discuss options re shared drive access and decide on FTP drive; review writeup of options for eventual submission to J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
1/18/2013	JD	Review and incorporate suggested edits to T. Fadell letter; sign and submit to Apple.	1.00	\$490.00
1/18/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/18/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page55 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

1010 5

Matter Number: 1004-1

1/18/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.20	\$192.00
1/20/2013	МН	Document review.	3.00	\$1,395.00
1/21/2013	MH	Document review.	3.00	\$1,395.00
1/22/2013	JD	Review P. Otellini hot documents and Conrad depo exhibits and compile first wave of documents for deposition of P. Otellini.	7.00	\$3,430.00
1/22/2013	JD	Review and motion to compel and offer suggestions based on proceedings at class certification hearing.	0.40	\$196.00
1/22/2013	JD	Review letter from C. Brown and set up discovery call w/Apple.	0.40	\$196.00
1/22/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/22/2013	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.40	\$384.00
1/22/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
1/22/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.60	\$576.00
1/22/2013	JRS	Review brief to Paul Grewal.	0.50	\$480.00
1/23/2013	GS	ECF Filings	1.50	\$450.00
1/23/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.50	\$150.00
1/23/2013	JD	Read up on public sources re P. Otellini and compile selection for J. Saveri and L. Leebove review; begin de-duping and identifying relevant hot documents for P. Otellini deposition.	3.50	\$1,715.00
1/23/2013	JD	Review Apple's proposed draft status report re T. Fadell and recommend signoff.	0.30	\$147.00
1/23/2013	JD	Further confer w/case team re scheduling all hands meeting.	0.20	\$98.00
1/23/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc review procedures.	0.50	\$245.00
1/23/2013	JD	Call w/O/C C. Brown, confer w/case team, and compose email to C. Brown declining Apple's request that Plaintiffs limit time on depositions of Apple witnesses.	1.50	\$735.00
1/23/2013	JD	Refine logo and prepare new joint co-counsel letterhead per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
1/23/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/23/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/23/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
1/23/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	6.20	\$5,952.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page56 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 55

\$384.00 0.40 **JRS** Deposition scheduling. 1/23/2013 10.00 \$4,900.00 Compile, de-dupe, review and select primary review set for J. 1/24/2013 JD Saveri review for deposition of P. Otellini. Compose detailed strategy memo re possible lines of questioning. Further confer with case team re scheduling for all hands status 0.30 \$147.00 1/24/2013 JD meeting. Followup review and confer with case team re draft T. Fadell 0.50 \$245.00 1/24/2013 JD status report and approve draft in email to C. Brown. 8.00 \$3,720.00 1/24/2013 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 1/24/2013 AADocument review. \$6,816.00 7.10 1/24/2013 Prepare for deposition. **JRS** \$980.00 2.00 Further review P. Otellini documents and schedule court reporter. 1/25/2013 JD \$1,960.00 4.00 Download and prepare first wave of review documents for 1/25/2013 JD deposition of J. Van der Voort. 3.50 \$1,715.00 Review Google production documents. 1/25/2013 JD \$490.00 1.00 Review and update case correspondence file. 1/25/2013 JD Confer w/L. Leebove and advise M. Peraria-Heinrich re doc \$147.00 0.30 1/25/2013 JD review procedures. \$3,720.00 8.00 Document review. 1/25/2013 MH 8.00 \$3,720.00 1/25/2013 AA Document review. \$4,992.00 5.20 Prepare for deposition. 1/25/2013 **JRS** \$768.00 0.80 **JRS** Expert issues. 1/25/2013 0.30 \$288.00 Case management. 1/25/2013 **JRS** 0.20 \$192.00 Review Apple letter re depositions. 1/25/2013 **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 1/25/2013 **JRS** Settlement issues. 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 1/26/2013 MH \$5,952.00 6.20 Prepare for deposition. 1/26/2013 **JRS** \$3,920.00 Review additional Intel documents and hits from targeted P. 8.00 1/27/2013 JD Otellini searches in preparation for P. Otellini deposition; select new documents and write up summary of additional possible lines of question for J. Saveri. \$2,325.00 5.00 MH Document review. 1/27/2013

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page57 of 125

1010-3 Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1/27/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	5.80	\$5,568.00
1/27/2013	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.30	\$288.00
1/28/2013	JD	Review new production documents from files of P. Otellini in preparation for P. Otellini deposition; direct printing of first round of deposition exhibits; confer multiple times w/J. Saveri and G. Saveri; compile final depo exhibit set.	14.00	\$6,860.00
1/28/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/28/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/28/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	8.50	\$8,160.00
1/29/2013	JD	Assist at deposition of P. Otellini	9.50	\$4,655.00
1/29/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/29/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/29/2013	JRS	Prepare for a take Paul Otellini deposition.	12.40	\$11,904.00
1/30/2013	GS	ECF Filings	1.00	\$300.00
1/30/2013	GS	Deposition Doc Prep	5.67	\$1,701.00
1/30/2013	JD	Compose and serve detailed discovery letters to O/C C. Harris, C. Brown, M. Tubach, D. Kiernan and F. Hinman to follow up on discovery matters prior to status report filing.	3.00	\$1,470.00
1/30/2013	JD	Travel to and attend deposition of S. Brown per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	8.00	\$3,920.00
1/30/2013	JD	Review status of discovery disputes, correspondence and responses from Lucas, Intel, Adobe and Apple, confer w/L. Leebove and compose detailed instructions re followup letters to defendants in advance of upcoming discovery status report.	3.00	\$1,470.00
1/30/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/30/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
1/30/2013	JRS	Schedule depositions; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
1/30/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	4.20	\$4,032.00
1/31/2013	JD	Compile and review custodial documents of J. Van der Voort and prior exhibits from deposition of S. Coker. Confer w/L. Leebove re additional exhibit request and possible depo themes.	5.00	\$2,450.00
1/31/2013	JD	Confer w/C. Harris and draft amended deposition notices and subpoena to change locations as requested.	0.50	\$245.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page58 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 57 Matter Number: 1004-1 2.50 \$1,225.00 1/31/2013 JD Review draft status report and confer w/D. Harvey re edits; draft new sections re Apple, Lucas, Adobe and Intel; review and circulate discovery correspondence per requests of D. Harvey. 5.00 \$2,325.00 MH 1/31/2013 Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 1/31/2013 AA Document review. 0.40 \$384.00 1/31/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$2,880.00 3.00 1/31/2013 **JRS** Prepare for deposition. \$768.00 0.801/31/2013 **JRS** Review and revise case management conference statement. 6.00 \$2,940.00 2/1/2013 JD Confer w/L. Leebove, collect supplemental J. Van der Voort and Lucas comp materials, and print exhibit copies of entire first set of print requests per requests and instructions of L. Leebove. 3.00 \$1,470.00 Run reports and review custodial documents and name hits and 2/1/2013 JD conduct online research re Intel R26 witnesses D. Bryant, G. Palangian, and C. Dickenson, compose detailed recommendations regarding deposition and document requests for each, and confer w/D. Harvey, B. Glackin. and other team members re same following Intel request that class withdraw depo requests. \$490.00 Compile and distribute custodian report to assist in evaluation of 1.00 2/1/2013 JD present discovery holdings and compliance with prior requests; review draft discovery status report and return comments per requests of D. Harvey. 1.00 \$490.00 2/1/2013 JD Compile complete list of JSLF deposition dates and distribute per request of A. Shaver; confer w/E. Cramer re availability to cover upcoming depositions. 8.43 \$5,058.00 2/1/2013 LJL VanDerVoort deposition prep. \$3,720.00 8.00 2/1/2013 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/1/2013 AA Document review. 0.30 \$288.00 Review and revise case management conference. 2/1/2013 **JRS** \$480.00 0.50 2/1/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with L. Leebove. 0.50 \$480.00 Case management; telephone conference with J. Dallal. 2/1/2013 **JRS** \$1,395.00 3.00 2/3/2013 MH Document review. \$3,920.00 8.00 2/4/2013 JD Print exhibit set for supplemental exhibit requests for J. Van der Voort; prepare complete set of folders and check against outline; confer w/L. Leebove re strategy and plan for arrival etc. 5.50 \$5,280.00 2/4/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions; case management.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page59 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

2/4/2013	LJL	Van Der Voort preparation.	3.10	\$1,860.00
2/4/2013	LJL	Prep for Van Der Voort	8.33	\$4,998.00
2/4/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/4/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/5/2013	JD	Assist at deposition of J. Van der Voort	8.00	\$3,920.00
2/5/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
2/5/2013	LJL	Deposition of Jan Van Der Voort	8.08	\$4,848.00
2/5/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/5/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/6/2013	GS	ECF Filings, Update Depo Binders	2.17	\$651.00
2/6/2013	JD	Review, assemble and organize first set of M. Maupin documents for L. Leebove in advance of 12/12 deposition.	4.00	\$1,960.00
2/6/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	3.00	\$1,470.00
2/6/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.50	\$480.00
2/6/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/7/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence, assemble still pending requests in hard copy and compose preliminary summary of present schedule and scheduling issues resolved and to be resolved per request of A. Shaver.	1.00	\$490.00
2/7/2013	JD	Preliminary review of new document productions by L. Leebove and J. Saveri and confer re plan for additional review and addressing upcoming depositions.	1.00	\$490.00
2/7/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence files.	3.50	\$1,715.00
2/7/2013	JRS	Review supplemental disclosures; deposition planning.	1.50	\$1,440.00
2/7/2013	МН	Document review.	3.00	\$1,395.00
2/7/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/7/2013	GS	ECF Filings, Updated depo binders	2.00	\$600.00
2/8/2013	JD	Review updated Intel initial disclosures.	0.40	\$196.00
2/8/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence and confer w/O/C for Adobe and confirm date for deposition of D. Horner and provide update re other pending dates.	0.30	\$147.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page60 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 59 1004-1 Matter Number: Compose summary of upcoming depositions and presently pending 0.50 \$245.00 2/8/2013 JD scheduling issues for D. Clevenger per request and instructions of J. Saveri. Review and update case correspondence files, filings folder, 3.00 \$1,470.00 2/8/2013 JD deposition transcript and deposition exhibits folders, and request assistance from G. Saveri in compiling latest deposition materials on shared drive. Confer w/D. Harvey and J. Saveri re scheduling of deposition for 0.50 \$245.00 2/8/2013 JD Intel witness D. McKell per request of S. Welch. \$196.00 Confer w/E. Cramer and confirm his availability to handle 0.40 2/8/2013 JD deposition of D. Horner on 3/1 and re possible assistance of other Berger & Montague attorneys. 0.30 \$147.00 Call w/B. Glackin re scheduling of all hands meeting, proceedings JD 2/8/2013 at all parties discovery conference call and plan for addressing witness J. Podolny's role. Call w/O/C C. Brown and writeup re resolution of dates for 0.50 \$245.00 2/8/2013 JD remaining Apple depositions. 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 2/8/2013 MH 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/8/2013 AA Document review. \$288.00 Deposition planning; conference with J. Dallal. 0.30 **JRS** 2/8/2013 5.00 \$2,325.00 2/9/2013 MH Document review. 3.80 \$3,648.00 2/10/2013 **JRS** Prepare for Patricia Murray deposition. \$3,240.00 5.40 Review Maupin documents for Maupin deposition prep & 2/10/2013 LJL deposition prep for Maupin. 8.00 \$3,720.00 MH Document review. 2/10/2013 \$490.00 Review complaint and case background, conduct online research 1.00 2/10/2013 JD re director witnesses J. Doerr and A. Levinson, and conduct legal research into feasability of noticing depositions of party directors per request for subpoenas by J. Saveri. Review custodial M. Maupin hits for issue coding and new M. 7.00 \$3,430.00 2/10/2013 JD Maupin production files in advance of deposition on 2/12; compile potential exhibit docs, distribute and summarize for L. Leebove. \$8,040.00 13.40 2/11/2013 LJL Michelle Maupin document review / deposition prep \$480.00 0.50 2/11/2013 **JRS** Review discovery. \$4,320.00 4.50 2/11/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 0.30 \$288.00 2/11/2013 **JRS** Case management. Continued On Next Page

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page61 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

2/11/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/11/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/11/2013	JD	Email and phone correspondence w/O/C for Lucasfilm, Intel and Adobe re deposition scheduling.	1.10	\$539.00
2/11/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove; answer doc reviewers' questions and advise re coding and priorities.	0.70	\$343.00
2/11/2013	JD	Deposition preparation for P. Murray depo.	1.00	\$490.00
2/11/2013	JD	Depo prep for M. Maupin depo w/L. Leebove and G. Saveri.	11.20	\$5,488.00
2/12/2013	LJL	Depose Michelle Maupin	9.20	\$5,520.00
2/12/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.50	\$3,360.00
2/12/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
2/12/2013	МН	Document review.	3.00	\$1,395.00
2/12/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/12/2013	JD	Assist at deposition of M. Maupin.	9.20	\$4,508.00
2/12/2013	JD	Confer w/doc reviewers; answer questions and advise re coding and priorities.	0.60	\$294.00
2/12/2013	JD	Email correspondence with O/C for Lucasfilm and Intel re deposition scheduling.	0.60	\$294.00
2/12/2013	JD	Review and collect documents to prepare for deposition of P. Murray.	2.80	\$1,372.00
2/12/2013	JD	Review case record, case correspondence and calendar and draft and circulate email summary of upcoming tasks.	0.80	\$392.00
2/13/2013	GS	ECF Filings, Prepared Depo Docs, Filing	4.00	\$1,200.00
2/13/2013	GS	Deposition Doc Preparation Murray Deposition	2.00	\$600.00
2/13/2013	LJL	Prep for case management meeting with co-counsel; case management meeting with co-Lead counsel; follow-up phone calls with CaseMap and correspondence w/ Co-Leads re same	1.90	\$1,140.00
2/13/2013	LJL	Conference w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re deposition planning/scheduling and issue of potential perjury by M. Maupin; follow up correspondence w/ J. Dallal, co-lead counsel re both issues.	0.90	\$540.00
2/13/2013	JRS	Prepare for Patricia Murray deposition.	5.50	\$5,280.00

# 

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

2/13/2013	JRS	Case management; deposition scheduling; conference with J. Dallal and Berger & Montague.	1.10	\$1,056.00
2/13/2013	JRS	Conference with co-counsel; prepare for meeting.	2.30	\$2,208.00
2/13/2013	MH	Document review,	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/13/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/13/2013	JD	Confer w/O/C for Apple, Intel, and Lucasfilm re scheduling of upcoming depositions; write emails to circulate information and update calendar.	1.50	\$735.00
2/13/2013	JD	Research background, update custodian list, review documents produced, prepare summary checklist, and meet with co-counsel.	3.00	\$1,470.00
2/13/2013	JD	Draft, edit and review discovery letters to O/C for Apple and Intel re outstanding depositions.	1.50	\$735.00
2/13/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and co-counsel Berger & Montague re coverage for upcoming Adobe and Intel depositions.	0.50	\$245.00
2/13/2013	JD	Review privilege log submitted by O/C for Lucasfilm, circulate comments and respond to emails.	0.50	\$245.00
2/13/2013	JD	Select, review, and organize documents for deposition of P. Murray; review additional P. Murray custodial documents in advance of deposition.	9.50	\$4,655.00
2/14/2013	LJL	Review and cull Murray documents in preparation for JRS's deposition of Patty Murray	3.70	\$2,220.00
2/14/2013	LJL	Review A. Shaver summary of Chuong deposition; correspondence w/ J. Dallal re Murray deposition.	0.20	\$120.00
2/14/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
2/14/2013	MH	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/14/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/14/2013	JRS	Prepare for and take Patricia Murray deposition.	10.20	\$9,792.00
2/14/2013	JD	Assist at deposition of P. Murray.	9.10	\$4,459.00
2/14/2013	JD	Review, edit, correspond w/D. Clevenger re, and submit discovery letters to O/C for Apple and Intel.	0.80	\$392.00
2/14/2013	JD	Review case record, correspondence, and calendar and write summary of open discovery issues for inclusion in weekly discovery status report.	0.60	\$294.00
2/15/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.60	\$180.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page63 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

2/15/2013	GS	Prepared deposition binders	5.00	\$1,500.00
2/15/2013	JRS	Case management; prepare for Micheline Chau deposition.	4.00	\$3,840.00
2/15/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/15/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/15/2013	JD	Prepare for and conduct conference call w/co-counsel at Berger & Montague to assign deposition coverage for Adobe and Intel depositions.	0.60	\$294.00
2/15/2013	JD	Draft, edit, and circulate summary of deposition of P. Murray; review notes.	0.90	\$441.00
2/15/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.40	\$196.00
2/15/2013	JD	Review S. Dykes custodial documents to prepare for deposition. Confer w/J. Saveri and D. Harvey re review priorities and coverage.	3.20	\$1,568.00
2/15/2013	JD	Update case calendar, update filings database, confer w/Teris re production database and coordinate setup of additional reviewer login. Review and update case correspondence database.	2.20	\$1,078.00
2/15/2013	JD	Confer w/co-counsel re discovery report, submit proposed updates, and monitor filing.	0.80	\$392.00
2/15/2013	JD	Email and telephone correspondence and confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re depo scheduling for multiple Adobe, Lucasfilm, and Intel witnesses. Review and update deposition calendar.	1.50	\$735.00
2/15/2013	JD	Run searches and review production documents to identify potential exhibits for the deposition of M. Chau.	1.40	\$686.00
2/16/2013	JRS	Prepare for Micheline Chau deposition.	4.50	\$4,320.00
2/16/2013	JRS	Prepare for Steve Dykes deposition; conference with J. Dallal.	2.00	\$1,920.00
2/16/2013	МН	Document review.	1.00	\$465.00
2/17/2013	МН	Document review.	4.00	\$1,860.00
2/17/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	4.50	\$4,320.00
2/17/2013	JD	Review S. Dykes search hits and custodial documents, select additional potential deposition exhibits, and deliver results to D. Harvey.	3.20	\$1,568.00
2/17/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.50	\$245.00
2/18/2013	GS	Prepared deposition binders	8.00	\$2,400.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page64 of 125 5/7/2015 Client Number: 1010-3 Page: 63 1004-1 Matter Number: 5.90 \$3,540.00 Review, code and cull Murray documents in preparation for JRS 2/18/2013 LJL deposition of Patty Murray 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/18/2013 AADocument review. 8.00 \$2,400.00 2/18/2013 GS Prepared deposition docs 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/18/2013 MH Document review. 5.10 \$4,896.00 2/18/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 0.80 \$768.00 2/18/2013 **JRS** Case management. Confer w/team members re scheduling and location of upcoming 0.50 \$245.00 JD 2/18/2013 Intel depositions. 4.50 \$2,205.00 Review, collect and organize documents in preparation for 2/18/2013 JD deposition of M. Chau; online research; draft ideas re deposition themes. \$343.00 Collect and organize US v Lucasfilm documents per request of J. 0.70 2/18/2013 JD Saveri. 0.40 \$196.00 Confer w/L. Leebove and answer questions and advise document 2/18/2013 JD reviewers on coding and priorities. 0.20 \$192.00 Conference with J. Dallal; deposition schedule. 2/18/2013 **JRS** 3.50 \$1,050.00 2/19/2013 GS **Deposition Document Preparation** 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review. 2/19/2013 AA8.00 \$3,720.00 2/19/2013 MH Document review. \$3,840.00 Steve Dykes deposition; conference with Dean Harvey. 4.00 2/19/2013 **JRS** \$3,552.00 3.70 Prepare for depositions. 2/19/2013 **JRS** 0.20 \$192.00 2/19/2013 **JRS** Case management.

> Review documents; retrieve and organize documents per requests 8.00 of J. Saveri; identify, prepare and organize exhibits and confer re themes for deposition of M. Chau. 8.00 \$3,720.00 Document review.

1.00

1.50

0.50

1.00

\$960.00

\$735.00

\$245.00

\$490.00

\$3,920.00

Continued On Next Page

Scheduling and online research for deposition of R. Prajapati.

and circulate email summary of upcoming tasks.

upcoming depositions of P. Burke and R. Okamoto.

Review case record, case correspondence and calendar and draft

Run searches, draft instructions, and organize document pulls for

2/19/2013

2/19/2013

2/19/2013

2/19/2013

2/19/2013

2/20/2013

**JRS** 

JD

JD

JD

JD

AA

Discovery planning.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page65 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

2/20/2013	GS	Prepared deposition documents	8.00	\$2,400.00
2/20/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/20/2013	МН	Document review.	3.00	\$1,395.00
2/20/2013	JRS	Discovery planning; review e-mails.	1.00	\$960.00
2/20/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	8.30	\$7,968.00
2/20/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
2/20/2013	LJL	phone conferences w/ KMD, conferences JRS re statuts/case management.	0.40	\$240.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Review Lucas / Van Der Voort & Maupin transcripts and deposition exhibits re JRS's Chau deposition.	2.00	\$1,200.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Legal research re authenticity RFA's; drafted RFA's re authenticity issues for all defendants.	1.00	\$600.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ co-lead counsel re issues and strategy re authenticity, RFAs.	0.40	\$240.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Assist with Prajapati deposition prep - reviewing Pixar deposition transcripts, exhibits and discussions w/ JGD re same.	1.60	\$960.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Run initial searches for Dramen documents for Dramen depo and depo prep.	0.50	\$300.00
2/20/2013	LJL	Phone calls and correspondence w/ Sarah Schalman-Bergen re Horner and Okamoto depositions.	0.40	\$240.00
2/20/2013	JD	Review calendar a correspondence, submit updates and confirm details to schedule depositions/arrangements with court reporter.	0.50	\$245.00
2/20/2013	JD	Assist in collection/organization of documents for depositions of R. Okamoto, P. Burke, and D. Horner.	2.50	\$1,225.00
2/20/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of R. Prajapati.	13.00	\$6,370.00
2/21/2013	AA	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/21/2013	МН	Document review.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/21/2013	JRS	Micheline Chau deposition.	12.50	\$12,000.00
2/21/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.40	\$384.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page66 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 65 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$360.00 Research re and phone calls and correspondence w/ JRS, 0.60 2/21/2013 LJL co-counsel re authentication and expert issues; phone call with JRS re Chau deposition. \$1,020.00 Review Bentley and Lambert deposition transcripts re Okamoto 1.70 2/21/2013 LJL deposition. 12.50 \$6,125.00 2/21/2013 JD Depose R. Prajapati. 6.00 \$2,790.00 2/22/2013 MH Document review. 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/22/2013 AADocument review. \$5,952.00 6.20 2/22/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 1.80 \$1,728.00 2/22/2013 **JRS** Discovery planning; conference with L. Leebove. \$180.00 0.30 Phone call w/ D. Harvey and review correspondence to 2/22/2013 LJL defendants. Prepare and serve deposition notices and subpoena for upcoming \$637.00 1.30 2/22/2013 JD depositions of Apple, Adobe, and Lucasfilm witnesses. Confer w/O/C re depo scheduling. \$588.00 Draft and circulate summary of R. Prajapati deposition. 1.20 2/22/2013 JD \$490.00 1.00 Review Lucasfilm production, confer w/O/C for Lucasfilm re 2/22/2013 JD production errors, negotiate supplemental production and download and organize on system. Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize 5.50 \$2,695.00 2/22/2013 JD potential exhibits and identify themes for deposition of R. Prajapati. \$1,395.00 3.00 2/23/2013 MH Document review. \$2,400.00 2.50 2/23/2013 **JRS** Review and revise letter. \$10,080.00 10.50 2/23/2013 **JRS** Prepare for Patrick Burke deposition; prepare for Shantanu Narayen deposition. \$1,860.00 4.00 2/24/2013 MH Document review. \$2,700.00 9.00 2/25/2013 GS Prepared deposition docs. 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/25/2013 AAReview documents. 8.00 \$3,720.00 2/25/2013 MH Review documents. Prepare for Patrick Burke deposition; prepare for Shantanu \$11,808.00 12.30 2/25/2013 **JRS** Narayen deposition. \$600.00 1.00 Case management/status conference call with co-lead counsel; 2/25/2013 LJL

prep for same.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page67 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

2/25/2013	LJL	Multiple conferences / phone calls with J. Dallal, S. Schalman-Bergen, M. Pereira-Heinrich re document review and deposition prep.	1.50	\$900.00
2/25/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and identify themes for deposition of P. Burke.	7.90	\$3,871.00
2/25/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.60	\$294.00
2/25/2013	JD	Review, collect and circulate documents for use as potential exhibits for upcoming depositions of A. Dramen and R. Okamoto.	0.80	\$392.00
2/25/2013	JD	Review case record, case correspondence and calendar and draft and circulate email summary of upcoming tasks.	0.70	\$343.00
2/26/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/26/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/26/2013	JRS	Patrick Burke deposition; prepare for Shantanu Narayen deposition.	15.80	\$15,168.00
2/26/2013	LJL	Travel to San Jose for hearing on motion to compel; attend hearing; return to office (conference w/ D. Harvey along the way re deposition and discovery strategy).	4.70	\$2,820.00
2/26/2013	LJL	Research and draft 30(b)(6) depo notices re document authentication issues and stipulation re same.	3.00	\$1,800.00
2/26/2013	JD	Assist at P. Burke deposition.	11.50	\$5,635.00
2/26/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.40	\$196.00
2/26/2013	JD	Summarize P. Burke deposition, collect additional documents, confer w/O/C re scheduling, and answer questions re strategy/themes for R. Okamoto deposition.	1.77	\$867.30
2/26/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with L. Leebove re motion to compel.	0.20	\$192.00
2/27/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/27/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
2/27/2013	JRS	Prepare for Shantanu Narayen deposition.	6.50	\$6,240.00
2/27/2013	LJL	Work on Plaintiffs' discovery requests to all defendants; revise and finalize.	2.50	\$1,500.00
2/27/2013	ĵD	Confer w/L. Leebove and answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.30	\$147.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page68 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 67 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.50 \$245.00 Review Rule 26 disclosures and depo transcripts and draft email 2/27/2013 JD summary re decisions re seeking additional discovery re Intel recruiting practices. Review late-produced Okamoto documents identified by 2.00 \$980.00 JD 2/27/2013 recruiters, collect, select and organize, and coordinate remote printing and delivery of emergency exhibit supplement for R. Okamoto deposition. 11.80 \$5,782.00 2/27/2013 JD Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and identify themes for deposition of S. Narayen per requests and instructions of J. Saveri. 8.00 \$3,720.00 Review documents. 2/28/2013 AA \$3,720.00 8.00 2/28/2013 MH Review documents. \$12,960.00 2/28/2013 **JRS** Prepare for and take Shantanu Narayen deposition. 13.50 1.00 \$960.00 2/28/2013 **JRS** Case management. 0.70 \$672.00 Review and revise interrogatories. 2/28/2013 **JRS** \$750.00 Review, revise CMC statement and correspondence w/ co-counsel 1.25 2/28/2013 LJL re same \$7,620.00 12.70 Multiple conferences w/ JDD, SSB re discovery, depositions, 2/28/2013 LJL documents, case and deposition strategy; review documents and deposition transcripts for A. Dramen deposition prep and prepare exhibits for A. Dramen deposition. \$196.00 Confer w/O/C for Intel re deposition scheduling; write and 0.40 2/28/2013 JD circulate email summary. 1.10 \$539.00 Review production and deposition exhibits and draft and circulate 2/28/2013 JD email summary of the state of discovery of compensation information for Apple, Intel, Adobe and Lucasfilm. 0.80 \$392.00 Search for and review A. Dramen documents in Google production JD 2/28/2013 and prepare email summary of findings per request of L. Leebove. 11.70 \$5,733.00 Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize 2/28/2013 JD potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of D. Baja. 0.20 \$192.00 Review and revise case management conference statement; 2/28/2013 **JRS** conference with L. Leebove. 0.30 \$90.00 3/1/2013 GS **ECF Filings** 8.00 \$3,720.00 3/1/2013 AA Review documents. \$3,720.00 8.00 Review documents. 3/1/2013 MH

# 

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/1/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey re Adobe.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/1/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
3/1/2013	JRS	Schedule depositions.	0.90	\$864.00
3/1/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.80	\$3,648.00
3/1/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Michael Tubach; telephone conference with Frank Hinman.	1.00	\$960.00
3/1/2013	JRS	Review Amgen.	0.30	\$288.00
3/1/2013	LJL	Prep for A. Dramen deposition	3.50	\$2,100.00
3/1/2013	LJL	Take deposition of A. Dramen.	2.60	\$1,560.00
3/1/2013	LJL	Conferences/correspondence w/ JDD and JRS re deponents and potential release of deponents.	0.50	\$300.00
3/1/2013	JD	Depose D. Baja.	12.00	\$5,880.00
3/1/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of D. Baja.	1.50	\$735.00
3/2/2013	JD	Deposition scheduling, confirm dates w/court reporter, review discovery record and prepare detailed summary of all outstanding depositions and requests of Apple, Adobe, Intel and Lucasfilm witnesses per request of L. Leebove.	1.70	\$833.00
3/3/2013	JD	Calls w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re discovery strategy planning and scheduling for upcoming depositions.	0.90	\$441.00
3/4/2013	GS	Prepared depo exhibits.	6.00	\$1,800.00
3/4/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/4/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/4/2013	LJL	Prep for conference call and conference call.	1.30	\$780.00
3/4/2013	LJL	Legal research re legitimacy of collaborations as defense to antitrust liability; draft/revise/finalize memo re deposition quesitoning re collaborations and distribute to co-counsel.	3.50	\$2,100.00
3/4/2013	LJL	Review Amgen decision; research local rules re statement of decision; prepare statement of decision and proposed stipulation for defense counsel to filing statement of decision; circulate to defense counsel; correspond w/ defense counsel re same; finalize and file statement of recent decision, email courtesy copy, take hard copy courtesy copy to FedEx.	3.40	\$2,040.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page70 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 69

1004-1 Matter Number: 4.60 \$2,760.00 Correspondence/conference w/ G. Saveri, JDD re McKell 3/4/2013 LJL documents for potential deposition exhibits; review documents. \$294.00 0.60 Review depo transcripts and prepare and circulate memo on 3/4/2013 JD impeaching collaborative justification testimony per request of L. Leebove. 0.60 \$294.00 Confer w/L. Leebove and D. Harvey to coordinate review of large 3/4/2013 JD late production of D. McKell documents. Draft, edit and serve deposition notices for upcoming Apple \$245.00 0.50 3/4/2013 JD witness depos. 0.50 \$245.00 3/4/2013 Review factual background and prepare email summary re JD requested depositions of G. Palangian and D. Bryant. 11.30 \$5,537.00 Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize 3/4/2013 JD potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of D. Alvarez. 0.80 \$768.00 3/4/2013 **JRS** Review Amgen; telephone conference with L. Leebove. \$3,720.00 8.00 3/5/2013 AAReview documents. \$3,720.00 8.00 3/5/2013 MH Review documents. Begin preparation / review documents and prior testimony re Intel \$3,360.00 5.60 3/5/2013 LJL re D. McKell \$2,040.00 3.40 3/5/2013 LJL Begin reviewing declaraton / documents re Burmeister \$120.00 0.20 phone conference w/ J. Dallal re Alvarez deposition, McKell 3/5/2013 LJL documents, depo scheduling, CMC statement. 0.20 \$98.00 Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and 3/5/2013 JD priorities. 0.50 \$245.00 Review discovery record and prepare email summary of 3/5/2013 JD background information re delay in production of S. Condiotti documents per request of L. Leebove. \$392.00 Run searches and prepare email instructions for collection of 0.80 3/5/2013 JD documents for R. Bechtel deposition. 9.50 \$4,655.00 3/5/2013 JD Depose D. Alvarez. 0.80 \$768.00 **JRS** 3/5/2013 Case management. \$1,650.00 5.50 3/6/2013 GS Prepared depo exhibits. \$3,720.00 8.00 3/6/2013 AAReview documents. \$3,720.00 8.00 3/6/2013 MH Review documents.

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page71 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:
 70

3/6	/2013	LJL	Review documents and pleadings re Intel, Apple, and Lucas for McKell and Burmeister and Beck depositions.	8.40	\$5,040.00
3/6	/2013	LJL	Oversee, revise, negotiate, discuss filing of Case Mgt. Conference statement between/among opposing counsel and co-counsel.	5.20	\$3,120.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Run searches and prepare email instructions for collection of documents for L. Beck deposition.	0.50	\$245.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Email and phone correspondence with O/C re upcoming Adobe and Intel depositions.	0.70	\$343.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Monitor, answer questions re, and draft proposed sections for CMC statement.	1.30	\$637.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Revise, update and circulate Apple recruiter deposition outline.	0.60	\$294.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.50	\$245.00
3/6	/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of R. Bechtel.	10.00	\$4,900.00
3/6	/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.30	\$288.00
3/6	/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions; conference with J. Dallal.	2.30	\$2,208.00
3/7	/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/7	/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/7	/2013	LJL	Prepare for deposition of L. Beck.	9.10	\$5,460.00
3/7	//2013	LJL	Multiple correspondence and discussions w/ J. Dallal, K. Dermody re J. Sessions corrections to CMC statement.	0.60	\$360.00
3/7	/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of R. Bechtel.	1.60	\$784.00
3/7	/2013	JD	Depose R. Bechtel.	10.50	\$5,145.00
3/7	/2013	JD	Call O/C for Lucasfilm re Joint Statement to correct the record.	0.30	\$147.00
3/7	7/2013	JD	Draft, edit and serve deposition notices for upcoming Lucasfilm and Adobe witness depos.	0.50	\$245.00
3/7	//2013	JRS	Case management; conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00
3/7	//2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.10	\$2,976.00
3/8	3/2013	GS	ECF Filing	0.10	\$30.00
3/8	3/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00

## Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page72 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

3/8/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/8/2013	LJL	Prepare for Beck deposition.	3.60	\$2,160.00
3/8/2013	LJL	Deposition of L. Beck.	7.40	\$4,440.00
3/8/2013	LJL	Conferences and correspondence w/ J. Dallal, S. Schalman-Bergen, co-counsel re planning, status, strategy, case management.	1.50	\$900.00
3/8/2013	LJL	Discussions, review and correpsondence w/ J. Dallal, K. Dermody, co-counsel re revisions to CMC statement.	0.40	\$240.00
3/8/2013	JD	Phone and email correspondence with team members and O/C re joint statement to correct record; negotiation with O/C; draft and edit proposals for revisions and additions.	3.00	\$1,470.00
3/8/2013	JD	Confer w/court reporter, S. Schalman-Bergen, J. Saveri, and O/C re scheduling of upcoming depositions. Update case calendar.	1.50	\$735.00
3/8/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits for deposition of D. Streeter.	4.50	\$2,205.00
3/8/2013	JRS	Organize depositions; conference with J. Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
3/8/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.40	\$384.00
3/9/2013	LJL	Review Google documents re Facebook no-recruit effort and correspondence w/ K. Dermody, A. Shaver and co-counsel re same.	0.80	\$480.00
3/9/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re pulling documents for upcoming depositions; review and respond to email discussion re inquiry into Google-Facebook negotiations re recruiting.	1.00	\$490.00
3/9/2013	JRS	Deposition preparation; conference with J. Dallal.	2.90	\$2,784.00
3/10/2013	GS	Prepared depo exhibits	4.00	\$1,200.00
3/10/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re scheduling, depositions, status; correspondence w/ K. Dermody, J. Dallal re deposition excerpts for Dr. Hallock.	0.50	\$300.00
3/10/2013	LJL	Burmeister deposition preparation.	1.70	\$1,020.00
3/10/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of D. McCarney.	4.10	\$2,009.00
3/10/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.90	\$931.00
3/10/2013	JD	Correspondence w/L. Leebove re depo scheduling and exhibits and selection of exhibits for K. Hallock.	0.50	\$245.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page73 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

3/10/20	13 JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.80	\$3,648.00
3/10/20	13 JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
3/11/20	13 GS	Prepared depo exhibits	9.00	\$2,700.00
3/11/20	13 AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/11/20	13 MH	Review documents.	3.00	\$1,395.00
3/11/20	13 MA	Deposition notices for McCarney & Burmeister.	0.75	\$225.00
3/11/20	13 LJL	Conference call re case status/strategy and discovery.	1.50	\$900.00
3/11/20	13 LJL	Review Okamoto and Horner deposition summaries.	0.17	\$102.00
3/11/20	13 LJL	Document review re Burmeister and Apple.	9.50	\$5,700.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of D. McCarney. Confer w/J. Saveri and O/C M. Tubach re release of D. McCarney in exchange for removal from Rule 26 disclosures.	6.40	\$3,136.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Confer w/L. Leebove re identification of documents and strategy for deposition of S. Burmeister.	0.50	\$245.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Confer w/O/C and team members re scheduling of depositions of N. Kessler and R. Goodwin.	0.50	\$245.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re depo strategy and scheduling.	0.40	\$196.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and call and email O/C re cancellation of G. Currey deposition.	0.40	\$196.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Advise M. Adriano on preparation of deposition notices.	0.30	\$147.00
3/11/20	13 JD	Conference call re case status/strategy and discovery.	1.50	\$735.00
3/11/20	13 JRS	Deposition scheduling; conference with J. Dallal.	0.70	\$672.00
3/11/20	13 JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.00	\$2,880.00
3/12/20	13 AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/12/20	13 MA	Fadell deposition preparation.	2.00	\$600.00
3/12/20	13 MA	Goodwin deposition preparation.	1.50	\$450.00
3/12/20	13 LJL	Document review.	10.00	\$6,000.00
3/12/20	013 JD	Review Apple production documents from custodial files of S. Burmeister in preparation for deposition.	6.20	\$3,038.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page74 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 73 Matter Number: 1004-1 1.20 \$588.00 3/12/2013 JD Confer w/J. Saveri and S. Schalman-Bergen re exhibits for Chizen deposition, provide instructions to M. Adriano and circulate exhibits and background documents. \$196.00 0.40 Confer w/O/C and court reporters re scheduling of Intel 3/12/2013 JD depositions. 3/12/2013 JD Confer w/J. Saveri and team members re additional Apple 0.50 \$245.00 deponents and discovery. 0.20 \$98.00 3/12/2013 Answer press inquiry; refer to J. Saveri. JD \$98.00 Call and email Kramm to request logins for team attorneys and 0.20 3/12/2013 JD paralegals. 0.80 \$392.00 Review case record and discovery correspondence and prepare 3/12/2013 JD comprehensive calendar list of all scheduled and outstanding depositions per request of J. Saveri. Train paralegal M. Adriano on Relativity document database and 1.00 \$490.00 3/12/2013 JD provide instructions re collection of deposition exhibits. Document review; team correspondence re new Intel production; 1.20 \$588.00 3/12/2013 JD confer w/J. Saveri, call O/C for Intel and conference call w/O/C for Intel re new outstanding production. Review and update case correspondence file. 1.80 \$882.00 3/12/2013 JD 2.30 \$2,208.00 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 3/12/2013 1.00 \$960.00 3/12/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with J. Dallal and Berger & Montague. 1.00 \$960.00 Case management; prepare for case management conference. 3/12/2013 JRS 0.30 \$288.00 3/12/2013 JRS Organize depositions. 8.00 \$3,720.00 3/13/2013 AA Review documents. 6.00 \$2,790.00 3/13/2013 MH Review documents. 12.00 \$3,600.00 3/13/2013 Chizen deposition preparation. MA 4.50 \$2,700.00 Travel to CMC, attend CMC, confer with co-counsel, return travel 3/13/2013 LJL to office. Review Burmeister documents, review prior Apple depositions, 4.50 \$2,700.00 3/13/2013 LJL prepare for deposition. \$2,205.00 4.50 Travel to CMC, attend CMC, confer with co-counsel, return travel 3/13/2013 JD to office. Run searches and prepare email instructions for collection of 1.50 \$735.00 3/13/2013 JD documents for T. Fadell and B. Chizen depositions.

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page75 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 74 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.20 \$98.00 3/13/2013 JD Compile and organize class rep depo transcripts on shared system; correspondence re missing transcripts. 0.60 \$294.00 3/13/2013 Correspondence w/Kramm and O/C re scheduling and JD arrangements for Adobe and Intel depositions Confer w/S. Schalman-Bergen and J. Saveri re Chizen deposition. 0.40 \$196.00 3/13/2013 JD 0.80 \$392.00 Review documents and summary email selected for Goodwin 3/13/2013 JD deposition; confer w/D. Ratner re collection of additional documents. Revise depo calendar and prepare email summary of document 1.00 \$490.00 3/13/2013 JD counts from recent production in advance of CMC per requests of J. Saveri and K. Dermody. 0.50 \$245.00 3/13/2013 JD Confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri and draft email re challenge to witness declarations. Prepare for and attend case management conference. 7.50 \$7,200.00 3/13/2013 **JRS** 3.80 \$3,648.00 3/13/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 8.00 \$3,720.00 3/14/2013 AAReview documents. 8.00 \$3,720.00 3/14/2013 MH Review documents. 3.50 \$1,050.00 3/14/2013 MA Burmeister deposition final preparation. 5.50 \$1,650.00 Chizen deposition final preparation. 3/14/2013 MA 4.00 \$1,200.00 3/14/2013 MA Goodwin deposition final preparation. 14.25 \$8,550.00 3/14/2013 LJL Deposition preparation. \$735.00 Calls and emails w/D. Harvey and M. Fichtner re Goodwin 1.50 3/14/2013 JD deposition. 0.80 \$392.00 Review proposed supplement to Plaintiffs' Rule 26 disclosures, 3/14/2013 JD identify suggested additions, draft emails re additions. \$294.00 0.60 Correspondence w/O/C and Kramm re scheduling for Goodwin 3/14/2013 JD and McKell depositions. 2.30 \$1,127.00 3/14/2013 JD Search for and identify additional materials on Apple-Adobe feud, circulate materials sent by S. Schalman-Bergen, confer w/J. Saveri, and draft detailed discovery letter to O/C G. Riley re additional Apple materials. 9.30 \$4,557.00 3/14/2013 Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize JD potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of R. Goodwin; travel to depo location. 6.20 \$5,952.00 3/14/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. Continued On Next Page

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/15/2013 AA Review documents. 8.00	\$3,720.00
3/15/2013 MH Review documents. 8.00	\$3,720.00
3/15/2013 MA Condiotti deposition pre-preparation. 3.75	\$1,125.00
3/15/2013 MA Fadell deposition preparation. 3.50	\$1,050.00
3/15/2013 LJL Burmeister deposition. 8.80	\$5,280.00
3/15/2013 JD Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize 2.00 potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of R. Goodwin.	\$980.00
3/15/2013 JD Prepare and circulate Goodwin depo summary. 1.00	\$490.00
3/15/2013 JD Confer w/L. Leebove re strategy for in-progress S. Burmeister deposition.	\$245.00
3/15/2013 JD Depose R. Goodwin; return travel. 5.50	\$2,695.00
3/15/2013 JRS Review documents; prepare for deposition. 8.00	\$7,680.00
3/15/2013 JRS Organize depositions; conference with J. Dallal. 0.30	\$288.00
3/15/2013 JRS Case management. 0.50	\$480.00
3/16/2013 MH Review documents. 8.00	\$3,720.00
3/17/2013 MH Review documents. 6.00	\$2,790.00
3/17/2013 LJL Phone calls and correspondence w/ co-counsel re scheduling. 0.40	\$240.00
3/17/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 2.10	\$1,029.00
3/17/2013 JD Emails w/co-counsel re preparation and scheduling for D. McKell 0.30 deposition.	\$147.00
3/17/2013 JD Run searches and prepare email instructions for collection of documents for R. James deposition.	\$294.00
3/18/2013 MA James deposition preparation. 6.00	\$1,800.00
3/18/2013 MA Brennan deposition final preparation. 5.50	\$1,650.00
3/18/2013 AA Review documents. 8.00	\$3,720.00
3/18/2013 MH Review documents. 8.00	\$3,720.00
3/18/2013 LJL Co-lead counsel conference call re status/strategy. 0.40	\$240.00
3/18/2013 LJL Conference w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re status/strategy, discovery and depositions.	\$240.00
3/18/2013 LJL Prepare for Condiotti deposition. 10.60  Continued On Next Page	\$6,360.00

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

		(9.1		
3/18/2013	JD	Draft, edit and serve deposition notices for upcoming Apple, Intel, Adobe and Lucasfilm witness depos.	1.20	\$588.00
3/18/2013	JD	Confer w/O/C and coordinate with co-counsel and court reporters re scheduling for upcoming depositions.	0.80	\$392.00
3/18/2013	JD	Run searches and prepare email instructions for collection of documents for R. James deposition.	0.60	\$294.00
3/18/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re strategy for upcoming depositions.	0.40	\$196.00
3/18/2013	JD	Weekly co-lead conference call re status/strategy.	0.40	\$196.00
3/18/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence, witness disclosures and document production and prepare summary memo re outstanding Adobe witness depositions and discovery needs for discovery conference per request of J. Saveri.	0.70	\$343.00
3/18/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.40	\$196.00
3/18/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of L. Brennan.	10.00	\$4,900.00
3/18/2013	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove re Lori Beck deposition.	0.30	\$288.00
3/18/2013	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove and J. Dallal; case management.	0.70	\$672.00
3/18/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	3.80	\$3,648.00
3/18/2013	JRS	Review and revise deposition notices.	0.20	\$192.00
3/18/2013	JRS	Prepare for call with Lieff, Cabraser, et al; call with Lieff, Cabraser, et al.	1.50	\$1,440.00
3/19/2013	MA	Coniotti deposition final preparation.	5.00	\$1,500.00
3/19/2013	MA	Fadell deposition final preparation.	3.50	\$1,050.00
3/19/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/19/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/19/2013	LJL	Prepare for Condiotti deposition.	11.50	\$6,900.00
3/19/2013	JD	Review case calendar; emails w/court reporters and O/C re coordination of depo scheduling.	0.50	\$245.00
3/19/2013	JD	Depose L. Brennan.	8.50	\$4,165.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page78 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

3/19/2013	JD	Review production documents, assist w/exhibit preparation,	1.50	\$735.00
		answer questions, circulate documents for T. Fadell deposition.		
3/19/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions.	7.70	\$7,392.00
3/19/2013	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove; conference with J. Dallal.	0.70	\$672.00
3/19/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
3/19/2013	JRS	Staff document review.	0.30	\$288.00
3/19/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition; conference with M. Adriano.	5.80	\$5,568.00
3/20/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/20/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/20/2013	LJL	Condiotti preparation.	1.60	\$960.00
3/20/2013	LJL	Deposition of S. Condiotti.	6.40	\$3,840.00
3/20/2013	MA	R. James deposition final preparation.	8.00	\$2,400.00
3/20/2013	JD	Deposition summary - P. Burke.	1.20	\$588.00
3/20/2013	JD	Deposition summary - L. Brennan.	0.70	\$343.00
3/20/2013	JD	Review new production documents, identify new exhibits, prepare exhibits and deliver to S. Condiotti deposition.	1.30	\$637.00
3/20/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.80	\$392.00
3/20/2013	JD	Emails and calls w/O/C for Adobe to negotiate schedule and locations for upcoming depositions.	0.60	\$294.00
3/20/2013	JD	Review documents.	4.00	\$1,960.00
3/20/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents and select/print/organize potential exhibits for deposition of R. James.	2.90	\$1,421.00
3/20/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	6.70	\$6,432.00
3/20/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
3/20/2013	JRS	Review deposition summary.	0.30	\$288.00
3/20/2013	JRS	Review Tony Fadell objections.	0.30	\$288.00
3/21/2013	MA	Hoffman deposition preparation.	5.00	\$1,500.00
3/21/2013	MA	Reeves deposition preparation.	2.00	\$600.00
3/21/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/21/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/21/2013	LJL	Document review.	5.80	\$3,480.00
3/21/2013	LJL	Discussions w/ J. Dallal, S. Schalman-Bergen re depositions and strategy.	0.70	\$420.00
3/21/2013	JD	Prepare list of potential additional deponents and explanations per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
3/21/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and S. Schalman-Bergen re case strategy re sharing of compensation information.	0.50	\$245.00
3/21/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities; train new document reviewer L. Kempner on coding procedures and priorities.	1.20	\$588.00
3/21/2013	JD	Collect and email documents for R. James deposition per requests of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
3/21/2013	JD	Collect and email documents for N. Kessler deposition per requests of S. Schalman-Bergen.	0.40	\$196.00
3/21/2013	JD	Coordinate depo scheduling with court reporters and team members.	0.30	\$147.00
3/21/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of B. Croll.	9.70	\$4,753.00
3/21/2013	JRS	Review discovery responses; conference with J. Dallal re discovery report.	0.80	\$768.00
3/21/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re James Warnock.	0.60	\$576.00
3/21/2013	JRS	Travel to Portland; prepare for depositions.	10.50	\$10,080.00
3/22/2013	GS	Prepared depo exhibits Lucas Various admin regarding Mansfield, Evangelista, Lucas/GWL docs, and others	8.00	\$2,400.00
3/22/2013	MA	Reeves deposition preparation.	2.00	\$600.00
3/22/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/22/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/22/2013	LJL	Document review.	9.10	\$5,460.00
3/22/2013	LJL	Phone call w/ JRS re deposition issues.	0.20	\$120.00
3/22/2013	LJL	Phone conferences with B. Glackin, B. Glackin & R. Mittelstaedt re discovery issues.	0.40	\$240.00
3/22/2013	LJL	Review and revise discovery report.	0.40	\$240.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page80 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 79

3/22/2013	LJL	Oversee discovery report revisions, negotiations, filing; multiple correspondence and calls with co-counsel, correspondence w/ opposing counsel re same.	2.50	\$1,500.00
3/22/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of B. Croll.	2.00	\$980.00
3/22/2013	JD	Depo strategy planning call and debriefing per request of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
3/22/2013	JD	Depose B. Croll; travel to and from Cupertino.	11.20	\$5,488.00
3/22/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition; take deposition; travel to San Francisco.	14.00	\$13,440.00
3/22/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer.	0.30	\$288.00
3/22/2013	JRS	Review deposition transcript.	0.80	\$768.00
3/22/2013	JRS	Discovery report; telephone conference with L. Leebove.	0.30	\$288.00
3/23/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/23/2013	JD	Review documents	1.00	\$490.00
3/23/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	8.30	\$7,968.00
3/24/2013	GS	Prepared depo exhibits George Lucas	8.00	\$2,400.00
3/24/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/24/2013	LJL	Review Intel / Arriada-Keiper documents.	1.50	\$900.00
3/24/2013	LJL	Document review re Arriada-Keiper (Adobe).	1.50	\$900.00
3/24/2013	JD	Review Adobe and Lucas production documents.	2.70	\$1,323.00
3/24/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.30	\$147.00
3/24/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	6.80	\$6,528.00
3/24/2013	JRS	Review contention interrogatories.	0.30	\$288.00
3/25/2013	GS	Prepared depo exhibits Evangelista	6.33	\$1,899.00
3/25/2013	MA	Reeves deposition final preparation.	3.50	\$1,050.00
3/25/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/25/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/25/2013	LJL	Document review; prepare for Reeves deposition.	8.40	\$5,040.00
3/25/2013	LJL	Prep for and Co-lead conference call.	0.70	\$420.00
3/25/2013	MA	Mansfield deposition final preparation.	4.00	\$1,200.00
		C. C. LO. North Dans		

Continued On Next Page

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page81 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/25/2013	LJL	Document review and deposition preparation for A. Reeves (Apple).	8.58	\$5,148.00
3/25/2013	LJL	Co-Lead conference call and brief preparation prior to.	0.50	\$300.00
3/25/2013	JD	Weekly co-lead conference call.	0.70	\$343.00
3/25/2013	JD	Review and coordinate review of Adobe and Lucas documents	8.00	\$3,920.00
3/25/2013	JD	Review and update draft letter to G. Riley per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
3/25/2013	JD	Emails with team members and O/C re depo scheduling.	0.40	\$196.00
3/25/2013	JD	Emails with team members and court reporters re assembling comprehensive depo list.	0.40	\$196.00
3/25/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.40	\$196.00
3/25/2013	JRS	Review supplemental discovery.	0.70	\$672.00
3/25/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
3/26/2013	MA	Arriada-Keiper deposition preparation.	3.00	\$900.00
3/26/2013	MA	Warnock deposition preparation.	2.50	\$750.00
3/26/2013	MA	Hoffman deposition final preparation.	5.00	\$1,500.00
3/26/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/26/2013	MH	Review documents.	4.00	\$1,860.00
3/26/2013	LJL	Prepare for Reeves and Arriada-Keiper depostiions.	7.00	\$4,200.00
3/26/2013	JD	Depo summary - B. Croll.	1.30	\$637.00
3/26/2013	JD	Search Adobe production for Adobe board of directors, select documents for depo exhibits and summarize per request of J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00
3/26/2013	JD	Search for and email re Intel privilege logs.	0.30	\$147.00
3/26/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.40	\$196.00
3/26/2013	JD	Emails and calls w/O/C for Intel and Adobe re depo scheduling.	0.60	\$294.00
3/26/2013	JD	Review and finalize discovery letter to G. Riley per request of J. Saveri	0.30	\$147.00
3/26/2013	JD	Prepare and serve deposition notices for Apple, Intel, Lucas, and Adobe witnesses.	0.80	\$392.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page82 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/26/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of K. Hoffman.	6.80	\$3,332.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition.	6.90	\$6,624.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Privilege log issues.	0.40	\$384.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Intel production issues.	0.50	\$480.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Organize discovery.	0.30	\$288.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Prepare for depositions; conference with L. Leebove re Arriada-Keiper.	5.70	\$5,472.00
3/26/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
3/27/2013	MA	Lucas deposition final preparation.	2.50	\$750.00
3/27/2013	MA	Arriada-Keiper deposition final preparation.	5.25	\$1,575.00
3/27/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/27/2013	MH	Review documents.	6.00	\$2,790.00
3/27/2013	LJL	Prepare for Arriada-Keiper deposition.	13.75	\$8,250.00
3/27/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of T. Evangelista.	4.00	\$1,960.00
3/27/2013	JD	Depose K. Hoffman.	7.50	\$3,675.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Prepare for Lucus and James Warnock depositions.	8.80	\$8,448.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Draft letter to George Riley.	0.30	\$288.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Review authenticity stipulation.	0.40	\$384.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Apple discovery issues; conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Reivew and revise initial disclosures.	0.60	\$576.00
3/27/2013	JRS	Review Comcast; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.30	\$1,248.00
3/28/2013	MA	Arriada-Keiper deposition preparation.	1.00	\$300.00
3/28/2013	MA	Evangelista deposition final preparation.	7.75	\$2,325.00
3/28/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/28/2013	MH	Review documents.	7.00	\$3,255.00
3/28/2013	LJL	Prep for deposition of R. Arriada-Keiper (Adobe).  Continued On Next Page	0.40	\$240.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page83 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 82

3/28/2013	LJL	Deposition of R. Arriada-Keiper (Adobe).	8.60	\$5,160.00
3/28/2013	LJL	Prep for A. Reeves (Apple) deposition.	3.20	\$1,920.00
3/28/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.20	\$98.00
3/28/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and prepare notices of deposition of D. Anderman and D. Bryant.	0.50	\$245.00
3/28/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of T. Evangelista; travel to depo location in Phoenix, AZ.	13.60	\$6,664.00
3/28/2013	JD	Finalize and arrange service of discovery letter re P. Schiller, Apple Town Hall videos etc. per instruction of J. Saveri.	0.20	\$98.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Travel to Salt Lake City; prepare for James Warnock deposition.	7.50	\$7,200.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Take George Lucas depositon.	9.50	\$9,120.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Organize depositons; case management.	0.60	\$576.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.50	\$480.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Draft letter to George Riley.	0.60	\$576.00
3/28/2013	JRS	Sheryl Sandberg issues.	0.20	\$192.00
3/29/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
3/29/2013	МН	Review documents.	5.00	\$2,325.00
3/29/2013	LJL	Travel to Palo Alto for Reeves deposition; deposition of A. Reeves; return travel to SF.	6.80	\$4,080.00
3/29/2013	LJL	Calls and correspondence with co-counsel re discovery status/strategy and discovery report.	1.40	\$840.00
3/29/2013	JD	Depose T. Evangelista; return travel from Phoenix, AZ.	14.50	\$7,105.00
3/29/2013	JD	Review case record, review documents, select/print/organize potential exhibits, and prepare themes and outline for deposition of T. Evangelista.	5.20	\$2,548.00
3/29/2013	JRS	Review stipulation and order; telephone conference with Dean Harvey.	0.70	\$672.00
3/29/2013	JRS	Review discovery response; case management.	0.50	\$480.00
3/29/2013	JRS	Review and revise interrogatory responses; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.00	\$960.00

Continued On Next Page

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page84 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

3/29/2013	JRS	Discovery organization; prepare for and take James Warnock deposition; travel to San Francisco.	14.50	\$13,920.00			
3/30/2013	МН	Review documents.	6.00	\$2,790.00			
3/30/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.50	\$480.00			
3/31/2013	МН	Review documents.	4.00	\$1,860.00			
3/31/2013	AA	Review documents.	4.00	\$1,860.00			
4/1/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00			
4/1/2013	JRS	Prepare for Deborah Streeter deposition.	2.50	\$2,400.00			
4/1/2013	MA	Streeter deposition preparation.	7.50	\$2,250.00			
4/1/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00			
4/1/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Co-lead conference call.	0.75	\$450.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Weekly co-lead conference call.	0.80	\$392.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Review case record and deposition testimony and assemble main documents re various Intel-Google agreements re recruiting.	1.50	\$735.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Deposition summary - Kim Hoffman.	1.00	\$490.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Deposition summary - T. Evangelista	1.20	\$588.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Review draft revisions of Plaintffs' interrogatory responses	0.50	\$245.00			
4/1/2013	JD	Review discovery record; update discovery file; read and review new ROG responses and prior ROG responses.	2.50	\$1,225.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Review rough transcripts and prepare summaries for Arriada-Keiper and Reeves	4.50	\$2,700.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Review interrogatories, review previous responses from LCHB; work on contention interrogatory responses.	1.60	\$960.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Review correspondence from Covington re Pixar production.	0.03	\$18.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Review J. Dallal's Evangelista summary and discussion re same.	0.30	\$180.00			
4/1/2013	LJL	Discussion w. J. Dallal re Google and Intel privilege log issues; review documents re same.	0.50	\$300.00			
4/2/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00			
4/2/2013	JRS	Discovery; prepare for Deborah Streeter.	1.00	\$960.00			
4/2/2013	MA	Exhibit preparation.	7.00	\$2,100.00			
Continued On Next Page							

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page85 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

4/2/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
4/2/2013	MH	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
4/2/2013	JD	Compare new ROG response submissions to prior ROG responses and create electronic comparison documents to identify changes per request of J. Saveri.	3.00	\$1,470.00
4/2/2013	JD	Review Intel privilege challenge correspondence and prepare email summary detailing documents showing Google-Intel agreements.	0.80	\$392.00
4/2/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.30	\$147.00
4/2/2013	JD	Email re press strategy re S. Sandberg.	0.20	\$98.00
4/2/2013	JD	Review production database and prepare email summary identifying source of exhibits for Streeter deposition; assist with deposition preparation.	0.80	\$392.00
4/2/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove, review correspondence and review production documents and case record; draft additional language for contention ROG responses.	2.20	\$1,078.00
4/2/2013	JD	Review deposition transcripts for materials related to compensation policies and salary structures for submission to expert K. Hallock.	2.00	\$980.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Review Lucasfilm responses/objections to second set of interrogatories; discussion w/ J. Dallal re same.	1.00	\$600.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey re Intel privilege issues.	0.10	\$60.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ K. Dermody, J. Dallal re Sanberg deposition; discussion J. Dallal re same.	0.25	\$150.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey re materials for Hallock and conferences w/ J. Dallal re same.	0.30	\$180.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich re hot documents and with J. Dallal re same; review documents.	0.20	\$120.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Review letter from G. Riley re Apple non-cooperation in discovery requests; discusison w/ J. Dallal re same.	0.30	\$180.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Work on contention interrogatory responses; conferences w/ J. Dallal re same; correspondence w/ D. Harvey re same.	1.00	\$600.00
4/2/2013	LJL	Review J. Dallal draft responses; correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal and B. Glackin re contention interrogatory responses and limiting agreement w/ R. Mittelstaedt.	0.50	\$300.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page86 of 125

5/7/2015 Client Number: 1010-3 Page: 85 1004-1 Matter Number: \$60.00 0.10 Review S. Buran subpoena; correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same. 4/2/2013 LJL 0.40 \$240.00 Review draft contention interrogatory responses; correspondence 4/2/2013 LJL w/ J. Dallal, J. SAveri, B. Glackin re same. \$2,400.00 2.50 Prepare for Deborah Streeter deposition. 4/3/2013 JRS \$900.00 3.00 4/3/2013 Streeter deposition preparation. MA \$2,100.00 7.00 4/3/2013 Exhibit preparation. MA 8.00 \$3,720.00 4/3/2013 Review documents. AA\$1,860.00 4.00 Review documents. 4/3/2013 MH \$196.00 Emails re upcoming deposition of P. Flynn. 0.40 4/3/2013 JD \$392.00 0.80 4/3/2013 JD Draft additional language, confer w/L. Leebove, and correspondence re contention ROG responses. Review transcripts; confer w/L. Leebove and S. Schalman-Bergen, 7.50 \$3,675.00 4/3/2013 JD and assemble spreadsheet of deposition excerpts re compensation policies and salary structures. \$3,480.00 5.80 4/3/2013 LJL Review compensation and HR deposition transcripts for excerpts to highlight for Hallock. Correspond w/ J. Saveri re contention interrogatory responses. 0.10 \$60.00 LJL 4/3/2013 0.10 \$60.00 Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re Sandberg issues. 4/3/2013 LJL \$240.00 0.40 Correspondence w/ co-lead counsel re privilege log issues w/ Intel 4/3/2013 LJL and discussion w/ J. Dallal re same. \$288.00 0.30 4/3/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$4,320.00 4.50 Prepare for Deborah Streeter deposition. 4/4/2013 **JRS** \$900.00 3.00 4/4/2013 MA Exhibit preparation. \$2,400.00 8.00 4/4/2013 Streeter deposition final preparation. MA \$3,720.00 8.00 Review documents. 4/4/2013 AA \$1,395.00 3.00 4/4/2013 MH Review documents. Review draft discovery report; discuss same with J. Dallal. \$120.00 0.20 LJL 4/4/2013 Multiple communications with co-counsel and J. Dallal re 0.30 \$180.00 4/4/2013 LJL discovery issues, interrogatory repsonses. 1.50 \$735.00 JD Complete and circulate comparison documents showing changes

Continued On Next Page

between new and prior versions of Defendants' ROG responses; review deposition transcripts for testimony re collaborations cited

4/4/2013

by Intel.

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page87 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

4/4/2013	JD	Prepare and serve deposition notice; confirm scheduling of D. Streeter deposition.	0.50	\$245.00
4/4/2013	JD	Review and comment on draft discovery report.	0.40	\$196.00
4/4/2013	JD	Locate additional Adobe production documents and assist w/preparation of D. Streeter exhibits per requests of J. Saveri and M. Adriano.	1.00	\$490.00
4/4/2013	JD	Review transcripts; update and circulate spreadsheet of excerpts re compensation policies and salary structure for witness K. Hallock.	4.20	\$2,058.00
4/4/2013	LJL	Law Docs Express presentation and call.	0.80	\$480.00
4/4/2013	LJL	Review transcripts for Hallock designations.	4.20	\$2,520.00
4/4/2013	LJL	Review Intel documents from D. Harvey, discuss same w/ J. Dallal and correpsond w/ co-counsel re same.	0.40	\$240.00
4/4/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich re potentially hot documents.	0.17	\$102.00
4/4/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
4/5/2013	JRS	Prepare for and take Deborah Streeter deposition.	10.50	\$10,080.00
4/5/2013	JRS	Reveiw and revise schedule.	0.30	\$288.00
4/5/2013	JRS	Review Order.	1.00	\$960.00
4/5/2013	MA	Exhibit preparation.	5.50	\$1,650.00
4/5/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
4/5/2013	МН	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
4/5/2013	LJL	Review and analyze Judge Koh's class certification order; conferences, phone calls, correspondence with J. Dallal, J. Saveri, co-counsel re same.	3.00	\$1,800.00
4/5/2013	JD	Read and analyze order on class certification; conference w/L. Leebove, J. Saveri and other class counsel re case status and strategy.	3.50	\$1,715.00
4/5/2013	JD	Phone calls w/O/C C. Brown and follow-up w/team members re extensions on depo errata sheets; review and update case calendar.	0.80	\$392.00
4/5/2013	JD	Answer questions and advise document reviewers on coding and priorities.	0.50	\$245.00
4/5/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, M. Pereira-Heinrich re potentially hot documents.	0.20	\$120.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page88 of 125

Client Number:

4/8/2013

LJL

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 87 1004-1 Matter Number: 0.20 \$120.00 LJL Review Pixar's supplemental responses/objections to 4/5/2013 interrogatories. Correspondence w/ co-lead counsel (KMD, BG) and J. Saveri re \$120.00 4/5/2013 LJL 0.20 case scheduling issues. \$420.00 Conference call with co-leads; follow-up call with B. Glackin, K. 0.70 4/5/2013 LJL Dermody. \$360.00 Conference call w/ co-leads and K. Hallock re class certification. 0.60 4/5/2013 LJL 2.50 \$2,400.00 Review order; telephone conference with co-counsel. 4/6/2013 **JRS** 4.00 \$1,860.00 4/6/2013 Review documents. MH 0.60 \$360.00 Review Schreiber rough transcript from D. Harvey 4/6/2013 LJL \$120.00 0.20 4/6/2013 LJL Correspondence among co-leads re scheduling and expert issues (re disclosure to defendants of experts on class certification). 5.00 \$2,325.00 4/7/2013 MH Review documents. \$120.00 4/7/2013 LJL Multiple additional correspondence among co-leads re scheduling 0.20 issues, experts on class certification. 0.10 \$60.00 Correspondence w/ J. Dallal re CMC. 4/7/2013 LJL 0.50 \$150.00 4/8/2013 GS **ECF Filings** 7.50 \$2,250.00 4/8/2013 MA Exhibit preparation. \$3,720.00 8.00 4/8/2013 AAReview documents. 6.00 \$5,760.00 4/8/2013 **JRS** Prepare for depositions. 0.30 \$288.00 4/8/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$1,440.00 1.50 4/8/2013 **JRS** Review and revise interrogatories. Prepare for case management conference; case management 6.50 \$3,185.00 4/8/2013 JD conference; travel to and from case management conference. \$490.00 1.00 JD Upload and organize deposition transcripts on TextMap per 4/8/2013 request of J. Saveri. 3.50 \$2,100.00 4/8/2013 LJL To San Jose for CMC, attend CMC, return travel. \$1,080.00 1.80 4/8/2013 LJL Work on discovery responses. \$120.00 0.20 Multiple correspondence w/ D. Harvey re scheduling conference 4/8/2013 LJL call.

More work on contention interrogatory responses.

1.60

\$960.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page89 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1010-3

1004-1

5/7/2015 Page: 88

6.50 \$6,240.00 Prepare for case management conference; case management JRS 4/8/2013 conference. \$3,360.00 3.50 4/8/2013 JRS Case management conference. \$2,250.00 7.50 4/9/2013 MA Exhibit preparation. \$3,720.00 8.00 4/9/2013 AA Review documents. 6.50 \$6,240.00 Prepare for depositions. 4/9/2013 **JRS** 0.70 \$672.00 Conference with J. Dallal. 4/9/2013 **JRS** \$768.00 0.80 4/9/2013 **JRS** Case management; conference with L. Leebove. \$245.00 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.50 4/9/2013 0.70 \$343.00 4/9/2013 JD Confer w/J. Saveri re Mansfield deposition and case status and strategy. \$882.00 Confer w/L. Leebove and A. Shaver; review discovery record re 1.80 4/9/2013 JD salary ranges; review and comment on draft letter by L. Leebove to O/C re production of range information. \$588.00 1.20 4/9/2013 JD Load transcripts into TextMap per request of J. Saveri; correspondence with court reporters re missing transcripts; resolve formatting issues. 0.50 \$245.00 Confer w/and instruct M. Adriano on preparation of hard-copy 4/9/2013 JD exhibit binders; review. Collect, read, review and summarize materials on Font Wars and \$980.00 2.00 4/9/2013 JD Apple-Adobe feud per request of J. Saveri. \$1,200.00 Revise interrogatory responses per J. Saveri comments. 2.00 LJL 4/9/2013 Draft letter to Riley, Purcell, Hinman, Kiernan re defendants' 0.80 \$480.00 4/9/2013 LJL production of salary range info. \$1,740.00 2.90 Review discovery record for information re defendants' salary 4/9/2013 LJL ranges; discussion with J. Dallal re same and correspondence w/ A. Shaver re same: revise letter to defendants and correpsondence w/ J. Saveri re same. 0.10 \$60.00 Additional correspondence w/ J. Saveri re letter to defendants re 4/9/2013 LJL salary ranges. \$78.00 0.13 4/9/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ A. Andreoli re potential hot documents. \$768.00 Discovery issues; conference with L. Leebove. 0.80 4/9/2013 **JRS** \$1,200.00 4.00 4/10/2013 MA Exhibit preparation. 4.50 \$1,350.00 4/10/2013 Mansfield deposition final preparation. MA

Continued On Next Page

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page90 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
JRS	Prepare for deposition.	9.50	\$9,120.00
JRS	Review and revise interrogatories.	0.80	\$768.00
JRS	Organize depositions.	0.30	\$288.00
JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.00	\$960.00
JD	Weekly co-lead conference call.	0.80	\$392.00
JD	Review draft contention ROGs, collect and summarize documents re possible Apple-Lucasfilm agreement; correspondence re same.	0.80	\$392.00
JD	Emails w/O/C and court reporters to confirm scheduling for Mansfield deposition; draft and serve deposition notice.	0.50	\$245.00
JD	Assist in preparation and assembly of exhibits for Mansfield deposition; search production database and collect and summarize documents re Silver Bullet List; read, review and summarize references to B. Mansfield in prior depo transcripts per request of J. Saveri.	5.50	\$2,695.00
LJL	Additional revisions to draft responses to interrogatories; correspondence w/ D. Harvey re same.	0.80	\$480.00
LJL	Review discovery record re agreements between defendants; multiple discussions of same with J. Dallal; correspondence w/ D. Harvey (6).	3.40	\$2,040.00
LJL	Final revisions to letter to Riley, Purcell, et al. re defendants' production of salary range information; distribute.	0.40	\$240.00
LJL	Review Eustace transcript re Apple/Google; correpsondence w/ D. Harvey.	0.60	\$360.00
LJL	Review correspondence from C. Brown to K. Dermody re Apple's salary range production; discuss same w/ J. Dallal; pull and review documents referenced.	0.50	\$300.00
LJL	Review G. Lucas transcript from J. Saveri.	1.10	\$660.00
LJL	Correspondence w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich, J. Dallal re hot documents.	0.20	\$120.00
MA	Exhibit preparation.	5.75	\$1,725.00
1411 1			
AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
	JRS JRS JRS JRS JD JD JD LJL LJL LJL LJL LJL LJL LJL LJ	Prepare for deposition.  Review and revise interrogatories.  Organize depositions.  Telephone conference with co-counsel.  Weekly co-lead conference call.  Review draft contention ROGs, collect and summarize documents re possible Apple-Lucasfilm agreement; correspondence re same.  Emails w/O/C and court reporters to confirm scheduling for Mansfield deposition; draft and serve deposition notice.  JD Assist in preparation and assembly of exhibits for Mansfield deposition; search production database and collect and summarize references to B. Mansfield in prior depo transcripts per request of J. Saveri.  LJL Additional revisions to draft responses to interrogatories; correspondence w/ D. Harvey re same.  LJL Review discovery record re agreements between defendants; multiple discussions of same with J. Dallal; correspondence w/ D. Harvey (6).  LJL Final revisions to letter to Riley, Purcell, et al. re defendants' production of salary range information; distribute.  LJL Review Eustace transcript re Apple/Google; correpsondence w/ D. Harvey.  LJL Review correspondence from C. Brown to K. Dermody re Apple's salary range production; discuss same w/ J. Dallal; pull and review documents referenced.  LJL Review G. Lucas transcript from J. Saveri.  LJL Correspondence w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich, J. Dallal re hot documents.	Prepare for deposition.  Prepare for deposition.  Review and revise interrogatories.  Organize depositions.  Organize depositions.  Discrepance conference with co-counsel.  Discrepance depositions.  Discrepance conference with co-counsel.  Discrepance depositions described in the possible deposition of the possible Apple-Lucasfilm agreement; correspondence re same.  Discrepance deposition; draft and serve deposition notice.  Discrepance deposition; draft and serve deposition notice

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page91 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

4/11/2013	LJL	Follow up call w/ D. Harvey re discovery report; review same; correspondence w/ J.Saveri re same; search for correspondence between Plaintiffs and OMM re Town Hall production.	0.20	\$120.00
4/11/2013	JRS	Prepare for Bob Mansfield deposition; e-mail with counsel.	5.20	\$4,992.00
4/11/2013	JRS	Prepare for deposition; take deposition.	10.50	\$10,080.00
4/11/2013	JRS	Review and revise interrogatories.	0.80	\$768.00
4/11/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.40	\$384.00
4/11/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery report.	1.00	\$960.00
4/11/2013	JD	Prepare list of questions/deposition themes for deposition of B. Mansfield.	0.80	\$392.00
4/11/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove re case status/strategy.	0.60	\$294.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re Hallock status.	0.10	\$60.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Review discovery record notes, discussions with J. Dallal, correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri re Merlin, Mansfield deposition issues.	0.40	\$240.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Review C. Richardson correspondence re Pixar salary range information.	0.10	\$60.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich re hot documents.	0.20	\$120.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Review redline from D. Harvey of interrogatory responses; correspondence re same.	0.20	\$120.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Draft, discuss, revise, finalize letter to C. Brown re Apple salary range information.	1.10	\$660.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri re Apple Town Hall meetings.	0.20	\$120.00
4/11/2013	LJL	Multiple correspondence w/ J. Saveri re discovery report; review correspondence as pertains to same.	0.30	\$180.00
4/12/2013	AA	Review documents.	8.00	\$3,720.00
4/12/2013	LJL	On call re Discovery Report filing; multiple correspondence with K. Dermody, L. Cisneros, opposing counsel re changes to Discovery Report and re filing same.	2.00	\$1,200.00
4/12/2013	LJL	Co-lead conference call re discovery status/strategy re interrogatory responses and trial strategy.	1.50	\$900.00

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/7/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 91

4/12/2013	LJL	Work on discovery report; review correspondence from F. Busch and correspondence w/ A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re same; review Intel salary range info from F. Busch; correpsondence w/ F. Busch re salary range information; review correspondence from J. Sessions re Lucasfilm salary range information and review/analyze documents identified in Sessions letter; correspondence w/ co-counsel re same; letter to J. Sessions re Lucasfilm salary range information; review depositions (Condiotti, Maupin) re salary range information and exhibits.	3.70	\$2,220.00
4/12/2013	LJL	Work on Interrogatory responses; multiple correspondence and conversations w/ B. Glackin, D. Harvey, J. Dallal re same; finalize and serve.	1.00	\$600.00
4/12/2013	JRS	Expert issues; telephone conference with co-counsel.	2.50	\$2,400.00
4/12/2013	JRS	Discovery issues; review and revise interrogatories; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.70	\$1,632.00
4/12/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
4/12/2013	MA	Exhibit preparation.	4.50	\$1,350.00
4/12/2013	MA	Lucasfilm document organization.	0.50	\$150.00
4/12/2013	JD	All-hands call re contention ROG responses and outstanding discovery issues.	1.50	\$735.00
4/12/2013	JD	Review discovery report drafts and emails; review discovery record; confer w/L. Leebove.	1.20	\$588.00
4/12/2013	JD	Search document production for Lucasfilm salary range documents identified in correspondence w/O/C per request of L. Leebove.	0.50	\$245.00
4/12/2013	JD	Review deposition transcripts and exhibits for background information of Adobe-Apple agreement to ascertain start dates per request of J. Saveri.	1.20	\$588.00
4/12/2013	JD	Review and comment on drafts of contention ROG responses.	0.80	\$392.00
4/12/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.60	\$294.00
4/14/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
4/15/2013	LJL	Co-lead conference call.	0.35	\$210.00
4/15/2013	JRS	Case management; discovery issues.	1.60	\$1,536.00
4/15/2013	AA	Document review.	2.00	\$930.00
4/15/2013	LJL	Review A. Dramen errata.	0.10	\$60.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page93 of 125

5/7/2015

Page: 92

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

4/15/2013	LJL	Review/database search for salary range documents; correspondence w/ A. Shaver, J. Dallal re same.	2.10	\$1,260.00
4/15/2013	LJL	Discussions w/ J. Dallal re salary range information; draft letter; review J. Dallal revisions to same.	1.30	\$780.00
4/15/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri re potential additional Apple discovery P. Schiller, town hall meetings.	0.10	\$60.00
4/15/2013	JD	Review case calendar and open discovery issues and prepare and circulate weekly call agenda; conference call with co-lead counsel.	0.90	\$441.00
4/15/2013	JD	Review letter from O/C F. Busch re Intel production of salary range information and confer w/L. Leebove.	0.30	\$147.00
4/15/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re requests for Apple town hall materials and additional discovery re P. Schiller	0.20	\$98.00
4/15/2013	JD	Review Court order re salary range information declarations and update case calendar.	0.30	\$147.00
4/15/2013	JD	Review draft discovery letter prepared by L. Leebove; review prior correspondence; collect and review all range documents identified by Apple previously; confer w/L. Leevove; redraft, review, edit, finalize and send letter to Apple re insufficiency of range material production.	6.50	\$3,185.00
4/15/2013	LJL	Review Order from Judge Koh re discovery; correspondence re same.	0.10	\$60.00
4/16/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
4/16/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey and J. Dallal re Apple's production of Town Hall materials.	0.20	\$120.00
4/16/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.90	\$931.00
4/16/2013	JD	Update and review chart of custodians and sources to reflect late and recently produced documents in advance of CMC and discovery reports.	0.60	\$294.00
4/16/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and collect, organize and circulate all Apple salary range materials.	0.60	\$294.00
4/16/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence and documents circulated by A. Shaver and L. Leebove and prepare draft discovery report sections regarding production of salary range materials by Apple, Intel, and Lucas.	4.00	\$1,960.00
4/17/2013	MA	Exhibit preparation.	2.00	\$600.00
4/17/2013	LJL	Work on discovery report; multiple conversations with J. Dallal re same; review/revise J. Dallal sections re same.	1.50	\$900.00

#### Continued On Next Page

Client Number: 1010-3 5/7/2015 Page: 93 Matter Number: 1004-1

4/17/2013	LJL	Legal research/analysis re proof of common impact in antitrust cases.	2.80	\$1,680.00
4/17/2013	LJL	Further work on discovery report and correspondence among co-leads re same.	1.00	\$600.00
4/17/2013	LJL	Analysis of deposition coding issues for class certification, round 2; review list from D. Harvey re same.	0.90	\$540.00
4/17/2013	JD	Review discovery correspondence, documents circulated by A. Shaver and L. Leebove, S. Schalman-Bergen memo and S. Kuz depo transcript and prepare draft discovery report sections regarding production of salary range materials by Apple, Intel, and Lucas.	4.50	\$2,205.00
4/17/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.90	\$441.00
4/17/2013	JD	Review and propose edits to revised draft discovery report sections.	0.80	\$392.00
4/17/2013	JD	Review and summarize discovery letter and late production by Google per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
4/17/2013	JD	Review proposed coding sheet sent by D. Harvey and prepare list of proposed revisions in advance of renewed cass cert motion filing.	0.50	\$245.00
4/17/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	6.50	\$3,185.00
4/18/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with expert; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.00	\$960.00
4/18/2013	JRS	Class issues.	0.80	\$768.00
4/18/2013	JRS	Settlement.	1.00	\$960.00
4/18/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery report.	1.50	\$1,440.00
4/18/2013	LJL	Work on coding system for class certification deposition coding project.	0.70	\$420.00
4/18/2013	LJL	Review discovery draft report and discuss correspondence re same w/ J. Dallal.	0.40	\$240.00
4/18/2013	LJL	Conference call w/ experts (Leamer/Johnson).	1.00	\$600.00
4/18/2013	LJL	Review incoming correspondence from J. Sessions re Lucasfilm salary range info; discussions w/ J. Dallal re same	0.70	\$420.00
4/18/2013	LJL	Review record of Lucasfilm productions; discussions w/ J. Dallal re same.	0.30	\$180.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page95 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

4/18/2013	LJL	Additional work on coding for class certification issues.	1.30	\$780.00
4/18/2013	JD	Review and edit draft discovery report and circulate proposed line edits and substantive revisions; confer w/L. Leebove.	2.50	\$1,225.00
4/18/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.40	\$196.00
4/18/2013	JD	Review letter sent by O/C J. Sessions, collect and research production history of purported pay range documents, confer w/L. Leebove re same.	2.00	\$980.00
4/18/2013	JD	Confer w/D. Harvey and L. Leebove and revise, discuss and exchange proposed coding schemes for analysis of transcripts for class cert briefing.	1.80	\$882.00
4/18/2013	JD	Review proposed task allocation by D. Harvey; team conference call re briefing tasks.	0.50	\$245.00
4/18/2013	JD	Review and summarize late Apple production.	0.40	\$196.00
4/19/2013	JRS	Class issues.	1.00	\$960.00
4/19/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery report; conference with J. Dallal.	1.50	\$1,440.00
4/19/2013	LJL	Multiple phone calls, conferences w/ J.Dallal, correspondence w/ co-counsel and opposing counsel re discovery report.	2.07	\$1,242.00
4/19/2013	LJL	Coding deposition transcripts for class certification issues.	5.75	\$3,450.00
4/19/2013	JD	Finalize depo transcript coding sheet, confer w/L. Leebove and D. Harvey, incorporate late edits, prepare and send replica TextMap database to co-lead counsel.	1.60	\$784.00
4/19/2013	JD	Review and revise draft discovery report for circulation to defendants; incorporate team members' edits and conference with J. Saveri.	1.50	\$735.00
4/19/2013	JD	Collect and circulate Apple town hall materials.	0.20	\$98.00
4/19/2013	JD	Confer via phone and email with team members and counsel for all defendants; draft, propose, revise, and circulate revisions; review, edit, obtain signoff on, and file final joint discovery report through ECF system.	10.50	\$5,145.00
4/19/2013	LJL	Work on TextMap; multiple correspondence/discussions w/ D. Harvey, J. Dallal, re same.	1.20	\$720.00
4/22/2013	LJL	Review and code depositions for class certification phase 2.	8.30	\$4,980.00
4/22/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	5.50	\$2,695.00
4/22/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.80	\$882.00

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

4/22/2013	JRS	Expert issues; review drafts; case management.	3.80	\$3,648.00
4/23/2013	LJL	Reviewing and coding Lucas and Apple depositions for class certification.	8.40	\$5,040.00
4/23/2013	JD	Confer w/S. Schalman-Bergen re coding for Intel and Adobe depositions.	0.40	\$196.00
4/23/2013	JD	Collect and review Apple range documents and confer w/L. Leebove, K. Dermody and experts re preparation of Apple salary range charts per instructions of O/C for Apple.	2.50	\$1,225.00
4/23/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	7.50	\$3,675.00
4/23/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.50	\$480.00
4/23/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.50	\$480.00
4/23/2013	JRS	Prepare for expert call.	1.80	\$1,728.00
4/23/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	0.30	\$288.00
4/24/2013	LJL	Conference call with experts; follow-up co-lead conference call re experts.	1.53	\$918.00
4/24/2013	LJL	Reviewing and coding deposition transcripts for class certification.	9.40	\$5,640.00
4/24/2013	JD	Draft, circulate, edit, finalize and send discovery letter re Lucasfilm salary range information to O/C J. Sessions.	1.60	\$784.00
4/24/2013	JD	Draft, circulate, edit, finalize and send discovery letter re Lucasfilm salary range information to O/C F. Busch.	0.80	\$392.00
4/24/2013	JD	Calls w/A. Silva and confer w/team re charts of Apple range data prepared by EconOne, other ways of sorting the data and usefulness in class cert briefing.	1.80	\$882.00
4/24/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	6.50	\$3,185.00
4/24/2013	GS	Updated exhibits binders/index	8.00	\$2,400.00
4/24/2013	JRS	Telephone conference re experts.	1.50	\$1,440.00
4/24/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.30	\$288.00
4/25/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.67	\$201.00
4/25/2013	JD	Call O/C C. Brown to request confirmation by Apple of Apple pay range charts prepared by experts.	0.40	\$196.00
4/25/2013	JD	Upload and organize discovery request and response documents on firm system.	0.40	\$196.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page97 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 96 1004-1 Matter Number: 0.40 \$196.00 Confer w/team members re requesting Apple confirmation of 4/25/2013 JD range charts prepared by experts. \$588.00 Confer w/L. Leebove re talking points for discussion of 1.20 4/25/2013 JD Defendants withholding compensation decisionmaking documents; review discovery requests and responses to confirm compensation decisionmaking within the scope of requests. Draft, revise and circulate discovery report sections re outstanding 1.50 \$735.00 4/25/2013 JD Apple and Lucasfilm discovery. Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class 5.30 \$2,597.00 4/25/2013 JD certification in advance of revised motion for class certification. 0.70 \$672.00 4/25/2013 **JRS** Case management. 1.00 \$960.00 **JRS** Class certification briefing. 4/25/2013 0.80\$768.00 Review and revise draft discovery report. **JRS** 4/25/2013 \$3,450.00 5.75 Coding Lucasfilm deposition transcripts for class certification. 4/26/2013 LJL \$1,440.00 Reviewing and coding deposition transcripts for class certification. 2.40 4/26/2013 LJL \$98.00 0.20 Review and update case correspondence file. JD 4/26/2013 \$1,715.00 3.50 4/26/2013 JD Draft, revise, edit, confer with team members re, and send draft discovery report to Defendants. 1.80 \$882.00 Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class 4/26/2013 JD certification in advance of revised motion for class certification. Confer via phone and email with team members and counsel for all 7.70 \$3,773.00 JD 4/26/2013 defendants; draft, propose, revise, and circulate revisions; review, edit, obtain signoff on, and file final joint discovery report through ECF system. 0.50 \$480.00 **JRS** 4/26/2013 Case management. 1.00 \$960.00 **JRS** Settlement issues; choose mediators. 4/26/2013 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** Review and revise draft discovery report. 4/26/2013 \$960.00 1.00 Review Kevin Hallock report. **JRS** 4/26/2013 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** Review Kevin Hallock report. 4/27/2013 1.80 \$1,080.00 Multiple conference calls (with and without experts) re expert 4/29/2013 LJL analysis and strategy. \$2,460.00 Review Lucasfilm background materials (deposition excerpts and 4.10 4/29/2013 LJL documents); work on Lucasfilm and Apple inserts for brief.

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

4/29/2013	LJL	Multiple discussions with J. Dallal re salary range documents and search for same for K. Hallock.	0.60	\$360.00
4/29/2013	LJL	Review rough draft of brief from D. Harvey.	0.20	\$120.00
4/29/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.40	\$196.00
4/29/2013	JD	Call w/O/C C. Brown and confer w/J. Saveri re extensions on depo errata sheets.	0.40	\$196.00
4/29/2013	JD	Compile and send charts of Apple and Intel salary range data to expert K. Hallock.	0.30	\$147.00
4/29/2013	JD	Search for and compile depo excerpts and relevant exhibits for K. Hallock; confer w/L. Leebove.	1.30	\$637.00
4/29/2013	JD	Review draft outline for revised class cert brief.	0.30	\$147.00
4/29/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	4.30	\$2,107.00
4/29/2013	JD	Draft and revise Intel draft brief section; review Intel deposition transcripts and background materials.	1.40	\$686.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Coding Lucasfilm and Apple deposition transcripts re class certification project.	5.50	\$3,300.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Review rought draft of brief from D. Harvey.	0.20	\$120.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ co-leads (KMD, BG, JRS, DMH) re class definition issues and Leamer.	0.20	\$120.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Multiple emails w/ D. Harvey re case management/expert issues.	0.20	\$120.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ G. Paige re extension on deadline for Condiotti deposition errata.	0.10	\$60.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Correspondence and discussion w/ J. Dallal re letter from J. Sessions and Lucasfilm's production of report re job codes, ranges, grades.	0.30	\$180.00
4/30/2013	LJL	Additional coding of deposition transcripts for class certification.	1.00	\$600.00
4/30/2013	JD	Draft and revise Intel draft brief section; review Intel deposition transcripts and background materials.	0.80	\$392.00
4/30/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	5.10	\$2,499.00
4/30/2013	JD	Correspondence re and review depo excerpt coding by S. Schalman-Bergen for class cert issues.	0.50	\$245.00
4/30/2013	JD	Calls and emails w/O/C C. Brown re extensions on depo errata sheets.	0.30	\$147.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page99 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

4/30/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and team members re letter from J. Sessions and review background of Lucasfilm of report re job codes, ranges, grades; emails w/O/C re same.	0.60	\$294.00
4/30/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.20	\$98.00
4/30/2013	JRS	Settlement; telephone conference with Frank Hinman.	0.50	\$480.00
4/30/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel re class definition and expert issues.	0.70	\$672.00
5/1/2013	LJL	Deposition transcript coding for class certification - Apple / Intel / Lucas	3.90	\$2,340.00
5/1/2013	LJL	Multiple correpondence with K. Dermody, J. Saveri, B. Glackin re how to proceed with class definition issues, experts.	0.40	\$240.00
5/1/2013	LJL	Transcript coding for class certification/Hallock.	1.40	\$840.00
5/1/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.70	\$343.00
5/1/2013	JD	Collect and review revised ROG responses to identify changes; upload and organize discovery request and response documents on firm system.	0.80	\$392.00
5/1/2013	JD	Review correspondence re Lucasfilm range charts from J. Sessions.	0.40	\$196.00
5/1/2013	JD	Draft and revise Intel draft brief section; review Intel deposition transcripts and background materials.	3.00	\$1,470.00
5/1/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	2.60	\$1,274.00
5/1/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ G. Paige re Condiotti errata deadline.	0.10	\$60.00
5/1/2013	JRS	Review draft class certification brief; conference with Frank Hinman re Intel expert issues; review draft.	4.50	\$4,320.00
5/2/2013	LJL	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Johnson re use of salary range data information in support of class certification; discussions with J. Dallal re same; phone conference w/ P. Johnson, J. Dallal re same; correpsondence w/ K. Dermody re same.	1.60	\$960.00
5/2/2013	LJL	Deposition transcript review/coding.	4.10	\$2,460.00
5/2/2013	LJL	Phone call w/ E. Leamer re expert analysis/class certification.	0.30	\$180.00
5/2/2013	JD	Call w/O/C S. Shah re Intel confirmation of salary range charts prepared by experts; confer w/team members and writeup re same.	0.70	\$343.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page100 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 99 1004-1 Matter Number: 0.60 \$294.00 Call w/O/C M. Tubach and C. Brown re Apple confirmation of 5/2/2013 JD salary range charts prepared by experts; confer w/team members and writeup re same. \$686.00 Confer w/L. Leebove re use of salary range data information in 1.40 5/2/2013 JD support of class certification; phone conference w/ P. Johnson, L. Leebove re same. \$245.00 0.50 5/2/2013 JD Collect and circulate newly produced S. Jobs videos from Apple; attempt to resolve formatting issues; emails w/D. Harvey. \$98.00 Review and comment on draft S. Sandberg declaration. 0.20 5/2/2013 JD \$98.00 0.20 Brief call w/L. Cisneros to discuss salary range charts for 5/2/2013 JD additional defendants. Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class 3.60 \$1,764.00 5/2/2013 JD certification in advance of revised motion for class certification. Draft and revise Intel draft brief section; review Intel deposition 0.60 \$294.00 5/2/2013 JD transcripts and background materials. \$288.00 0.30 Review Sheryl Sandberg declaration; conference with J. Dallal. 5/2/2013 **JRS** \$600.00 1.00 Multiple phone calls and correspondence w/ J.Dallal, L. Cisneros 5/3/2013 LJL re discovery statement; review correspondence between defense and co-lead counsel re same; confirm filing re same. Correspondence w/ B. Glackin re contention interrogatory 0.10 \$60.00 5/3/2013 LJL responses. Review Sandberg declaration draft and correspondence from K. 0.80 \$480.00 5/3/2013 LJL Dermody re same; multiple rounds of correspondence w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody re Sandberg declaration and revisions to same. Additional correpsondence w/ B. Glackin, K. Dermody re 0.10 \$60.00 5/3/2013 LJL contention interrogatory responses. \$120.00 Review 4/8/13 CMC transcript re supplemental class certification. 0.20 5/3/2013 LJL \$392.00 Calls and emails w/A. Conley to resolve formatting issues with S. 0.80 JD 5/3/2013 Jobs videos; circulate links to working copies to team. \$1,078.00 Draft and revise Intel draft brief section; review Intel deposition 2.20 JD 5/3/2013 transcripts and background materials. \$2,303.00 Confer via phone and email with team members and counsel for all 4.70 5/3/2013 JD defendants; draft, propose, revise, and circulate revisions; review, edit, obtain signoff on, and file final joint discovery report through ECF system.

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page101 of 125

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/3/2013	LJL	Multiple rounds of correpsondence w/ Co-Lead counsel and J. Dallal re discovery statement, issues with Lucasfilm, Intel, Apple town hall videos.	0.80	\$480.00
5/3/2013	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Frank Hinman.	1.10	\$1,056.00
5/3/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
5/3/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.40	\$384.00
5/3/2013	JRS	Review Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	0.50	\$480.00
5/4/2013	LJL	Multiple emails among co-leads, experts re status, strategy.	0.40	\$240.00
5/4/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification; draft and revise Adobe draft brief section; review Adobe deposition transcripts and background materials.	5.20	\$2,548.00
5/5/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.30	\$90.00
5/5/2013	JD	Draft and revise Adobe draft brief section; review Adobe deposition transcripts background materials.	6.70	\$3,283.00
5/6/2013	LJL	Work on class certification briefing, etc., part 2.	9.30	\$5,580.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Team call; conference with L. Leebove; case management.	0.10	\$96.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	1.00	\$960.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Review Town Hall videos; conference with J. Dallal.	0.60	\$576.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with experts; conference with co-counsel.	1.20	\$1,152.00
5/6/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	4.60	\$2,254.00
5/6/2013	JD	Review draft of K. Hallock report; review and comment on draft of supplemental class cert brief; confer w/L. Leebove.	2.60	\$1,274.00
5/6/2013	JD	Weekly co-lead conference call; review case calendar and open discovery issues and prepare and circulate weekly call agenda.	0.20	\$98.00
5/6/2013	JD	Review Town Hall videos and confer w/J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.80	\$768.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.40	\$384.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Discovery issues.	0.30	\$288.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Expert issues; review draft.	1.00	\$960.00
5/6/2013	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal re town hall meetings.  Continued On Next Page	0.20	\$192.00

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page102 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2013	LJL	Work on class certification briefing and related issues / expert work / deposition transcript coding & review.	8.40	\$5,040.00
5/7/2013	JRS	Case management; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	0.50	\$480.00
5/7/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.80	\$768.00
5/7/2013	JD	Research background, review transcripts, and draft Plaintiffs' position for CMC statement per request and instructions of B. Glackin.	2.70	\$1,323.00
5/7/2013	JD	Read emails re footnotes citing range docs for brief and locate on system.	0.50	\$245.00
5/7/2013	$\mathrm{JD}_{-}$	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	5.70	\$2,793.00
5/7/2013	JD	Further phone calls and emails w/A. Silva at EconOne to discuss development of range charts for remaining defendants.	0.60	\$294.00
5/7/2013	JD	Review and propose changes to draft CMC statement.	0.70	\$343.00
5/8/2013	LJL	Work on brief and related expert and document issues.	9.20	\$5,520.00
5/8/2013	JRS	Review and revise brief; conference with L. Leebove.	1.50	\$1,440.00
5/8/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman re settlement.	0.50	\$480.00
5/8/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.30	\$288.00
5/8/2013	JD	Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class certification in advance of revised motion for class certification.	5.10	\$2,499.00
5/8/2013	JD	Review and propose line edits to draft CMC statement; read and comment on emails re same.	0.60	\$294.00
5/8/2013	JD	Calls and emails w/A. Silva, confer w/L. Leebove and emails w/team members re missing Adobe pay ranges, derivation of Adobe ranges from available data, and how to prepare footnote on Adobe ranges.	2.00	\$980.00
5/8/2013	JD	Collect all range documents for Apple, Intel and Lucas and draft, edit and send footnotes summarizing all range doc information per request and instructions of D. Harvey; confer w/L. Leebove and emails re same.	3.50	\$1,715.00
5/9/2013	LJL	Work on brief revisions, edits, expert issues.	9.90	\$5,940.00
5/9/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman re settlement.	1.00	\$960.00
5/9/2013	JRS	Review and revise case managment conference statement.	0.70	\$672.00
5/9/2013	JRS	Review and revise brief.	1.50	\$1,440.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page103 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 102 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$98.00 0.20 Call and email w/O/C C. Brown re extension on depo errata sheet. 5/9/2013 JD \$2,058.00 4.20 Calls and emails w/A. Silva and D. Harvey re Adobe range charts; 5/9/2013 JD draft, review and edit footnote on Adobe range tables; compile and circulate Adobe range tables; prepare abbreviated Adobe tables for possible inclusion as exhibits; confer w/L. Leebove re same. Prepare and circulate proposed edits to drafts of supplementl class 4.50 \$2,205.00 5/9/2013 JD cert brief; confer w/L. Leebove and incorporate further edits; identify additional citations re Apple's Merlin system; research and review depositions to identify additional citations for Apple and Lucasfilm sections per request and instructions of L. Leebove. 2.00 \$980.00 Read and review compilation of all depo designations from Apple, 5/9/2013 JD Intel, Lucas and Adobe and select excerpts for submission to court along with class cert filing per requests of L. Leebove and D. Harvey. 3.10 \$1,519.00 Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class 5/9/2013 JD certification in advance of revised motion for class certification. \$5,820.00 9.70 Work on draft brief revisions/edits, finalizing, expert issues, salary 5/10/2013 LJL range issues. \$1,920.00 Review and revise brief; conference with L. Leebove; expert 2.00 5/10/2013 **JRS** issues. \$49.00 Email exchange w/O/C. K. Bowen re extension on depo errata 0.10 5/10/2013 JD \$735.00 1.50 Read and review compilation of all depo designations from Apple, JD 5/10/2013 Intel, Lucas and Adobe and select excerpts for submission to court along with class cert filing per requests of L. Leebove and D. Harvey; send to team. 3.30 \$1,617.00 Multiple emails and confer w/L. Leebove and team members re JD 5/10/2013 Google salary ranges; research discovery background and draft email summaries; call w/L. Cisneros to O/C L. Rubin; write up instructions to A. Silva re how to proceed on Google range analysis. \$980.00 2.00 Confer via phone and email with team members and counsel for all 5/10/2013 JD defendants; draft, propose, revise, and circulate revisions; review, edit, obtain signoff on, and file final joint discovery report through ECF system. \$2,450.00 5.00 JD Review and propose edits to supplemental class cert motion brief 5/10/2013 drafts; confer w/L. Leebove and circulate proposed changes. 0.80 \$392.00 Review supplemental class cert filing and CMC statement and 5/11/2013 JD compose and circulate summary email.

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page:103

5/13/2013	JRS	Case management; review discovery responses; prepare for hearing.	0.80	\$768.00
5/13/2013	JRS	Prepare for hearing; conference with J. Dallal.	0.80	\$768.00
5/13/2013	JD	Weekly co-lead conference call; review case calendar and open discovery issues and prepare and circulate weekly call agenda.	0.60	\$294.00
5/13/2013	JD	Review case record and case correspondence; collect and circulate correspondence and production documents showing state of and Intuit and Pixar salary range production on system.	2.50	\$1,225.00
5/13/2013	JD	Organize class cert briefing and unredacted copies of same on system and circulate to team.	0.50	\$245.00
5/13/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re state of discovery and salary range production in advance of CMC.	1.40	\$686.00
5/13/2013	LJL	Multiple discussions w/ J. Dallal re salary range info and defendants' discovery responses/document productions.	0.80	\$480.00
5/14/2013	GS	ECF Filings	0.20	\$60.00
5/14/2013	JRS	Prepare for hearing.	4.30	\$4,128.00
5/14/2013	JD	Collect and circulate correspondence and production documents showing state of and Intuit and Pixar salary range production on system; organize range documents for Adobe, Pixar and Intuit and correspondence re same for Pixar and Intuit on system; upload and organize discovery request and response documents on firm system.	4.00	\$1,960.00
5/14/2013	JD	Review case record, case correspondence and calendar; update calendar; prepare summary of upcoming tasks in advance of CMC.	1.50	\$735.00
5/14/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.70	\$343.00
5/15/2013	JRS	Prepare for and attend hearing; mediation issues; telephone conference with Lee Rubin.	7.50	\$7,200.00
5/15/2013	JRS	Facebook subpoena.	0.60	\$576.00
5/15/2013	JD	Review, upload and organize Apple depo errata sheets.	0.30	\$147.00
5/15/2013	JD	Send and review emails re Pixar salary ranges; collect and circulate excerpts from Pixar discovery re same.	1.70	\$833.00
5/15/2013	JD	Attend CMC hearing at NDCAL San Jose.	7.50	\$3,675.00
5/16/2013	GS	ECF Filing	0.20	\$60.00
5/16/2013	JRS	Mediation issues.	0.70	\$672.00
5/16/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
		C. C. ad On Nand Bane		

Continued On Next Page

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/16/2013	JD	Upload and organize discovery request and response documents on firm system.	1.70	\$833.00
5/16/2013	JD	Further collection and reorganizing of correspondence, discovery responses, and deposition excerpts re completeness of Pixar salary range production; confer w/L. Leebove.	0.80	\$392.00
5/17/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
5/17/2013	JD	Review S. Sandburg declaration.	0.40	\$196.00
5/17/2013	JD	Review draft discovery report and confirm signoff with JSLF team.	0.20	\$98.00
5/17/2013	JD	Collect and reorganize all correspondence, discovery responses, and deposition excerpts and write up findings re completeness of Pixar salary range production.	4.50	\$2,205.00
5/17/2013	JD	Upload and organize discovery request and response documents on firm system.	0.60	\$294.00
5/20/2013	JRS	Mediation issues.	0.30	\$288.00
5/20/2013	ΊD	Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re upcoming tasks, CMC, and production of salary range information; review and update case calendar.	0.80	\$392.00
5/20/2013	JD	Internal discussions w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re mediation, case schedule, response to ROGs 15 and 16, and production of salary range information; review and update case calendar; call w/B. Glackin re ROG responses.	1.40	\$686.00
5/20/2013	LJL	Correspond w/ K. Dermody re conf. call and discuss same with team JSLF.	0.10	\$60.00
5/20/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal, co-counsel re experts.	0.10	\$60.00
5/20/2013	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal re discovery responses.	0.50	\$480.00
5/21/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence.	0.30	\$288.00
5/21/2013	JD	Review, edit and comment on drafts of responses to ROGs 15 and 16.	2.00	\$980.00
5/21/2013	LJL	Correspondence B. Glackin, J. Saveri, J. Dallal and internally with J. saveri, J. Dallal re interrogatory responses; review discovery materials.	0.70	\$420.00
5/21/2013	LJL	Work on resonses to contention interrogatories; discussions with J. Dallal re same.	2.00	\$1,200.00
5/22/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery responses; conference with J. Dallal.	0.40	\$384.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page106 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 105 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.50 \$480.00 Mediation issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. 5/22/2013 **JRS** \$686.00 1.40 Emails and calls w/A. Silva re status of Intuit salary range 5/22/2013 JD tables/production of same; review and organize Intuit salary range information. Review case record and transcripts and compose insert to ROG 0.60 \$294.00 5/22/2013 JD response re additional Intel agreements. \$780.00 1.30 Multiple discussions with J. Dallal re salary range data for class 5/22/2013 LJL certification. 0.10 \$60.00 5/22/2013 LJL Co-lead correspondence re mediation. 0.10 \$60.00 Review mediation status report and correspondence among all 5/22/2013 LJL counsel re same. 0.30 \$288.00 5/23/2013 JRS Mediation issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. Calls and emails w/O/C C. Brown and C. Bowen re extensions on 0.40 \$196.00 5/23/2013 JD depo errata sheets. Confer w/L. Leebove, review case record, and draft email request 1.50 \$735.00 5/23/2013 JD for instruction to J. Saveri re incompleteness of salary range information. 0.40 \$196.00 5/23/2013 JD Emails w/S. Schalman-Bergen re case status and progress of settlement talks. Upload and organize discovery request and response documents on 0.80 \$392.00 5/23/2013 JD firm system. \$196.00 Review and update case correspondence file. 0.40 5/23/2013 JD \$60.00 Correspond w/ K. Dermody re discovery report. 0.10 5/23/2013 LJL Conference w/ J. Dallal re salary range information from 1.00 \$600.00 5/23/2013 LJL defendants. 1.00 \$600.00 LJL Correspondence w/ K. Dermody, D. Harvey re discovery report; 5/24/2013 conferences w/ J. Dallal re same; draft discovery report and discuss status of discovery with J. Dallal. Review and revise supplemental interrogatory responses. 0.80 \$768.00 **JRS** 5/24/2013 5/24/2013 **JRS** Reveiw and revise status report. 1.00 \$960.00 \$288.00 5/24/2013 JRS Case management. 0.30 \$784.00 Additional emails, review and comment on drafts and confer w/L. 1.60 5/24/2013 JD Leebove re amended answer to ROG 15.

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 106

5/24/2013	JD	Confer via phone and email with team members and counsel for defendants; draft, revise, and circulate proposed filing; obtain signoff on and attempt to file final joint discovery report through ECF system; review court rules on procedures when ECF is down.	4.00	\$1,960.00
5/24/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.70	\$833.00
5/24/2013	LJL	Correspondence among co-leads re response to contention interrogatory no. 15.	0.30	\$180.00
5/24/2013	LJL	Multiple correspondence with J. Dallal re discovery report, filing and system failure.	0.70	\$420.00
5/24/2013	LJL	Multiple emails, discussions with J. Saveri, J. Dalall and among co-lead counsel re substantive responses and timing issues re contention interrogatories.	1.40	\$840.00
5/24/2013	LJL	Phone calls and emails with co-counsel, J. Dallal re discovery report.	0.60	\$360.00
5/25/2013	JRS	Case management.	1.00	\$960.00
5/27/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
5/28/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery responses.	1.00	\$960.00
5/28/2013	ĴD	Compose, edit and sign declaration on Technical Failure; file Discovery Report and technical failure declaration through ECF system.	1.50	\$735.00
5/28/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	2.10	\$1,029.00
5/29/2013	LJL	Phone call with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re interrogatory No. 16; conference & correspondence w/ J. Dallal re same.	0.60	\$360.00
5/29/2013	JRS	Settlement; case management.	0.80	\$768.00
5/29/2013	JRS	Review discovery responses; conference with J. Dallal	0.80	\$768.00
5/29/2013	JRS	Mediation issues.	0.50	\$480.00
5/29/2013	JRS	Discovery correspondence; expert.	0.20	\$192.00
5/29/2013	JD	Conversations w/M. Adriano re passdown and status of depo exhibit list.	0.50	\$245.00
5/29/2013	JD	Team call and confer w/L. Leebove re response to ROG 16; begin collection of exhibits for same.	3.50	\$1,715.00
5/29/2013	JD	Call and email w/O/C C. Brown re extension on depo errata sheet.	0.20	\$98.00
5/30/2013	MA	Organize and finalize exhibit master list.	5.50	\$1,650.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page108 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 107

1004-1 Matter Number: Collect and review exhibits to identify materials response to ROG 3.20 \$1,568.00 5/30/2013 JD 16; emails w/A. Shaver re same. \$900.00 3.00 Organized and finalized exhibit master list. 5/31/2013 MA 2.50 \$787.50 Download/cataloging exhibit PDF's 5/31/2013 PL2.00 \$980.00 Collect and review exhibits to identify materials response to ROG 5/31/2013 JD 16. \$588.00 Passdown conversation w/departing paralegal M. Adriano on 1.20 JD 5/31/2013 completion of exhibit lists, organization and completeness of hard-copy files, and location of case materials on system. 2.00 \$980.00 Collect and review exhibits to identify materials for response to 6/1/2013 JD ROG 16. \$768.00 0.80 **JRS** Case management. 6/3/2013 Collect and review exhibits to identify materials for response to 5.00 \$2,450.00 6/3/2013 JD ROG 16. 2.00 \$980.00 Read and review transcripts and code issues relevant to class 6/3/2013 JD certification. \$480.00 0.80 Correspond w/ D. Harvey, B. Glackin, A. shaver, J. Dallal re 6/3/2013 LJL response to interrogatory 16; review materials re same. Review and comment on drafts of response to ROG 16; confer 1.50 \$735.00 6/4/2013 JD w/L. Leebove; emails w/D. Harvey and L. Leebove. 2.10 \$1,260.00 Work on response to Interrogatory 16, correspond w/ D. Harvey re 6/4/2013 LJL same; discussions w/ J. Dallal re same. \$60.00 0.10 6/4/2013 LJL Correspond w/ K. Dermody re Hallock prep. \$2,058.00 4.20 Reorganize exhibits and prepare chart; collect and review exhibits 6/5/2013 JD to identify materials for response to ROG 16. \$147.00 0.30 Email re Lucasfilm compensation witnesses. JD 6/5/2013 \$98.00 Call and email w/O/C C. Brown re extension on depo errata 0.20 6/5/2013 JD sheets. \$2,220.00 Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, co-counsel re organizing evidence 3.70 6/5/2013 LJL and discovery responses; discussions w/ J. Dallal re same; reviewing and organizing evidence. \$4,200.00 7.00 6/6/2013 LJL Depo prep: Hallock. \$768.00 0.80 Review and revise discovery responses. 6/6/2013 **JRS** \$539.00 Review and comment on drafts to ROG 16 response; confer w/J. 1.10 JD 6/6/2013 Saveri; emails w/team re same.

Continued On Next Page

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

6/6/2013	JD	Research Lucasfilm merit increase budgets and report back w/relevant documents via email for K. Hallock depo prep per request of D. Harvey.	0.80	\$392.00
6/6/2013	JD	Call and email w/O/C C. Brown re extension on depo errata sheets.	0.20	\$98.00
6/7/2013	LJL	Hallock deposition.	9.70	\$5,820.00
6/7/2013	JRS	Case magangement.	0.70	\$672.00
6/7/2013	JRS	Mediation issues; telephone conference with mediator.	0.70	\$672.00
6/7/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman.	0.30	\$288.00
6/7/2013	JRS	Review and revise discovery responses.	1.00	\$960.00
6/7/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
6/7/2013	JD	Brief meeting w/J. Saveri re case progress and status of settlement negotiations.	0.20	\$98.00
6/7/2013	JD	Review and comment on drafts of ROG 16; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove and obtain signoff on filing; emails re same.	1.60	\$784.00
6/8/2013	JRS	Mediation issues.	0.60	\$576.00
6/10/2013	JRS	Prepare for Edward Leamer; Telephone conference with co-counsel.	3.80	\$3,648.00
6/10/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
6/10/2013	PL	Reorganized/verified files in S-Drive.	1.20	\$378.00
6/11/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
6/11/2013	JRS	Expert issues; conference with co-counsel.	2.50	\$2,400.00
6/11/2013	PL	Researched Kramm.com for mission files per deponent.	1.30	\$409.50
6/11/2013	PL	Searched exhibit binders for anomalies; added missing tabs.	4.40	\$1,386.00
6/11/2013	JD	Confer briefly w/P. Lall re completing depo exhibit spreadsheet and hard-copy exhibit binders.	0.40	\$196.00
6/11/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence database.	0.90	\$441.00
6/12/2013	LJL	Meeting w/ B. Glackin re HTCC	0.40	\$240.00
6/12/2013	LJL	Conference w/ J. Saveri re status, strategy, settlement strategy; conference call w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody, B. Glackin re Intel settlement offer.	0.70	\$420.00
6/12/2013	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Donn Pickett.	1.00	\$960.00

Client Number: 1010-3

5/7/2015 Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 109

6/12/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
6/12/2013	PL	Searched exhibit binders for anomalies; added missing tabs.	3.20	\$1,008.00
6/12/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove briefly re division of responsibilities/workflow per request of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
6/12/2013	JD	Confer briefly w/P. Lall re completing depo exhibit spreadsheet and hard-copy exhibit binders.	0.30	\$147.00
6/13/2013	JRS	Settlement; telephone conference with Donn Pickett; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
6/13/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
6/13/2013	PL	Searched exhibit binders for anomalies and missing tabs.	3.20	\$1,008.00
6/14/2013	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Frank Hinman; telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt; telephone conference with Robert Rothman.	3.50	\$3,360.00
6/14/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ co-counsel re scheduling Murphy deposition.	0.10	\$60.00
6/15/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.20	\$192.00
6/15/2013	JRS	Settlement.	0.30	\$288.00
6/15/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.30	\$288.00
6/17/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
6/17/2013	JRS	Team call.	1.00	\$960.00
6/17/2013	JRS	Settlement discussions.	0.70	\$672.00
6/17/2013	JD	Team call; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re agenda for team call; prepare agenda.	1.70	\$833.00
6/17/2013	JD	Review response to ROG 16 and emails re same.	0.20	\$98.00
6/17/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.20	\$98.00
6/17/2013	LJL	Review correspondence from R. Mittelstaedt re discovery responses; correspondence w/ co-counsel re same.	0.25	\$150.00
6/17/2013	LJL	Team conference call; conferences w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri re status, strategy; prep for call.	1.60	\$960.00
6/17/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ co-counsel re Murphy deposition.	0.10	\$60.00
6/18/2013	JRS	Review and revise mediation brief.	1.00	\$960.00
6/18/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page111 of 125

5/7/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 110 Matter Number: 1.30 \$637.00 6/18/2013 JD Review mediation brief; check case facts; circulate comments. 6/18/2013 LJL Review draft mediation brief and revise, circulate revisions, 1.40 \$840.00 correspond J. Dallal re same. 6/19/2013 JRS Review and revise mediation brief. 1.50 \$1,440.00 6/19/2013 **JRS** Settlement calls. 1.10 \$1,056.00 6/19/2013 JD Review mediation brief; check case facts; circulate comments; 2.30 \$1,127.00 read exhibit case Leyva; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re filing. 0.80 \$480.00 6/19/2013 LJL Review final submitted mediation brief; correspondence re J. Saveri, J. Dallal re same. 6/20/2013 LJL Correspond w/ J. SAveri, J. Dallal re mediation brief. 0.30 \$180.00 6/21/2013 JDConfer w/J. Saveri and begin review of key case documents and 1.50 \$735.00 deposition exhibits to identify top 10 documents for each defendant per request of J. Saveri. 6/21/2013 JD Review case calendar and case correspondence; confer w/team 0.40 \$196.00 members re schedule for weekend strategy call. Conf. JRS, JDallal re expected opposition brief; schedule co-lead \$120.00 6/21/2013 LJL 0.20 conference call Sunday night call re reply brief. 6/22/2013 JD Review Opposition to Class Certification and related filings. 2.50 \$1,225.00 6/22/2013 Review class certification opposition materials. 1.50 \$900.00 LJL 6/23/2013 JD Team call re strategy for Reply brief in support of Class Cert 3.50 \$1,715.00 motion; emails re scheduling; review opposition to class cert and related filings; write up and circulate notes. 6/23/2013 LJL correspondence re Conference call re class certification opposition 0.30 \$180.00 and reply briefing. 6/23/2013 LJL 0.13 \$78.00 Review J. Dallal recap re conference call. 6/23/2013 LJL Review class cert opposition papers. 2.20 \$1,320.00 6/24/2013 **JRS** Prepare for mediation. 2.50 \$2,400.00 6/24/2013 **JRS** Case management. 0.30 \$288.00 JPD \$3,280.00 6/24/2013 Review certification materials. 4.10 6/24/2013 PLReview, download and forward ECF documents. 0.90 \$283.50 6/24/2013 JD Emails and confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re weekend 0.80 \$392.00 conference call and plan for Reply brief.

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

6/24/2013	JD	Review Murphy report and other documents filed with opposition to class cert.	2.20	\$1,078.00
6/24/2013	JD	Set up chart of new evidence submitted in attorney declarations per request of J. Saveri.	0.60	\$294.00
6/24/2013	JD	Review key case documents and deposition exhibits to identify top 10 documents for each defendant per request of J. Saveri.	2.50	\$1,225.00
6/24/2013	JD	Review case files and confer w/team members re evidence submitted by Plaintiffs with supplemental class cert motion.	0.40	\$196.00
6/24/2013	LJL	Discussions w/ J. Dallal, J. SAveri re plan of action on reply briefing.	0.80	\$480.00
6/24/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re conference call, staffing.	0.20	\$120.00
6/24/2013	LJL	Review current and prior class cert. briefing and reports and files re reply briefing.	4.80	\$2,880.00
6/24/2013	LJL	Review correspondence/correspond with K. Dermody, K. Hallock re Shaw. Re-review Shaw report, Hallock report, Murphy.	1.25	\$750.00
6/25/2013	JRS	Prepare for mediation.	1.80	\$1,728.00
6/25/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
6/25/2013	JPD	Review certification materials.	2.80	\$2,240.00
6/25/2013	PL	Review, download and forward ECF documents.	1.30	\$409.50
6/25/2013	PL	Research LexisNexis to find/print cases cited in opposition to revised class certification motion.	2.10	\$661.50
6/25/2013	LJL	Conference call with co-Leads and K. Hallock; follow up discussion re same.	0.60	\$360.00
6/25/2013	JD	Review key case documents and deposition exhibits to identify top 10 documents for each defendant per request of J. Saveri.	6.80	\$3,332.00
6/25/2013	LJL	Correspondence re scheduling calls with claims admin candidates.	0.17	\$102.00
6/26/2013	JRS	Prepare for mediation; mediation.	10.00	\$9,600.00
6/26/2013	LJL	Mediation	5.00	\$3,000.00
6/26/2013	LJL	Read and analyze cases cited in class certification opposition.	4.58	\$2,748.00
6/26/2013	JD	Review key case documents and deposition exhibits to identify top 10 documents for each defendant per request of J. Saveri; organize and save on system; write up findings.	4.20	\$2,058.00

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

6/26/2013	JD	Review and analyze opposition to class cert filing and fill in chart of new evidence submitted in attorney declarations per request of J. Saveri.	2.20	\$1,078.00
6/27/2013	JRS	Conference call with co-counsel.	1.00	\$960.00
6/27/2013	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove and J. Davis.	0.60	\$576.00
6/27/2013	JRS	Review and revise opposition.	1.00	\$960.00
6/27/2013	JRS	telephone conference with David Rotman.	0.30	\$288.00
6/27/2013	JRS	Conference with Edward Leamer re class certification.	1.50	\$1,440.00
6/27/2013	JPD	Review certification, expert reports.	1.70	\$1,360.00
6/27/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with L. Leebove re certification reply.	0.50	\$400.00
6/27/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with L. Leebove re certification reply.	0.60	\$480.00
6/27/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel re certification reply.	1.00	\$800.00
6/27/2013	JD	Review and analyze opposition to class cert filing and complete filling in chart of new evidence submitted in attorney declarations per request of J. Saveri and circulate via email.	1.80	\$882.00
6/27/2013	JD	Review and comment on draft outline for Reply brief circulated by D. Harvey; confer w/team re same.	0.80	\$392.00
6/27/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re Reply brief; review Opposition brief; collect and organize and begin review of cases citing In re GPUs.	4.50	\$2,205.00
6/27/2013	LJL	Conference w/ J. Saveri, J. Davis re status/strategy.	0.60	\$360.00
6/27/2013	LJL	Discussions w/ J. SAveri, J. Dallal re class certification; review materials and outline; read cases; conduct initial research.	5.80	\$3,480.00
6/27/2013	LJL	Co-lead conference call re class certification.	1.00	\$600.00
6/27/2013	LJL	Confer/correspond w/ J. Dallal re summary of evidence in opposition and review draft of same.	0.70	\$420.00
6/28/2013	JRS	Settlement discussions with Pixar; team call.	2.50	\$2,400.00
6/28/2013	JRS	Prepare class certification reply; conference with J. Davis and L. Leebove.	0.80	\$768.00
6/28/2013	JPD	Reveiw expert reports/briefs re experts.	2.90	\$2,320.00
6/28/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel re certification.	1.00	\$800.00
6/28/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.20	\$63.00
6/28/2013	PL	Prepare deposition exhibit binders.  Continued On Next Page	1.10	\$346.50

### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page114 of 125

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/7/2015

 Page:113

6/28/2013	PL	E-mailed S-drive path to cited cases re opposition to revised class certification motion.	0.10	\$31.50
6/28/2013	LJL	Conference call with co-leads and J. Davis re strategy on class certification.	1.00	\$600.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Phone call w/ D. Harvey re status/strategy.	0.40	\$240.00
6/28/2013	JD	Team conference call re Reply brief strategy.	1.00	\$490.00
6/28/2013	JD	Call w/experts re status of Intuit data.	0.40	\$196.00
6/28/2013	JD	Emails re and review and organize evidence filed with plaintiffs' class cert filings.	0.50	\$245.00
6/28/2013	JD	JSLF team call re strategy on Reply brief, division of responsibilities, proposed revisions to outline.	0.60	\$294.00
6/28/2013	JD	Talk w/P. Lall re organizing averaging cases.	0.20	\$98.00
6/28/2013	JD	Read, outline and organize averaging cases; confer w/L. Leebove re same.	5.20	\$2,548.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Internal JSLF conference call re class certification status/strategy, tasks.	0.60	\$360.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Legal research & analysis.	2.50	\$1,500.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Legal research & analysis re class certification; review and comment on outline and correspondence w/ co-lead counsel re same.	3.50	\$2,100.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Correspond with D. Harvey, P. Johnson re salary range data; phone call w/ P. Johnson re salary range data; review discovery and correspondence record re salary range data.	2.00	\$1,200.00
6/28/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey, P. Barile re research assignments.	0.10	\$60.00
6/30/2013	LJL	Review email from B. Glacking re Leamer/Murphy.	0.10	\$60.00
7/1/2013	PL	Prepare deposition exhibit binders.	4.90	\$1,543.50
7/1/2013	JPD	Class certification reply re Comcast.	2.20	\$1,760.00
7/1/2013	JD	Review J. Davis draft section on Comcast etc.	0.30	\$147.00
7/1/2013	JD	Read/review/outline class cert order argument; read supplemental Leamer report and Murphy report for discussion of averaging. Prepare outline of averaging arguments.	6.50	\$3,185.00
7/1/2013	JD	Confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re assignments and strategy for Reply brief.	0.50	\$245.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page115 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 114

1004-1 Matter Number: 6.50 \$3,900.00 Emails and discussions w/ J. Dallal, J. Davis, D. Harvey, B. 7/1/2013 LJL Glackin re scheduling, assignments, brief outline, strategy, expert issues, all re class cert reply; legal research and analysis re class cert reply. 1.30 \$1,248.00 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. 7/1/2013 1.80 \$567.00 7/2/2013 PLPrepare deposition exhibit binders. 9.70 \$4,753.00 Read and review GPU, Reed and additional averaging cases and 7/2/2013 JD internal case citations; develop outline and begin draft of averaging section for Reply brief. \$735.00 1.50 Confer and emails w/L. Leebove and co-leads re status of Intuit JD 7/2/2013 and Pixar compensation data and comp analysis; collect and circulate examples re same. \$392.00 JD Review discovery record and correspondence for R26 disclosures 0.80 7/2/2013 and mentions of potential witness G. Currey; emails re same. \$4,200.00 Multiple communications w/ J. Dallal, co-counsel, re salary range 7.00 7/2/2013 LJL data, defendants' productions, use of salary range data; review/assess discovery record, prior work on salary range charts... \$240.00 Correspondence w/ J. Dallal re release of amended 30(b)(6) 0.40 7/2/2013 LJL witness G. Currey. Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition; telephone conference with 1.50 \$1,440.00 JRS 7/2/2013 co-counsel. 0.20 \$63.00 7/3/2013 PLMeet with J. Dallal. Class certification; review and comment on Murphy deposition \$1,040.00 1.30 7/3/2013 JPD outline. \$160.00 0.20 JPD Class certification; telephone conference with J. Saveri re Murphy 7/3/2013 deposition. \$180.00 0.30 Phone call w/ J. Davis re class certification issues. LJL 7/3/2013 \$98.00 0.20 7/3/2013 JD Confer w/P. Lall about exhibit binders. Review writeup of Shaw depo; review outline of Murphy depo. 0.50 \$245.00 7/3/2013 JD \$196.00 Further inquiry into decision not to depose G. Currey; review 0.40 7/3/2013 JD discovery and correspondence. Read and review article on Reed; read and review additional cases; 11.90 \$5,831.00 7/3/2013 JD draft, revise and emails re averaging section for Reply brief. \$420.00 Conference w/ J. Dallal re G. Currey; review correspondence, 0.70 7/3/2013 LJL disclosures.

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page116 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 115 1004-1 Matter Number: 1.00 \$600.00 Field discovery record research requests from Shaw deposition; LJL 7/3/2013 confer w/ J. Dallal re same. \$300.00 Correpsondence w/ P. Johnson re Intuit/Pixar salary data; confer 0.50 7/3/2013 LJL w/ J. Dallal re same. 4.20 \$2,520.00 Research/analysis, record review re class certification reply. LJL 7/3/2013 1.10 \$1,056.00 7/3/2013 **JRS** Review Kevin Murphy outline. 1.30 \$1,248.00 7/3/2013 **JRS** Review and revise brief. Class certification; review of B. Glackin outline; expert report. 1.50 \$1,200.00 7/4/2013 JPD Draft, revise and emails re averaging section for Reply brief. \$539.00 1.10 7/4/2013 JD 8.00 \$4,800.00 LJL Work on supplemental reply brief. 7/5/2013 2.00 \$630.00 7/5/2013 PLShepardize case. Class certification; Murphy deposition. 7.90 \$6,320.00 7/5/2013 JPD 0.40 \$320.00 JPD Class certification; meeting with J. Saveri; telephone conference re 7/5/2013 reply. 0.60 \$294.00 Review Murphy depo outline and prepare and circulate suggested 7/5/2013 JDdepo questions. 0.80 \$392.00 Confer w/experts and L. Leebove re compensation data and 7/5/2013 JD preparation of salary range charts; calls re same. 3.50 \$1,715.00 7/5/2013 JD Review, edit and comment on drafts of Leamer report and brief; conferences and calls w/L. Leebove re same. 3.00 \$1,470.00 Download, read and outline additional cases on averaging issue 7/5/2013 JD and circulate comments. 7.50 \$7,200.00 7/5/2013 JRS Kevin Murphy deposition. 1.50 \$1,440.00 Review and revise brief; conference with L. Leebove. 7/5/2013 **JRS** \$4,020.00 6.70 7/6/2013 LJL Reviewing discovery record and evidence; drafting, revising structure section(s) of supplemental class certification reply. Class certification; review reply; telephone conference with 2.90 \$2,320.00 7/6/2013 JPD co-counsel. \$80.00 0.10 Class certification; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin. 7/6/2013 JPD 3.00 \$1,470.00 Review and comment on draft Leamer report; review drafts of 7/6/2013 JD brief; review Zaul memo on compensation decisions; review Teece report; team call re outstanding tasks/responsibilities. 1.60 \$1,536.00 **JRS** Review and revise brief. 7/6/2013

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page117 of 125

**Client Number:** 

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 116 1004-1 Matter Number: \$864.00 0.90 7/6/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with co-counsel. Class certification; review edward Leamer deposition and 1.70 \$1,360.00 7/7/2013 JPD comment. 1.50 \$735.00 Review and comment on draft Leamer report. 7/7/2013 JD 0.80\$480.00 Review Shaw notes and correpsondence from co-counsel re same; 7/7/2013 LJL correspond with K. Dermody re rebutting Shaw. \$900.00 1.50 7/7/2013 LJL Review Leamer draft. Correspond w/ D. Harvey re salary range data. \$960.00 1.00 7/7/2013 **JRS** Review Kathryn Shaw transcript. 3.50 \$3,360.00 Review and revise class certification papers. 7/8/2013 **JRS** \$1,152.00 1.20 **JRS** Settlement issues. 7/8/2013 \$576.00 0.60 Telephone conference with David Rotman. 7/8/2013 **JRS** 1.50 \$1,440.00 **JRS** Telephone conference with experts. 7/8/2013 \$5,460.00 Work on Supplemental class certification reply; reviewing 9.10 7/8/2013 LJL evidence, drafting, revising, conferencing with J.Dallal, J Saveri; correspondence with co-counsel re same; conference calls re Leamer report. 0.90 \$720.00 7/8/2013 JPD Class certification; edit reply. Class certification; redline and memorandum re Edward Leamer \$2,720.00 3.40 7/8/2013 JPD report. 1.20 \$960.00 Class certification; telephone conference with Edward Leamer and 7/8/2013 JPD co-counsel re Edward Leamer report. Class certification; telephone conference with J. Saveri re Edward 0.30 \$240.00 7/8/2013 JPD Leamer report. \$98.00 0.20 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 7/8/2013 \$98.00 Research background of witness R. Okamoto per request of A. 0.20 7/8/2013 JD Shaver. 10.20 \$4,998.00 Revise and edit averaging section; emails re relevant case 7/8/2013 JD authority; review and comment on drafts of class cert brief and Leamer report; confer w/L. Leebove re outstanding tasks. Settlement; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone \$2,304.00 2.40 7/9/2013 **JRS** conference with Lucasfilm/Pixar. 2.30 \$2,208.00 Telephone conference with co-counsel re class certification **JRS** 7/9/2013 papers; class certification papers.

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page118 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page:117 1004-1 Matter Number: 9.30 \$5,580.00 7/9/2013 LJL Drafting, editing, revising supplemental class certification reply; multiple conferences with J. Dallal, JRS re same; conference call w/ HTCC team re status, strategy, next steps. Class certification; telephone conference with L. Leebove re reply 0.30 \$240.00 7/9/2013 JPD brief. \$240.00 Class certification; telephone conference with co-counsel re reply 0.30 JPD 7/9/2013 brief. 0.40 \$320.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri re settlement. 7/9/2013 JPD \$960.00 1.20 Class certification; telephone conference; review reply brief. 7/9/2013 JPD 10.00 \$4,900.00 Review, revise and comment on multiple versions of rebuttal 7/9/2013 JD Leamer report; review J. Davis memo; check and supplement case citations; draft and revise new intro for Reply brief; review and comment on L. Leebove draft section; schedule team call; internal meeting re outstanding Reply brief tasks; team call. \$1,152.00 7/10/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with Lucasfilm/Pixar. 1.20 Review and revise class certification paper. 3.10 \$2,976.00 7/10/2013 **JRS** 0.80 \$768.00 7/10/2013 **JRS** Review and revise expert report. 1.80 \$1,440.00 JPD Class certification;; review and edit of reply brief to J. Saveria 7/10/2013 10.50 \$5,145.00 Calls and emails w/A. Silva and team members re salary range 7/10/2013 JD charts; review, edit and comment on brief sections per request of L. Leebove; request and review prior class cert hearing transcript; internal meeting re possible settlement; review and comment on GPU case expert reports; schedule team call and team call. Work on reply brief and salary range issues for reply brief. 8.50 \$5,100.00 LJL 7/10/2013 1.80 \$1,728.00 Review and revise class certification papers. 7/11/2013 **JRS** \$1,632.00 Settlement discussions; telephone conference with Kelly 1.70 7/11/2013 **JRS** Dermody; review and revise memorandum of understanding. \$1,440.00 **JRS** Review and revise expert report. 1.50 7/11/2013 7.30 \$2,299.50 PLConduct legal research re reverse payment cases. 7/11/2013 \$480.00 7/11/2013 JPD Class certification; review and edit of reply brief to J. Saveri. 0.60 \$3,920.00 7/11/2013 JD Online research and organize data for presentation of salary range 8.00 charts in expert reports; review and comment on multiple versions of draft brief and draft Leamer report; transcribe and circulate edits to brief by J. Saveri; compare draft brief with prior filings and compile list of new evidence to be submitted with Reply; check and update Reply brief citations.

Continued On Next Page

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page119 of 125

Client Number: 1010-3
Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015 Page:118

8.00 \$4,800.00 Work on reply briefing and charts. 7/11/2013 LJL 3.08 \$1,848.00 Review case materials, conference with J. Dallal, work on 7/12/2013 LJL interrogatory responses. 0.70 \$672.00 Settlement discussions with Lucasfilm/Pixar. 7/12/2013 JRS 1.00 \$960.00 7/12/2013 **JRS** Review and revise letter. 1.70 \$1,632.00 7/12/2013 **JRS** Review and revise class certification papers. 0.50 \$245.00 Internal meeting re settlement terms, disclosure conditions, and 7/12/2013 JD upcoming tasks. Review, edit and comment on multiple drafts of Reply brief and \$4,165.00 8.50 7/12/2013 JD expert report; propose new language for footnotes; check numbers and propose language to ensure accuracy of numerical impact claims; review and comment on modifications to proposed final versions of brief and expert report; calls and emails with experts and team members re presentation of salary range data. 0.30 \$147.00 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 7/12/2013 \$300.00 0.50 7/12/2013 LJL JSLF team meeting re status/strategy. \$2,700.00 4.50 7/12/2013 LJL Work on reply brief. 2.50 \$1,500.00 7/13/2013 LJL Work on draft settlement agreement re Pixar/Lucas; correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same. 1.00 \$960.00 **JRS** 7/13/2013 Settlement issues. 0.80 \$768.00 7/14/2013 **JRS** Settlement. 0.70 \$672.00 7/14/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$196.00 Review settlement documents filed in other cases; emails re scope 0.40 7/14/2013 JD of assignment for preliminary approval filing. Phone call w/ J. Saveri re status, strategy, effect of Pixar/Lucas 0.83 \$498.00 7/15/2013 LJL setttlement on proceedings. Work on revising draft settlement agreement re Lucasfilm and \$3,300.00 5.50 7/15/2013 LJL Pixar. 1.40 \$840.00 Multiple conferences w/ J. Dallal re partial Pixar/Lucasfilm 7/15/2013 LJL settlement and settlement approval procedures and settlement documents. 3.50 \$3,360.00 7/15/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement papers; telephone conference with L. Leebove. 1.30 \$409.50 7/15/2013 PL Download ECF documents.

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page120 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page:119 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.60 \$480.00 7/15/2013 JPD Review filing re settlement; comments to J. Saveri. Review and compare expert reports; revise class definition for 1.50 \$735.00 7/15/2013 JD inclusion with all settlement documents; run analyses of settlement numbers per request of J. Saveri. 4.50 \$2,205.00 Download and organize templates from recent settlement filings in 7/15/2013 JD other cases; create list of documents to be prepared; create shell pleadings; begin drafting final approval and preliminary approval orders. 1.50 \$735.00 Review, edit and comment on draft settlement agreement; review 7/15/2013 JD MOU; confer w/L. Leebove. 0.50 \$245.00 Organize notes, update case calendar, update task list. 7/15/2013 JD 5.20 \$3,120.00 Researching and working on drafting settlement class notice re 7/16/2013 LJL Pixar and Lucasfilm settlement. \$900.00 Multiple conferences with J. Dallal re class action settlement, 1.50 7/16/2013 LJL preliminary and final approval procedures and practices, drafting settlement documents. 0.60 \$576.00 Schedule meet and confer. **JRS** 7/16/2013 3.80 \$3,648.00 Review and revise settlement papers. 7/16/2013 **JRS** \$2,592.00 2.70 Review and revise brief re effect of the settlement; conference 7/16/2013 **JRS** with J. Davis. 1.00 \$960.00 Telephone conference with co-counsel. 7/16/2013 **JRS** 0.20 \$63.00 PLSave unredacted versions of documents to filing. 7/16/2013 Review J. Saveri e-mails; telephone conference with J. Saveri. 1.80 \$1,440.00 JPD 7/16/2013 \$560.00 0.70 7/16/2013 JPD Edit J. Saveri filing. 0.90 \$720.00 JPD Review filing re settlement process. 7/16/2013 \$196.00 0.40 7/16/2013 JD Organize settlement drafts, templates and case law on system. \$2,450.00 5.00 7/16/2013 JD Draft and revise draft final approval and preliminary approval proposed orders per instructions of J. Saver and L. Leebove and in light of recent case precedent; circulate; review and comment on feedback. Research, download and review recent case precedent on standards \$1,715.00 7/16/2013 JD 3.50 for certification of settlement class; read and summarize cases; confer w/L. Leebove re same. \$588.00 1.20 Review and comment on draft J. Saveri memo; check against case 7/16/2013 JD calendar and settlement docs.

5/7/2015 Client Number: 1010-3 Page: 120 Matter Number: 1004-1

7/16/2013	LJL	Review/revise settlement documents.	1.50	\$900.00
7/17/2013	LJL	Work on drafts/revisions to joint statement re status of mediation and joint statement re effect of settlement on class certification; conference with J. Saveri re same; revise statements per J. Saveri comments; conference call with co-counsel re statements, strategy on preliminary approval and certification; follow-up conference with J. Saveri, J. Dallal and J.Davis (by phone)	2.50	\$1,500.00
7/17/2013	LJL	Drafting Pixar/Lucas settlement class notice.	4.08	\$2,448.00
7/17/2013	LJL	Multiple conferences with J. Dallal re status, strategy, preliminary approval brief and order, final approval order.	1.10	\$660.00
7/17/2013	JRS	Schedule meet and confer.	0.80	\$768.00
7/17/2013	JPD	Review filing re settlement process; edits to J. Saveri.	1.50	\$1,200.00
7/17/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with co-counsel re settlement filing.	0.40	\$320.00
7/17/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri firm re settlement filing.	0.40	\$320.00
7/17/2013	JPD	Edit to joint filing re efforts at settlement.	1.50	\$1,200.00
7/17/2013	JD	Online research and download and circulate settlement orders per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
7/17/2013	JD	Revise and refine draft of preliminary approval and final approval proposed orders per comments and instruction of J. Saveri and L. Leebove.	4.00	\$1,960.00
7/17/2013	ĴD	Review, rewrite and comment on co-lead draft of plaintiffs' statement re effect of settlement; conference and emails w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re same.	3.00	\$1,470.00
7/17/2013	JD	Team call and firm call re settlement documents/strategy.	1.50	\$735.00
7/18/2013	JRS	Review and revise settlement papers; conference with L. Leebove; conference with J. Dallal; settlement statement; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	3.00	\$2,880.00
7/18/2013	JPD	Edit filing re settlement; telephone conference with J. Saveri.	0.80	\$640.00
7/18/2013	JD	Research, download and organize Settlement Agreement materials; review Settlement Agreement standards from other cases; confer w/L. Leebove; begin drafting Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement.	4.00	\$1,960.00
7/18/2013	JD	Review and comment on additional drafts of effect of settlement brief; confer w/J. Saveri and emails re same.	2.00	\$980.00
7/18/2013	JD	Confer w/team members re class cert docs and needs for class cert hearing; organize class cert docs on system.	0.80	\$392.00
7/18/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.  Continued On Next Page	0.40	\$196.00

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

5/7/2015

Page: 121

7/19/2013	JRS	Schedule meet and confer.	0.60	\$576.00
7/19/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Mittlestaedt; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody re settlement.	1.50	\$1,440.00
7/19/2013	JRS	Review and revise settlement papers.	0.80	\$768.00
7/19/2013	JRS	Review and revise settlement papers; conference with L. Leebove; conference with J. Dallal.	1.80	\$1,728.00
7/19/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.20	\$63.00
7/19/2013	JD	Draft, revise and edit Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement per instructions of J. Saveri and L. Leebove; conference w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re same.	5.20	\$2,548.00
7/19/2013	JD	Review, comment and obtain signoff on effect of settlement brief.	0.60	\$294.00
7/19/2013	JD	Revise and circulate preliminary approval motion; circulate draft preliminary approval and final approval orders.	1.40	\$686.00
7/19/2013	LJL	Work on LFL/Pixar settlement documents and materials.	7.50	\$4,500.00
7/19/2013	LJL	Work on mediation statement; correspondence w/ co-counsel re same.	0.40	\$240.00
7/19/2013	LJL	Work on joint statement re mediation.	0.30	\$180.00
7/20/2013	JRS	Settlement papers.	0.80	\$768.00
7/22/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	1.80	\$567.00
7/22/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.50	\$157.50
7/22/2013	JD	Revise and update draft Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement; revise and edit draft preliminary approval motion.	2.50	\$1,225.00
7/22/2013	JD	Review improper sur-reply filed by Defendants; online research and review depo transcripts and other documents cited in same; download and review evidence law cases; review draft letter sent by D. Harvey.	3.50	\$1,715.00
7/22/2013	JD	Review and comment on drafts sent by J. Saveri of notice, proposed orders etc.	0.50	\$245.00
7/22/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; conference with L. Leebove.	0.80	\$768.00
7/22/2013	JRS	Review and revise settlement document.	1.70	\$1,632.00
7/23/2013	JD	Draft, revise and edit Motion for Preliminary Approval.	3.20	\$1,568.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page123 of 125

Client Number:

1010-3

5/7/2015

Page: 122 1004-1 Matter Number: \$245.00 Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re JSLF position on response to 0.50 7/23/2013 JD improper sur-reply. 0.40 \$196.00 7/23/2013 JD Emails re plan for effect of settlement brief. \$882.00 1.80 7/23/2013 JD Review treatises and case law re standard for exclusion of argument; review court rules; write up findings for response to improper sur-reply. 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** Case management. 7/23/2013 Locate exemplars for and draft declaration of J. Saveri for 3.00 \$1,470.00 JD 7/24/2013 inclusion with preliminary approval filing. \$1,078.00 Meeting at OMM to discuss briefs on effect of settlement; confer 2.20 7/24/2013 JD re and prepare for same. 1.00 \$490.00 Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re plan for offline version of 7/24/2013 JD document database. 0.80 \$768.00 Review and revise settlement document; conference with L. 7/24/2013 **JRS** Leebove. \$1,248.00 1.30 7/24/2013 **JRS** Review and revise brief. Revise settlement; review and revise settlement documents. \$1,536.00 1.60 7/24/2013 **JRS** \$63.00 0.20 7/25/2013 PLDownload/forward ECF documents. \$1,960.00 Additional legal research re effect of settlement on class cert and 4.00 7/25/2013 JD appropriateness of certifying settlement class; read and summarize Hanlon, Amchem and related cases. 0.30 \$180.00 7/25/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ A. Shaver, K.Mason re claims administration interview; review backlog of messages and status update w/ A. Shaver. 0.20 \$120.00 Correspondence w/ co-counsel re Keker appearing for Google. 7/25/2013 LJL 1.08 \$648.00 Review email backlog from vacation. 7/25/2013 LJL Review defendants' draft brief re effect of settlement; correspond 0.40 \$240.00 7/25/2013 LJL w/ J. Saveri, co-counsel re same. \$720.00 Legal research/analysis re settlement class certification. 1.20 7/25/2013 LJL Review and revise case management conference statement. \$2,688.00 2.80 **JRS** 7/25/2013 Telephone conference re settlement; review and revise 1.60 \$1,536.00 **JRS** 7/25/2013 memorandum of understanding. \$240.00 0.40 7/26/2013 LJL Conference call with A. Shaver, J. Mottek, M. Rappazini re Heffler notice and claims administration bid; follow-up call w/ J. Mottek

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

7/26/2013	JD	Identify number of class members and write up per request of J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re pending settlement and upcoming tasks.	1.40	\$686.00
7/26/2013	JD	Review, edit and comment on drafts of effect of settlement brief; emails re same; prepare and circulate draft to address last-minute issue due to pending new settlement.	2.30	\$1,127.00
7/26/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.60	\$294.00
7/26/2013	LJL	Work on settlement documents.	3.70	\$2,220.00
7/26/2013	LJL	Work on filing re effect of settlement; communications w/ D. Harvey, J. Dallal, J. Saveri re same.	1.30	\$780.00
7/26/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	3.00	\$2,880.00
7/26/2013	JRS	Review and revise memorandum of understanding; telephone conference re settlement.	1.40	\$1,344.00
7/27/2013	JRS	Telephone conference re settlement; review and revise memorandum of understanding.	1.00	\$960.00
7/28/2013	JRS	Telephone conference re settlement with Adobe; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with L. Leebove.	1.50	\$1,440.00
7/29/2013	LJL	Phone call and correspondence with J. Mottek re Heffler bid.	0.20	\$120.00
7/29/2013	LJL	Conference call with A. Shaver, Boston Financial re notice and claims administration bid.	0.30	\$180.00
7/29/2013	LJL	Correspondence re Rust notice and claims administration bid.	0.17	\$102.00
7/29/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.60	\$189.00
7/29/2013	LJL	Work on settlement documents; corresondence w/ co-counsel re preliminary approval papers; review Intuit MOU; conferences with J. Dallal re status, strategy, settlement document prep.	5.90	\$3,540.00
7/29/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.60	\$294.00
7/29/2013	JD	Work on settlement documents; emails re preliminary approval papers; review Intuit MOU; confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re status, strategy, settlement document prep, division of labor in light of Intuit settlement.	6.50	\$3,185.00
7/29/2013	JD	Review draft administrative motion re sur-reply.	0.40	\$196.00
7/29/2013	JRS	Review and revise draft; conference with L. Leebove.	3.00	\$2,880.00
7/29/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00

#### Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1073-4 Filed05/07/15 Page125 of 125

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/7/2015

Page: 124

0.50 \$480.00 7/29/2013 **JRS** Teris issues. 0.50 \$480.00 Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt. 7/29/2013 **JRS** \$147.00 0.30 7/30/2013 JD Review draft CMC statement. Revise and combine prior motion for preliminary approval drafts 4.70 \$2,303.00 7/30/2013 JD into unified draft covering both Pixar-Lucas and Intuit settlements; collect and incorporate additional authority from settlement filings in other cases. 2.10 \$1,029.00 Review and summarize changes made by co-lead counsel to 7/30/2013 JD Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement draft; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re changes; collect and circulate operative drafts per request of J. Saveri. Review, revise, comment on draft preliminary approval papers; 1.80 \$1,080.00 7/30/2013 LJL communications w/ J. Dallal re same. \$480.00 LJL Discussions w/ J. Dallal re workload/workflow issues. 0.80 7/30/2013 Review and revise draft Pixar/LFL preliminary approval brief; 0.70 \$420.00 7/30/2013 LJL multiple discussions with J. Dallal re same. Review and revise settlement agreement; telephone conference 3.70 \$3,552.00 7/30/2013 **JRS** with co-counsel; conference with L. Leebove; review and revise brief re settlement; telephone conference with J. Davis. Work on LFL, Pixar, Intuit settlement agreements and issues; 6.10 \$3,660.00 7/31/2013 LJL conferences with J. Dallal re same. Download ECF documents. 0.10 \$31.50 7/31/2013 PL 0.70 \$343.00 Collect and verify three competing versions of class definition 7/31/2013 JD language and check against all operative drafts of settlement documents and expert reports; circulate class language to team. Full redraft of Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement to incorporate all 8.30 \$4,067.00 7/31/2013 JD changes by K. Dermody and comments by J. Saveri; review Intuit settlement agreement prepared by L. Leebove and harmonize Pixar-Lucas changes to Intuit language; review MOU to check for consistency. 2.70 \$2,592.00 Conference with L. Leebove; review and revise settlement 7/31/2013 **JRS** agreement; telephone conference with co-counsel. 1.40 \$686.00 8/1/2013 JD Review K. Dermody draft, J. Saveri email and proposed harmonized draft of Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement; confer w/L. Leebove; and prepare list of open issues. \$784.00 1.60 Reorganize class cert documents on system; locate and incorporate 8/1/2013 JD missing documents; prepare detailed instructions to P. Lall for class cert binders for hearing. Continued On Next Page