Exhibit 1

(Part 2 of 2)

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page2 of 124

5/20/2015

1010-3

Client Number:

Matter Number				Page:124
7/31/2013	JD	Full redraft of Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement to incorporate all changes by K. Dermody and comments by J. Saveri; review Intuit settlement agreement prepared by L. Leebove and harmonize Pixar-Lucas changes to Intuit language; review MOU to check for consistency.	8.30	\$4,067.00
7/31/2013	JRS	Conference with L. Leebove; review and revise settlement agreement; telephone conference with co-counsel.	2.70	\$2,592.00
8/1/2013	JD	Review K. Dermody draft, J. Saveri email and proposed harmonized draft of Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement; confer w/L. Leebove; and prepare list of open issues.	1.40	\$686.00
8/1/2013	JD	Reorganize class cert documents on system; locate and incorporate missing documents; prepare detailed instructions to P. Lall for class cert binders for hearing.	1.60	\$784.00
8/1/2013	JD	Review and comment on draft CMC statement; emails w/J. Saveri re same.	0.60	\$294.00
8/1/2013	JD	Review, edit and reformat Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement and incorporate suggestions from L. Leebove; confer w/L. Leebove. remove duplicative sections; circulate to team.	2.70	\$1,323.00
8/1/2013	LJL	Work on Pixar/Lucas settlement and documents; multiple conferences w/ J. Dallal re same.	5.20	\$3,120.00
8/1/2013	LJL	Phone call w/ C. Birgirs (class member) re case status, information.	1.00	\$600.00
8/1/2013	JRS	Review and revise settlement agreement.	2.40	\$2,304.00
8/2/2013	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.10	\$31.50
8/2/2013	PL	Prepared binders for J. Dallal.	2.40	\$756.00
8/2/2013	JD	Draft and circulate new Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement redline reflecting new consensus positions; confer further to obtain JSLF signoff to narrow open issues; revise and circulate updated list of open issues.	3.00	\$1,470.00
8/2/2013	JD	Collect and circulate class definition language and release language per requests of K. Dermody and L. Leebove.	0.50	\$245.00
8/2/2013	JD	Internal meeting re JSLF positions on Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement; prepare new draft of agreement based on updated positions; revise, synthesize and circulate detailed list of open issues in advance of team call; team call re open settlement agreement issues.	3.80	\$1,862.00
8/2/2013	LJL	Prep for co-lead call, call, review follow up corespondence from D. Harvey.	0.90	\$540.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page3 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 125 1004-1 Matter Number: 6.40 \$3,840.00 8/2/2013 LJL Work on Pixar/Lucas settlement and issues; multiple conferences J. Dallal re same; conference with J. Dallal, J. SAveri re same. Review and revise settlement agreement; telephone conference \$2,208.00 2.30 8/2/2013 **JRS** with co-counsel. 0.20 \$120.00 8/4/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody re settlements. 4.60 \$1,449.00 8/5/2013 PLPrepare trial binders for J. Saveri. 0.20 \$98.00 8/5/2013 Review plan of allocation sent by K. Dermody. JD 2.00 \$980.00 Review correspondence and MOU and update Saveri declaration 8/5/2013 JD draft to reflect settlement with Intuit. \$1,715.00 3.50 8/5/2013 JD Further revision to Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement per request and instruction of J. Saveri; final edit for proofing and formatting; circulate to team and send to Defendants per request of K. Dermody. 0.20 \$98.00 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 8/5/2013 \$2,160.00 8/5/2013 LJL Work on revising settlement agreement, review and discuss plan of 3.60 allocation. 0.10 \$60.00 Correpsondence w/ J. Saveri re expert prep session. 8/5/2013 LJL Corespondence w/ J. Trang (Gilardi), A. Shaver re scheduling 0.20 \$120.00 8/5/2013 LJL claims administration bid call. 1.60 \$960.00 8/5/2013 LJL Additional work on settlement documents. 1.10 \$1,056.00 8/5/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement agreement. PLPrepared trial binders for J. Saveri. 3.30 \$1,039.50 8/6/2013 0.40 \$240.00 Call w/ A. Shaver, Gilardi re claims administration bid. 8/6/2013 LJL \$2,695.00 5.50 8/6/2013 JD Review and comment on draft Intuit settlement agreement; confer w/L. Leebove re separate vs. combined settlement documents; review settlement correspondence, MOU documents and case law and prepare combined version of preliminary approval order; revise and update combined version of motion for preliminary approval. \$60.00 8/6/2013 LJL Correpsondence A. Shaver, J. Trang re call scheduling re Gilardi 0.10 bid. 6.10 \$3,660.00 Work on Intuit settlement agreement and documents. 8/6/2013 LJL 4.50 \$4,320.00 JRS Prepare for class certification hearing. 8/6/2013 5.40 \$3,240.00 Review all Leamer and Murphy reports in prep for meeting. 8/7/2013 LJL

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page4 of 124

5/20/2015

1010-3

Client Number:

Matter Number:	: 1004			Page: 126
8/7/2013 I	LJL	Meeting with co-counsel and Leamer re hearing prep.	2.50	\$1,500.00
8/7/2013 J	JD	Meeting w/experts and co-counsel in advance of class cert hearing.	2.50	\$1,225.00
8/7/2013 J	JD	Review expert reports, briefing and first class cert order in advance of meeting with co-counsel and experts; review binders prepared by P. Lall.	3.10	\$1,519.00
8/7/2013 J	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re plan for completion of all settlement documents; compile and distribute copies of all operative versions and identify on system per request of J. Saveri.	1.40	\$686.00
8/7/2013 I	LJL	Review correspondence/information from K. Mason re claims administration bid.	0.30	\$180.00
8/7/2013 J	JRS	Case management; review and revise settlement agreement; conference with L. Leebove.	1.80	\$1,728.00
8/7/2013 J	JRS	Prepare for class certification hearing.	3.90	\$3,744.00
8/8/2013 I	LJL	Travel to San Jose for hearing; attend hearing; return travel.	8.00	\$4,800.00
8/8/2013 J	JD	Revise and edit Pixar-Lucas proposed preliminary approval order; review, edit, and reformat Intuit settlement agreement draft and check for consistency against Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement draft; identify and circulate operative settlement document drafts per request of J. Saveri.	2.50	\$1,225.00
8/8/2013 J	JD	Class certification hearing; travel to San Jose and back.	8.00	\$3,920.00
8/8/2013 J	JRS	Prepare for class certification hearing; class certification hearing.	7.80	\$7,488.00
8/9/2013 J	JD	Read Rail Freight decision; emails and calls w/O/C A. Conley re Statement of Recent Decision; emails w/team members re plaintiffs' position on same.	2.40	\$1,176.00
8/9/2013 J	JD	Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re Intuit settlement agreement; emails and confer w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re staffing and preparation of Intuit settlement agreement.	0.80	\$392.00
8/9/2013 I	LJL	Review new Rail Freight decision; correpsondence with co-counsel re same; discus same w/ J. Davis, J. Dallal.	2.30	\$1,380.00
8/9/2013 I	LJL	Discussions w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re Intuit status, agreement.	0.80	\$480.00
8/9/2013 J	JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel re class certification hearing.	0.70	\$672.00
8/12/2013 I	PL	Download/forward ECF documents.	0.30	\$94.50
8/12/2013 H	PL	Prepare transcript order.	1.10	\$346.50
8/12/2013 J	JRS	Reivew and revise settlement papers.	1.00	\$960.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page5 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 127 1004-1 Matter Number: \$245.00 0.50 Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re document database preservation 8/12/2013 JD and requirements. 1.70 \$833.00 8/12/2013 JD Review new draft version of Intuit settlement agreement; identify and summarize changes; confer w/J. Saveri re proposed edits. 0.10 \$60.00 LJL Correpsond w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re database issues. 8/12/2013 0.80 \$480.00 8/12/2013 LJL Review, compare notice/claims admin. bids. \$1,140.00 Review revised Intuit agreement; conference J. Saveri re same; 1.90 8/12/2013 LJL discussions w/ J. Dallal re same. \$120.00 LJL Additional correpsondence w/ M. Pereira-Heinrich re potential hot 0.20 8/13/2013 Apple documents. Download/forward ECF documents. 0.10 \$31.50 8/13/2013 PL 0.30 \$147.00 Emails re request for transcript of class cert hearing per request of 8/13/2013 JD J. Saveri. 0.30 \$147.00 8/13/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.20 \$120.00 Review corrpondence from J. Damasco re tax issues. 8/13/2013 LJL 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** 8/13/2013 Case management. Conference call re document coding for class certification. 0.80 \$480.00 8/14/2013 LJL 1.80 \$1,728.00 8/14/2013 **JRS** Settlement issues: telephone conference with co-counsel; telephone conference with Intuit and Pixar/LucasFilm. Online research; download, review, and summarize recent ruling 3.00 \$1,470.00 8/14/2013 JD in Apple E-books case per request of J. Saveri; collect w/previously compiled documents and organize on system. 1.50 \$900.00 Review and compare bids; discuss same w/ A. Shaver; 8/14/2013 LJL correpsondence w/ A. Shaver, candidates re bids and information. 1.00 \$600.00 Prep for call re document coding; review claims and issues. 8/14/2013 LJL Review additional info/correspondence re claims/notice bids; 1.40 \$840.00 8/14/2013 LJL conference w/ J. Saveri re notice/claims administration candidates; discussion w/ J. Mottek re Heffler bid. 0.70 \$672.00 8/15/2013 **JRS** Case Management. 1.00 \$960.00 Review and revise settlement documents. 8/15/2013 **JRS** 0.80 \$392.00 8/15/2013 JD Review all case management orders and confirm calendar dates per request of D. Clevenger. \$300.00 0.50 8/16/2013 LJL Co-lead call re claims and notice administrators, status.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page6 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 128 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$672.00 0.70 8/16/2013 **JRS** Case administration. \$768.00 0.80 8/16/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents. 1.00 \$960.00 8/16/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with co-counsel. Team call re claims administrator bids; review and confer w/L. 0.90 \$441.00 8/16/2013 JD Leebove re same and re status of settlement docs. 0.20 \$120.00 8/16/2013 LJL Correspondence re claims administration bids. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.20 \$63.00 8/19/2013 PL respective attorneys. 2.00 \$980.00 8/19/2013 JD Read and review transcript of class certification hearing; update case calendar and task list. Emails w/co-counsel S. Schalman-Bergen re class cert hearing and 0.30 \$147.00 8/19/2013 JD case status. Review and comment on updated preliminary approval motion and 1.20 \$588.00 8/19/2013 JD notice drafts. 1.20 \$720.00 Communications w/ A. Shaver, candidates re bids for 8/19/2013 LJL notice/claims admin, review bids and correspondence, discussion w/ J. Mottek Review revised preliminary approval order; multiple 1.00 \$600.00 8/19/2013 LJL correspondence among co-leads re same. \$240.00 Review notice documents; review K. Dermody correspondence 0.40 8/19/2013 LJL and comments. JD Review and comment on updated version of long-form notice. 0.50 \$245.00 8/20/2013 Collect offline Relativity database from co-counsel; review 2.50 \$1,225.00 8/20/2013 JD contents; online research and calls re viewing data offline and database changeover requirements; calls and emails re same. 1.50 \$735.00 Read and review new briefing filed in Comcast case forwarded by 8/20/2013 JD J. Saveri; check against arguments made in class cert briefing. Communicate w/ J. Saveri re claims administrator bids status. \$120.00 0.20 8/20/2013 LJL \$60.00 Correspondence among counsel re scheduling settlement call. 0.10 8/20/2013 LJL \$245.00 0.50 Review and compare claims administrator bids. 8/21/2013 JD \$1,200.00 2.00 Correspond (multiple) w/ A. Shaver, claims/notice administration 8/21/2013 LJL candidates re bids; phone calls w/ J. Mottek re bid; review bid materials and compare; discuss w/ J. SAveri.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page7 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015 Page: 129 Matter Number: 1004-1 8/22/2013 JD Review and comment on chart of potential senior executives 0.70 \$343.00 identified by O/C D. Kiernan; check against class definitions in expert report and settlement documents; emails re same. Calls and emails re scheduling call to discuss experts; update case 0.40 \$196.00 8/22/2013 JD calendar. 8/22/2013 LJL Review administrator bids; conference call re same; follow-up 1.40 \$840.00 correspondence re same; phone call w/ J. Mottek re Heffler winning bid. 8/22/2013 LJL Correspondence among co-leads re senior executive issue; review 0.60 \$360.00 D. Kiernan correspondence re same; review documents; discuss w/ J. Dallal. 8/22/2013 LJL 0.40 \$240.00 Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re settlement tax issues; review J. Damasco revisions. 0.10 \$60.00 8/22/2013 LJL Correspondence re call re merits expert issues. \$360.00 8/22/2013 LJL Review new 7th Circuit case re Comcast; correspondence among 0.60 co-leads res submitting to court. 8/22/2013 **JRS** Review new class certification authority; conference with L. 0.50 \$480.00 Leebove. 8/23/2013 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.10 \$31.50 respective attorneys. 8/23/2013 Review Huntsman prelim. approval brief from J. Saveri re creation 0.40 \$240.00 LJL of litigaiton fund with settlement proceeds. \$60.00 8/23/2013 LJL 0.10 Correspondence among co-counsel re mediation. \$960.00 8/24/2013 JRS Review and revise settlement documents. 1.00 8/26/2013 **JRS** Prepare for call with defendants'; call with defendants' re 1.00 \$960.00 settlement. PL0.10 \$31.50 8/27/2013 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys. \$196.00 8/27/2013 JD Collect and organize class certification filings including 0.40 unredacted copies on system. \$960.00 8/28/2013 **JRS** Expert issues; telephone conference with Josh Davis. 1.00 **JRS** \$288.00 8/28/2013 Case management. 0.30 8/28/2013 JPD Telephone conference with D. Harvey re merits experts. 0.50 \$400.00 \$98.00 8/28/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.20

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page8 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 130 Matter Number: 1004-1 2.50 8/28/2013 JD Confer w/J. Saveri re expert issues; call w/D. Harvey re status of \$1,225.00 experts; calls w/J. Davis and E. Cramer re expert issues; outline requirements for expert testimony; confer w/J. Saveri re assignments. 0.40 \$384.00 8/29/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement agreement. 8/29/2013 JPD Review file re merits experts. 2.10 \$1,680.00 \$180.00 8/30/2013 LJL Phone call with J. Saveri re status/strategy/tasks 0.30 0.30 \$288.00 8/30/2013 **JRS** Review and revise supplemental authority. 8/30/2013 JD Read and summarize US Foodservice case in preparation for filing 1.60 \$784.00 of Statement of Recent Decision; emails and confer w/J. Saveri re same. Review and summarize changes in Defendants' version of 1.70 \$833.00 8/30/2013 JD Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement returned by E. Henn; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re same; confer re upcoming tasks. 9/1/2013 LJL Detailed review/comparison of Disney drafts. 2.00 \$1,200.00 0.60 \$576.00 9/1/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents. 6.00 \$2,940.00 9/1/2013 JD Compose detailed memo outlining all changes to Pixar-Lucas settlement agreement in version returned by E. Henn and circulate to team per request of J. Saveri. Detailed review and redline of Intuit revised draft settlement. 9/2/2013 LJL 1.30 \$780.00 \$840.00 9/2/2013 LJL Revise/redline Disney agreement. 1.40 1.50 \$1,440.00 9/2/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents. \$980.00 9/2/2013 JD Circulate memo and operative versions of draft; scheduling emails; 2.00 call w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove to discuss draft settlement agreement, progress on preliminary approval filing, and assignments. 9/2/2013 LJL Phone call w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re Disney settlement. 0.50 \$300.00 9/3/2013 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.10 \$31.50 respective attorneys. 3.50 \$1,715.00 9/3/2013 JD Online research re merits expert search. 1.40 \$686.00 9/3/2013 JD Review and comment on Intuit settlement agreement redline; coordinate w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove and emails to schedule call re document. 9/3/2013 LJL Correspond w/ A. Shaver, J. Mottek re status, scheduling. 0.10 \$60.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page9 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

1004-1 Page: 131 Matter Number: 9/3/2013 1.30 \$780.00 LJL Correspond w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody re Disney changes and effects on notice/claims issues; communicate w/ E. Henn re same; communicate w/ J. Mottek re same; phone call w/ J. Mottek re same. 1.10 \$660.00 9/3/2013 LJL Review/revise Intuit documents; correspondence w/ J. Dallal. 1.00 \$600.00 Work on redline to Disney agreement; distribute to co-leads. 9/4/2013 LJL Multiple calls and correspondence w/ Jacqui Mottek (Heffler) re 1.10 \$660.00 9/4/2013 LJL claims administration issues. 0.70 \$420.00 9/4/2013 LJL Co-lead conference call re draft settlement agreements. 0.80 \$480.00 9/4/2013 LJL Review revised redline from K. Dermody and scrub for prior changes. \$1,440.00 1.50 9/4/2013 **JRS** Settlement documents; telephone conference with co-counsel. 1.00 \$490.00 9/4/2013 JD Team call re draft settlement agreements; emails re same. Review and comment on new versions of draft Pixar-Lucas and 1.00 \$490.00 9/4/2013 JD Intuit settlement agreements; emails re same. 5.50 \$2,695.00 9/4/2013 JD Online research re merits expert search. 0.80 \$480.00 9/4/2013 LJL Additional revisions to Disney agreement, correspondence re same. \$1,248.00 1.30 9/4/2013 **JRS** Settlement issues. 0.30 \$288.00 9/4/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with Lucusfilm counsel. 8.00 \$3,920.00 9/5/2013 JD Online research re merits expert search; calls and emails w/D. Harvey re experts; write, read, and respond to emails to and from expert witness candidates; call w/potential expert witness L. Fleming; confer w/J. Saveri re experts. 4.00 \$2,400.00 Work on revising Disney SA, communications among counsel re 9/5/2013 LJL same. \$480.00 JPD Telephone conference with D. Harvey re experts. 0.60 9/5/2013 9/6/2013 LJL Co-lead call with E. Henn and D. Kiernan re settlement draft. 1.00 \$600.00 \$450.00 0.75 9/6/2013 LJL Co-lead conference call re expert issues. Follow up call with Disney, Intuit, K. Dermody, J. Saveri re \$378.00 9/6/2013 0.63 LJL settlement agreement draft. 1.00 \$960.00 9/6/2013 JRS Review and revise settlement documents. 0.60 \$576.00 9/6/2013 **JRS** Case management.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page10 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page:132 9/6/2013 **JRS** Expert issues. 0.80 \$768.00 9/6/2013 JD Emails and calls w/potential expert M. Marx and D. Harvey; 6.00 \$2,940.00 emails re expert witness search; review academic papers and testimony from M. Marx forwarded by D. Harvey. 0.60 \$360.00 9/6/2013 LJL Review/revise settlement documents. \$180.00 Communication among co-leads, w/ J. Saveri, re expert issues. 0.30 LJL 9/6/2013 \$960.00 9/6/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference re experts. 1.00 0.90 \$864.00 **JRS** 9/6/2013 Settlement issues. 0.80 \$640.00 JPD Telephone conference with co-counsel re experts. 9/6/2013 9/7/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement papers; telephone conference re 1.00 \$960.00 Pixar and Intuit. 9/7/2013 **JRS** Expert issues; conference with Brendan Glackin and Eric Cramer; 1.00 \$960.00 telephone conference with co-counsel. 0.30 \$288.00 9/7/2013 **JRS** Case management. 2.70 \$1,323.00 9/9/2013 JD Review competing drafts of settlement documents and case correspondence, compile operative versions, prepare and circulate table of settlement documents per request of J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove, re same. 0.50 \$245.00 9/9/2013 Review and edit draft Saveri declaration. JD Further emails w/ and re expert candidate M. Marx; emails w/ and \$637.00 9/9/2013 1.30 JD re backup expert candidates. 1.50 \$735.00 9/9/2013 JD Emails and intake call w/potential expert T. Stuart; emails w/D. Harvey re same; write up and circulate notes; collect and send background case materials. 0.40 \$196.00 9/10/2013 JD Emails w/D. Harvey and T. Byers re expert search. \$833.00 1.70 9/11/2013 JD Review email instructions from J. Saveri re order of proof; call w/J. Davis and L. Leebove re same; write up notes in advance of preparation of order of proof to inform expert witness search per request of J. Saveri. 0.40 \$196.00 9/11/2013 JD Additional emails re expert search. Work on notice/claim form; drafting, revisions, implementing 4.00 \$2,400.00 9/11/2013 LJL revisions, correspondence among co-leads. 0.40 \$240.00 9/11/2013 LJL Communications w/ J. Mottek re status, notice, claims. \$480.00 0.80 9/11/2013 LJL Disney notice issues; review, revise.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page11 of 124

5/20/2015 Client Number: 1010-3 Page: 133 Matter Number: 1004-1 2.70 \$2,160.00 9/11/2013 JPD Notes re order of proof; e-mail re same; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri Law Firm re same. 1.00 \$490.00 9/12/2013 JD Overhaul claim form to correct formatting per request of L. Leebove; review and edit. \$490.00 Read Jury Instructions document forwarded by J. Davis; review 1.00 9/12/2013 JD internal case citations. \$1,960.00 4.00 9/12/2013 JD Schedule expert calls; expert calls w/team members and J. McClave, M. Marx and EconOne; write up notes re EconOne call and confer w/J. Saveri. 0.20 \$98.00 Further emails re expert candidate L. Fleming. 9/12/2013 JD 0.60 \$360.00 Confer w/ J. Saveri re status of settlement documents and 9/12/2013 LJL discussions: follow up communication w/ D. Kiernan re same. \$2,700.00 4.50 9/12/2013 LJL Work on claim form. \$900.00 Additional work on claim form; correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. 1.50 9/12/2013 LJL Saveri re same. 0.70 \$672.00 9/12/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with L. Leebove; settlement status; review and revise document. \$735.00 Write and update order of proof memo. 1.50 9/13/2013 JD \$1,470.00 3.00 9/13/2013 JD Rewrite final approval order to reflect updates to settlement agreement per request of J. Saveri; modify combined final approval order to prepare separate final approval orders for Pixar-Lucas and Intuit settlements.

and competing drafts and prepare and circulate updated table per request of J. Saveri; calls w/L. Leebove and D. Harvey and w/L. Leebove and J. Saveri re state of docs and staffing. 1.20 \$720.00 9/13/2013 LJL Additional work on claim form; send revisions to co-counsel. 5.00 \$3,000.00 9/13/2013 LJL Work on final approval order and settlement documents, multiple discussions/emails with J. Dallal, J. Saveri re settlement documents and status. 0.20 \$192.00 9/13/2013 **JRS** Case management; telephone conference with J. Dallal re status. Write, edit, review and circulate order of proof memo per request 4.50 \$2,205.00 9/16/2013 JD of J. Saveri and instructions of J. Davis.

Review settlement document table, recent case correspondence,

9/13/2013

9/16/2013

JD

JD

2.30

0.80

\$1,127.00

\$392.00

Continued On Next Page

Review settlement document table, recent case correspondence,

Leebove and J. Saveri re state of docs and staffing.

and competing drafts and prepare and circulate updated table per request of J. Saveri; calls w/L. Leebove and D. Harvey and w/L.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page12 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 134 Matter Number: 1004-1 1.50 \$735.00 9/16/2013 JD Review new settlement agreement drafts; preparation for call and team call re line-by-line edits to latest settlement agreement drafts sent by defendants. 9/16/2013 LJL Work on claim form and other settlement documents; 5.00 \$3,000.00 correspondence w/ counsel re same; phone call w/ D. Harvey re status, briefing; communications w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri re status and settlemnet documents. 1.20 \$720.00 9/16/2013 LJL Review/revise prelim approval order; correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same; communications w/ J. Mottek re dates in same. 1.00 \$960.00 9/16/2013 **JRS** Review settlement documents; telephone conference with co-counsel. 1.00 \$490.00 9/17/2013 JD Revise and edit Saveri Declaration per request of J. Saveri and circulate to team. Read article re and download and review recent Cason-Merenda 0.60 \$294.00 9/17/2013 JD precedent forwarded by J. Davis. 0.80 \$392.00 9/17/2013 JD Further expert call w/EconOne. 0.10 \$60.00 LJL Correspond with J. Dallal re expert call, status. 9/17/2013 Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re Heffler obligations under 0.20 \$120.00 LJL 9/17/2013 prelim. app. order. \$180.00 0.30 9/17/2013 LJL Review Saveri decl. \$3,300.00 5.50 9/17/2013 LJL Reviewing, revision, comments on various settlement documents and communications/correspondence among counsel re same. 0.40 \$384.00 9/17/2013 **JRS** Review and revise settlement papers; conference with J. Dallal. 0.80 \$768.00 9/17/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference re experts. 0.70 \$560.00 9/17/2013 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri; telephone conference with Ed Leamer and co-counsel. Review preliminary approval briefs and prepare two exhibits for \$245.00 0.50 9/18/2013 **RJM** same. 1.00 \$490.00 9/18/2013 JD Revise and edit draft Saveri Declaration in line with K. Dermody instructions per request of J. Saveri. 9/18/2013 JD Read, review related authority re, and write up findings re recent 3.00 \$1,470.00 Cason-Merenda precedent forwarded by J. Davis. 1.70 \$833.00 Review preliminary approval motion draft; review expert reports 9/18/2013 JD

and docket report and fill in citations; correct citations per request

of D. Harvey; emails re same.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page13 of 124

1010-3

Client Number:

5/20/2015

Page: 135 Matter Number: 1004-1 7.25 \$4,350.00 9/18/2013 LJL Work on settlement documents; reviewing, revisions, incorporating changes, correspondence between/among co-leads and defense counsel. \$4,608.00 4.80 9/18/2013 **JRS** Settlement calls. \$490.00 Emails w/M. Marx and J. Saveri and confer re J. Saveri re expert 1.00 9/19/2013 JD decisions. 3.50 \$1,715.00 9/19/2013 JD Emails re strategy on filing statement of recent decision re Cason-Merenda case; confer w/O/C C. Brown re Defendant stipulation; prepare supporting documents and revise and edit to incorporate suggestions from A. Shaver; obtain defendant signoff and file through ECF system. 2.00 \$980.00 JD Review drafts of motion and settlement agreements; emails re 9/19/2013 same. 1.00 \$490.00 9/19/2013 JD Line-edit and call and email w/L. Leebove re proposed changes to long-form notice. JD Review expert reports and perform calculations to identify precise 1.50 \$735.00 9/19/2013 proportions of employees and compensation covered by pending settlement agreements per request of D. Harvey. 0.20 \$120.00 9/19/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Mottek re Heffler obligations under prelim. app. order. 9/19/2013 LJL Work on notice and settlement documents; multiple 5.80 \$3,480.00 communications w/ co-counsel, opposing counsel re same. \$720.00 Late night conference call with settling counsel re settlment 1.20 9/19/2013 LJL agreement and tax issues; follow-up correspondence re same. \$1,380.00 2.30 Additional work on reviewing, revising, finalizing settlement 9/19/2013 LJL documents for preliminary approval; multiple comunications and work on revisions to documents. Expert issues; coordinate Matt Marx; conference with J. Dallal. 1.10 \$1,056.00 **JRS** 9/19/2013 3.90 \$3,744.00 **JRS** 9/19/2013 Settlement calls. \$94.50 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.30 9/20/2013 PL respective attorneys. 2.20 \$1,078.00 Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re decisions on experts; call w/J. 9/20/2013 JD Saveri and B. Glackin re same; call and email w/M. Marx confirming intention to retain expert services; send protective order. Confer w/D. Clevenger re submission of courtesy copies of recent \$196.00 0.40 JD 9/20/2013 authority; emails w/D. Harvey re same.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page14 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 136 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$539.00 1.10 9/20/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 8.50 \$5,100.00 9/20/2013 LJL Multiple phone calls, conference calls, correspondence among counsel; review and revise agreements, working on trying to get all documents finalized and preliminary approval filing completed. \$2,688.00 Coordinate experts; telephone conference with co-counsel; 2.80 9/20/2013 **JRS** telephone conference with Jude Damasco. 1.10 \$880.00 9/20/2013 JPD Telephone conference with co-counsel re experts; telephone conference with J. Saveri re same. 9/21/2013 LJL Correspondence among counsel re final settlement document; 1.00 \$600.00 review as-filed documents. 2.30 \$1,840.00 JPD 9/22/2013 Comments re J. Dallal order of proof. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 1.20 \$378.00 9/23/2013 PL respective attorneys. 0.30 \$147.00 Review and update case correspondence file. 9/23/2013 JD 1.50 \$735.00 Compile selection of expert reports, ROG responses and major 9/23/2013 JD case documents for submission to expert M. Marx per request of J. Saveri. 0.30 \$180.00 LJL Correspondence among co-leads re retaining Marx. 9/23/2013 0.60 \$576.00 9/23/2013 **JRS** Case management. Conference with J. Dallal; coordinate expert issues; telephone 1.00 \$960.00 9/23/2013 **JRS** conference with Matt Marx. Telephone conference with J. Saveri re order of proof. 0.80 \$640.00 9/23/2013 JPD \$196.00 Review CMC draft; write up and circulate proposed changes. 0.40 9/24/2013 JD \$196.00 0.40 9/24/2013 JD Review order sent by B. Glackin and confer w/J. Saveri re submission of statement of recent decision; emails re same. 9/24/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.70 \$343.00 Correspond w/ J. Dallal, J. Saveri, D. Harvey re scheduling, CMC 1.00 \$600.00 9/24/2013 LJL statement; with J. Dallal, J. Saveri re same; review CMC statement and correpsond w/ J. Saveri re same. 0.40 \$240.00 Review CRTs order and correspondence among co-lead counsel re 9/24/2013 LJL same. 0.70 \$672.00 9/24/2013 **JRS** Expert issues. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.40 \$126.00 9/25/2013 PL respective attorneys.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page15 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3 5/20/2 Matter Number: 1004-1 Page:				
9/25/2013	JD	Calls and emails w/D. Harvey and L. Leebove re JSLF position and signoff on CMC statement.	0.30	\$147.00
9/25/2013	LJL	Communications w/ J. Dallal, D. Harvey re CMC statement, review statement, review correspondence from J. Saveri.	0.50	\$300.00
9/25/2013	LJL	Review CMC statement from defendants; research/analysis re production of contact information and class member information; correspondence among co-lead counsel re same; correspondence re strategy with non-settling defendants and meet/confer.	3.00	\$1,800.00
9/25/2013	LJL	Additional research/analysis re CMC statement; review revised draft.	1.00	\$600.00
9/25/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.40	\$384.00
9/26/2013	JD	Review CMC draft and review and respond to related emails; write up and circulate proposed change.	0.50	\$245.00
9/26/2013	LJL	Research CMC issues; correspondence w/ D. Harvey, among co-counsel re same.	1.80	\$1,080.00
9/26/2013	LJL	CMC statement issues, correspondence, revisions.	1.40	\$840.00
9/26/2013	JRS	Review and revise case management conference statement.	1.30	\$1,248.00
9/27/2013	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
9/27/2013	JD	Emails re expert materials and coverage for M&C next week.	0.20	\$98.00
9/27/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ co-counsel, opposing counsel re meet and confer.	0.10	\$60.00
9/27/2013	LJL	Correspondence re Marx.	0.10	\$60.00
9/27/2013	JRS	Conference with co-counsel; telephone conference re experts.	1.10	\$1,056.00
9/30/2013	PL	For JRS, prepared binder of preliminary approval docs (Intuit/Pixar/Lucasfilm).	1.30	\$409.50
9/30/2013	JRS	Mediation e-mails.	0.30	\$288.00
9/30/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	1.00	\$960.00
9/30/2013	JRS	Reschedule hearing; e-mail with co-counsel.	0.60	\$576.00
9/30/2013	LJL	Correspondence re Marx.	0.10	\$60.00
9/30/2013	LJL	Communications w/ J. Mottek re prelim. approval filing, status.	0.20	\$120.00
10/1/2013	LJL	Conference call w/ J. Saveri, co-counsel, Marx.	1.00	\$600.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page16 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1				
10/1/2013	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
10/1/2013	PL	For JRS, prepared binder of preliminary approval docs (Intuit/Pixar/Lucasfilm).	3.30	\$1,039.50
10/1/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with Matt Marx; prepare outline of opinion.	2.50	\$2,400.00
10/1/2013	LJL	Communications with J. Mottek re status, notice and claims administration issues.	0.40	\$240.00
10/1/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Mottek re approval filing.	0.10	\$60.00
10/1/2013	LJL	Review incoming orders re scheduling; correpsondence with J. Saveri re same.	0.20	\$120.00
10/2/2013	LJL	Review Manning draft; conference call re Manning; review Manning materials and correspondence w/ J. Saveri, co-counsel re same.	2.10	\$1,260.00
10/2/2013	JRS	Settlement; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	0.50	\$480.00
10/2/2013	JRS	Expert issues; telephone conference with co-counsel; telephone conference with Josh Davis; Telephone conference with Alan Manning.	2.90	\$2,784.00
10/2/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
10/2/2013	JRS	Review outline of opinion.	0.50	\$480.00
10/2/2013	LJL	Review Marx outline; correspondence w/ D. Harvey, J. Saveri re Marx/Manning issues and assignments; review B. Glackin revisions to same; additional correspondence re experts.	1.00	\$600.00
10/2/2013	LJL	Review Marx outline; correspondence w/ D. Harvey, J. Saveri re Marx/Manning issues and assignments.	0.50	\$300.00
10/2/2013	LJL	Review Manning materials; online research re employer monopsony; correspondence w/ J. SAveri, J. Davis re Manning and monopsony.	0.80	\$480.00
10/2/2013	JPD	Review draft Alan Manning report.	2.20	\$1,760.00
10/3/2013	LJL	Call w/ J. Davis re expert theories, issues.	0.20	\$120.00
10/3/2013	LJL	Conference call w/ Prof. A. Manning; re-scan report pre-call.	1.00	\$600.00
10/3/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
10/3/2013	JRS	Expert issues; telephone conference re experts.	1.80	\$1,728.00
10/3/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel.	0.80	\$768.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page17 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 139 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$2,080.00 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re experts; telephone 2.60 10/3/2013 conference with L. Leebove re experts; telephone conference with J. Saveri and E. Cramer re experts. \$1,536.00 10/4/2013 **JRS** Case management. 1.60 10/7/2013 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.80 \$252.00 respective attorneys. Review Marx outline comments; correspondence w/ co-counsel re 10/7/2013 LJL 0.60 \$360.00 same. 0.30 \$180.00 10/7/2013 LJL Review ECF filings; corespondence/discussion with J. Saveri re same; review correspondence w/ J. Saveri and C. Brown re same. \$960.00 1.00 10/7/2013 **JRS** Expert issues; telephone conference with Dean Harvey. 0.30 \$288.00 10/7/2013 **JRS** Case management; telephone conference with co-counsel. \$126.00 10/8/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.40 respective attorneys. 0.20 \$120.00 10/8/2013 LJL Communications w/ J. Saveri re defendant class member data issues; correspondence to K. Dermody re status of same. \$60.00 0.10 10/8/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ co-counsel re Marx. \$60.00 Communications w/ J. Mottek re data issues. 0.10 10/8/2013 LJL \$384.00 0.40 10/8/2013 **JRS** Case management. \$60.00 0.10 10/9/2013 LJL Correspondence re mediation scheduling. Read and respond to case-related emails; write up instructions re 1.00 \$490.00 10/9/2013 JD procedures and status for unredacted materials collection and location on S drive. 10/10/2013 JRS 1.00 \$960.00 Case management. \$480.00 10/10/2013 JRS Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. 0.50 \$288.00 0.30 10/10/2013 JRS Case management. 0.60 \$576.00 10/11/2013 JRS Case management. 3.70 \$3,552.00 10/14/2013 JRS Review expert reports; telephone conference re experts; case management. \$245.00 0.50 10/14/2013 JD Confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove; call w/co-counsel and experts re expert strategy Read, review and comment on Marx report per request of J. 4.50 \$2,205.00 10/14/2013 JD Saveri; review factual record and pleadings; compose and circulate detailed summary.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page18 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number				Page: 140
10/14/2013	JD	Online research and calls re pricing and requirements for conversion of native Relativity database to available formats.	1.50	\$735.00
10/14/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.40	\$196.00
10/14/2013	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re identification and filing of unredacted copies of non-public documents.	0.20	\$98.00
10/14/2013	LJL	Conference call w/ J. SAveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, E. Leamer, P. JOhnson re status.	0.20	\$120.00
10/15/2013	JRS	Case management; review expert reports.	0.80	\$768.00
10/15/2013	LJL	Review defs' draft CMC update from J. Sessions; multiple correspondence w/ co-counsel, JSLF team re same and response to same; phone call w/ D. Harvey re strategy and call w/ J. Sessions.	1.30	\$780.00
10/15/2013	LJL	Review Marx materials; correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re our comments.	0.60	\$360.00
10/15/2013	LJL	Further correspondence w/ co-counsel re response to defs' proposed CMC; correpsondence w/ J. Sessions re same.	0.33	\$198.00
10/15/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey, J. Sessions re plaintiffs' position on CMC.	0.30	\$180.00
10/15/2013	JD	Emails re and pick up Concordance format database, review contents for completeness and to assess software needs; confer w/J. Saveri; calls w/kCura, Summation, TransPerfect and outside IT support; further online research; summarize pricing, hardware requirements, and other aspects of database contract offers.	3.50	\$1,715.00
10/15/2013	JD	Emails and confer w/L. Leebove re strategy re novelty of alleged facts in Marx report.	0.80	\$392.00
10/15/2013	JD	Review Defendants' proposed revisions to CMC statement; confer w/L. Leebove; read treatise sections and online legal research re discovery matters related to production of Social Security Numbers and other personal identification information; review and comment on correspondence related to CMC statement.	3.00	\$1,470.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Conference call w. D. Harvey, K. Dermody, T. Sessions re class member contact/employment info production.	0.50	\$300.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re response to defs' proposed CMC update.	0.20	\$120.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Multiple rounds of correspondence between/among co-counsel re CMC strategy, data issues re class notice.	1.50	\$900.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Review Leamer report.	1.60	\$960.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ D. Harvey, J. Sessions re follow up.	0.10	\$60.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page19 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page:141

10/16/2013	LJL	Expert call w/ co-leads, Leamer.	1.20	\$720.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Legal research re SSNs, discovery of class member info versus Rule 23; conference call w/ K. Dermody, D. Harvey, J. Sessions.	1.73	\$1,038.00
10/16/2013	LJL	Correspondence between/among co-counsel re data issues, communications with J. Mottek re same; research re SSNs; correspondence/discussions with J. Dallal re SSNs.	0.90	\$540.00
10/16/2013	JPD	Pre re certification of litigation vs. settlement class; telephone conference with J. Saveri and E. Cramer.	1.40	\$1,120.00
10/16/2013	JD	Legal research re SSNs, discovery of class member info versus Rule 23; review and collect cases on system; confer w/L. Leebove and read emails re same.	5.20	\$2,548.00
10/16/2013	JD	Review expert report drafts; conference call w/expert E. Leamer and attorneys; confer w/J. Saveri.	2.20	\$1,078.00
10/17/2013	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
10/17/2013	PL	Discussion of document search project for 2013-10-18 with J. Dallal.	0.10	\$31.50
10/17/2013	JRS	Case management; e-mail with B. Glackin re cost fund.	1.30	\$1,248.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Calls and research and emails re defs' data production issues.	1.50	\$900.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Correpsondence among co-leads re Munger substitution for Bingham.	0.20	\$120.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Review revised Manning; correspondence re experts.	1.50	\$900.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Correspondence among co-counsel re edits/comments on Manning.	0.80	\$480.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Review revised Manning; correspondence re experts.	1.10	\$660.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Research re 23(d)(2); communications w/ J. Dallal re SSN production research, all re data production issues.	1.20	\$720.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Review defs' updated CMC; correspondence among counsel re same.	0.40	\$240.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Discussions w/ J. Mottek re data confidentiality issues.	0.40	\$240.00
10/17/2013	LJL	Follow-up call with J. Sessions; correspondence w/ J. Dallal re same.	0.25	\$150.00
10/17/2013	JPD	Review report.	1.10	\$880.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page20 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number:	1004-1		Page: 142
10/17/2013 JI	Review substitution of attorney form; review and update case distribution list.	0.40	\$196.00
10/17/2013 JI	Calls and emails w/S. Crosby re pricing, training, and hardware requirements for document database; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	1.00	\$490.00
10/17/2013 JI	Review and comment on Manning report draft; confer w/L. Leebove re same.	1.30	\$637.00
10/17/2013 JI	Confer w/J. Saveri and D. Harvey re proof of factual claims and collection of additional supporting materials for Marx report.	0.50	\$245.00
10/17/2013 JI	Collect and review exhibits and materials pulled for depositions of D. Conrad, T. Evangelista, P. Murray, and D. McKell to ascertain Intel recruiting policies with respect to passive candidates per request of D. Harvey.	1.70	\$833.00
10/17/2013 JI	Further legal research; collect and outline cases re SSNs and production of personal identifying information; review correspondence w/O/C J. Sessions and confer w/L. Leebove re same.	2.80	\$1,372.00
10/18/2013 PI	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
10/18/2013 JF	Review and revise case management conference statement; conference with L. Leebove.	1.50	\$1,440.00
10/18/2013 L.	Review draft repsonse to CMC update; correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. SAveri re same.	0.50	\$300.00
10/18/2013 L.	Phone call w/ D. Harvey re CMC statement issues.	0.20	\$120.00
10/18/2013 L.	Research re 23(d)(2) and defendants' refusal to voluntarily produce class member info; correspondence between/among co-leads re data issues and legal arguments.	1.40	\$840.00
10/18/2013 L.	Review orders and cases re production of class member contact info for notice; correspondence w/ among co-counsel re same.	0.90	\$540.00
10/18/2013 JF	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re experts.	0.20	\$160.00
10/18/2013 JI	Collect and review exhibits and materials pulled for depositions of D. Conrad, T. Evangelista, P. Murray, and D. McKell to ascertain Intel recruiting policies with respect to passive candidates per request of D. Harvey.	1.50	\$735.00
10/18/2013 JI	Organize materials re SSN production etc. on system.	0.40	\$196.00
10/18/2013 JI	draft sections and check citations per requests of D. Harvey; review and comment on drafts of response to Defendants' CMC statement supplement.	5.00	\$2,450.00
	Continued On Next Page		

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page21 of 124

5/20/2015

\$7,200.00

\$960.00

7.50

1.00

Page: 143

Client Number:

10/21/2013 JRS

10/21/2013 JRS

1010-3

1004-1 Matter Number: \$240.00 10/19/2013 LJL Review revised CMC update draft and correspondence. 0.40 \$660.00 Review revised Marx draft. 1.10 10/19/2013 LJL 2.70 \$2,160.00 10/19/2013 JPD Review Alan Manning report. Review and comment on draft response to Defendants' CMC 10/19/2013 JD 0.50 \$245.00 statement update. 3.40 \$3,264.00 10/20/2013 JRS Telephone conference with J. Davis re Manning report; review and revise expert report. 1.20 \$720.00 10/20/2013 LJL Review Manning materials. \$560.00 0.70 Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Alan Manning draft. 10/20/2013 JPD 1.10 \$880.00 10/20/2013 JPD E-mail with J. Saveri re Alan Maning draft. 0.70 \$343.00 10/20/2013 JD Read and respond to email re offer for Concordance system; emails w/J. Saveri re offer and hardware requirements. \$189.00 10/21/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.60 respective attorneys. \$598.50 1.90 10/21/2013 PL Printed out documents for hearing re Preliminary Approval/CMC and prepared binders for J. Saveri and J. Dallal. 1.00 \$600.00 10/21/2013 LJL Phone calls with J. Saveri, J. Mottek re notice and claims issues. Work on Manning; prep for phone call; conference call; analysis 2.50 \$1,500.00 10/21/2013 LJL of expert issues. \$60.00 Correspondence w/ co-leads re status of Leamer report. 0.10 10/21/2013 LJL \$240.00 10/21/2013 LJL Review comments to Manning draft. 0.40 10/21/2013 LJL Review and prepare Manning redline for JRS. 2.00 \$1,200.00 Review consultants' material re database; emails w/ J. Saveri and 10/21/2013 JD 0.30 \$147.00 rep re same. 8.50 \$4,165.00 10/21/2013 JD Travel to and attend Preliminary Approval Hearing and CMC per request and instructions of J. Saveri; review Preliminary Approval and CMC statement filings; collect materials and assist and instruct P. Lall on preparation of binders for hearing; request and collect additional documents from FedEx per requests of J. Saveria 0.50 \$480.00 10/21/2013 JRS Case management.

Review and revise preliminary approval papers; conference with

Prepare for hearing; hearing.

L. Leebove.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page22 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

1004-1 Page: 144 Matter Number: 0.80 \$768.00 Settlement documentation; conference with L. Leebove. 10/21/2013 JRS 2.10 \$2,016.00 10/21/2013 JRS Expert reports. \$94.50 10/22/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.30 respective attorneys. 0.50 \$300.00 10/22/2013 LJL Call / correspondence w/ J. Saveri re case timeline, status, strategy. \$480.00 Review Marx draft and correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same. 0.80 10/22/2013 LJL 2.25 \$1,350.00 10/22/2013 LJL Work on escrow agreement. \$480.00 Correspondence between/among co-leads re Manning report. 0.80 10/22/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, D. Harvey re Intel documents for 0.20 \$120.00 10/22/2013 LJL experts. \$600.00 1.00 10/22/2013 LJL Correspondence between/among co-leads re Marx report. 1.60 \$784.00 10/22/2013 JD Review depositions to identify transcripts containing details re possible collaboration defenses; compile and generate and circulate TextMap report identifying relevant transcript sections. 10/22/2013 JD Emails, calls, and confer w/J. Saveri, L. Leebove, and L. Cisneros 0.60 \$294.00 re plan and scheduling for revised notice to class members per Court instructions. \$1,323.00 Review and comment on Marx report draft per request of J. Saveri; 2.70 10/22/2013 JD review J. Saveri comments and prepare and circulate combined redline incorporating JSLF attorney comments. \$882.00 1.80 Further review exhibits and materials pulled for depositions of D. 10/22/2013 JD Conrad, T. Evangelista, P. Murray, and D. McKell to ascertain Intel recruiting policies with respect to passive candidates per request of D. Harvey; identify best document and forward to D. Harvey. Review hearing notes and minute order; review and update case 0.50 \$245.00 10/22/2013 JD calendar and request changes to firm calendar. Contact consultant re trial evidence database. 0.80 \$392.00 10/22/2013 JD \$576.00 0.60 10/22/2013 JRS Case management. 3.40 \$3,264.00 10/22/2013 JRS Expert work. Preliminary approval papers; settlement documentation; 0.50 \$480.00 10/22/2013 JRS conference with L. Leebove. \$768.00 Settlement administration; review and revise settlement forms and 0.80 10/22/2013 JRS notice.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page23 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number: 1010-3

Client Number Matter Numbe				5/20/201 Page: 14	
10/23/2013	JRS	Call re experts	0.17	\$163.20	
10/23/2013	LJL	Calls w/ J. Mottek re declaration; review draft.	1.20	\$720.00	
10/23/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. SAveri re Mottek declaration; follow-up with J. Mottek.	0.60	\$360.00	
10/23/2013	LJL	Check-in call w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal	0.80	\$480.00	
10/23/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. SAveri re escrow agreement; revisions to same.	0.60	\$360.00	
10/23/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.30	\$147.00	
10/23/2013	JD	Review and comment on revised drafts of settlement documents.	0.60	\$294.00	
10/23/2013	JD	Case strategy and check-in call w/L. Leebove, J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00	
10/23/2013	JD	Read Warnock transcript and related documents re Apple-Adobe relationship per request and instructions of J. Saveri; compose email responding to expert questions; call w/D. Harvey re expert strategy.	5.50	\$2,695.00	
10/23/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00	
10/24/2013	LJL	Additional work on Mottek declaration; correspondence among co-leads re same; call w/ J. Mottek re same.	1.10	\$660.00	
10/24/2013	LJL	Work on Manning; review and mark up Manning draft; correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J.Dallal re evidence supporting Manning; discussion w/ J. Davis re same.	3.50	\$2,100.00	
10/24/2013	LJL	Follow-up correspondence w/ co-counsel and J. Mottek re declaration and issues.	0.50	\$300.00	
10/24/2013	LJL	Review order re class certification; correspondence w/ co-counsel re same.	1.40	\$840.00	
10/24/2013	JD	Additional calls with consultant re case database; confer with J. Saveri re same.	0.40	\$196.00	
10/24/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.40	\$384.00	
10/24/2013	JRS	Preliminary approval papers; review and revise brief; conference with L. Leebove.	2.70	\$2,592.00	
10/24/2013	JRS	Settlement administration; review drafts; telephone conference with David Kiernan.	1.10	\$1,056.00	
10/25/2013	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50	
10/25/2013	PL	Conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re processing of High Tech document filed under seal (docket number 0532).	0.10	\$31.50	
		Continued On Novt Bage			

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page24 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page:146

10/25/2013	LJL	Work on Manning; correspondence w/B. Glackin, J. Dallal re evidence to support Manning.	1.00	\$600.00
10/25/2013	LJL	Correspondence among counsel re Heffler declaration; issue of data and non-settling defendants.	0.60	\$360.00
10/25/2013	LJL	More work on Manning.	1.00	\$600.00
10/25/2013	LJL	Correspondence B. Glackin, A. Shaver re Manning report.	0.30	\$180.00
10/25/2013	LJL	Discussion/corespondence w/ K. Dermody, L. Cisneros re notice issues.	0.30	\$180.00
10/25/2013	LJL	Prepare Manning redline.	1.50	\$900.00
10/25/2013	LJL	Multiple correspondence between/among co-leads, Heffler, re declaration and discussions w/ J. Mottek re same.	0.90	\$540.00
10/25/2013	JD	Review drafts of Manning report and list of proposed additions and revisions prepared by L. Leebove; search class certification filings, deposition exhibits etc. for additional evidence substantiating additions and revisions; draft additional language to reflect additional findings and add citiations; collect and circulate documents cited pre request of L. Leebove and requests and instructions of B. Glackin.	4.40	\$2,156.00
10/25/2013	JD	Calls, emails, and internal discussions re hardware requirements, pricing, and response times of outside IT vendor for new database server; schedule appointment for further discussions.	1.10	\$539.00
10/25/2013	JD	Review fact record for information about Apple-Microsoft relationship for Marx report.	0.20	\$98.00
10/25/2013	JD	Review and comment on class certification opinion; outline argument.	4.00	\$1,960.00
10/25/2013	JRS	Case management; telephone conference with co-counsel.	1.70	\$1,632.00
10/25/2013	JRS	Expert work; issues re Manning and Marx factual basis; review re record.	2.80	\$2,688.00
10/25/2013	JRS	Settlement; preliminary approval papers; review and revise brief; conference with L. Leebove.	0.50	\$480.00
10/25/2013	JRS	Review order; press inquiries.	1.40	\$1,344.00
10/26/2013	LJL	Correspondence back/forth among J. Dallal, B. Glackin re Manning evidence.	1.00	\$600.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page25 of 124

5/20/2015

Page: 147

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Matter Number: 3.50 \$1,715.00 Review P. Burke deposition for information on Apple raiding 10/26/2013 JD practices; identify and review recruiter depositions for information on cold calling practices; further review of depositions with information concerning collaborations; follow up re delivery of additional supporting documents to expert. \$960.00 Case managment; review order. 1.00 10/26/2013 JRS 3.20 \$3,072.00 10/26/2013 JRS Expert reports. 1.90 \$1,140.00 10/27/2013 LJL Review draft expert reports. 5.50 \$2,695.00 10/27/2013 JD Further review recruiter depositions for information on cold calling practices; further review of depositions with information concerning collaborations; write up findings re both subjects for inclusion in Marx and Manning expert report filings. \$126.00 0.40 10/28/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys. 0.30 \$180.00 10/28/2013 LJL Correspondence/call w/ J. Dallal re status, Marx report. 0.10 \$60.00 10/28/2013 LJL Corresopndence B. Glackin re Leamer status. 0.10 \$60.00 Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, L. Cisneros re plan for disclosing 10/28/2013 LJL expert background documents. 0.50 \$300.00 Review Marx; correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same. 10/28/2013 LJL \$300.00 10/28/2013 LJL Calls w/ J. Davis, J. Dallal re Marx report/status. 0.50 \$600.00 1.00 10/28/2013 LJL Review Leamer; correspondence among counsel re same. Confer w/J. Saveri and begin close review of class certification 4.00 \$1,960.00 10/28/2013 JD order and collection of cited cases to assess legal standards and handling of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal filing per request of J. Saveri. \$1,715.00 Review and comment on proposed final drafts of Manning and 3.50 10/28/2013 JD Marx reports per request and instructions of J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove and compose emails re status of reports and filing. \$588.00 Conference call with J. Saveri and consultant re database; confer 1.20 10/28/2013 JD further with J. Saveri. 2.00 \$1,920.00 10/28/2013 JRS Expert reports. 0.50 \$480.00 10/28/2013 JRS Case management. For L. Leebow, researched 23(f) petitions and oppositions. 3.20 \$1,008.00 10/29/2013 PL Confer with James Dallal, research exemplar of Order of Proof. 10/29/2013 KR 0.50 \$245.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page26 of 124

	10-3 04-1		5/20/2015 Page:148
10/29/2013 LJL	Correspondence re notice status.	0.10	\$60.00
10/29/2013 LJL	Correspondence J. Dallal, L. Cisneros re Marx report.	0.10	\$60.00
10/29/2013 LJL	Legal research/reading re 23(f).	1.50	\$900.00
10/29/2013 LJL	Begin 23(f) research; correspondence P. Lall re pulling together briefing.	3.20	\$1,920.00
10/29/2013 JD	Continue close review of class certification order and expand to initial order on class certification to assess legal standards and handling of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal filing per request of J. Saveri; confer w/P. Lall and assist in collection of Rule 23(f) briefs in other cases per requests and instructions of L. Leebove.	5.70	\$2,793.00
10/29/2013 JD	Emails w/J. Saveri and ECI re choices and scheduling for installation of new hard drive to house case database.	0.50	\$245.00
10/29/2013 JD	Confer w/K. Rayhill and J. Saveri re requirements for and progress on order of proof.	0.40	\$196.00
10/29/2013 JD	Collect and organize expert report filings on shared drives; follow up re corrected version of Marx report; read final versions of expert reports.	2.40	\$1,176.00
10/29/2013 JRS	Settlement administration; conference with L. Leebove.	0.80	\$768.00
10/30/2013 PL	Updated "orders" folder on S-drive.	0.70	\$220.50
10/30/2013 PL	For L. Leebow, populated Rule 23F subfolder with relevant PDFs of petitions/oppositions.	0.20	\$63.00
10/30/2013 PL	For J. Saveri, processed unredacted versions of sealed documents received by email.	1.00	\$315.00
10/30/2013 PL	For J. Dallal, researched appellate activity re several Rule 23(f)-related cases.	2.20	\$693.00
10/30/2013 LJL	23(f) research.	5.00	\$3,000.00
10/30/2013 LJL	Review recent ECF materials; correspondence re scheduling.	0.20	\$120.00
10/30/2013 JD	Collect additional academic and case materials re Rule 23(f) and close review of arguments in Defendants' opposition filings to assess legal standards and handling of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal filing per request of J. Saveri; further collection and review of Rule 23(f) briefs in other cases; emails w/P. Lall re collection of 23(f) materials.	7.50	\$3,675.00
10/30/2013 JRS	Settlement administration; conference with L. Leebove.	0.40	\$384.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page27 of 124

	10-3 04-1		5/20/2015 Page: 149
10/31/2013 PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.60	\$504.00
10/31/2013 LJL	Correspondence w/ K. Dermody, J. Saveri re notice data issue.	0.40	\$240.00
10/31/2013 LJL	Review 23(f) materials.	2.00	\$1,200.00
10/31/2013 JD	Read, review and outline arguments in related academic materials and cases cited in Defendants' opposition filings, class certification orders, and related 23(f) filings to assess legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal.	6.00	\$2,940.00
10/31/2013 JRS	Settlement administration; review and revise forms.	1.00	\$960.00
10/31/2013 JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
11/1/2013 PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
11/1/2013 PL	Calendar Motion for Settlement.	0.40	\$126.00
11/1/2013 LJL	Emails and call w/ J. Mottek re status, court-approved notice.	0.60	\$360.00
11/1/2013 LJL	Corresp. J. Davis re scheduling, status, 23(f).	0.10	\$60.00
11/1/2013 JD	Read, review and outline arguments in related academic materials and cases cited in Defendants' opposition filings, class certification orders, and related 23(f) filings to assess legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal; schedule call w/L. Leebove and J. Davis to discuss planned response.	7.00	\$3,430.00
11/1/2013 JD	Review recent orders for notice deadlines and changes to preliminary approval schedule per request of J. Saveri and circulate findings; confer w/D. Clevenger re updating case calender; emails re same.	0.80	\$392.00
11/1/2013 JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/1/2013 LJL	Corresp. w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re status, scheduling.	0.20	\$120.00
11/1/2013 LJL	Reading/research re 23(f) project.	3.00	\$1,800.00
11/1/2013 LJL	Discussion w/ J. Saveri re status, class notice issues; review class certification orders; correspondence w/ co-counsel re scheudling call re same.	1.00	\$600.00
11/3/2013 JPD	Review class certification opinion.	2.60	\$2,080.00
11/3/2013 JD	Emails re notice issues and coverage for same.	0.30	\$147.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page28 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 150 Matter Number: 1.00 \$315.00 PL Email correspondence with Martha Brown at CA Northern District 11/4/2013 Court (San Jose) and with J. Saveri re Docket. 0531. \$480.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri and L. Leebove re R23(f). 0.60 11/4/2013 JPD 1.60 \$1,280.00 11/4/2013 JPD Review class certification opinion. 0.60 \$360.00 11/4/2013 LJL Phone call w/ J. DAvis, J. Saveri re 23(f). 0.20 \$120.00 11/4/2013 LJL Corresp. among co-leads re notice status/scheduling, call. 11/4/2013 LJL Review orders/briefs in prep for call re 23(f). 1.20 \$720.00 \$180.00 0.30 11/4/2013 LJL Multiple communications w/ J. Dallal re notice issues, timing, assignments. Work on form of combined class notice. 4.00 \$2,400.00 11/4/2013 LJL 11/4/2013 JD Read, review and outline arguments in recent 23(f) cases to assess 5.00 \$2,450.00 legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal. 0.30 \$147.00 Emails and calls w/L. Leebove re notice issues. 11/4/2013 JD \$98.00 Update and circulate revised case calendar. 0.20 11/4/2013 JD \$3,264.00 Case management; prepare for conference call with lead counsel. 3.40 11/4/2013 **JRS** 0.80 \$768.00 Settlement documentation; review forms of notice, claim forms, 11/4/2013 **JRS** Citibank documents. 0.20 \$192.00 11/4/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with David Rotman; schedule mediation. \$504.00 PL For J. Saveri and J. Dallal, wrote letter to Court requesting reprint 1.60 11/5/2013 of an Order. For K. Rayhill, processed incoming email re deposition notices \$126.00 0.40 11/5/2013 PL and saved notices to file. 11/5/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Dallal re notice draft; Revise, 3.00 \$1,800.00 re-work class notice. 11/5/2013 LJL Correspondence among co-counsel re scheduling call. 0.10 \$60.00 1.20 \$720.00 11/5/2013 LJL Review and revise notice. 11/5/2013 LJL Corresp./call w/ J. Mottek re forms of notice. 0.30 \$180.00 11/5/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.20 \$98.00 \$1,715.00 Read, review and outline arguments in recent 23(f) cases and 3.50 11/5/2013 JD treatises to assess legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page29 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 151 11/5/2013 JD Review and comment on drafts of notice form; write up and 2.70 \$1,323.00 circulate suggestions re organization; emails and confer w/J. Saveri and L. Leebove re same. 0.70 11/5/2013 JD Calls and emails re calendar, depo scheduling, coverage for \$343.00 depositions; request updates to case calendar. 11/5/2013 JD Review, edit, and sign letter to court clerk requesting replacement 0.80 \$392.00 copy of non-public document per request of P. Lall and instructions of J. Saveri. 11/5/2013 **JRS** Telephone conference with co-counsel re expert issues. 0.60 \$576.00 11/5/2013 **JRS** Case management. 0.30 \$288.00 11/5/2013 **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 Organize 23(f) opposition. 11/5/2013 **JRS** 2.80 \$2,688.00 Settlement administration; review and revise form of notice; telephone conference with Jonathan Mitchell re escrow document and incumbency certification; review documents. 11/6/2013 PLDeposition notices (Manning/Hallock). 0.20 \$63.00 11/6/2013 PLFor J. Dallal, downloaded Marx deposition notice. 0.10 \$31.50 11/6/2013 PL0.20 \$63.00 Email correspondence with J. Saveri re Manning/Marx/Hallock deposition notices and an order. 0.10 \$31.50 11/6/2013 PL Conference with J. Dallal re creating binders for expert reports (Marx, etc.). 11/6/2013 For J. Saveri, printed out expert report of Matthew Marx to 0.10 \$31.50 PLprepare deposition-related binders. 11/6/2013 PLAssist J. Saveri with preparation re expert deposition. 0.50 \$157.50 11/6/2013 JPD 2.80 \$2,240.00 Research re potential R23(f) issues. 11/6/2013 \$60.00 LJL Review incoming depo notices; correspondence among co-counsel 0.10 re same. 11/6/2013 \$1,500.00 LJL Legal research re 23(f). 2.50 11/6/2013 \$1,620.00 LJL Additional preparatory research/reading re 23(f) issues 2.70 11/6/2013 \$1,960.00 JD Read, review and outline arguments in recent 23(f) and class 4.00 certification cases and treatises to assess legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal. 11/6/2013 JD Review appellate rules and emails w/J. Saveri and case team re 0.50 \$245.00 scheduling and coverage for 23(f) response.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page30 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number:	1010 1004			5/20/2015 Page:152
11/6/2013 J	JD	Review and comment on additional drafts of notice to class members; emails and confer w/L. Leebove re same.	1.50	\$735.00
11/6/2013 J	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and J. Saveri, draft instructions, and collect and organize documents for preparation of expert report binders per request of J. Saveri.	0.60	\$294.00
11/6/2013 J	JD	Emails and confer w/P. Lall and D. Clevenger re downloading filings and calendar updates.	0.20	\$98.00
11/6/2013 J	IRS	Case management.	1.80	\$1,728.00
11/6/2013 J	JRS	Mediation issues; telephone conference with David Rotman.	0.80	\$768.00
11/6/2013 J	IRS	Telephone conference with John Mitchell; review and revise escrow papers; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; review settlement agreements; review and revise notice; conference with L. Leebove.	4.20	\$4,032.00
11/6/2013 I	LJL	Correspondence w/ JSLF team re 23(f) scheduling.	0.20	\$120.00
11/6/2013 J	IRS	Conference with P. Lall re materials for Matthew Marx deposition.	0.50	\$480.00
11/7/2013 F	PL	For J. Saveri, combined component documents/attachments into final Intuit Settlement doc.	0.20	\$63.00
11/7/2013 F	PL	For J. Saveri, combined component documents/attachments into final Intuit Settlement doc.	0.40	\$126.00
11/7/2013 F	PL	For J. Saveri, combined component documents/attachments into final Lucas-Pixar Settlement doc.	0.20	\$63.00
11/7/2013 F	PL	Conference with J. Saveri re Intuit and Lucas-Pixar Settlement documents.	0.20	\$63.00
11/7/2013 F	PL	For J. Dallal, printed out expert reports and created deposition preparation binders.	4.30	\$1,354.50
11/7/2013 I	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody, J. Mottek/Heffler re settlement fund tax issues	0.30	\$180.00
11/7/2013 I	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Davis, J. Dallal re scheduling.	0.10	\$60.00
11/7/2013 I	LJL	Begin reviewing 23(f) brief.	0.80	\$480.00
11/7/2013 J	ID	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.10	\$49.00
11/7/2013 J	ID	Confer w/L. Leebove and J. Davis re schedule and coverage for 23(f) petition response.	0.20	\$98.00
11/7/2013 J	ID	Research re legal standards and applicability of recent case precedent in advance of anticipated 23(f) appeal.	3.00	\$1,470.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page31 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 153 11/7/2013 JD Review 23(f) petition; download and organize filing on S drive per 1.20 \$588.00 request of J. Saveri. \$3,072.00 11/7/2013 JRS Prepare for expert depositions. 3.20 11/7/2013 **JRS** Mediation issues; telephone conference with David Rotman. 1.80 \$1,728.00 11/7/2013 **JRS** Review escrow documents; settlement administration; review 1.10 \$1,056.00 drafts; telephone conference with John Mitchell. 3.40 11/8/2013 PLFor J. Saveri, transferred to PowerPoint presentation re \$1,071.00 preparation of expert witnesses for deposition, converted slides to PDF then by OCR to Word as text file. JPD Review 23(f) petition; telephone conference with J. Saveri re 4.90 \$3,920.00 11/8/2013 same; draft opposition. Work on 23(f) project: Conf. call w/ J. Davis, J. Dallal re brief; 6.30 \$3,780.00 11/8/2013 LJL review and analyze petition; correspondence/discussion among co-counsel re issues and assigments; TC w/ B. Glackin; notice of appearance; research and drafting. 11/8/2013 LJL Work on 23(f) brief. 1.50 \$900.00 11/8/2013 JD Review 23(f) brief; identify primary factual contentions; review 12.00 \$5,880.00 deposition transcripts, case law, and class certification orders to identify facts responsive to factual contentions in brief; schedule conference call; emails and call w/L. Leebove and J. Davis to discuss strategy and scheduling for response; write memorandum summarizing factual contentions and avenues for response per request and instructions of J. Saveri. 11/8/2013 **JRS** Case management; telephone conference with co-counsel. 1.70 \$1,632.00 11/8/2013 **JRS** Expert work; prepare for depositions. 5.80 \$5,568.00 **JRS** 2.20 11/8/2013 Settlement; review and revise escrow agreement; telephone \$2,112.00 conference with David Kiernan; review and revise documents; e-mail to counsel. 11/8/2013 **JRS** 3.90 \$3,744.00 Organize 23(f) opposition; review 23(f) petition. 11/8/2013 1.00 \$960.00 JRS Case management; review order. **JRS** \$1,056.00 11/8/2013 Review and organize settlement documentation. 1.10 11/8/2013 **JRS** 23(f) issues; telephone conference with Josh Davis; telephone \$3,072.00 3.20 conference with L. Leebove; review 23(F) Petition. \$1,920.00 11/8/2013 **JRS** Prepare for expert depositions. 2.00 11/8/2013 **JRS** 1.20 \$1,152.00 Settlement administration; telephone conference with David Kiernan; review drafts; review and revise escrow documents.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page32 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 154 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$6,560.00 JPD 8.20 11/9/2013 Draft 23(f) opposition. \$1,800.00 11/9/2013 LJL Work on brief. 3.00 2.00 \$980.00 11/9/2013 JD Review, comment on and emails re draft 23(f) response brief section circulated by J. Davis; review cases and fact background re use of aggregated data in antitrust cases. Review and revise 23(f) opposition. 4.20 \$4,032.00 11/9/2013 **JRS** \$1,056.00 **JRS** Settlement documentation; review e-mails; review and revise 1.10 11/9/2013 settlement documentation. \$2,560.00 Telephone conference with L. Leebove; draft 23(f) opposition. 3.20 11/10/2013 JPD Phone call w/ J. Davis; work on 23(f) brief. 1.40 \$840.00 11/10/2013 LJL \$1,200.00 2.00 11/10/2013 LJL More work on 23(f) brief. 5.00 \$2,450.00 11/10/2013 JD Draft 23(f) response section on 23(f) standards; collect and circulate cases and relevant excerpts re use of aggregated data in antitrust cases; write up and circulate suggestion for argument re standard applied in district court opinion; begin drafting of 23(f) response section on case procedural history. \$192.00 11/10/2013 JRS 0.20 Case management. 0.90 \$864.00 11/10/2013 JRS 23(f) issues; telephone conference with Josh Davis. \$768.00 0.80 11/10/2013 JRS Settlement administration; review drafts. \$5,920.00 7.40 Three telephone conferences with L. Leebove; revise 23(f) 11/11/2013 JPD opposition. 11/11/2013 LJL Work on 23(f) brief; phone calls/communication throughout day 12.00 \$7,200.00 w/ J. Davis, J. Dallal. Review and revise draft of 23(f) response; draft and circulate 23(f) 7.50 \$3,675.00 11/11/2013 JD response section re procedural history; write up and circulate summary of cases and relevant excerpts on use of aggregated data and statistical findings in antitrust cases. 0.90 Review and revise claim forms; conference with L. Leebove. \$864.00 11/11/2013 JRS 0.70 \$672.00 11/11/2013 JRS Case management. Conference with Josh Davis; review and revise 23(f) petition 2.90 \$2,784.00 11/11/2013 JRS opposition; review and revise mediation brief. 0.70 \$672.00 Schedule expert depositions. 11/11/2013 JRS 0.30 \$180.00 Conference with J. Saveri re claim forms. 11/11/2013 LJL

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page33 of 124

Client Number:

5/20/2015

Page: 155 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.30 \$94.50 11/12/2013 PL For J. Saveri, combined component mediation documents/attachments into final brief PDF and printed. 5.40 \$4,320.00 11/12/2013 JPD Revise 23(f) opposition. \$60.00 Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Mottek re notice. 0.10 11/12/2013 LJL \$60.00 11/12/2013 LJL Communication w/ J. Dallal re status of 23(f) project. 0.10 2.00 \$980.00 Review and comment on draft of assembled 23(f) brief; emails re 11/12/2013 JD same. \$1,960.00 Read expert reports in advance of expert depositions. 4.00 11/12/2013 JD \$245.00 11/12/2013 JD Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re scheduling and coverage for 0.50 expert depositions; update case calendar. Emails and confer w/D. Clevenger and J. Saveri re purchase of 0.50 \$245.00 11/12/2013 JD Concordance software package to house case database. \$1,632.00 Settlement administration: conference with L. Leebove; review 1.70 11/12/2013 JRS and revise mediation brief; conference with Dean Harvey. 4.60 \$3,680.00 11/13/2013 JPD Revise 23(f) opposition. \$1,715.00 3.50 Read expert reports in advance of expert depositions. 11/13/2013 JD 2.80 \$1,372.00 11/13/2013 JD Search for, download, and review amicus brief; review Ninth Circuit rules re amicus filing; emails and confer w/J. Saveri and case team re same. Emails w/J. Saveri re supplement excerpts of record with 23(f) 1.40 \$686.00 11/13/2013 JD response filing; review class certification filings, expert reports, and other case materials to identify additional materials for submission. \$60.00 0.10 11/13/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Saveri re notice issues. Review and revisions/comments to 23(f) brief and correspondence 3.00 \$1,800.00 11/13/2013 LJL among counsel re same. \$1,200.00 2.00 Review and revisions to 23(f) brief and correspondence among 11/13/2013 LJL counsel re same. Correspondnece among counsel re notice of intent to file amicus 0.30 \$180.00 11/13/2013 LJL brief: review rule re same. Review mediation materials. 0.80 \$480.00 11/13/2013 LJL 0.40 \$240.00 11/13/2013 LJL Review draft of form of combined notice; re-circulate to group. \$60.00 Follow-up correspondence w/ K. Dermody, J. Dallal, J. Saveri re 0.10 11/13/2013 LJL status of notice.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page34 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 156 E-mail with amici counsel; conference with Kelly Dermody. 0.40 \$384.00 11/13/2013 JRS 11/13/2013 JRS Review and revise 23(f) petition. 1.70 \$1,632.00 1.00 \$960.00 11/13/2013 JRS Settlement issue; review and revise claim form; conference with L. Leebove. 2.50 \$1,225.00 11/13/2013 JD Review and comment on drafts of assembled 23(f) brief; review emails re same; research details of case facts an applicable case precedent and write up suggestions re same. 0.30 \$288.00 11/13/2013 JRS Review outline of 23(f) opposition. \$2,480.00 3.10 11/14/2013 JPD Revise 23(f) opposition. \$5,047.00 10.30 11/14/2013 JD Deposition of A. Manning; prepare memorandum summarizing deposition; emails re deposition preparation for further expert depositions; emails re 23(f) draft. 11/14/2013 JD Review draft of 23(f) brief; write up notes in preparation for call 1.30 \$637.00 w/J. Davis re suggested revisions; emails w/P. Lall and D. Clevenger re filing procedures and whereabouts. Review/revise 23(f) brief; correspondence w/ JSLF team re same. 1.50 \$900.00 11/14/2013 LJL 1.00 \$600.00 Review/analyze Chamber of Commerce amicus brief; brief 11/14/2013 LJL discussion w/ J. Davis re same. 11/14/2013 JRS Prepare for Mathew Marx deposition; telephone conference with 1.00 \$960.00 Dean Harvey. Prepare Alan Manning for deposition. \$2,400.00 2.50 11/14/2013 JRS \$576.00 0.60 11/14/2013 JRS Amici issues re 23(f) petition. \$4,320.00 4.50 11/14/2013 JRS Expert issues; prepare Matthew Marx for deposition. 0.80 \$768.00 11/14/2013 JRS Prepare for Matthew Marx deposition. \$2,080.00 11/15/2013 JPD Revise 23(f) opposition; telephone conference with J. Dallal. 2.60 9.30 \$4,557.00 11/15/2013 JD Deposition of M. Marx; emails re submission of excerpts of record; emails re responding to amicus filing re 23(f) appeal. 0.30 \$147.00 11/15/2013 JD Call J. Davis re suggestions for revision to 23(f) response. 11/15/2013 LJL Correspondence among counsel re responding to Chamber brief; 0.90 \$540.00 review brief and rules re responding to amicus briefing. \$60.00 Correspondence w/ J. Davis re 23(f) briefing status, work. 0.10 11/15/2013 LJL Expert issues; telephone conference with Dean Harvey; Alan 3.80 \$3,648.00 11/15/2013 JRS Manning report.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page35 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010 - 3

Page:157 Matter Number: 1004-1 1.80 \$882.00 11/16/2013 JD Review and comment on near-final version of 23(f) brief circulated by B. Glackin; collect and circulate excerpts of order and record citations re purpose of conduct per request of B. Glackin. 1.90 \$1,140.00 11/16/2013 LJL Review Marx rough transcript. 0.80 \$480.00 11/16/2013 LJL Review Glackin 23(f) rewrite. 11/16/2013 JPD Review and revise R 23(f) petition. 1.60 \$1,280.00 \$4,753.00 Deposition of K. Hallock; write up summaries of expert 9.70 11/17/2013 JD depositions; write up summary of expert deposition questioning patterns and anticipated topics for E. Leamer deposition. 0.10 \$60.00 11/17/2013 LJL Correspondence w/ J. Dallal re Hallock depo in progress. \$360.00 11/17/2013 LJL Review J. Dallal write-up re Marx; re-review portions of Marx. 0.60 11/17/2013 JPD Review and revise R 23 (f) petition. 0.40 \$320.00 2.00 \$1,920.00 11/17/2013 JRS Prepare for mediation. 11/17/2013 JRS Review opposition to 23(f). 2.40 \$2,304.00 11/18/2013 JD Deposition of E. Leamer; emails re status and suggestions for 23(f) 9.00 \$4,410.00 response brief. Rounds of correspondence w/ J. Dallal, J. Davis, D. Harvey re 0.50 \$300.00 11/18/2013 LJL status of 23(f) petition. 0.10 \$60.00 11/18/2013 LJL Correpond w/ J. Mottek re status, notice. 0.70 \$420.00 11/18/2013 LJL Review as-filed 23(f) opposition papers. 3.40 \$3,264.00 11/18/2013 JRS Case management; prepare for conference call with lead counsel; conference call. 11/18/2013 JRS 1.80 \$1,728.00 Prepare for mediation. 1.00 \$960.00 11/18/2013 JRS Review opposition to 23(f); finalize; telephone conference with Josh Davis. \$126.00 11/19/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.40 respective attorneys. 1.00 11/19/2013 JD Online research re history of contributions and relationships \$490.00 between Apple, Adobe, Google, and Intel and the US Chamber of Commerce. 1.20 \$588.00 11/19/2013 JD Prepare, sign, submit and file notice of appearance in appellate action; review appellate docket. 1.00 \$490.00 11/19/2013 JD Review final 23(f) response filing.

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page36 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number: 1010-3

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1			5/20/2015 Page: 158	
11/19/2013 LJL	Notice of appearance.	0.30	\$180.00	
11/19/2013 LJL	Calls with ECF tech support re petition filing.	0.80	\$480.00	
11/19/2013 LJL	Discussion with J. Mottek re notice/claims status, deadlines, anticipated schedule; correspondence w/ J. Saveri re same; further correspondence w/ J. Mottek re Heffler/Intel confidentiality agreement and data production issues.	1.00	\$600.00	
11/19/2013 LJL	Correspondence w/ K. Dermody re draft form of notice.	0.10	\$60.00	
11/19/2013 LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Saveri, J. Davis re progress at mediation.	0.10	\$60.00	
11/19/2013 LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Dallal re issue of Chamber of Commerce as amici.	0.10	\$60.00	
11/19/2013 JRS	Prepare for mediation; mediation.	7.50	\$7,200.00	
11/19/2013 JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00	
11/19/2013 JRS	Organize 23(f) opposition.	0.50	\$480.00	
11/19/2013 JRS	Notice issues; e-mail with L. Leebove.	0.30	\$288.00	
11/20/2013 PL	Organize database.	2.60	\$819.00	
11/20/2013 JD	Organize case file; review and update case calendar.	0.50	\$245.00	
11/20/2013 JD	Collect and organize expert materials and circulate to team members per request of J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00	
11/20/2013 JD	Background research and read treatise sections re general standard for establishing liability for overarching conspiracy in advance of call re same.	1.70	\$833.00	
11/20/2013 LJL	Calls, emails w/ J. Mottek re defendants' data production issues; review correspondence from defendants re data issues and confidentiality.	1.50	\$900.00	
11/20/2013 LJL	Additional calls, correspondence w/ J. Mottek re status, defendants' confidentiality and data production issues, call w/ Mittelbach.	1.20	\$720.00	
11/20/2013 JPD	Meeting with J. Saveri re next steps.	0.80	\$640.00	
11/20/2013 JRS	Case management.	0.40	\$384.00	
11/20/2013 JRS	Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody re settlement; schedule call with Intel; schedule mediation; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest; organize settlement demands and strategy.	1.90	\$1,824.00	
11/20/2013 LJL	Additional correspondence w/ co-counsel re response to defs' CMC update.	0.33	\$198.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page37 of 124

	010-3 004-1		5/20/2015 Page: 159
11/21/2013 PL	Organize database; conference with J. Dallal and D. Clevenger.	1.15	\$362.25
11/21/2013 JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.10	\$49.00
11/21/2013 JD	Prepare research re summary judgment opposition; call w/J. Davis re standard for proving participation in overarching conspiracy in antitrust cases; preliminary research and collection of documents per instructions of J. Davis.	1.50	\$735.00
11/21/2013 JPD	Preparation re Summary Judgment; telephone conference with J. Dallal re Summary Judgment research.	1.80	\$1,440.00
11/21/2013 JRS	Prepare for expert depositions.	3.20	\$3,072.00
11/21/2013 JRS	Mediation issues; telephone conference with David Rotman.	0.50	\$480.00
11/21/2013 JRS	Settlement negotiations; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Intel.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/21/2013 JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/22/2013 LJL	Call with C. Brown re Heffler/Apple issue.	0.40	\$240.00
11/22/2013 JD	Collect and review major cases and treatise materials re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	5.50	\$2,695.00
11/22/2013 LJL	Follow-up calls w/ J.Mottek re defendants' productions; review correspondence from Mittelbach re confidentiality; correspondence w/ J. SAveri and K. Dermody and follow-up call w/ J. SAveri re J. Mottek issue with Apple; follow-up discussions w/ J. Mottek re Apple issues.	3.80	\$2,280.00
11/22/2013 JRS	Case management; telephone conference with co-counsel; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin.	0.80	\$768.00
11/22/2013 JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with L. Leebove.	0.40	\$384.00
11/22/2013 JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re mediation.	1.00	\$960.00
11/23/2013 LJL	Call w/ J. Mottek re Apple/Heffler issue and notice.	0.70	\$420.00
11/24/2013 JRS	Settlement documentation; review e-mails; review and revise settlement documentation.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/25/2013 PL	Database organization.	2.10	\$661.50
11/25/2013 JD	Collect and review cases and legal treatises re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	2.50	\$1,225.00
11/25/2013 LJL	Review Manning depo transcript.	3.00	\$1,800.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page38 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number:	1010-3		Page: 160
11/25/2013 LJ	Notice issues; correspondence and/or calls with J. Mottek, K. Dermody, J. Saveri re deadlines and combined form of notice; review K. Dermody revisions to draft.	1.20	\$720.00
11/25/2013 LJ	Correspondence among co-leads re motion for leave to file reply.	0.20	\$120.00
11/25/2013 JR	S Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/25/2013 JR	S Settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
11/25/2013 JR	Case management; review request to file 23(f) reply.	0.80	\$768.00
11/25/2013 JR	S Review expert reports.	1.00	\$960.00
11/25/2013 JR	Settlement administration; notice issues; conference with L. Leebove.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/26/2013 PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.50	\$157.50
11/26/2013 PL	For J. Saveri, printed expert reports and assembled binder.	0.80	\$252.00
11/26/2013 PI	Organize database.	2.50	\$787.50
11/26/2013 JD	Download and organize Defendant expert reports; confer w/P. Lall re preparation of binders of same per requests of J. Saveri; review expert reports.	2.00	\$980.00
11/26/2013 JD	Review cases re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	1.50	\$735.00
11/27/2013 PI	For J. Dallal, created expert merit report binder with complete printouts of expert reports.	1.00	\$315.00
11/27/2013 LJ	L Review expert materials.	3.00	\$1,800.00
11/27/2013 LJ	L Conference call re experts.	0.90	\$540.00
11/27/2013 LJ	L Review expert materials.	2.20	\$1,320.00
11/27/2013 LJ	Rounds of correspondence w/ K. Dermody, J. Mottek re notice issues; calls w/ J. Mottek re same.	1.00	\$600.00
11/27/2013 JP	D Review expert reports.	4.10	\$3,280.00
11/27/2013 JP	Telephone conference with lead counsel re expert reports; 23(f).	0.90	\$720.00
11/27/2013 JP	D Review 23(f) reply.	1.10	\$880.00
11/27/2013 JP	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re expert reports.	0.50	\$400.00
11/27/2013 JP	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and Eric Cramer re expert reports.	0.40	\$320.00
11/27/2013 JP	PD Review expert reports (Marx, Talley, Snyder). Continued On Next Page	3.20	\$2,560.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page39 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page:161

11/27/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Davis and Eric Cramer re experts.	1.10	\$1,056.00
11/28/2013	LJL	Correspondnece w/ J. Mottek, J. Saveri, K. Dermody re notice deadline issues.	0.10	\$60.00
11/28/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/28/2013	JRS	Review expert materials.	2.50	\$2,400.00
11/29/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Mottek re notice.	0.10	\$60.00
11/29/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
11/29/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	2.10	\$2,016.00
11/29/2013	JRS	Concordance issues.	0.80	\$768.00
11/30/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
11/30/2013	JRS	Expert issues.	0.80	\$768.00
12/1/2013	JPD	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer and J. Saveri; re Talley, Snyder.	0.70	\$560.00
12/1/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
12/1/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	4.50	\$4,320.00
12/2/2013	LJL	Communications w/ J. Saveri re notice plan; review case materials and notice materials; review case schdule as pertains to notice.	0.50	\$300.00
12/2/2013	LJL	Phone call w/ D. Kiernan re notice issues; correspondence with K. Dermody, opposing counsel re notice issues.	1.00	\$600.00
12/2/2013	LJL	Review defendants' expert materials.	1.50	\$900.00
12/2/2013	LJL	Correspondence among co-leads re expert disclosures and content.	0.25	\$150.00
12/2/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	3.50	\$3,360.00
12/2/2013	JRS	Settlement administration and notice issues.	1.00	\$960.00
12/2/2013	JRS	Case administration.	0.30	\$288.00
12/2/2013	JRS	Review and revise expert report.	2.00	\$1,920.00
12/2/2013	JD	Call and email outside vendor Celerity re conversion of prior versions of database to Concordance 10 database.	0.20	\$98.00
12/2/2013	JD	Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re upcoming depositions, notice and coverage.	0.40	\$196.00
12/2/2013	JD	Review cases re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	2.50	\$1,225.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page40 of 124

Client Numbe Matter Numb				5/20/2015 Page:162
12/2/2013	JD	Update and circulate case litigation and settlement calendar; review case management orders.	0.30	\$147.00
12/2/2013	JD	Online research and request assistance from J. Davis per request of J. Saveri.	0.30	\$147.00
12/3/2013	PL	For J. Saveri, consulted with J. Dallal and started research of Lewin Report citations (finding articles/reports/etc. and creating tracking chart).	2.80	\$882.00
12/3/2013	PL	For J. Saveri, generated color versions of the Lewin and Murphy expert reports.	0.10	\$31.50
12/3/2013	LJL	Work on notice issues; conference call w/ D. Kiernan, E. Henn, K. Dermody; review settling defendants' revisions to draft notice; revisions to notice.	3.00	\$1,800.00
12/3/2013	LJL	Follow-up call w/ K. Dermody after call w/ defendants re notice.	0.30	\$180.00
12/3/2013	LJL	Revise notice.	1.20	\$720.00
12/3/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	5.30	\$5,088.00
12/3/2013	JRS	Case administration.	0.60	\$576.00
12/3/2013	JRS	Review and revise expert reports.	2.40	\$2,304.00
12/3/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and P. Lall, review K. Murphy expert report, and prepare detailed instructions for collection of materials in preparation for upcoming deposition.	1.60	\$784.00
12/3/2013	JD	Review cases re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	3.00	\$1,470.00
12/3/2013	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re depo scheduling and notice; draft notices.	0.40	\$196.00
12/4/2013	PL	For J. Saveri and J. Dallal, continued research of Lewin Report citations (locating mainly discovery material).	5.60	\$1,764.00
12/4/2013	LJL	Work on revised notice.	1.40	\$840.00
12/4/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	6.80	\$6,528.00
12/4/2013	JRS	Settlement administration.	1.10	\$1,056.00
12/4/2013	JRS	Settlement issues.	1.00	\$960.00
12/4/2013	JRS	Review and revise expert report.	2.50	\$2,400.00
12/4/2013	JD	Emails re update on case database.	0.20	\$98.00
12/4/2013	JD	Calls and email with Teris, Celerity, P. Lall and J. Saveri re conversion of database to Concordance 10 compatible version.	0.70	\$343.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page41 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Matter Numb				Page: 163
12/5/2013	PL	For J. Saveri and J. Dallal, continued research of Lewin Report citations (locating mainly discovery material).	7.10	\$2,236.50
12/5/2013	LJL	Work on notice isssues; reviews and revisions, communications among co-leads, communications/conversations w/ J. Mottek; draft letter to J. Koh.	5.50	\$3,300.00
12/5/2013	JPD	Snyder comments to Eric Cramer.	0.90	\$720.00
12/5/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	7.50	\$7,200.00
12/5/2013	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.30	\$288.00
12/5/2013	JRS	Review and revise expert report.	1.80	\$1,728.00
12/5/2013	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.20	\$588.00
12/5/2013	JD	Review cases re overarching conspiracy standard per instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	3.80	\$1,862.00
12/5/2013	JD	Calls and emails with co-counsel and P. Lall re collection of depo prep materials and assistance w/depo prep.	0.50	\$245.00
12/5/2013	JD	Prepare draft deposition notices, emails re same, calls w/O/C re same, finalize and serve same; schedule court reporters; confirm scheduling and update case calendar.	1.30	\$637.00
12/6/2013	PL	Murphy deposition preparation (printing of exhibits and creation of exhibit folders and binder).	5.00	\$1,575.00
12/6/2013	PL	Murphy deposition preparation (comparison of Murphy's different versions of CVs and materials, preparation of comparison spreadsheet).	3.10	\$976.50
12/6/2013	LJL	Work on notice issues, correspondence among co-counsel re status/strategy; review revised letter to J. Koh; prepared proposed order; coordinate w/ JSLF re filing same.	4.00	\$2,400.00
12/6/2013	JPD	Prepare comments; telephone conference with Eric Cramer re Snyder.	1.10	\$80.00
12/6/2013	JRS	Expert depositions.	2.50	\$2,400.00
12/6/2013	JRS	Settlement issues; schedule mediation.	1.10	\$1,056.00
12/6/2013	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.50	\$480.00
12/6/2013	JD	Quick review of record and emails to co-counsel re class size.	0.20	\$98.00
12/6/2013	JD	Print and prepare exhibit copies of additional deposition exhibits per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	2.00	\$980.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page42 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 164 Matter Number: 6.50 \$3,185.00 Collect documents referenced in Murphy report and prepare 12/6/2013 JD deposition exhibits per request of J. Saveri, confer w/J. Saveri and P. Lall, organize docs on system; collect and circulate versions of materials relied upon and CV from prior Murphy reports; review and edit comparison tables prepared by P. Lall. Confer w/ECI, J. Saveri and P. Lall, emails to ECI, and meet 1.30 \$637.00 12/6/2013 JD w/ECI re uploading of Concordance 8 version of database to newly installed server; follow-up calls and emails. \$480.00 0.50 Notice issues; L. Leebove e-mail. 12/6/2013 **JRS** \$7,200.00 12/7/2013 7.50 **JRS** Expert depositions. \$480.00 0.50 12/7/2013 **JRS** Case management. 0.50 \$245.00 Emails re database upload; QC checks re same. 12/7/2013 JD 12/7/2013 Deposition of K. Murphy; writeup same. 9.00 \$4,410.00 JD \$7,200.00 12/8/2013 **JRS** Expert depositions. 7.50 0.30 \$288.00 12/8/2013 **JRS** Case management. 0.20 \$98.00 12/8/2013 JD Run TextMap searches, review transcripts, compile, edit and circulate best excerpts referencing inflation and/or COLA adjustments per request of B. Glackin. 1.00 \$490.00 12/8/2013 Database issues; calls and emails re file upload; various QC JD checks to ensure integrity of upload. \$126.00 0.40 12/9/2013 PL Analyzed email correspondence between J. Saveri and J. Dallal re finding material contradicting Lewin arguments. 0.40 \$126.00 12/9/2013 PL Email correspondence with J. Dallal re outcome of Murphy deposition of 2013-12-07 and potential next steps. \$2,100.00 Work on notice issues w/ co-counsel and opposing counsel and J. 3.50 12/9/2013 LJL Mottek. 8.50 \$8,160.00 12/9/2013 **JRS** Prepare for Lewin deposition. \$1,536.00 12/9/2013 **JRS** Review expert reports; telephone conference with co-counsel; case 1.60 management. 0.30 \$288.00 12/9/2013 **JRS** Reivew and revise case management conference statement. \$672.00 0.70 12/9/2013 **JRS** Review and revise notice. 8.50 \$4,165.00 12/9/2013 JD Deposition of L. Stiroh 0.40 \$196.00 Emails re Murphy deposition and planning for future depos w/P. 12/9/2013 JD Lall.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page43 of 124

Client Number Matter Number				5/20/2015 Page:165
12/9/2013	JD	Run TextMap searches, review transcripts, compile, edit and circulate best excerpts referencing inflation and/or COLA adjustments per request of B. Glackin.	1.30	\$637.00
12/9/2013	JD	Collect and organize new materials relied upon in Murphy report per request of J. Saveri for rebuttal expert report.	1.40	\$686.00
12/9/2013	JD	Review expert reports and depo transcripts for admissions re internal equity for Lewin depo per request of J. Saveri; circulate docs.	0.40	\$196.00
12/10/2013	PL	For J. Saveri and J. Dallal: printed copies of 2013-11-25 Lewin Expert Report and excerpts from books, etc. to prepare both attorney binder and exhibit folders for 2013-12-11 Lewin deposition.	4.70	\$1,480.50
12/10/2013	PL	For J. Dallal, conducted teleconference with Lexis Nexis Concordance representative to resolve HTCC database initiation problems and corresponded via email with J. Dallal re progress.	2.40	\$756.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Review Manning reply.	1.00	\$600.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Review Leamer reply.	2.00	\$1,200.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Review Lewin materials.	1.00	\$600.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Correspondence w/ J. Dallal, B. Glacking re Manning reply; review expert materials.	1.20	\$720.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Review Marx reply.	1.00	\$600.00
12/10/2013	LJL	Correspondence among counsel re Manning reply.	0.20	\$120.00
12/10/2013	JRS	Prepare for Lewin deposition.	8.10	\$7,776.00
12/10/2013	JRS	Review expert reports.	1.30	\$1,248.00
12/10/2013	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
12/10/2013	JRS	Telephone conference with co-counsel.	0.80	\$768.00
12/10/2013	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and J. Saveri and instruct P. Lall re completion of exhibit sets for D. Lewin deposition; print and prepare extra exhibits per request of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
12/10/2013	JD	Review draft expert report and comment on co-counsel proposal not to submit rebuttal Manning report; calls and emails to J. Saveri re same.	0.40	\$196.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page44 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 166 Matter Number: 0.90 \$441.00 Compile and batch-OCR documents collected for Adobe 12/10/2013 JD compensation expert depositions, identify and circulate best documents concerning internal equity applied to integration of workers added in acquisitions per request of J. Saveri; forward set to P. Lall for inclusion as deposition exhibits. 0.80 \$392.00 Draft and circulate suggestion for expert reports regarding 12/10/2013 JD interlocking directors argument; draft and circulate condensed version per request of B. Glackin. 6.90 \$3,381.00 Deposition of E. Becker. 12/10/2013 JD \$787.50 12/11/2013 PL Database issues for J. Dallal, conducted Concordance 2.50 problem-solving teleconference with agent re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress by email periodically. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.20 \$63.00 12/11/2013 PL respective attorneys. 0.20 \$63.00 12/11/2013 PL For J. Saveri, set up Lewin depo prep-related print project. \$180.00 0.30 12/11/2013 LJL Communications w/ J. Mottek re plans for notice, status. \$900.00 12/11/2013 LJL Correspondence among co-counsel re submitting experts' reports; 1.50 review reports. 3.00 \$1,800.00 12/11/2013 LJL Rounds of correspondence re CMC statement, submission of form of notice; work on both w/ K. Dermody, A. Shaver. 0.40 \$240.00 12/11/2013 LJL Coordinate w/ J/ Dallal re ECF filing. 10.50 \$10,080.00 12/11/2013 JRS Prepare for and take Lewin deposition. 1.00 \$960.00 12/11/2013 JRS Review expert reports. 1.00 \$960.00 12/11/2013 JRS Review and revise notices. 1.00 \$960.00 Review and revise order; review and revise letter to Judge Koh. 12/11/2013 JRS 8.80 \$4,312.00 12/11/2013 JD Deposition of D. Lewin. 12/11/2013 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 1.10 \$539.00 0.40 \$196.00 12/11/2013 RJM Telephone conference and email correspondence with L. Leebove re filing letter to court re revised forms of notice and proposed order. \$63.00 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.20 12/12/2013 PL respective attorneys. \$180.00 12/12/2013 LJL Call/correspondence w/ J. Dallal re plaintiff Marshall. 0.30 \$960.00 1.00 12/12/2013 JRS Notice issues; review and revise notice.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page45 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number:	1010 : 1004			5/20/2015 Page:167
12/12/2013 J	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	1.00	\$490.00
12/12/2013 J	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and review database to test functioning of image viewing capability.	0.60	\$294.00
12/12/2013 J	JD	Review primary cases and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	4.00	\$1,960.00
12/12/2013 J	JRS	Review and revise 23(f) petition.	1.00	\$960.00
12/12/2013 J	JPD	Correspond with L. Leebove re Brandon Marshall.	0.30	\$240.00
12/13/2013 F	PL	Database issues; telephone conference with Help Desk.	1.00	\$315.00
12/13/2013 J	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.50	\$245.00
12/13/2013 J	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and advise on requesting additional support with conversion of image database to allow viewing of document images.	0.50	\$245.00
12/13/2013 J	JD	Review primary cases and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	4.50	\$2,205.00
12/13/2013 J	JD	Review ECF and pleadings and prepare and save revised distribution list.	0.40	\$196.00
12/14/2013 J	JRS	Expert issues.	1.00	\$960.00
12/15/2013 J	JRS	Expert issues; review and revise order.	1.20	\$1,152.00
12/15/2013 J	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
12/16/2013 F	PL	For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving teleconference with ECI agent re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically.	0.60	\$189.00
12/16/2013 F	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
12/16/2013 J	JRS	Expert issues.	1.00	\$960.00
12/16/2013 J	JRS	Review and revise notice.	0.80	\$768.00
12/16/2013 I	LJL	Multiple rounds of correspondence and communications w/ K. Dermody, J. Mottek re notice issues, defendants' internal notices; online research re defendant notice efforts.	1.40	\$840.00
12/16/2013 J	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re image database errors and potential solutions and advise on seeking assistance.	0.20	\$98.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page46 of 124

5/20/2015

Page: 168

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

12/16/2013 JD 4.00 \$1,960.00 Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. \$945.00 12/17/2013 PL 3.00 For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving teleconference with both ECI agent Rudy Villafane and Lexis Nexis Concordance agents (Jessica S. and Tia J.) re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. 12/17/2013 JRS 0.50 \$480.00 Expert issues. \$1,920.00 12/17/2013 JRS Review and revise notice; prepare for conference call; telephone 2.00 conference with Kelly Dermody; prepare for conference call; conference call. 12/17/2013 LJL Review def's internal Q&A notice and comments re same; 1.00 \$600.00 correpsondence w/ J. Saveri, K. Dermody, G. Stone re same. 12/17/2013 LJL 2.00 \$1,200.00 Review revised notice with all defendant comments; review prior drafts of notice and court-approved form for comparison; communications w/ co-counsel re same; phone call w/ J. Saveri re same. \$294.00 12/17/2013 JD Confer w/P. Lall re image database errors and potential solutions 0.60 and advise on seeking assistance. 12/17/2013 JD Verify case schedule and confer w/J. Saveri re Case Management 0.50 \$245.00 Conference. 3.50 \$1,715.00 12/17/2013 JD Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. 12/18/2013 PL 1.30 For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving email \$409.50 correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agents Jessica S. and Jules McNeill re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. 7.00 12/18/2013 JRS Prepare for case management conference; case management \$6,720.00 conference; Daubert issues; telephone conference with Josh Davis; telephone conference with Eric Cramer. 12/18/2013 LJL Work on notice issues. 1.00 \$600.00 12/18/2013 JD Review, comment on, and propose edits for revised notice of class 0.60 \$294.00 settlement circulated by L. Leebove. 12/18/2013 JD Emails re schedule for Leamer deposition. 0.20 \$98.00 \$2,695.00 12/18/2013 JD Prepare for and attend Case Management Conference. 5.50

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page47 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number:	1010-3 1004-1		5/20/2015 Page:169
12/19/2013 PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
12/19/2013 PL	HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically.	1.60	\$504.00
12/19/2013 JR	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
12/19/2013 JR	Review and revise notice.	0.80	\$768.00
12/19/2013 LJ	Daubert research and reading.	5.50	\$3,300.00
12/19/2013 JPI	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Daubert.	0.20	\$160.00
12/19/2013 JD	Deposition of E. Leamer.	8.50	\$4,165.00
12/19/2013 JD	Confer w/B. Glackin, email w/J. Saveri, and schedule call re allocation of Daubert motion pages.	0.50	\$245.00
12/20/2013 PL	For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving teleconference and email correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agent Jessica S. re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically.	1.20	\$378.00
12/20/2013 PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
12/20/2013 JR	Notice issues.	1.40	\$1,344.00
12/20/2013 JD	Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard, plus factors, and joint and several liability in the context of conspiracy in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	6.50	\$3,185.00
12/21/2013 JR	Notice issues.	0.80	\$768.00
12/21/2013 JR	Review expert reports re Daubert; case management.	3.80	\$3,648.00
12/21/2013 JD	Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard, plus factors, and joint and several liability in the context of conspiracy in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	6.00	\$2,940.00
12/22/2013 JR	Notice issues.	0.70	\$672.00
12/22/2013 JR	Review expert reports re Daubert.	2.70	\$2,592.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page48 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010 - 3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 170 12/22/2013 JD Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum 6.00 \$2,940.00 on overarching conspiracy standard, plus factors, and joint and several liability in the context of conspiracy in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. 1.10 \$346.50 12/23/2013 PL For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving teleconference and email correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agents Jessica Solano and Jules McNeill re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. 12/23/2013 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.10 \$31.50 respective attorneys. 2.50 \$1,500.00 12/23/2013 LJL Review Lewin transcript. 12/23/2013 LJL Work on notice issues. 1.50 \$900.00 12/23/2013 LJL Daubert research/reading re scope of expert testimony versus 3.50 \$2,100.00 province of the jury/factfinder. 12/23/2013 JD 10.50 \$5,145.00 Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard, plus factors, and joint and several liability in the context of conspiracy in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. 12/24/2013 PL For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving 0.90 \$283.50 teleconference and email correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agent Jules McNeill re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. \$196.00 12/24/2013 JD Review and comment on letter objecting to rebuttal Leamer report. 0.40 12/24/2013 JD 7.10 \$3,479.00 Review treatises and case law and prepare detailed memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard, plus factors, and joint and several liability in the context of conspiracy in preparation for opposition to summary judgment per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; circulate memo; emails re same; review additional case per request of J. Davis; compile and print additional cases for review on holiday break. 12/26/2013 LJL Emails w/ K. Dermody, G. Stone; call w/ J. Mottek re notice 0.25 \$150.00 issues. 12/31/2013 JD Collect and send expert reports, depo transcripts, and ROG 0.80 \$392.00 responses and summarize re Daubert motion re K. Murphy analysis per request and instructions of J. Saveri and S. Schalman-Bergen.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page49 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 171 Matter Number: 3.00 \$1,470.00 Review additional cases suggested by J. Davis and integrate into 12/31/2013 JD memorandum on overarching conspiracy standard; review treatises cases on per se vs. rule of reason. 1/2/2014 PLFor J. Dallal, conducted prep for Concordance problem-solving 0.50 \$157.50 teleconference with Lexis Nexis Concordance agent Jessica S. scheduled for 1/3/14 re HTCC database issues. \$160.00 1/2/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re co-conspirator theory. 0.20 8.50 \$4,165.00 1/2/2014 JD Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. 0.20 \$192.00 1/2/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with J. Davis re co-conspirator exception. PL1.60 \$504.00 1/3/2014 For J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving teleconference and email correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agent Jessica Solano re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. \$31.50 0.10 1/3/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys. \$384.00 0.40 1/3/2014 **JRS** Case administration; telephone conference with J. Dallal. 0.70 \$672.00 1/3/2014 **JRS** Notice issues. \$1,840.00 2.30 1/3/2014 JPD Review J. Dallal memorandum re conspiracy; e-mail response. 0.40 \$196.00 1/3/2014 JD Calls and emails w/J. Saveri and S. Schalman-Bergen to plan strategy for Daubert motions; review orders and case calendar re same. 1/3/2014 Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and draft 8.10 \$3,969.00 JD memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. 12.00 \$5,880.00 1/4/2014 JD Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises, summarize and shepherdize major cases on Monsanto-Matsushita standard and draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; ; review and summary of MTD briefing and main cases. 1/5/2014 **JRS** Review and revise Daubert motion. 1.30 \$1,248.00 \$3,675.00 7.50 1/5/2014 JD Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises, develop plus factors standards and summarize main cases, and draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; develop outline of overarching conspiracy argument; emails re same.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page50 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010 - 3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 172 \$504.00 1/6/2014 PLFor J. Dallal, conducted Concordance problem-solving 1.60 teleconference and email correspondence with Lexis Nexis Concordance agent Jessica Solano re HTCC database issues and informed J. Dallal of progress periodically. 0.50 \$480.00 1/6/2014 **JRS** Case administration. \$1,728.00 1/6/2014 **JRS** Review and revise Daubert. 1.80 1/6/2014 **JRS** 0.70 \$672.00 Review summary judgment standards. \$1,617.00 1/6/2014 JD Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and draft 3.30 memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis. \$784.00 1/6/2014 JD Confer w/ECI and P. Lall re database upload; extensive review of 1.60 Relativity and Concordance database versions to identify folder of Intel documents only available in Relativity; update database and review for integrity. 2.40 \$1,176.00 1/6/2014 JD Review, comment on and draft proposed edits for Daubert motion re K. Murphy per request of J. Saveri. Processed/saved letters from Harvey (2014-01-06) and Riley 0.30 \$94.50 1/7/2014 PL(2013-12-23)1/7/2014 **JRS** Daubert issues; reveiw and revise memorandum. 2.00 \$1,920.00 1.00 \$960.00 1/7/2014 **JRS** Class notice issues. **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 1/7/2014 Telephone conference with co-counsel. 1/7/2014 5.50 \$2,695.00 JD Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and update draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; prepare and circulate executive summary memo of main standards and key facts. 1/7/2014 JD Review and comment on draft of Daubert motion and draft and 1.30 \$637.00 circulate section re reliance of defendants expert on whether and ACS data. 0.20 \$63.00 1/8/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys. \$288.00 **JRS** 0.30 1/8/2014 Case administration. \$1,536.00 1/8/2014 **JRS** Review and revise Daubert motion. 1.60 \$768.00 1/8/2014 **JRS** Review order; notice issues. 0.80 \$1,280.00 JPD 1.60 1/8/2014 Review Murphy Daubert motion.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page51 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Numb)4-1		Page: 173
1/8/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Murphy Daubert brief.	0.20	\$160.00
1/8/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and update draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; research cases on monopsony and bid-rigging.	3.30	\$1,617.00
1/8/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft Daubert motion; enter and revise handwritten notes of J. Saveri per request of J. Saveri; circulate draft Murphy brief, confer w/co-counsel, and forward requested cases to co-counsel; revise and prepare alternative Murphy sections per request and instructions of J. Saveri and circulate to team.	4.20	\$2,058.00
1/8/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Davis.	0.20	\$192.00
1/9/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
1/9/2014	JRS	Review and revise Daubert motion.	3.50	\$3,360.00
1/9/2014	JRS	Notice issues.	0.70	\$672.00
1/9/2014	JRS	Review summary judgment motions.	1.60	\$1,536.00
1/9/2014	JD	Review and comment on Intel motion for summary judgment.	0.60	\$294.00
1/9/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft Daubert motion; calls and emails w/J. Saveri and co-counsel re same; review Murphy transcript for admissions per request of D. Harvey.	2.30	\$1,127.00
1/9/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and update draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; review and shepherdize cases identified by J. Saveri	4.00	\$1,960.00
1/10/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	4.50	\$1,417.50
1/10/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, prepared binder of defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment (Google unredacted, Adobe, Apple, Intel, Joint).	0.60	\$189.00
1/10/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, began process of saving unredacted versions of filings to JSLF system.	1.40	\$441.00
1/10/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, emailed Motions for Summary Judgment (Adobe, Apple, Intel, Google unredacted, Joint) to Eric Cramer and J. Davis and discussed preparation of binders for next week.	0.60	\$189.00
1/10/2014	JRS	Notice issues; telephone conference with Greg Stone.	0.80	\$768.00
1/10/2014	JRS	Mediation issues.	0.30	\$288.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page52 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/20/2015 Page: 174

1/10/2014	IDC	Deview aumory independent metions	1.00	\$960.00
1/10/2014	JRS	Review summary judgment motions.		
1/10/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; draft case summaries re good and bad cases concerning plus factors and conspiracy from bilateral agreements; meeting w/J. Saveri to discuss progress and next steps.	6.00	\$2,940.00
1/10/2014	JD	Review and comment on summary judgment and Daubert filings; confer w/J. Saveri; confer w/P. Lall re downloading and organizing filings on system.	3.50	\$1,715.00
1/11/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and update draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; review, summarize, and synthesize additional plus factors cases.	5.50	\$2,695.00
1/12/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Review cases and treatises and update draft memo on overarching conspiracy standard per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and J. Davis; review, summarize, and synthesize additional plus factors cases and cases cited in summary judgment briefing.	5.50	\$2,695.00
1/13/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, completed saving unredacted versions of filings to JSLF system.	1.60	\$504.00
1/13/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, processed 2013-12-07 Murphy Errata Sheet.	0.20	\$63.00
1/13/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	1.30	\$409.50
1/13/2014	JPD	Review J. Dallal memorandum.	0.40	\$320.00
1/13/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re J. Dallal memorandum.	0.10	\$80.00
1/13/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re summary judgment.	0.30	\$240.00
1/13/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Saveri regarding research assignment.	0.20	\$98.00
1/13/2014	JRS	Review and revise expert motions.	1.30	\$1,248.00
1/13/2014	JRS	Settlement; schedule mediation.	1.00	\$960.00
1/13/2014	JRS	Organize opposition; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	1.20	\$1,152.00
1/13/2014	JD	Meeting w/J. Saveri to discuss research priorities; additional summary judgment research on criminal conspiracy cases, synthesize and shepherdize per requests of J. Saveri; further research into Gilley line of cases; complete and circulate draft of overarching conspiracy memo and review comments of J. Saveri and J. Davis.	9.20	\$4,508.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page53 of 124

5/20/2015

Page: 175

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

Research re secrecy/proof of conspiracy. 0.80 \$392.00 1/13/2014 **RJM** 1.90 \$598.50 1/14/2014 PLOrganize case file. \$378.00 1/14/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 1.20 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 0.30 \$94.50 1/14/2014 PL For J. Saveri, processed unredacted Cisneros exhibits 7, 8, 10, and 13 from Christina Brown's email. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to \$472.50 1/14/2014 PL 1.50 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 1/14/2014 PLDatabase issues; organize case file. 0.10 \$31.50 3.60 \$2,880.00 1/14/2014 JPD Review summary judgment motions. \$160.00 1/14/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re summary judgment 0.20 opposition. 1/14/2014 **JRS** Prepare summary judgement opposition. 1.70 \$1,632.00 1/14/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody re trial preparation. 0.30 \$288.00 0.50 \$480.00 1/14/2014 **JRS** Settlement. 1/14/2014 **JRS** Case management; review filings. 0.50 \$480.00 1/14/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration issues; telephone conference with Jackie 0.40 \$384.00 Mottek. \$192.00 1/14/2014 **JRS** Review news clippings re case development. 0.20 JD 5.60 \$2,744.00 1/14/2014 Summary judgment research on criminal conspiracy cases, Gilley line of cases; other labor market antitrust conspiracy cases per requests and instructions of J. Saveri. 0.80 \$392.00 1/14/2014 JD Collect and circulate major cases cited in summary judgment briefing and memo on overarching conspiracy per request of J. Saveri; confer w/P. Lall. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.20 \$63.00 1/15/2014 PLrespective attorneys. \$189.00 1/15/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via PACER. 0.60 \$598.50 1/15/2014 PLFor J. Saveri, prepared MTD-related binder 1.90 (order/briefs/transcripts) re Joint MTD and Lucasfilm MTD and emailed related docs to J. Davis and E. Cramer.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page54 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Numb		04-1		Page: 176
1/15/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and Eric Cramer re summary judgment.	0.60	\$480.00
1/15/2014	RJM	Update JSLF website with recent case activity.	1.00	\$490.00
1/15/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Van Nest; schedule mediation; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	0.30	\$288.00
1/15/2014	JRS	Correspondence with Mathew Marx.	0.70	\$672.00
1/15/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer and Josh Davis re summary judgment research.	0.50	\$480.00
1/15/2014	JRS	Conference with James Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
1/15/2014	JD	Close review of motions for summary judgment against factual record for misstatements and inconsistent facts; write up summary of same in preparation for further conference w/J. Saveri and calls re summary judgment strategy.	1.90	\$931.00
1/15/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Further research into MTD and MSJ orders and present case progress in nurses' cases and other labor market antitrust cases per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	3.30	\$1,617.00
1/15/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re research and next steps.	0.50	\$245.00
1/15/2014	JD	Draft and circulate email summary of relevant Ninth Circuit cases citing Interstate Circuit per request of J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00
1/15/2014	JD	Collect and circulate Daubert motions and Motion to Strike Leamer testimony per request of E. Cramer.	0.40	\$196.00
1/15/2014	JD	Draft and circulate memo summarizing and synthesizing Gilley line of cases per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	2.60	\$1,274.00
1/15/2014	JD	Draft and circulate email summary of major criminal conspiracy cases cited in MTD and MSJ cases per request of J. Saveri.	1.20	\$588.00
1/15/2014	JD	Review 23(f) order, confer w/J. Saveri and D. Clevenger and post to website.	0.60	\$294.00
1/15/2014	JD	Identify and update pleading exemplars for use in templates per request of D. Clevenger.	0.40	\$196.00
1/16/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
1/16/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	1.00	\$960.00
1/16/2014	JRS	Review and revise facts re summary judgment; conference with J. Dallal.	2.30	\$2,208.00
1/16/2014	JRS	Case management; review statement of cost fund and B. Glackin decisions.	0.50	\$480.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page55 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/20/2015

 Page: 177

1/16/2014	JD	Emails and calls re team-wide call to plan SJ opposition brief.	0.30	\$147.00	
1/16/2014	JD	Summary judgment research: Further research into MTD and MSJ orders and case progress in nurses' cases and other labor market antitrust cases per requests and instructions of J. Saveri; write up and circulate summary re same; review buyers' cartel cases.	6.20	\$3,038.00	
1/17/2014	PL	Conferred with J. Dallal regarding motion for summary judgment and read background case information from class certification order.	1.40	\$441.00	
1/17/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50	
1/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re summary judgment briefing.	0.10	\$80.00	
1/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re summary judgment briefing.	0.40	\$320.00	
1/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re summary judgment briefing.	0.10	\$80.00	
1/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with co-counsel re summary judgment briefing.	0.20	\$160.00	
1/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer re summary judgment briefing.	0.20	\$160.00	
1/17/2014	JRS	Review summary judgment evidence; telephone conference with J. Dallal; telephone conferences with Josh Davis.	3.80	\$3,648.00	
1/17/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00	
1/17/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; Baldwin correspondence.	0.60	\$576.00	
1/17/2014	JRS	Review summary judgment evidence.	2.80	\$2,688.00	
1/17/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri; further review summary judgment briefing and memo and compile template of facts to establish for summary judgment opposition; revise and edit based on comments form J. Saveri; emails re same.	4.90	\$2,401.00	
1/17/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re summary judgment and evidence collection project, provide instructions and key documents to review	1.40	\$686.00	
1/17/2014	JD	Calls and emails w/J. Saveri and J. Davis re summary judgment briefing; calls w/co-counsel re research assignments to other class counsel.	1.10	\$539.00	
1/17/2014	JD	Compile and circulate compendium of conspiracy cases, revise and recirculate per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page56 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 178 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.50 \$480.00 1/18/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. \$288.00 0.30 1/18/2014 **JRS** Case management. \$1,715.00 1/18/2014 JD Summary judgment research; review remaining cases re secrecy as 3.50 plus factor; update memo on overarching conspiracy standard; revise plaintiffs' contentions table per comments of J. Saveri. Summary judgment research; review plus factor cases and 3.50 \$1,715.00 1/19/2014 JD conclude memo on overarching conspiracy standard. 0.50 \$480.00 1/20/2014 JRS Telephone conference with Josh Davis and Eric Cramer. 2.00 \$1,920.00 **JRS** Reivew summary judgment outline; review and revise summary 1/20/2014 judgment opposition. \$288.00 0.30 1/20/2014 **JRS** Conference with J. Dallal; case administration. \$1,840.00 1/20/2014 JPD Opposition to summary judgment. 2.30 \$400.00 1/20/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri and Eric Cramer re summary 0.50 judgment opposition. \$2,940.00 Call w/J. Saveri re evidence collection and next steps; review 6.00 1/20/2014 JD MTD and class cert briefing and prepare per-Defendant tables of plaintiffs' contentions; emails re same; review Adobe deposition exhibits and transcripts re same. Read background case information from class certification order, 3.00 \$945.00 1/21/2014 PLmore. 2.20 \$2,112.00 Telephone conference with J. Dallal; review and revise summary 1/21/2014 **JRS** judgment opposition. 0.30 \$288.00 1/21/2014 **JRS** Case management. \$1,152.00 1/21/2014 **JRS** 1.20 Settlement administration. 8.00 \$3,920.00 Review MTD and class cert briefing and prepare per-Defendant 1/21/2014 JD tables of plaintiffs' contentions; circulate and finalize based on comments from J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri re SJ strategy; review Adobe deposition exhibits and transcripts re same. 0.70 \$672.00 **JRS** Case administration. 1/22/2014 \$1,248.00 1/22/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration; telephone conference with Jacqueline 1.30 Mottek. Settlement issues; telephone conference with David Rotman. 1.00 \$960.00 1/22/2014 **JRS** \$3,920.00 8.00 1/22/2014 JD Review Adobe deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page57 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 179 Matter Number: 1004-1 1/22/2014 JD Confer w/J. Saveri and D. Clevenger and prepare update on 1.10 \$539.00 settlement notice for posting to website. 1.20 \$1,152.00 1/23/2014 **JRS** Notice issues. Review and revise summary judgment opposition; conference with \$1,728.00 1/23/2014 **JRS** 1.80 J. Dallal. 1/23/2014 **JRS** Case administration. 0.70 \$672.00 Review Chizen transcript to identify evidence for use in summary 2.00 \$980.00 1/23/2014 JD judgment opposition. 0.10 \$31.50 PLFor J. Saveri, saved attachment from inter-office email to 1/24/2014 correspondence subfolder. 1/24/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with defense counsel re 3.40 \$3,264.00 notice. Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re summary 0.50 \$400.00 1/24/2014 JPD judgment. 1/24/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Dallal re opposition to motion for 0.20 \$160.00 summary judgment. \$196.00 1/24/2014 JD Update Intel summary judgment evidence table; calls and emails 0.40 w/J. Saveri re same. \$3,920.00 1/24/2014 JD Review Adobe deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile 8.00 evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; circulate table to team. 0.70 \$343.00 JD Calls w/J. Saveri and J. Davis re summary judgment opposition 1/24/2014 strategy. **JRS** Telephone conferences with J. Davis and J. Dallal re summary 1.10 \$1,056.00 1/24/2014 judgment opposition. 0.40 \$384.00 1/25/2014 **JRS** Case administration. 1/25/2014 JRS Review and revise summary judgment opposition. 1.30 \$1,248.00 5.60 \$2,744.00 1/25/2014 JD Review Intel deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; emails re summary judgment strategy. 0.30 \$288.00 1/26/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. Review and revise summary judgment opposition; e-mail to J. \$960.00 1/26/2014 **JRS** 1.00 Dallal. 1/26/2014 Review Intel deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile 7.00 \$3,430.00 JD evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page58 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 180 1/27/2014 **JRS** Review and revise summary judgment opposition; conference with 2.50 \$2,400.00 J. Dallal. 1/27/2014 **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 Case management. 1/27/2014 JD Update Apple plaintiffs' contention table based on evidence 0.50 \$245.00 collected; begin review of Apple materials. 1/27/2014 Review Intel deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile 6.30 \$3,087.00 JDevidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; circulate completed Intel table to team. \$196.00 1/27/2014 JD Call from putative class member; calls and emails re same. 0.40 Update website to point to live versions of case documents. 0.30 \$147.00 1/27/2014 JD 1/27/2014 JD Class member call. 0.20 \$98.00 \$819.00 1/28/2014 PLRead background case information from class certification order, 2.60 more. 1/28/2014 PL 0.20 \$63.00 Filed all loose documents into physical file folder. 1/28/2014 **JRS** Review factual support for summary judgment opposition; 2.00 \$1,920.00 conference with J. Dallal. 1/28/2014 **JRS** Case management; telephone conference re Intel settlement. 0.70 \$672.00 1/28/2014 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 0.70 \$343.00 1/28/2014 JD Review Apple deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile 3.30 \$1,617.00 evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion. For J. Saveri, verified presence of and emailed 2013-12-06 Snyder 0.10 \$31.50 1/29/2014 PLreport. 1/29/2014 PL For J. Saveri, located and emailed copies of all 1.20 \$378.00 class-certification-related briefs/motions/orders. 1/29/2014 PLDiscussed deposition transcript download project (Kramm) with J. 0.30 \$94.50 Dallal. 1/29/2014 PL For J. Saveri, located protective order signature subfolder and 0.20 \$63.00 saved Koonan's signature PDF. For J. Saveri, located and emailed unredacted copy of plaintiffs' 0.60 \$189.00 1/29/2014 PL supplemental motion and brief in support of class certification. PL 4.10 \$1,291.50 1/29/2014 Read background case information from class certification order, order re motions to dismiss in preparation for motion for summary judgment.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page59 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 181 1/29/2014 KR Confer with James Dallal re reviewing deposition transcripts for 4.50 \$2,205.00 Opposition to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment, review Defs' MSJ. 1/29/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to motion to 0.40 \$320.00 dismiss. **JRS** Prepare for meeting with National Jury Project. 0.80 \$768.00 1/29/2014 Expert issues; conference with P. Lall. 1/29/2014 **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 1/29/2014 Case management. **JRS** Claims and settlement administration. 0.30 \$288.00 1/29/2014 1/29/2014 **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 Schedule Intel mediation. 1/29/2014 **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 Telephone conference with Brendan Glackin re summary judgment. \$98.00 Confer w/P. Lall re downloading and organizing additional 0.20 1/29/2014 JD transcripts for use as supporting exhibits at SJ/trial. 1/29/2014 JD Review Apple deposition transcripts and exhibits and W. 8.00 \$3,920.00 Campbell transcript and compile evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; confer w/K. Rayhill re assistance on same project. 1/30/2014 PL For J. Dallal, downloaded deposition transcripts (Kramm.com). 0.90 \$283.50 1/30/2014 PLResponded to J. Saveri's emailed request for copy of Apple's 0.10 \$31.50 unredacted Motion for Summary Judgment. 1/30/2014 KR Review Tim Cook and Mark Bentley depo transcripts for 8.00 \$3,920.00 Opposition to Defs' MSJ. \$240.00 1/30/2014 **JPD** Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to summary 0.30 judgment. 1/30/2014 **JRS** Meeting with National Jury Project. 1.30 \$1,248.00 1/30/2014 **JRS** Case management. 0.40 \$384.00 1/30/2014 **JRS** Summary judgment opposition; telephone conference with Dean 1.00 \$960.00 Harvey; telephone conference with Josh Davis; telephone conference with Eric Cramer. 0.50 \$480.00 1/30/2014 **JRS** Review Eric Cramer memorandum re conspiracy. 0.50 \$480.00 1/30/2014 **JRS** Schedule mediation.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page60 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 182

1/30/2014	JD	Review Apple deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; review Schmidt transcript re same; emails to J. Saveri re progress; update Apple plaintiffs' contentions based on evidence compiled and circulate to team; review comments re same.	11.00	\$5,390.00	
1/30/2014	JD	Review Apple answers to interrogatories against verifications to identify verifying witnesses as part of summary judgment analysis.	0.40	\$196.00	
1/30/2014	JD	Collect cases on summary judgment and circulate per requests of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00	
1/31/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, began process of researching and documenting all party representatives for National Jury Project.	1.80	\$567.00	
1/31/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, downloaded deposition transcripts (Kramm.com).	1.50	\$472.50	
1/31/2014	PL	For R. McEwan, printed out case preparation materials and prepared binder.	1.30	\$409.50	
1/31/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, researched case material on Lexis, emailed to respective attorneys and printed out for J.S.	1.10	\$346.50	
1/31/2014	PL	Scanned/saved unredacted version of Order for Plaintiffs' Motion for Class Certification, emailed to J. Saveri.	0.50	\$157.50	
1/31/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, printed out printed out case preparation materials.	0.30	\$94.50	
1/31/2014	KR	Review Mark Bentley and Tony Fadell depo transcripts for Opposition to Defs' MSJ.	4.00	\$1,960.00	
1/31/2014	JPD	Review outline; J. Saveri opposition to Apple summary judgment.	1.10	\$880.00	
1/31/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal regarding opposition to summary judgment; conference with J. Dallal regarding same; conference with J. Saveri regarding opposition brief.	0.90	\$441.00	
1/31/2014	RJM	Review and analyze Defendants' joint and individual motions for summary judgment as well as Berger Montague's research memorandum regarding same.	3.00	\$1,470.00	
1/31/2014	JRS	Review and revise opposition to motion for summary judgment; conference with J. Dallal.	1.20	\$1,152.00	
1/31/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Josh Davis.	0.50	\$480.00	
1/31/2014	JRS	Settlement issues re Intel; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	0.60	\$576.00	
1/31/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Mittlestaedt re Adobe.	0.50	\$480.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page61 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010 - 3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 183 1/31/2014 JD Review Apple deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile 6.30 \$3,087.00 evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; confer w/K. Rayhill re same; review Lucas and Catmull transcripts re same; circulate partially filled table to team. 1/31/2014 0.30 \$147.00 JD Update firm website to establish link to settlement administrator website per request of J. Saveri. \$588.00 1/31/2014 JD Review and comment on draft of summary judgment argument 1.20 sent by J. Saveri; collect main cases from co-counsel research and circulate to team; circulate prior research on major civil and criminal conspiracy cases. **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 1/31/2014 Settlement administration; conference with J. Dallal. 2/1/2014 KR Review Tony Fadell depo transcript for Opposition fo Defs' MSJ. 2.00 \$980.00 2/1/2014 **RJM** Research regarding opposition to summary judgment and draft 9.00 \$4,410.00 sections of brief. 2/1/2014 **RJM** Telephone conference with J. Saveri regarding opposition brief. 0.40 \$196.00 2/1/2014 **JRS** Review and revise summary judgment opposition; telephone 2.00 \$1,920.00 conference with R. McEwan; review J. Davis e-mail. 2/1/2014 JPD E-mail to J. Saveri re Apple opposition to summary judgment. 0.70 \$560.00 8.00 \$3,920.00 2/1/2014 JD Review Apple deposition transcripts and exhibits and compile evidence into table for summary judgment oppostion; circulate completed table to team; confer w/K. Rayhill re same; write up summary of factual findings re Apple; confer w/R. McEwan and circulate prior summary judgment research. 2/2/2014 KR 3.00 \$1,470.00 Read Sergey Brin depo Transcript for Opposition to Defs' MSJ. 9.00 \$4,410.00 2/2/2014 Conduct research for and draft sections of opposition brief to **RJM** summary judgment; revise and comment on draft of same. 2/2/2014 **JRS** Review and revise summary judgment opposition. 2.20 \$2,112.00 \$2,560.00 2/2/2014 JPD Review draft and e-mails and opposition for summary judgment; 3.20 telephone conference with J. Saveri. 2/2/2014 JD Per requests and instructions of J. Saveri, review and revise draft 8.00 \$3,920.00 consolidated MSJ opposition; review Adobe evidence table and draft Adobe insert; review Intel evidence and draft Intel insert. 1.60 \$784.00 2/2/2014 JD Review and revise summary judgment opposition; write up additional summary judgment points re Apple witnesses, external effects of conspiracy, efforts to expand, and knowledge necessary for showing of conspiracy; circulate to team and review comments.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page62 of 124

5/20/2015

1010-3

Client Number:

Matter Numb		04-1		Page: 184
2/3/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, continued process of researching and documenting all party representatives for National Jury Project.	3.10	\$976.50
2/3/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Dallal regarding opposition brief.	0.30	\$147.00
2/3/2014	RJM	Review opposition brief and conduct research regarding same.	1.50	\$735.00
2/3/2014	JPD	Review opposition to motion for summary judgment.	2.10	\$1,680.00
2/3/2014	JD	Review draft MSJ opposition brief circulated by J. Davis.	0.50	\$245.00
2/3/2014	JD	Per requests and instructions of J. Saveri, review Apple evidence table and draft and cite-check Apple insert for MSJ opposition brief.	6.30	\$3,087.00
2/3/2014	JD	Write up and circulate email summary of proposed argument discussing comparison with noncompetes and right to work issue for possible inclusion in opposition brief.	0.50	\$245.00
2/3/2014	JD	Prepare revised version of Adobe section per redline draft of J. Saveri; cite-checking for same.	0.80	\$392.00
2/3/2014	JD	Email response to question about class member inquiry.	0.20	\$98.00
2/3/2014	JD	Revise Intel section for draft MSJ opposition, draft and collect citations for Intel-Pixar section.	1.60	\$784.00
2/3/2014	JD	Confer w/R. McEwan re remaining tasks on MSJ opp brief.	0.30	\$147.00
2/4/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, continued process of researching and documenting all party representatives for National Jury Project.	1.20	\$378.00
2/4/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, saved email attachments from Dean M. Harvey re mediation.	0.10	\$31.50
2/4/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Saveri regarding brief and email correspondence regarding same with J. Saveri, J. Davis, J. Dallal.	0.30	\$147.00
2/4/2014	RJM	Review updated draft of opposition to summary judgment brief and research issues related to proving overarching conspiracy.	1.50	\$735.00
2/4/2014	JPD	Review opposition to motion for summary judgment.	2.20	\$1,760.00
2/4/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.10	\$80.00
2/4/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.30	\$240.00
2/4/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri, Brendan Glackin, Dean Harvey, re opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.40	\$320.00
2/4/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and emails w/J. Saveri and R. McEwan re opposition brief.	0.30	\$147.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page63 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page:185

2/4/2014	JD	Review and respond to J. Davis email re MSJ opposition concerns; write up email summary of proposed argument for distinguishing key defense cases as yet unaddressed by draft opposition.	1.60	\$784.00
2/4/2014	JD	Write up proposed footnote and respond to D. Harvey questions re payout by Apple to key fact witness.	0.70	\$343.00
2/4/2014	JD	Review MSJ Opposition and identify possible deletions based on redundant material.	1.00	\$490.00
2/4/2014	JD	Prepare redline draft MSJ opposition incorporating additional collaboration evidence; review and comment on draft MSJ opposition.	2.30	\$1,127.00
2/4/2014	JRS	Summary judgment opposition; telephone conference with team.	0.60	\$576.00
2/5/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, continued process of researching and documenting all party representatives for National Jury Project.	1.60	\$504.00
2/5/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, read/saved/printed National Jury Project overview and schedules.	0.30	\$94.50
2/5/2014	KR	Proof read Opposition to MSJ.	2.00	\$980.00
2/5/2014	RJM	Revise and email correspondence with JSLF team regarding same.	0.50	\$245.00
2/5/2014	RJM	Revise opposition brief.	1.50	\$735.00
2/5/2014	JRS	Adobe settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	0.80	\$768.00
2/5/2014	JPD	Review opposition to motion for summary judgment, telephone conference with J. Saveri, Brendan Glackin, Dean Harvey.	0.90	\$720.00
2/5/2014	JPD	Review opposition to motion for summary judgment; telephone conference with J. Saveri.	2.20	\$1,760.00
2/5/2014	JD	Confer w/R. McEwan and K. Rayhill to divide up sections; review MSJ opposition; prepare and circulate revised redline reflecting all JSLF edits to operative version of brief.	4.50	\$2,205.00
2/5/2014	ĴD	Confer w/J. Saveri, multiple emails re edits to draft insert re case law not yet addressed, revise and cite-check insert to integrate all edits and send to D. Harvey per instructions of J. Saveri.	1.80	\$882.00
2/5/2014	JD	Write up additional proposal for collaboration argument based on Google interrogatory responses and circulate to team.	0.30	\$147.00
2/5/2014	JD	Draft, edit, cite-check and condense insert for MSJ opposition brief distinguishing case law not yet addressed per instructions of J. Davis.	2.70	\$1,323.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page64 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 186 0.60 \$576.00 2/5/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with co-counsel and J. Davis; review summary judgment opposition. For J. Dallal, tested Concordance for accessibility of database files 2/6/2014 PL4.00 \$1,260.00 and documented findings to discuss with Concordance representative. 2/6/2014 **RJM** Research 9th Circuit and N.D. Cal rules regarding citations and 0.40 \$196.00 discuss same with J. Saveri. 2/6/2014 \$240.00 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri; e-mail re opposition to 0.30 motion for summary judgment. 2/6/2014 JD Spot-check Concordance database, confer w/P. Lall re tests to 0.80 \$392.00 identify problem documents and plan for resolving problems w/Concordance staff. JD \$637.00 2/6/2014 Review revised insert re distinguishing case law, confer w/J. 1.30 Saveri re same, emails re same. JD Email response to and confer w/J. Saveri re email from putative 0.30 \$147.00 2/6/2014 class member. 2/6/2014 **JRS** Review summary judgment opposition; telephone conference with 0.70 \$672.00 J. Davis; conference with J. Dallal. 2/7/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 3.40 \$1,071.00 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 2/7/2014 PL Teleconference with J. Dallal and Jessica Solano of 1.30 \$409.50 Concordance/Lexis-Nexis re problem with database file accessibility. 0.20 \$63.00 2/7/2014 PLSet up subfolder for documents related to Heffler Claims administration (status reports, etc.) and saved related documents. 2/7/2014 JD Download and organize all .OPT files from Relativity database 1.40 \$686.00 extraction; rename files with duplicate names; identify overlapping .OPT files. 2/7/2014 1.90 \$931.00 JD Review Oppositions to Leamer and Marx Dauberts; review Defendants' opposition to Plaintiffs' Daubert motion; confer w/P. Lall re filing on system. 2/7/2014 JD \$49.00 Call to J. Saveri and email re agreement to extend time on sealing 0.10 motion. 2/7/2014 JD Review MSJ opposition. 0.70 \$343.00 2/7/2014 JD Call w/J. Solano of Concordance and P. Lall re Concordance 1.30 \$637.00 database and possible fixes.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page65 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1 5/20/20 Page: 1						
2/7/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Dallal re summary judgment opposition.	0.40	\$384.00		
2/10/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	0.70	\$220.50		
2/10/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re February 19th hearing.	0.10	\$80.00		
2/10/2014	JD	Summary judgment opposition; database issues; .OPT files and identify and commence keying in mapping information for previously unmapped .OPTs.	6.50	\$3,185.00		
2/11/2014	PL	Teleconference with J. Dallal and Jessica Solano of Concordance re database problem solving.	0.30	\$94.50		
2/11/2014	JD	Summary judgment; opposition database issues; review Defendant production volumes that had lacked mapping information; write up report on progress per request of J. Saveri.	7.50	\$3,675.00		
2/12/2014	PL	Conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re database progress, CaseMap planning agenda.	0.60	\$189.00		
2/12/2014	JD	Summary judgment opposition; database issues; assemble folder containing all up-to-date .OPT files in preparation for replacing image database.	3.50	\$1,715.00		
2/12/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and P. Lall re Concordance databse, CaseMap file of contentions and evidence, and preparation for trial.	0.60	\$294.00		
2/13/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00		
2/13/2014	PL	Conference with J. Dallal re documentation of facts from Concordance database in CaseMap.	0.10	\$31.50		
2/13/2014	PL	Teleconference training session with Rozanne Langley of Lexis Nexis CaseMap on CaseMap 10 to begin process of factual analysis casework.	1.70	\$535.50		
2/13/2014	JD	Per request and instructions of J. Saveri, combine summary judgment tables, class certification holdings, and expert report findings into integrated chart of plaintiffs' contentions for use in trial prep.	3.50	\$1,715.00		
2/13/2014	JD	Organized databasees; reindex Concordance database to allow for creation of substitute .OPT files from documents already loaded.	1.20	\$588.00		
2/13/2014	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal re organization of databases for summary judgment and trial.	0.70	\$672.00		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page66 of 124

Client Numbe Matter Numbe				5/20/2015 Page:188
2/14/2014	PL	For J. Saveri and J. Dallal, prepared binder of plaintiffs' oppositions to defendants motions for summary judgment and Daubert motions.	1.40	\$441.00
2/14/2014	PL	For J. Saveri and J. Dallal, prepared binder of mediation-related documents.	0.90	\$283.50
2/14/2014	JD	Organize database for summary judgment and trial; extract information from Concordance database to create exemplars for vendor estimate and forward same to Celerity.	2.10	\$1,029.00
2/14/2014	JD	Per request of J. Saveri, collect best 5-6 documents per defendant and other materials for mediation; confer w/J. Saveri re needs for mediation; identify and edit additional depo transcript exhibits; collect opposition briefing for MSJ and Daubert binders; confer w/P. Lall and provide instructions on assembly of binders per request of J. Saveri.	2.50	\$1,225.00
2/14/2014	JRS	Prepare for mediation; conference with J. Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
2/14/2014	JRS	Review list of parties for mock trial.	0.40	\$384.00
2/16/2014	JRS	Prepare for mediation.	2.00	\$1,920.00
2/17/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.80	\$768.00
2/18/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, created CaseMap 10 suite for this case and entered facts from 2014-02-13 Plaintiffs' Contentions spreadsheet.	1.90	\$598.50
2/18/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.30	\$94.50
2/18/2014	JD	Emails re and begin assembly of witness list per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
2/18/2014	JD	Organize database for summary judgment and trial; confer w/J. Saveri re emails re same.	2.00	\$980.00
2/18/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re design and required fields for creation of CaseMap database to organize documents and testimony in advance of trial; collect and circulate source documents.	0.70	\$343.00
2/19/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, modified CaseMap 10 suite and added persons and organizations, adding links and relevant information.	3.20	\$1,008.00
2/19/2014	PL	With J. Dallal, discussed creation of witness list.	0.30	\$94.50
2/19/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, compared Dean Harvey's listed of attorneys/parties/witnesses to the list J. Dallal and I had prepared.	0.80	\$252.00
2/19/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Karen Jo Koonan; prepare for mock trial.	2.50	\$2,400.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page67 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number		1004-1		Page: 189
2/19/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.50	\$480.00
2/19/2014	JD	Check expert and counsel information prepared by P. Lall and research and supplement with missing names and addresses; assemble full witness list from deposition record, organize by Defendant and identify 30(b)(6) witnesses; compare against alternative list forwarded by co-counsel to identify missing names per request of J. Saveri.	2.80	\$1,372.00
2/19/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re witness list, CaseMap project etc.	0.30	\$147.00
2/20/2014	PL	Conferred with J. Dallal about CaseMap strategy, moved CaseMap file to S Drive, and entered Google facts into CaseMap.	0.60	\$189.00
2/20/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
2/20/2014	JRS	Prepare for mock trial; telephone conference with Karen Jo Koonan; settlement administration.	3.50	\$3,360.00
2/20/2014	JD	Organize database for summary judgment and trial; assemble .OPT files and commence checking folder-by-folder to verify completeness; review online instructions re deleting existing image database from Concordance 10 database.	1.50	\$735.00
2/20/2014	JD	Review deposition exhibits to identify material useful for filling in Word tables of evidence and comparison against plaintiffs' contentions; update plaintiffs' contentions; email J. Saveri re status.	3.00	\$1,470.00
2/20/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re CaseMap updates and strategy and Word tables of Plaintiffs' contentions; reviewed CaseMap file for completeness and accuracy.	0.60	\$294.00
2/21/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, began comparison of Adobe facts table to consolidated facts table to document sources.	3.20	\$1,008.00
2/21/2014	JD	Complete review of deposition exhibits to identify material useful for filling in Word tables of evidence and comparison against plaintiffs' contentions; create witness list table and fill in with documents from non-settling defendants; email summary and preliminary witness list to J. Saveri.	4.00	\$1,960.00
2/21/2014	JD	Review work by P. Lall in linking evidence previously gathered for summary judgment research to related facts in Word tables of Plaintiffs' contentions.	0.40	\$196.00
2/21/2014	JD	Emails to co-counsel re transcript request and plan for reply brief due 2/27.	0.20	\$98.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page68 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1 5/20/2 Page:					
2/24/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	2.80	\$882.00	
2/24/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, concluded comparison of Adobe facts table to consolidated facts table to document sources and began comparison of Apple facts table.	2.70	\$850.50	
2/24/2014	PĽ	Respond to J. Saveri's email re updating the JSLF web site re case developments.	0.20	\$63.00	
2/24/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Davis; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	1.10	\$1,056.00	
2/24/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; Melissa Baldwin e-mail.	0.70	\$672.00	
2/24/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00	
2/24/2014	JD	Complete entry of key documents into witness list spreadsheet; organize witness list by Defendant and according to "will call" and "may call" designations and deliver completed list per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	2.80	\$1,372.00	
2/24/2014	JD	Compare public and unredacted versions of summary judgment opposition filing and email summary of findings to J. Saveri; confer w/P. Lall re same.	0.40	\$196.00	
2/24/2014	JD	Website update per requests of J. Saveri and D. Clevenger.	0.30	\$147.00	
2/25/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, documented comparisons of consolidated Plaintiffs' Contentions table versus Apple and Intel fact tables.	2.60	\$819.00	
2/25/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	0.80	\$252.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Davis; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	2.00	\$1,920.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Case managmenet; organize litigation account; Brendan Glackin e-mail.	0.70	\$672.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt.	1.00	\$960.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Robert Van Nest.	0.20	\$192.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Jacqueline Mottek.	0.80	\$768.00	
2/25/2014	JRS	Review witness list.	0.50	\$480.00	
2/25/2014	JD	Organize database for summary judgment and trial; complete review of assembled .OPT files to verify completeness.	1.30	\$637.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page69 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number: 1010-3

Matter Number		004-1		Page: 191
2/25/2014	JD	Review draft Reply ISO Daubert motion and compare Defendants' opposition and briefing re Defendants' Daubert motion to exclude Marx; write up recommendations and circulate to JSLF team.	2.00	\$980.00
2/26/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	2.90	\$913.50
2/26/2014	JRS	Review and revise Daubert reply; telephone conference with J. Dallal; telephone conference with J. Davis.	1.00	\$960.00
2/26/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; e-mail to Gregory Stone.	0.90	\$864.00
2/26/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; e-mail to Melissa Baldwin.	0.80	\$768.00
2/26/2014	JRS	Review and revise status report; e-mail to Dean Harvey.	0.80	\$768.00
2/26/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Jacqueline Mottek; claims administration.	0.80	\$768.00
2/26/2014	JD	Commence review of class cert orders and evidence submitted for class cert briefing to identify material supporting contentions to be proven at trial; add new material to plaintiffs' contentions table.	2.00	\$980.00
2/26/2014	JD	Organize database for summary judgment and trial; upload collected .OPT files to create new image database for Concordance 10 document database; checks to verify media keys associated with entries.	0.80	\$392.00
2/26/2014	JD	Internal emails re suggestions for Reply brief ISO Daubert motion.	0.50	\$245.00
2/27/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	3.20	\$1,008.00
2/27/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with the New York Times.	0.80	\$768.00
2/27/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.60	\$576.00
2/27/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; e-mail to Kelly Dermody.	0.70	\$672.00
2/27/2014	JRS	Review reply re Daubert; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	1.50	\$1,440.00
2/27/2014	JRS	Motion to exclude; e-mail to counsel.	1.00	\$960.00
2/27/2014	JD	Review class cert orders and evidence submitted for class cert briefing to locate material supporting contentions to be proven at trial; add new material to plaintiffs' contentions and add new proposed facts.	2.50	\$1,225.00
2/27/2014	JD	Review deposition transcript of M. Chau for facts relevant to contentions to be proven at trial per request of J. Saveri.	1.30	\$637.00
2/27/2014	JD	Review draft Reply ISO Daubert motion; internal emails re propsoed edits. Continued On Next Page	0.70	\$343.00
		9		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page70 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 192

2/27/2014	JD	Search correspondence and collect background materials re discovery abuses in interrogatory response verification; assemble exhibit PDFs for possible inclusion in filing and draft and circulate summary of findings.	1.00	\$490.00
2/27/2014	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.20	\$98.00
2/28/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	5.30	\$1,669.50
2/28/2014	JRS	Review facts in opposition to motion for summary judgment; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	1.70	\$1,632.00
2/28/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.50	\$480.00
2/28/2014	JRS	Case managmenet.	0.40	\$384.00
2/28/2014	JD	Prepare and table of contentions with supporting evidence collected for MSJ but not included in existing charts of plaintiffs contentions and circulate with recommendations for additions.	0.50	\$245.00
2/28/2014	JD	Complete review of class cert orders and documents submitted with class cert briefing; add new material to plaintiffs' contentions table; review plaintiffs' contentions table for completeness of supporting evidence.	2.50	\$1,225.00
2/28/2014	JD	Emails to J. Saveri re progress on database, plaintiffs' contentions, and plan for summary judgment argument.	0.30	\$147.00
2/28/2014	JD	Review Defendants Reply briefs ISO Daubert motions and MSJs.	2.00	\$980.00
3/1/2014	RJM	Update website with recent developments in case; email correspondence with J. Saveri regarding same.	1.00	\$490.00
3/1/2014	JRS	Review facts in opposition to motion for summary judgment; e-mail to J. Davis.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/1/2014	JRS	Review New York Times story.	0.30	\$288.00
3/3/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.60	\$576.00
3/3/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief.	3.50	\$3,360.00
3/3/2014	JRS	Adobe settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
3/3/2014	JPD	Review Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.80	\$2,240.00
3/4/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, created 3 binders (for Dallal/Saveri/Davis) of motions for summary judgment, oppositions to MSJs, motions to exclude expert reports/testimony, and oppositions to those motions.	5.40	\$1,701.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page71 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 193 Matter Number: 1004-1 2.80 \$2,688.00 3/4/2014 **JRS** Review and revise brief; conference with J. Dallal. 1.00 \$960.00 3/4/2014 **JRS** Case management. 1.00 \$960.00 3/4/2014 **JRS** Adobe settlement issue. 2.70 \$2,592.00 3/4/2014 Prepare for summary judgment opposition. **JRS** 2.00 \$1,920.00 3/4/2014 **JRS** Focus group script. 2.30 \$1,127.00 3/4/2014 JD Draft, edit and finalize preliminary approval papers. 3/5/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.20 \$63.00 respective attorneys. \$3,552.00 3.70 3/5/2014 **JRS** Review and revise brief; conference with J. Dallal. 3.00 \$2,880.00 **JRS** Prepare for summary judgment opposition. 3/5/2014 3/5/2014 **JRS** Review and revise case management conference statement. 0.70 \$672.00 \$576.00 3/5/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. 0.60 \$480.00 0.50 3/5/2014 **JRS** Case management. \$160.00 JPD Telephone conference with J. Dallal re Motion for Summary 0.20 3/5/2014 Judgment. Review final approval brief drafts and email edits to Brendan 0.70 \$343.00 3/5/2014 JD Glackin per request of J. Saveri. 0.50 \$245.00 3/5/2014 JD Call with class member S. K. re submitting claim; memorandum to file 3.80 \$1,862.00 JD Calls and emails w/J. Saveri and J. Davis re preparation for 3/5/2014 summary judgment hearing; review briefing from Defendants' summary judgment motions. 2.40 \$2,304.00 Prepare for summary judgment motion. 3/6/2014 **JRS** 1.10 \$1,056.00 3/6/2014 **JRS** Adobe settlement issues. **JRS** 1.20 \$1,152.00 3/6/2014 Focus group script. Review and revise case management conference statement; 1.00 \$960.00 3/6/2014 **JRS** telephone conference with Anne Shaver. Settlement administration; conference with J. Dallal; telephone 1.10 \$1,056.00 3/6/2014 **JRS** conference with class member. 1.50 \$735.00 Review and revise Memorandum of Understanding with Adobe; 3/6/2014 RJM compare to previous Settlement Agreements with Intuit, LucasFilm, and Pixar.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page72 of 124

5/20/2015

1010-3

Client Number:

Client Number: Matter Number:		1010-3 1004-1					
3/6/2014	JD	Review summary judgment briefing; assist J. Saveri in summary judgment motion preparation.	2.00	\$980.00			
3/6/2014	JD	Review and comment on drafts of CMC statement per requests of J. Saveri.	0.80	\$392.00			
3/6/2014	JD	Organize and upload fee brief filings to website per requests of L. Cisneros and J. Saveri.	1.00	\$490.00			
3/6/2014	JD	Draft and circulate brief memo re call w/class member per request of J. Saveri.	0.60	\$294.00			
3/7/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, prepared MSJ review binder (72 exhibits).	4.30	\$1,354.50			
3/7/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	2.30	\$724.50			
3/7/2014	JRS	Prepare for summary judgment hearing; review focus group material; case management; telephone conference with J. Dallal; Adobe settlement issues; settlement administration issues.	3.80	\$3,648.00			
3/7/2014	RJI	M Review/revise Memorandum of Understanding.	0.60	\$294.00			
3/7/2014	JPI	Analyze Summary Judgment Briefs.	3.30	\$2,640.00			
3/7/2014	JD	Arrange for courier to deliver replacement copy of summary judgment materials to J. Davis.	0.30	\$147.00			
3/7/2014	JD	Call w/class member E.D. and writeup re same.	0.50	\$245.00			
3/7/2014	JD	Review summary judgment briefing, collect 37 most relevant cases, and prepare tabbed binders for upcoming hearing per request and instructions of J. Saveri.	3.50	\$1,715.00			
3/7/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and provide detailed instructions re preparation of exhibit binders per request of J. Saveri; forward required documents.	0.50	\$245.00			
3/7/2014	JD	Review and update internal case calendar.	0.30	\$147.00			
3/8/2014	JRS	Prepare for summary judgment hearing.	6.10	\$5,856.00			
3/8/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; prepare for call with Phillips.	0.80	\$768.00			
3/8/2014	JRS	Review and revise to focus group script; case managmenet.	1.80	\$1,728.00			
3/9/2014	JRS	Prepare for summary judgment hearing.	4.50	\$4,320.00			
3/9/2014	JRS	S Settlement issues; telephone conference with Layn Phillips.	1.00	\$960.00			
3/9/2014	JRS	Review and revise focus group script.	2.50	\$2,400.00			
3/9/2014	JPI	Analyze Summary Judgment Brief; research.	2.70	\$2,160.00			

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page73 of 124

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/20/2015

Page: 195

4.40 \$1,386.00 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 3/10/2014 PL respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. For J. Saveri, located exhibits containing later versions of Apple 0.90 \$283.50 3/10/2014 PLDo Not Cold Call lists and created Focus Group subfolder to monitor related information. 3/10/2014 PL For J. Saveri, located and printed copy of deposition of Sheryl 0.10 \$31.50 Sandberg. 1.50 \$1,440.00 3/10/2014 **JRS** Review JSA; conference with R. McEwan. **JRS** 2.80 \$2,688.00 3/10/2014 Prepare for hearing. Review and revise focus group materials. \$2,400.00 3/10/2014 **JRS** 2.50 \$672.00 0.70 3/10/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues. 1.10 \$1,056.00 **JRS** Telephone conference with Karen Jo Koonan. 3/10/2014 Conference with J. Saveri regarding settlement and sharing 0.30 \$147.00 3/10/2014 **RJM** agreements. 1.50 \$735.00 3/10/2014 **RJM** Research regarding sharing agreements. \$4,320.00 5.40 3/10/2014 JPD Analyze Summary Judgment Brief; research. \$196.00 3/10/2014 Call and email w/P. Lall re exhibits for use in upcoming focus 0.40 JD group presentations. 3/11/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 2.70 \$850.50 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 1.00 \$315.00 PL For J. Dallal, researched information re importing OCR'd text from 3/11/2014 HTCC PDF does in Concordance and conferred re oral arguments in motion for summary judgment. 0.80 \$252.00 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 3/11/2014 PLrespective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. PLWith J. Dallal, conferred re Judge Koh's decision to evaluate MSJ 0.10 \$31.50 3/11/2014 without oral argument. 3.00 \$2,880.00 3/11/2014 **JRS** Review and revise focus group materials; telephone conference with Brendan Glackin. \$1,056.00 1.10 3/11/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues. 0.30 \$288.00 3/11/2014 **JRS** Case management. \$960.00 1.00 3/11/2014 **JRS** Prepare for hearing.

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page74 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 196

3/11/2014	RJM	Research regarding joint sharing agreements; email J. Saveri regarding same and discuss same with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$490.00
3/11/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Dallal re Summary Judgment and Daubert.	0.20	\$160.00
3/11/2014	JD	Research issues re joint MSJ on damages analysis required for viable antitrust claim; confer w/J. Saveri and emails and calls w/J. Saveri and J. Davis re revised plans for hearing preparation in light of Court's order that individual MSJ's will be decided on papers.	2.80	\$1,372.00
3/11/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re Concordance issues and revised needs for hearing prep in light of court's order re distribution of motions for hearing.	0.60	\$294.00
3/12/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.10	\$346.50
3/12/2014	JRS	Prepare for hearing; conference with J. Dallal.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/12/2014	JRS	Review and revise focus group materials.	1.90	\$1,824.00
3/12/2014	JRS	Prepare for hearing.	2.50	\$2,400.00
3/12/2014	JRS	Case management.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/12/2014	JRS	Mock trial materials; review and revise script.	1.30	\$1,248.00
3/12/2014	JRS	Review order.	1.00	\$960.00
3/12/2014	JD	Review and update case correspondence file.	0.20	\$98.00
3/12/2014	JD	Research cases re discoverability of JSA; confer w/R. McEwan and J. Saveri re same; download relevant cases; search discovery record for requests for insurance agreements or other agreements among Defendants	3.80	\$1,862.00
3/13/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	5.40	\$1,701.00
3/13/2014	PL	Conferred with J. Dallal re gathering of facts from court orders.	0.10	\$31.50
3/13/2014	JRS	Amicus issues; review draft brief; conference with R. McEwan.	1.00	\$960.00
3/13/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Bradley Phillips; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
3/13/2014	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00
3/13/2014	JRS	Prepare for argument.	1.70	\$1,632.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page75 of 124

Client Number Matter Number				5/20/2015 Page:197
3/13/2014	JD	Review briefing on Plaintiffs' Daubert motion per request of J. Saveri to prepare for hearing.	1.00	\$490.00
3/13/2014	JD	Call w/class members re procedures for filing claim.	0.40	\$196.00
3/13/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re focus group prep, hearing prep, and case management.	0.30	\$147.00
3/14/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.60	\$504.00
3/14/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with K. Dermody; telephone conference with J. Dallal re judgment sharing agreement.	1.80	\$1,728.00
3/14/2014	JRS	Prepare for Daubert motion; conference with Josh Davis.	2.00	\$1,920.00
3/14/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips.	1.00	\$960.00
3/14/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Summary Judgment and Daubert.	0.20	\$160.00
3/14/2014	JD	Per request of J. Saveri, review Plaintiffs' Daubert Motion, outline argument, and download, organize, and prepare electronic set of all cases re exclusion arguments, MSJ premised on exclusion of damages expert, and JSA.	6.50	\$3,185.00
3/14/2014	JD	Call w/J. Saveri re JSA.	0.20	\$98.00
3/15/2014	JRS	Prepare for mock trial; mock trial.	12.00	\$11,520.00
3/15/2014	JD	Travel to/from and attend focus group.	8.50	\$4,165.00
3/16/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.70	\$672.00
3/16/2014	JRS	Review mock trial results prepare for hearing.	1.20	\$1,152.00
3/16/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
3/16/2014	JPD	Review plaintiffs' motion to exclude defendants' experts.	3.30	\$2,640.00
3/17/2014	JRS	Trial preparation.	1.00	\$960.00
3/17/2014	JRS	Review focus group materials; telephone conference with Karen Jo Koonan.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/17/2014	JRS	Prepare for meeting with co-counsel; meeting.	2.00	\$1,920.00
3/17/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; conference with J. Dallal; prepare for summary judgment hearing.	1.60	\$1,536.00
3/17/2014	JD	Calls and emails to class members per request and instruction of J. Saveri.	2.00	\$980.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page76 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1 Page: 198 2.50 \$1,225.00 3/17/2014 JD Emails, confer w/J. Saveri, and draft detailed memo re observations from focus group session over the weekend. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.10 \$31.50 3/18/2014 PLrespective attorneys. 0.50 \$480.00 3/18/2014 **JRS** Review and revise case management conference statement. \$480.00 3/18/2014 **JRS** Review and revise report re settlement; telephone conference with 0.50 Dean Harvey. 0.30 \$288.00 3/18/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. 3/18/2014 **JRS** Prepare for focus group. 1.70 \$1,632.00 2.30 \$2,208.00 3/18/2014 **JRS** Prepare for summary judgment hearing. \$1,225.00 3/18/2014 JD Confer w/R. McEwan and J. Saveri and review briefing and order 2.50 from DRAM case and referenced cases on appropriateness and discoverability of JSA's; search for additional cases and treatise sections and map out arguments. 3/18/2014 JD Review draft MILs, search for exemplars from prior cases, confer 0.50 \$245.00 w/J. Saveri re same. 3/18/2014 JD Confer w/P. Lall re testing of database, trial preparation tasks etc. 0.40 \$196.00 0.30 \$147.00 3/18/2014 JD Review and revise draft Case Management Conference statement. 3/18/2014 JDCall w/class member, writeup and confer w/J. Saveri re same. 0.40 \$196.00 For J. Dallal, conducted database performance analysis. 3/19/2014 PL 1.00 \$315.00 Review and revise case management conference statement. 0.30 \$288.00 3/19/2014 **JRS** 3/19/2014 **JRS** Trial preparation. 3.00 \$2,880.00 **JRS** 2.00 \$1,920.00 3/19/2014 Review and analyze mock trial results. **JRS** 1.00 \$960.00 3/19/2014 Settlement; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Layn Phillips. 1.90 \$1,824.00 3/19/2014 **JRS** Prepare for summary judgment hearing. 3/19/2014 JD Organize database for completeness and accuracy of mapping, run 0.50 \$245.00 searches, and confer with P. Lall re questions. 3/19/2014 Draft, edit, cite-check and circulate letter re JSA to opposing 1.80 \$882.00 JD counsel per request of J. Saveri; revise letter per instructions of J. Saveri. \$1,225.00 3/19/2014 JD Further research on in case law and treatises on discoverability of 2.50 JSA's.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page77 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 199 Matter Number: 0.40 \$196.00 3/19/2014 **RJM** Review and revise draft letter to defense counsel regarding Judgment Sharing Agreement and discuss same with J. Dallal. For J. Dallal, conducted database performance analysis. \$976.50 3/20/2014 PL3.10 0.30 \$94.50 3/20/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys. Review focus group issues; telephone conference with J. Dallal; \$5,088.00 3/20/2014 **JRS** 5.30 prepare for hearing; telephone conference with J. Davis. 1.10 \$1,056.00 3/20/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with Layn Phillips; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. \$288.00 Review case management conference statement. 0.30 3/20/2014 **JRS JRS** Settlement administration. 0.30 \$288.00 3/20/2014 \$240.00 3/20/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re JSA; hearing on March 0.30 27th. 8.50 \$4,165.00 3/20/2014 JD Complete entry of new facts and testimony and documentary evidence collected for summary judgment opposition into plaintiffs' contentions table and circulate proposed final version for use as basis of CaseMap file outlining trial argument. Review draft CMC statement and emails w/opposing counsel re 0.40 \$196.00 3/20/2014 JD dispute over sealing; collect and forward cases re discoverability of agreements among co-Defendants. 0.80 \$392.00 Revise letter requesting production of JSA per request of 3/20/2014 JD co-counsel, finalize and serve on opposing counsel. 1.00 \$490.00 3/20/2014 JD Review discovery record and draft and edit request for production of documents for judgment sharing agreement per request of J. Saveri. For J. Dallal, conducted database performance analysis. 0.90 \$283.50 3/21/2014 PLPLCollected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 4.70 \$1,480.50 3/21/2014 factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 3/21/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.70 \$220.50 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. **JRS** 2.70 \$2,592.00 3/21/2014 Prepare for hearing. \$288.00 3/21/2014 **JRS** Robert Van Nest correspondence. 0.30 0.70 \$672.00 3/21/2014 **JRS** Review filings; conference with J. Dallal. 1.00 \$960.00 3/21/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration; e-mail with Mottek. **Continued On Next Page**

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page78 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 200

3/24/2014	JPD	Dermody; conference with Layn Phillips. Travel and meetings with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re Daubert	4.90	\$3,920.00
3/24/2014	JRS	Settlement negotiations; telephone conference with Kelly	1.00	\$960.00
3/24/2014	JRS	Case management; conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
3/24/2014	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal; prepare for hearing.	2.50	\$2,400.00
3/24/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.30	\$288.00
3/24/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	0.70	\$220.50
3/24/2014	PL	Conferred with J. Dallal re case management priorities.	0.10	\$31.50
3/24/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	4.80	\$1,512.00
3/23/2014	JD	Legal research and compose detailed memorandum outlining issues and best arguments supporting Plaintiffs' Daubert motion per request of J. Saveri.	8.50	\$4,165.00
3/23/2014	JPD	Prepare for Daubert hearing.	4.10	\$3,280.00
3/23/2014	JRS	Prepare for hearing.	3.50	\$3,360.00
3/22/2014	JD	Trial preparation; e-mails re sealing, MILs, JSA request, etc.	0.50	\$245.00
3/22/2014	JRS	Trial preparation; organize in limine motions.	1.10	\$1,056.00
3/22/2014	JRS	Review and revise opposition to motion to strike.	1.00	\$960.00
3/21/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall and provide instructions re needs for CaseMap file outlining trial argument, write up email re same, answer questions.	1.70	\$833.00
3/21/2014	JD	Review clawback request from opposing counsel and provide recommendation of no opposition per request of J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
3/21/2014	JD	Compare draft MILs against exemplars from prior cases, integrate omitted items and edit for consistency per request of J. Saveri; confer w/J. Saveri; make suggested edits and circulate proposed redline draft.	2.70	\$1,323.00
3/21/2014	JD	Create electronic and hard-copy binders of authorities covering five areas of JSLF responsibility for 3/27 hearing, download and organize new authorities, renumber files and create index, send completed sets to J. Davis and J. Saveri in advance of hearing prep.	3.50	\$1,715.00

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page79 of 124

5/20/2015

Page: 201

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3 1004-1

3/24/2014 JD Further legal research and complete detailed memorandum 5.50 \$2,695.00 outlining issues and best arguments supporting Plaintiffs' Daubert motion per request of J. Saveri; circulate to team. 1.80 \$882.00 Hearing prep meeting w/J. Saveri and J. Davis. 3/24/2014 JD 0.80 \$392.00 3/24/2014 JD Calls and emails w/J. Saveri on status of sealing requests for DNC lists, other documents re expansion and effect of conspiracy etc.; research same. 0.20 \$98.00 Call w/co-counsel re coverage for late filings and status of sealing 3/24/2014 JD requests. Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and \$2,047.50 6.50 3/25/2014 PLfactual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 0.80 \$252.00 3/25/2014 PL For J. Saveri, conducted factual research online re Sheryl Sandberg's admission re Google's approaching Facebook re a recruiting agreement. 3/25/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.10 \$31.50 respective attorneys. 3/25/2014 **JRS** Prepare for hearing; conference with J. Dallal. 1.80 \$1,728.00 0.50 \$480.00 3/25/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with Layn Phillips. 0.50 \$480.00 3/25/2014 **JRS** Review and revise document request. 0.50 \$480.00 3/25/2014 **JRS** Review and revise motions in limine. 1.10 \$1,056.00 **JRS** 3/25/2014 Trial preparation. 0.50 \$480.00 3/25/2014 **JRS** Review Court filings. 2.00 \$980.00 3/25/2014 JD Additional legal research and draft detailed memorandum on discoverability of JSA's per request of J. Saveri. 4.50 \$2,205.00 3/25/2014 JD Confer w/J. Saveri re hearing argument and required demonstratives; review deposition record and create depo calendar demonstrative; emails w/co-counsel and review ROG response verifications to create chart of response dates and verifications; collect and organize copies of emails and documents re withdrawn witness D. Bryant. 0.40 \$196.00 3/25/2014 Review claims procedures and email class member to respond to JD questions. \$945.00 3/26/2014 PL Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 3.00 factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page80 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 202 1004-1 Matter Number: 3.40 \$1,071.00 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 3/26/2014 PL respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 3/26/2014 **JRS** Prepare for hearing. 3.50 \$3,360.00 0.80 \$768.00 3/26/2014 **JRS** Trial preparation. 1.00 \$960.00 3/26/2014 **JRS** Prepare for focus group. 0.70 \$672.00 3/26/2014 **JRS** Review and revise brief. 0.50 \$480.00 JRS 3/26/2014 Respond to class member inquiries. \$384.00 0.40 **JRS** Settlement issues; conference with J. Dallal. 3/26/2014 0.30 \$288.00 3/26/2014 **JRS** Review and revise document request. **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 3/26/2014 Settlement issues. Print out and assemble demonstratives for use at hearing. 0.60 \$294.00 3/26/2014 JD 3.00 \$1,470.00 3/26/2014 JD Per request of J. Saveri, search pleadings, orders, discovery record, and expert reports to ascertain chronology of where Defendants relied on informal interviews and sworn declarations not subject to cross-examination for factual assertions and write up findings re same. 6.50 \$3,185.00 3/26/2014 JD Additional legal research and draft detailed memorandum on discoverability of judgment sharing agreements per request of J. Saveri. 6.30 \$1,984.50 Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 3/27/2014 PLfactual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 3/27/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; 1.00 \$960.00 telephone conference with Layn Phillips. 2.00 \$1,920.00 **JRS** 3/27/2014 Trial preparation. 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** 3/27/2014 Case management. **JRS** Settlement administration. 0.50 \$480.00 3/27/2014 7.20 \$6,912.00 JRS Prepare for hearing; hearing. 3/27/2014 0.80 \$768.00 3/27/2014 **JRS** Discovery re JSA; conference with J. Dallal. 0.40 \$320.00 JPD E-mail with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re per se vs. rule of reason. 3/27/2014 0.20 \$98.00 Update and circulate draft Rule 34 request re judgment sharing JD 3/27/2014 agreement per request of J. Saveri.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page81 of 124

5/20/2015

1010-3

Client Number:

Matter Number:		1010-3				
3/27/2014	JD	Travel to/from and appear at hearing on Daubert and dispositive motions.	5.50	\$2,695.00		
3/27/2014	JD	Review, update and circulate case calendar with new dates from Court order.	0.60	\$294.00		
3/27/2014	JD	Further research into circumstances of Discover v. Visa case and evidentiary orders in advance of trial relevant to discoverability of JSA's per request of J. Saveri.	1.50	\$735.00		
3/27/2014	JD	Make requested corrections to hearing demonstratives and reassemble per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00		
3/28/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	6.10	\$1,921.50		
3/28/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.40	\$126.00		
3/28/2014	JR	Review summary judgment order.	0.80	\$768.00		
3/28/2014	JR	S Trial preparation.	2.10	\$2,016.00		
3/28/2014	JR	S Settlement issues.	0.50	\$480.00		
3/28/2014	JR	Prepare for mock trial.	2.00	\$1,920.00		
3/28/2014	JR	Discovery issues re judgment sharing agreement; telephone conference re Per se brief; review J. Davis e-mail; conference with J. Davis.	1.60	\$1,536.00		
3/28/2014	JPI	E-mail re per se vs. rule of reason; review summary judgment order; telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal.	0.90	\$720.00		
3/28/2014	JD	Review orders, briefing, and CMC statements for references to per se vs. rule of reason analysis, compile and circulate per requests of J. Davis and J. Saveri.	1.30	\$637.00		
3/28/2014	JD	Review order on individual motions for summary judgment.	0.40	\$196.00		
3/28/2014	JD	Legal research, per se vs. rule of reason analysis.	3.00	\$1,470.00		
3/28/2014	JD	Call w/J. Davis and J. Saveri and confer w/J. Saveri re arguments for per se vs. rule of reason analysis, case management etc.	1.40	\$686.00		
3/29/2014	JR	Trial preparation; prepare for mock trial.	10.00	\$9,600.00		
3/29/2014	JD	Legal research, per se vs. rule of reason analysis.	4.00	\$1,960.00		
3/30/2014	JR	Trial preparation; prepare for mock trial.	10.00	\$9,600.00		
3/30/2014	JD	Legal research, per se vs. rule of reason analysis.	6.00	\$2,940.00		

5/20/2015

Client Number: 1010-3

Client Number: Matter Number:			1010-3 1004-1				
	3/31/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	4.70	\$1,480.50		
	3/31/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.40	\$441.00		
	3/31/2014	PL	Downloaded and processed article re Judge Koh's OK of conspiracy claim.	0.30	\$94.50		
	3/31/2014	JD	Legal research, per se vs. rule of reason analysis; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	4.50	\$2,205.00		
	3/31/2014	JD	Calls w/co-counsel re integration of lists of authentication requests; confer w/J. Saveri and P. Lall re same.	0.40	\$196.00		
	3/31/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re exhibits needed for mock trial; search expert reports and assemble documents to be used as exhibits per requests of J. Saveri.	1.60	\$784.00		
	3/31/2014	JD	Update website per requests and instructions of J. Saveri and D. Clevenger.	0.50	\$245.00		
	4/1/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	5.80	\$1,827.00		
	4/1/2014	PL	Reviewed Materials Relied Upon in Defendant expert reports; collected referenced documents and organized on S drive; updated list of documents for review.	2.40	\$756.00		
	4/1/2014	JRS	Prepare for mock trial/focus group.	8.30	\$7,968.00		
	4/1/2014	JRS	Case management; conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00		
	4/1/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re CaseMap and process for extracting information for documents relied upon for use in authentication requests; analyze CaseMap export and edit proposed list of requests; finalize list and send to co-counsel; review list provided by co-counsel; calls and emails w/J. Saveri and co-counsel re same.	3.20	\$1,568.00		
	4/1/2014	JD	Review partial list prepared by P. Lall of materials cited in expert reports and listed in materials relied upon; confer w/P. Lall re same.	0.30	\$147.00		
	4/1/2014	JD	Search expert reports and online for additional material to use as exhibits in Defendants' damages presentation for mock trial; confer w/J. Saveri re same and re mock trial strategy.	2.00	\$980.00		
	4/1/2014	JPI	Research re Per se v. Rule of Reason.	2.80	\$2,240.00		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page83 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Matter Numb		04-1		Page: 205
4/2/2014	PL	Reviewed Materials Relied Upon in Defendant expert reports; collected referenced documents and organized on S drive; updated list of documents for review.	5.50	\$1,732.50
4/2/2014	PL	Conferred with J. Dallal re case management priorities.	0.10	\$31.50
4/2/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
4/2/2014	JRS	Prepare for mock trial/focus group.	7.20	\$6,912.00
4/2/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
4/2/2014	JRS	Review and revise final approval motion.	0.80	\$768.00
4/2/2014	JRS	Settlement and claims administration.	0.60	\$576.00
4/2/2014	JRS	Review order.	0.30	\$288.00
4/2/2014	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal.	0.40	\$384.00
4/2/2014	JD	Code in additional information for 76 non-duplicative entries from internal list of authentication requests per request of L. Cisneros.	3.00	\$1,470.00
4/2/2014	JD	Compile, edit, and send exhibits for mock trial per requests and instructions of J. Saveri.	1.50	\$735.00
4/2/2014	JD	Review and update internal proposal for witness list; review witness list sent by co-counsel; per request of J. Saveri, research witness lists in Apple v. Samsung trial and download and circulate relevant documents; confer w/J. Saveri and emails w/co-counsel re same.	1.50	\$735.00
4/2/2014	JD	Call w/co-counsel re scope of recruiting teams, search exhibits for documents re Apple recruiting org and send.	0.40	\$196.00
4/2/2014	RJM	Review and revise memorandum in support of motion for final approval of Intuit and Lucasfilm/Pixar settlements; and research regarding same.	2.50	\$1,225.00
4/2/2014	RJM	Review and revise proposed order granting final approval.	1.00	\$490.00
4/2/2014	RJM	Analyze Shaver Declaration in Support of Motion for Final Approval.	0.30	\$147.00
4/2/2014	JPD	Research re Per se v. Rule of Reason.	3.10	\$2,480.00
4/3/2014	PL	Reviewed Materials Relied Upon in Defendant expert reports; collected referenced documents and organized on S drive; updated list of documents for review.	6.60	\$2,079.00
4/3/2014	JRS	Prepare for mock trial/focus group.	9.30	\$8,928.00
4/3/2014	JRS	Motions in limine.	1.00	\$960.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page84 of 124

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/20/2015

Page: 206

\$288.00 0.30 4/3/2014 **JRS** Claims administration. 0.30 \$288.00 4/3/2014 **JRS** Case managment. Settlement issues; conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone 1.20 \$1,152.00 4/3/2014 **JRS** conference with Layn Phillips. 3.50 \$1,715.00 4/3/2014 JD Rewrite Defendants' damages presentation for mock trial, identify and edit electronic copies of new exhibits supporting main points per request and instructions of J. Saveri. 6.00 \$2,940.00 JD Mock trial rehearsal w/J. Saveri and co-counsel. 4/3/2014 2.90 \$2,320.00 JPD Research re Per se v. Rule of Reason. 4/3/2014 4.60 \$1,449.00 4/4/2014 PLReviewed Materials Relied Upon in Defendant expert reports; collected referenced documents and organized on S drive; updated list of documents for review. 4/4/2014 JRS 10.30 \$9,888.00 Prepare for mock trial. 0.40 \$384.00 4/4/2014 **JRS** Review letters re business records. \$1,728.00 1.80 4/4/2014 **JRS** Review summary judgment order; press inquires. 0.70 \$672.00 **JRS** 4/4/2014 Motions in Limine. 9.50 \$4,655.00 JD 4/4/2014 Mock trial preparation: Edit PowerPoint sent by J. Saveri; draft new slides to reflect agreements w/co-counsel per instructions of J. Saveri; research, edit and circulate new exhibits; compile and circulate all exhibits in multiple formats per request and instructions of A. Shaver. 0.40 \$196.00 4/4/2014 JD Website updates posting recent summary judgment and Daubert opinions per request of J. Saveri. \$392.00 0.80 JD Review list prepared by P. Lall of materials cited in expert reports 4/4/2014 and listed in materials relied upon; compare against prior list of authentication requests; revise spreadsheet for ease of use; confer w/P. Lall re same. 0.40 \$196.00 Confer w/J. Saveri and email co-counsel re position on revisions to 4/4/2014 JD draft witness list. \$1,680.00 4/4/2014 JPD Prepare for telephone conference with E. Cramer and Sarah 2.10 Schalman-Bergen re Per se v. Rule of Reason (review materials); research. 1.50 \$1,200.00 4/4/2014 JPD Review final approval papers. \$240.00 0.30 4/4/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re per se v. Rule of Reason. \$960.00 1.00 4/5/2014 **JRS** Review and revise draft motion in limine. **Continued On Next Page**

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page85 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/20/2015 Page: 207

4/5/2014	JRS	Trial preparation; mock trial.	12.30	\$11,808.00
4/5/2014	JD	Review draft letter re authentication requests for completeness and accuracy; prepare redline of suggested revisions; research erroneous Bates numbers listed w/deposition exhibit numbers and call co-counsel re same; emails w/J. Saveri and co-counsel re same.	1.40	\$686.00
4/5/2014	JD	Mock trial day 1; travel to/from mock trial.	10.30	\$5,047.00
4/5/2014	JPD	Edits to final approval papers.	1.30	\$1,040.00
4/5/2014	JPD	Edits to Motions in limine.	1.70	\$1,360.00
4/6/2014	JRS	Trial preparation; mock trial.	6.30	\$6,048.00
4/6/2014	JRS	Review and revise motion in limine.	1.10	\$1,056.00
4/6/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.50	\$480.00
4/6/2014	JRS	Case managmenet.	0.70	\$672.00
4/6/2014	JD	Mock trial day 2; travel to/from mock trial.	7.50	\$3,675.00
4/6/2014	JPD	Research re Per se v. Rule of Reason; telephone conference with Sarah Schalman-Bergen.	2.30	\$1,840.00
4/7/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	1.30	\$409.50
4/7/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.90	\$598.50
4/7/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief re JSA; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	1.50	\$1,440.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Review mock trial focus group.	1.00	\$960.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Review proposed exhibit list.	0.60	\$576.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.80	\$768.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Organize motions in limine.	0.80	\$768.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Settlement strategy.	0.80	\$768.00
4/7/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief re joint sharing agreement; telephone conference with J. Dallal; conference with R. McEwan.	1.10	\$1,056.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page86 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 208 1004-1 Matter Number: 7.50 \$3,675.00 4/7/2014 JD Research, draft, revise, and circulate Motion to Compel JSA per request of J. Saveri; emails and confer w/J. Saveri and R. McEwan re same. Emails w/co-counsel and J. Saveri and confer internally re 0.80 \$392.00 4/7/2014 JD proposed witness list and coverage for Apple, Intel, and Adobe witnesses. 4/7/2014 **RJM** Research, draft, and revise brief regarding JSA brief/motion to 3.50 \$1,715.00 compel; email correspondence among JSLF team regarding same. 4/7/2014 RJM Analyze final approval brief; email correspondence with J. Saveri 1.50 \$735.00 and J. Davis regarding same. 0.30 \$147.00 4/7/2014 **RJM** Conference with J. Dallal regarding JSA brief. \$2,480.00 4/7/2014 JPD 3.10 Edit per se brief. Telephone conference re per se brief; JSA. 0.20 \$160.00 4/7/2014 JPD \$320.00 4/7/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Dallal re JSA brief. 0.40 \$1,606.50 5.10 4/8/2014 PL Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 1.10 \$1,056.00 4/8/2014 **JRS** Review and analyze mock trial and focus group. 0.50 \$480.00 4/8/2014 **JRS** Organize motions in limine. 0.80 \$768.00 4/8/2014 JRS Case management; telephone conference with J. Davis. 0.70 \$672.00 4/8/2014 **JRS** Settlement strategy. 4/8/2014 JD Revise JSA motion to compel per requests and instructions of J. 4.80 \$2,352.00 Davis and J. Saveri; additional research and update draft re Terazosin, Discover, and Advisory Notes; emails re same; confer w/J. Saveri re same; prepare comparison documents identifying unique and overlapping sections of internal draft and draft prepared by co-counsel. 4/8/2014 JD Review draft per se brief, compare against prior defense comments 2.50 \$1,225.00 on per se issue, and prepare notes for internal discussion. 0.60 \$294.00 JD Review, update and circulate case calendar with new dates. 4/8/2014 2.00 \$980.00 Review and revise JSA Brief/Motion to Compel; email 4/8/2014 **RJM** correspondence among JSLF team regarding same. 1.90 \$1,520.00 4/8/2014 JPD Edit JSA brief. \$240.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Judgment Sharing 0.30 4/8/2014 JPD Agreement brief.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page87 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3

5/20/2015

Client Number Matter Number		10-3 04-1		5/20/2015 Page: 209	
4/9/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	2.60	\$819.00	
4/9/2014	JRS	Settlement discussion and strategy.	1.10	\$1,056.00	
4/9/2014	JRS	Case managmenet; review motions in limine/per se briefs; conference with J. Dallal; telephone conference with J. Davis.	1.20	\$1,152.00	
4/9/2014	JRS	Review and revise final approval brief.	1.00	\$960.00	
4/9/2014	JRS	Review motion re judgment sharing agreement.	0.70	\$672.00	
4/9/2014	JD	Review draft per se brief and compare against case record; write up comments re prior statements in government investigation, prior non-compete litigation, relief sought, market definition, price-fixing standard, bid-rigging cases, discovery abuses, collaboration argument, and interlocking directors point; emails and calls w/J. Davis and J. Saveri re same; draft sections on interlocking directors and non-competes and forward latter to co-counsel; emails re same.	6.40	\$3,136.00	
4/9/2014	JD	Emails and confer w/J. Saveri re draft JSA briefs prepared internally and by co-counsel; forward comparison documents re same.	0.60	\$294.00	
4/9/2014	RJM	Review and revise final settlement approval papers.	1.00	\$490.00	
4/9/2014	JPD	Review Per se brief; telephone conference with J. Saveri; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	3.10	\$2,480.00	
4/9/2014	RJM	Review information from claims administrator regarding opt-outs and objectors; discuss same with J. Saveri and J. Dallal and email regarding same.	0.40	\$196.00	
4/10/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	6.70	\$2,110.50	
4/10/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50	
4/10/2014	JRS	Review final approval papers.	1.00	\$960.00	
4/10/2014	JRS	Review stipulation; e-mail to Dean Harvey.	0.50	\$480.00	
4/10/2014	JRS	Settlement discussion and strategy.	1.70	\$1,632.00	
4/10/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Dallal re motions in limine.	0.80	\$768.00	
4/10/2014	JRS	Review per se brief.	0.80	\$768.00	
4/10/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; Dean Harvey e-mail.	0.60	\$576.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page88 of 124

Client Number Matter Numbe				5/20/2015 Page: 210
4/10/2014	JD	Review emails re proposed agreement on MILs; review draft MIL submission; confer w/J. Saveri re same; email re same.	1.10	\$539.00
4/10/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and email co-counsel re proposed edits to per se brief.	0.40	\$196.00
4/10/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re case workflow, working with co-counsel and circulation of documents; review emails re same.	0.60	\$294.00
4/11/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	2.90	\$913.50
4/11/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	2.40	\$756.00
4/11/2014	JRS	Review motion to seal; telephone conference with J. Dallal; case management.	0.90	\$864.00
4/11/2014	JRS	Settlement discussions.	1.70	\$1,632.00
4/11/2014	JRS	Review final approval papers.	1.00	\$960.00
4/11/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re case priorities and next steps.	0.20	\$98.00
4/11/2014	JD	Review sealing requests and compare against prior sealing orders to ascertain newly unsealed material per request of J. Saveri; write up inconsistencies; confer w/J. Saveri and calls and emails w/co-counsel re possibility of seeking redress for same.	2.20	\$1,078.00
4/11/2014	JD	Download all authorities from main pleadings filed previous day and organize on system; review cases.	1.00	\$490.00
4/11/2014	JD	Review per se brief and outline possible additional arguments for reply brief; check same against treatise positions.	1.20	\$588.00
4/11/2014	JD	Review Defendants' motions in limine and outline possible responsive arguments.	1.00	\$490.00
4/11/2014	JD	Confer w/P. Lall re work on CaseMap database; review CaseMap database progress to date.	0.60	\$294.00
4/11/2014	JPD	E-mail J. Saveri re settlement.	0.10	\$80.00
4/14/2014	PL	Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.	4.90	\$1,543.50
4/14/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	1.00	\$315.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page89 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page:211

1004-1 Matter Number: 1.80 \$1,728.00 4/14/2014 **JRS** Settlement negotiations; settlement documentation. 1.10 \$1,056.00 4/14/2014 **JRS** Review automation issues; conference with J. Dallal. 0.90 \$864.00 **JRS** 4/14/2014 Trial preparation. 4/14/2014 JD Collect and review Defendants' authentication requests and locate 1.80 \$882.00 in database; confer w/P. Lall and J. Saveri re same. Complete analysis of sealing requests compared with documents 2.00 \$980.00 4/14/2014 JD previously unsealed; confer w/J. Saveri re same. 0.70 \$343.00 4/14/2014 JD Review and update case correspondence file. 3.90 \$1,228.50 PL Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 4/15/2014 factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 0.60 \$189.00 4/15/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 1.70 \$1,632.00 4/15/2014 **JRS** Settlement negotiations. JRS 1.00 \$960.00 4/15/2014 Settlement documentation. \$768.00 0.80 JRS 4/15/2014 Trial preparation. 0.70 \$672.00 4/15/2014 **JRS** Case management. 2.70 \$1,323.00 4/15/2014 JD Review Defendants' authentication requests; confer w/J. Saveri and B. Glackin; call w/D. Harvey re same; emails re same; review D. Harvey draft letter and propose edits per request of J. Saveri. JD Review order on Daubert motions and review and circulate press 0.80 \$392.00 4/15/2014 coverage per requests of J. Saveri. \$196.00 0.40 JD Review materials on J-M. Hullot incident and email S. 4/15/2014 Schalman-Bergen re same. 3.70 \$1,165.50 4/16/2014 PL Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. \$409.50 1.30 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 4/16/2014 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 1.20 \$1,152.00 4/16/2014 **JRS** Settlement negotiations. 4/16/2014 **JRS** Trial preparation. 0.80 \$768.00 \$294.00 0.60 4/16/2014 JD Review and mark up draft opposition to Defendants' motions in limine.

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page90 of 124

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/20/2015

Page:212

\$245.00 Review and comment on Defendants' opposition to motion to 0.50 4/16/2014 JD compel JSA. Call w/class member to explain the settlements and procedures for 0.30 \$147.00 4/16/2014 JD attempting to file a late claim. Review spreadsheet prepared by P. Lall and identify documents 0.70 \$343.00 4/16/2014 JD relied upon not included in prior authentication requests. 3.00 \$1,470.00 Call w/M. Hamer; collect and organize objector materials and 4/16/2014 JD charts on system; review objections and objector profiles; map out issues; call objectors and write up results; emails re same. 0.40 \$196.00 Compose instructions and confer w/P. Lall re protocol for 4/16/2014 JD uploading latest sealed filings. \$147.00 Review and update case correspondence file. 0.30 4/16/2014 JD \$160.00 E-mail J. Saveri re settlement. 0.20 4/16/2014 JPD Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 3.50 \$1,102.50 PL4/17/2014 factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 1.50 \$472.50 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 4/17/2014 PLrespective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 1.70 \$1,632.00 4/17/2014 JRS Settlement negotiations. \$768.00 0.80 JRS Conference with J. Dallal re trial preparation. 4/17/2014 \$960.00 1.00 **JRS** Trial preparation. 4/17/2014 0.80 \$768.00 **JRS** Case management; review filings. 4/17/2014 0.80 \$392.00 JD Confer w/J. Saveri re case workflow, working with co-counsel, 4/17/2014 and next steps; email L. Cisneros re division of tasks in exhibit preparation and depo designations. JD Call w/class member, search on settlement website and in 0.50 \$245.00 4/17/2014 settlement materials for class member job title list; email w/M. Hamer re same. 2.00 \$980.00 4/17/2014 JD Review objections and objector profiles; map out issues; call objectors and write up results; emails re same. Comment on draft opposition to motions in limine, prepare redline \$1,127.00 4/17/2014 2.30 JD incorporating edits; emails re same. Review new deposition notices and add to case calendar; forward 0.40 \$196.00 4/17/2014 JD to D. Clevenger to add to firm calendar.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page91 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 213 1004-1 Matter Number: 0.20 \$160.00 4/17/2014 JPD Telephone conference and e-mail J. Saveri re settlement. \$1,248.00 4/18/2014 **JRS** Settlement documentation; review memorandum of understanding. 1.30 Case management; telephone conference with J. Davis and R. 0.70 \$672.00 4/18/2014 **JRS** McEwan. \$240.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri and R. McEwan re 0.30 4/18/2014 **JPD** settlement. \$880.00 4/18/2014 JPD Review motion of understanding; edits to JSLF. 1.10 \$98.00 4/18/2014 **RJM** Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding global 0.20settlement. 1.00 \$490.00 4/18/2014 **RJM** Review and revise Memorandum of Understanding and email J. Saveri regarding same. Draft settlement agreement with remaining defendants per terms in 1.50 \$735.00 4/18/2014 **RJM** Memorandum of Understanding. Research issues related to class settlement notice and additional 1.50 \$735.00 4/18/2014 **RJM** opt-out opportunities for class members. Review and revise draft settlement documents. 1.20 \$1,152.00 4/19/2014 **JRS** \$960.00 4/19/2014 **JRS** 1.00 Review motions. \$1,470.00 3.00 4/19/2014 **RJM** Draft settlement documents including settlement agreement, proposed order granting preliminary approval, and proposed order granting final approval. **RJM** Draft settlement documents including settlement agreement, 3.50 \$1,715.00 4/20/2014 proposed order granting preliminary approval, and proposed order granting final approval. 4/21/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 2.80 \$882.00 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. \$1,920.00 4/21/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues. 2.00 \$672.00 4/21/2014 **JRS** Review and revise Memorandum of Understanding. 0.70 Telephone conference with R. McEwan re settlement documents. \$672.00 **JRS** 0.70 4/21/2014 \$768.00 4/21/2014 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents. 0.80 4/21/2014 **JRS** Conference with J. Dallal re trial preparation. 0.50 \$480.00 \$768.00 4/21/2014 **JRS** 0.80 Case management.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page92 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page:214 1004-1 Matter Number: \$294.00 JD Confer w/R. McEwan re case background and settlement papers; 0.60 4/21/2014 call and email co-counsel re case management and trial preparation adjustments based on agreement to settle. Confer w/J. Saveri re state of trial preparations and adjustments 0.50 \$245.00 4/21/2014 JD due to agreement to settle. 0.30 \$147.00 JD 4/21/2014 Class member call. \$196.00 0.40 **RJM** 4/21/2014 Revise draft settlement agreement. Discuss settlement procedures regarding opt-in and opt-out \$98.00 4/21/2014 **RJM** 0.20 opportunities with J. Dallal. Review defendant's revised draft of Memorandum of 0.40 \$196.00 4/21/2014 **RJM** Understanding. 0.60 \$294.00 4/21/2014 **RJM** Review and revise Plaintiffs' counter-draft of Memorandum of Understanding and discuss same with J. Saveri. \$1,260.00 4/22/2014 PLCollected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and 4.00 factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial. 0.50 \$157.50 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 4/22/2014 respective attorneys. **JRS** 3.00 \$2,880.00 4/22/2014 Settlement issues. \$960.00 4/22/2014 **JRS** Review and revise memorandum of understanding. 1.00 Review and revise settlement documents; telephone conference 1.20 \$1,152.00 4/22/2014 **JRS** with J. Davis and R. McEwan. 0.30 \$288.00 4/22/2014 **JRS** Review and revise statement of disputed issues. 4/22/2014 **JRS** Case management. 0.30 \$288.00 \$245.00 4/22/2014 JD Review draft MOU; confer w/R. McEwan and emails re same. 0.50 0.40 \$196.00 4/22/2014 JD Call and email co-counsel re trial preparation adjustments based on agreement to settle; email re repeated unreturned calls and emails to co-counsel. 0.30 \$147.00 Confer w/J. Saveri re case management and settlement. 4/22/2014 JD Conference with J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding settlement with \$98.00 0.20 4/22/2014 RJM remaining defendants. 1.00 \$490.00 4/22/2014 **RJM** Revise draft settlement agreement with remaining defendants. 3.80 \$1,197.00 4/23/2014 PL Collected and organized documents, transcript excerpts, and factual contentions identified by attorneys; update CaseMap database with materials identified in preparation for trial.

Continued On Next Page

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 Page: 215

4/23/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via correspondence email or ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.30	\$94.50
4/23/2014	JRS	Review and revise Memorandum of Understanding; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; settlement issues.	1.80	\$1,728.00
4/23/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	0.60	\$576.00
4/23/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
4/23/2014	JRS	Trial preparation; review filings.	1.00	\$960.00
4/23/2014	JD	Class member calls; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.80	\$392.00
4/23/2014	JD	Review draft MOU; confer w/R. McEwan and emails re same.	0.60	\$294.00
4/23/2014	JD	Call w/class member; email re same.	0.60	\$294.00
4/23/2014	RJM	Review and analyze defendant's edits and comments to Memorandum of Understanding and email J. Saveri and J. Dallal regarding same.	0.50	\$245.00
4/24/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive.	2.40	\$756.00
4/24/2014	JRS	Settlement negotiations.	2.80	\$2,688.00
4/24/2014	JRS	Review and revise memorandum of understanding; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	2.50	\$2,400.00
4/24/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with press.	1.50	\$1,440.00
4/24/2014	JD	Follow-up call and email w/class member.	0.30	\$147.00
4/24/2014	JD	Update case page on website with information regarding settlement.	0.80	\$392.00
4/24/2014	JD	Respond to press inquiries; collect contact information and forward calls; collect and organize reporting on settlement.	1.50	\$735.00
4/24/2014	JD	Review draft MOU; emails re same.	1.00	\$490.00
4/24/2014	RJM	Analyze executed Memorandum of Understanding.	0.30	\$147.00
4/24/2014	RJM	Review and revise draft Settlement Agreement and email correspondence with JSLF team regarding same.	2.00	\$980.00
4/25/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
4/25/2014	JRS	Review and revise notice; conference with R. McEwan; conference with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$960.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page94 of 124

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/20/2015

Page:216

3.50 \$3,360.00 Review and revise settlement agreement; telephone conference 4/25/2014 **JRS** with Kelly Dermody. \$196.00 Confer w/J. Saveri re settlement materials and responding to press. 0.40 4/25/2014 JD 4.00 \$1,960.00 Edit draft motion for preliminary approval and proposed notice to 4/25/2014 JD class members; prepare redline incorporating all JSLF edits; confer w/R. McEwan and emails re same. Confer w/M. Hamer and J. Saveri re per-Defendant breakdown of 1.00 \$490.00 JD 4/25/2014 claims submitted; collect and organize information and run calculations; emails re same. 0.70 \$343.00 4/25/2014 JD Review bids by settlement administrator candidates and correspondence re same; collect and forward with summary per request of J. Saveri. \$490.00 1.00 4/25/2014 **RJM** Draft proposed order preliminarily approving global settlement. 0.40 \$196.00 Conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal regarding settlement 4/25/2014 **RJM** documentation next steps. Conference with J. Dallal regarding claims process and approval 0.30 \$147.00 4/25/2014 **RJM** order. 4/25/2014 Review and revise proposed class notice and brief in support of 1.50 \$735.00 **RJM** preliminary approval motion. 0.30 \$147.00 4/25/2014 **RJM** Review draft settlement agreement. \$98.00 0.20 4/25/2014 **RJM** Email correspondence with J. Saveri regarding settlement documentation. \$63.00 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.20 4/28/2014 PL respective attorneys. 2.50 \$2,400.00 4/28/2014 JRS Review and revise settlement documents. Review, edit and comment on draft settlement agreement; confer 2.20 \$1,078.00 4/28/2014 JD w/R. McEwan re same; emails re same. \$294.00 Review, update and circulate case calendar with new dates from 0.60 4/28/2014 JD Court order; emails and confer re revisisons w/D. Clevenger. 0.60 \$294.00 4/28/2014 JD Call w/class member. 4/28/2014 Collect, organize and review press coverage of settlement; confer 1.50 \$735.00 JD w/J. Saveri re responding to press and addressing erroneous reporting. \$294.00 4/28/2014 JDReview and update case correspondence file. 0.60 \$245.00 0.50 4/28/2014 **RJM** Review and revise settlement documentation and email J. Saveri regarding same. Continued On Next Page

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page:217

4/29/2014	JRS	Claims administration; conference with J. Dallal.	0.80	\$768.00
4/29/2014	JRS	Review status of objections.	0.50	\$480.00
4/29/2014	JRS	Reivew and revise settlement documentation.	1.10	\$1,056.00
4/29/2014	JD	Prepare for hearing; review pleadings and outline arguments; confer w/J. Saveri re motion, objector arguments etc.	1.80	\$882.00
4/29/2014	JD	Press call from R. Dwyer of Harper's.	0.40	\$196.00
4/29/2014	JD	Calls w/class member objectors; confer w/J. Saveri and writeup re same.	1.50	\$735.00
4/29/2014	JD	Call w/class member.	0.50	\$245.00
4/29/2014	RJM	Draft memorandum regarding status of settlement documentation and related motions and due dates for same.	0.20	\$98.00
4/30/2014	PL	For J. Dallal, modified and sorted spreadsheet of Objectors.	1.00	\$315.00
4/30/2014	PL	Filed physical documents into case folders.	0.20	\$63.00
4/30/2014	JRS	Review and revise proposed order; conference with J. Dallal; prepare for hearing.	2.70	\$2,592.00
4/30/2014	JD	Emails w/M. Hamer, confer w/J. Saveri, and collect and organize data re opt-outs; remove duplicates and identify late opt-outs; draft proposed order to refer to opt-outs; prepare and format alternative forms of draft proposed order exhibits listing opt-outs; emails re same.	2.80	\$1,372.00
4/30/2014	JD	Draft, edit, and revise declaration of J. Saveri.	1.50	\$735.00
4/30/2014	JD	Calls w/class members.	0.70	\$343.00
4/30/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Saveri regarding settlement documentation.	0.20	\$98.00
4/30/2014	RJM	Revise draft of proposed order preliminarily approving global settlement.	0.30	\$147.00
5/1/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via emails from Office of California Attorney General and forwarded them to respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
5/1/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Kathleen Foote re e-bay settlement.	0.80	\$768.00
5/1/2014	JRS	Conference with J. Dallal; prepare for and attend hearing.	7.50	\$7,200.00
5/1/2014	JD	Review emails w/claims administrator re inclusion of non-class members among opt-outs and email summary per request of J. Saveri.	0.50	\$245.00
5/1/2014	JD	Final approval hearing; travel to/from.	5.50	\$2,695.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page96 of 124

Client Number Matter Numbe				5/20/2015 Page:218
5/1/2014	JD	Press inquiries; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.30	\$147.00
5/1/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re final approval.	0.30	\$240.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Case management; conference with J. Davis.	0.50	\$480.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Review and revise preliminary approval papers; conference with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$960.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Claims administration.	0.30	\$288.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Review and revise final judgment.	0.40	\$384.00
5/2/2014	JD	Review, edit, and comment on draft proposed preliminary approval order; review and comment on emails re proposed changes and confer w/J. Saveri; collect and circulate documents per requests of J. Saveri and J. Davis; run settlement calculations per request of J. Davis; prepare redline version incorporating all JSLF changes; legal research; prepare revised redline per request of K. Dermody.	5.30	\$2,597.00
5/2/2014	JD	Compare draft Saveri declaration against notes from hearing and Dermody declaration; outline arguments; draft and edit revised declaration and email analysis re same.	2.00	\$980.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Dallal; review letter to Lieff, Cabraser.	1.40	\$1,344.00
5/2/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; conference with J. Dallal.	1.10	\$1,056.00
5/3/2014	JRS	Review and revise preliminary approval papers.	1.50	\$1,440.00
5/4/2014	JRŠ	Review and revise preliminary approval papers.	1.20	\$1,152.00
5/5/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re draft proposed final approval order; emails re same.	0.60	\$294.00
5/6/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.40	\$126.00
5/6/2014	JD	Class member call	0.30	\$147.00
5/7/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and related journal article and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.30	\$94.50
5/7/2014	JD	Press inquiry.	0.30	\$147.00
5/7/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri.	0.80	\$640.00
5/9/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
5/9/2014	JD	Call w/class member.	0.30	\$147.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page97 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 219 1004-1 Matter Number: 3.00 \$1,470.00 5/9/2014 JD Review and comment on draft settlement agreement; confer w/J. Saveri and R. McEwan re same; compose detailed summary incorporating comments from all JSLF attorneys. Analyze defendant's edits to Settlement Agreement and Plan of 1.20 \$588.00 5/9/2014 **RJM** Allocation and discuss same with J. Dallal and email J. Saveri regarding same. 5/12/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.70 \$220.50 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; 1.30 \$1,248.00 5/12/2014 **JRS** conference with J. Dallal. 1.00 \$960.00 5/12/2014 **JRS** Review newspaper articles. \$768.00 0.80 5/12/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. \$490.00 5/12/2014 Call w/co-counsel, O/C re settlement agreements; confer w/J. 1.00 JD Saveri re same. 0.80 \$392.00 5/12/2014 JD Review letter purportedly sent by class member M. Devine to Court; call chambers re same; confer w/J. Saveri re response. PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 0.90 \$283.50 5/13/2014 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 2.00 \$1,920.00 5/13/2014 **JRS** Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. Issues re Michael Devine; telephone conference with Kelly \$768.00 0.80 5/13/2014 **JRS** Dermody. 5/14/2014 1.80 \$1,728.00 **JRS** Settlement issues. \$480.00 5/14/2014 **JRS** Michael Devine issues; review correspondence. 0.50 \$480.00 0.50 5/14/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. 0.90 \$864.00 5/14/2014 JRS Review settlement documentation. 0.30 \$147.00 JD Emails re proposal re distribution of settlement fund. 5/14/2014 \$63.00 0.20 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 5/15/2014 respective attorneys. E-mails with Layn Phillips; settlement issues; e-mail with Kelly 1.80 \$1,728.00 5/15/2014 **JRS** Dermody and Bob Van Nest. 5/15/2014 JRS Review settlement documents. 1.00 \$960.00 0.40 \$196.00 5/15/2014 **RJM** Analyze defendants' revisions to Settlement Agreement.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page98 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

1004-1 Page: 220 Matter Number: 0.20 \$98.00 Conference with J. Saveri regarding defendants' proposed 5/15/2014 **RJM** revisions to Settlement Agreement. \$480.00 5/15/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Girard re Devine substitution. 0.50 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the \$126.00 PL0.40 5/16/2014 respective attorneys. Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; 1.70 \$1,632.00 5/16/2014 **JRS** telephone conference with Bob Van Nest. 0.80 \$768.00 5/16/2014 **JRS** Review settlement documents. 0.30 \$288.00 5/16/2014 **JRS** Case administration. 0.30 \$288.00 5/16/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with R. McEwan. \$288.00 JRS Communication re Michael Devine substitution. 0.30 5/16/2014 \$384.00 5/16/2014 **JRS** Organize file. 0.40 0.40 \$320.00 5/16/2014 JPD E-mail and telephone conference with co-counsel re objector. 0.20 \$98.00 5/16/2014 **RJM** Telephone call with class member regarding settlement agreements. \$98.00 Telephone conference with J. Davis regarding withdrawal of 0.20 5/16/2014 **RJM** representation with class rep. Devine. 5/16/2014 **RJM** Telephone conference with J. Saveri regarding withdrawal of 0.20 \$98.00 representation with class rep. Devine and research assignment regarding same. 0.60 \$294.00 5/16/2014 **RJM** Research professional responsibility issues related to withdrawal of representation in class action lawsuit. **JRS** 1.00 \$960.00 5/17/2014 Settlement issues. 0.30 \$288.00 JRS 5/17/2014 Case management. 5/17/2014 JRS Review orders. 0.80 \$768.00 5/17/2014 RJM Research professional responsibility issues related to withdrawal 1.50 \$735.00 of representation in class action lawsuit and email J. Saveri and J. Davis summarizing same. 0.50 \$245.00 5/19/2014 **RJM** Review defendant's proposed changes to settlement agreement and discuss same with J. Saveri. 1.00 \$490.00 5/19/2014 **RJM** Review and revise preliminary approval papers and discuss same with J. Saveri. \$63.00 0.20 5/20/2014 PLPrinted and assembled J. Saveri Declaration.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page99 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 221

1004-1 Matter Number: 3.00 \$1,470.00 Revise Settlement Agreement, preliminary approval brief, 5/20/2014 **RJM** proposed class notice, and plan of allocation. Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to \$346.50 5/21/2014 PL1.10 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 0.70 \$343.00 Review and revise settlement agreement and proposed order 5/21/2014 **RJM** granting preliminary approval. 0.20 \$98.00 Review and revise proposed order granting preliminary approval. 5/22/2014 **RJM** 0.10 \$49.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri regarding preliminary 5/22/2014 **RJM** approval papers. Review settlement documentation and correspond (via email) with 0.50 \$245.00 5/22/2014 **RJM** J. Saveri regarding same. \$504.00 5/23/2014 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to 1.60 respective attorneys; review and update case records file on S drive. 5/23/2014 PL Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.40 \$126.00 respective attorneys. 5/23/2014 RJM Update JSLF website with new information on HTCC and post 0.80 \$392.00 links to preliminary approval papers. \$94.50 Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.30 PL 5/27/2014 respective attorneys. 0.50 \$480.00 **JRS** Settlement administration. 5/27/2014 \$480.00 5/27/2014 **JRS** Review settlement documents. 0.50 \$31.50 PLDownloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the 0.10 5/28/2014 respective attorneys. Confer w/R. McEwan and A. Purdy re case disposition and 0.80 \$392.00 5/28/2014 JD proposed response to M. Devine objection. \$392.00 Meet with J. Dallal and A. Purdy re case disposition and response 0.80 5/28/2014 **RJM** to M. Devine objection. 0.50 \$480.00 5/29/2014 **JRS** Case management. 5/29/2014 **JRS** E-mails to and from Brendan Glackin. 0.40 \$384.00 \$441.00 6/2/2014 JD Review and comment on M. Devine filings; confer w/J. Saveri re 0.90 strategy. 2.90 \$1,421.00 Research re discovery rights of objectors; review and summarize 6/3/2014 JD cases and begin drafting memo; review filings and calls and emails w/J. Saveri re same. Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page100 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/20/2015 Page: 222

6/4/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.10	\$31.50
6/4/2014	JD	Research re discovery rights of objectors; review and summarize cases; draft and edit memo; review filings and calls and emails w/J. Saveri re same.	4.20	\$2,058.00
6/5/2014	JD	Shepardize cases and finalize and circulate memo re objectors' discovery rights.	2.00	\$980.00
6/6/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
6/6/2014	JD	Review and comment on Devine objection to Mot. for Prelim. Approval; review cases; calls and email re same.	1.60	\$784.00
6/9/2014	PL	Downloaded court documents via ECF and forwarded them to the respective attorneys.	0.20	\$63.00
6/11/2014	JRS	Preliminary approval reply; e-mails to Kelly Dermody.	0.80	\$768.00
6/11/2014	JRS	Review report re class member inquiry.	0.50	\$480.00
6/11/2014	JD	Class member call re claims of class member; review job title list and class definition; write summary email and update chart.	0.60	\$294.00
6/12/2014	JRS	Review and revise preliminary approval brief.	2.50	\$2,400.00
6/12/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; review Escrow and qualified settlement fund agreement.	0.50	\$480.00
6/12/2014	JPD	Review response to objectors; redline; e-mail; telephone conference with J. Saveri; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.20	\$960.00
6/12/2014	JPD	Review response to objectors; redline; e-mail; telephone conference with J. Saveri; telephone conference with K. Dermody.	1.20	\$960.00
6/12/2014	RJM	Review Michael Devine's objection to settlement.	0.40	\$196.00
6/12/2014	RJM	Review draft of response brief to Devine's objection.	0.40	\$196.00
6/12/2014	RJM	Conference with J. Saveri, J. Davis, and J. Dallal regarding response to Devine's objection to settlement.	0.30	\$147.00
6/12/2014	RJM	Revise brief responding to Devine's objection to settlement.	0.50	\$245.00
6/12/2014	RJM	Email correspondence with Kelly Dermody, Josh Davis, and Dean Harvey regarding response to Devine's objection.	0.30	\$147.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page101 of 124

Client Number:

Matter Number:

1010-3

1004-1

5/20/2015

Page:223

2.70 \$1,323.00 6/12/2014 JD Call and confer w/J. Saveri, R. McEwan, J. Davis to discuss edits to Reply Brief ISO Mot. for Prelim. Approval; review prior memo on objectors' rights; download and Shepardize cases; draft edits and review and edit revised draft prepared by R. McEwan. 0.30 \$147.00 Update website with Reply Brief ISO Mot. for Prelim. Approval. 6/12/2014 JD 0.30 \$288.00 Case management; telephone conference with J. Davis. **JRS** 6/13/2014 0.50 \$400.00 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re fee dispute. 6/13/2014 0.50 \$400.00 6/13/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re fee dispute. Follow-up calls re claims of class member; call and emails re 0.60 \$294.00 6/13/2014 JD same. \$196.00 0.40 6/17/2014 JD Calls/emails re claims of class member. 0.30 \$94.50 For J. Dallal, printed hard copies of documents re motion for 6/18/2014 PL preliminary approval of settlement in preparation for hearing. 0.20 \$98.00 6/18/2014 JD Call w/D. Harvey re confused class member. 0.50 \$245.00 Prepare materials and confer w/J. Saveri re prelim. approval 6/18/2014 JD hearing. \$80.00 0.10 JPD Telephone conference with J. Dallal re attorney fees. 6/19/2014 \$400.00 Telephone conference with Fran Scarpulla re attorney fees. 0.50 6/19/2014 JPD Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed 0.70 \$220.50 6/20/2014 PL respective physical documents. 0.80 \$768.00 6/23/2014 **JRS** Prepare for telephone conference with Attorney General. \$1,152.00 1.20 6/23/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Attorney General. 0.20 \$63.00 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and 6/25/2014 PL co-counsel email. 0.80 \$768.00 **JRS** Claims issues; conference with J. Dallal. 6/25/2014 0.70 \$672.00 6/25/2014 **JRS** Settlement administration. 1.10 \$539.00 Review all disputed claims from first round of settlements; confer 6/25/2014 JD w/J. Saveri; prepare summary email of proposed positions on disputed claims. 0.80 \$768.00 6/26/2014 **JRS** Claims issues; conference with J. Dallal. 0.50 \$480.00 6/26/2014 **JRS** E-mail to claims administrator re claims questions. \$960.00 6/26/2014 **JRS** Review transcript of June nineteenth hearing. 1.00 0.70 \$672.00 6/26/2014 **JRS** Case management. Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page102 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 224

6/27/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
6/30/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
6/30/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and Eric Cramer re settlement approval.	0.10	\$80.00
7/1/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
7/1/2014	JRS	Review class member correspondence.	0.20	\$192.00
7/2/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
7/2/2014	JRS	Review class member letter; telephone conference with J. Dallal.	0.20	\$192.00
7/7/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
7/7/2014	RJM	Review Motion to Intervene.	0.30	\$147.00
7/7/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.50	\$480.00
7/7/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re fees.	0.80	\$640.00
7/7/2014	JD	Review Briggs Jones Law motion to intervene; research filing attorney/firm and named movants.	0.40	\$196.00
7/7/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re case status, comments in letters to court, prelim. approval hearing, and motion to intervene by persons outside class.	0.60	\$294.00
7/8/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
7/8/2014	JRS	Review motion to intervene.	0.80	\$768.00
7/9/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, accessed/read/forwarded article from the Recorder re "rogue" intervenor and checked metadata of proposed intervenor's PDF filed with ECF.	0.40	\$126.00
7/11/2014	JRS	Review and revise escrow agreement.	0.50	\$480.00
7/14/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	2.80	\$882.00
7/16/2014	JRS	Review and revise escrow agreement.	0.50	\$480.00
7/17/2014	JD	Class member call.	0.30	\$147.00
7/21/2014	JRS	Review escrow agreement.	0.30	\$288.00
7/22/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
7/22/2014	JRS	Review cost filing.	0.30	\$288.00
7/22/2014	JRS	Review escrow agreement.	0.30	\$288.00
7/24/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. Continued On Next Page	0.10	\$31.50

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page103 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 225

7/24/2014	PL	Saved/printed/filed executed escrow agreement re Pixar/Lucasfilm.	0.30	\$94.50
7/25/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.50	\$480.00
7/25/2014	JRS	Review and revise escrow agreement; telephone conference with John Mitchell.	0.30	\$288.00
7/31/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
8/8/2014	PL	Discussion with A. Purdy re 2014-08-08 decision by Judge Koh re settlement.	0.20	\$63.00
8/8/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.30	\$94.50
8/8/2014	JRS	Review order; e-mail to J. Dallal; e-mail to co-counsel.	1.00	\$960.00
8/8/2014	JRS	E-mail to Layn Phillips.	0.50	\$480.00
8/8/2014	JRS	Respond to press inquiries; telephone conference with Daniel Girard.	1.20	\$1,152.00
8/8/2014	RJM	Review Order denying preliminary approval.	0.40	\$196.00
8/8/2014	JD	Press inquiries; answer background questions; collect contact information and forward to J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
8/8/2014	JD	Review Order Denying Preliminary Approval of proposed final class action settlement; compose email summarizing key findings, possible responses, and potential responses by Defendants.	1.80	\$882.00
8/9/2014	JRS	Review order; e-mail to Robert Lieff.	0.50	\$480.00
8/9/2014	JRS	E-mails to Layn Phillips.	0.50	\$480.00
8/10/2014	JRS	Review order.	1.20	\$1,152.00
8/11/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.30	\$94.50
8/11/2014	PL	For A. Purdy, prepared and e-filed his Notice of Appearance (Northern District of California).	0.50	\$157.50
8/11/2014	PL	For A. Purdy, drafted initial version of his Notice of Appearance for modification and approval.	0.80	\$252.00
8/11/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Lieff Cabraser re status.	0.50	\$480.00
8/11/2014	JD	Review appeal filed by non-party intervenor applicant B. Greenspan.	0.40	\$196.00
8/12/2014	JPD	Review Judge Koh's opinion.	0.70	\$560.00
8/12/2014	JD	Class member calls.	0.40	\$196.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page104 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1				
8/13/2014	PL	For J. Saveri, assembled print copy of order (docket no. 916).	0.10	\$31.50
8/13/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
8/13/2014	JRS	Settlement administration; review costs.	0.80	\$768.00
8/13/2014	JRS	Conference with Daniel Girard re status.	0.80	\$768.00
8/13/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re next steps.	0.80	\$640.00
8/14/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
8/15/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
8/15/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.70	\$672.00
8/15/2014	JRS	Review proposed administrative motion; e-mail to Lieff Cabraser.	1.00	\$960.00
8/15/2014	JRS	Review draft case management conference statement.	1.00	\$960.00
8/15/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with Eric Cramer re next steps.	0.20	\$160.00
8/15/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft case management statement; review scheduling portion of order denying prelim approval.	0.60	\$294.00
8/17/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.30	\$288.00
8/17/2014	JRS	Review settlement posture.	1.00	\$960.00
8/17/2014	JRS	Formulate strategy re settlement.	0.80	\$768.00
8/18/2014	JD	Class member call.	0.20	\$98.00
8/18/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re upcoming case management conference, strategy re pace and settlement disposition.	0.40	\$196.00
8/19/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re settlement.	0.20	\$160.00
8/19/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft case management statement.	0.40	\$196.00
8/20/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
8/20/2014	JD	Download and store class member list; review and emails re same.	0.40	\$196.00
8/22/2014	JD	Download and store jury pool videos; briefly review same.	0.40	\$196.00
8/25/2014	PL	Took call from Dean Harvey (co-counsel from Lieff Cabraser) requesting wiring of funds to JSLF and forwarded request accordingly.	0.10	\$31.50
8/25/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical documents in case folder.	0.20	\$63.00
8/25/2014	JD	Review Greenspan motion to intervene and background of proposed intervener Greenspan.	0.60	\$294.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page105 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number: 1010-3

Matter Number:		1010-3		9720/2013 Page: 227
8/26/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
8/26/2014	JD	Research employment history, personal background, location, past litigation and prior attorney relationships of proposed intervenor B. Greenspan to determine potential eligibility to intervene and assess possible motivations.	2.70	\$1,323.00
8/28/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft case management statement; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.40	\$196.00
8/29/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft case management statement; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.30	\$147.00
9/2/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft CMC statement and confer w/J. Saveri re same; draft and circulate letter to proposed intervenor B. Greenspan; call from tech worker seeking inclusion in class; confer w/J. Saveri re class member contacts and status of class representatives.	1.90	\$931.00
9/3/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
9/3/2014	JD	Review draft mandamus brief sent by Defendants; follow-up call re strategy for CMC statement.	0.70	\$343.00
9/3/2014	JPI	Telephone conference with J. Saveri; review mandamus.	1.30	\$1,040.00
9/4/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
9/4/2014	JD	Review and comment on Defendants' Petition for Writ of Mandamus.	1.10	\$539.00
9/4/2014	JD	Call w/class member; emails and confer w/J. Saveri re plaintiffs' opposition to stay pending outcome of writ and final signoff on Heffler cost accounting.	1.30	\$637.00
9/5/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.60	\$189.00
9/5/2014	JD	Review per se briefing in advance of filing Reply.	1.20	\$588.00
9/5/2014	JD	Call w/class member.	0.40	\$196.00
9/5/2014	JD	Review FRAP; confer w/team and emails re response to Writ petition.	0.80	\$392.00
9/5/2014	JPI	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re per se; writ.	0.30	\$240.00
9/5/2014	JPI	Telephone conference with Dean Harvey re writ.	0.10	\$80.00
9/5/2014	JPI	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re writ.	0.10	\$80.00
9/5/2014	JPI	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Case Managmenet Statement, writ.	0.20	\$160.00
9/5/2014	JPI	E-mail to J. Saveri re writ.	0.40	\$320.00
		Continued On Next Page		

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page106 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/20/2015 Page: 228

9/8/2014	JRS	Review orders.	0.50	\$480.00
9/8/2014	JRS	Communication with mediator; conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
9/8/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	1.00	\$960.00
9/8/2014	JRS	Review related case.	0.80	\$768.00
9/8/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	1.00	\$960.00
9/8/2014	JD	Additional research re writ of mandamus procedures; further review writ petition and underlying motion, settlement and hearing transcript.	1.60	\$784.00
9/8/2014	JD	Review and comment on new proposed related case filed on behalf of North Bay studios' visual effects artist employees.	0.50	\$245.00
9/8/2014	JRS	Analyze Mandamus petition.	1.00	\$960.00
9/8/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re Mandamus	0.10	\$80.00
9/9/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical documents.	0.50	\$157.50
9/9/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
9/9/2014	JRS	Review orders.	0.50	\$480.00
9/9/2014	JRS	Review related case.	1.00	\$960.00
9/9/2014	JRS	Analyze mandamus petition.	1.00	\$960.00
9/9/2014	JRS	Review and revise per se brief.	0.50	\$480.00
9/9/2014	JD	Review scheduling order; revise, update and circulate case calendar; review upcoming dates.	0.60	\$294.00
9/9/2014	JD	Edit, finalize and send letter to proposed intervenor B. Greenspan.	0.60	\$294.00
9/9/2014	JPD	Edit reply brief re per se.	2.40	\$1,920.00
9/9/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re per se.	0.30	\$240.00
9/10/2014	JRS	Case management.	0.70	\$672.00
9/10/2014	JRS	Review and revise per se brief.	0.80	\$768.00
9/11/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document.	0.10	\$31.50
9/11/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief.	1.00	\$960.00
9/11/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
9/12/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. Continued On Next Page	0.10	\$31.50

Client Number: Matter Number: 1004-1

1010-3

5/20/2015 Page: 229

9/12/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Dan Girard; communication with Layn Phillips.	3.80	\$3,648.00
9/12/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief.	1.00	\$960.00
9/16/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and co-counsel correspondence.	0.30	\$94.50
9/16/2014	JRS	Review motion to relate.	0.30	\$288.00
9/16/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri, review record and circulate materials re JSA issue to team.	0.70	\$343.00
9/17/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief.	1.50	\$1,440.00
9/17/2014	JPD	Prepare outline/notes for brief re Judgment Sharing Agreement.	1.20	\$960.00
9/17/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Dallal re JSA brief.	0.40	\$320.00
9/17/2014	JPD	Draft section of brief on JSA.	1.70	\$1,360.00
9/17/2014	JD	Research and draft proposed section for JSA brief; review and propose edits re section prepared by J. Davis and submit integrated draft to J. Saveri.	2.20	\$1,078.00
9/17/2014	JD	Calls to discuss JSA issue w/J. Davis, J. Saveri.	0.40	\$196.00
9/17/2014	JD	Calls re, download, review, and upload claimant list.	0.40	\$196.00
9/18/2014	JRS	Review and revise brief; conference with J. Dallal.	1.80	\$1,728.00
9/18/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft motion to compel reply brief.	0.50	\$245.00
9/18/2014	JD	Read/review sur-reply re per se issue and confer w/J. Saveri re possible response including motion to strike.	1.10	\$539.00
9/19/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical copies.	0.30	\$94.50
9/19/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips; settlement issues; telephone conference with K. Dermody.	2.80	\$2,688.00
9/19/2014	JRS	Review and revise JSA brief; conference with J. Dallal.	1.00	\$960.00
9/19/2014	JPD	Edit JSA reply review and e-mail re Defendants' Motion re per se.	1.30	\$1,040.00
9/19/2014	JD	Review and comment on further drafts to motion to compel reply.	0.60	\$294.00
9/21/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.80	\$768.00
9/22/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and co-counsel correspondence.	0.30	\$94.50

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page108 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3

 Matter Number:
 1004-1

 5/20/2015
 Page: 230

9/22/2014	JRS	Review 9th Circuit Order.	0.50	\$480.00
9/22/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; e-mail with Layn Phillips.	1.00	\$960.00
9/22/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and E. Cramer re mandamus.	0.20	\$160.00
9/22/2014	JD	Review draft opposition to admin motion to file sur-reply.	0.60	\$294.00
9/22/2014	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri re possible responses to writ of mandate.	0.40	\$196.00
9/23/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.30	\$94.50
9/23/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	2.50	\$2,400.00
9/23/2014	JRS	Review 9th Circuit Order; organize Opposition to Mandamus.	1.10	\$1,056.00
9/23/2014	JD	Review settlement agreements for terms regarding best efforts/duty to support; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.60	\$294.00
9/24/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; E-mail with Mediator.	2.00	\$1,920.00
9/24/2014	JD	Class member call.	0.50	\$245.00
9/25/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
9/25/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	1.70	\$1,632.00
9/25/2014	JRS	Review motion to relate.	0.80	\$768.00
9/25/2014	JD	Circulate related visual effects employees contractors case and review for possible effect on high tech workers' case.	0.60	\$294.00
9/26/2014	JRS	Settlement issues.	0.50	\$480.00
9/27/2014	JRS	Review opposition to writ.	1.00	\$960.00
9/28/2014	JRS	Organize writ opposition.	0.50	\$480.00
9/29/2014	JPD	Review writ appeal; research re opposition.	1.20	\$960.00
9/29/2014	JRS	Review settlement agreements; review and revise letter to Robert Van Nest.	2.00	\$1,920.00
9/29/2014	JD	Review proposed letter to defendants re writ; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.30	\$147.00
9/30/2014	RJM	Email J. Davis regarding plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus.	0.10	\$49.00
9/30/2014	RJM	Confer with J. Davis regarding plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus.	0.20	\$98.00
9/30/2014	RJM	Review and revise draft of Plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus.	1.00	\$490.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page109 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 231 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.70 \$343.00 **RJM** Research regarding response to petition for writ of mandamus and 9/30/2014 preliminary approval standards. \$49.00 9/30/2014 **RJM** Email J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding research in support of 0.10 Plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus. JPD Revise writ opposition; travel to and meeting with J. Saveri and R. 2.60 \$2,080.00 9/30/2014 McEwan. \$960.00 1.00 Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; review and revise 9/30/2014 **JRS** letter to Robert Van Nest. Telephone conference with Daniel Girard and Kelly Dermody. 0.80\$768.00 9/30/2014 **JRS** 0.50 \$480.00 9/30/2014 **JRS** Writ opposition; conference with Josh Davis. \$588.00 Legal research in Manual for Complex Litigation re preliminary 1.20 9/30/2014 JD approval standard; review cases; review J. Davis draft of writ opposition. PL0.10 \$31.50 Correspondence with J. Saveri re Writ of Mandamus. 10/1/2014 10/1/2014 **RJM** Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding 0.30 \$147.00 Plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus. \$49.00 10/1/2014 Email J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding Plaintiffs' response to 0.10 **RJM** petition for writ of mandamus. 0.40 \$196.00 10/1/2014 Revise Plaintiffs' response to petition for writ of mandamus and **RJM** email J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding same. \$735.00 1.50 10/1/2014 **RJM** Research regarding motions to dismiss on jurisdictional grounds in Ninth Circuit and email J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding same. Review Ninth Circuit Order dated 9/22/14 setting briefing 0.10 \$49.00 10/1/2014 **RJM** schedule on petition for writ of mandamus. \$196.00 Review Defendants' petition for writ of mandamus. 0.40 10/1/2014 **RJM** Confer with J. Saveri regarding Motion to Dismiss defendants' 0.20 \$98.00 10/1/2014 **RJM** petition for writ of mandamus. 0.30 \$147.00 **RJM** Research Ninth Circuit Rules regarding effect of motion to dismiss 10/1/2014 on briefing schedule and email J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding same. Telephone conference with J. Davis regarding motion to dismiss 0.10 \$49.00 10/1/2014 **RJM** and response to petition for writ of mandamus. 1.50 \$735.00 Draft motion to dismiss petition for writ of mandamus. 10/1/2014 **RJM** \$98.00 0.20 10/1/2014 **RJM** Telephone conference with J. Saveri and J. Davis regarding motion to dismiss and response to petition.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page110 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page:232 1004-1 Matter Number: \$80.00 0.10 10/1/2014 JPD Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody re opposition to writ. 0.10 \$80.00 Telephone conference with R. McEwan re potential Motion to 10/1/2014 JPD Dismiss. \$160.00 0.20 10/1/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri and R. McEwan re opposition and potential Motion to Dismiss. 1.20 \$1,152.00 10/1/2014 **JRS** Review and revise letter to Robert Van Nest. Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference 0.90 \$864.00 10/1/2014 **JRS** with Daniel Girard. Confer w/R. McEwan re writ opposition arguments; confer w/J. 1.40 \$686.00 JD 10/1/2014 Saveri re same. 0.50 \$245.00 10/2/2014 **RJM** Review letter from Van Nest regarding writ of mandamus and research cases cited therein; email J.Saveri, J. Davis, and J. Dallal regarding same. 0.20 \$98.00 Research procedural rules regarding motion to dismiss writ of 10/2/2014 **RJM** mandamus and email J. Saveri, J. Davis, and J. Dallal regarding same. 1.40 \$686.00 10/2/2014 **RJM** Research effect of denial of preliminary approval on settlement agreement and email J. Saveri, J. Davis, J. Dallal, and A. Purdy regarding same. \$147.00 0.30 10/2/2014 RJM Confer with J. Dallal regarding Ninth Circuit jurisdiction over writ of mandamus, including effect of preliminary approval denial. \$320.00 10/2/2014 JPD Review Keker letter; telephone conference with J. Saveri re same. 0.40 \$1,120.00 1.40 10/2/2014 JPD Research and draft e-mail writ. \$768.00 Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. 0.8010/2/2014 **JRS** 0.30 \$288.00 Review letter from Robert Van Nest. 10/2/2014 **JRS** Additional writ of mandate research and confer w/R. McEwan re 1.00 \$490.00 10/2/2014 JD \$1,440.00 1.50 Review draft writ opposition; telephone conference with Josh 10/3/2014 **JRS** Davis. \$960.00 10/3/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Daniel Girard. 1.00 \$960.00 1.00 10/3/2014 **JRS** Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; settlement communication; telephone conference with Daniel Girard. \$294.00 10/6/2014 **RJM** Review and revise draft response to petition for writ of mandamus 0.60 and email JSLF team regarding same.

Client Number: 1010-3 Matter Number: 1004-1

5/20/2015 Page: 233

10/6/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re writ opposition and Motion to Dismiss.	0.20	\$160.00
10/6/2014	JPD	Revise opposition to writ.	2.40	\$1,920.00
10/6/2014	JRS	Review 9th Circuit filing; telephone conference with Josh Davis.	1.10	\$1,056.00
10/6/2014	JD	Review and comment on draft opposition to writ of mandate.	0.40	\$196.00
10/6/2014	JD	Class member call; calls and emails to inquire about status of settlement checks.	0.80	\$392.00
10/7/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
10/7/2014	RJM	Review draft of response to petition for writ of mandamus and confer with J. Dallal regarding same and email JSLF team regarding same.	0.40	\$196.00
10/7/2014	JD	Confer w/R. McEwan, J. Saveri re writ of mandate opposition.	0.50	\$245.00
10/7/2014	JPD	Revise opposition to writ re J. Saveri and R. McEwan comments.	1.40	\$1,120.00
10/7/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to writ.	0.20	\$160.00
10/8/2014	JRS	E-mail with mediator.	0.80	\$768.00
10/9/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
10/10/2014	JRS	Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Layn Phillips.	1.50	\$1,440.00
10/10/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Josh Davis; review and revise 9th Circuit filings.	1.00	\$960.00
10/10/2014	JD	Review writ of mandate opposition brief.	0.40	\$196.00
10/10/2014	JPD	Revise draft opposition to writ; e-mail with J. Saveri.	0.70	\$560.00
10/12/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Josh Davis; review opposition to writ.	0.80	\$768.00
10/12/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to writ.	0.30	\$240.00
10/12/2014	JPD	E-mail with Kelly Dermody; review opposition to writ; telephone conference with D. Harvey re opposition; e-mail with D. Harvey re opposition.	1.20	\$960.00
10/13/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; Telephone conference with Layn Phillips; Telephone conference with Daniel Girard.	2.00	\$1,920.00
10/13/2014	JRS	Review and revise opposition to writ petition; telephone conference with J. Davis.	1.30	\$1,248.00
10/13/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri and E. Cramer re writ opposition.	0.30	\$240.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page112 of 124

Client Number:

10/23/2014 PL

1010-3

5/20/2015

Page: 234

Matter Number: 1004-1 0.40 \$384.00 10/13/2014 JRS Reivew and edit writ opposition; e-mail. 0.40 \$320.00 10/13/2014 JPD Reivew writ opposition by Daniel Girard. \$320.00 0.40 10/13/2014 JPD Review and edit writ opposition; e-mail. 0.40 \$126.00 10/14/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. \$1,440.00 1.50 10/14/2014 JRS Review and revise opposition to writ petition; telephone conference with J. Davis; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. \$960.00 1.00 10/14/2014 JRS Settlement issues. \$245.00 0.50 Review Michael Devine's Response to Petition for Writ of 10/14/2014 RJM Mandamus. \$294.00 0.60 10/14/2014 JD Class member calls. \$80.00 0.10 10/14/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re opposition to writ. \$160.00 0.20 Final review of opposition to writ. 10/14/2014 JPD 0.20 \$63.00 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 10/15/2014 PL 1.80 \$1,728.00 Settlement issues; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; 10/15/2014 JRS telephone conference with Daniel Girard. \$1,440.00 Review opposition to writ petition. 1.50 10/15/2014 JRS \$245.00 0.50 10/15/2014 JD Review M. Devine writ of mandate filing. \$392.00 0.80 Update case webpage with recent developments re settlement. 10/15/2014 JD \$31.50 Processed/distributed correspondence from opposing counsel. 0.10 10/16/2014 PL \$288.00 0.30 10/17/2014 JRS Review related case filings. Collect cases and further online research re would-be intervenor B. 1.00 \$490.00 10/17/2014 JD Greenspan. 0.30 \$147.00 Update and circulate revised internal case calendar. 10/17/2014 JD 1.00 \$960.00 10/18/2014 JRS Related case filings. 0.30 \$147.00 Class member call. 10/20/2014 JD 0.50 \$480.00 10/21/2014 JRS E-mails with Amicus. 0.30 \$288.00 10/21/2014 JRS E-mail with co-counsel. 0.30 \$288.00 10/21/2014 JRS Related case filings. 0.10 \$31.50 10/22/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. \$63.00 0.20

Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.

Continued On Next Page

Client Number:

1010-3

Matter Number: 1004-1

5/20/2015 Page:235

10/23/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Daniel Girard.	0.50	\$480.00
10/24/2014	JRS	Review mandamus reply.	0.30	\$288.00
10/27/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.40	\$126.00
10/27/2014	JRS	Amicus issues; review brief.	0.60	\$576.00
10/28/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.30	\$94.50
10/28/2014	JRS	Related case filings.	0.50	\$480.00
10/29/2014	JRS	Related case notice.	0.50	\$480.00
10/30/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
10/30/2014	JRS	Review briefs; telephone conference with J. Dallal; telephone conference with Daniel Girard and Kelly Dermody.	1.00	\$960.00
10/30/2014	JD	Class member call.	0.60	\$294.00
10/31/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
10/31/2014	JRS	Review Michael Devine filing.	0.50	\$480.00
10/31/2014	JD	Class member calls.	1.20	\$588.00
11/3/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with Brendan Glackin and Dean Harvey; edit writ brief.	0.80	\$640.00
11/4/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
11/4/2014	JRS	Review amicus brief.	0.50	\$480.00
11/4/2014	JD	Review opposition to amici filing in writ proceeding	0.20	\$98.00
11/4/2014	JPD	Telephone conference with J. Saveri re writ opposition.	0.10	\$80.00
11/6/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
11/6/2014	JRS	Settlement communication.	0.80	\$768.00
11/6/2014	JRS	Review and revise CMC statement; conference with J. Dallal.	0.50	\$480.00
11/6/2014	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.50	\$480.00
11/6/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with David Kiernan.	0.50	\$480.00
11/6/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with David Kiernan.	0.50	\$480.00
11/6/2014	JD	Review rules, filings, and status of 9th Circuit writ proceedings and draft insert for CMC statement.	0.70	\$343.00
11/7/2014	JRS	Telephone conference with Daniel Girard.	0.80	\$768.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page114 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 236 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.50 \$245.00 11/8/2014 JD Class member call. 0.70 \$672.00 Review and revise case managment conference statement; 11/10/2014 JRS conference with J. Dallal. \$768.00 11/11/2014 JRS Review draft case managment conference statement; conference 0.80 with J. Dallal. 0.50 \$480.00 11/11/2014 JRS Claims administration. \$245.00 Review and comment on draft case management statement; confer 0.50 11/11/2014 JD w/J. Saveri re same. 0.70 \$220.50 11/12/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. \$672.00 0.70 11/12/2014 JRS Review and revise draft case managment conference statement. \$480.00 11/12/2014 JRS Review and revise witness list. 0.50 \$480.00 0.50 11/12/2014 JRS Settlement administration. \$343.00 0.70 11/12/2014 JD Confer w/J. Saveri re witness list and case management statement; calls and emails re same. \$196.00 11/12/2014 JD Class member call. 0.40 \$31.50 11/13/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 \$672.00 Review and revise draft case management conference statement. 0.70 11/13/2014 JRS \$480.00 11/14/2014 JRS Review witness list. 0.50 \$31.50 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 11/17/2014 PL \$63.00 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.20 11/18/2014 PL \$315.00 For J. Dallal, created binders of 1.00 11/18/2014 PL case-management-conference-related documents. 1.80 \$1,728.00 Prepare for case management conference; conference with J. 11/18/2014 JRS Dallal; review order. \$490.00 Review status of Greenspan appeal; collect and review related 1.00 11/18/2014 JD cases and cases filed by same counsel. \$63.00 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.20 11/19/2014 PL \$768.00 11/19/2014 JRS Review per se brief; conference with Josh Davis. 0.80 0.40 \$196.00 11/19/2014 JD Review and update internal case calendar. 2.50 \$1,225.00 Review case record and status of all pleadings; assemble hearing 11/19/2014 JD prep binders; confer w/J. Saveri re same. \$80.00 0.10 11/19/2014 JPD Telephone conference with J. Saveri re per se brief.

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page115 of 124

5/20/2015 **Client Number:** 1010-3 Page:237 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.10 \$31.50 11/20/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 11/20/2014 JRS Telephone conference with Josh Davis; review brief. 0.70 \$672.00 \$768.00 11/20/2014 JRS 0.80 Case management. 0.40 \$320.00 11/20/2014 JPD Review opposition to defendants' motion for leave to file sur-reply as sur-sur reply; e-mail with J. Saveri and Lieff Cabraser, et al. Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 \$31.50 11/25/2014 PL 11/26/2014 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 \$31.50 \$288.00 11/26/2014 JRS Reveiw Greenspan 9th Circuit filing. 0.30 \$31.50 12/1/2014 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 PL\$63.00 PL0.20 12/4/2014 Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. \$31.50 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material. 0.10 12/8/2014 For J. Saveri, conducted file searches re letter to Heffler Claims 1.50 \$472.50 12/10/2014 PL from K. Dermody and/or D. Harvey. 12/12/2014 JD Review and revise draft settlement agreement; read transcript of 4.20 \$2,058.00 hearing re previous preliminary approval motion hearing for denied motion to identify Court concerns re Notice language; review record for prior submission of notices revised per Court request; confer w/J. Saveri re same.

12/15/2014	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and co-counsel correspondence and filed physical document copies.	0.80	\$252.00		
12/15/2014	JD	Review and revise draft Notice to Class Members.	0.40	\$196.00		
12/16/2014	JD	Class member call.	0.40	\$196.00		
12/17/2014	JD	Review and update case calendar; review pending deadlines for two outstanding appeals.	0.20	\$98.00		
12/19/2014	JD	Close review and comment on draft settlement agreement; draft proposed revised language to address potential ambiguity in term addressing possible contingency of preliminary approval denial; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	1.80	\$882.00		
12/21/2014	JD	Review and revise fresh draft of settlement agreement; confer w/J. Saveri re positions on open issues.	0.70	\$343.00		
12/22/2014	JPD	Review preliminary approval brief.	0.90	\$720.00		
12/23/2014	JD	Review records and submit final costs.	0.30	\$147.00		
Continued On Next Page						

Review and revise new draft preliminary approval motion.

12/14/2014 JD

0.20

\$98.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page116 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page: 238 Matter Number: 1004-1 0.40 \$196.00 Review and revise draft settlement agreement. 12/23/2014 JD 0.40 \$320.00 Telephone conference with J. Saveri re preliminary approval brief; 12/23/2014 JPD draft insert. 0.90 \$441.00 12/29/2014 JD Review and revise new settlement agreement draft; review and comment on new draft proposed order. \$160.00 12/29/2014 JPD Review edits to settlement agreements; e-mail J. Saveri. 0.20 2.50 \$2,400.00 1/2/2015 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents; e-mail to Kelly Dermody; telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. Review and revise changes, edits to preliminary approval motion 0.60 \$294.00 JD 1/2/2015 draft. 3.10 \$2,976.00 1/3/2015 **JRS** Settlement documentation. 1.30 \$1,248.00 1/4/2015 **JRS** Settlement documentation. 1.00 \$960.00 1/5/2015 **JRS** Review settlement documents. 1/6/2015 **JRS** Review and revise settlement documents. 0.90 \$864.00 1/6/2015 **JRS** Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody. 0.50 \$480.00 0.10 \$31.50 1/7/2015 PLProcessed/distributed co-counsel correspondence. \$1,056.00 Review settlement agreement; finalize. 1.10 1/7/2015 **JRS** Review and revise settlement approval papers. \$1,248.00 1/7/2015 **JRS** 1.30 \$637.00 1/7/2015 JD Review and close line edit of proposed final draft settlement 1.30 agreement; call in comments to O/C J. Sessions. 0.30 \$147.00 Review and update firm case calendar. 1/7/2015 JD 1.30 \$409.50 1/8/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and co-counsel correspondence, and filed physical document copies. \$1,152.00 1/8/2015 **JRS** Settlement issues; review and revise settlement papers. 1.20 \$768.00 0.80 1/9/2015 **JRS** Review and revise settlement papers. E-mail with Kelly Dermody; review and revise settlement papers. \$1,728.00 1.80 1/12/2015 **JRS** Settlement administration. \$288.00 1/12/2015 **JRS** 0.30 \$768.00 Telephone conference with Kelly Dermody; telephone conference 0.80 1/12/2015 **JRS**

Review and revise settlement papers; settlement communication.

Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.

0.10

2.40

\$31.50

\$2,304.00

with Daniel Girard.

1/13/2015

1/13/2015

PL

JRS

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page117 of 124

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 239

1/13/2015	JRS	Review communication to 9th Circuit; e-mail to defendants'	0.70	\$672.00
1/13/2015	JRS	Press inquiries.	1.10	\$1,056.00
1/13/2015	JD	Review dockets and draft email update re status of Greenspan litigation and Greenspan appeal.	0.50	\$245.00
1/14/2015	JRS	Review settlement papers; settlement issues.	1.40	\$1,344.00
1/14/2015	JRS	Review settlement papers; settlement issues.	1.40	\$1,344.00
1/15/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and correspondence from court.	0.90	\$283.50
1/15/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.40	\$384.00
1/15/2015	JRS	Review and revise settlement papers.	1.00	\$960.00
1/15/2015	JRS	Press inquiries.	0.80	\$768.00
1/15/2015	JD	Review and update case website page.	0.30	\$147.00
1/15/2015	JD	Class member call.	0.40	\$196.00
1/15/2015	JRS	Telephone conference with Daniel Burke of Gilardi.	0.50	\$480.00
1/16/2015	PL	For J. Saveri, located media articles re settlement.	0.70	\$220.50
1/16/2015	PL	For J. Saveri, circulated court filings of 2015-01-15 to co-counsel.	0.20	\$63.00
1/16/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
1/16/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.60	\$576.00
1/16/2015	JRS	Press inquiries.	0.90	\$864.00
1/20/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
1/21/2015	PL	Processed/distributed correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.20	\$63.00
1/21/2015	JD	Class member calls.	0.50	\$245.00
1/22/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
1/23/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
1/23/2015	JD	Review status of B. Greenspan appeal; legal research re standards for motion to dismiss in 9th Circuit.	1.80	\$882.00
1/26/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
1/26/2015	JD	Class member calls.	0.40	\$196.00
1/27/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and 3rd-party correspondence.	1.00	\$315.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page118 of 124

Client Number: Matter Number				5/20/2015 Page: 240
1/28/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
1/28/2015	JD	Class member call.	0.20	\$98.00
1/28/2015	JD	Review correspondence re URL transfer; follow-up call w/co-counsel.	0.20	\$98.00
1/28/2015	JD	Preliminary research and outline for motion to dismiss B. Greenspan appeal; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	1.80	\$882.00
1/29/2015	JD	Further research into standards for motions to dismiss in Ninth Circuit, modify outline, call w/O/C C. Brown re same, confer w/J. Saveri re same.	2.80	\$1,372.00
1/29/2015	JD	Call w/co-counsel and proposed settlement administrator Gilardi re plans for transfer of data and administration of new settlement if approved.	0.50	\$245.00
1/30/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.30	\$94.50
1/30/2015	JD	First draft of Motion for Summary Dismissal or alternative Motion to Dismiss Greenspan appeal.	6.20	\$3,038.00
2/2/2015	JD	Further drafting of motion to dismiss Greenspan appeal; search for exemplars; review 9th Circuit rules.	1.70	\$833.00
2/3/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copy.	0.30	\$94.50
2/3/2015	JD	Revise and edit motion to dismiss draft; further drafting; download and read cases from Rutter Guide.	1.90	\$931.00
2/3/2015	JD	Review and update case calendar.	0.40	\$196.00
2/4/2015	JRS	Review calendar; conference with J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00
2/5/2015	JD	Class member call.	0.20	\$98.00
2/6/2015	PL	Processed/Distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
2/6/2015	JRS	Class member communication.	0.70	\$672.00
2/6/2015	JRS	Settlement administration; Kenneth Jue e-mail.	0.50	\$480.00
2/6/2015	JD	Class member calls.	0.30	\$147.00
2/9/2015	JD	Class member calls/emails.	0.70	\$343.00
2/10/2015	JD	Class member calls/emails; revise and update class member contacts chart.	1.80	\$882.00
2/10/2015	JD	Meeting with J. Saveri re plan for upcoming motion hearing, data issues, ongoing class member contacts and general pattern of inquiries and objections; calls to M. Hamer and J. Mahan.	1.90	\$931.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page119 of 124

5/20/2015

Client Number:

1010-3

Page:241 Matter Number: 1004-1 Class member calls/emails; update chart of contacts; write up \$588.00 2/11/2015 JD 1.20 results of recent class member interactions related to Google internal email group discussion for J. Saveri. 0.10 \$31.50 2/17/2015 PLRead correspondence from class members/potential class members. 2/17/2015 JD Class member calls/emails; research class member details and 1.60 \$784.00 follow up with claims administrator. 1.10 \$539.00 2/18/2015 JD Class member calls/emails; follow up with M. Hamer. 0.40 \$196.00 2/19/2015 JD Follow up calls re class member. 0.70 \$343.00 2/23/2015 JD Class member calls/emails. 0.30 \$147.00 2/24/2015 JD Class member call. 0.80 \$768.00 3/2/2015 **JRS** Review and revise notice; conference with J. Dallal. \$768.00 0.803/2/2015 **JRS** Review and revise notice; conference with J. Dallal. 5.30 \$5,088.00 3/2/2015 **JRS** Prepare for hearing; hearing. 5.50 \$2,695.00 Hearing on Motion for Preliminary Approval and travel to/from; 3/2/2015 JD assemble/review documents and prepare for hearing. Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and court \$189.00 0.60 3/3/2015 PL correspondence. 3/3/2015 **JRS** Settlement administration. 0.60 \$576.00 0.30 \$288.00 3/3/2015 **JRS** Review and revise notice. \$245.00 Review Orders; update case webpage. 0.50 3/3/2015 JD \$94.50 3/4/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed 0.30 physical document copies. 0.70 \$672.00 3/4/2015 **JRS** Settlement documentation. 0.30 \$288.00 **JRS** 3/4/2015 Settlement administration. \$480.00 0.50 3/4/2015 **JRS** Review order. 0.80 \$392.00 3/4/2015 JD Class member calls/emails. 0.70 \$672.00 **JRS** 3/5/2015 Kenneth Jue e-mail; claims administration. 0.90 \$864.00 3/5/2015 **JRS** Settlement issues; Brown e-mail. 3/5/2015 JD Review draft website materials forwarded by Gilardi. 0.30 \$147.00 \$31.50 0.10 3/6/2015 PLProcessed/distributed electronic case filing material.

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page120 of 124

Client Number: 1010-3
Matter Number: 1004-1

5/20/2015 Page: 242

Call w/K. Jue; call and email w/J. Saveri re settlement administration plan.					
administration plan. 3/9/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement; settlement administration. 3/10/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/10/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement. 0.80 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.50 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.30 3/10/2015 JD Call re passdown from Heffler to Gilardi. 0.30 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.60 3/12/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.60 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/13/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.20 3/16/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.20 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.30 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.30 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.40	3/6/2015	class member inquiry.	JRS	ry. 1.40	\$1,344.00
3/10/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/10/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JR Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/6/2015	w/J. Saveri re settlement	JD	nent 0.70	\$343.00
3/10/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/10/2015 JD Call re passdown from Heffler to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/16/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/9/2015	reement; settlement administr	JRS	dministration. 1.10	\$1,056.00
3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.30 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.30 3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.30 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.60 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 0.20 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.50 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 0.30 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/10/2015		JRS	0.30	\$288.00
3/10/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.30 3/10/2015 JD Call re passdown from Heffler to Gilardi. 0.30 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.60 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 0.20 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.50 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 0.30 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/10/2015	reement.	JRS	0.80	\$768.00
3/10/2015 JD Call re passdown from Heffler to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/16/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JR Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50	3/10/2015		JRS	0.50	\$480.00
3/11/2015 JRS Review and revise Escrow agreement and related documents. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 1.10 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue	3/10/2015		JRS	0.30	\$288.00
3/11/2015 JRS Review settlement website; e-mail to Gilardi. 3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/10/2015	r to Gilardi.	JD	0.30	\$147.00
3/11/2015 JRS Coordinate Gilardi hand-off. 0.60 3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 0.20 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.50 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.30 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/11/2015	reement and related document	JRS	locuments. 1.10	\$1,056.00
3/12/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation; review and revise Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/11/2015	mail to Gilardi.	JRS	1.10	\$1,056.00
Escrow agreement. 3/12/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed webpage examples provided by Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.40 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/11/2015		JRS	0.60	\$576.00
Gilardi. 3/13/2015 PL Filed physical document copies. 3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.30 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/12/2015	documentation; review and re	JRS	ew and revise 0.80	\$768.00
3/13/2015 JRS Review and revise settlement documentation. 1.00 3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/12/2015	osed webpage examples prov	JD	oles provided by 0.40	\$196.00
3/15/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 1.20 Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/13/2015	es.	PL	0.20	\$63.00
3/15/2015 JRS Review FAQs; review notice; e-mails to counsel. 3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/13/2015	documentation.	JRS	1.00	\$960.00
3/16/2015 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/15/2015		JRS	0.50	\$480.00
physical document copies. 3/16/2015 JRS Telephone conference with class member. 3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/15/2015	e-mails to counsel.	JRS	1.20	\$1,152.00
3/16/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/16/2015	nic case filing material and file	PL	al and filed 0.50	\$157.50
3/16/2015 JD Class member calls. 0.50 3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/16/2015	ass member.	JRS	0.30	\$288.00
3/16/2015 JD Review and comment on proposed FAQ for webpage; raise issue 0.40	3/16/2015		JRS	0.40	\$384.00
troview and comment on proposed 1112 151 week 200, 1111	3/16/2015		JD	0.50	\$245.00
with J. Saveri and emails re same.	3/16/2015		JD	ige; raise issue 0.40	\$196.00
3/18/2015 JRS Settlement administration; google data issues. 0.50	3/18/2015	ogle data issues.	JRS	0.50	\$480.00
3/18/2015 JD Emails re progress on data transfer. 0.30	3/18/2015	nsfer.	JD	0.30	\$147.00
3/18/2015 JD Class member emails. 0.20	3/18/2015		JD	0.20	\$98.00
3/19/2015 JRS Settlement administration. 0.30	3/19/2015	ed On Next Page	JRS	0.30	\$288.00

 Client Number:
 1010-3
 5/20/2015

 Matter Number:
 1004-1
 Page: 243

3/19/2015	JRS	Contact with class memeber.	0.40	\$384.00	
3/19/2015	JD	Call re data transfer process among Heffler, Gilardi and representatives for all parties.	0.40	\$196.00	
3/20/2015	PL	Saved fully executed escrow agreement to server and filled physical copy.	0.20	\$63.00	
3/20/2015	JRS	Claims administration.	0.40	\$384.00	
3/20/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.30	\$288.00	
3/20/2015	JRS	Google data issues.	0.30	\$288.00	
3/20/2015	JRS	Telephone conference with J. Davis.	0.50	\$480.00	
3/20/2015	JD	Class member emails; follow-up inquiry w/D. Harvey re class members excluded as foreign workers added back due to some US work performed.	0.80	\$392.00	
3/21/2015	JRS	Claims administration; e-mail to J. Dallal.	0.30	\$288.00	
3/23/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50	
3/23/2015	JRS	Settlement administration; Google data issues; review Mike Hamer e-mails; conference with J.Dallal.	1.10	\$1,056.00	
3/23/2015	JD	Class member call/emails.	0.60	\$294.00	
3/23/2015	JD	Follow up emails and calls re data transfer completion; confer w/J. Saveri re same and re notice process generally; update case page on firm website.	1.40	\$686.00	
3/24/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50	
3/24/2015	JD	Follow-up re data transfer; calls/emails w/K. Jue and D. Harvey re Gilardi questions; confer w/J. Saveri re same; review proposed call script; forward collected updated class member list to K. Jue.	2.10	\$1,029.00	
3/24/2015	JD	Class member calls.	0.50	\$245.00	
3/25/2015	JRS	Settlement administration; notice issues; conference with J. Dallal; review FAQs and script.	1.20	\$1,152.00	
3/25/2015	JD	Review call script and raise concern re time to reach an operator with J. Saveri and K. Jue; emails re same.	0.70	\$343.00	
3/26/2015	JD	Follw up re call script and Notice formatting issues; review and compare Notice drafts.	0.60	\$294.00	
3/27/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.70	\$672.00	
3/27/2015	JRS	Claims/settlement administration.	0.60	\$576.00	

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page122 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

5/20/2015

Matter Number		004-1		Page: 244
3/27/2015	JD	Follow-up emails re Notice format issues.	0.30	\$147.00
3/27/2015	JD	Class member email.	0.20	\$98.00
3/30/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.20	\$63.00
3/30/2015	JD	Review and comment on revised notice and call script; confer w/J. Saveri re same.	0.50	\$245.00
3/31/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
4/2/2015	JD	Confer w/J. Saveri and respond to questions re class member data from K. Jue and Notice plan.	0.80	\$392.00
4/2/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.70	\$672.00
4/3/2015	JD	Reply to K. Jue responses re questions on class member data and Notice plan.	0.30	\$147.00
4/3/2015	JRS	Claims administration.	0.30	\$288.00
4/6/2015	PL	Filed physical copies of subpoenae from plaintiffs Ryan et al. to defendants Google, Apple, Microsoft, and others.	0.10	\$31.50
4/7/2015	JD	Check-in email w/Gilardi re completion of notice and report back to J. Saveri.	0.30	\$147.00
4/7/2015	JRS	Telephone conference with experts.	1.00	\$960.00
4/9/2015	PL	Processed/distributed correspondence from class member.	0.20	\$63.00
4/9/2015	JRS	Settlement administration.	0.80	\$768.00
4/9/2015	JD	Class member emails.	0.40	\$196.00
4/10/2015	JD	Class member emails.	0.50	\$245.00
4/13/2015	JD	Class member email.	0.30	\$147.00
4/15/2015	JD	Class member call.	0.30	\$147.00
4/20/2015	PL	Accessed transcript of 2013-10-21 case management conference (PACER) and contacted court reporter Lee-Anne Shortridge re transcript of 2015-03-16 preliminary hearing, both hearings before Judge Koh.	0.40	\$126.00
4/20/2015	JD	Review case record and assemble all preliminary approval and related documents including transcripts and orders from the three proposed settlements.	2.50	\$1,225.00
4/21/2015	PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material.	0.10	\$31.50
4/21/2015	PL	Prepared transcript order re 2015-03-02 preliminary hearing.	0.30	\$94.50
4/21/2015	PL	E-filed transcript order re 2015-03-02 preliminary hearing. Continued On Next Page	0.20	\$63.00

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page123 of 124

Client Number:

1010-3

er: 10	004-1		Page: 245
PL	Correspondence with court reporter Lee-Anne Shortridge re transcript of 2015-03-02 preliminary hearing.	0.20	\$63.00
JD	Further review case record and create complete set of case documents from three settlement proposals for use in upcoming preliminary approval filings.	1.30	\$637.00
PL	Researched and compiled filings re motions for attorney fees.	0.10	\$31.50
JD	Internal conference re plan for preliminary approval briefing, division of labor etc.	0.30	\$147.00
JRS	Telephone conference with Daniel Girard re status.	0.50	\$480.00
JRS	Review claims administrator correspondence.	0.50	\$480.00
JD	Review class member activity in report sent by K. Jue; email J. Saveri re findings and proposed outreach plan.	0.50	\$245.00
JD	Class member email.	0.20	\$98.00
PL	Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copy.	0.20	\$63.00
		#######	4########
	PL JD PL JD JRS JRS JD	PL Correspondence with court reporter Lee-Anne Shortridge re transcript of 2015-03-02 preliminary hearing. JD Further review case record and create complete set of case documents from three settlement proposals for use in upcoming preliminary approval fillings. PL Researched and compiled fillings re motions for attorney fees. JD Internal conference re plan for preliminary approval briefing, division of labor etc. JRS Telephone conference with Daniel Girard re status. JRS Review claims administrator correspondence. JD Review class member activity in report sent by K. Jue; email J. Saveri re findings and proposed outreach plan. JD Class member email. PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed	PL Correspondence with court reporter Lee-Anne Shortridge re transcript of 2015-03-02 preliminary hearing. JD Further review case record and create complete set of case documents from three settlement proposals for use in upcoming preliminary approval filings. PL Researched and compiled filings re motions for attorney fees. JD Internal conference re plan for preliminary approval briefing, division of labor etc. JRS Telephone conference with Daniel Girard re status. JRS Review claims administrator correspondence. JRS Review class member activity in report sent by K. Jue; email J. Saveri re findings and proposed outreach plan. JD Class member email. December 2020 PL Processed/distributed electronic case filing material and filed physical document copy.

Grand Totals: 10,788.77 \$ 6,314,819.25

Billable Hours / Fees:

10,788.77 \$6,314,819.25

5/20/2015

Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper AA worked 1742.00 hours at \$465.00 per hour, totaling \$810,030.00.

Timekeeper GS worked 293.11 hours at \$300.00 per hour, totaling \$87,933.00.

Timekeeper JD worked 3278.70 hours at \$490.00 per hour, totaling \$1,606,563.00.

Timekeeper JPD worked 346.10 hours at \$800.00 per hour, totaling \$276,880.00.

Timekeeper JRS worked 2145.15 hours at \$960.00 per hour, totaling \$2,059,344.00.

Timekeeper KR worked 87.25 hours at \$490.00 per hour, totaling \$42,752.50.

Timekeeper LJL worked 1336.12 hours at \$600.00 per hour, totaling \$801,672.00.

Timekeeper MA worked 193.75 hours at \$300.00 per hour, totaling \$58,125.00.

Timekeeper MH worked 827.00 hours at \$465.00 per hour, totaling \$384,555.00.

Timekeeper PL worked 442.65 hours at \$315.00 per hour, totaling \$139,434.75.

Cost Summary

Timekeeper RJM worked 97.00 hours at \$490.00 per hour, totaling \$47,530.00.

<u>Description</u> <u>Amount</u>

Continued On Next Page

Case5:11-cv-02509-LHK Document1085-2 Filed05/21/15 Page124 of 124

5/20/2015 **Client Number:** 1010-3 Page: 246 Matter Number: 1004-1 \$3,333.34 **Mediation Services** \$245,581.62 Expert Witness Fee \$1,629.78 Court Reporters/Transcripts \$5,831.90 Commercial Copies Photocopies \$56,865.50 \$381.62 Postage/Express/Delivery/Messenger \$6,328.26 Travel Expenses Telephone \$37.50 \$5,441.67 Miscellaneous/Other \$76,921.64 Computer Research \$795.98 Meal \$1,752,049.26 Litigation Fund \$2,155,198.07 \$2,155,198.07 **Total Costs**

 Prior Balance:
 \$0.00

 Payments Received:
 \$0.00

 Current Fees:
 \$6,314,819.25

 Advanced Costs:
 \$2,155,198.07

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: \$ 8,470,017.32