EXHIBIT 12

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/24/10	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email potential plaintiff re antitrust action.	0.10	
09/24/10	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with potential plaintiff re antitrust case.	0.30	
09/26/10	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with J. Sagafi and E. Fastiff re investigation; email R. Dempsey, H. Mottershead, K. Fahey re contacts.	0.20	
09/27/10	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff and conference re same; research re claims/clients.	1.00	
09/27/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri. K. Dermody, and B. Glackin; investigate facts and legal claims: telephone conference with ; telephone conference with	3.00	
09/27/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with	0.40	
09/27/10	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft complaint; telephone conference with experts re same.	3.80	
09/27/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Review background materials, research potential case, conference with Joe Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin re same.	1.40	
09/27/10	KRUSE, JOY	Assist re developing witnesses for High-Tech cold calling case;	0.80	
09/27/10	LIU, DANIEL	Research the companies and potential class for E. Fastiff.	6.70	
09/27/10	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	1.00	
09/28/10	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with potential experts.	0.40	
09/29/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re experts; telephone conference with John Radice re facts; research legal theories.	2.00	
09/29/10	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Develop outreach plan for no cold-call case.	0.60	
09/29/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with E. Fastiff and J. Saveri re potential case; review Department of Justice filings re same; conference with potential economists re same; draft and circulate summary re discussions with economists; research liability and damages issues.	4.50	
09/29/10	LIU, DANIEL	Look for plaintiff for E. Fastiff	0.80	
09/29/10	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.50	
09/30/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re expert analysis; edit complaint.	1.80	
09/30/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference ; conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re case strategy; conference with J. Sagafi and J. Shipp re potential witnesses and class definitions: conference with S. London re potential witnesses. draft correspondence re same; review draft complaint; conference with D. Liu re damages research, review same; research potential clients.	3.90	
09/30/10	LIU, DANIEL	Research the financials of the potential defendants and put together a spreadsheet on employee details for D. Harvey.	4.70	
09/30/10	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.80	
10/01/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for meeting with expert; conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey, B. Glackin	1.50	
10/01/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with and team re expert issues; conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin re potential clients and class certification issues; review prior expert reports.	2.60	
10/01/10	LIU, DANIEL	Continue researching evidence on the potential defendants for D. Harvey.	2.80	
10/04/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential witnesses.	0.70	
10/05/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Factual and legal research.	1.40	
10/05/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with recruiter re potential case, conference with B. Glackin re same; research rules re witness contact.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/06/10	LIU, DANIEL	Research news articles to identify any breakdown of employees within the potential defendants companies for D. Harvey.	4.00	
10/07/10	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research facts.	0.40	
10/07/10	KRUSE, JOY	Cold calling/tech employees investigation.	0.70	
10/07/10	LIU, DANIEL	Continue to look for information on employee breakdown for the defendants for D. Harvey.	4.00	
10/12/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Review news reports re potential case.	0.80	
10/20/10	LIU, DANIEL	Research blogs re potential witnesses for D. Harvey.	2.60	
10/21/10	LIU, DANIEL	Research blogs re potential witnesses for D. Harvey.	2.00	
11/04/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Research applicable law re investigating potential cases; conference with J. Saveri re potential case; correspond with former employee.	1.50	
12/27/10	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential clients.	0.50	
01/20/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case.	3.50	
01/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, communicate with potential co-counsel.	4.50	
01/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, discuss with potential clients.	2.80	
01/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, discuss case with potential clients.	3.50	
01/24/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re potential client; review case facts.	0.50	
01/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, conference with E. Fastiff and J. Saveri re same; conference with potential class representative; conference with D. Liu re technology market; draft retention agreement; research Executive Committee memo.	4.60	
01/24/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research Pixar and Lucasfilm for D. Harvey.	3.80	
01/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.50	
01/25/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research facts; telephone conference with D. Harvey re clients.	0.50	
01/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential class representative, conference with E. Fastiff re same; research potential case.	1.50	
01/25/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.80	
01/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with E. Fastiff re potential case; conference with J. Shipp and A. Shaver re employment issues; research class certification and merits issues.	3.50	
01/26/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research Pixar and Lucas Film for D. Harvey.	4.00	
01/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.50	
01/27/11	LIU, DANIEL	Review Federal Communications Commission (FCC) documents for witness information for D. Harvey.	4.00	
01/31/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with D. Liu and Litigation Support re potential case; research standard of antitrust review; research class certification issues; communicate with potential class representative.	5.70	
01/31/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research employee statistics for D. Harvey.	2.30	
01/31/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.50	
02/01/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Assist D. Liu with a research strategy for finding the number of employees of various high tech companies.	0.90	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/01/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Create flow chart for cold call.	2.00	
02/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, conference with D. Liu re same, conference with research staff re same.	3.80	
02/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	1.00	
02/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case.	3.30	
02/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation.	0.80	
02/03/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri, B. Glackin (partial).	0.50	
02/03/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey, E. Fastiff re case.	1.00	
02/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, J. Sagafi, and B. Glackin re potential case, research same.	4.20	
02/04/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case; conference with potential economic consultants re same.	4.50	
02/07/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with E. Fastiff re potential case, research potential case, conference with potential class representative, conference with potential consulting expert, correspond with economic consultants.	5.40	
02/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	4.80	
02/08/11	LIU, DANIEL	Conduct research on defendants' employee statistics for D. Harvey.	4.30	
02/09/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, correspond with potential testifying experts re same.	1.20	
02/09/11	LIU, DANIEL	Conduct research on defendants' employee statistics for D. Harvey.	3.00	
02/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with potential consulting and testifying economists; research potential case, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	3.50	
02/14/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate judge economic interest statements for D. Harvey.	0.40	
02/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with R. Nelson re venue issues; research potential venues; research class certification and merits issues; correspond with potential client; conference with potential testifying economic expert; confer with J. Saveri re investigation.	3.70	
02/15/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation; conference with D. Harvey.	1.00	
02/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential testifying expert; conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re potential case; research potential case.	6.20	
02/17/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Order docket items from Southern District of Texas Court re labor restraint case.	0.50	
02/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, draft memo re same.	2.50	
02/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case.	5.50	
02/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class certification issues.	3.80	
02/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class certification issues, conference with M. Jackson re potential case.	3.50	
02/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case.	1.20	
02/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case.	0.60	
03/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with B. Glackin re potential case, correspond with potential class representative.	0.50	
03/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, draft Executive Committee memo re same.	3.50	
03/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, conference with B. Glackin re same, conference with potential class representative.	4.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case; conference with Neil Hariharan, prepare for same, draft correspondence re same.	1.80	
03/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert re labor market issues; conference with E. Fastiff re potential case; conference with A. Shaver re potential case; research class certification issues and draft memo re same.	3.50	
03/22/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet with D. Harvey re cold calling case and review materials re same.	1.50	
03/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Complete new case memo, circulate same, conference with B. Glackin re same.	3.60	
03/23/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Read D. Harvey's Executive Committee memo and comment on same re employment issue.	0.50	
03/24/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit research memorandum and confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
03/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with E. Fastiff re memo revisions, research same.	0.40	
03/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, revise memo re same.	6.80	
04/08/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit memorandum and conference with D. Harvey re claims.	0.50	
04/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with E. Fastiff re Executive Committee memo; conference with potential experts; revise Executive Committee memo describing case strategy.	0.80	
04/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert re class certification issues, prepare for same, research same.	1.70	
04/12/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential case, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	1.50	
04/13/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read draft Executive Committee memorandum and conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey, B. Glackin re venue re case strategy.	1.00	
04/13/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey, re case strategy and review memo re same	1.10	
04/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise Executive Committee memo, research same, conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin re same.	2.50	
04/13/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review memorandum; prefiling investigation; conference with D. Harvey.	2.00	
04/14/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Call re expert work and research claims.	0.50	
04/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise Executive Committee memo, research same; correspond with potential client.	0.50	
04/15/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Corporate research in Pixar. Assist D. Liu on company research.	1.90	
04/15/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with re expert work.	0.20	
04/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and research memo re potential case; conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, and E. Fastiff re same; supervise D. Liu research re same.	2.50	
04/15/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research the Board of Directors of Apple and Google from 2005 - 2007 for D. Harvey.	0.80	
04/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Department of Justice filings, correspond with team re same; correspond with team re case strategy and schedule.	1.20	
04/18/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation; review Department of Justice filing.	1.30	
04/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research judicial background.	0.30	
04/20/11	LIU, DANIEL	Gather Board of Directors information on defendants for D. Harvey.	1.30	
04/21/11	LIU, DANIEL	Gather Board of Directors information on defendants for D. Harvey.	3.00	
04/22/11	LIU, DANIEL	Gather Board of Directors information on defendants for D. Harvey.	2.50	
04/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft complaint.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/25/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Litigation search. Research documents.	0.50	
04/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with potential client; research and draft complaint.	3.50	
04/25/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research Apple - Pixar relationship for D. Harvey.	5.60	
04/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft complaint, supervise research re same; conference with D. Liu re fact research; conference with S. Shin re filling requirements; conference with class representative, conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re same.	6.60	
04/26/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research the relationship between defendants for D. Harvey.	6.50	
04/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation; review and revise complaint; conference with D. Harvey and E. Fastiff re same.	2.00	
04/26/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize P:/ drive with folders and file and sort documents. Search for local rules to Alameda County Superior Court. Search for defendants' agents for the service of process.	1.50	
04/27/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Retrieve court document for D. Harvey.	0.30	
04/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research complaint, draft same; conference with potential client re allegations.	6.50	
04/27/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research the relationship between defendants for D. Harvey.	6.00	
04/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize and save retainer agreement and other related documents from the client. Further create subfolder in the P:/ drive for the new documents.	0.70	
04/28/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint and conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.00	
04/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft, research, and revise complaint; research filing and service requirements, conference with A. Elgart, N. Desai, and S. Shin re same; confer with E. Fastiff re complaint.	6.50	
04/28/11	LIU, DANIEL	Review complaint to fact check for D. Harvey.	1.20	
04/28/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise complaint.	1.10	
04/28/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare for filings of complaints and related documents. Download and prepare civil case cover sheet, addendum, and summons for D. Harvey.	1.50	
04/29/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint and confer with D. Harvey.	1.00	
04/29/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise complaint, conference with B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, and K. Lehe re same; research communications strategy, supervise work re same; confer with J. Saveri re investigation.	5.20	
04/29/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with D. Harvey to discuss assignment.	0.20	
04/29/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review background materials.	0.30	
04/29/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research Lucasfilm revenue for D. Harvey	0.50	
04/29/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation; conference with D. Harvey.	1.00	
04/29/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Discuss with D. Harvey regarding filing process of summons and complaint. Prepare a cover letter for filing summons and complaint.	1.00	
04/30/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prefiling investigation; conference with D. Harvey.	1.20	
05/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise complaint and press release; research filing and service issues.	3.50	
05/02/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Review/process court records.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/02/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint; edit cover sheet and summons; telephone conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey and B. Glackin re diversity jurisdiction issues.	0.50	
05/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise complaint, research same; supervise K. Lehe research re legal claims; conference with team re complaint and strategy.	3.50	
05/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read complaint; confer with D. Harvey; research case law on claims.	5.10	
05/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise complaint.	1.00	
05/03/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint and conference with D. Harvey re same; research causes of action.	2.00	
05/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise complaint, supervise filing; supervise research re claims, research same, conference with K. Lehe and E. Fastiff re same.	3.50	
05/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research case law on claims for addition to complaint; confer with D. Harvey re same; draft complaint language; review complaint.	4.80	
05/03/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research complaints alleging claims under the Cartwright Act and state law for D. Harvey.	0.70	
05/03/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review complaint; arrange filing; conference with D. Harvey; conference with E. Fastiff; draft press notice.	1.70	
05/03/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with First Legal courier regarding filing information. Prepare for the filing of summons and complaint. Further search for agents for the defendants.	3.00	
05/03/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare new set of summons and complaint with the revised version of summons and complaint by D. Harvey. Assist with filing.	0.80	
05/04/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re response to filings and class member inquiries; review same; read press stories re case and comments to same; confer with J. Saveri re communications to public.	0.50	
05/04/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise service of complaint; supervise communication strategy; review news reports; conference with class representative; conference with employees and other sources of information.	6.60	
05/04/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review press release, complaint, web site for case follow up.	0.20	
05/04/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise filing; conference with press; conference with E. Fastiff.	2.10	
05/04/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Scan, save, and email PDF copies of the summons, complaint, and civil case cover sheet to attorneys and Records. Request a check for advanced fee of filing a complex case. Create a chart of all the defendants' agents for the process service. Research for any updates on the defendants' agents' information. Review local rules regarding service to defendants. Hold a telephone conference with First Legal to discuss process service plan. Communicate with process server to receive updates on the service.	4.00	
05/05/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Follow-up on class member inquiries, conference with J. Saveri re same; monitor and review news reports of case; supervise communications with court re complex determination and other matters.	2.50	
05/05/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review news coverage; service issues; review case assignment; confer with D. Harvey.	0.50	
05/05/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with court clerk re assigned judge. Communicate with First Legal to get an update on the proofs of service. Update emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Create a list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Update copies of the proofs of service to P:/ drive and email PDF copies to attorneys and Records. Organize P:/ by creating new subfolders for better and easier access.	3.20	
05/06/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey and re expert issues.	1.00	
05/06/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert and E. Fastiff, prepare for same; review news articles; research filing and service issues; confer with J. Saveri re expert.	1.80	
05/06/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with reporters; conference with D. Harvey re expert.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/06/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Update copies of the documents from the court to P:/ drive and email PDF copies to attorneys, Records, and Calendar. Communicate with a class member and intake information.	1.50	
05/09/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with S. Shin re filing and service requirements; conference with K. Lehe re outstanding tasks and case strategy; monitor news reports; conference with B. Glackin re class representative; research letter to defendants re class communications.	2.50	
05/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re tasks on case.	0.30	
05/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review sample Freedom of Information Act letters for drafting same.	0.10	
05/09/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Update proof of service of summons and complaint received from the service processors to P:/ drive and email PDF copies to attorneys and Records. Organize court documents to P:/ drive. Prepare a letter to the clerk of the Court for filings of proof of service of summons and complaint. Prepare proof of service of summons and complaint to the Court.	2.70	
05/10/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Litigation searches. Set up CourtHouse News Dingers for case-related information.	0.60	
05/10/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members; conference with K. Lehe, E. Fastiff, and J. Saveri re discovery strategy, research same.	1.50	
05/10/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey, B. Troxel re requests for production, person most knowledgeable; research California Rules of Court, California Code of Civil Procedure and local rules on timing of discovery requests and requirements for same; research re requests for production.	1.90	
05/10/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on Department of Justice, Antitrust Division Freedom of Information Act requests; draft letter; review E. Cabraser memo for the same.	1.10	
05/10/11	LIU, DANIEL	Gather stories on hightech cold calling for D. Harvey.	1.70	
05/10/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Organize discovery; proofs of service.	0.50	
05/10/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize endorsed copies of proofs of service to defendants to P:/ drive. Email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Organize correspondence to the court and documents received from processors to P:/ drive.	1.50	
05/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review news reports, supervise fact research; conference with current class members; research discovery plan.	1.50	
05/11/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft requests for production of documents; review discovery rules for same.	3.80	
05/11/11	LIU, DANIEL	Gather stories on High Tech Cold Calling for D. Harvey.	2.00	
05/11/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously update emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Review articles found by D. Liu. Further organize P:/ by creating subfolders.	1.20	
05/12/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re discovery strategy.	0.20	
05/12/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re outstanding tasks; research discovery plan; research background facts; conference with co-counsel re case generally; conference with class member; conference with K. Lehe re service requirements.	2.50	
05/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft and edit draft first set of requests for production of documents.	0.60	
05/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review state code, proof of service, emails from process server and Calendar re scheduling of discovery deadlines; review local rules, California Rules of Court, Cal. Code. Civ. Proc. re sanctions for serving discovery early.	1.70	
05/12/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research standing orders for Steve Brick for K. Lehe.	0.40	
05/12/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Organize discovery; telephone conference with Eric Cramer.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/12/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Communicate with Calendar, K. Lehe, D. Harvey, and First Legal regarding discovery deadline issues. Locate California Code of Civil Procedure regarding service of summons and complaint for calendaring.	1.50	
05/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise request for production, research same, conference with J. Saveri re same, conference with E. Fastiff re same, conference with K. Lehe re same; research electronically stored information protocol, conference with document vendors re same, conference with J. Saveri re same.	2.80	
05/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review code and local rules for provisions on subparts in discovery requests; email D. Harvey re same.	0.40	
05/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review edits to request for production of documents; confer with D. Harvey re same and Freedom of Information Act request.	0.30	
05/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Judge Brick's direct calendaring instructions; confer with R. Mukherji re standing orders.	0.10	
05/13/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Organize discovery; conference with D. Harvey re task list.	0.80	
05/13/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Communicate with First Legal regarding service of document production to the defendants.	1.00	
05/15/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise draft discovery.	1.00	
05/16/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit request for production template.	0.40	
05/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise first set of document requests, supervise service of same; conference with team re electronically stored information production specification, conference with vendor and in-house Litigation Support re same; research and review draft Freedom of Information Act request; confer with K. Lehe re Freedom of Information Act request and discovery; confer with J. Saveri re remand.	4.50	
05/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft Freedom of Information Act request; review template and complaint for same; confer with D. Harvey re same; email team.	1.40	
05/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review local rules, state code and state rules to ensure compliance of discovery requests; confer with D. Harvey re same.	1.00	
05/16/11	RUIZ, ALAN	For D. Harvey, organize and arrange for service of requests for production of documents directed to all seven defendants.	1.40	
05/16/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise Freedom of Information Act request; conference with D. Harvey re remand; review and revise draft discovery.	0.90	
05/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re case strategy; research potential removal; conference with potential clients, correspond with same; review draft Freedom of Information Act request.	2.50	
05/17/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Confirm service of yesterday's requests for production of documents with process server.	0.40	
05/17/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Remand issues and strategy; conference with D. Harvey.	0.70	
05/17/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Communicate with First Legal regarding discovery service on the defendants.	0.70	
05/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential class representative; conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re case status; research potential removal issues.	1.50	
05/18/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with First Legal regarding service of discovery to the defendants and its proof of service. Review request for document production. Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status.	1.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/19/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Save proofs of service received by First Legal to P:/ and circulate the PDF copies to attorneys, Records, and Calendar.	0.80	
05/20/11	NGUYEN, PHONG-CHAU	Continue research for D. Harvey on a state remand under the Class Action Fairness Act; draft memo based on research.	5.90	
05/23/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re removal issues.	0.20	
05/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review notice of removal and research same, conference with E. Fastiff, J. Saveri re same; research potential clients.	1.50	
05/23/11	NGUYEN, PHONG-CHAU	Draft memo for D. Harvey on remanding proceedings under the Class Action Fairness Act and confer with D. Harvey re same.	6.30	
05/23/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Save proofs of service received by First Legal to P:/ and circulate to attorneys, Records, and Calendar.	0.80	
05/24/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Download docket and pleadings for newly transferred case in Northern District of California, Hariharan v. Adobe Systems Inc, 11cv2509 for attorneys.	0.50	
05/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review removal materials, conference with E. Fastiff re same; research federal enclave jurisdiction, draft correspondence re same; review class member inquires; review letter re improper communications with class members; review and revise memo re Class Action Fairness Act jurisdiction, conference with D. Nguyen re same; confer with J. Saveri re removal.	6.20	
05/24/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Lucasfilm's amended declaration in support of notice of removal, Intel's corporate disclosure statement, certificate of service, with exhibits; email D. Harvey re same.	0.20	
05/24/11	NGUYEN, PHONG-CHAU	Revise memo for D. Harvey on remanding proceedings under the Class Action Fairness Act and confer with D. Harvey re same.	6.40	
05/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review letter re class communications.	0.30	
05/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review removal briefs; conference with D. Harvey.	0.80	
05/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with Michael Tubach re extensions.	1.00	
05/24/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Update documents received from the defendants to P:/ drive. Circulate documents received from the defendants to attorneys. Review the pleading documents.	1.60	
05/25/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Download docket and pleadings for newly transferred case in Northern District of California, Hariharan v. Adobe Systems Inc, 11cv2509 for attorneys.	0.50	
05/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' notice of removal and supporting papers; research jurisdictional issues; draft stipulation regarding extension of time for defendants to respond to complaint, conference with E. Fastiff re same; research federal enclave jurisdiction; answer class member inquiries, conference with class members.	7.80	
05/25/11	NGUYEN, PHONG-CHAU	Finish revised memo for D. Harvey on remanding proceedings under the Class Action Fairness Act.	3.50	
05/25/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Strategy; telephone conference with Michael Tubach; review stipulation.	2.00	
05/25/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Update documents received from the defendants and electronic court filing files to P:/ drive. Circulate documents to attorneys.	2.00	
05/26/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit stipulation re defendants' responses to the complaint; conference with D. Harvey re same; read P. Nguyen memorandum re Class Action Fairness Act jurisdiction; research federal jurisdiction.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential clients, conference with same; conference with class representative; research remand issues, conference with P. Nguyen re same; research venue issues; confer with E. Fastiff re defendant responses; confer with J. Saveri re Freedom of Information Act.	4.50	
05/26/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Obtain Delaware case docket and related documents for D. Harvey research re tech labor issues.	0.40	
05/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise Freedom of Information Act request; conference with D. Harvey.	0.60	
05/26/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Organize proofs of service received by First Legal to P:/ and circulate the PDF copies to attorneys.	0.80	
05/27/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Freedom of Information Act letter; conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re discovery and remand strategy; research remand issues.	2.50	
05/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research jurisdictional issues, conference with E. Fastiff and J. Saveri re same; review, revise, and research Freedom of Information Act request, conference with K. Lehe re same; draft and file declination to proceed before Magistrate; conference with potential clients, review employment records; research potential testifying experts; conference with A. Shaver re motion to remand; research removal.	6.50	
05/27/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Freedom of Information Act request; confer with D. Harvey re same; proofread and send Freedom of Information Act request letter.	0.40	
05/27/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Client retention; conference with D. Harvey conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin.	0.60	
05/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email PDF copies to attorneys. Update list of defense counsels. Gather defense counsels' contact information. Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Research rule re consent/declination of Magistrate Judge. Revise letter to defense counsels. Prepare a letter to Department of Justice for K. Lehe.	3.50	
05/28/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Research re federal enclave.	1.00	
05/29/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review Freedom of Information Act request.	0.70	
05/31/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research re federal enclave jurisdiction; conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re same.	2.40	
05/31/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members and potential clients; conference with press; research and draft additional complaint; conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re case strategy; review research re federal enclave, research same; research motion for jurisdictional discovery; conference with John Radice re case generally and next steps.	6.80	
05/31/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Obtain federal statute creating the Presidio Trust for E. Fastiff.	0.30	
05/31/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Case law research on Class Action Fairness Act discretionary exception; review complaint and removal brief.	3.50	
05/31/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email to attorneys. Continuously organize emails received from the potential class members to P:/ drive. Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Organize retainer agreements and documents provided by the clients.	1.00	
06/01/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re district venue; research same; research remand legal issues.	3.10	
06/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re jurisdictional issues and overall strategy; conference with potential clients; conference with A. Shaver re discretionary remand; review memo re federal enclave, research same; research intra-district transfer, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	4.30	
06/01/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft brief on Class Action Fairness Act jurisdictional exception; case law research on same.	4.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/01/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email to attorneys. Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Further organize retainer agreements and documents provided by the clients.	1.00	
06/02/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with plaintiff counsel re remand issues; read Judge Armstrong's standing orders; read Enclave Jurisdiction cases.	3.80	
06/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re overall strategy and next steps; correspond with class member; research federal enclave jurisdiction; research Class Action Fairness Act jurisdiction; review memos re jurisdictional issues; confer with A. Shaver re research.	5.40	
06/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Conference call with co-counsel re strategy and next steps.	1.00	
06/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re next steps in litigation, assignments.	0.10	
06/02/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit Class Action Fairness Act brief section; team conference call to discuss next steps in litigation; telephone call with D. Harvey re federal enclave jurisdiction; follow-up emails with team.	1.50	
06/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re jurisdiction issues, research same; correspond with clients; review and revise Freedom of Information Act letter; draft complaints for additional clients.	4.30	
06/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft response to Freedom of Information Act request acknowledgment.	0.30	
06/03/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Further update and revise the list of potential class members with their contact information and their current status. Further organize retainer agreements and documents provided by the clients. Prepare service of a letter to Department of Justice regarding Freedom of Information Act request.	1.10	
06/06/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Draft Freedom of Information Act letter; develop damages calculation and confer with D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
06/06/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise damages estimates, conference with E. Fastiff and D. Liu re same; research federal enclave and Class Action Fairness Act issues.	4.30	
06/06/11	LIU, DANIEL	Update potential damages table with declared employee numbers from defendants for D. Harvey.	2.50	
06/06/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Locate Santa Clara Superior Court local rules regarding complaint filing and assist with same. Communicate with court office regarding complaint filing.	1.00	
06/07/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re remand strategy; read cases re same.	1.80	
06/07/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re case strategy; research jurisdictional issues; conference with M. Nettles re intra-district transfer issues; revise complaint for additional clients.	2.20	
06/07/11	LIU, DANIEL	Research Ed Colligan and current board of director positions for D. Harvey.	0.50	
06/07/11	NETTLES, MARVIN	Meet with D. Harvey regarding research assignment.	0.30	
06/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri re jurisdictional discovery, revise draft agreement with defendants re same; conference with client; conference with M. Nettles re intra-district transfer.	1.20	
06/08/11	NETTLES, MARVIN	Begin memo assignment for D. Harvey re transfer issues.	6.00	
06/09/11	NETTLES, MARVIN	Continue memo assignment for D. Harvey re transfer/jurisdictional issues.	7.00	
06/10/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re discovery; read jurisdiction cases.	0.50	
06/10/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery issues; draft complaints; conference with client.	3.50	
06/10/11	NETTLES, MARVIN	Complete memo assignment for D. Harvey re transfer/jurisdictional issues.	6.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft complaints for additional clients; conference with J. Saveri and A. Shaver re revised allegations; research and draft notice of pendency of other cases, review M. Nettles memo re same.	6.50	
06/13/11	LIU, DANIEL	Background checks for class representatives for D. Harvey and investigation re Steve Jobs.	2.00	
06/13/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate pending actions filed by Google, Apple, Pixar and Adobe in the Northern District Court of California, for D. Harvey.	1.00	
06/13/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review new complaint and Class Action Fairness Act memo; emails with D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
06/13/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for the final judgment orders against the defendants for the cases filed by the Department of Justice. Organize clients' documents in the P:/ drive.	0.60	
06/14/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Jurisdiction legal research.	2.00	
06/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft venue transfer issues and motion; conference with co-counsel re revised complaints; research and revise new complaints.	3.50	
06/14/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read emails re draft new complaint.	0.10	
06/15/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit discovery agreement; telephone conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re discovery and remand strategy.	2.40	
06/15/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise proposed discovery agreement.	0.20	
06/15/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re removal/remand, new complaints, discovery.	1.90	
06/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft notice re venue transfer; conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin re discovery, remand, and other cases; review, research, and revise draft discovery agreement with defendants, conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin re same; revise additional complaints, research same.	5.20	
06/16/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Organize correspondence to P:/ drive.	0.10	
06/27/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey and J. Saveri re strategy; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re remand discovery and briefing schedule.	0.70	
06/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise complaints, conference with clients re same; research related case procedures in state and federal court; conference with Intuit counsel re declaration; conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re case strategy; review expert materials.	7.10	
06/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Assist with filing. Prepare a draft of a letter to court clerk regarding complaint filing.	0.50	
06/28/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint and cover sheets; conference with D. Harvey re filing and service of complaints; edit notice of related action and conference with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re defendants' briefing proposal.	1.40	
06/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members and clients, revise complaints re same; supervise filing of complaints; research coordination and transfer strategy, draft and circulate notice re same; confer with E. Fastiff re filings.	7.20	
06/28/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review letter from Department of Justice re Freedom of Information Act request; email team; confer with D. Seltz, M. Miarmi re appeals and Freedom of Information Act process.	0.20	
06/28/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare summons, civil case cover sheets, notices of related case, and cover letters. Communicate with courier services regarding summons and complaint filing. Locate local rules and California Code of Civil Procedure regarding service of summons and complaint to defendants. Further create subfiles to add new filings.	5.50	
06/29/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Dan Purcell and D. Harvey re Lucasfilm jurisdictional discovery and possible settlement; review related materials.	0.40	
06/29/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise statement re consolidation/transfer of cases; memorandum re same to D. Harvey.	2.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/29/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise notice of related cases and ancillary filings, conference with team re same, supervise e-filing of same; conference with Lucasfilm counsel re jurisdictional discovery; conference with clients re draft complaints and case strategy; research remand issues; research coordination issues, correspond with defense counsel re same; conference with K. Lehe re Freedom of Information Act issues.	6.50	
06/29/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft appeal of Freedom of Information Act request denial; legal research for same; review exemplars and confer with D. Harvey.	7.60	
06/29/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update endorsed copies of the filings and organize them to P:/ drive. Prepare copies for attorneys and Records. Further create subfiles in the P:/ drive to organize additional files.	1.60	
06/30/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Freedom of Information Act Appeal; edit second notice of related case; conference with D. Harvey re service.	1.40	
06/30/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research pro hac vice applications and notices of appearance, conference with co-counsel re same; review and revise Freedom of Information Act appeal, conference with E. Fastiff and K. Lehe re same; supervise filing of additional complaint; draft and serve correspondence to defense counsel re meet and confer; draft, revise, and file notice of related case.	6.50	
06/30/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft appeal of Freedom of Information Act request denial; legal research and docket research for same; meet with D. Harvey re edits.	1.90	
06/30/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare summons, civil case cover sheets, notices of related case, and cover letters. Communicate with courier services regarding summons and complaint filing. Search for other cases relating to the defendants for K. Lehe. Organize endorsed copies from the court to P:/ drive and email PDF copies to the attorneys. Prepare summons, complaint and other papers for serving the opposing counsels by first class mail.	3.70	
07/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise service of complaints, conference with S. Shin re same; draft and circulate task list; confer with J. Saveri re service.	2.50	
07/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for Freedom of Information Act appeal; edits to appeal.	0.50	
07/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Service issues; conference with D. Harvey.	0.30	
07/01/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare letters to the opposing counsels regarding notice and acknowledgment of summons and envelopes. Further organize endorsed copies from the court to P:/ drive. Communicate with courier service to check on the status of delivery.	1.70	
07/05/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Service issues.	0.40	
07/05/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare summons and complaint to serve the agents for process of service. Prepare letters to defense counsels regarding the enclosure of Santa Clara Superior Court's Complex Civil Guidelines. Update class member status list with additional information.	1.30	
07/06/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with process server regarding changes to service and updates. Research for rules regarding application of pro hac vice and filing. Communicate with D. Harvey regarding summons and complaint service. Organize endorsed copies of pro hac vice application to P:/ drive.	1.00	
07/08/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize proofs of service of summons and complaint to P:/ drive and copies to attorneys. Prepare a letter to court clerk regarding proof of service filing. Communicate with courier service regarding proof of service filing.	1.00	
07/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise Daniel Stover complaint; conference with class members and clients; supervise preparation for filing Daniel Stover complaint; draft and revise third notice of related case, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	4.50	
07/11/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare summons, civil case cover sheets, notices of related case, and cover letters for Daniel Stover. Communicate with courier services regarding summons and complaint filing.	2.00	
07/12/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft stipulation re coordination, discovery, and briefing schedule on motion to remand and potential motions to dismiss, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	0.80	
07/13/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference scheduling stipulation; email with Michael Tubach re same; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.40	
07/13/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re scheduling.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise stipulation regarding jurisdictional discovery and scheduling, conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same; research motion to remand.	2.50	
07/14/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Finalize Daniel Stover complaint; conference with D. Harvey re related case issues.	0.20	
07/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise filing Daniel Stover complaint, supervise service copies of same; research response deadline to notice of other action, conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same; research remand issues.	2.50	
07/14/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare summons and complaint filing for Daniel Stover. Communicate with Spin Cycle regarding filings of the papers. Prepare service copies for the defendants to serve by mail.	2.50	
07/14/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Mark Fichtner and Daniel Stover complaints for service.	4.80	
07/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with plaintiff and press, conference with team re same; draft notices of appearance for co-counsel, conference with co-counsel re same; draft notices of others actions and declaration in support, proposed order; research case strategy.	7.50	
07/15/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Setup electronic court filing email notification for the United States District Court, Northern District of California. Search for any missing documents that were filed on the court docket. Download missing documents from the docket and organize them to P:/ drive. Create subfolders to organize new documents in the P:/ drive. Organize documents for Records.	3.00	
07/18/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Michael Tubach email re scheduling; conference with D. Harvey re same; confer with J. Saveri re stipulation.	0.20	
07/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery strategy; review and revise proposed stipulation re jurisdictional discovery and deadlines; research Case Management Conference requirements, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	2.50	
07/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review notice of receipt of appeal from Department of Justice.	0.10	
07/18/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with E. Fastiff; review stipulation.	1.00	
07/18/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Gather defense counsel's contact information to update a service list. Scan and organize notices and acknowledgment of receipt to P:/ drive and email PDF copies to attorneys. Communicate with Spin Cycle regarding notice and acknowledgment of receipt filing to the court.	1.20	
07/19/11	CARNAM, TODD	Search for complaint in related case, per D. Harvey's request.	0.40	
07/19/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit notice of pendency case and declaration and proposed order; read defendants' administrative motion to relate cases; research local rules re same; confer with D. Harvey re related issues; confer with J. Saveri.	3.10	
07/19/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review transfer/coordination filings and confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.40	
07/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise third notice of other action and supporting documents, conference with B. Glackin and E. Fastiff re same; review defendants' administrative motion and research responses.	7.20	
07/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Email team re appeal letter to Department of Justice; confer with team re source of deadlines.	0.20	
07/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research to determine deadlines for Department of Justice to respond to Freedom of Information Act request, our deadline to appeal to District Court; calendar and email team re same.	1.60	
07/19/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with E. Fastiff; review and revise stipulation.	0.80	
07/19/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same. Organize endorsed copies of the notice and acknowledgment of receipt to P:/ drive and email re same.	0.50	
07/20/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for the complaint for recently-filed Northern District of California antitrust case to determine if related.	0.90	
07/20/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit response to administrative motion to relate cases and declaration and proposed order; edit scheduling stipulation; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re scheduling stipulation and intra-district transfer stipulation motion; conference with D. Harvey re strategy; confer with J. Saveri re removal.	4.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/20/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft memorandum re case coordination.	0.40	
07/20/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, revise, and file response to defendants' administrative motion, conference with E. Fastiff re same, supervise service re same; review notices of removal for four additional cases, research response, draft and circulate correspondence to co-counsel re same; confer with J. Saveri re removal.	7.50	
07/20/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate Northern District Court orders relating cases pursuant to Civil Local Rule 3-12, for D. Harvey.	0.70	
07/20/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Organize case filings to P:/ drive.	0.70	
07/20/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review removal petition; review and revise stipulation; conference with D. Harvey; conference with E. Fastiff.	1.50	
07/20/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chamber copies re related cases pleadings.	2.00	
07/21/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re removal/research issues; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re defendants' response stipulation and intra-district transfer; email with J. Saveri re same; research Class Action Fairness Act re removal.	1.00	
07/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research jurisdiction issues, conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same; conference with potential clients; conference with reporter re recently-filed actions; conference with co-counsel re jurisdiction issues; draft memoranda re consolidation steps and circulate.	9.40	
07/21/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with D. Harvey re status; transfer motion; conference with E. Fastiff.	1.00	
07/21/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same. Organize missing documents from court dockets for the plaintiffs, Brandon Marshall, Michael Devine, Mark Fichtner, and Daniel Stover to P:/ drive. Further create subfolders in the P:/ drive to organize files. Organize filed documents received from the defense counsels. Organize and email notice and acknowledgment of receipt to attorneys. Create binders for all five cases for E. Fastiff. Update class members list and add new members to the list.	5.20	
07/22/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Docket search re defendants.	0.20	
07/22/11	CARNAM, TODD	Research for D. Harvey cases in which any of the named defendants moved for intra district transfer, pull and send all relevant fillings.	2.00	
07/22/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference and email with Michael Tubach re defendants' extension stipulation; review D. Harvey's research memo re remand.	0.50	
07/22/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review D. Harvey memorandum re jurisdiction; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.90	
07/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research jurisdiction issues, conference with B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, and co-counsel re same, draft memo re same.	9.10	
07/22/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same. Create a contact list of all the defendants' counsels. Update certificate of service list with new defendants' and plaintiffs' counsels.	1.20	
07/25/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same.	0.40	
07/26/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re venue; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re same.	1.50	
07/26/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey re pleading issues, scheduling.	1.00	
07/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re remand issues and other pending tasks; research stipulation re remand, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	1.50	
07/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with E. Fastiff re case management.	0.50	
07/26/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same. Prepare pro hac vice application for the co-counsel.	0.80	
07/27/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review joint administrative motion; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise joint motion for transfer and stipulated order, conference with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same.	4.50	
07/27/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Coordinate with Calendar to ensure events logged. For S. Shin and D. Harvey review, create spreadsheet of upcoming events on the calendar.	1.60	
07/27/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with E. Fastiff.	0.30	
07/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same.	0.80	
07/28/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Finalize administrative motion to transfer; send to Michael Tubach.	0.20	
07/28/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same.	0.80	
07/29/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Review calendar, court clerks' notice, Case Management Order, and other order and update calendar events' chart. Prepare a letter to co-counsel and send them the filed pro hac vice application.	1.80	
08/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint motion re intra-district transfer and supporting documents, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	1.50	
08/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Case management; conference with D. Harvey; review discovery correspondence.	2.00	
08/01/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare clients' contact information table for D. Harvey and co-counsel.	0.20	
08/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and file administrative motion transferring cases, and supporting documents; conference with E. Fastiff and J. Saveri re case status generally.	2.80	
08/02/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare a letter for chamber copies. Prepare a set of chamber copies. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same.	0.80	
08/02/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Judge Armstrong's local rules re chamber copy for filing.	0.20	
08/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research transfer status and agreement with defendants re remand, conference with E. Fastiff re same.	0.50	
08/04/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read order transferring case to San Jose; conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re pretrial order 1 and consolidated complaint; email with Michael Tubach re case.	0.70	
08/04/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Court's order re transfer, conference with team re same; correspond with co-counsel re implications of transfer; research next steps post transfer and conference with team re same; research stipulated pretrial order; conference with E. Fastiff re class member contacts.	2.70	
08/04/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Case management; monitor emails; conference with E. Fastiff, D. Harvey, B. Glackin; review order.	1.80	
08/04/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and email attorneys re same. Organize notice and acknowledgment of receipt from the defendants, Adobe Systems, Inc. and Intuit, Inc.	0.40	
08/05/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review order assigning case to Judge Lucy Koh, conference with team re same; research first consolidated amended complaint and stipulated pretrial order.	1.80	
08/05/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review order of reassignment; review standing order.	1.00	
08/05/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.40	
08/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise calendar; conference with court clerk re standing order, review same; serve standing order, file certificate of service re same; conference with A. Shaver re letter to defendants re class member contacts; review standing orders and case status.	2.30	
08/08/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research background of Judge Koh, for D. Harvey.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/08/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search for the Honorable Judge Lucy H. Koh's standing order. Communicate with a court clerk regarding standing order and Case Management Conference. Review calendar for all five cases, and update and edit the list of calendar events for D. Harvey. Communicate with Calendar regarding the upcoming events. Prepare and serve a certificate of service to all defense counsels regarding the standing order via email and regular mail. Prepare a letter to defense counsels per D. Harvey.	4.30	
08/09/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Case management; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re schedule.	0.60	
08/09/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.20	
08/10/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft proposed pretrial order re organization of counsel and other issues.	1.70	
08/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research case management issues; research, draft, and circulate pretrial order number 1; correspond with A. Shaver re defendant communications with putative class members.	4.50	
08/11/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise pretrial order.	1.00	
08/11/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Case law research on defendants' communications with absent class members; emails with D. Harvey re same.	2.00	
08/12/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise pretrial order; conference with D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/12/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review D. Harvey's pretrial order; draft letter to defendants re communications with absent class members and circulate.	2.60	
08/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise draft pretrial order, correspond with E. Fastiff re same; research consolidated amended complaint.	1.50	
08/16/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit pretrial order 1; review Judge Koh's orders; research pending Google and Apple cases.	1.40	
08/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise draft pretrial order no. 1, conference with E. Fastiff re same; research consolidated complaint.	1.50	
08/16/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with D. Harvey; review and revise pretrial order; conference with E. Fastiff.	1.00	
08/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential client, draft summary re same.	0.60	
08/17/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update contact list with new potential class members.	0.20	
08/18/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 26(f) letter invitation.	0.10	
08/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft letter to defendants re Rule 26 conference, confer with J. Saveri re same; revise letter to defendants re class member contacts; research discovery plan.	1.50	
08/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise letters to defendants re Rule 26 conference and class member communications.	1.50	
08/19/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Case management; review and revise letter to defendants; schedule Case Management Conference.	1.10	
08/19/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit letter to defense counsel; emails with team re incorporating edits; circulate letter.	1.00	
08/19/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence to defense counsel in P:/ drive and iManage. Create email list for D. Harvey. Prepare a letter to send to defense counsel regarding communication with putative class members.	1.00	
08/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class member and potential client, draft summary re same; research potential motion to compel re Rule 26 conference.	0.70	
08/23/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Update list of class member with new information.	0.10	
08/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise Case Management Order; review Steve Jobs status; conference with D. Harvey.	1.00	
08/25/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read edits to pretrial order 1; email with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re same and Steve Jobs' possible deposition.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re draft pretrial order and preservation of Steve Jobs' testimony, conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re same; research and draft pretrial order.	2.50	
08/25/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise letter to Michael Tubach re Steve Jobs; discovery planning.	1.50	
08/25/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review draft pretrial order from D. Harvey.	0.80	
08/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise proposed pretrial order, conference with J. Saveri and E. Fastiff re same, serve same; revise draft letter re preservation of Steve Jobs' testimony.	1.50	
08/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review Steve Jobs' issue; conference with D. Harvey; review and revise consolidation paper; telephone conference with B. Glackin; review and revise letter to Michael Tubach; telephone conference with Michael Tubach.	2.70	
08/26/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Team emails re Steve Jobs deposition.	0.20	
08/26/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Collect research materials for attorneys on consolidation.	1.70	
08/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft letter re Rule 26(f) conference; revise letter re Steve Jobs' testimony.	0.30	
08/29/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit letter re Steve Jobs' health.	0.10	
08/29/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise letters to defendants re Steve Jobs' testimony and Rule 26(f) conference; research hearsay issues.	0.70	
08/29/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise letter re Steve Jobs status.	0.50	
08/30/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit letter and read defendants' edits to pretrial order 1.	0.40	
08/30/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence with Michael Tubach.	0.50	
08/30/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise letters to defendants re Steve Jobs' testimony and Rule 26(f) conference, conference with team re same; review defendants' letter re class member communications; review defendants' revisions to draft pretrial order; research and draft consolidated amended complaint, circulate same; conference with defense counsel re Rule 26(f) conference.	6.50	
08/30/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research exact corporate names for various listed defendants, for D. Harvey.	0.80	
08/30/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise consolidated complaint; review Michael Tubach letter; review and revise 26(f) letter.	1.50	
08/30/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review D. Harvey's letter to defendants; review letter from defendants to A. Shaver.	0.30	
08/30/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence sent by defense counsel and D. Harvey in the P:/ drive and to Records.	0.30	
08/31/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read draft complaint and conference with D. Harvey re defendants' edits to pretrial order 1.	1.00	
08/31/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft consolidated complaint; conference with defense counsel re draft pretrial order and other issues, conference with team re same; revise draft pretrial order; confer with J. Saveri.	1.80	
08/31/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise proposed schedule re motions to dismiss; telephone conference D. Harvey; review and revise consolidated complaint.	1.50	
09/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise consolidated amended complaint, circulate same and conference with team re same; conference with defense counsel re pretrial order no. 1, circulate revision of same, conference with team re same.	5.50	
09/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re pretrial order, circulate revision of same, conference with team re same.	1.50	
09/06/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise stipulated proposed pretrial order, e-file same; research discovery strategy; confer with J. Saveri.	1.50	
09/06/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read proposed stipulated pretrial order no. 1.	0.10	
09/06/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise orders; conference with D. Harvey.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/06/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.50	
09/09/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review evidence memorandum.	0.50	
09/12/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read pretrial order 1.	0.20	
09/13/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review order; conference with D. Harvey; review complaint.	1.00	
09/13/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.40	
09/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft document requests; conference with court clerk re motion to dismiss hearing date, conference with defense counsel re same.	2.20	
09/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft document requests; correspond with defendants' counsel re outstanding discovery issues, conference with J. Saveri re same.	3.50	
09/15/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise draft discovery; telephone conference with Michael Tubach; conference with E. Fastiff.	1.10	
09/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise document request; research and draft interrogatories; research and draft protective order; research discovery dispute procedures, draft and circulate memo re same.	4.50	
09/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for motion to compel discovery; confer with D. Harvey re same, Rule 26 conference, protective order, Electronically Stored Information protocol; review standing order re joint reports on discovery.	1.20	
09/16/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with Michael Tubach re Steve Jobs; case management; review documents.	1.00	
09/16/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey and K. Lehe re case tasks for Rule 26 conference.	0.30	
09/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise stipulated protective order; revise discovery requests.	1.50	
09/20/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Rule 12 briefing; email with J. Saveri, et al. re same.	0.20	
09/20/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise discovery requests; revise stipulated protective order; conference with K. Lehe re motion to compel issues, research same; research defendants' request for another motion to dismiss brief.	3.50	
09/20/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise discovery; conference with D. Harvey.	1.00	
09/21/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Lucasfilm's request for additional Rule 12 briefing; telephone conference and conference with J. Saveri re same; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.30	
09/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery plan, conference with B. Glackin re same; correspond with expert re document request.	0.70	
09/21/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with E. Fastiff re Lucasfilm pleadings.	0.50	
09/22/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Lucasfilm's request for a separate brief.	0.20	
09/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise discovery requests, conference with J. Saveri re same; research and draft opposition to administrative motion; research discovery plan, conference with J. Saveri re same.	2.50	
09/22/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive, and email attorneys re same.	0.20	
09/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise opposition to defendants' administrative motion.	3.50	
09/23/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Email and save a letter from the Department of Justice to P:/ drive and iManage.	0.10	
09/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and circulate opposition to Lucasfilm's administrative motion.	1.50	
09/24/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review denial of Freedom of Information Act request; email with attorney team re next steps.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/26/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Lucasfilm's administrative motion to file a separate Rule 12 brief; edit plaintiffs' opposition and E. Fastiff's declaration; conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
09/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, revise, and file opposition to Lucasfilm's administrative motion; research discovery issues; draft letter to defendants re Rule 26(f) conference, communicate with class members re same.	4.50	
09/27/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 26(f) letter to defense counsel.	0.20	
09/27/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft production order; telephone conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re same.	1.10	
09/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise letter to all defendants re Rule 26(f) conference; revise draft stipulations re discovery; conference with class representatives re document preservation and other issues; conference with team re Rule 26(f) conference and prepare for same.	7.20	
09/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare chambers copies and a cover letter for Judge Lucy H. Koh. Prepare class members' documents for D. Harvey. Search for exhibits for a letter to all defense counsel.	0.70	
09/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives; prepare for Rule 26(f) conference, conference with A. Shaver re same.	4.50	
09/28/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for motion to compel discovery.	4.80	
09/28/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re preparation for Rule 26 conference; order materials printed for conference.	0.30	
09/29/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for motion to compel discovery.	3.90	
09/30/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri re Rule 26(f) conference, prepare for same; conference with K. Lehe re motion for stay of discovery; draft outline for 26(f) conference.	4.20	
09/30/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re motion to compel, legal research.	0.20	
10/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft outline re Rule 26(f) conference.	1.50	
10/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review outline of Rule 26 conference agenda; confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.10	
10/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prepare for Rule 26 conference.	1.00	
10/01/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review D. Harvey's letter to defendants; draft discovery requests and stipulated protective order and Electronically Stored Information protocol.	1.50	
10/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prepare for Rule 26 conference.	0.80	
10/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Rule 26(f) conference, attend same, conference re same with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, and A. Shaver; revise discovery requests, conference with J. Saveri re same, serve same; draft and serve letter to defendants re Rule 26(f) conference.	6.50	
10/03/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prepare for Rule 26 conference; Rule 26 conference; prepare and propound discovery; conference with D. Harvey.	4.30	
10/03/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend Rule 26 conference; conference with D. Harvey and J. Saveri re conference; prepare attendee list.	2.70	
10/03/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare proof of service and a list of defense and plaintiff counsels for discovery. Organize request for document production and interrogatories to P:/ drive and iManage.	0.50	
10/04/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft joint discovery report, conference with J. Saveri re same.	4.50	
10/04/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for Freedom of Information Act enforcement suit.	1.00	
10/04/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Alternative Dispute Resolution certifications; conference with D. Harvey.	0.50	
10/04/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft Rule 26(f) follow-up letter and email to D. Harvey re same.	1.90	
10/04/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/05/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with each plaintiff individually re Alternative Dispute Resolution procedures; draft Alternative Dispute Resolution compliance statement and e-file; research and draft discovery dispute joint report 1.	8.50	
10/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research for Freedom of Information Act enforcement suit; review briefings, orders, and complaints in other LCHB cases; draft complaint.	8.10	
10/05/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review Alternative Dispute Resolution (ADR) certification.	0.30	
10/05/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey re joint status report and follow-up letter; team emails re FOIA from FBI; review draft report from D. Harvey.	0.40	
10/05/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update correspondence documents to P:/ drive.	0.40	
10/06/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit discovery dispute report.	0.50	
10/06/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Freedom of Information Act complaint and research same.	1.50	
10/06/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re 26(f) report.	0.20	
10/06/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review joint discovery statement; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.70	
10/06/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint discovery report, draft and serve letter re same; research subpoena to Palm; research protective order issues; review letters re discovery issues.	8.20	
10/06/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft complaint for Freedom of Information Act enforcement suit; confer with team re same.	2.80	
10/06/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise 26(f) letter.	0.50	
10/07/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re his conversation with defense counsel re discovery; read email re same.	0.30	
10/07/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re discovery dispute, draft and circulate summary re same; conference with co-counsel re Palm subpoena; research and revise joint discovery report.	7.20	
10/07/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Read D. Harvey's email re call with defendants; confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.10	
10/07/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Cite check discovery dispute joint report 1 and run a Shephard's report for D. Harvey.	2.50	
10/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint discovery report.	2.20	
10/09/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint discovery report, conference with team re same, serve draft of same to defendants; draft and serve letter re discovery issues to defendants.	2.50	
10/10/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit discovery letter to defendants.	0.20	
10/10/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re Case Management Conference statement.	0.80	
10/10/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise letter to defendants re Rule 26 conference; research and draft joint Case Management Conference statement, conference with B. Glackin re same; research outstanding discovery issues; research arguments re motions to dismiss.	8.50	
10/10/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review joint discovery report; Rule 26 conference letter.	0.20	
10/10/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents to defense counsels for D. Harvey and A. Shaver. Correct a defense counsel's email address from the contact list.	0.20	_
10/10/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare scheduling orders for D. Harvey's review.	0.40	
10/11/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference; conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, K. Lehe re discovery and case schedule.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/11/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re Case Management Conference statement.	2.10	
10/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery issues, conference with team re same; revise draft Case Management Conference statement; draft initial disclosures.	6.50	
10/11/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting.	1.60	
10/11/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Team conference re Case Management Conference statement and schedule; review D. Harvey's draft of same; read emails from J. Saveri and D. Harvey re same and subpoenas.	0.90	
10/12/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re Case Management Conference statement; edit; read defendants' edits to discovery dispute joint report.	1.50	
10/12/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise joint discovery report, conference with defense counsel re same, conference with J. Saveri re same; revise Rule 26 report, conference with E. Fastiff re same, circulate draft of same; review research re Freedom of Information Act venue.	9.50	
10/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on Judge Reggie Walton's Freedom of Information Act cases; confer with D. Harvey re scheduling, Freedom of Information Act suit; review joint discovery report.	1.70	
10/12/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Confirm notes on scheduling order for D. Harvey; emails re initial disclosures.	0.10	
10/12/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search and gather parties' contact information for the initial disclosure.	0.80	
10/13/11	CARNAM, TODD	Search for Chief Executive Officers during the relevant time periods for all companies named in complaint.	1.60	
10/13/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference statement; conference with J. Saveri, et al re same.	1.80	
10/13/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft Case Management Conference statement; conference with E. Fastiff re same.	1.50	
10/13/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Colligan; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
10/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re discovery issues; conference with B. Glackin re Ed Colligan and subpoenas; research and draft initial disclosures, supervise research re same; revise and e-file joint discovery report; research expert issues.	7.00	
10/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Case Management Conference statement and joint discovery report.	0.20	
10/13/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey and J. Saveri re Electronically Stored Information meetings; email correspondence with defendants re same; emails with team re FOIA issues; review D. Harvey's Case Management Conference statement; emails with D. Harvey re initial disclosures and look at past cases for standards.	1.80	
10/13/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare a cover letter and chamber's courtesy copies to Judge Lucy Koh. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Edit and add contact information to plaintiffs' initial disclosure.	1.20	
10/14/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' motions to dismiss (2) and motion to stay.	1.50	
10/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise initial disclosures, conference with J. Saveri re same; conference with team re electronically stored information issues; research tasks; review motions to dismiss; review motion to stay.	6.50	
10/14/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team conference call; follow up emails.	0.50	
10/14/11	RUIZ, ALAN	For D. Harvey and B. Glackin review and organize into binders yesterday's motions to dismiss, discovery report, and motion for a temporary stay of discovery. Distribute and organize on P:/ drive electronic case filings.	1.70	
10/14/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with team re employee data; conference call with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re same; emails with defendants re scheduling Electronically Stored Information conference; review draft task list; emails with team re initial disclosures.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/14/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Team conference call re data needs; review letter by K. Lehe re same; conference call with D. Harvey and expert re narrowing data requests; prepare for Electronically Stored Information conferences with defendants.	2.20	
10/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read and respond to team emails re draft task list, data requests, electronically stored information.	0.20	
10/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise subpoena to Hewlett-Packard; draft, revise, and serve initial disclosures, draft and serve letter to defendants re same; conference with plaintiffs re initial disclosures; draft and circulate task list.	8.50	
10/17/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letter to defendants re database electronically stored information; review requests for production and 30(b)(6) notices for same; call with D. Harvey re same.	4.20	
10/17/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Research California law on employee file access; draft letters to plaintiffs' employers counsel re same; review K. Lehe letter re data and email notes.	0.50	
10/17/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing documents to iManage. Update class member chart with new contact information.	0.40	
10/18/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Finalize Freedom of Information Act Complaint and supporting documents; read defendants' additions to Case Management Conference statement; edit data letter; read Judge Koh's Rule 12 Order in Apple/Samsung case.	1.80	
10/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise Freedom of Information Act complaint; revise subpoena to Hewlett-Packard; research potential testifying experts; conference with attorneys for Hewlett-Packard; serve subpoena on defendants; review letters re personnel information of plaintiffs; revise administrative motion.	8.50	
10/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to data request letter to defense, Freedom of Information Act complaint, summons and civil cover sheet, team emails re same; draft administrative motion to consider whether cases should be related, supporting declaration, proposed order, notice of pendency of related action; legal research as needed for same; draft letter to defense re stipulation to relate cases.	8.50	
10/18/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with team re data letter; draft letters to defendants re personnel files and incorporate edits to same; emails with defendants and D. Harvey re Electronically Stored Information conference scheduling.	1.70	
10/18/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare civil cover sheet and summons for complaint filing. Prepare letter templates for A. Shaver. Prepare proof of service regarding subpoena for document production to Hewlett-Packard Company. Communicate with Spin Cycle to navigate the filing of complaint and other related papers. Communicate with K. Lehe regarding complaint filing preparation. Scan conformed copies of complaint and other related papers and organize them to P:/ drive and iManage. Email attorney re same.	4.50	
10/18/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review local rules re filing complaint.	0.30	
10/19/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research serving Freedom of Information Act complaint on Department of Justice and US Attorney; read response to defendants' Case Management Conference edits.	0.50	
10/19/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise Case Management Conference statement.	2.50	
10/19/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Emily Henn re Pixar.	0.30	
10/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise joint Case Management Conference statement, conference with team re same, correspond with defendants re same; conference with Adobe counsel re electronically stored information issues; supervise service of Hewlett-Packard subpoena.	9.50	
10/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to data letter to defense counsel; handle service of Freedom of Information Act complaint; email with S. Shin, LCHB team; draft letters to Department of Justice, defense counsel re Freedom of Information Act case; email complaint to Judge; emails with S. Shin, E. Fastiff.	3.40	
10/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Electronically stored information conference with Adobe counsel Jones Day; call with D. Harvey, A. Shaver to prepare.	1.80	
10/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Opposition to motion to stay.	1.00	
10/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team emails re class certification brief.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team emails re data letter to defense, administrative motion to relate cases, Case Management Conference statement; brief legal research for same.	0.30	
10/19/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey and K. Lehe to prepare for meeting; conference with same and counsel for Adobe and Intuit re Electronically Stored Information; emails with team re FOIA lawsuit and re Case Management Conference statement; edit same; oversee e-filing of Case Management Conference statement.	3.10	
10/19/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Research defendants' address to serve summons and complaint. Communicate with receptions of the Department of Justice, the United States Attorney General and the United States Attorney for the Northern District of California. Prepare copies of summons, complaint and other related papers to serve the defendants. Prepare certificate of service for summons, complaint, and other related papers. Review all defendants' motions for cited cases and create a list of the cites cases. Run Lexis brief check to pull cited cases.	7.00	
10/19/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Research local rules re docket initiation.	0.50	
10/20/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise, file amended Case Management Conference statement; telephone conference with Emily Henn.	0.60	
10/20/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel to and from Redwood Shores for Pixar electronically stored information conference; attend Pixar electronically stored information conference; attend Intel electronically stored information conference; research opposition to the motion to dismiss.	6.50	
10/20/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Opposition to motion to stay; review Case Management Conference statement, discovery dispute report, other filings for same; legal research.	5.10	
10/20/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Intel and D. Harvey re electronically stored information; conference with Pixar and D. Harvey re electronically stored information; draft electronically stored information follow-up letter.	6.50	
10/20/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Search and organize cases that defendants cited as Westlaw cases. Prepare binders for the cases cited by the defendants. Communicate with court clerks regarding court docket setup and electronic court filing. Organize correspondence to iManage.	5.20	
10/21/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re briefs.	0.60	
10/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft letter to Pixar's counsel re electronically stored information conference; research opposition to motion to dismiss; conference with team re responses to motions to dismiss and motion to stay; conference with K. Lehe re opposition to motion to stay.	6.50	
10/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Opposition to motion to stay; review Case Management Conference statement, discovery dispute report, other filings for same; legal research.	6.20	
10/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting re motion to dismiss, motion to stay; meeting with D. Harvey re same.	0.70	
10/21/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with court docket clerk regarding docket creation for the newly filed complaint. Email K. Lehe regarding the certificate of service for the complaint and summons. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare cover letter and chamber's copies for the e-filed certificate of service.	1.00	
10/22/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Opposition to motion to stay.	6.00	
10/23/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft follow-up letter to Intel re Electronically Stored Information conference.	1.10	
10/24/11	CARNAM, TODD	Search through several very large dockets looking for court orders permitting discovery despite pending motion to dismiss.	4.30	
10/24/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re motions to dismiss, electronically stored information conferences.	0.70	
10/24/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review motions to dismiss memorandum re antitrust inquiry.	1.10	
10/24/11	HARVEY, DEAN	In-person conference with Lucasfilm counsel re electronically stored information issues, prepare for same; research opposition to motion to dismiss, conference with B. Glackin re same; review defendants' initial disclosures; revise and serve letter re Pixar's electronically stored information.	8.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/24/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft opposition to motion to stay; legal research for same.	9.60	
10/24/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Electronically stored information conference with Lucasfilm counsel; follow-up meeting with D. Harvey.	1.40	
10/24/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review Rule 26 disclosure; review and revise electronically stored information letter to defendants.	1.30	
10/24/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review J. Saveri's comments to electronically stored information letter; edit Intel electronically stored information letter and recirculate.	0.40	
10/24/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery orders re pending motions to dismiss for K. Lehe.	0.70	
10/25/11	CARNAM, TODD	Finish reviewing dockets of three separate cases looking for court orders permitting discovery to proceed prior to a decision on a motion to dismiss, per request from K. Lehe.	3.20	
10/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review initial disclosures; prepare for Case Management Conference, conference with J. Saveri re same; research opposition to motion to dismiss.	7.90	
10/25/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft opposition to motion to stay; legal research for same.	8.90	
10/25/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review disclosures; review expert stipulation; prepare for hearing.	4.50	
10/25/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize emails and attached documents to iManage and P:/ drive. Prepare binder for 10/26/2011 Case Management hearing for J. Saveri and D. Harvey. Save electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	1.60	
10/25/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case dockets re discovery orders and motions to dismiss briefing.	2.80	
10/26/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Attend, return from Case Management Conference.	5.50	
10/26/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re Case Management Conference.	0.70	
10/26/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Case Management Conference, travel to San Jose for same, attend same, conference with J. Saveri and team re same; research opposition to motion to dismiss.	8.50	
10/26/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Case Management Conference, and travel.	5.30	
10/26/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft declaration; edit and proofread brief; confer with D. Harvey.	0.90	
10/26/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Electronically stored information letter to Lucasfilm.	2.60	
10/26/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for Case Management Conference.	0.60	
10/26/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Prepare for and attend hearing; hearing; case management; review and revise Freedom of Information Act stipulation.	2.50	
10/26/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare documents for the hearing for D. Harvey, J. Saveri, and K. Lehe.	0.20	
10/27/11	CARNAM, TODD	Research Department of Justice's Antitrust Division's policy on Records retention in/re investigations.	3.30	
10/27/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit stipulation letter re discovery Freedom of Information Act case.	0.30	
10/27/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re expert schedule.	0.50	
10/27/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum re Freedom of Information Act case.	0.40	
10/27/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise stipulation re Freedom of Information Act case.	0.30	
10/27/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research opposition to motion to dismiss; draft correspondence re Department of Justice production; conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re case management and electronically stored information vendor; conference with co-counsel re case strategy and class certification experts; conference with potential experts.	8.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/27/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to United States Attorney re Freedom of Information Act case dismissal; prepare for same; review suit and correspondence to Department of Justice, emails from team; follow-up emails with team re next steps; email Research Department with research request for Department of Justice records retention policy.	1.50	
10/27/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft stipulation and cover letter to Department of Justice.	2.80	
10/27/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review research on Section 16600 claim; email with D. Harvey.	0.20	
10/27/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Order transcript of yesterday's Case Management Conference. For D. Harvey, serve via mail his letter to all defendants regarding our request for production.	0.80	
10/27/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise Freedom of Information Act stipulation; review order.	1.00	
10/28/11	CARNAM, TODD	Finish research into whether the Department of Justice has a records retention policy for information its agencies gather in the course of an investigation, then report back to K. Lehe.	4.00	
10/28/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Case Management Conference Order; read Rule 12 motions.	2.00	
10/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, conference with B. Glackin and J. Saveri re same; research 16600 and 17200 claims; research opposition to joint motion to dismiss; review and revise letters re defendants' electronically stored information; review minute order re Case Management Conference.	6.50	
10/28/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft follow up letters to counsel for Lucasfilm, Adobe, Intuit after conferences; email with co-counsel re research on 16600 claim.	4.60	
10/28/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Organize correspondence to the P:/ drive and iManage. Distribute and store on P:/ drive and iManage electronic case filings.	0.40	
10/28/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise electronically stored information letter; telephone conference with press; review website.	0.80	
10/29/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to defendants' motion to dismiss.	9.10	
10/30/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	8.50	
10/31/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Steve Jobs' evidentiary memorandum/team meeting re Rule 12 motion.	0.50	
10/31/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting.	0.50	
10/31/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with	0.50	
10/31/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise opposition to motion to dismiss, conference with team re same; conference with potential economic experts.	13.20	
10/31/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Team meeting; organize discovery; telephone conference with	1.50	
10/31/11	SHAVER, ANNE	Review article and team emails re 16600 claims.	0.20	
10/31/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Attend meeting with attorney regarding status; plan for upcoming filings.	0.70	
11/01/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for pleadings for United States v. Association of Family Practice Residency Doctors, No. 96-575-CV-W-2 (Western District of Missouri) re analagous wage suppression antitrust prosecution.	0.50	
11/01/11	CARNAM, TODD	Search for name and contact information of General Counsel of Facebook for D. Harvey.	1.00	
11/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to defendants' joint motion to dismiss, conference with J. Saveri re same.	7.30	
11/01/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research corporate structure of Lucasfilm Limited, for D. Harvey.	0.50	
11/01/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research locations of Lucasfilm and subsidiaries from 2004 to present, for D. Harvey.	1.00	
11/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise brief; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin; telephone conference with Eric Cramer; third party discovery.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/01/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize summons, complaint, and defendants' initial disclosures for Records. Organize research documents in P:/ drive for D. Harvey.	0.20	
11/02/11	CARNAM, TODD	Follow-up research re records retention policies at Department of Justice.	2.40	
11/02/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition; conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey, B. Glackin re brief.	2.80	
11/02/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with team re opposition to motion to dismiss; revise motion to dismiss,	4.40	
11/02/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft motion to dismiss; conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re same; draft withdrawal of claim for injunctive relief.	3.30	
11/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and research opposition to motion to dismiss; conference with Apple's counsel re electronically stored information issues.	7.50	
11/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Email from United States Attorney re Freedom of Information Act case; research on Department of Justice document retention policy; email to team.	1.30	
11/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with Apple counsel re electronically stored information; follow-up letter to counsel.	1.70	
11/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team emails as needed.	0.50	
11/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with D. Harvey; review withdrawal of prayer for injunctive relief; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Freedom of Information Act case; review and revise oppositions to motion to dismiss.	6.80	
11/03/11	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for complaint in related matter.	0.60	
11/03/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise opposition brief.	3.40	
11/03/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri, E. Fastiff re brief; file notice of withdrawal.	0.80	
11/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise motion to dismiss oppositions, conference with team re same; review and revise filings re Freedom of Information Act case and injunctive relief claim.	11.50	
11/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft notice of dismissal; letter to defense counsel; review local rules and general orders for same; team emails re same; confer with defendant; e-file.	2.50	
11/03/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research main work place of George Lucas, for D. Harvey.	0.50	
11/03/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise opposition to motion to dismiss; conference with. B. Glackin, D. Harvey; review and revise dismissal of Freedom of Information Act case; review and revise withdrawal of prayer for injunctive relief.	5.80	
11/03/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare letter and attachment to send out via regular mail to United States Attorney, Claire T. Cormier. Prepare chamber's copies and a cover letter for a notice of voluntary dismissal.	0.80	
11/03/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chamber copies re electronic court filings.	0.80	
11/04/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize, file oppositions to motions to dismiss.	4.50	
11/04/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise opposition to consolidated motion to dismiss, supervise e-filing of same; research, draft, and revise opposition to Lucasfilm's motion to dismiss, supervise e-filing of same.	12.50	
11/04/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letter to Apple counsel following up on conference re discovery.	2.00	
11/04/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Status report to court; team emails re same and edits; e-file.	1.40	
11/04/11	RUIZ, ALAN	For D. Harvey, draft his declaration in support of our oppositions to defendants' joint and Lucasfilm's motions to dismiss, and locate and prepare exhibits thereto. Also for D. Harvey cite check same oppositions.	4.80	
11/04/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery issues; review and revise oppositions to motions to dismiss; Jones Day correspondence.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/04/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re opposition to motion to dismiss.	3.30	
11/07/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re assignments.	0.60	
11/07/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting.	0.70	
11/07/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re discovery issues and case status; research electronically stored information issues; review draft protective order; research potential experts.	4.50	
11/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' edits to protective order.	0.30	
11/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review hearing transcript.	0.10	
11/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting.	0.60	
11/07/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Circulate, arrange payment for, and load to P:/ drive transcript of the Case Management Conference held October 2, 2011.	0.20	
11/07/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Team meeting; review draft protective order; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin.	1.50	
11/07/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare chambers courtesy copies and a cover letter for the oppositions to motion to dismiss.	1.20	
11/08/11	CARNAM, TODD	Research Google's 10% across-the-board pay increase to all employees shortly before CEO Eric Schmidt stepped down.	1.90	
11/08/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri re brief, protective order.	0.50	
11/08/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft protective order with D. Harvey and J. Saveri.	1.50	
11/08/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review revisions to protective order; memorandum re same.	0.50	
11/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research protective order issues, conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re same, correspond with defendants re same.	1.50	
11/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Apple counsel re discovery.	0.40	
11/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Revise requests for production for reference by document hosters; research on document hosting services; confer with B. Glackin, T. Walburg re same.	1.80	
11/08/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review protective order; conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	1.50	
11/08/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery re requests for production for K. Lehe.	0.60	
11/09/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re protective order.	0.30	
11/09/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts; conference with defendants re draft protective order, research and revise same.	2.50	
11/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on document hosting services; confer with D. Hutchinson, K. Dugar, D. Harvey; review correspondence to determine production formats from defendants.	4.90	
11/09/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review In Re TFT-LCD litigation discovery documents re electronically stored information protocol for adaptation here for K. Lehe.	0.60	
11/10/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft adapted electronically stored information specification based on models suggested by B. Glackin; meet with K. Dugar re hosting services; summarize research and send to team.	2.20	
11/10/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on labor market analysis seminar.	0.10	
11/11/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, class certification issues, and document vendor issues.	1.50	
11/11/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with J. Saveri, K. Dugar re document hosting.	0.10	
11/11/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on evidence preservation requirements.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/11/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Palm discovery issues; expert issues; organize discovery.	1.00	
11/14/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review vendor list; calls with K. Lehe; organize meetings with vendors for document review hosting.	3.00	
11/14/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Edward Leamer; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
11/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, correspond with same; conference with Ed Leamer and B. Glackin; research electronically stored information vendors, conference with K. Lehe re same.	2.50	
11/14/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Research on document hosting vendors; calls with D. Harvey, K. Dugar; email and calls with potential vendors and schedule meetings.	2.50	
11/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, correspond with same; conference with potential document vendors.	2.80	
11/15/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review; draft custodian memo.	2.20	
11/15/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with Catalyst; call with ILS (document hosting services); meeting with TERIS re electronically stored information support.	2.30	
11/16/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Prepare for, attend and follow up on ILS document review platform for case with D. Harvey and K. Lehe.	2.00	
11/16/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re experts, document hosting.	0.40	
11/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential testifying economists, draft and circulate memo re same; research potential document vendors, conference with same.	3.80	
11/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with K. Dugar re contract negotiation with potential document hosters; summarize findings and email to team.	0.50	
11/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with ILS document hosting, D. Harvey and K. Dugar.	1.70	
11/16/11	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research treatises discussing judicial ethics regarding connections between judges and expert witnesses, for D. Harvey.	0.60	
11/16/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence received from defense counsel to P:/ drive. Search for motions that led to order denying plaintiff's motion for protective order in Apple Inc. v. Samsung.	0.50	
11/17/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with potential experts; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
11/17/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert; revise draft protective order and provide to defendants' counsel.	3.60	
11/17/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with Evolve document hosting re electronically stored information support.	1.00	
11/17/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Expert issues.	0.60	
11/18/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential testifying economists, research same; conference with potential document vendors, conference with K. Lehe and K. Dugar re same, research same.	5.50	
11/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with Epiq discovery re electronically stored information support.	1.20	
11/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with K. Dugar, D. Harvey re document hosting selection.	1.00	
11/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet with ILS for document review demo.	1.00	
11/21/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Manage litigation vendor bids. Meeting with K. Lehe and D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
11/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential document vendors, conference with K. Lehe and K. Dugar re same; correspond with Hewelett-Packard counsel re subpoena; conference with potential expert and B. Glackin.	2.50	
11/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review letter from Department of Justice; check statutory citations to confirm their claims; email team.	0.40	
11/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Test iConect for document hoster selecting; confer with D. Harvey; meeting with K. Dugar.	1.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/21/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review Department of Justice letter re FOIA case; telephone conference with K. Lehe.	0.50	
11/21/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize and save correspondence received from Department of Justice for K. Lehe. Search the docket of Behrend v. Comcast, et al., for the documents related to class certification and create a list.	0.80	
11/22/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review revised submissions for electronically stored information hosting from vendors; prepare comparative charts; conference call with K. Lehe and D. Harvey re same.	2.50	
11/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re protective order issues, research and prepare for same; conference with K. Lehe and K. Dugar re document vendor issues; conference with counsel for Hewlett-Packard re subpoena.	3.20	
11/22/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re document hosters; call with K. Dugar re final cost comparison; summary email to team.	1.10	
11/23/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, draft letter re Hewlett-Packard subpoena; conference with J. Saveri re case status; research document review strategy.	1.80	
11/23/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Email with document hosting vendor representatives re proposed contract terms, K. Dugar, D. Harvey and team; review statements of work/contracts.	1.00	
11/23/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Refine document hosting vendor cost comparison and email team.	0.30	
11/25/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft protective order; revise and serve letter re Hewlett-Packard subpoena; research class certification issues, review recent Third Circuit authority; research potential expert.	4.50	
11/28/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Emails from K. Lehe and vendors re hosting solution.	1.00	
11/28/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read letters re Hewlett Packard subpoena.	0.20	
11/28/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with re expert issues.	3.00	
11/28/11	HARVEY, DEAN	In-person conference with potential expert travel re same, conference with B. Glackin re same; review and revise draft protective order; conference with K. Lehe re document vendor.	3.50	
11/28/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review and edit draft stipulated protective order and draft expert stipulation; review relevant local rules regarding same.	0.70	
11/28/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review updated contract from TERIS requesting revision of same, cost-comparison; email exchange with TERIS staff and LCHB team re contract terms, users, scheduling project design meeting; email with co-counsel Shelly Friedland.	1.40	
11/28/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise protective order; review web hosting issues.	1.50	
11/28/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize emails and letters exchanged by plaintiffs' and defendants' counsels in to P:/ drive and iManage.	0.30	
11/29/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize protective order.	2.20	
11/29/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise protective order, conference with defendants re same; conference with Hewlett-Packard's counsel re subpoena, draft letter re same.	2.50	
11/29/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with team, K. Dugar re TERIS contract; email with vendors; confer with B. Glackin; contract negotiations with vendors; review contract with Autonomy for comparison.	1.90	
11/30/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize protective order, TERIS contract; telephone conference with David Kiernan, Michael Tubach re same.	1.50	
11/30/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: File preparation and load documents into electronic discovery database.	5.00	
11/30/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re protective order, revise same, serve and file same; serve letter to Hewlett-Packard re subpoena; review defendants' discovery responses; conference with class members; research whistleblower protections.	6.50	
11/30/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with team, K. Dugar re TERIS contract; contract negotiations with TERIS.	0.70	
11/30/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read filings, complaint, Executive Committee memo, Competitive Impact Statement (CIS) in preparation for document review.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/30/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' objections and correspondence re document production.	0.30	
11/30/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise protective order; telephone conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey; review productions; telephone conference with D. Harvey.	1.90	
12/01/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation support: Follow up on loading of data, creation of database and assigning team; meetings with Litigation Support staff re same.	3.00	
12/01/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with potential expert econometrician conference with D. Harvey, K. Lehe re document review plan.	1.10	
12/01/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential testifying expert supervise uploading of documents.; review defendants' productions, draft summaries re same;	5.50	
12/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Conference call with potential expert ; review information re same .	0.80	
12/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meetings with B. Glackin, D. Harvey to plan for document review.	0.60	
12/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' production.	2.10	
12/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Judge Lucy Koh's standing orders.	0.10	
12/01/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Summation meeting for document review.	1.00	
12/01/11	RUIZ, ALAN	With D. Harvey, K. Lehe, K. Dugar, K. Rayhill, C. Yamat, and S. Shin, attend meeting re Summation document management and database of defendants' latest productions.	0.80	
12/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/01/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review standing order.	0.30	
12/01/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Attend meeting regarding Summation and documents produced by the defendants. Organize discovery and correspondence papers to P:/ drive and iManage.	2.00	
12/01/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Create Summation database for new documents. Load new documents into Summation database.	2.50	
12/02/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation support: Review document loads; check database; follow up with D. Harvey and K. Lehe; test and Quality Control loads.	3.00	
12/02/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re experts.	0.30	
12/02/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re discovery, experts.	0.70	
12/02/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Preparation of file and load electronic discovery production into database.	4.00	
12/02/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re strategy; review Lucasfilm's reply brief; review Department of Justice production; conference with potential testifying expert; draft retention agreement.	6.50	
12/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' objections and responses in preparation for meet and confer; create spreadsheet of same.	2.90	
12/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' production; Summation meeteing with M. Mugrage.	1.30	
12/02/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting.	0.70	
12/02/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Assist new database users with document access.	0.80	
12/02/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: load document production to database.	1.30	
12/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Confer with D. Harvey; team meeting.	1.00	
12/02/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/02/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: load new documents into Summation database.	3.00	
12/03/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' Department of Justice productions.	3.50	
12/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Read defendants' reply briefs in support of motion to dismiss.	0.70	
12/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' objections and responses in preparation for meet and confer; create spreadsheet of same.	2.40	
12/03/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' production.	0.10	
12/05/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on quality check of loads from productions; email from K. Lehe re analysis of production; follow up re same.	2.00	
12/05/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Assist with preparation and conversion of files for loading into electronic document database.	3.00	
12/05/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery issues; conference with Intel's counsel re database issues; conference with B. Glackin and E. Fastiff re potential expert; review discovery responses and conference with K. Lehe re same.	5.50	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Correspondence to defendants to schedule and meet and confer re production; confer with Litigation Support re numerous issues involving production; process and analysis of same.	0.50	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letter to Advanced Micro Devices re evidence preservation; litigation hold.	0.30	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet with Intel counsel; confer with D. Harvey re follow up.	1.10	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' objections and responses in preparation for meet and confer; create spreadsheet of same; review correspondence from and to Intel counsel in preparation for meeting with Intel counsel.	3.80	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' production; team emails and instructions re same.	0.20	
12/05/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review documents from Intel in preparation for meeting with counsel.	0.20	
12/05/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create index of document productions.	0.70	
12/05/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Review court orders for upcoming hearing schedules. Organize discovery documents to P:/ drive and iManage for K. Lehe.	0.70	
12/06/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Calls to and from D. Harvey re next steps and document project; calls to and from vendors re quotes; meeting with vendor re format and delivery of documents; set project guidelines; further calls from D. Harvey and email for K. Lehe re same.	2.00	
12/06/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re discovery issues.	0.40	1
12/06/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Facebook counsel re evidence preservation; conference with team re discovery plan, research same; review and revise letter to Advanced Micro Devices.	3.50	
12/06/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with Intel counsel Zach Alinder re production format; review production in Summation for same.	0.40	
12/06/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with Litigation Support, K. Dugar, S. Shin re production issues; review prior to meet and confer; review production in Summation.	1.50	
12/06/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Evidence preservation/litigation hold letter to Advanced Micro Devices; review template letters and Intel production re Advanced Micro Devices; look up General Counsel contact information; emails with team; edits.	2.20	
12/06/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: load electronic documents into database and duplicate original disks.	1.60	
12/06/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for the agent for service of process and the general counsel for Advanced Micro Devices for K. Lehe. Communicate with K. Lehe, D. Harvey, and K. Dugar regarding defendants' produced documents. Prepare letters to defense counsel for K. Lehe and send them via regular mail. Meet with K. Dugar regarding document review.	2.80	
12/07/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Calls to and from vendor re Department of Justice documents; calls and emails to and from D. Harvey re same.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with Intel counsel re format of production; email D. Harvey re scheduling meet and confer.	0.30	
12/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Finalize discovery letter to Advanced Micro Devices; review information on Advanced Micro Devices website re antitrust settlements.	0.40	
12/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' objections and responses to requests for production; email opposing counsel; confer with D. Harvey.	0.60	
12/07/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Schedule meet and confer conferences with defendants.	0.30	
12/07/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: duplicate and label data disks.	0.40	
12/07/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Review and revise Advanced Micro Devices document preservation letter; case organization; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, K. Lehe.	0.70	
12/07/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Review CaseMap with K. Rayhill. Organize emails exchanged with defense counsel.	1.60	
12/07/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: load documents into Summation database. Extract media files to be copied over to our local network.	2.50	
12/08/11	DUGAR, KIRTI	Prepare Department of Justice documents and setting up of war room for document review.	1.00	
12/08/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Analysis of production in preparation of loading.	3.00	
12/08/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Department of Justice production, conference with team re same; research and draft coding outline; conference with Intel's counsel re Department of Justice productions.	6.50	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Investigate sources re finding, analyzing and using labor market data.	2.30	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with D. Harvey re meet and confers with defendants; confer with co-counsel to schedule same.	0.70	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for meet and confer conference with Apple; review production.	0.70	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for meet and confer conference with Intel.	0.60	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review template discovery meet and confer letters.	0.30	
12/08/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Schedule meet and confer conference with defendants; confer with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re same; meet and confer call with Intel counsel; follow-up letter to Intel counsel.	2.00	
12/08/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/08/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Organize document review; telephone conference with co-counsel.	0.70	
12/09/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conduct conference re discovery issues with co-counsel; supervise preparation for document review, research same; review and revise letters to co-counsel.	3.50	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Intuit counsel.	0.40	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer calls with counsel for Intuit, Adobe; preparation for same.	2.10	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer letter to Adobe counsel.	0.70	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer letter to Intel counsel; review protective order for same.	0.60	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for meet and confer with Lucasfilm re requests 1-7.	0.40	
12/09/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team conference call to plan discovery, document review.	0.50	
12/09/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/09/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Scan documents for K. Lehe. Organize documents - divide them into red wells for document review.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/11/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Conference with D. Harvey re document review.	0.30	
12/12/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise document review of Department of Justice production; confer with co-counsel re document review; review Department of Justice production.	3.50	
12/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review.	7.00	
12/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for meet and confer with Google counsel re first set of requests for production; call to counsel.	0.80	
12/12/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare for meet and confer with Lucasfilm counsel re first set of requests for production; schedule same; confer with D. Harvey.	0.80	
12/12/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/12/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare red wells for the document review. Organize documents by dividing and labeling them. Setup CaseMap and enter information into the database. Communicate with K. Rayhill regarding the CaseMap. Prepare a letter to mail out for K. Lehe. Organize correspondence to P:/ drive and iManage.	4.80	
12/12/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database. Provide review acces support to users of Summation program.	2.50	
12/13/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Department of Justice production, supervise same; conference with expert; conference with co-counsel re retaining expert; retain expert.	6.50	
12/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review.	7.00	
12/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Apple counsel; prepare for same.	1.20	
12/13/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Pixar counsel; prepare for same.	1.30	
12/13/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Expert issues.	0.80	
12/13/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize Intel Corp.'s documents. Enter attorneys' notes into CaseMap. Search for characters that appear on the documents.	2.80	
12/14/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Department of Justice production, supervise same.	2.50	
12/14/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review.	6.00	
12/14/11	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Meet to discuss incoming production protocol and assist with review of hard drive.	1.40	
12/14/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Monitor document review; review documents; expert issues; confer with D. Harvey.	1.70	
12/14/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters.	6.80	
12/15/11	CARNAM, TODD	Research and assemble for D. Harvey "best place to work" lists, particularly lists specific to the technological sector, digital animation studios, gaming companies, and retail management.	3.50	
12/15/11	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re discovery, case assignments.	0.40	
12/15/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise document review; conference with team re next steps; research Google production issues; review and revise CaseMap summary.	2.50	
12/15/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/15/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters.	4.70	
12/15/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Provide access support to users of Summation program. Load new documents into Summation database.	2.00	
12/16/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise document review; review Department of Justice documents; conference with Google's counsel re production issues, research same.	7.50	
12/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Google counsel, preparing for same.	1.00	
12/16/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Lucasfilm counsel, prepare for same.	0.40	
12/16/11	RUIZ, ALAN	With B. Troxel, meet with S. Shin to discuss project of coding defendants' recent production documents in CaseMap.	0.20	
12/16/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters. Meeting with B. Troxel and A. Ruiz for CaseMap and document review. Organize correspondence received from defendants to P:/ drive and iManage.	6.70	
12/16/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meeting re coding procedures for defendants' production.	0.40	
12/18/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letters to defendants following up on discovery meet and confer conferences.	3.50	
12/19/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise document review, conference with team re same; review and revise letters to defendants re Department of Justice production; draft letter re Pixar document retention, conference with Pixar's counsel re same.	7.50	
12/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Document review.	2.10	
12/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to meet and confer follow up letters to defendants.	0.20	
12/19/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Search for Lucasfilm responses to Department of Justice interrogatories. Confer with D. Harvey re case plan.	0.40	
12/19/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Lucasfilm production for review.	0.40	
12/19/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	
12/19/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: transfer documents to CD. Load new documents into Summation database.	1.50	
12/20/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise document review; review and revise letters to defendants' counsel re discovery conferences; research, draft, and revise letters re confidentiality challenges; meeting with B. Troxel and A. Ruiz re confidentiality challenges.	6.50	
12/20/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to letters to defense counsel following up on production meet and confer; call to Advanced Micro Devices attorney Elizabeth Ozmun re subpoena; review confidentiality challenges.	1.30	
12/20/11	RUIZ, ALAN	Organize correspondence and new discovery in P:/ drive and iManage. Organize K. Lehe, save in P:/ drive and iManage, make labels for, and mail her letters to various defendants memorializing recent meet and confers. For D. Harvey, provide copies of stipulated protective order to document reviewers. With B. Troxel, discuss with D. Harvey and begin indexing certain of defendants' production documents whose confidentiality designations will be challenged.	2.70	
12/20/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/20/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meeting re confidentiality challenges with D. Harvey and A. Ruiz.	0.50	
12/20/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders re confidentiality for D. Harvey's review.	0.40	
12/20/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review bilateral agreement research and organize to file.	0.10	
12/20/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defendants' production and prepare for coding.	0.50	
12/21/11	CARNAM, TODD	Research into who are the general counsels, and mailing and email addresses of those general counsels, of two dozen possible defendants.	4.00	
12/21/11	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri and D. Harvey re settlement demand letter.	0.20	
12/21/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re settlement demand and confidentiality designations, research and revise letters to defendants re same; research other discovery issues, including third party preservation.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call and letter to Lucasfilm counsel re missing responses to Department of Justice's interrogatories; confer with Research and D. Harvey re third party companies for litigation hold letters; email with Google counsel re Rule 26(f) conference.	1.00	
12/21/11	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review letter from Pixar counsel, email summary to team.	0.60	
12/21/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/21/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Adobe documents for D. Harvey's review.	0.40	
12/21/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and organize in file.	0.20	
12/21/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and organize in file.	0.20	
12/22/11	CARNAM, TODD	Finish research into who are the general counsels, and mailing and email addresses of those general counsels, of two dozen possible defendants.	5.80	
12/22/11	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and serve letter to Adobe re confidentiality, research and review letters to other defendants re same, conference with J. Saveri re same.	3.00	
12/22/11	RUIZ, ALAN	For K. Lehe, finalize her letter to Lucasfilm's counsel. Organize correspondence to the P:/ drive and iManage.	0.30	
12/22/11	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
12/27/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents regarding defendants' produced documents in P:/ drive and iManage. Prepare letters and enclosures to defense counsels regarding confidentiality for D. Harvey.	1.00	
12/28/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with electronic discovery processing.	4.00	
12/28/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with D. Harvey regarding document review. Research characters online and Lexis to input their job history in the database.	0.40	
12/28/11	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and organize file.	0.20	
12/28/11	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database.	2.50	
12/29/11	GRANT, ANTHONY	Load electronic discovery production into Summation database.	4.00	
12/29/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Research job history for the characters and enter the information into the database.	6.00	
12/30/11	SHIN, STEVEN	Communicate with D. Harvey regarding Intel Corp.'s documents. Further search job history for the characters and enter the information into the database.	1.20	
01/03/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Group meeting re scheduling and strategy; edit documents.	0.70	
01/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey; team meeting.	0.90	
01/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery strategy, conference with team re same; research privilege log issues; research Case Management Conference requirements, conference with K. Lehe re same; conference with Pixar counsel re electronically stored information protocol.	3.50	
01/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to Intel counsel re electronically stored information protocol; review draft of same.	0.20	
01/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re division of tasks prior to hearing.	0.10	
01/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' privilege logs and correspondence re same; confer with S. Shin and D. Harvey re productions; email to co-counsel.	1.30	
01/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review local rules and standing orders for requirements of Case Management Conference statement.	0.50	
01/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team planning meeting; review hearing transcript from Oct. 26, 2011 in preparation for same; meeting with D. Harvey.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/03/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/03/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize letters to defense counsel for D. Harvey. Continue to research job history for the characters and enter the information into the database.	4.80	
01/04/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit meet and confer letters to defense counsel.	0.40	
01/04/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review documents.	0.80	
01/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review document production issues; draft letters re confidentiality; supervise evidence summaries, etc; review draft Case Management Conference statement.	4.50	
01/04/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft Case Management Conference Statement; review document productions, correspondence, filings, privilege logs for same.	4.80	
01/04/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letters to third parties re document retention; review information from Research on each third party; coordinate with Word Processing, D. Harvey, S. Shin re third party letters.	0.90	
01/04/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Adobe privilege log; confer with team and co-counsel re privilege log review; coordinate privilege log review printout and distribution with Litigation Support, co-counsel.	0.90	
01/04/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize defendants' privilege logs and its corresponding letters in P:/ drive and iManage. Review Adobe Systems Inc.'s and Apple Inc.'s produced documents for any memoranda, civil investigation demands, and interrogatories. Organize documents and enter information into the database. Prepare an Excel spreadsheet containing defendants' document production and privilege log dates for K. Lehe.	6.50	
01/04/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	2.40	
01/04/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database.	3.00	
01/05/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit and read discovery letters.	0.40	
01/05/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Preparation and conversion of documents for loading into electronic discovery database.	3.00	
01/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Google counsel; revise and serve letters to Intuit, Pixar, and Lucasfilm re confidentiality designations; review and revise document hold letters to third parties; research Case Management Conference statement.	6.50	
01/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Coordinate with co-counsel, Litigation Support on privilege log document review.	0.20	
01/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to document retention letters to 21 third parties.	0.50	
01/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review letters challenging defendants' confidentiality designations, and attached documents.	0.30	
01/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Rule 26(f) conference with Google counsel; prepare for same; legal research for same.	3.60	
01/05/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Compile privilege logs from multiple defendants and organize documents for review.	1.30	
01/05/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/05/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further review defendants' produced documents for any memoranda, civil investigation demands, and interrogatories. Organize documents and enter information into the database. Prepare letters and attachments to defense counsel regarding confidentiality for D. Harvey.	5.50	
01/05/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	3.00	
01/05/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Provide litigation support for users of CaseMap program. Load new documents into Summation database.	3.00	
01/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research status conference statement; review defendants' Department of Justice productions.	3.50	
01/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Locate United States affiliates for Vivendi, WPP (third parties) for document retention letter.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/06/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/06/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further review defendants' produced documents for any memoranda, civil investigation demands, and interrogatories.	0.80	
01/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft status conference statement; review defendants' documents.	4.50	
01/09/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Preparation and conversion of electronic discovery production for loading into database.	4.00	
01/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft status conference statement.	3.50	
01/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review privilege log documents; confer with Litigation Support re same; confer with S. Shin, D. Harvey to coordinate with co-counsel firms.	1.10	
01/09/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update service list with defense counsel's new contact information. Search documents from the database for D. Harvey. Prepare defendants' produced documents to send to co-counsel for K. Lehe. Further build CaseMap: search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters.	4.80	
01/09/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	1.00	
01/09/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database.	3.00	
01/10/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, revise Case Management Conference statement.	0.80	
01/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise Case Management Conference statement, conference with B. Glackin and J. Saveri re same; research, draft, and revise settlement demand letter; review defendants' productions of documents.	4.20	
01/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with co-counsel re privilege log review; forward logs.	0.20	
01/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to Case Management Conference statement.	0.60	
01/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review document production, motion to dismiss and opposition thereto for possible inclusion of information.	0.50	
01/10/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Update privilege designations in database.	0.50	
01/10/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Discuss with D. Harvey and begin project of uploading and recording selected Google production documents onto CaseMap.	0.70	
01/10/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/10/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Litigation support: Further build CaseMap: search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters.	5.20	
01/10/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	3.50	
01/11/12	CARNAM, TODD	Find the email address and contact information for Facebook's new General Counsel.	0.40	
01/11/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference statement and settlement letter; conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, K. Lehe re same.	1.00	
01/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting; review/revise Case Management Conference statement.	1.20	
01/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise settlement demand letter; research and revise Case Management Conference statement.	2.50	
01/11/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edit and prepare document retention letters to third parties; coordinate with Word Processing, S. Shin; send letters.	1.50	
01/11/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
01/11/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review settlement demand letter and edits.	0.10	
01/11/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting; meet with D. Harvey separately.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/11/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/11/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Litigation support: Further build CaseMap: search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters. Prepare letters and attachments to non-party companies for K. Lehe.	6.00	
01/11/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	4.00	
01/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement demand letter, conference with J. Saveri and Eric Cramer re same, revise same; review documents; conference with Adobe counsel re confidentiality designations.	4.50	
01/12/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Litigation support: Begin downloading selected production documents from defendant Google from Summation database and converting to PDF for forthcoming uploading and coding onto and in CaseMap.	4.00	
01/12/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/12/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Litigation support: Further build CaseMap: search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code and search for characters. Prepare binders with defendants' produced documents relating to the Department of Justice.	6.50	
01/12/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and log defendants' production.	1.00	
01/13/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read draft Case Management Conference statement for comment on same.	0.40	
01/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise Case Management Conference statement; revise settlement demand letters; conference with Apple's counsel re confidentiality designations, draft letter re same; draft and revise letter re confidentiality challenges to all counsel; research discovery strategy, conference with J. Saveri re same.	5.50	
01/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to Kayak counsel Nicole Lauerbach re third party subpoena.	0.20	
01/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to Case Management Conference statement.	0.30	
01/13/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Litigation support: Finish downloading selected production documents from defendant Google from Summation database and converting to PDF and begin uploading and coding onto and in CaseMap.	4.20	
01/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Litigation support: Further build CaseMap: search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters. Prepare letters to defense counsel for D. Harvey. Organize emails and letters sent to defense counsel in P:/ drive and iManage.	3.80	
01/13/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	2.30	
01/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and draft correspondence to Apple's counsel re confidentiality issues; revise draft Case Management Conference statement; draft correspondence to Google's counsel re production issues.	1.50	
01/17/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' white papers and Apple/Samsung briefs and orders for potential related issues.	2.10	
01/17/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference re confidentiality, Case Management Conference issues.	0.80	
01/17/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting; telephone conference with re possible retention of Econ One.	1.50	
01/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert support staff, conference with B. Glackin and K. Lehe re same; review defendants' correspondence re confidentiality designations, correspond and conference with defendants re same; review defendants' draft electronically stored information protocol.	2.70	
01/17/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with potential expert firm .	1.00	
01/17/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Communications with third parties re litigation hold.	0.10	
01/17/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review privilege log memo; email with co-counsel and D. Harvey to follow-up re review and document coding.	1.00	
01/17/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/17/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare a binder of defendants' white papers submitted to the Department of Justice for co-counsel. Search, print and organize documents cited on the joint Case Management Conference statement for D. Harvey. Prepare Google's supplemental documents for co-counsel. Further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters.	3.50	
01/17/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	2.00	
01/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re confidentiality challenges, research and prepare for same; review and revise draft Case Management Conference statement; conference with J. Saveri and K. Lehe re discovery plan.	5.80	
01/18/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research on requirements for third parties to implement litigation holds.	1.00	
01/18/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review of, edits to Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
01/18/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Litigation support: Continue uploading and coding onto and in CaseMap selected production documents from defendant Google.	3.50	
01/18/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/18/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare a draft of notice of appearance for Joshua Davis. Further build CaseMap - search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters.	6.80	
01/18/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database.	2.50	
01/19/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' edits to Case Management Conference statement for comment on same.	0.30	
01/19/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: preparation and conversion of electronic discovery production for loading into Summation database.	4.00	
01/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint Case Management Conference statement, conference with J. Saveri re same, conference with defense counsel re same; draft motion for sealing order; conference with defense counsel re confidentiality challenges.	7.50	
01/19/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to Kayak, WPP counsel re document retention.	0.90	
01/19/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letter to Google counsel re electronically stored information meet and confer.	0.30	
01/19/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Litigation support: Continue uploading and coding onto and in CaseMap selected production documents from defendant Google.	3.50	
01/19/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/19/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters. Organize correspondence in P:/ drive and iManage. Prepare certificate of service for the joint Case Management Conference statement. Prepare mailing of the joint Case Management Conference statement and certificate of service to the defense counsel. Prepare a cover letter, and chambers and clerk's copies of joint Case Management Conference statement.	6.60	
01/19/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defendants' production.	3.40	
01/19/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load documents into Summation database. Provide technical support to users of Summation database.	2.00	
01/20/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' white papers in Department of Justice case for discovery here.	3.00	
01/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives re case developments; prepare for oral argument on motions to dismiss, conference with J. Saveri re same; review and revise letter to Google counsel; review letter from Apple's counsel.	5.50	
01/20/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Google counsel re meet and confer.	1.70	
01/20/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review documents related to WPP, PLC; email to counsel for same; confer with D. Harvey.	0.40	
01/20/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Litigation support: Finish uploading and coding onto and in CaseMap selected production documents from defendant Google.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/20/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Further build CaseMap - search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters. Update class members status list with new information. Prepare binders for January 26, 2012 hearing of motion to dismiss and subsequent Case Management Conference. Organize documents that were cited in the Case Management Conference statement.	6.30	
01/20/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	
01/20/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research for potential conspiracy within the digital animation industry.	3.50	
01/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for hearing on defendants' motions to dismiss.	2.10	
01/23/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' white papers.	1.80	
01/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for hearing on defendants' motions to dismiss; conference with defendants' counsel re hearing; conference with J. Saveri re hearing.	5.20	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to Turbine counsel re litigation hold request.	0.20	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with counsel for eBay, PayPal re litigation hold request.	0.40	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Coordinate privilege log review with co-counsel; review of same.	0.50	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft template subpoena; draft outline of oral argument on Cal. Bus. & Prof. Code on §16600 claim; confer with co-counsel and D. Harvey.	1.50	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review and sign protective order agreement.	0.10	
01/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review coded Google production; email to team re same; email team with summary of correspondence with third parties re litigation hold; review correspondence from Facebook.	0.60	
01/23/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/23/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search and email documents relating to the 1/26/2012 hearing to D. Harvey. Further update class member list with new information. Scan and organize protective order acknowledgments on P:/ drive. Prepare a binder of documents relating to 1/26/2012 hearing and send to co-counsel. Further build CaseMap - search and load documents, enter attorneys' notes, code, and search for characters.	4.80	
01/23/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and sign protective order.	0.20	
01/23/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research for digital animation market research.	6.50	
01/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for hearing, draft materials re same.	7.50	
01/24/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Hearing preparation; outline argument for Cal. Bus. & Prof. Code Section 16600 claim; legal research for same.	8.60	
01/24/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Google counsel re discovery; email with co-counsel re document review.	0.10	
01/24/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Confirm documents designated as privileged have not been loaded into database.	0.30	
01/24/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Email co-counsel with defendants' white papers that were submitted to the Department of Justice. Prepare acknowledgment of protective order for J. Saveri, E. Fastiff, and B. Glackin to sign. Scan and save acknowledgment of protective order to P:/ drive and notify D. Harvey. Organize correspondence files sent and received from co-counsel on P:/ drive and iManage. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Review documents and further build CaseMap by searching and loading documents, entering attorneys' notes, coding, and searching for characters.	4.00	
01/24/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research for digital animation industry.	6.50	
01/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Case Management Conference and hearing re motions to dismiss and motion to stay, conference with team re same.	11.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/25/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to Advanced Micro Devices, Inc.; document search re same; determine key cases for hearing outline; confer with D. Harvey re same.	1.80	
01/25/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Hearing preparation meeting with co-counsel and internal team.	5.50	
01/25/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Google re electronically stored information.	0.60	
01/25/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate historical Chief Executive Officer information for Intel, Advanced Micro Devices and ATI Technologies, for K. Lehe.	0.80	
01/25/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/25/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search and print case laws for the 1/26/2012 hearing for D. Harvey. Prepare binders for D. Harvey for the 1/26/2012 hearing. Update CaseMap with defendants' supplemental production and information.	3.00	
01/25/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research for digital animation industry.	1.00	
01/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with client; travel and attend Case Management Conference and hearing re motions to dismiss and motion to stay, prepare for same.	9.20	
01/26/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Hearing on motion to dismiss and preparation.	7.90	
01/26/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/26/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further search and organize cases related to antitrust issues and the 1/26/2012 hearing for D. Harvey. Further prepare binders for the key cases and cited documents from Case Management Conference statement. Update CaseMap with information regarding the characters.	3.30	
01/27/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with re potential experts.	0.20	
01/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with defendants re discovery; conference with J. Saveri re same.	1.30	
01/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with co-counsel re privilege review.	0.10	
01/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to Advanced Micro Devices.	1.90	
01/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare to file joint Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
01/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review electronic discovery status; email J. Saveri re same.	0.20	
01/27/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence received from defense counsel to P:/ drive and iManage. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare copies of discovery documents for J. Saveri.	0.80	
01/28/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Media issues.	5.00	
01/29/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research on Rule 12 issues; team emails re same.	2.60	
01/30/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for the Chief Executive Officers of high tech companies form 2001 to 2012.	1.00	
01/30/12	CARNAM, TODD	Research Chief Executive Officers of various companies for the time period of 2001 - present.	1.80	
01/30/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel conference call re discovery and experts and claim dismissal; edit dismissal notice; emails re fact witnesses; read defendants' documents from production.	2.50	
01/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel re discovery planning.	0.90	
01/30/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Compile documents for production to defendant.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise status report; conference with experts; conference with team re discovery strategy; review and revise subpoenas; conference with K. Lehe re document review; conference with Adam Steinfeld re defendants' Department of Justice productions.	5.50	
01/30/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft status report, legal research on same.	0.70	
01/30/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft template third party subpoena; edits to Advanced Medical Device and Palm subpoenas; draft cover letter to defendants re same; legal research on same; confer with Research Department re executives of 21 third parties; call with potential class member confer with team re same; e-file status report.	5.10	
01/30/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team conference call; confer with D. Harvey re assignments.	1.50	
01/30/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/30/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search and organize discovery documents for D. Harvey. Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage. Prepare a binder of defendants' white papers submitted to the Department of Justice, and send it to co-counsel. Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.80	
01/30/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load documents into Summation database.	2.50	
01/31/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Research to determine the Chief Executive Officers of a list of high tech companies.	0.70	
01/31/12	CARNAM, TODD	Find the Chief Executive Officers of still more technology companies from 2001 - present.	1.00	
01/31/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review defense production proposal; meet with D. Harvey re changes to same.	1.00	
01/31/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 hearing and Case Management Conference transcript and discovery letters for next steps.	1.40	
01/31/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with , and co-counsel.	1.00	
01/31/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Compile electronic discovery documents.	3.00	
01/31/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and send letter to Apple re document production; review electronically stored information production protocol, conference with K. Dugar re same; conference with experts re class certification; research document discovery issues.	6.80	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Conference call with experts.	1.00	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoenas to Oracle, Sun; review documents for same.	1.50	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review co-counsel comments on requests for production; confer with S. Shin re subpoenas.	0.20	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Facebook documents for subpoena; email D. Harvey re same.	0.20	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Kayak documents for subpoena; email D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
01/31/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Motorola documents for subpoena; email D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
01/31/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
01/31/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Update class member list with new information. Prepare letter to defense counsel and subpoena drafts. Organize Electronic Court Filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with a court reporter regarding transcript ordering. Organize correspondence documents in P:/ drive and iManage. Search documents in Summation and send them to co-counsel.	2.20	
01/31/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Load new documents into Summation database.	2.50	
02/01/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for the names of the Chief Executive Officers of various high tech companies from 2001 to 2012.	0.40	
02/01/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with D. Harvey and TERIS re database and repository setup.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/01/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review production disks and attend conference call with TERIS production and data field mapping issues.	1.50	
02/01/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Compile electronic discovery documents.	4.00	
02/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification; research, draft, and serve subpoena notice to defendants; conference with defendants re document requests, conference with team re same.	5.40	
02/02/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Prepare for and attend calls re Relativity database set up; conference calls with Relativity re same.	1.50	
02/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Data call with experts and co-counsel.	0.70	
02/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re data issues, draft and serve letter to defendants re same; conference with vendor representatives; review and revise subpoenas; research data issues.	5.20	
02/02/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft Kayak subpoena.	0.50	
02/02/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft Motorola Mobility and Motorola Solutions subpoenas; draft cover letter to defense counsel.	1.10	
02/02/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting on CaseMap with Litigation Support.	0.40	
02/02/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team emails as needed; confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.40	
02/02/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Attend conference call regarding the loading of new documents into Relativity database program.	2.50	
02/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research on Lucasfilm.	0.50	
02/03/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read correspondence with defendants.	0.20	
02/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re database issues, prepare for same; review and revise subpoenas; conference with defense counsel re database issues; conference with electronically stored information vendor re production specifications.	6.20	
02/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to counsel for Turbine, Janet Grady, re document retention and subpoena.	0.20	
02/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft Facebook subpoena.	0.60	
02/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to eBay, PayPal.	0.70	
02/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Issue subpoenas to Advanced Micro Devices, Palm; confer with D. Harvey and S. Shin re same; legal research on service of subpoenas.	0.80	
02/03/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review expert data requests, draft interrogatories, requests for production, correspondence re same, in preparation for meet and confer with defendants; confer with D. Harvey re same; meet and confer with defense counsel.	3.40	
02/03/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/03/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare proof of service for subpoenas to third parties, Advanced Micro Devices, Inc. and Palm, Inc. Prepare mailing of subpoenas to service agents and defense counsel. Organize correspondence documents to P:/ drive and iManage.	0.90	
02/03/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research on Lucasfilm.	6.70	
02/04/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft letter to defense counsel following up on meet and confer re data production.	1.00	
02/05/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, B. Glackin, J. Saveri and	0.70	
02/05/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri, E. Fastiff re	0.40	
02/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with conference with team re same,	2.50	
02/06/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit letter to court; conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter re ; telephone conference with D. Harvey re ; review draft letter re	0.60	
02/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise letters re strategy; research Lucasfilm facts and damages.	5.50	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to Disney; review documents for same.	0.50	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to Dreamworks; review production for same; draft cover letter to defendants to provide notice; email to defense counsel.	0.70	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoena to Proctor & Gamble.	0.20	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review defendants' production to identify third parties to subpoena; legal research on requirements of service for subpoenas, filing and proof of service; call with D. Harvey re next steps; call to Facebook General Counsel; confer with D. Harvey re possible expansion of case to include Clairmail.	2.10	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review emails; draft task list.	0.10	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Lucasfilm production in preparation for settlement conference.	0.50	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review production, prepare subpoena to Dreamworks; email D. Harvey re same.	0.40	
02/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Serve subpoenas on Advanced Micro Devices, Palm counsel; locate general counsel contact information; serve defendants.	0.40	
02/06/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Expert issues; third party; telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt; telephone conference with Michael Tubach; discovery; settlement.	3.00	
02/06/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery documents to P:/ drive and iManage. Organize defendants' produced documents in the 14th floor war room. Prepare proofs of service and letters to file to court for D. Harvey. Prepare copies of proofs of service and letters for Services to send to defense counsel. Update and upload documents to CaseMap.	4.20	
02/06/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research on Lucasfilm.	6.70	
02/07/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit letter and draft discovery; conference with J. Saveri re Lucasfilm settlement strategy.	1.10	
02/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with outside counsel re subpoenas; research potential new cases re animator employers; review and revise discovery requests; conference with document review vendor.	6.20	
02/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft memo summarizing Lucasfilm agreements in preparation for settlement conference; review defendants' production for same; confer with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re same.	7.00	
02/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to meet and confer follow up letter to defense counsel.	0.10	
02/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare subpoena for service on Oracle, Sun; confer with S. Shin.	0.50	
02/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team emails as needed; review information on fields from discovery vendor, possible expansion of case to address animation studios; Lucasfilm damages research.	0.30	
02/07/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/07/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Expert issues; review and revise third party discovery; conference with D. Harvey.	1.80	
02/07/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare a proof of service for the subpoena to Oracle Corporation. Search for the service agent for Oracle Corporation. Prepare letter and subpoena drafts to defense counsel. Create an Excel spread sheet for all the subpoena drafts sent to defense counsel for J. Saveri. Update the list of defendants' document production log with new information. Communicate with K. Lehe regarding subpoenas.	2.70	
02/07/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research re amount of commerce for animation industry.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/08/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey, J. Saveri re settlement, re-pleading of complaint.	1.30	
02/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise production stipulation; review and revise letter to defendants re meet and confer; conference with document vendor; conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re	5.50	
02/08/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft and serve third party subpoenas; confer with Research re same: Facebook, Motorola Mobility, Motorola Solutions, Kayak; update third party tracking chart.	3.80	
02/08/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer letter to defense counsel, electronically stored information stipulation.	0.30	
02/08/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Serve Oracle subpoenas; copies to defendants, counsel.	0.70	
02/08/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review defendants' document production and update production log. Prepare proofs of service for subpoenas to Advanced Micro Devices, Inc., Palm, Inc., and Oracle Corp. for re-service. Communicate with K. Lehe and D. Harvey regarding subpoenas to Kayak Software Corp., Motorola Mobility, Inc., and Motorola Solutions, Inc. Prepare proofs of service for subpoenas to Kayak Software Corp., Motorola Mobility, Inc., and Motorola Solutions, Inc. Prepare copies of subpoenas and proofs of services for mailing.	5.50	
02/08/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research of live action animation film industry.	2.00	
02/09/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Corporate research information appropriate service for Kayak Software, Inc.	1.00	
02/09/12	CARNAM, TODD	Search for registered agent who is to accept service of process.	0.50	
02/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel, draft summaries re same.	0.80	
02/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoenas to Dell, IBM; review evidence for same.	1.40	
02/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edit and serve subpoenas for Kayak, Motorola Mobility, Motorola Solutions.	0.70	
02/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review second and third sets of interrogatories.	0.30	
02/09/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/09/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize subpoenas that were served in P:/ drive and iManage. Update third party subpoenas chart with new information. Modify and print subpoenas to Kayak Software Corporation for mailing. Further review defendants' document production and update production log.	4.80	
02/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise subpoenas, conference with K. Lehe re same; prepare for meeting with Lucasfilm counsel, conference with K. Lehe and J. Zhu re same; review and revise memo re Lucasfilm evidence; review and revise interrogatories, conference with co-counsel re same.	5.50	
02/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with D. Harvey re Lucasfilm settlement conference preparation; edits to memorandum on Lucasfilm agreements.	0.70	
02/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review edits to interrogatories.	0.10	
02/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Lucasfilm materials for evidence binder; confer with A. Ruiz, B. Troxel re same.	1.20	
02/10/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Serve subpoenas: Kayak, Dreamworks, Disney, EBay, PayPal, Proctor & Gamble, IBM, Dell, Facebook; confer with A. Ruiz, J. Saveri, D. Harvey.	2.00	
02/10/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research chief executive officer history for nine corporations, for K. Lehe.	2.00	
02/10/12	RUIZ, ALAN	For K. Lehe, create proofs of service for and revise and serve subpoenas to eBay, Walt Disney Company, Procter & Gamble, and DreamWorks on same and defendants. For K. Lehe, D. Harvey and J. Saveri review, prepare binder with B. Troxel of Lucasfilm agreements.	3.40	
02/10/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/10/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Lucasfilm documents for J. Saveri review.	1.00	
02/10/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research re amount of commerce for Lucasfilm for meeting with Lucasfilm.	2.00	
02/13/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with J. Saveri before and after Lucasfilm meeting; review Facebook subpoena.	0.60	
02/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for settlement conference with Lucasfilm counsel, participate in same; review Lucasfilm documents; research animator complaint and potential case; review J. Saveri edits to Facebook subpoena, revise same.	4.20	
02/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Gather documents supporting Intel/Advanced Micro Devices agreement.	0.20	
02/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Intuit's privilege log.	0.40	
02/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Serve third party subpoenas, courtesy copies to counsel; serve defendants.	0.40	
02/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Settlement conference with Lucasfilm; preparation for same.	1.00	
02/13/12	RUIZ, ALAN	For K. Lehe and D. Harvey review, replicate for each the binder of Lucasfilm agreements made for J. Saveri last Friday.	0.80	
02/13/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Finalize document production log and forward it to D. Harvey and K. Lehe. Organize discovery documents served on defendants on P:/ drive and iManage.	1.00	
02/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise Facebook subpoena, serve draft of same; conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re case status; research potential class expert; review document production; draft and revise task list.	6.20	
02/14/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Facebook subpoena.	0.10	
02/14/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/14/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare table of contents and binders for J. Saveri, D. Harvey, and K. Lehe. Prepare letters and subpoena drafts for mailing to defense counsel.	1.30	
02/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, conference with J. Saveri, B. Glackin, and E. Fastiff re same; review and revise draft subpoenas to third parties; review document production offer from defendants' counsel.	2.50	
02/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft subpoenas to Blue Sky Studios/News Corporation, NVIDIA; review document production for same; confer with S. Shin; research re same; search for corporate structure.	2.80	
02/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to defendants' response/comments to requests for production; review same.	0.50	
02/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Gather Freedom of Information Act materials; confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.10	
02/15/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for service agents of News Corporation and Blue Sky Studios. Review Apple's and Pixar's produced documents for third party issues. Edit CaseMap for issue coding.	2.00	
02/15/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research of service agent for News Corporation and executives of Blue Sky Studios.	1.00	
02/16/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Corporate research into the Chief Executive Officers of Blue Sky Studio and Fox Filmed Entertainment.	0.70	
02/16/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Advanced Micro Devices emails and letter.	0.30	
02/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, conference with research groups are same; correspond with potential experts; research discovery strategy; review K. Lehe summary re Advanced Micro Devices subpoena.	2.70	
02/16/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with Katie Robison, counsel for Advanced Micro Devices, re subpoena compliance; email summary to team; email protective order to Katie Robison; confer with team; draft follow up letter; legal research for same.	5.10	
02/16/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/16/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare third party subpoena drafts and cover letters for mailings to defense counsel. Update third party subpoena list. Update CaseMap with issues to Adobe's produced documents.	3.80	
02/17/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Attend Relativity Analytics process conference call for processing e-discovery from defendants.	1.50	
02/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' correspondence with the Department of Justice, conference with co-counsel re same; review and revise letter to Advanced Micro Devices; conference with potential expert; correspond with potential experts, conference with B. Glackin re same; review defendants' document request response, correspond with defense counsel re same; attend meeting re Analytic software with K. Lehe and K. Dugar.	5.50	
02/17/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to letter to Advanced Micro Devices counsel re subpoena; email team re requests for extension of time.	0.20	
02/17/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	TERIS Analytics meeting for online document review.	1.00	
02/17/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for correspondence between the Department of Justice and defendants and pull documents from Summation.	5.50	
02/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re document requests, prepare for same, draft summary of same.	3.50	
02/20/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Advanced Micro Devices counsel re subpoena compliance.	3.20	
02/21/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review TERIS material re Analytics for e-discovery from defendants.	1.50	
02/21/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis of encryption for productions in database.	2.00	
02/21/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; draft discovery plan, research same; review subpoena issues; research potential experts, correspond with same.	3.50	
02/21/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Calls to counsel for Kayak, Advanced Micro Devices, Proctor & Gamble, Oracle re subpoenas, prepare for same; draft confirmatory letters; confer with team; email to Kayak counsel, Oracle counsel; team emails re Motorola subpoena; review protective order re terms of disclosure to third party authors; email exchange with eBay counsel.	4.40	
02/21/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/21/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize discovery requests sent by the defendants in P:/ drive and iManage, and Calendar. Search for correspondence between the Department of Justice and defendants, and pull documents from Summation.	5.50	
02/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re interrogatory responses, draft summaries re same; review non-party responses to subpoenas; supervise document review issues.	3.50	
02/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Calls to Paul Loh re subpoena to Motorola; email team; follow up call; email to team.	0.80	
02/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call with Dreamworks counsel re subpoena.	0.20	
02/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Email with eBay counsel to schedule meet and confer re subpoena; conduct meet and confer re same; summarize call for the team; legal research re same; team emails re subpoena to Advanced Micro Devices and counsel's response.	2.60	
02/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Prepare and serve subpoenas to Facebook, IBM, Dell, NVIDIA, Blue Sky.	1.00	
02/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Schedule new subpoena compliance deadlines.	0.20	
02/22/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/22/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further search for correspondence between the Department of Justice and defendants, and pull documents from Summation. Prepare a binder for the correspondence between the Department of Justice and defendants. Search and save defendants' organization charts. Update CaseMap with a new document. Prepare subpoenas and proofs of service for third parties.	6.50	
02/22/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research Dell, Inc.'s registered agent in Texas.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues, conference with J. Saveri re same; conference with potential experts, prepare for same, conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re same; review subpoena-related documents; conference with counsel for Palm, conference with J. Saveri and B. Glackin re same; review Palm production.	3.50	
02/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review subpoenas; legal research on third party discovery obligations; compile list of questions; team emails re subpoena responses and negotiations; review Motorola Mobility motion to quash and local rules for same; emails to third party counsel to schedule meet and confers; call with E. Fastiff; gather materials and email S. Shin re binder of subpoena responses.	3.90	
02/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Subpoenas to IBM, Dell, Facebook, NVIDIA, Blue Sky; update chart with counsel contact information; review correspondence and confer with S. Shin for same.	1.00	
02/23/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/23/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents, and third parties' objections and responses in P:/ drive and iManage. Update third party subpoenas list with new information. Search for defendants' organization chart and save them to P:/ drive. Create second set of binders for correspondence files between the U.S. Department of Justice and the defendants.	4.50	
02/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; research discovery issues, including document requests, data requests, and electronically stored information specification; conference with potential class members, summarize same.	2.50	
02/24/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Legal research on deadlines for response to motion to quash; calls to clerk; email to team; legal research on transfer of motion to quash; email results to team; email and call opposing counsel; confer with S. Shin re subpoena binder.	3.20	
02/24/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Update third party subpoena list. Organize third party's responses, objections, and production in P:/ drive and iManage, and forward them to attorneys and Records. Search third party subpoenas and correspondence, and create a binder for E. Fastiff. Search and organize defendant, Intel Corp.'s production for D. Harvey and K. Lehe.	4.00	
02/25/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash.	4.60	
02/26/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash.	2.10	
02/27/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review third party subpoenas and responses.	1.00	
02/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meetings re experts; discovery issues.	3.60	
02/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	In-person conference with co-counsel, prepare for same, draft summary re same; conference with potential experts, research same; review and revise document discovery documents, proposals, and issues; conference with K. Lehe re third party discovery.	6.20	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with co-counsel John Radice re hearing on Motorola Mobility motion to quash.	0.10	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with counsel for Dreamworks re subpoena response extension.	0.30	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; confer with S. Chelton re filing requirements for Northern District of Illinois.	5.10	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Letter to Apple challenging confidentiality designations.	1.20	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with counsel for Advanced Micro Devices.	0.20	
02/27/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Team meeting with co-counsel.	1.50	
02/27/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/27/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Update E. Fastiff's binder with third party's responses and objections to subpoena. Prepare documents for a meeting for D. Harvey. Prepare a table of all the defendants listed in the initial disclosures. Upload Palm, Inc.'s production to CaseMap and code. Search for Steve Jobs' email to Ed Colligan in Summation. Update the third party's response chart.	4.50	
02/28/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on Relativity Analytics implementation in database.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/28/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with K. Lehe re third party subpoenas and review same and current meet and confer correspondence.	2.00	
02/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential expert economists, conference with B. Glackin re same, correspond with experts re same; research imperfect competition in labor markets; revise document request responses, conference with J. Saveri re same; conference with database representative re Analytics.	4.70	
02/28/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Call to Apple counsel re withdrawing confidentiality designations; confer with co-counsel re brief in opposition to motion to quash.	0.40	
02/28/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; legal research for same.	4.00	
02/28/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with E. Fastiff re subpoena enforcement, gather information for same; email to co-counsel following up on strategy.	1.00	
02/28/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meeting with TERIS, re e-discovery platform for document review.	0.70	
02/28/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Obtain copy of cases involving Manpower Inc. for K. Lehe.	0.30	
02/28/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
02/29/12	CARNAM, TODD	Pull 10-Ks for K. Lehe.	0.20	
02/29/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Third party subpoenas; edit emails and letters; conference with K. Lehe re strategy.	1.00	
02/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review K. Lehe's opposition to Motorola's motion to quash.	0.50	
02/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re data production from Adobe and Intuit, prepare for same, draft summary re same; review documents.	3.50	
02/29/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; legal research for same; conference calls with John Radice, Adam Steinfeld; calls and emails to Apple counsel re confidentiality designations of documents; review same.	10.60	
02/29/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for current locations of the employees for the Motorola Mobility Holdings, Inc., Motorola Solutions, Inc., and Motorola, Inc. Update CaseMap with new documents and information. Scan and save defendant, Apple Inc.'s documents for K. Lehe. Update production log. Organize emails in iManage.	2.30	
03/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft opposition to motion to quash, conference with K. Lehe re same; research discovery issues; research data issues.	3.50	
03/01/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; call with Apple counsel re document designation; review local rules in jurisdictions where subpoenas served to determine deadlines, recording same in chart; confer with co-counsel to coordinate filing.	12.20	
03/01/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Update production log and third party subpoena list. Redact emails between the defendants' and the third parties for filing. Update CaseMap with new documents and information.	2.80	
03/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise opposition to Motorola motion to quash.	1.10	
03/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise opposition to motion to quash, research same, conference with B. Glackin and K. Lehe re same; conference with potential expert; conference with team re discovery issues.	5.20	
03/02/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft brief in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; confer with team, co-counsel, local counsel.	5.90	
03/02/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/02/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further update CaseMap with new documents and information. Redact and prepare exhibits for the opposition to third party's motion to quash.	2.60	
03/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, correspond with same; correspond with team re case management.	2.50	
03/05/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Motorola's reply brief in support of motion to quash; email with K. Lehe re Dreamwork's response to subpoena.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/05/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re Lucasfilm settlement demand.	1.10	
03/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement offers; research potential case re animator studios, conference with team re same, review documents re same, draft complaint re same, run conflicts check re same; conference with document hosting website re production stipulation; conference with Lucasfilm counsel.	6.20	
03/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Compile information for D. Harvey re animation studio conspiracy.	0.20	
03/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Dreamworks counsel re subpoena production.	0.80	
03/05/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Motorola Mobility's reply in support of motion to quash; emails with co-counsel re hearing.	0.30	
03/05/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Organize discovery documents received from defendants in P:/ drive and iManage. Update third party subpoena list with new information. Update CaseMap with new documents and new information. Prepare documents relating to animation conspiracy issues and print for D. Harvey.	3.20	
03/05/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research headquarters of animation studios in California.	0.20	
03/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; correspond with class representatives re discovery requests, review same; conference with J. Saveri re discovery status; research draft complaint.	3.50	
03/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with co-counsel re sur-reply to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash; review brief; email to team with suggestions.	0.70	
03/06/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review evidence of agreements with eBay/PayPal; meet and confer with counsel.	2.20	
03/06/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/06/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search for agreements between eBay, PayPal, Intuit, and Google, and forward them to K. Lehe. Prepare a letter to defense counsel regarding Palm, Inc.'s production.	1.80	
03/07/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit draft Motorola Mobility sur reply re motion to quash; read and respond to emails re same; read IBM's response to subpoena; read Apple emails re documents; read Lucasfilm letter re custodian search terms.	1.30	
03/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research expert issues; conference with counsel for Apple re data issues, prepare for same; conference with counsel for Pixar re production protocol, prepare for same; review document issues and research custodians and search terms.	3.20	
03/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Calls and emails to counsel for Intuit, Google re de-designating confidential documents relating to eBay, PayPal; meet and confer email to eBay counsel; meet and confer call to Dreamworks counsel; review local rules for jurisdictions where subpoenas served; review objections and responses to IBM subpoena; confer with co-counsel re subpoena enforcement; update subpoena tracking chart; review objections and responses to subpoenas from Facebook, NVIDIA, scan and send to co-counsel.	5.30	
03/07/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to sur-reply in opposition to Motorola Mobility's motion to quash.	0.20	
03/07/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review co-counsel's memorandum and defendants' correspondence to the Department of Justice regarding defendants' search terms and custodians. Prepare letters to defense counsel with custodians and search terms. Scan and organize third parties' responses and objections in P:/ drive and iManage, and forward them to attorneys. Update the third party list with new information. Organize emails in P:/ drive and iManage.	4.70	
03/08/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read third party subpoena responses.	0.50	
03/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients re discovery requests, conference with J. Saveri re same; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues, draft summaries re same; conference with experts regarding data issues; conference with Joshua Davis re privilege log issues; research settlement calculation issues.	6.80	
03/08/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with Intuit counsel re agreement to release documents to eBay/PayPal counsel to enforce subpoena; confer with eBay counsel.	0.30	
03/08/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with eBay, PayPal counsel; review evidence for same.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/08/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/08/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Scan and organize third parties' responses and objection, and email to attorneys. Update third-party list with new information. Update class member status list with D. Harvey's notes. Search for documents related to other agreements in CaseMap and organize them in P:/ drive for K. Lehe. Continue reviewing correspondence documents between the defendants and the Department of Justice for any search terms and custodians.	3.50	
03/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients re discovery responses, research same; conference with co-counsel re discovery responses; conference with defendants' counsel re outstanding discovery issues.	4.50	
03/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Dreamworks counsel; review proposed agreement and email team with suggestions.	1.30	
03/09/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with Motorola Solutions counsel re subpoena.	1.00	
03/09/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Log received document production and duplicate production disks for attorney review.	0.70	
03/09/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/09/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Edit PDF documents into text searchable for co-counsel. Organize third party discovery documents in P:/ drive and iManage. Update third party list with new information.	1.20	
03/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft letter re discovery issues; research and draft attachment re search terms and custodians; research other outstanding discovery issues, correspond with co-counsel re same.	4.50	
03/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts; conference with defense counsel re outstanding discovery issues, revise draft correspondence re same; conference with K. Lehe re subpoenas.	4.50	
03/12/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Correspondence with counsel for eBay, PayPal.	0.20	
03/12/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet and confer with DreamWorks counsel; follow up email; letter to defense counsel serving Kayak production; confer with S. Shin re same.	1.00	
03/12/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents in P:/ drive and iManage. Update third party list and production log with new information. Communicate with K. Lehe regarding third party production. Communicate with D. Harvey regarding search terms and custodian project. Search and review for any duplications of search terms among the defendants' search terms and custodian. Prepare letters and disks for mailing to defense counsel.	3.00	
03/13/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review and code evidence of agreements with Blue Sky, Disney, ImageMovers Digital (IMD), Dreamworks; organize and email co-counsel with these and other materials for subpoena enforcement.	1.40	
03/13/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Stellings; conference with K. Lehe; email to D. Harvey.	0.30	
03/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for the third party's discovery documents in the CaseMap for K. Lehe. Email the third party discovery documents to co-counsel. Organize discovery documents received from defendants in P:/ drive and iManage. Search and email defendants' responses and white papers to D. Harvey. Prepare attachments of search terms and custodians for each defendants. Review defendants' documents submitted to the Department of Justice.	6.20	
03/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft correspondence re discovery disputes; draft and review correspondence; research expert work re class certification issues.	5.50	
03/14/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with S. Shin, opposing counsel re email domain names for defendants to facilitate response to Motorola Solutions subpoena.	0.30	
03/14/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/14/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further prepare attachments of search terms and custodians for each defendants. Organize discovery documents received from defense counsel. Review defense correspondence for email domains for each of the defendants for K. Lehe. Prepare letters and attachments regarding custodians to be mailed and emailed. Communicate with D. Harvey regarding custodian list.	2.50	
03/14/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Export custodian information out of Summation database. Import information into an Excel spreadsheet.	2.00	
03/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review and circulate correspondence, discovery responses.	0.20	
03/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review correspondence from defendants re discovery status.	0.10	
03/15/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Dell's production and confer with co-counsel, S. Shin re follow up.	0.40	
03/15/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Duplicate data disk and provide to vendor for loading into review database.	0.60	
03/15/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/15/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and third-party discovery documents to P:/ drive and iManage, and forward them to Records. Update third-party list, production log, and class member list with new information.	1.00	
03/16/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read responses to third party subpoena and letter from defendants.	0.50	
03/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re discovery issues; review documents manage document review; review and draft correspondence re discovery issues.	4.80	
03/16/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Confer with co-counsel re status of subpoenas, next steps and third parties' proposals.	0.20	
03/16/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet with A. Shaver re case status prior to discovery conference.	0.10	
03/16/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review correspondence from defendants re discovery status.	0.10	
03/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review correspondence re discovery; emails with D. Harvey re employee privacy; attend meet and confer with J. Saveri and defendants; conference with K. Lehe.	3.30	
03/16/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare discovery documents for J. Saveri. Organize correspondence documents on P:/ drive and iManage.	0.50	
03/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri, D. Harvey re class certification, discovery.	1.00	
03/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with J. Saveri re discovery strategy; conference with defendants' counsel re search terms, draft and serve correspondence re same; draft expert retention agreement; draft letters re discovery issues; draft electronically stored information production stipulation; conference with vendor and K. Dugar re Apple documents.	4.50	
03/19/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/19/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search and review defendants' custodian and search terms submitted to the Department of Justice. Update the list of defendants' search terms.	1.50	
03/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft letter re discovery disputes; conference with counsel for Pixar and Google re discovery issues, prepare for same; research search terms, custodians, and other search procedures; research discovery responses; conference with vendor re Apple documents.	8.30	
03/20/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Update status of third party subpoenas; draft memo re outstanding task list.	0.20	
03/20/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/20/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search and organize documents related to joint Case Management Conference for D. Harvey.	0.50	
03/21/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Edits to discovery search terms.	0.60	
03/21/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Meet with A. Shaver re task list; draft memo re assignments; organize correspondence in iManage, Records, P:/ drive.	4.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/21/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review Dreamworks' proposal for subpoena compliance; email with team.	0.20	
03/21/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Lehe re third party discovery; confer with D. Harvey re case strategy; edit D. Harvey's discovery letter.	1.60	
03/21/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review and search defendants' produced document for individual's email addresses. Communicate with Litigation Support regarding searching protocol for Summation and TERIS.	3.20	
03/21/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Provide search support to users of Summation database.	0.50	
03/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research search terms, draft same; draft correspondence re discovery issues.	3.50	
03/22/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Review correspondence from co-counsel and update tracking chart; confer with A. Shaver; call with Sarah Schalman-Bergen.	0.60	
03/22/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Call with D. Harvey re responses and objections; update on third party discovery; confer with K. Lehe re same.	0.50	
03/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with defense counsel re discovery issues; correspond with counsel for third parties re subpoenas; review discovery materials.	1.70	
03/23/12	LEHE, KATHERINE	Draft and file motion to withdraw.	0.30	
03/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Read task memo from K. Lehe and review associated materials; email team re Twitter talent war.	0.70	
03/23/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, discovery, and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update third-party list and production log.	3.70	
03/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise discovery responses.	3.20	
03/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review third party subpoena materials and update status chart; review emails with co-counsel re same.	1.00	
03/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients; draft and revise interrogatory responses; review third party discovery.	5.80	
03/26/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with co-counsel re third party discovery; review and edit responses to interrogatories and requests for production; update chart.	1.30	
03/26/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Scan and organize correspondence received from counsel to P:/ drive.	0.50	
03/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise interrogatory responses, conference with clients re same; review documents.	4.50	
03/27/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/27/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with J. Saveri; conference with E. Fastiff; conference with D. Harvey; review hot documents folder; emails with co-counsel re third party discovery.	1.50	
03/27/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents in P:/ drive and iManage. Communicate with A. Shaver and D. Harvey regarding defendants' custodians and search terms.	0.60	
03/28/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with A. Shaver re eBay and Advanced Micro Devices responses to subpoenas.	0.20	
03/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and serve discovery responses, conference with J. Saveri re same.	2.50	
03/28/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/28/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with E. Fastiff; review Kayak's and Palm's discovery responses and productions; draft memos on same and circulate; voicemails to Advanced Micro Devices and eBay; update tracking chart.	3.90	
03/28/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare a proof of service for the plaintiffs' interrogatory responses and request for production. Organize discovery and correspondence documents on P:/ drive and iManage.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/29/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit meet and confer letter to eBay re third party subpoena.	0.50	
03/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Facebook and Nvidia counsel re subpoenas; correspond with defendants' counsel re discovery issues; review and enter into stipulation re electronically stored information production, correspond with counsel re same; conference with A. Shaver re third party discovery issues; correspond with potential expert.	3.50	
03/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Tom Brown re eBay subpoena; draft and follow-up letter for same and research case law for authority for same; update tracking chart; telephone conference with D. Harvey and third party counsel re subpoena to Facebook and Nvidia; review briefing on motion to quash for same.	5.50	
03/29/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery documents on P:/ drive and iManage. Prepare letters to defense counsel regarding third-party production. Update third-party list with new productions. Review third parties' productions and organize it on P:/ drive and iManage. Communicate with TERIS regarding document uploading. Organize discovery documents for D. Harvey and A. Shaver. Communicate with D. Harvey and A. Shaver regarding third parties' productions.	3.00	
03/30/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Research materials regarding potential expert Alan Manning.	1.60	
03/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research discovery issues, conference with J. Saveri and defendants' counsel re same; conference with experts re class certification issues; review third party discovery; review and revise letter re discovery from Nvidia and Facebook.	5.60	
03/30/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Arrange library research vendor search of economic literature for expert for D. Harvey.	0.20	
03/30/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
03/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Voicemail to Advanced Micro Devices counsel; draft letter to Facebook counsel and circulate; email to co-counsel re Dell; send letter to eBay.	1.90	
03/30/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for hearing transcripts and orders for A. Shaver. Organize email documents for D. Harvey.	0.40	
03/30/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles re expert.	0.20	
04/02/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare electronic discovery production.	4.00	
04/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' discovery responses; prepare for discovery conference with defendants, conference with J. Saveri re same, attend same; draft first request for production of documents; review memo re Dell/Intel agreement; conference with experts; research draft complaint.	8.20	
04/02/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with growth and circulate same; review Dell production and draft memo on same.	1.30	
04/02/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare binders of discovery documents for D. Harvey. Save electronic court filing, correspondence, and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Update class members list with new information.	2.70	
04/02/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Import documents to be converted to TIFF and OCR format. Export documents to Concordance format.	2.50	
04/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research and summarize economic research papers that criticize and cite Alan Manning.	6.00	
04/03/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Animal Logic, LLC. Corporate research for third party discovery.	0.50	
04/03/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on plaintiffs' production.	0.50	
04/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with experts; prepare for same.	1.40	
04/03/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Preparation of electronic discovery production.	4.00	
04/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues; review documents; review class certification literature; draft letter to defendants re discovery issues.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/03/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Obtain class certification orders issued by Judge Lucy Koh for D. Harvey.	0.60	
04/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review eBay email; email D. Harvey re same.	0.30	
04/03/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email copies to attorneys. Review correspondence and discovery files and update production log. Search and download documents from CaseMap for issues and prepare for D. Harvey.	3.50	
04/03/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Generate production from our database to be sent to defense.	2.50	
04/03/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research and summarize economic research papers that criticize Alan Manning's thesis.	1.50	
04/04/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Electronic document production work for plaintiff production.	1.00	
04/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and serve discovery requests; revise and serve discovery response; prepare and serve document production; correspond with defendants re discovery issues; review documents; review documents.	6.50	
04/04/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey and Sarah Schalman-Bergen re Dell subpoena; check documents with S. Shin; review emails from D. Harvey to defendants.	0.50	
04/04/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery documents to P:/ drive and iManage, and forward them to Records. Prepare mailing of plaintiffs' document productions. Prepare proof of service of verified interrogatories responses. Review defendant Google's produced documents for any discussion of the third-party, Dell, Inc.	2.70	
04/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft Case Management Conference statement; research plaintiff discovery obligations and discovery abuse re confidential plaintiff information; review defendants' correspondence re ongoing discovery issues.	5.50	
04/05/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey re Case Management Conference; email team summary of Motorola production and response; update tracking chart; email D. Harvey and Sarah Schalman-Bergen re Dell and Google connection - review documents re same.	1.80	
04/05/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence documents to P:/ drive and iManage.	0.40	
04/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft Case Management Conference statement.	3.50	
04/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with grant status letter to same; email to emails from John Radice re same.	2.50	
04/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN		3.50	
04/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft email to Kristen Rowse with attachments re documents to eBay; draft joint dispute letter; email co-counsel re Dell documents and meet and confer schedule; email S. Shin to pull eBay documents.	1.80	
04/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference re discovery status; revise draft Case Management Conference statement; review defendants' discovery responses; conference with J. Zhu re impact and damages issues; prepare materials for experts.	3.50	
04/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and circulate letter to Advanced Micro Devices; review letter from eBay and email response to same; emails with co-counsel re response from Intuit; review eBay documents pulled by S. Shin.	1.90	
04/09/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Communicate with A. Shaver regarding eBay, Inc. related documents. Review defendants' produced documents for eBay, Inc. Communicate with TERIS regarding plaintiffs' production.	3.80	
04/09/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research expert literature re calculating damages.	0.20	
04/10/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Prepare files for loading and review.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft, revise, and serve Case Management Conference statement; correspond with co-counsel re discovery; conference with defense counsel re Case Management Conference statement; research discovery issues; draft correspondence re data productions; review data productions.	6.50	
04/10/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with defendants re third party documents.	0.50	
04/10/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records.	0.40	
04/10/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles that support our claims.	3.00	
04/11/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read and edit Case Management Conference statement; read defendants' email and production letters; edit D. Harvey's production response letters.	0.50	
04/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Case Management Conference statement; conference with D. Harvey.	0.50	
04/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Case Management Conference statement; conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.60	
04/11/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Conversion and preparation of electronic discovery production for upload into Summation database.	4.00	
04/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise Case Management Conference statement, conference with team re same, conference with defense counsel re same; conference with A. Shaver re third party discovery; conference with defendants re discovery disputes; draft and serve correspondence; review defendants' productions.	9.70	
04/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey re status of third party discovery; pull documents and order binders for eBay conference; draft joint dispute letter for same; email co-counsel re same.	3.70	
04/11/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare documents for meet and confer with eBay, Inc. and create binders.	1.00	
04/11/12	ZHU, JULIE	Read complaint and research scholarly articles that support our claims.	4.00	
04/12/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/12/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.70	
04/12/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles that support our claims.	4.00	
04/13/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare disks to from from	0.20	
04/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft letter to all defense counsel re class certification briefing procedure, conference with co-counsel re same; correspond with defense counsel re data productions and electronically stored information collections; correspond with class expert; review data productions.	6.80	
04/16/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Summarize document productions received over the past week.	0.80	
04/16/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/16/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review defendants' produced documents and data, and update production log. Communicate with Litigation Support and TERIS regarding defendants' data. Search for defendants' correspondence regarding search terms.	4.20	
04/16/12	ZHU, JULIE	Outline for damages factors from literature review.	4.00	
04/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review data productions, conference with expert team re same; review J. Zhu research re class certification issues; conference with third party discovery; draft letter re search terms, serve; prepare for Case Management Conference.	5.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/17/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review defendants' produced documents and data, and update production log. Organize discovery and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Prepare letters and documents to defense counsel regarding the third-party's production.	3.50	
04/17/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research - outline for damages estimate.	4.00	
04/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review correspondence and data productions from defendants; prepare for, attend, and travel re Case Management Conference; review order re motions to dismiss, correspond with co-counsel re same.	8.60	
04/18/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/18/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare a chart with defendants' latest production for the further Case Management Conference. Prepare and organize documents for D. Harvey and J. Saveri. Prepare CDs and DVDs to TERIS and	4.20	
04/18/12	ZHU, JULIE	Outline of impact of damages.	3.00	
04/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with clients re motion to dismiss order, conference with experts and co-counsel re same.	1.50	
04/19/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare email to clients regarding the outcome of the hearing.	0.80	
04/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class certification motion; conference with co-counsel re case status; correspond with clients; research motion to relate case.	1.50	
04/20/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/20/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with the defense counsel, Jonathan Herczeg regarding password issue on the produced documents.	0.40	
04/23/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Email with A. Shaver re Advanced Micro Devices discovery.	0.20	
04/23/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 order for next steps.	0.30	
04/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review discovery; conference with experts and co-counsel re discovery strategy; respond to class member inquiries; conference with vendor re electronically stored information collections, prepare for same.	5.50	
04/23/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review emails; edit letter to eBay; conference with D. Harvey; read letter from Advanced Micro Devices and email team with status; read Judge Koh order on motion to dismiss.	2.80	
04/23/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review documents using TERIS web-database. Communicate with TERIS and D. Harvey regarding organization of documents. Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update production logs. Search for documents via CT Summation for co-counsel.	3.00	
04/23/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research common literature surrounding wages.	0.50	
04/24/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read IBM motion to quash third party discovery.	0.30	
04/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review discovery re class certification issues; prepare for in-person meeting; conference with experts.	4.60	
04/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Send letter to eBay; emails with co-counsel re IBM; emails with team re conference.	0.50	
04/24/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and agreement files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with a court reporter regarding court transcript request. Update member status list. Research and review 10K and 10Q for eBay, Inc. for A. Shaver.	2.50	
04/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	In-person meeting with co-counsel to discuss case strategy; conference with experts re class certification.	5.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/25/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend conference with co-counsel; prepare for same.	1.50	
04/25/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare documents for a meeting for D. Harvey. Communicate with court reporter regarding hearing transcripts. Prepare a check request for the hearing transcripts. Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records.	2.00	
04/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re amending complaint and deadline to file answers; review correspondence.	1.50	
04/26/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/26/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Update service list with new defense counsel information.	0.40	
04/26/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles and summarize points in outline.	5.00	
04/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with experts; research class certification issues; conference with J. Zhu re class research, review research and documents re same; conference with defense counsel re data productions, review same.	5.50	
04/27/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Prepare a letter to court reporter regarding the Case Management Conference hearing transcript. Prepare CDs for delivery to	0.70	
04/27/12	ZHU, JULIE	Summarize articles into outline to highlight common impact.	4.00	
04/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials re claims and class certification strategy.	2.00	
04/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re discovery responses; review expert work re data; conference with J. Saveri re case status; review documents; conference with J. Zhu re document review.	4.20	
04/30/12	SAVERI, JOSEPH	Discovery; case management.	0.50	
04/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft emails re protocol for third party discovery; emails with eBay re meet and confer.	0.70	
04/30/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence, transcript, and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Organize discovery, correspondence, and document oroduction in order to send them to Records. Update production logs with new information. Prepare letters to regarding new productions.	5.20	
04/30/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Examine documents to be loaded onto Relativity software.	1.50	
04/30/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review documents from defendants and summarize into article.	4.00	
05/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with vendor and clients re document collections; review third party discovery; conference with co-counsel and with defendants re extension to deadline for answer.	3.50	
05/01/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with John Radice, D. Harvey, Adam Steinfeld re opposition brief; email Paul Loh re same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re eBay custodian list; email team re Nvidia update.	1.30	
05/01/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and pleading files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with TERIS regarding the third-party production uploading. Prepare a letter to defense counsel regarding the third-party production. Communicate with J. Zhu regarding the case status with the third parties and defendants. Further update the production log with new information.	1.20	
05/01/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review defendants' documents and summarize into outline.	4.00	
05/02/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials re case; research re claims and class certification issues.	4.00	
05/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients; conference with TERIS re document collection; review and revise opposition to motion to quash, conference with A. Shaver re same.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Read IBM's motion to quash; edit opposition brief to same; emails with co-counsel re same.	1.60	
05/02/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.20	
05/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review documents produced by defendant and compile into outline.	5.00	
05/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review case materials/hot documents for class certification work.	4.00	
05/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage data and document review; review and revise draft opposition to motion to compel, research same, conference with co-counsel re same; conference with vendors re document collections.	7.60	
05/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Tom Brown re eBay; prepare for same; conference with D. Harvey re motion to quash opposition; emails with co-counsel re same; email Nvidia re subpoena progress emails with Motorola re subpoena response.	1.90	
05/03/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files and signed protective orders received from consultants and experts in P:/ drive and iManage. and email attorneys re same. Communicate with TERIS regarding uploaded documents. Prepare a letter to regarding the defendant Apple Inc.'s new production.	1.80	
05/03/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review documents produced by defendant and compile into outline.	4.00	
05/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise opposition to motion to compel; conference with co-counsel re discovery issues; research third party discovery; review correspondence re search terms, draft correspondence re same; research data issues.	7.20	
05/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Nvidia; conference with D. Harvey re same; emails with co-counsel re Oracle/Sun response; edit opposition to IBM's motion and attorney declaration for same.	2.40	
05/04/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	0.30	
05/04/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review documents produced by defendant and compile into outline.	3.00	
05/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients re document collection; review and revise correspondence with defendants; conference with experts re damages calculations; research case strategy.	2.50	
05/07/12	RUIZ, ALAN	For A. Shaver, locate within defendant Intel's production to the Department of Justice any documents which mention the custodians proposed in our subpoena to third party Advanced Micro Devices.	2.00	
05/07/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Advanced Micro Devices; draft letter to eBay; review Intel-Advanced Micro Devices documents.	1.40	
05/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re discovery responses; conference with vendor re client document collection; conference with A. Shaver re Nvidia document review; correspond with co-counsel re third party discovery; research class certification.	4.20	
05/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Beatriz Mejia re Nvidia; search documents re Advanced Micro Devices custodians and emails to co-counsel re same; start drafting follow-up letter to Advanced Micro Devices; telephone conference with D. Harvey re amending complaint.	2.30	
05/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re data production; review data productions; conference with clients re document collection; review defense counsel correspondence; conference with E. Fastiff re case status; correspond with experts.	4.50	
05/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey re conference call; finish letter to Advanced Micro Devices and circulate; input E. Fastiff edits to same; review responses to interrogatories.	1.80	
05/09/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Prepare documents to be downloaded by experts.	0.50	
05/10/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Assist with file-transfer protocol transfer of documents. Prepare documents for transfer for expert review.	6.00	
05/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues; manage document review; review correspondence; review documents.	6.50	
05/10/12	RUIZ, ALAN	Organize on P:/ drive and iManage new discovery pleadings and correspondence. Organize, write cover letter for, and mail to economists new productions from various defendants. Partially update spreadsheet tracking such accordingly.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, co-counsel and experts.	0.80	
05/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with E. Fastiff re case; review materials re Department of Justice investigation.	1.00	
05/11/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery correspondence and defendants' subpoena to plaintiffs' former employees for follow up.	0.30	
05/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients; manage document review; conference with experts re data analysis, research same; conference with document vendor; review documents.	6.50	
05/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with team and Nvidia re nondisclosure agreement; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.00	
05/12/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re third party discovery and Nvidia.	0.20	
05/14/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re Nvidia and plaintiffs' employer subpoenas; conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same.	0.50	
05/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Nvidia's counsel re subpoena; research motions to quash third party subpoenas seeking information re plaintiffs' work histories.	4.50	
05/14/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey re subpoenas to plaintiff's employers; emails to team re same; review briefing re same; conference with D. Harvey and Nvidia re subpoena; draft summary re same; email co-counsel re status report; conference with E. Fastiff and D. Harvey re third party discovery.	4.00	
05/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Case Management Conference statements and hearing transcript re discovery instructions; conference with D. Harvey re same and discovery plan going forward.	2.00	
05/15/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Calls and emails from D. Harvey re plaintiffs' document collection efforts; calls with TERIS re status of same.	1.50	
05/15/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare electronic discovery transfer via file-transfer protocol server.	2.00	
05/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re discovery from plaintiffs, prepare for same; review defendants' subpoenas; conference with K. Dugar and vendors re document collection; conference with K. Dermody re case status; review case filings regarding discovery from plaintiffs; conference with Adobe counsel re discovery status; review data production.	5.50	
05/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Research motions to quash third party subpoenas; conference with D. Harvey re same; conference with defendants re same; conference with K. Dermody re same; review letter from eBay and circulate email re same.	6.30	
05/15/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare binders containing defendant Apple Inc's subpoenas to non-party and other discovery files for D. Harvey.	0.70	
05/15/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Prepare files on external site to be downloaded by experts and co-counsel.	0.50	
05/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meetings with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, and R. Heimann re case/strategy; review materials re same; edit notice of appearance and call with D. Harvey re same.	5.00	
05/16/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on data collection; calls to and from vendor; calls to and from D. Harvey.	2.00	
05/16/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Team strategy meeting.	3.00	
05/16/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting (partial attendance).	1.90	
05/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dugar re document collections, research same; conference with team re case overall case strategy and next steps, prepare for same; conference with A. Shaver re discovery from plaintiffs.	6.20	
05/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft letter to subpoena recipients; read former Case Management Conference statements and transcript of hearing; conference with D. Harvey, K. Dermody, B. Glackin, R. Heimann and E. Fastiff re case overview; edit and circulate letters.	5.50	
05/16/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare documents for D. Harvey for a meeting.	1.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review correspondence re discovery and edit responses re same; email with D. Harvey re clients; telephone call with Michael Tubach and D. Harvey re schedule; telephone call with plaintiffs' team re strategy; email with team re 30(b)(6) depositions; multiple emails with team re schedule; review investigative material.	3.50	
05/17/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on plaintiffs' document collection with vendors; call from D. Harvey re same; set reporting protocol for same.	1.50	
05/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues; review third party discovery issues, research same, conference with co-counsel re same; manage document review; research 30(b)(6) deposition notices re data; review interrogatory responses; research subpoena issues.	4.50	
05/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft letter to defendants re subpoenas; incorporate edits to same and circulate; case research for same; emails re class representative question; email re 30(b)(6) to D. Harvey; emails with co-counsel re status on third party discovery and start memo on same.	3.90	
05/17/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, discovery, and pleading files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Review files produced by the defendants and enter information on the production logs. Communicate with D. Harvey and A. Ruiz regarding defendants' production of documents and data. Update members' chart with new information.	6.00	
05/17/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review answers and objections to defendant's interrogatories for follow-up re same.	0.50	
05/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Call to Mark Fichtner re conference with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re discovery and schedule; emails with team and Michael Tubach re schedule; telephone call with Daniel Stover re telephone call with Brandon Marshall reconference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re case management; telephone call with Mike Devine re Heimann re Case Management Conference schedule; review case materials.	4.00	
05/18/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare and assist with transfer of electronic discovery via file-transfer protocol.	3.00	
05/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients, correspond with same; draft correspondence with defendants re subpoena and data issues; review correspondence; conference with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re discovery status and strategy; correspond with court re moving the Case Management Conference; research and draft Case Management Conference statement.	5.50	
05/18/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Process hard drive duplication for case work.	1.30	
05/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with team re eBay proposal; emails with David Kiernan re plaintiff's production; conference calls with K. Dermody and named plaintiffs; create chart for case management dates; draft memo on third party discovery status; telephone calls with subpoena recipients and create tracking chart for same.	3.90	
05/18/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, discovery, and pleading files in P:/ drive and iManage. and email attorneys re same. Update production logs for D. Harvey. Prepare defendants' productions to send to TERIS and Prepare a list of upcoming events for K. Dermody and A. Shaver.	4.50	
05/18/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review answers and objections to defendant's interrogatories for memo re same.	4.00	
05/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft joint Case Management Conference statement.	2.80	
05/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Case Management Conference statement; emails with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re discovery, subpoenas.	1.00	
05/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with client re document collection and other issues, draft summary re same; correspond with defendants re subpoenas; revise draft Case Management Conference statement.	2.50	
05/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey, team re status; edit Case Management Conference statement; call/email Michael Tubach re Case Management Conference.	1.00	
05/21/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise Case Management Conference statement, research same; review and revise draft 30(b)(6) data depositions; conference with A. Shaver re case status; conference with J. Saveri re case status and deadlines; review defendants' answers; review data productions.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with Advanced Micro Devices and eBay re third party subpoenas; emails with defendants re impasse and Case Management Conference schedule; conference with D. Harvey re plaintiff's interrogatory responses; draft 30(b)(6) notice on data.	4.80	
05/21/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, discovery, and pleading files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Review produced data and documents to enter information on the production logs. Prepare a draft of stipulation of rescheduling Case Management Conference for D. Harvey. Prepare a list of the defendants' data production for A. Shaver.	5.50	
05/22/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with D. Harvey re status; edit request to court re Case Management Conference; conference with S. Fineman re case management strategy.	1.00	
05/22/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on plaintiffs' document collection; conference call with D. Harvey; review production agreement; plan for plaintiffs' production.	1.50	
05/22/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Preparation of electronic discovery production. Assist with transfer via file-transfer protocol server.	2.00	
05/22/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with J. Zhu re interrogatory responses; emails with plaintiffs re same; draft interview script for same; review letter from Cristina Brown and draft response; draft email to co-counsel re 30(b)(6) notice and telephone call with Adam Steinfeld re same; case law research for joint dispute letter; emails with defendants re schedule for same and for Case Management Conference; review data summary.	5.80	
05/22/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, pleading, correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Search for material regarding motion to strike affirmative defense. Create a list of our current named plaintiffs' contact information for A. Shaver. Update the production logs with new defendants' productions.	6.00	
05/22/12	ZHU, JULIE	Insert additional information into interrogatories.	1.00	
05/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit discovery brief; multiple calls/emails re data subpoenas; Case Management Conference issues; conference with A. Shaver re discovery gaps.	2.50	
05/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Add to third party status memo and email co-counsel re same; edit 30(b)(6) notices and serve; email schedule to co-counsel; draft joint discovery dispute letter and conference with K. Dermody re same; edit J. Zhu's draft interrogatory responses and emails re same; emails with S. Shin re missing data and telephone call with Kate Zeng re same.	6.90	
05/23/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize the production logs with new defendants' productions. Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with experts and A. Shaver regarding defendants' data production. Prepare a set of copies of defendants' production to send to the experts. Prepare proof of service and mailing of the notice of deposition to defendants pursuant to Federal Rules of Civil Procedure 30(b)(6).	4.30	
05/23/12	ZHU, JULIE	Call clients re	5.00	
05/24/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
05/24/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Work on document productions. Transfer of electronic documents via file-transfer protocol server.	4.00	
05/24/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create and label multiple production disks to be sent to co-counsel.	1.20	
05/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft third party discovery summary and circulate; review Case Management Conference statement and emails with team re same; emails with S. Shin and experts re missing data; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re subpoenas and email to same re same; draft motion for extension of time; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same; telephone interview with Brandon Marshall and J. Zhu; edit J. Zhu's interview writeup.	9.50	
05/24/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further update the production logs with defendants' productions. Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Communicate with experts and A. Shaver regarding defendants' data production. Review experts' production logs for the defendants' database to our production log. Communicate with Litigation Support regarding preparing copies of the database for the co-counsel.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/24/12	ZHU, JULIE	Contact plaintiffs re interrogatory questions and fact information.	5.00	
05/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver re stipulation on pretrial order 1 and discovery; emails to D. Harvey and J. Saveri re case management.	0.80	
05/25/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit pretrial order 1 amended stipulation; motion for class certification extension; conference with A. Shaver re same.	1.50	
05/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review motion for a continuance of class certification deadlines.	1.50	
05/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit motion for extension of time and attorney declaration; draft proposed order for same; case law research for same; find exhibits for same; conferences with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same; circulate joint dispute letter to defendants; file notice of firm appearance for J. Saveri; draft stipulation and order re appointment of co-lead counsel; call and email clients re same.	10.30	
05/25/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, and pleading files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Communicate with A. Shaver regarding filings. Search for correspondence for A. Shaver. Prepare exhibits to the declaration of A. Shaver in support of motion for extension of time to file motion for class certification. Communication with Litigation Support regarding database. Review the contents in the defendants' produced data and update production log.	6.00	
05/25/12	ZHU, JULIE	Contact plaintiffs and draft memo re interrogatories.	5.00	
05/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit discovery letter and emails with team re same.	1.00	
05/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit joint dispute letter; email with team and co-counsel re same; telephone conference with Christina Brown re same; e-file same; edit plaintiff interrogatory responses; review Adam Steinfeld email re Motorola Mobility; review court decision on motion to extend time and team emails re same.	14.30	
05/29/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Search for the passwords and review contents to defendants' productions and update the production logs. Communicate with defense counsel regarding passwords to their productions. Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, Calendar, and Records. Prepare a chart of defendants' data and non-data production dates for K. Dermody, D Harvey, and A. Shaver.	4.60	
05/29/12	ZHU, JULIE	Draft memo re interrogatories and contact plaintiffs.	3.50	
05/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with E. Fastiff and D. Harvey re pretrial order 1 and discovery; email with A. Shaver re Intel and Lucasfilm.	0.50	
05/30/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit pretrial order no. 1 brief and declaration.	1.00	
05/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re 30(b)(6) deposition issues; revise draft Case Management Conference statement; conference with subpoena recipient; conference with defense counsel re subpoena extension; review joint discovery dispute letter; review draft motion to modify pretrial order.	5.50	
05/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey and Pixar re 30(b)(6) topic; telephone conference with D. Harvey and Intel re same; emails with co-counsel re data assertions; emails with Intel and Lucasfilm re same; draft motion to amend pretrial order No. 4; telephone conference with E. Fastiff re same; emails with K. Dermody re same.	6.10	
05/30/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Organize and create a binder for the defendants' production disks. Search for the filing of attorney declaration. Update production log with new information.	3.70	
05/31/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails re discovery, Case Management Conference; case meeting with D. Harvey, LCHB team.	1.00	
05/31/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' section of Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
05/31/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with client re discovery issues; research and draft Case Management Conference statement; conference with co-counsel and experts re class certification strategy; review correspondence and discovery production schedule; review motion to extend time and supporting materials; review documents and data analysis; meeting with K. Dermody.	8.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/31/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with experts; edit interrogatory responses; telephone calls with defendants re 30(b)(6) schedule; emails with co-counsel re same; review Case Management Conference statement; meeting with K. Dermody; telephone conference with D. Harvey re motion to amend and letter re affirmative defenses.	6.00	
05/31/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare binders containing defendants' answers for D. Harvey. Create charts separately containing defendants' document productions and data productions. Update production log with new productions from the defendants. Communicate with Litigation Support regarding disk copying. Communicate with TERIS and Econ One regarding defendants' productions. Prepare letters to Econ One with data productions. Organize correspondence in P:/ drive and iManage.	4.70	
05/31/12	ZHU, JULIE	Draft discovery memo and contact plaintiffs.	1.50	
06/01/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with team re case; edit Case Management Conference statement; meeting with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re discovery plan; emails with Joe Saveri re Case Management Conference, Pretrial Order 1; edit motion for appointment of counsel; review reports re discovery; review/respond to correspondence re document production.	5.50	
06/01/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re Case Management Conference; read edits and final version; edit pretrial order no. 1.	1.80	
06/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and file Case Management Conference statement, conference with defense counsel re same, conference with team and co-counsel re same; manage document review; review and revise documents re amending pretrial order.	7.50	
06/01/12	RUIZ, ALAN	For A. Shaver, organize copies of defendants' answers to our consolidated complaint.	0.30	
06/01/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with E. Fastiff, K. Dermody and D. Harvey re task list; edit motion to amend and attorney declaration; draft proposed order for same; review and edit Case Management Conference statement; emails with co-counsel re deposition schedules; draft letter to defendants re affirmative defenses; update interrogatory responses; emails with third parties re subpoenas; conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re Case Management Conference preparation.	8.50	
06/01/12	ZHU, JULIE	Contact plaintiffs re	1.50	
06/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise A. Shaver declaration in support of motion to amend and circulate.	0.90	
06/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for hearing; edit motion to amend pretrial order 1; emails with team re Case Management Conference.	1.50	
06/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for status conference, draft and circulate materials re same.	3.50	
06/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re interrogatory responses; revise same and email clients re same; edit motion to amend and e-file same.	3.50	
06/04/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for, drive to and attend hearing; many conferences with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; draft memo to team re class certification, deposition, discovery assignments; email with E. Fastiff re case management.	7.50	
06/04/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re upcoming production per court order and review set up for same; conference call with TERIS re planning for same.	1.50	
06/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Case Management Conference, travel for same; conference with clients; conference with team re case strategy; review documents, conference with A. Shaver re same; conference with A. Shaver re case schedule.	11.50	
06/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit and produce supplemental interrogatory responses; conference with D. Harvey, K. Dermody and J. Saveri; attend case conference in San Jose; draft case management calendar; telephone conference with K. Dugar and D. Harvey re plaintiff electronically stored information; locate plaintiff resumes.	12.50	
06/04/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare documents and binders for K. Dermody, A. Shaver, and D. Harvey for the case management conference hearing. Prepare and serve copies of Brandon Marshall's and Daniel Stover's supplemental answers and objections to first interrogatories. Organize Electronic Court Filing, correspondence, and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Review contents of defendants' production and update production log.	4.70	
06/04/12	ZHU, JULIE	Contact clients re	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with team re case status; meeting with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same and plaintiffs' documents; telephone call with team and experts re schedule; call to Joe Saveri re order; email Michael Tubach re meet and confer; conference with E. Fastiff re reply brief, document template, and experts.	6.00	
06/05/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with D. Harvey re document review and productions; follow up with TERIS re same; organize and attend review meeting for co-counsel.	2.50	
06/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with vendors re document database; conference with experts re class certification status; conference with team re class certification strategy; review documents; supervise service of resumes and production re same; conference with Apple's counsel re document production.	8.50	
06/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents.	2.50	
06/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Preparation for document review, document review and coding.	2.50	
06/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and produce supplemental interrogatory responses; conference call with co-counsel; conference call with experts; document review call; review plaintiff documents; call with Michael Tubach re 30(b)(6) deposition; emails with Dan Walker re same.	8.20	
06/05/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare plaintiffs' production cover letter. Update production log with new information. Produce plaintiffs' production to a defense counsel. Create bates labeled PDFs of plaintiffs' productions. Prepare mailing of plaintiffs' production to defense counsel.	4.00	
06/05/12	ZHU, JULIE	Draft plaintiffs' interrogatories response re fact questions.	3.30	
06/06/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey, Eric Cramer re experts; email defense counsel, D. Harvey, Joe Saveri re meet and confer; email A. Shaver re interrogatories; calls with D. Harvey re status, experts; review defendants' answers and conference with D. Harvey re same and objections.	5.50	
06/06/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with D. Harvey and co-counsel re document review and system tools.	1.00	
06/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents, conference with team re same; conference with defendants' counsel re data production; conference with client re document collection and interrogatory responses; draft correspondence re data; conference with experts re class definition.	11.50	
06/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
06/06/12	RAYHILL, KEVIN	Review plaintiffs' documents for responsiveness to defendants' request for production.	8.00	
06/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review plaintiff documents; emails with review team re same; telephone conference with Mark Fichtner re telephone conference with Michael Tubach re depositions; email to defendants re depositions.	5.50	
06/06/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize discovery, productions and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare mailing of plaintiff's supplemental response to interrogatories to defense counsel. Update production log. Prepare letters to defense counsel regarding third-party, eBay, Inc.'s production.	3.20	
06/06/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Bates stamp documents to be uploaded to Relativity database.	1.00	
06/07/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meetings, calls, emails with D. Harvey, A. Shaver re data issues and plaintiff documents; emails/calls to J. Saveri re case management; conference with D. Harvey re related companies; email with co-counsel re Intel documents; edit letter re objections to defenses; edit letter re data.	3.00	
06/07/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with D. Harvey and TERIS re plaintiffs' production review and processing.	0.50	
06/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with team and experts re class certification issues; conference with A. Shaver re schedule; draft and serve letters to defense counsel re discovery issues; conference with document vendor re production.	9.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/07/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Prepare compressed files from file-transfer protocol site, unzip, and make searchable.	1.40	
06/07/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Prepare documents from file-transfer protocol site and decrypt.	0.60	
06/07/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
06/07/12	RAYHILL, KEVIN	Review plaintiffs' documents for responsiveness to defendants' request for production.	8.00	
06/07/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with experts; call with Google re 30(b)(6) dates and subjects; review plaintiff documents; review data correspondence from defendants and experts; revise and produce plaintiff interrogatory responses.	6.10	
06/07/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize discovery, productions and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Prepare mailing of plaintiffs' supplemental responses to defendants' interrogatories. Organize production disks. Review contents of the production and update production log. Prepare letter to Econ One enclosing new defendants' production.	3.00	
06/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Intel documents; multiple calls/emails with D. Harvey re plaintiff documents; emails with team re Pixar data; conference with D. Harvey re overtime data for targeted positions.	2.00	
06/08/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review pending hosting invoices from vendor; finalize same; review load file for plaintiffs' production for compliance with production stipulation; calls with TERIS and D. Harvey re modification of same to ensure compliance.	3.50	
06/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; conference with team re document review, discovery issues; serve documents; conference with document vendor re production, manage production; emails with K. Dermody re Intel review; confer with K. Dermody re plaintiff documents and compensation data.	7.20	
06/08/12	JONES, KAREN	Review of background materials and review of plaintiff Mike Devine's documents for production.	2.00	
06/08/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Edit and replace metadata load file for outgoing document production and create data disks.	1.20	
06/08/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
06/08/12	RAYHILL, KEVIN	Review plaintiffs' documents for responsiveness to defendants' request for production.	2.00	
06/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with team re data issues; conference with D. Harvey re plaintiff documents; review Pixar job titles and draft email re same; telephone conference with Intel re 30(b)(6).	2.00	
06/08/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence, discovery, and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Review contents of the plaintiffs' and defendants' production and update the production log. Prepare letters to enclosing defendants' data production. Prepare mailings of plaintiffs' production to defendants' counsel. Process plaintiffs' production to Michael Tubach at O'Melveny & Myers, LLP. Communicate with Litigation Support and Word Processing regarding CD copying. Communicate with TERIS regarding defendants' production of documents.	4.50	
06/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents.	4.50	
06/09/12	JONES, KAREN	Review of background materials and review of plaintiff Mike Devine's documents for production.	1.00	
06/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Intel non-competes and email with D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
06/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents, manage document review; email with K. Dermody re Intel.	6.50	
06/10/12	JONES, KAREN	Review of background materials and learn database in preparation for review of plaintiff Mike Devine's documents for production.	3.00	
06/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review plaintiff documents.	2.70	
06/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with A. Shaver re data depositions; email with D. Harvey re document review.	0.30	
06/11/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Review Judge Koh's class certifications and denials for memo re same.	5.00	
06/11/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit code form.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Conduct document review in preparation for production of plaintiffs' documents.	1.00	
06/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; research motion to strike affirmative defenses; research data issues, conference with co-counsel and experts re same; conference with client re document collection; email with K. Dermody re document review.	12.50	
06/11/12	JONES, KAREN	Review of plaintiff Mike Devine's documents for production.	12.00	
06/11/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Generate and label multiple data production disks.	0.60	
06/11/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
06/11/12	RAYHILL, KEVIN	Review plaintiffs' documents for responsiveness to defendants' request for production.	8.00	
06/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re deadline for motion to strike; conference call with plaintiff document review team; conference with K. Dermody re depositions; emails to defendants re deposition dates; review letter from Intel re dates and emails with Dan Walker re same; review plaintiff documents.	4.80	
06/11/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence, hearing transcripts and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare copies of defendants' document productions and send to TERIS and Econ One. Prepare request form for hearing transcript. Review contents of the defendants' productions and update production logs.	3.00	
06/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conferences with team re answers and amendments; emails re Lucasfilm discovery; edit document coding sheet; conference with A. Shaver re overtime data; get updates on all production.	3.00	
06/12/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Call from D. Harvey re plaintiffs' hard copy document production and follow up re same.	0.50	
06/12/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with D. Harvey and TERIS re plaintiffs' additional document production.	0.50	
06/12/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Review class certifications and denials; draft memo re Judge Koh's class certifications.	5.00	
06/12/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with court re document review coding.	0.20	
06/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Conduct document review in preparation for production of plaintiffs' documents.	2.50	
06/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; collect client documents; conference with client re discovery issues; conference with defense counsel re data productions and affirmative defenses, research same; review memo re class certification issues, conference with K. Epstein re same; confer with K. Dermody re answers.	9.50	
06/12/12	JONES, KAREN	Review of plaintiff Mike Devine's documents for production.	11.00	
06/12/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create production disks to accommodate necessary changes and label.	0.70	
06/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; telephone conferences re document review.	8.00	
06/12/12	RAYHILL, KEVIN	Review plaintiffs' documents for responsiveness to defendants' request for production.	8.00	
06/12/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Pixar re overtime data and affirmative defenses; conference call with Intuit re 30(b)(6) and interrogatory responses; conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re same; review plaintiff documents; emails with deposition team re deposition scheduling; telephone conference with Cindy Harris re data issues; emails re Lucasfilm discovery.	3.90	
06/12/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence, electronic court filing, and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare a letter to defense counsel for the plaintiffs' replacement production CD. Review the contents of the defendants' document production and update the production log. Locate Magistrate Judge Paul Grewal's standing order for A. Shaver.	3.50	
06/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re multiple data issues, discovery; conferences with D. Harvey re document review and findings; hot documents assignments.	2.50	
06/13/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Class certification strategy research for K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	7.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/13/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read data production letters.	0.40	
06/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with client re document collection and discovery issues; conference with K. Epstein re class certification research, review same; conference with defense counsel re production issues; revise stipulation re affirmative defenses; review correspondence; conference with K. Dermody re various document review issues.	8.50	
06/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review of defendants' documents.	7.50	
06/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with document review team re Michael Devine document issues; review Pixar letter re overtime data; review proposed D. Harvey declaration.	1.50	
06/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Organize defendants' production disks.	1.30	
06/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit notice re discovery; multiple conferences with LCHB team re discovery efforts; email with cocounsel re privilege log; review stipulation re amended answers and conference re same; review coding sheet and assignments; call with experts.	3.00	
06/14/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on plaintiffs' second production.	0.50	
06/14/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Confer with K. Dermody re research; work on memo re class certification brief for K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	7.00	
06/14/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiffs' counsel conference call with experts re class certification data analysis; conference with K. Dermody.	0.70	
06/14/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/14/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails to defendants re deposition schedule; confer with K. Dermody; emails with deposition team re logistics; review.	0.50	
06/14/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Review the production log and gather the bates range for D. Harvey. Communicate with Word Processing regarding defendants' production CD copying.	1.00	
06/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit report to court re discovery and declaration re same; telephone call with D. Harvey and emails with D. Harvey re same; multiple emails re discovery status.	1.50	
06/15/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Class certification memo for K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	4.00	
06/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Preparation for document review and discovery follow-up.	3.00	
06/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review emails regarding discovery sent by D. Harvey, K. Dermody, and B. Glackin.	0.20	
06/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise production of documents; draft notices of compliance and declaration in support, research same, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with A. Shaver and co-counsel re 30(b)(6) data depositions.	6.20	
06/15/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create and label multiple document production disks.	0.40	
06/15/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Review outgoing document production for accuracy and completeness.	1.00	
06/15/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, Dan Walker and Adam Steinfeld re 30(b)(6) depositions; emails with defendants re scheduling same.	1.20	
06/15/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare plaintiffs' fourth document production and corresponding letter to defense counsel. Update production log. Prepare mailing of defendants' data production to experts. Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Review plaintiffs' productions for the total number.	3.20	
06/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey re staffing depositions.	0.20	
06/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft and circulate amended deposition notices; emails with K. Dermody and E. Fastiff re data depositions.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey re staffing depositions.	0.20	
06/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise draft notice of compliance; manage document review; review document and data productions; review K. Epstein research re class certification issues; email with K. Dermody re depositions.	4.50	
06/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with D. Harvey, Joe Saveri re case management, certificate of compliance; edit notice/declarations; conference with D. Harvey re discovery schedule/assignments; review defendants' compliance certificate and email re same.	2.00	
06/18/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Call from D. Harvey re plaintiffs' production and sizes of different productions; review production disks for response.	1.00	
06/18/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Class certification memo for D. Harvey.	8.00	
06/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet with D. Harvey to discuss next steps in the case.	0.30	
06/18/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis of electronic discovery.	2.00	
06/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise notice of compliance; manage document review; review documents; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; conference with clients re compensation issues; confer with K. Dermody re discovery tasks.	9.50	
06/18/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review of defendants' post-Department of Justice productions.	7.50	
06/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review additional defendant subpoenas.	0.20	
06/18/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, and production files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Review the contents of the defendants' productions and update the production log. Communicate with experts regarding the productions. Review plaintiffs' production and forward the number of documents and page numbers that were produced to the defendants to D. Harvey.	3.40	
06/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with Michael Tubach re settlement issues; conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; emails/calls with team re various data and discovery issues, including non-exempt employees; review objections of defendants to 30(b)(6) data deposition notices and conference with D. Harvey re same.	2.00	
06/19/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Call from D. Harvey re court reporters for case; conference call with agency; arrange for reporters for upcoming depositions; analyze document production by defendants for D. Harvey; coordinate setup of deposition repository and access.	3.00	
06/19/12	EPSTEIN, KATE	Memo for D. Harvey re class certification issues.	7.00	
06/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' answers and pull out relevant admissions.	2.00	
06/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review memo re class certification issue, conference with K. Epstein re same; conference with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re outstanding discovery issues; conference with vendor re document review, manage same; conference with J. Forderer re merits research; research and draft summary of deposition plan; correspond with defendants re data and document issues.	7.20	
06/19/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Prepare document production disks and ship to co-counsel.	0.50	
06/19/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review of defendants' post-Department of Justice productions.	7.50	
06/19/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re Apple settlement position; negotiate deposition logistics with defendants, co-counsel and Litigation Support; telephone conference with Econ One re data outlines and support; review of Lucasfilm overtime data; review merits deposition list and coding protocol; conference call with Google re objections to deposition notice.	5.30	
06/19/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare binders containing discovery responses, initial disclosures, and answers to the complaint for K. Dermody and D. Harvey. Orgaize electronic court filing, production, and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare a letter to a defense counsel enclosing the bad production disk. Prepare production disks for the vendor's database.	2.40	
06/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re cold calling depositions and data issues (x5); emails with LCHB team re discovery.	1.00	
06/20/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Meeting with court reporter and D. Harvey re live remote feed and setup and continuing reporting.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/20/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	0.20	
06/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting about how to code defendants' documents led by D. Harvey.	0.60	
06/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition of Lucasfilm.	1.50	
06/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review and code defendants' document production.	1.00	
06/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' answers and pull out relevant admissions.	1.00	
06/20/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Pepare e-discovery materials. Prepare for transmission of e-discovery materials.	6.00	
06/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues, data, and 30(b)(6) depositions; prepare for deposition of Lucasfilm, review data re same, conference with experts re same; conferences with court reporter re depositions; conferences with K. Dermody re case status; conduct document review meeting; review documents.	9.80	
06/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call re reviewing protocol for defendants' documents; conference call with D. Harvey and co-counsel re Lucasfilm deposition outline; emails with team re Adobe non-exempt titles; arrange court reporter and deposition logistics; review letter from Google; emails with D. Harvey re interrogatory verification.	3.10	
06/20/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Prepare mailing of the production to experts. Search and prepare deposition exhibits related to Lucasfilm, Ltd.	4.50	
06/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Team conference call re expert work; many conversations with D. Harvey re data, discovery; email Joe Saveri re Apple's settlement overture; emails/calls with deposition vendors re deposition costs.	2.80	
06/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	30(b)(6) deposition at Lucasfilm.	1.00	
06/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Conference re 30(b)(6) with A. Shaver and D. Harvey.	0.50	
06/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare 30(b)(6) deposition of Lucasfilm.	0.50	
06/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition of Pixar.	2.50	
06/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Weekly experts conference call.	1.00	
06/21/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Lucasfilm 30(b)(6) deposition, take same, conference with J. Forderer and Kevin Rayhill re same; prepare for Pixar 30(b)(6) deposition	9.60	
06/21/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Pete Barille and Adam Steinfeld re Adobe and Intuit deposition; call with D. Harvey and Apple re deposition; serve interrogatory verifications; team conference call with experts; circulate deposition documents to team; call with re data questionnaires; email with Google re objections negotiations.	4.10	
06/21/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Further prepare exhibit for Lucasfilm, Ltd.'s deposition. Review and search for data-related correspondence to and from the defendants, Adobe and Intuit. Prepare certificate of service for plaintiffs' verification to responses to defendants' first interrogatories. prepare a letter to expert enclosing data production. Further review contents of the defendants' production and update production log. Prepare exhibits to Pixar's deposition.	5.30	
06/22/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to calls/emails re document review, deposition strategy with LCHB team; meeting with D. Harvey, A. Shaver re status, depositions.	2.00	
06/22/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	30(b)(6) deposition at Pixar.	4.50	
06/22/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter re deposition of Pixar.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/22/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letters to opposing counsel re deposition of Pixar.	1.50	
06/22/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Read transcript of Lucasfilm 30(b)(6) deposition for follow up.	0.50	
06/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and take Pixar deposition; confer with K. Dermody, A. Shaver; conference with clients re deposition question; review and revise letter re Pixar deposition; manage document review; conference with document vendor; research future 30(b)(6) depositions; conference with experts re overtime issues; draft letter to Lucasfilm re deposition; research privilege issues.	8.70	
06/22/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; evidence consultation with co-counsel.	7.00	
06/22/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with D. Harvey and call with Dan Walker re deposition results; review defendant documents and team emails re coding issues; draft and serve amended deposition notices; pull exhibits for Intuit deposition; meeting with K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	3.30	
06/22/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare certificate of service for amended deposition notice to the defendants and mailing. Search and print coded documents from the CaseMap.	1.90	
06/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email to D. Harvey re Lucasfilm letter.	0.10	
06/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review defendant documents; review data materials.	1.00	
06/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with D. Harvey re data, discovery; emails re privileged material; email Joe Saveri re Apple's call to me re settlement.	1.00	
06/25/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition.	4.50	
06/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter re Lucasfilm 30(b)(6) deposition.	1.00	
06/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition of Apple.	3.50	
06/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' answer for pertinent admissions.	0.50	
06/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Confer with K. Dermody re discovery; manage document review; review documents; draft correspondence; conference with experts re class certification; research 30(b)(6) depositions, correspond and conference with co-counsel re same.	7.20	
06/25/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Create access accounts for co-counsel reviewers and update user index.	0.20	
06/25/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Interview Brandon Marshall re conference with J. Forderer re Apple deposition; call with Christina Brown re same; review Intuit deposition exhibits; review Adobe data questionnaire and emails re same with deposition team; emails re Lucasfilm clawback; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same; review defendant documents.	3.30	
06/25/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare exhibits for the deposition of Intuit, Inc. and Apple, Inc. Prepare a letter to Catherine Zeng enclosing third party production. Search and print coded documents from the CaseMap.	4.40	
06/26/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re discovery issues; review challenged Lucasfilm document and proposed redacted document; conference with E. Fastiff re 30(b)(6) deposition; email Joe Saveri and Eric Cramer re Apple's settlement overture; review data transcripts for discovery report; emails with A. Shaver re deposition vendors.	5.00	
06/26/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on database coding issues reported by A. Shaver.	1.00	
06/26/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for and take first part of Apple 30(b)(6) deposition; read J. Forderer's deposition for themes.	5.00	
06/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Apple 30(b)(6) deposition.	2.00	
06/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition.	1.30	
06/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition no. 2.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; supervise 30(b)(6) depositions; draft correspondence; conference with experts re class certification issues; research class certification; conference with opposing counsel re discovery issues; research law re clawback requests, conference with vendors re same.	8.20	
06/26/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/26/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Code defendant documents: telephone conference with D. Harvey re coding issue; telephone conference with Dan Stover re and email team re same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re and email Mark Fichtner re porter bids.	6.30	
06/26/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare deposition exhibits for Intuit, Inc. and Apple, Inc. Download coded documents from CaseMap and create a zip file. Forward the coded documents to experts. Prepare binders for experts containing the exhibits from the case management statement.	6.00	
06/26/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Create web access account for experts to view documents located within Summation database.	2.50	
06/27/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with Joe Saveri re settlement overture; email Eric Cramer re Lucasfilm; review preliminary expert analyses and email/conference with D. Harvey re same; telephone call with experts and team.	4.00	
06/27/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff co-counsel telephone conference re discovery and Apple offer; Apple 30(b)(6) deposition; prepare for same.	4.60	
06/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Apple 30(b)(6) deposition no. 2.	3.00	
06/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.50	
06/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition no. 2.	1.00	
06/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re 30(b)(6) depositions and other discovery issues; conference with experts re class certification issues; review draft report from Alan Manning; manage document review; review documents; draft and serve deposition subpoenas; draft discovery status report.	9.40	
06/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
06/27/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with attorney team and experts; conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re next steps with experts; email with Pete Barille re deposition preparation; circulate amended notice of Google deposition.	3.30	
06/27/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare deposition exhibits for Adobe Systems, Inc. Update production log with new information. Review production log chart and prepare a total production number list for D. Harvey. Review data for Apple, Inc. deposition and print for J. Forderer.	2.80	
06/28/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review order re discovery/certification schedule and confer with D. Harvey re same; review hot document re Steve Jobs' knowledge of agreements; email with D. Harvey re hot documents repository; emails with D. Harvey re Google documents; edit draft status report; conference with D. Harvey, A. Shaver re witness depositions, Adobe witness; email with co-counsel re Lucasfilm settlement offer; calls with team re analysis and deadlines; call with Eric Cramer re settlement, experts.	4.00	
06/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Call with Christina Brown re Apple's production.	0.60	
06/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Deal with Apple 30(b)(6) and supplemental production issues.	1.50	
06/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.50	
06/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare information for status report.	0.80	
06/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; draft and revise status report; conference with defendants' counsel re discovery issues, draft and revise correspondence re same; research and draft declaration re class certification; review documents; conference with J. Forderer re privilege log issues; conference with co-counsel re deposition issues.	7.40	
06/28/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/28/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull declarations for D. Harvey as examples; code defendant documents; arrange named plaintiff deposition schedule; review hot documents from D. Harvey; send files to experts re Google recruiting data; email K. Dermody and D. Harvey re new Adobe witness.	4.90	
06/28/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review and search for Google, Inc's data production, and print for deposition. Organize defendants' productions in a binder and forward the originals to Records. Update the production log with new information. Further update the production page count for D. Harvey. Download Google, Inc's document production from their file-transfer protocol site and forward to experts and vendors. Organize Google, Inc's production from Saveri Law Firm.	6.20	
06/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple meetings with D. Harvey re plaintiffs' status report to court and edit same; email Joe Saveri re deposition order; edit letter to defendants re plaintiff document search; review Google data deposition; confer with E. Fastiff re status report; confer with A. Shaver re scheduling.	5.00	
06/29/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with A. Shaver re reporter costs; calls from D. Harvey re Lucasfilm custodian names and production list; query database to prepare list.	1.00	
06/29/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit status report and conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re same.	1.20	
06/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Address Apple's pending supplemental production with D. Harvey and Christina Brown.	0.50	
06/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to all defendants re production.	0.50	
06/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Christina Brown re Apple's production.	0.90	
06/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log.	0.30	
06/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise status report and exhibit, conference with team and co-counsel re same; meetings with K. Dermody re discovery updates; conference with defendants' counsel re discovery issues; conference with vendor re document hosting issues; conference with Dan Walker re Google deposition; review documents; manage document review.	8.50	
06/29/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.00	
06/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review status report and email feedback to D. Harvey; create chart for Exhibit A; telephone conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re scheduling for report; document review and coding; telephone conference with D. Harvey re named plaintiff deposition scheduling; emails with Google and J. Forderer re recruiting data deposition.	5.00	
06/29/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare further exhibits for David Walker for Google, Inc's deposition. Review and verify page counts and percentages on the plaintiffs' state report regarding review of documents and data. Update production logs and defendants' production disks. Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same.	2.40	
06/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to D. Harvey re case management.	0.20	
07/02/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search civil and local rules on privilege logs.	0.70	
07/02/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference call with LCHB team and experts re analysis; review court order re schedule and conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; email Kevin Rayhill re J. Saveri request on letterhead; review draft expert report and make notes re same; email D. Harvey re questions about analysis; email with D. Harvey re supplementing interrogatory responses.	5.80	
07/02/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Prepare for and arrange for A. Shaver and J. Forderer to access e-discovery review.	2.00	
07/02/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel conference call with experts; read court order re class certification schedule.	0.30	
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Call with expert and	1.00	
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.70	
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Follow up on certain 30(b)(6) depositions.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re planning future tasks.	0.80	
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log.	1.20	
07/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review draft expert report.	1.00	
07/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft of Edward Learner report; conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.10	
07/02/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis of database. Optical character recognition of database documents. Implementation of new documents for use with database.	6.00	
07/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with team re outstanding tasks; review expert analysis, conference with team re same; draft correspondence re discovery to defendants; calls, meeting with K. Dermody re data, analysis.	7.50	
07/02/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Attend meeting to discuss protocol for entering information into CaseMap.	1.20	
07/02/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey and J. Forderer re tasks; review Edward Leamer report; conference call with attorney team and experts; meeting with Litigation Support on CaseVault; recalculate schedule for court; emails with Mike Devine redocument review; confer with K. Dermody re task scheduling.	7.70	
07/02/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing, correspondence, discovery, and deposition transcript files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update production log and production binder. Communicate with Word Processing regarding disks copying.	4.00	
07/02/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Provide search support session to remote users of CaseMap program.	1.50	
07/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails/calls with D. Harvey re case management assignments, experts and schedule; email Joe Saveri re schedule; telephone conference with J. Forderer re privilege; email with J. Forderer re Google documents; telephone conference with E. Fastiff re Edward Leamer/experts.	1.80	
07/03/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Arrange Citrix access for specific spec	2.50	
07/03/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Arrange remote access to Summation Department of Justice production database for experts at team re document access.	2.00	
07/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Call with Kevin Rayhill re letters.	0.20	
07/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production and confer with K. Dermody re Google.	1.50	
07/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log and confer with K. Dermody re same.	6.00	
07/03/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Continue with optical character recognition process of documents. Prepare optical character recognition versions. Quality control of optical character recognition documents.	5.00	
07/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; review and revise K. Epstein memo re class certification issues; manage document review; correspond with expert; conference with defense attorneys and draft letter re same; review expert drafts; conference with A. Shaver re expert work; conference with J. Forderer re privilege logs; correspond with co-counsel re case schedule, conference with K. Dermody re same.	6.50	
07/03/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Advise document reviewers re database access.	1.50	
07/03/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review documents; conference with D. Harvey re same; review follow-up data deposition emails from co-counsel.	6.90	
07/03/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence, production, deposition transcript and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email PDF copies to attorneys, and Records. Organize defendants' production disks.	1.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/03/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Create access for WebBlaze program for remote users to access database. Advise new users re Summation database questions.	3.00	
07/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review amended answers from defendants and email re same; review analysis re software engineers and email E. Fastiff, B. Glackin re same; emails with Joe Saveri re schedule; email Lisa Leebove re case management; email with R. Heimann re trial schedule; email Joe Saveri re cost fund/contributions required from his firm; review Lucasfilm letter and edit response to same.	5.00	
07/05/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read correspondence; review analysis chart.	0.30	
07/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letters to Google and Intel re 30(b)(6) depositions.	1.40	
07/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log.	5.50	
07/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise privilege log, conference with J. Forderer re same; review expert work; draft, revise, and serve letter to Lucasfilm re discovery from George Lucas; correspond with co-counsel re discovery and case schedule; review documents; manage document review.	4.50	
07/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Email Mark Fichtner reasonables; review defendant documents; review correspondence; telephone conference with J. Forderer re 30(b)(6) deposition coverage; telephone conference with D. Harvey re expert log and email S. Shin re same.	2.00	
07/05/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search documents listed on the privilege logs prepared by J. Forderer. Prepare documents with bates labels. Search for specific hot documents and send to experts. Prepare a new log for documents sent to experts.	3.00	
07/06/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone call with LCHB team, experts re analysis; email Joe Saveri re schedule; confer with D. Harvey re privilege log and document review; emails with Joshua Davis and D. Harvey re Palm declaration and edit same; telephone call with B. Glackin re Edward Leamer; emails with Accounting and Joe Saveri re cost fund and review vendor invoices and contracts re same; confer with D. Harvey re expert analysis and follow-up.	4.50	
07/06/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference call with experts; review graphs and analysis.	0.50	
07/06/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read correspondence.	0.30	
07/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with experts, and review materials for follow up.	1.80	
07/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log.	5.30	
07/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review expert materials.	0.50	
07/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone call with K. Dermody re expert issue.	0.40	
07/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues, research same; conference with K. Epstein re class certification research, review memo re same; conference with defendants' lawyers re discovery issues; draft and serve correspondence re case schedule, conference with co-counsel re same; revise draft declaration re class certification issues.	6.50	
07/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Econ One analysis; conference call with experts; follow-up emails with attorney team; review and code defendant documents; review Palm declaration.	5.30	
07/06/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search for documents in CaseMap and forward them to D. Harvey and J. Forderer. Further organize production disks. Update production log.	2.00	
07/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re witness depositions; email Joe Saveri re meetings; email Lisa Leebove re case management; email D. Harvey and Joshua Davis re Palm declaration.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with defense counsel re depositions and other discovery issues; manage document review; correspond with co-counsel; review documents; emails with K. Dermody re depositions.	1.80	
07/09/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls/email with team and defense counsel re stipulation on case management; telephone call with team re Palm witness and assignments; many calls with Lisa Leebove re case management schedule and assignments and memo re same.	6.00	
07/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	CaseMap reorganization.	0.50	
07/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare privilege log and redact documents.	2.00	
07/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Team call re Palm declaration and litigation schedule.	1.00	
07/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re Lori McAdams deposition; review expert topics.	1.60	
07/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	2.70	
07/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition (review Department of Justice submission).	0.90	
07/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Alan Manning draft report; Dennis Carlton submission; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.80	
07/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re schedule, Ed Colligan (partial).	0.70	
07/09/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion and preparation for new electronic discovery production for use with Summation database.	1.50	
07/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; conference with defendants' counsel re document production issues, depositions, and other issues; draft and revise stipulation re case schedule, conference with co-counsel and defense counsel re same, e-file same; prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	9.20	
07/09/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Assist database users re searches and review.	0.70	
07/09/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.00	
07/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attorney call re Ed Colligan declaration and schedule; conference with D. Harvey and J. Forderer re CaseMap; email plaintiffs re schedule; review and code documents; team emails re expert task list; emails re deposition logistics for Google and Apple 30(b)(6)s.	5.00	
07/09/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update CaseMap with new documents and dates in the fact sections. Review contents of the defendants' production and update production log. Search for cover letters for the defendants' productions. Communicate with K. Dugar regarding CaseMap upload.	3.40	
07/09/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Provide access to CaseMap database to new users of program. Advise users of CaseMap database re review access issues.	2.50	
07/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Pixar/Apple agreements; review Case Management Order and email R. Heimann re trial dates; emails with D. Harvey re merits depositions, and analysis re same.	1.00	
07/10/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on reviewer access from TERIS Relativity.	1.00	
07/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	0.80	
07/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft privilege log.	2.50	
07/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting re CaseMap with D. Harvey and A. Shaver.	0.40	
07/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for 30(b)(6) Apple deposition.	1.40	
07/10/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	4.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with team re CaseMap strategy; prepare for Lori McAdams deposition; review draft privilege logs, conference with J. Forderer re same; correspond with defendants re deposition dates; emails with K. Dermody re Pixar and Apple.	6.80	
07/10/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and code defendant documents; conference with D. Harvey and J. Forderer re CaseMap; conference with K. Dugar re same; call with D. Harvey re hot documents; emails with TERIS re access issue.	5.00	
07/10/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Attend meeting with B. Glackin regarding deposition preparation. Prepare defendants, Apple Inc.'s and Pixar's deposition exhibits and binders for B. Glackin and J. Forderer.	3.20	
07/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re Pixar documents; email team re privilege logs; LCHB team meeting re experts.	2.50	
07/11/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meet with J. Forderer and D. Harvey re CaseMap document access. Access documents on Relativity.	2.50	
07/11/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents and emails into i-Manage and P:/ drive. Prepare documents for J. Forderer. Log CDs, send to TERIS, and update production log. Read documents.	4.10	
07/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.00	
07/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting regarding CaseMap documents.	1.50	
07/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for 30(b)(6) Apple deposition.	0.50	
07/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Privilege log work.	0.80	
07/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert call.	1.40	
07/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	4.50	
07/11/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare CaseMap instruction guide for use with High Tech Cold Calling CaseMap database.	6.00	
07/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re data work; conference with defendants re privilege issues; review privilege log, conference with J. Forderer re same; manage document review; review documents; attend CaseMap meeting; prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition, conference with J. Forderer re same.	8.20	
07/11/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Troubleshoot database access problems.	0.80	
07/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with experts and all attorneys; meeting with D. Harvey and J. Forderer re CaseMap.	4.00	
07/11/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize electronic court filing and correspondence files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Search for defendants' document productions for J. Forderer and D. Harvey. Attend meeting with J. Forderer and D. Harvey regarding CaseMap.	3.40	
07/11/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Attend meeting re CaseMap. Prepare materials re CaseMap.	3.00	
07/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails and conference with B. Glackin re George Lucas; conference with D. Harvey re employee subpoenas; email with Eric Cramer re merits depositions; review Apple data transcript re recruiting database; conference with D. Harvey re Google documents; telephone conference with D. Harvey and Palm counsel re declaration; review cost information.	5.00	
07/12/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize multiple documents received via email into i-Manage and the P:/ drive. Log CDs, send out requests for copies, prepare service to go to review P:/ drive and i-Manage to sort through the High Tech document list.	4.40	
07/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Apple 30(b)(6) deposition.	2.30	
07/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	0.70	
07/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Apple re 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.50	
07/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Google 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.80	
07/12/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey; telephone conference with Dr. Alan Manning; confer with K. Dermody re Lucas.	1.20	
07/12/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise Lori McAdams deposition outline.	1.20	
07/12/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion of documents for use with Summation database. Update and upload records into Summation database.	6.00	
07/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Apple 30(b)(6) deposition, take same, review and revise letter re same; conference with K. Dermody and Ed Colligan's counsel re discovery issues; manage document review; prepare for Lori McAdams depositions, conference with B. Glackin re same; draft correspondence re document issues; conference with expert; confer with K. Dermody re subpoenas, Google.	8.50	
07/12/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Process documents received from vendor database for loading into local Summation.	2.50	
07/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/12/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Create hot documents folder; conference with J. Forderer re Google deposition; emails to correspondence for same; email team re Kramm court reporters; call re Relativity; review documents for market surveys and create list of same.	5.90	
07/12/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare documents and exhibits for deposition of Apple, Inc. and Pixar. Prepare binders for K. Dermody and B. Glackin. Organize correspondence and discovery files in P:/ drive and iManage, and email attorneys re same. Update the index for Pixar's potential deposition exhibit for B. Glackin. Download Pixar's and Lucasfilm, Ltd's documents prepared by TERIS and prepare them for review.	3.20	
07/12/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Convert documents into PDF format.	1.50	
07/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re privileged documents; review Pixar emails re same.	0.50	
07/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review with S. Shin re case task. Go over deposition preparation list, sending out data, adding documents to CT Summation and CaseMap.	1.00	
07/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Sort incoming files from email, log transcripts, log and help create copies of CD data coming in, prepare slip sheets for a deposition for D. Harvey, update production log and sign a protective order for the case.	4.20	
07/13/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Google 30(b)(6) deposition.	2.00	
07/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; conference with defense counsel re depositions and other discovery issues; conference with team re discovery issues; email with K. Dermody re privileged documents.	3.80	
07/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review new Google production; email Brandon Marshall re conference with D. Harvey re Google deposition; pull sample transcripts for same.	3.00	
07/13/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare Pixar's deposition documents provided by TERIS. Prepare binders for Pixar's deposition exhibits. Prepare service of plaintiffs' fifth document production. Download documents from CT Summation for the deposition exhibits.	2.80	
07/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Eric Cramer's memo re class definitions and email team re same; email D. Harvey re same and documents.	0.50	
07/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Eric Cramer memo re class certification issues and email from K. Dermody re same; review defendants' correspondence; manage document review.	2.50	
07/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Read transcript of Google deposition on compensation data for themes; draft deposition outline; email Econ One questions on exhibits; email paralegals re pulling exhibits; review recruiting data correspondence with Google.	4.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re discovery issues and defense letters; email D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Ed Colligan.	0.30	
07/16/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with vendor re export of coded documents.	0.50	
07/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Finalize letter to Apple re 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.30	
07/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Finalize privilege log.	1.00	
07/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research on deficiencies in Intel and Google's production; prepare to follow up with opposing counsel.	0.50	
07/16/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Colligan's counsel; conference with D. Harvey re same; email K. Dermody re same.	0.50	
07/16/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with re damage, model, Alan Manning report; conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
07/16/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare electronic discovery productions.	0.50	
07/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; revise CaseMap database; conference with expert re class certification issues; review and revise correspondence; conference with non-party counsel re class certification discovery; revise deposition notice; emails with K. Dermody re discovery.	8.50	
07/16/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Edit production disk for production.	1.30	
07/16/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for Google deposition; call with transcript; revise deposition outline.	5.50	
07/16/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Prepare exhibits and binders for Google Inc.'s deposition. Prepare a proof of service and a second amended deposition notice to Lori McAdams. Organize labels. Communicate with Litigation Support regarding plaintiffs' productions.	2.50	
07/17/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing documents into P:/ drive and i-Manage, forward them to attorneys and Records, save various correspondence emails and send them to Records. Prepare CD productions for Adobe, Intuit, and Lucasfilm for reviewers and TERIS.	2.00	
07/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Code documents in CaseMap.	0.90	
07/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Follow up with Sujal Shah about supplemental Intel production.	0.30	
07/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Update CaseMap procedure with D. Harvey and A. Shaver.	1.20	
07/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Weekly document review call with D. Harvey.	0.50	
07/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review with reviewer call; Prepare J. Forderer and A. Shaver re Casemap; review CaseMap database; conference with defense counsel re depositions.	6.20	
07/17/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Update production index.	0.30	
07/17/12	RATNER, DALE	Reviewer conference call; document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey and J. Forderer re CaseMap; emails with same re coding.	0.20	
07/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re assignments, experts; email Lisa Leebove re same; email team re vendors; emails re expert reports.	1.50	
07/18/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize and upload various electronic court filing notices, emails, and letters to i-Manage and P:/ drive, send to Records and Calendar. Organize CaseMap P:/ drive for D. Harvey, put in all 'hot documents' from CaseMap to P:/ drive. Add all authors and recipients into CaseMap for all 'hot' emails for J. Forderer. Make a copy of incoming production from Apple, send to TERIS, and log in databae. Review CD productions and sort into binder.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	3.50	
07/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Organize and code documents in CaseMap.	2.50	
07/18/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re expert tasks; memo to K. Dermody re same.	0.80	
07/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with defense counsel re supplementing interrogatory responses, research same; conference with K. Dermody re case status; conference with Lisa Leebove re document review status; revise CaseMap summary.	6.20	
07/18/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create new Summation database for key documents.	1.80	
07/18/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Replace documents according to defendants' clawback request.	0.80	
07/18/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; research into Human Resources terminology.	7.50	
07/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Coding emails with J. Forderer and D. Harvey.	0.20	
07/18/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Organize documents and boxes for the Pixar's and Lori McAdams' deposition. Upload and review documents in the CaseMap. Update correspondence files. Review uploaded files and enter authors and recipients in CaseMap.	4.30	
07/18/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Replace and remove clawback documents on production disks. Prepare production disk to be sent to co-counsel.	2.50	
07/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re document review; Telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re settlement idea; draft letter to George Lucas re same.	0.80	
07/19/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming electronic court filing notices, emails, and letters. Input data for Apple production into production log. Prepare e-Bay correspondence for J. Forderer. Prepare documents for A. Shaver in P:/ drive and i-Manage.	2.30	
07/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.30	
07/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; conference with co-counsel re document review tasks; correspond with defendants re document production issues; conference with experts re class certification progress; conference with K. Dermody re case status.	3.90	
07/19/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Assist database user to access e-document.	1.00	
07/19/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Edit load file and load documents to Summation database.	1.50	
07/19/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/19/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and code CaseMap documents; draft and serve letter to Google; email with re deposition schedule.	3.40	
07/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re Ed Colligan; conference with A. Shaver re plaintiff questions; email R. Heimann re trial date; email Lisa Leebove re George Lucas; internet research re George Lucas.	2.00	
07/20/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming emails, letters, and electronic court filing notices on P:/ drive and i-Manage. Load incoming production from Apple, Intuit, and Intel into production log and send originals to TERIS. Pull audio files from Relativity through contacting TERIS for documents in Intel. Prepare Zynga files and send to TERIS to upload to Relativity.	2.50	
07/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	2.80	
07/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re Intel production.	0.20	
07/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; revise draft declaration, conference with counsel re same; manage document review.	3.20	
07/20/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Edit load files and import key records to local Summation database for expedited searching and printing.	2.00	
07/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	CaseMap document review; edit Kevin Rayhill letter to Adobe.	5.10	
07/20/12	SHIN, STEVEN	Review documents from Relativity database and prepare a chart differentiating different types of productions produced by the defendants for D. Harvey.	4.20	
07/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Lisa Leebove's edits to Palm declaration and email D. Harvey re same; edit declaration.	0.50	
07/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to D. Harvey re discovery; emails to team re related wage case.	0.50	
07/23/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming documents and correspondence for team.	1.00	
07/23/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	4.30	
07/23/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and code documents in CaseMap.	5.20	
07/24/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review hot documents; emails with team re experts; emails to Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove re strategy for George Lucas settlement; emails with D. Harvey re expert report; email Lisa Leebove re case management; conference with D. Harvey re staffing/assignments/task list.	3.50	
07/24/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review incoming redacted productions from Pixar and compare to originals. Create notes and forward to D. Harvey for review. Prepare production for TERIS. Prepare files for D. Harvey, and send to him for review. Prepare Adobe file, code, import to CaseMap, and P:/ drive.	1.00	
07/24/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	1.40	
07/24/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Weekly call led by D. Harvey re document review.	0.50	
07/24/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with WebEx meeting re doc review. Attend webex meeting and answer questions regarding e-discovery database.	3.50	
07/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; revise CaseMap report, circulate same; conference with Palm counsel re declaration; conference with co-counsel re case status; conference with Alan Manning re class certification report; conference with client re deposition schedule; meeting with K. Dermody re task list; email K. Dermody re experts.	9.10	
07/24/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attorney conference call on document review; review and code CaseMap documents.	3.50	
07/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with D. Harvey, B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, Lisa Leebove re case; multiple emails re class definition; review expert's revised opinion and notes re same; many emails re various aspects of analysis; confer with D. Harvey on class definition.	3.00	
07/25/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Add a document to CaseMap and code according to instructions from D. Harvey. Update document in the P:/ drive. Research documents with problems for D. Ratner and D. Harvey: review the original copies from the disk copies we have. Update incoming correspondence into the P:/ drive and Records.	1.50	
07/25/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with TERIS re key documents export; call to D. Harvey.	0.50	
07/25/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, D. Harvey and Lisa Leebove re class definition, class certification briefing and discovery.	1.10	
07/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	3.90	
07/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference D. Harvey re case issues.	0.50	
07/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with D. Harvey re class certification; review D. Harvey memo re class certification.	0.80	
07/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with K. Dermody, E. Fastiff, and D. Harvey re class definition.	1.90	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with LCHB co-counsel re class certification issues and other outstanding tasks; review revised class certification expert report; review documents; manage document review; correspond with defendants re outstanding data issues.	10.50	
07/25/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/26/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review redline expert report and memos re class issues; attend conference call with team re same; emails with team re same; email John Keker re meeting on potential Lucas settlement; edit letter re missing data.	3.00	
07/26/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research for D. Harvey - all transcripts of the latest defendant privilege logs from the P:/ drive, pull out Michael Devine company names from subpoena documents in the P:/ drive, Intel's latest production. Make a folder on the file-transfer protocol site for all final deposition transcripts and exhibits then email documents for D. Ratner; look at original disk re missing documents.	2.00	
07/26/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Eric Cramer's analysis of Edward Leaner report; conference call with plaintiff counsel re same; research conspiracy law.	2.10	
07/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to all defendants re their data production, gaps and questions.	5.50	
07/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' privilege logs.	1.00	
07/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' production of documents.	0.20	
07/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re expert reports.	2.00	
07/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review privilege logs; manage document review; review documents; conference with co-counsel re class certification issues; conference with B. Glackin re class definition issues; correspond with expert and expert team re data gaps; review and revise letters to defense counsel re data gaps.	7.20	
07/26/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/27/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re discovery, missing data; prepare for depositions.	2.50	
07/27/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review data production for Intel and make sure TERIS has all the newest data. Prepare latest Adobe production for TERIS. Input new production into i-Manage production log document. Email D. Harvey re privilege logs, help D. Ratner locate Adobe documents, and organize correspondence on P:/ drive and i-Manage.	2.00	
07/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' privilege logs.	2.90	
07/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' production of documents.	0.50	
07/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; conference with co-counsel re document review and class certification issues; review and revise Eric Cramer's memo, correspond with team re same; manage document review.	4.50	
07/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
07/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Palm declaration; email Lisa Leebove re necessary Saveri firm cost contribution; email with D. Harvey re depositions; emails re missing data.	0.50	
07/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Call with co-counsel re class certification report and class definition issues, prepare for same, research same; review and revise Lori McAdams deposition outline.	2.50	
07/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review expert report outline and email team re same; emails with Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey re Palm declaration; review privilege log issues and advise J. Forderer re same.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review incoming correspondence and organize on P:/ drive and i-Manage, forward to Records. Identify Adobe documents for D. Harvey from Relativity and upload Lucasfilm documents to CaseMap. Print out all of defendant Zynga's production for D. Harvey. Work with M. Mugrage to coordinate project for D. Harvey. Organize all hot documents and documents coded as class certification for deposition this week and for the visiting attorney coming tomorrow. Find Apple-post Department of Justice documents and organize them for the visiting attorney. Contact Litigation Support to create a CD with copies of all the documents produced for Michael Devine. Update production log with new password to access Adobe production and organize the latest Pixar production for Records.	3.50	
07/30/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review and follow up on hosting vendor issues; meet with M. Mugrage re internal key documents database setup; follow up on requests from D. Harvey re documents and deposition setup for video exhibits.	1.50	
07/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	0.80	
07/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' privilege logs; confer with K. Dermody re logs.	2.30	
07/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memo to K. Dermody re damages.	0.30	
07/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with experts; read expert report drafts.	3.10	
07/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise Lori McAdams deposition outline; conference with expert staff and co-counsel; review documents; manage document review; prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	7.70	
07/30/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Convert client documents to image format, write to CD and produce.	1.30	
07/30/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Edit load files and load three web-based database exports into local review database for access.	3.00	
07/30/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Edit load files for key documents database update.	1.20	
07/30/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
07/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with David Kiernan re deposition scheduling; emails with Mark Fichtner re same.	0.30	
07/31/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review with D. Ratner; tagging documents.	4.00	
07/31/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Meet with D. Harvey and D. Ratner to discuss case assignment.	1.00	
07/31/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with D. Harvey re depositions, documents and privilege logs; calls to Brad Smith re Palm; conference re Palm declaration; confer with D. Harvey re Ed Colligan follow-up; meeting with A. Shaver re class certification drafting, plaintiff depositions and privilege logs.	1.50	
07/31/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming electronic court filing notices and correspondence to P:/ drive and i-Manage. Work with K. Dugar on Pixar production for D. Harvey to use in deposition with Lori McAdams this Friday. Prepare DVD copies of this Pixar production so it is easy to use during the deposition. Pull Pixar documents for D. Harvey and organize them out. Assist visiting attorney Peter Barile with CaseMap documents, get him defendant documents, scan certain documents for him and send him the amended complaints. Coordinate with M. Mugrage to finish doc retrieval for Jim Morris and Lori McAdams deposition. Help organize documents for Peter Barile. Pull documents, organize folders, and work with Services. Assist B. Glackin with preparing documents for Lori McAdams deposition.	6.50	
07/31/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with team re harnessing key documents for deposition preparation; conference call re CaseMap setup for visiting associate counsel; conference call with court reporter re video and split screen capture of video exhibit and deponent; meeting with D. Harvey re Pixar video files.	3.00	
07/31/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	3.20	
07/31/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis and index of discovery production for hard copy.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/31/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams and Jim Morris depositions; manage document review; review documents; conference with K. Dermody re case status.	10.20	
07/31/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Convert selected documents to PDF format for review.	1.80	
07/31/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Load key documents update into database.	1.00	
07/31/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Prepare documents for depositions and expert review.	3.50	
07/31/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; confer with K. Black re document review assignment.	7.50	
07/31/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re deposition coverage; conference with K. Dermody re case assignments; emails with David Kiernan re deposition scheduling.	1.50	
08/01/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review; tag documents.	7.00	
08/01/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Lori McAdams deposition outline; meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; confer with B. Glackin re deposition strategy; meeting with D. Harvey re Jim Morris deposition exhibits and strategy; prepare for Jim Morris deposition.	4.00	
08/01/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Coordinate with M. Mugrage on organizing CaseMap documents for visiting attorney Peter Barile. Organize chronologically and mark them according to a spreadsheet. Work for D. Harvey and B. Glackin on Lori McAdams and Jim Morris depositions. Put together two binders, add different documents, update the index. Individually mark 45 folders with labels for Lori McAdams deposition and organize documents in folders. Organize documents for Jim Morris deposition and put together binder for D. Harvey. Produce documents to Peter Barile.	7.50	
08/01/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' privilege logs and draft letters to defendants.	3.40	
08/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Lori McAdams deposition.	8.30	
08/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for depositions, conference with B. Glackin and K. Dermody re same; conference with co-counsel re document review projects; manage document review; review documents.	11.20	
08/01/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Print and organize documents marked for review in database.	2.80	
08/01/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/01/12	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Organize CaseMap documents.	3.50	
08/01/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for call with David Kiernan re interrogatories; telephone conference with same; review Google privilege log and edit J. Forderer letter re same; meet with Peter Barille re facts section; emails with team re deposition coverage.	2.90	
08/01/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Convert PDF documents into Excel spreadsheets.	1.50	
08/02/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	High Tech document review; identify relevant documents for D. Harvey for Friday deposition.	8.00	
08/02/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with A. Shaver re Lori McAdams deposition; meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; read Lori McAdams deposition and emails re same; edit privilege log letter; email to J. Saveri and Lisa Leebove re LucasFilm issues; email with A. Shaver re class definitions; review Pixar deposition exhibits.	7.50	
08/02/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Finish Jim Morris deposition binder for D. Harvey. Add documents, change index. Create folders with labels corresponding to the index. Produce other CaseMap documents to visiting co-counsel Peter Barile.	4.00	
08/02/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on document needs from D. Harvey and Econ One.	1.00	
08/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Pull rules on perjury at depositions and penalties for attorneys in light of defendant testimony.	0.50	
08/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Retrieve documents for D. Harvey for deposition.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Send letter to Google re their privilege log.	0.60	
08/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Lori McAdams.	8.90	
08/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and attend Lori McAdams deposition; prepare for Jim Morris deposition.	13.50	
08/02/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Organize documents for depositions and expert review.	2.20	
08/02/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/02/12	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Organize CaseMap documents and prepare them for co-counsel.	6.10	
08/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend deposition of Lori McAdams; research California perjury law; email David Kiernan re deposition dates; emails with Lisa Leebove re same.	7.10	
08/03/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	High Tech document review; tag documents.	8.00	
08/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meet with D. Harvey re deposition; attend Jim Morris deposition; confer with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove, Joe Saveri, John Keker and D. Harvey re Lucasfilm settlement negotiation; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove and D. Harvey re case management and depositions; email Doug Clevenger re cost fund contribution from Saveri firm.	8.50	
08/03/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on deposition of Jim Morris for D. Harvey. Prepare binder, make copies, and prepare folder. Provide D. Harvey with documents as needed for the deposition. Save correspondence to P:/ drive and i-Manage.	4.50	
08/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Assist D. Harvey in getting documents for deposition.	0.50	
08/03/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Maintenance of database. Update user information for use with updated database.	2.00	
08/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and take deposition of Jim Morris; confer with K. Dermody re same and deposition schedule.	10.50	
08/03/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Convert database documents to PDF format for printing.	1.50	
08/03/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.00	
08/04/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
08/06/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	High Tech document review; tag documents.	8.00	
08/06/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices on P:/ drive and i-Manage. Calendar upcoming case events.	1.50	
08/06/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Create a letter and CD to send to Sujal Shah for Intel under D. Harvey's directions. Log in the latest productions of documents and data from Adobe and prepare document production to TERIS. Load 5-7 documents into CaseMap and code them as hot. Finish organizing documents for visiting co-counsel Peter Barile from CaseMap. Create CD of latest document and data production. Verify contents of latest deposition transcript and update missing contents on P:/ drive.	3.60	
08/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Apple's privilege logs.	1.00	
08/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review suspicious redactions in Google's production.	0.50	
08/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Jim Morris deposition.	0.40	
08/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; <u>draft correspo</u> ndence to defense counsel re production issues; conference with Apple counsel re data issues; conference with re expert report; confer with B. Glackin re Jim Morris.	5.20	
08/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft second supplemental interrogatory responses; emails with defendants re same; review attorney memos on class definition and expert reports; email named plaintiffs re deposition dates; review hot documents on emails.	2.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/07/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	8.00	
08/07/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on P:/ drive and i-Manage, forward to Records. Prepare Adobe CD for Google privilege logs to find matching bates numbers per J. Forderer's instructions. Organize 12 documents on CaseMap, code as hot, and save to P:/ drive. Create CD for A. Shaver with the plaintiffs' first production.	3.00	
08/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Apple's privilege logs and draft letter re same to Christina Brown.	5.00	
08/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google's privilege log and suspicious redactions.	1.80	
08/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Weekly document review call led by D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review, hold reviewer call; review documents; conference with co-counsel re depositions; review and draft correspondence to defense counsel regarding document production issues and depositions.	2.50	
08/07/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/08/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	8.00	
08/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with John Keker, Dan Purcell, J. Saveri, Lisa Leebove re potential Lucas settlement; conference with Lisa Leebove re same; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove, J. Saveri re same; email LCHB re follow-up assignments for mediation.	0.50	
08/08/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Prepare newest Adobe production for Log in returned data from TERIS. Organize documents in CaseMap and code as hot per D. Harvey's directions. Update the production log in i-Manage.	1.00	
08/08/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Document review of defendants' production.	0.50	
08/08/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter re Apple's privilege logs and review privileges.	3.00	
08/08/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft supplemental interrogatory responses and locate new articles for same; edit J. Forderer's letter.	3.60	
08/09/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	8.00	
08/09/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review expert analysis re Lucas exposure; emails/calls to D. Harvey re same; emails with Joe Saveri and Lisa Leebove re same; email with media re case; review privilege log correspondence and email J. Forderer re same.	3.00	
08/09/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage, log in productions, communicate with productions, organize documents for A. Shaver, add documents to CaseMap for D. Harvey, sort production log, update hard copy binder re hot documents.	1.50	
08/09/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Email co-counsel re privilege log review; review correspondence on same.	0.50	
08/10/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	8.00	
08/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with Lisa Leebove, Joe Saveri, D. Harvey re Lucas; telephone call with Lisa Leebove, Joe Saveri, Dan Purcell re same; email LCHB team re Lucas; emails with A. Shaver re privilege log review.	1.50	
08/10/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage, update production log with new password for Adobe production, and ensure everything is current.	0.70	
08/10/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re case issues.	0.50	
08/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Track co-counsel privilege log responses and edit same; review CaseMap facts list; emails with K. Dermody re privilege log.	1.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/13/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	8.00	
08/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit supplemental interrogatory responses and email with A. Shaver re same; email with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re Google deposition.	1.00	
08/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage, forward. Organize fact chronology for A. Shaver. Work with Litigation Support to find out if TERIS updated the internal database as D. Harvey prepares for another deposition Friday. Verify contents of Lori McAdams deposition transcript are all on the P:/ drive and in i-Manage. Serve defendants' second amended deposition notices and a certificate of service. Organize signed errata sheets and save to P:/ drive and i-Manage.	2.50	
08/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Palm's counsel re declaration; review draft class certification report, correspond with co-counsel re same; conference with A. Shaver re Arnnon Geshuri deposition; serve discovery requests; email with K. Dermody re Arnnon Geshuri.	5.50	
08/13/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Load database coding update and key documents.	2.00	
08/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit co-counsel privilege log letters; review case filings for statement of facts; review Alan Manning report; confer with D. Harvey re Arnnon Geshuri deposition; email with K. Dermody re same.	3.50	
08/14/12	BLACK, KATHERINE	Document review.	1.00	
08/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review draft Alan Manning report and email comments to D. Harvey and B. Glackin; calls/email with D. Harvey re depositions and class certification discovery/assignments; email A. Shaver re same; meeting with B. Glackin re class certification.	3.00	
08/14/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence o the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Pull documents for A. Shaver for Arnnon Geshuri deposition Friday. Work with Litigation Support to get documents and create a folder on the P:/ drive. Create Excel sheet to log plaintiffs' employers responses to subpoenas for D. Harvey. Contact Ian Bagger at TERIS to confirm data. Create draft of letter to mail out Michael Devine documents.	2.10	
08/14/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on access issues with TERIS; meet with TERIS re litigation work.	1.00	
08/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with D. Harvey re class certification brief.	0.20	
08/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Weekly document review conference call led by D. Harvey.	0.20	
08/14/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re class certification brief; office conference with K. Dermody re same; review and draft report of Alan Manning.	3.30	
08/14/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Collate, index electronic discovery documents.	5.00	
08/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Arnnon Geshuri deposition; conference with co-counsel re document review; conference with B. Glackin re expert report and class certification work; conference with K. Dermody re class certification report; manage document review.	5.50	
08/14/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Edit load files and load metadata in three sections.	2.30	
08/14/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls/email with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re depositions and class certification assignments; confer with D. Harvey re experts; confer with A. Shaver re supplemental interrogatory responses; email with Dan Purcell re Lucas mediation; emails with team re Alan Manning.	3.00	
08/15/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Create binder for D. Harvey for Donna Morris deposition Friday. Find custodian name on Relativity and place in the index. Create chart for J. Forderer on all subpoenas requested by defendants and their status. Update chart on received productions from subpoenas and forward documents to TERIS to upload in special folder.	3.00	
08/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for calls re subpoenas to plaintiffs' former employers.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for class certification brief.	1.40	
08/15/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memo re Econ One work.	0.40	
08/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Arnnon Geshuri deposition, review documents re same; conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin; conference with Palm counsel re subpoena; correspond with experts re class certification work.	10.20	
08/15/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with Litigation Support and TERIS re document request; review Arnnon Geshuri deposition topic outline; review documents for same; confer with D. Harvey re same; emails with K. Dermody re interrogatory responses and Jim Morris deposition; review correspondence from Google; draft class certification statement of facts; review Lori McAdams transcript and Jim Morris transcript.	10.70	
08/15/12	ZHU, JULIE	Board of Directors chart for Google from 2000 to the present.	2.50	
08/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Ed Leamer's analysis and latest report; attend team conference call re experts/direction; multiple meetings with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re same; emails with team re depositions; Research.	5.50	
08/16/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition for D. Harvey on Arnnon Geshuri. Create binder by number tabs, pull all documents on Relativity. Create index of 55 documents for the deposition as well. Produce Google's latest CDs to chart for J. Forderer analyzing subpoenas given by defendants to plaintiffs' employers. Create a chart with six columns listing about 20 subpoenas with various traits.	6.00	
08/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Conduct telephone calls re subpoenas to plaintiffs' former employers.	1.00	
08/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for calls re subpoenas to plaintiffs' former employers.	0.20	
08/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for class certification brief.	6.80	
08/16/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert call; office conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and A. Shaver re class certification briefing.	1.50	
08/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with experts; manage document review; prepare for Arnnon Geshuri deposition; review documents; conference with LCHB co-counsel re class certification issues.	9.10	
08/16/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attorney conference call with co-counsel re expert reports; review documents for Arnnon Geshuri deposition and confer with D. Harvey re same; create timeline for Arnnon Geshuri deposition; draft statement of facts; meeting with K. Dermody re class certification strategy.	5.50	
08/16/12	ZHU, JULIE	Create Google Board of Directors chart, timeline.	4.60	
08/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review exhibits for Arnnon Geshuri; emails with A. Shaver re deposition; telephone call with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re Arnnon Geshuri deposition; email team re deposition terminology.	1.00	
08/17/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming electronic court filing notices on the P:/ drive and i-Manage, and forward to Records. Log in CDs to production log from Intuit, and update plaintiffs' subpoenas. Add documents to binder for Arnnon Geshuri's deposition per D. Harvey's directions. Update binder and labels.	2.00	
08/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Make calls re subpoenas to plaintiffs' former employers.	1.10	
08/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Depose Arnnon Geshuri; prepare for same; calls with K. Dermody re deposition.	10.50	
08/17/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
08/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Deposition of Arnnon Geshuri; calls with K. Dermody re deposition.	10.50	
08/17/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Export documents out of Summation. Convert documents to PDF format for review.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft statement of facts for certification brief.	1.80	
08/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise class certification brief, research same.	2.50	
08/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Arnnon Geshuri transcript and Pixar deposition exhibits; multiple emails with team re discovery depositions, certification papers; email with J. Forderer re errata for Apple and Apple deposition; conference with experts, team re analysis.	4.50	
08/20/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Add document to CaseMap and code as hot per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize incoming emails and correspondence on the P:/ drive and i-Manage. Create file-transfer protocol site for all up-to-date depositions and produce to Econ One.	2.50	
08/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft and research the class certification brief.	4.00	
08/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Make calls re subpoenas to plaintiffs' former employers.	1.30	
08/20/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Conversion and load documents into Summation database.	4.00	
08/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise fact section; conference with experts and team re analysis.	2.50	
08/20/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Update metadata in key documents database.	1.90	
08/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
08/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise statement of facts; emails with co-counsel re deposition questions.	7.50	
08/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise draft class certification brief; review materials re same; confer with E. Fastiff re status; confer with A. Shaver re assignments; telephone call with Lisa Leebove re settlement overture; telephone call with Dan Purcell and Lisa Leebove re LucasFilm negotiation; emails to J. Saveri re same; email with A. Shaver re supplemental interrogatory responses; emails to D. Harvey re deposition.	5.00	
08/21/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Download documents from the electronic court filing system and correspondence and organize on internal computer drive. Communicate with litigation vendor TERIS to find specific Google document for A. Shaver. Create binder with various cases of antitrust class certification for J. Forderer. Pull cases directly from Lexis/Nexis, create index.	2.70	
08/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft argument section of class certification brief and confer with A. Shaver re same.	5.20	
08/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Field calls from third party recipients of defendants' subpoenas.	0.20	
08/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Search docket to determine whether page limit extension granted.	0.50	
08/21/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Conversion and load documents into Summation database.	7.00	
08/21/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Email Eric Cramer and K. Dermody re interrogatories; duplicate same for other plaintiffs; confer with K. Dermody re statement of facts; emails with co-counsel re exhibit list; confer with J. Forderer re legal section of class certification brief.	1.30	
08/22/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Adobe deposition; telephone call with D. Harvey re experts, deposition, and assignments; many emails with team re class certification issues; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re Lucas settlement position; confer with D. Harvey re Lucas; confer with E. Fastiff re certification drafting; multiple emails with A. Shaver re supplemental interrogatory response and review Eric Cramer's edits re same; review 100+ pages of revised expert report and charts and prepare notes, comments and questions re same; email team re same and expert evidence; review answers re competitive justification.	2.00	
08/22/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and transcripts and save on internal computer drive. Organize electronic documents on internal computer drive. Update plaintiffs' subpoena log with new Manpower production. Prepare documents for Berger & Montague per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.60	
08/22/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft argument section of class certification brief.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/22/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence.	0.50	
08/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class certification issues, conference with team and experts re same; manage document review; review documents.	6.50	
08/22/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/22/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review K. Dermody's edits to statement of facts; telephone conference with Joe Saveri; emails with co-counsel re privilege log; team emails re interrogatory responses.	2.10	
08/22/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Export documents out of Summation database. Upload documents to external website for experts to view documents.	2.50	
08/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with team (except J. Saveri) re expert work, Pixar and Lucas settlement strategy; confer with D. Harvey re assignments, brief; confer with E. Fastiff re experts; telephone conference with Dan Purcell and Lisa Leebove re settlement (Lucas); review draft expert report; email Lisa Leebove about getting J. Saveri to respond on settlement question.	5.50	
08/23/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and save on internal computer drive. Organize electronic documents on internal computer drive. Log in new productions from LucasFilm and Intuit for our litigation vendor TERIS. Prepare the Intuit data production for our data analyst . Produce LucasFilm production to Lisa Leebove at Joseph Saveri Law Firm.	2.30	
08/23/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Discuss class certification brief with D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/23/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re expert reports.	0.40	
08/23/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft Edward Leamer report; memo re settlements.	3.30	
08/23/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re expert reports.	1.00	
08/23/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re expert work.	1.80	
08/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage class certification issues; conference with client re re class certification; review documents.	7.50	
08/23/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Ed Leamer expert report; attorney conference call re same; read Jim Morris deposition transcript.	3.00	
08/23/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review case materials.	0.70	
08/24/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re Pixar settlement strategy; email D. Harvey re cost fund; emails with Eric Cramer, Josh Davis, Lisa Leebove, B. Glackin re experts; telephone conference with Eric Cramer re Lucas settlement strategy; telephone call with B. Glackin re Lucas; email E. Fastiff re experts; email Dan Purcell re Lucas settlement call; email Lisa Leebove re Pixar insurance coverage; email with team re Pixar settlement strategy and review estimates re same; email J. Saveri re his failure to communicate on Pixar.	2.00	
08/24/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on internal computer drive. Prepare Jim Morris deposition for Records. Find Adobe documents on litigation vendor website and create a folder on the internal computer drive for D. Harvey to review them.	1.00	
08/24/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with Joe Saveri re economists; telephone conference with Ed Leamer and the re draft report.	6.80	
08/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel and experts re class certification report; review documents; conference with opposing counsel re redaction requests; research class certification issues.	5.60	
08/24/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
08/24/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Lucas post-Department of Justice - Industrial Light and Magic (a Lucas company) recruiting emails.	8.00	
08/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email to D. Harvey re brief assignments.	0.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/27/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update file-transfer protocol site with Arnnon Geshuri exhibits and email correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.70	
08/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft class certification brief.	1.40	
08/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google letter re privilege logs.	0.30	
08/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memo to Joe Saveri re Pixar.	0.50	
08/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with E. Fastiff re case issues.	0.50	
08/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Lucas post-Department of Justice - Industrial Light and Magic (a Lucas company) recruiting emails.	8.00	
08/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft class certification brief; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re same.	0.60	
08/28/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re status.	0.40	
08/28/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Lucas post-Department of Justice - Industrial Light and Magic (a Lucas company) recruiting emails.	8.00	
08/29/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize internal computer drive. Organize correspondence on internal computer drive. Log in new document production for Intuit. Create binders for D. Harvey.	1.00	
08/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Follow-up on privilege log letter to Apple and Google.	0.30	
08/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re case issues; memorandum to team re order to show cause hearing; memorandum re expert reports.	1.50	
08/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; conference with co-counsel re case management conference; research related case and order to show cause, conference with B. Glackin re same; research class certification brief and expert report, conference with B. Glackin re same; correspond with clients.	6.50	
08/29/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Lucas post-Department of Justice - Industrial Light and Magic (a Lucas company) recruiting emails.	8.00	
08/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence in the internal computer drive. Organize internal computer drive. Prepare production to litigation vendor TERIS. Gather transcripts for D. Harvey. Add Arnnon Geshuri final transcripts to the file-transfer protocol site and notify	1.10	
08/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Follow-up with respect to third party subpoenas issued to plaintiffs' former employers.	0.30	
08/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Settlement call with Pixar; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; prepare for same; confer with D. Harvey re experts.	1.40	
08/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review revised expert report materials; prepare for conference with experts and co-counsel, conference with B. Glackin re same; draft summary of damages approach; review documents; research class certification standards.	9.20	
08/30/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
08/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice 00126 and 00067 - Lucas companies recruiting emails; search documents for Google's 10% compensation increase.	8.00	
08/30/12	ZHU, JULIE	Create Chart of Facebook employees growth from 2004 to the present.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/31/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create chart for D. Harvey documenting data or document productions from defendants. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Organize documents off GOOG018 production for J. Forderer, verify redacted portions. Update production log.	2.00	
08/31/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google and Adobe documents and letters re inadvertently produced documents.	0.70	
08/31/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team re expert meeting.	0.20	
08/31/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting with Edward Leamer.	5.20	
08/31/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts and co-counsel re class certification expert report; research and draft class certification brief, conference with J. Forderer re same; review and revise Case Management Conference statement.	8.50	
08/31/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
08/31/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice 00096 - Lucas companies recruiting emails.	8.00	
09/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief.	7.50	
09/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification motion.	9.50	
09/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with team re class definition and review multiple days' correspondence re same; telephone call with D. Harvey re status, class certification.	1.00	
09/03/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of database. Analysis of production of documents.	5.00	
09/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief; conference with expert re class certification analysis; confer with K. Dermody re class certification briefing.	9.50	
09/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice 00096 - Lucas companies recruiting emails and Intel post-Department of Justice 00013.	7.80	
09/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey reporting on hot documents.	0.20	
09/04/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit interrogatory responses; email Dan Purcell and Joe Saveri re arranging for Lucas settlement talks; telephone call with D. Harvey re Case Management Conference; email Michael Tubach re Case Management Conference; review Titanium class certification order for use in High-Tech Cold Calling; edit draft Case Management Conference statement and multiple emails with team re same; call/email Lisa Leebove re Lucas; team call re status of case; telephone call with B. Glackin re status; review/respond to correspondence re class certification/discovery; email J. Forderer re class certification research; manage team class certification assignments.	5.50	
09/04/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on chart for D. Harvey. Input total page numbers for document productions from all defendants starting from June 2012 and insert type of data for all defendants during the same time period as well. Email for assistance. Print documents for K. Dermody. Attach amended disclosure from Lucasfilm to D. Harvey.	2.20	
09/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for class certification brief; email with K. Dermody re same.	1.00	
09/04/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memoranda re class certification; office conference with D. Harvey re same; confer with K. Dermody re same.	0.90	
09/04/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re motion for class certification; review same.	0.60	
09/04/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft motion for class certification; confer with A. Shaver re assignment.	1.60	
09/04/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Load electronic discovery information relevant for use with key documents database.	7.00	
09/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise class certification brief, conference with co-counsel re same; review draft expert report; manage document review; review documents.	9.80	
09/04/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review email correspondence; draft revised interrogatory responses; document review conference call; conference with B. Glackin re assignments.	2.90	
09/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Conference call with D. Harvey and team to discuss new case developments.	0.10	
09/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production regarding Paul Otellini, Eric Schmidt, and Bill Campbell.	6.90	
09/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting on hot documents to D. Harvey.	0.50	
09/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Work on Relativity document review interface.	0.50	
09/04/12	ZHU, JULIE	Intel and Apple Board of Directors chart.	6.00	
09/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Case management of discovery, experts, class certification, settlement. Review Mark Fichtner documents; email R. Heimann re trial; confer with B. Glackin re expert regressions; edit Case Management Conference statement and many emails/calls re revisions to same; edit expert report and calls/emails with team/B. Glackin re same; confer with D. Harvey re court reporter; confer with B. Glackin re deposition summaries; email Joe Saveri re Lucas; telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Lucas; emails with team re Apple production.	5.00	
09/05/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Input new data productions from Lucasfilm and Apple. Prepare new production for . Find documents for A. Shaver on Relativity. Add multiple documents to CaseMap for D. Harvey. Organize correspondence on the internal drive and organize internal computer drive.	2.50	
09/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with D. Harvey re class certification filing; meeting with B. Troxel re same.	0.50	
09/05/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team re expert report.	1.00	
09/05/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise expert report and confer with K. Dermody re same; office conference with A. Shaver re fact research; telephone conference with K. Dermody, Dan Purcell re Lucasfilm settlement.	6.70	
09/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise class certification brief; manage document review; review documents; confer with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, and B. Glackin re class certification issues; review revised expert report.	8.80	
09/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft memo re conduct periods; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re deposition testimony; confer with K. Dugar re TextMap; emails re TextMap assignments; circulate revised interrogatory responses to co-counsel.	3.00	
09/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel deposition preparation review.	7.80	
09/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey reporting on Intel hot documents.	0.20	
09/05/12	ZHU, JULIE	Board of Directors chart for Intel, Apple and Google.	5.00	
09/06/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference and emails with D. Harvey re Google documents; review revised expert report and call with B. Glackin re same; meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Google discovery violations; conference with LCHB team re class definition and emails re same; email with Lisa Leebove re Case Management Conference; meeting with D. Harvey re Lucas; review impact analyses and confer with B. Glackin re same.	5.00	
09/06/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents from Relativity for D. Harvey. Pull certain documents, verify production date in log and then combine selected ones into a PDF file. Cross check Google privilege logs with PDF file from J. Forderer. Look for any similar dates. Save correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive and organize internal computer drive.	4.50	
09/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and prepare for class certification filing.	0.50	
09/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google privilege logs.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with Peter Barile re Google privilege logs.	0.20	
09/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Edward Leamer report; memo re same; team call re same; confer with K. Dermody re strategy; review/revise class certification brief.	7.40	
09/06/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Update and review TextMap software for use with coding of documents in database.	4.00	
09/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise class certification brief, research same, conference with co-counsel re same; meeting with K. Dermody re Lucas; conference with experts re class certification work; review documents; meeting with K. Dermody re Google discovery and draft correspondence re discovery issues.	8.50	
09/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
09/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with co-counsel re Google and experts; review Google documents and summary by Peter Barille; review letter from D. Harvey re same; review class certification brief draft.	1.90	
09/06/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel deposition preparation review.	8.00	
09/07/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery and class certification assignments. Email with team re Adobe agreements; confer with A. Shaver re named plaintiff declarations; edit letter to Lee Rubin re Google documents; confer with D. Harvey re Google; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re LCHB strategy on class representative declarations; meeting with A. Shaver, D. Harvey re class certification assignments; confer with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer report and review edits to same; class certification review of hot documents.	6.50	
09/07/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents from brief and expert report per J. Forderer's instructions. Identify documents from litigation vendor TERIS and put into a folder on the P:/ drive for review next week. Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Prepare latest Google production to litigation vendor TERIS to upload.	4.00	
09/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet with D. Harvey re class certification logistics.	0.60	
09/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and prepare for class certification filing.	2.10	
09/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	TextMap update.	0.30	
09/07/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Edward Leamer report draft and conference with K. Dermody re same; review/revise class certification brief.	3.30	
09/07/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Create visual graphic.	3.00	
09/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and research class certification brief; manage document review; review documents; muliple conferences with K. Dermody re discovery and certification assignments.	8.50	
09/07/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
09/07/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Summarize Arnnon Geshuri deposition on TextMap; review team correspondence re expert report; meeeting with K. Dermody re class certification tasks; emails re miscellaneous class certification tasks.	6.00	
09/07/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel deposition preparation review and Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.70	
09/07/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting on hot documents to D. Harvey.	0.30	
09/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification motion; draft plaintiff declarations.	7.20	
09/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery and class certification briefing assignments. Meetings with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, J. Forderer re documents, data, privilege logs; review status of privilege logs and email team re same; email J. Forderer re letters re deficiencies in logs; email Emily Henn re Pixar; email Brandon Marshall re email team re late productions; edit letter re Intel documents; edit named plaintiff declaration; telephone conference with D. Harvey and Lee Rubin re documents; review/edit expert report.	7.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/10/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Identify documents from draft report and brief for class certification filing. Edit draft report to reflect cites from final depositions transcripts, create folders on the internal computer drive to separate redacted and filed under seal documents. Double check latest production from Google for new documents. Prepare latest Intuit production via the file-transfer protocol site. Update production log with the latest Intuit production data. Pull all letters related to privilege logs from July 1, 2012 for J. Forderer.	4.50	
09/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft documents for class certification and motion to seal.	2.10	
09/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting re privilege logs with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and A. Shaver.	0.30	
09/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and prepare for class certification filing.	0.70	
09/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' privilege log letters.	0.70	
09/10/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review privilege logs of LucasFilm.	0.60	
09/10/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Troubleshoot encryption of electronic discovery production for reviewers.	3.00	
09/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief; meet and confer with K. Dermody and Google's counsel re discovery issues; draft supplemental Case Management Conference statement; conference with experts re report; meetings with K. Dermody re assignments, logs.	8.50	
09/10/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft plaintiff declarations; revise interrogatory responses and emails with Eric Cramer re same; email same to plaintiffs; conference with K. Dermody, J. Forderer and D. Harvey re privilege logs.	3.40	
09/10/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification orders for J. Forderer's review.	0.20	
09/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Case management and settlement strategy. Meet with D. Harvey re discovery; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Pixar and Lucas damages; email D. Harvey re privilege logs; email Sarah Shalman-Bergen re Adobe documents; email D. Harvey re Apple data; confer with D. Harvey re late productions; email Emily Henn re Pixar; email A. Shaver re privilege logs and interrogatories; edit and revise supplemental Case Management Conference statement; edit class certification documents.	5.00	
09/11/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Add exhibits to D. Harvey's declaration for motion for class certification. Organize signatures coming in from plaintiffs on declarations to the internal computer drive. Prepare plan for chambers copy to the San Jose Northern Division Federal Court by 9:00 AM tomorrow morning. Create copy of Intuit production for file.	6.00	
09/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft documents for class certification and motion to file under seal.	1.10	
09/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter re LucasFilm privilege logs.	1.20	
09/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet with D. Harvey re class certification brief filing.	0.30	
09/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re local rules and e-filing procedure.	0.60	
09/11/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review privilege log and production letters from defendants.	0.20	
09/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise motion for class certification; email with K. Dermody re damages.	5.90	
09/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re motion for class certification.	1.50	
09/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research expert report; conference with co-counsel re case strategy; draft and file supplemental Case Management Conference statement; prepare for Case Management Conference.	10.50	
09/11/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Dan Stover re telephone conference with Siddharth Hariharan re telephone conference with Mark Fichtner re telephone conference with Brandon Marshall re telephone conference with Brandon Marshall re telephone conference re class certification definition and expert report; review latest draft of expert report.	4.30	
09/11/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re service in San Jose for D. Harvey.	0.20	
09/11/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.40	
09/11/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey regarding hot documents from Intel.	0.60	
09/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel round trip to hearing; meeting before hearing with Saveri Law Firm re strategy; meet/conferences with defense counsel re discovery, schedule; prepare for Case Management Conference; class certification work.	6.50	
09/12/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare exhibits for D. Harvey declaration for class certification. Label with redacted, unredacted, and highlighted versions. Verify with Nationwide that chambers copy of Case Management Conference statement was delivered. Organize privilege logs, and gather documents per D. Harvey's request. Collect Department of Justice productions on Google for a potential organization chart. Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Log in new Apple, Intel, and Google productions and provide to the litigation vendor.	5.70	
09/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and draft documents for class certification brief.	1.80	
09/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and organize documents to file class certification brief.	0.30	
09/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and pull documents for today's Case Management Conference.	0.90	
09/12/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise motion for class certification; attend Case Management Conference.	8.50	
09/12/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Add metadata for electric discovery database.	4.00	
09/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Case Management Conference, travel and attend same; conference with experts re class certification issues, research same.	7.50	
09/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/12/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review emails re class certification assignments.	0.50	
09/12/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Export documents out of Summation database. Convert documents to PDF format. Upload documents to website for expert review.	2.50	
09/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.10	
09/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re Google; telephone conference with J. Saveri and Dan Purcell re Lucas settlement proposal; email D. Harvey re Intel claw back; edit letter re stock options.	1.00	
09/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive, contact litigation vendor to confirm loading of recent Intel/Google CDs. Put documents for class certification filing in folders with labels. Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Go through deposition erratas to find designations of what is confidential.	2.50	
09/13/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research Federal Rules of Civil Procedure duty to sequester inadvertent productions.	0.50	
09/13/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with and Edward Leamer; telephone conference with Alan Manning; office conference with D. Harvey re case; review/revise class certification motion.	4.90	
09/13/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Locate and duplicate electronic discovery.	4.00	
09/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts and B. Glackin re class certification issues; research class certification report; research class certification brief; review and draft correspondence re discovery and conference with K. Dermody re same.	7.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/13/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
09/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with A. Shaver re interrogatory responses; confer with D. Harvey re Google documents; confer with D. Harvey re Pixar/Lucas damages/experts; confer with D. Harvey re plaintiff depositions; email J. Saveri re Lucas.	2.50	
09/14/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Load two redacted documents sent in Intel's latest production. Combine 500 and 700 files respectively, print original/redacted version, send to D. Harvey. Save incoming correspondence to the internal computer drive. Log in information for Google and Intel production.	1.70	
09/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, summarize and tag deposition transcript of Donna Morris.	3.20	
09/14/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion and load electronic discovery documents into Summation database.	5.00	
09/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues; confer with K. Dermody re Google issues; conference with Google's counsel and draft correspondence re same; conference with B. Glackin re class certification issues; manage document review; conference with K. Dermody re plaintiffs.	6.50	
09/14/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research surveys listing top companies to work for in the technical industry, for J. Zhu.	0.40	
09/14/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
09/14/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review email correspondence; conference with B. Glackin re agenda for class certification brief; emails with Josh Alpert re Intel privilege log; emails with D. Harvey and Lisa Leebove re deposition of plaintiffs; email with K. Dermody and revise interrogatory responses.	2.90	
09/14/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Export documents out of Summation database. Convert documents to PDF format. Upload documents to website to be reviewed by experts.	1.50	
09/14/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Load new documents into Summation database.	3.50	
09/14/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
09/14/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research "top companies" lists for market definitions.	4.50	
09/15/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/16/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	4.00	
09/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Dan Purcell re advancing Lucas talks; email D. Harvey re helping J. Saveri firm locate case documents; review Ed Leamer documents; edit letter to Google re recruiting documents; email A. Shaver re Intel privilege log.	2.00	
09/17/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save incoming correspondence to the internal computer drive. Upload latest data to and update production log.	0.40	
09/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Summarize and tag deposition of Donna Morris.	3.80	
09/17/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Summarize and tag deposition of Mark Bentley.	0.90	
09/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research expert report, collect documents regarding same; conference with team re class certification filing; review documents; draft, revise, and serve correspondence; email K. Dermody re Saveri firm missing files.	11.20	
09/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with K. Dermody re privilege log issues; confer with D. Harvey re two-week tasks on class certification; review class certification brief.	2.90	
09/17/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification work re experts; edit letters re case management work; email Dan Purcell re Lucas and update J. Saveri re same and experts; confer with A. Shaver re stock splits; confer with B. Glackin re experts; email with team re Intel settlement strategy; email J. Forderer re privilege logs and reviewing same.	5.00	
09/18/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Contact court report Lee Anne Shortridge for transcript of proceedings from September 12, 2012. Pull redacted and original version of four Intel documents for A. Shaver. Create chart for J. Forderer showing Lucasfilm privilege log response, problems, and solutions. Prepare copy of latest Intuit production for file.	3.00	
09/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft class certification brief and merge everyone's edits.	1.10	
09/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Email and discuss with A. Shaver re class certification filing and motion to seal.	0.20	
09/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review and respond to letter from Apple re their privilege logs; review K. Dermody email re same.	0.30	
09/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review and respond to letter from Lucasfilm re their privilege logs.	0.30	
09/18/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Summarize and tag deposition of Mark Bentley.	3.70	
09/18/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re damages analysis, case issues; telephone conference with J. Saveri re case management; draft correspondence to Joe Saveri re case management expectations; draft correspondence to co-counsel firm; review/revise draft of Edward Leamer report; review Edward Leamer damages analysis; review correspondence from Christina Brown; respond to same.	5.50	
09/18/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Transfer data to flash drive for co-counsel.	1.20	
09/18/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with document review team; emails with D. Ratner and J. Zaul re review status; emails with T. Desouza re same; review James Dallal letter; confer with K. Dermody re equity compensation; class cerification work.	4.00	
09/18/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Transfer documents from local network to external hard drive.	1.00	
09/18/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Conference call with document review team.	0.10	
09/18/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.60	
09/18/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails with A. Shaver hot documents.	0.30	
09/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery and settlement issues. Review/respond to Google correspondence re discovery; telephone conference with J. Saveri re Lucas; email Joe Saveri re same; email with A. Shaver re Intel claw back; confer with A. Shaver re stock split issues; telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Lucas settlement talks.	1.50	
09/19/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish chart for J. Forderer comparing Apple privilege logs to problems and responses given by Christina Brown. Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive.	3.00	
09/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft and edit class certification brief.	7.00	
09/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review LucasFilm privilege logs and LucasFilm letter regarding their privilege logs.	0.50	
09/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Intel clawback letter; memorandum to team re same; coordinate with Eric Cramer re expert report, brief; coordinate with re Intel damages estimate for settlement purposes; memorandum to K. Dermody and Joe Saveri re same; review draft of class certification motion for J. Forderer.	2.80	
09/19/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation support: Troubleshoot TextMap database for reviewers.	3.00	
09/19/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/19/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Mike Devine; telephone conference with J. Forderer re privilege log research; email with K. Dermody re claw back and draft letter to Intel re third party withholdings; email document review team re new batches; confer with K. Dermody re equity compensation.	2.50	
09/19/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production and Google post-Department of Justice production.	7.80	
09/19/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.20	
09/20/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Corporate research.	0.50	
09/20/12	CARNAM, TODD	Pull employee numbers for Pixar for A. Shaver.	0.30	
09/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Lucas; review revised damages analyses and telephone conference with experts and team re same; confer with A. Shaver re Lucas/Pixar data issues; emails with Google re documents; email with B. Glackin re case management; review Google correspondence re search terms; class certification work and call with experts; meeting with B. Glackin and A. Shaver re same.	3.50	
09/20/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Log in incoming Google CD, load to file-transfer protocol site, and provide to Teris and Help A. Shaver access files from this production for review. Update production log, and assist with finding documents.	1.50	
09/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft and edit class certification brief; confer with A. Shaver re same.	6.10	
09/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google's modified search terms in its 9/19/2012 letter.	0.70	
09/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Summarize and tag deposition of Mark Bentley.	1.10	
09/20/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise class certification brief; review/revise Edward Leamer report; review correspondence from J. Saveri; draft response re same and LCHB request for exchange of contemporaneous time and expense reports; leave messages for Joe Saveri; confer with K. Dermody, A. Shaver re experts, class cerification.	5.10	
09/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; search the P:/ drive for correspondence with Google on search term negotiation.	7.50	
09/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with J. Forderer re class certification brief; review Google search term meet and confer; process new Google documents; emails re named plaintiff deposition scheduling; conference call with attorneys and experts; conference call with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; review new Google documents; review hot documents from review team.	5.90	
09/20/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Load new documents into Summation database.	2.00	
09/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	4.60	
09/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.40	
09/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search Lucas Film and Pixar filings for revenue and head count.	3.00	
09/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification briefing; confer with B. Glackin re 23(g) argument; edit B. Glackin's letter re case management expectations; multiple emails with Lee Rubin re Google and with A. Shaver, D. Harvey re same; email team re parallel arguments; confer with A. Shaver re class certification brief and assignments.	2.50	
09/21/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive, update production log, save Oracle documents produced because of plaintiff subpoena,.	1.00	
09/21/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise class certification brief; memorandum re same; confer with K. Dermody re arguments.	1.10	
09/21/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody re briefing assignments; insert citations to brief; email with K. Dermody re Google documents and review Google Big Bang documents; circulate summary of same; send documents to experts; email team re Intel list; review hot documents from reviewers.	5.50	
09/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.00	
09/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search Lucas Film and Pixar filings for revenue and head count.	1.00	
09/22/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Lee Rubin, team re Google documents; email with A. Shaver re Danielle Lambert subpoena; class certification updates.	1.00	
09/22/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and send letter to J. Saveri re case management expectations.	0.60	
09/22/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
09/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email J. Saveri re scheduling deposition.	0.10	
09/24/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage class certification discovery and team assignments. Review Google discovery correspondence in preparation for meet and confer; telephone call to D. Harvey re same; telephone call with J. Forderer re same; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re strategy; telephone conference with Lee Rubin, Eric Evans, Lisa Leebove, A. Shaver and J. Forderer re Google documents; email Dan Purcell re Lucas; review correspondence re depositions and email team re same; email with B. Glackin re expert issues; confer with J. Forderer re hot documents; review hot documents.	6.80	
09/24/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive, update production log, and organize signed documents from Michael Devine.	1.00	
09/24/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Google re meet and confer.	1.10	
09/24/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare documents and research for class certification brief.	0.80	
09/24/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google's previous search terms; meet and confer with Google re same; office conference with A. Shaver and K. Dermody re same.	4.50	
09/24/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Coordinate calls re expert report and future deponents.	0.50	
09/24/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
09/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review documents from D. Ratner and J. Zaul; circulate summaries of same to team; add deposition citations to class certification brief; start drafting deposition defense outline; prepare for meet and confer with Google; conference call with K. Dermody, J. Forderer, Google re search terms.	6.30	
09/24/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	6.40	
09/24/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	1.60	
09/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Organize team re class brief filing. Confer with B. Glackin re Danielle Lambert deposition; conference with A. Shaver and J. Forderer re Google meet and confer; telephone conference with experts, team (not J. Saveri) re report and follow-up assignments; telephone conference with Dan Purcell re Lucas settlement talks; update call to J. Saveri re same; edit letter to Google and confirm search terms; advise LCHB team re deponents.	3.00	
09/25/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence to the internal computer drive and circulate to team. Update production log with Adobe 013 CD, send to litigation vendor. Pull all deposition excerpts from brief per J. Forderer's instructions. Add to folder containing all files on the internal computer drive. Call SpinCycle to verify delivery time to San Jose District Court on Monday for documents. Organize war room for filing.	3.70	
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft administrative motion to file under seal and review local rules; discuss class certification filing plan with B. Glackin and A. Shaver.	2.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Google re production and confer with K. Dermody, A. Shaver.	0.70	
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft proposed order granting class certification.	1.90	
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Expert call with. K. Dermody, A. Shaver, and B. Glackin; telephone conference with team re deposition notices and letters.	0.80	
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, summarize and tag deposition of Jim Morris.	1.80	
09/25/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, summarize and tag deposition of Mark Bentley.	1.40	
09/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Shaver and J. Forderer re brief and deponents.	0.60	
09/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review list of potential deponents.	0.40	
09/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re deponents.	0.50	
09/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re experts; office conference with K. Dermody re same.	1.10	
09/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with re work.	0.40	
09/25/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis and index of electronic discovery materials in database. Troubleshoot metadata issues regarding electronic discovery database.	5.00	
09/25/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
09/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit J. Forderer letter to Google; confer with K. Dermody, J. Forderer re Google follow ups; conference call with document review team; conference call with B. Glackin, J. Forderer and J. Saveri re deponents; draft defendant letters re same; review expert damages model; conference call with experts re same; call to clerk re filing deadline; review rules for citations in expert report.	5.20	
09/25/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders re lead counsel appointments for J. Forderer review.	0.40	
09/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.80	
09/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.10	
09/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Weekly document review conference call.	0.10	
09/26/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage class discovery and settlement issues. Review privilege log letters from defendants; review correspondence from Google and email team re same; edit/revise response re same; confer with B. Glackin re damages estimates and data; email with Eric Cramer, B. Glackin re technical class; confer with A. Shaver re privilege log issues; review defendants' letter re plaintiff privilege log; telephone conference with Dan Purcell, J. Saveri re Lucas; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re Lucas; email with B. Glackin re proposed order; edit brief.	5.00	
09/26/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents from expert report for class certification filing per A. Shaver's instructions. Pull all letters that contain the words 'high level', 'custodial', or 'non custodial' per J. Forderer's instructions. Work with to ensure they receive all requested documents for expert report. Organize all correspondence on the internal computer drive.	5.00	
09/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft motion to compel against Google.	5.90	
09/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft motion to seal and research filing protocol.	1.40	
09/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft proposed order granting class certification.	0.60	
09/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, summarize and tag deposition of Jim Morris.	1.30	
09/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re class certification proposed order and data.	0.30	
09/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read "nursing" decisions re wage price-fixing.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise class certification brief.	2.70	
09/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise proposed order granting class certification.	0.50	
09/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with re damage analysis; memorandum re same.	0.60	
09/26/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull citations for pull all salaried documents for D. Harvey; conference with J. Forderer re motion to compel and emails re same; pull sample filing table; edit letters to defendants re deponents and emails with co-counsel re same; confer with K. Dermody re privilege log challenge; draft letter to Lee Rubin re discovery issues; draft email to Eric Evans re same; emails with TERIS re Adobe production.	6.10	
09/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	4.90	
09/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.60	
09/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for and review documents on recruiting non-technical and non-creative employees.	2.50	
09/27/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit expert report; emails with B. Glackin re same; meet and confer with Lee Rubin, Lisa Leebove, A. Shaver, J. Forderer re Google documents; edit order; review/edit letter to Lee Rubin re meet and confer and review transcript re same.	4.00	
09/27/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents for expert report for class certification. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare deposition preparation CDs for five named plaintiffs per A. Shaver's instructions. Organize documents for class certification in war room. Log in new production and produce to litigation vendors and update production log.	3.20	
09/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Edit motion to compel against Google.	0.70	
09/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Edit proposed order granting class certification.	3.00	
09/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet and confer with Google re production; meet with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re same.	1.50	
09/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Advise A. Shaver re motion for class certification; advise J. Forderer re proposed order; memorandum re same.	0.80	
09/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum re damages analysis.	0.30	
09/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Shaver re brief; memorandum to team re same; review D. Harvey inset re class definition; memorandum re same; emails with K. Dermody re class strategy.	0.90	
09/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Edward Leamer report.	2.50	
09/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/27/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with K. Dermody, J. Forderer and Lee Rubin; draft follow-up letter to same; review transcript from same; edit letters to defendants re depositions and serve; emails with co-counsel re same; calendar plaintiff depositions and draft letters to plaintiffs re deposition preparation; pull citations for edit class certification brief; confer with B. Glackin re same.	7.70	
09/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for and review documents on recruiting non-technical and non-creative employees.	2.00	
09/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for and review documents on recruiting technical and creative employees.	5.80	
09/28/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Run searches regarding potential exhibits to declaration in support of class certification. Meeting with A. Shaver and J. Forderer regarding strategy regarding preparation of class certification documents.	4.00	
09/28/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit expert report; calls/emails with B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Purcell re Lucas settlement talks; telephone conference with Eric Cramer and B. Glackin re experts; email with J. Forderer re order and review same.	6.50	
09/28/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save incoming correspondence to the internal computer drive. Pull documents for the internal computer drive. Pull documents for the internal computer drive.	2.50	
09/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Confer with K. Dermody and revise proposed class certification order.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare and research for class certification filing.	1.40	
09/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review/revise draft expert report.	3.50	
09/28/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert report and brief and confer with K. Dermody re same; confer with K. Dermody and Eric Cramer re same.	3.90	
09/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise class certification brief and expert report.	5.50	
09/28/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
09/28/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull cites for class certification brief; pull cites at request of and N. Barrows re same; develop plan for filing under seal; review expert report; email defendants re confidentiality and review production for designations.	7.00	
09/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.80	
09/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.20	
09/28/12	ZHU, JULIE	Create board of directors chart.	0.20	
09/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage class cerification and settlement projects. Work on expert reports; many emails with and studies; edit draft order; calls with Lisa Leebove, B. Glackin re experts, Lucas; telephone conference with Eric Cramer, Lisa Leebove, Joe Saveri and B. Glackin re Lucas negotiations; review/edit letter to Lee Rubin re Google documents.	12.00	
09/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, edit and proofread expert report.	7.50	
09/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert report and brief; confer with K. Dermody re same.	3.40	
09/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, Eric Cramer, J. Saveri re Lucas; telephone conference with review drafts.	1.50	
09/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit class certification brief; pull documents for Rubin and serve same. ; emails with co-counsel re expert report revisions; draft letter to Lee	7.00	
09/30/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Check legal and factual citations in the class certification brief. Search for exhibits in the document database, Relativity, and download documents needed for A. Shaver's declaration. Edit A. Shaver's declaration.	6.50	
09/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with B. Glackin, Eric Cramer, conference with Dan Purcell and Joe Saveri re settlement; calls with B. Glackin re class strategy; edit certification brief and order; emails with A. Shaver and J. Forderer re assignments.	9.00	
09/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on class certification filing with J. Forderer and A. Shaver. Pull documents from the brief, organize folder on the internal computer drive, fact check the brief, locate other documents needed.	7.00	
09/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, edit and proofread class certification brief and motion to seal materials; emails with K. Dermody re assignments.	8.10	
09/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise brief. expert report and confer with K. Dermody re strategy; telephone conference with K. Dermody, Eric Cramer, Ed Leamer, re report.	5.10	
09/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with K. Dermody re class assignments and edit class certification brief; edit administrative motion to file under seal; edit A. Shaver declaration; supervise paralegal cite check; legal research for brief; pull documents for same.	10.50	
10/01/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Perform legal citation check of class certification brief per A. Shaver. Search for and pull exhibits from database for A. Shaver's declaration. Prepare documents to be lodged under seal. Prepare strategy for chambers copies and associated binders.	10.60	
10/01/12	CARNAM, TODD	Cite check brief.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/01/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit certification brief; meet with B. Glackin re same; confer with A. Shaver re same; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove and B. Glackin re class definition; edit order; review administrative motion/declaration; review/edit A. Shaver declaration; meet with A. Shaver re brief; meet with B. Glackin re brief, report, Lucas; edit proof of service; telephone conference with Dan Purcell and Joe Saveri re Lucas; email team re Pixar; email team re Pixar settlement position.	5.00	
10/01/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on class certification motion. Prepare documents for filing under seal, create index, cover letters, envelopes, letter to Judge per A. Shaver's and J. Forderer's instructions. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive.	11.00	
10/01/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft, edit, redact and file class certification brief, expert report and motion to seal materials.	13.50	
10/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review final brief; meet with K. Dermody re filing.	0.90	
10/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise filing of motion for class certification; revise proposed order; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Danielle Lambert deposition.	5.60	
10/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise finalization of class certification papers.	2.80	
10/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re class certification motion; supervise finalization of same.	1.40	
10/01/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet with K. Dermody on finalizing documents for fling; prepare, file and serve motion to file under seal, motion for class certification and all accompanying documents.	13.50	
10/01/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organized documents re filing under seal.	0.30	
10/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.90	
10/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.10	
10/02/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Preparation of chambers copies and documents being lodged under seal. Communication regarding conformed copies with A. Shaver, J. Forderer, the court clerks and our courier.	5.30	
10/02/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage cost fund for expert payments; email B. Glackin re brief errata, Danielle Lambert.	0.30	
10/02/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Assemble binders for class certification motion per J. Forderer's instructions. Log incoming production and send to litigation vendor. Find documents in plaintiffs' privilege log for J. Forderer.	3.50	
10/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Lin Kahn re plaintiffs' privilege logs and research applicable law.	1.50	
10/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare documents to be lodged under seal.	4.40	
10/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review status of meet and confer with defendants re their privilege logs and prepare a chart.	2.50	
10/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Danielle Lambert.	5.50	
10/02/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research ethics of consulting fees by defendant counsel to former employees of Apple for B. Glackin.	0.80	
10/02/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research when Apple started using Google technology in its Safari browser, for A. Shaver.	0.50	
10/02/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend deposition of Danielle Lambert in Palo Alto; calls and emails with J. Forderer and N. Barrows re chambers' copies.	11.00	
10/02/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.80	
10/02/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re hot documents.	0.20	
10/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research time period Eric Schmidt was on Apple's Board.	0.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for and attend meeting re privilege log issues with B. Glackin, A. Shaver, J. Forderer, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal; conference with B. Glackin and A. Shaver re same; emails with team re discovery, expert preparation; edit interrogatory responses; email Eric Cramer re assignments; email A. Shaver re TERIS.	2.50	
10/03/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Project for J. Forderer: create privilege log folders for each defendant. Upload information into production log. Produce hard drive to Christina Brown at O'Melveny & Myers. Create draft of letter and label for the envelope.	3.00	
10/03/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on collection of data from experts.	1.00	
10/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Lin Kahn re plaintiffs' privilege logs and research applicable law.	1.50	
10/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Facilitate expert materials being sent to defense counsel.	3.10	
10/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for meeting and meeting with defendants re privilege logs with K. Dermody and B. Glackin.	2.50	
10/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with J. Saveri re case management.	0.50	
10/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft correspondence to co-counsel firm re case; draft correspondence to defendants re financial agreements with witnesses.	1.40	
10/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise service of backup data; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Danielle Lambert deposition; draft letter re case management to Linda Nussbaum and Eric Cramer.	1.30	
10/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re privilege logs.	0.70	
10/03/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
10/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Compile information on plaintiffs' production; team emails re expert materials to defendants; email team re plaintiff deposition defense schedules and document review; review invoices from TERIS with K. Dugar; email James Dallal re Adobe documents.	2.80	
10/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google post-Department of Justice defendant production and Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.30	
10/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for and review documents on recruiting non-technical and non-creative employees.	0.10	
10/04/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery plan. Telephone conference with A. Shaver, D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove, Eric Cramer re plaintiff depositions; many emails re privilege log issues and review correspondence re same; confer with J. Forderer re follow-up; emails with A. Shaver re TERIS; review research re plaintiffs' privilege logs and email team re same; edit letter re same.	4.00	
10/04/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Compare letters for follow up. Find the defendants' request for production and plaintiff response for J. Forderer.	1.30	
10/04/12	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation support: Follow up on technical issues re transfer of large files to opposing counsel; call with J. Forderer re same.	2.00	
10/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Confer with K. Dermody and draft letters re privilege log challenges re Google's and plaintiffs' logs.	2.00	
10/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Respond to request by Justina Sessions re document retention.	0.30	
10/04/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft agenda for deposition defense call; conference call on same with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, D. Harvey and co-counsel; call with TERIS on accounting issue and confer with K. Dermody re vendor.	7.60	
10/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	7.80	
10/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to A. Shaver re documents.	0.20	
10/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re experts; email J. Forderer re privilege logs.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/05/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and documents on the internal computer drive. Create chart of all depositions for D. Harvey. Work with Litigation Support and litigation vendor to find documents on named plaintiffs per D. Harvey's instructions. Update production log, send CD to litigation vendor for upload.	4.70	
10/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
10/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
10/05/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find faculty websites for potential experts.	0.30	
10/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re deposition defense outline and edit same; email to B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Ed Leamer deposition; email D. Harvey re privilege logs.	0.80	
10/08/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Prepare various documents for D. Harvey in preparation for the deposition of plaintiffs Neil Hariharan and Michael Devine. Organize documents in the war room. Contact litigation vendor to receive updates on status of documents on plaintiffs. Update production log with Intel information. Provide latest productions from third parties to litigation vendor and update chart and put in war room per D. Harvey's instructions. Create copies of deposition preparation CD for A. Shaver and provide to Joseph Saveri Law Firm and D. Harvey. Update chart with the time and location of plaintiff depositions per A. Shaver's instructions. Work with litigation vendor to create CD with two plaintiff documents that need bates numbers assigned per J. Forderer's instructions. Retrieve conformed copy of motion for class certification from Records for D. Harvey. Organize documents for plaintiff deposition preparation.	5.00	
10/08/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letters re plaintiffs' privilege logs and Apple's privilege logs.	2.40	
10/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Siddharth Hariharan deposition; review plaintiffs' documents; email with K. Dermody re privilege logs; revise discovery responses; email with K. Dermody, conference with E. Fastiff re plaintiff depositions.	7.20	
10/08/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Process correspondence for records; emails with Lee Rubin re Google discovery; confer with D. Harvey re interrogatory responses; draft deposition defense outline and circulate; conference with James Dallal re deposition letters and follow-up.	3.40	
10/08/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
10/09/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with D. Harvey re discovery assignments and review of materials.	1.20	
10/09/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re depositions, privilege logs. Review interrogatory response with D. Harvey and A. Shaver.	0.50	
10/09/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Prepare binder for D. Harvey with the declaration of A. Shaver including all 71 exhibits. Verify documents sent over by litigation vendor and insert beginning documents for each named plaintiff. Draft letter for J. Forderer to enclose plaintiffs' fifth production. Send to Services to mail out via Federal Express. Verify production CD contains all the needed elements. Print three Excel files plaintiffs produced for Michael Devine and give to D. Harvey, work with litigation vendor to obtain list of all Excel documents.	5.40	
10/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare production of plaintiff documents previously withheld for privilege.	0.70	
10/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research defendants' privilege log correspondence and meet with D. Harvey.	1.80	
10/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for plaintiff depositions, review documents re same and confer with K. Dermody re same; conference with co-counsel re same; review correspondence; conference with J. Forderer re privilege log issues; conference with L. Cisneros re case assignment.	7.50	
10/09/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; research for memorandum on a Google recruiting practice; preparation for upcoming plaintiff's deposition.	7.50	
10/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with K. Dugar re TERIS and emails re same; call with James Dallal re deponents and emails with team re same; review deposition chart; confer with K. Dermody re witness preparation.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	3.90	
10/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel post-Department of Justice defendant production.	2.00	
10/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of plaintiff Michael Devine documents in preparation for deposition preparation.	1.80	
10/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey re document review.	0.10	
10/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Weekly conference call re document review.	0.20	
10/10/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Review materials for discovery assignment.	0.50	
10/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re privilege logs; email team re depositions.	0.20	
10/10/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and electronic court filing notices. Send D. Harvey copies of letters from Adobe counsel and recent Apple privilege log. Examine documents and look for a certain plaintiff's name per A. Shaver's instructions.	2.50	
10/10/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit memorandum re plaintiffs' depositions.	0.40	
10/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Email with K. Dermody and review privilege logs, conference with co-counsel re same; prepare for Siddharth Hariharan deposition.	9.10	
10/10/12	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation, document review and memorandum research.	7.50	
10/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise deposition defense outline and circulate: confer with D. Harvey re interrogatory responses and send new versions to plaintiffs; emails with Mark Fichtner re defendants' depositions discussion. ; review Mark Fichtner documents for deposition; schedule team call for defendants' depositions discussion.	4.00	
10/10/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of plaintiff Michael Devine documents in preparation for deposition preparation.	8.00	
10/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery. Telephone conference with J. Saveri, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal, A. Shaver re deposition witnesses; meeting with D. Harvey and Lisa Leebove re plaintiff deposition preparation; emails with team re privilege log issues; email Lee Rubin re discovery; review materials re deponents; telephone conference with Siddarth Hariharan and D. Harvey re	3.00	
10/11/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and documents on the internal computer drive. Organize materials for deposition preparation. Put together deposition binder for A. Shaver for Mark Fichtner deposition. Locate all emails involving Steve Jobs for A. Shaver.	5.20	
10/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Siddharth Hariharan deposition and meetings with K. Dermody re same.	10.10	
10/11/12	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation review; memorandum on Google "pancake" project; document review.	7.50	
10/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Mark Fichtner documents and prepare for deposition; conference call with K. Dermody, Saveri Law Firm re custodians; review correspondence on same; emails with Lee Rubin re Google production; pull Steve Jobs' emails; revise deposition defense outline and emails on same.	5.30	
10/11/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
10/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re plaintiff depositions and discovery.	0.30	
10/12/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find attachments to Steve Jobs' emails for A. Shaver. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Find documents for D. Harvey deposition on original CD.	4.70	
10/12/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Deposition target analysis.	0.80	
10/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Defend Siddharth Hariharan deposition, prepare for same; conference with Siddharth Hariharan re	11.20	
10/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/12/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft letters to defendants re supplemental custodians; research correspondence on same; team emails re same and re Siddharth Hariharan deposition.	4.30	
10/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice defendant production.	5.50	
10/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email and memo to D. Harvey summarizing Google document review.	2.50	
10/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to D. Harvey re Michael Devine, Ed Leamer depositions.	0.20	
10/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit letters re custodians and send; emails to D. Harvey re deposition defense and preparation.	0.60	
10/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re depositions.	0.20	
10/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and circulate summary of Siddharth Hariharan deposition; prepare for Mark Fichtner deposition; correspond with team re class certification issues; email K. Dermody re depositions.	3.50	
10/14/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with Mark Fichtner to	8.00	
10/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with A. Shaver and Mark Fichtner re general; email team re documents and depositions; email D. Harvey re Michael Devine.	1.00	
10/15/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and documents on the internal computer drive. Contact Nic Burns per D. Harvey's request re format for deposition transcript and video. Send D. Harvey information on all Intel depositions requested.	2.40	
10/15/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Intel; team correspondence re same.	0.60	
10/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re case status; review and draft correspondence; conference with defendants' counsel re deposition of Edward Leamer.	2.50	
10/15/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Defend deposition of Mark Fichtner.	8.20	
10/15/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Intel and Lucas post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
10/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Ed Leamer deposition; email D. Harvey re logs; email team re Google documents.	0.20	
10/16/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive, send dates to Calendar for upcoming depositions. Scan and save Daniel Stover's recent interrogatory response for plaintiffs.	1.50	
10/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Michael Devine rediscovery status, logs.	3.50	
10/16/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with Frank Hinman and Mark Fichtner re confer with D. Harvey re Google custodian requests; emails with TERIS re pulling documents for Google supplemental custodians; emails with B. Glackin re Brandon Marshall deposition defense.	1.70	
10/16/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice defendant production.	8.00	
10/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re Intel settlement/damages; email B. Glackin re deposition summaries; attend call with A. Shaver, B. Glackin, J. Saveri, Lisa Leebove re depositions (partial); review/edit letter to Google re depositions.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/17/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update Excel chart with attorneys who took depositions for B. Glackin. Search what documents may be missing and communicate with litigation vendor per D. Harvey's instructions. Pull fifty documents off Relativity for D. Harvey. Create proof of service for D. Harvey and combine responses from plaintiffs with verification pages to submit to defense counsel. Talk to litigation vendor about a recently delivered CD. Process incoming Donna Morris transcript, update file-transfer protocol site, and send to Econ One. Scan in signed protective order for Neil Hariharan.	4.80	
10/17/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for defense of Brandon Marshall deposition; meeting with D. Harvey; team call re deposition scheduling; telephone conference with Ed Leamer; telephone conference with	7.50	
10/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for depositions of Brandon Marshall, Michael Devine, and Daniel Stover, review documents re same, conference with team re same; manage document review; serve interrogatory responses; research privilege log legal standards.	7.50	
10/17/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging; deposition preparation.	7.50	
10/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, B. Glackin, K. Dermody and co-counsel re depositions and custodians; draft letter to Lee Rubin re same; leave voicemails with Emily Henn and David Kiernan re same; confer with D. Harvey re verification pages for Daniel Stover and Brandon Marshall; review TERIS pull of Google custodians.	2.00	
10/17/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice defendant production.	3.00	
10/17/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; plaintiff Brandon Marshall deposition preparation.	7.50	
10/18/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Speak with K. Dermody and D. Harvey regarding research assignment.	0.20	
10/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Case management. Prepare for team call re Ed Leamer deposition and review Ed Leamer materials; telephone call with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove re Intel; meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re assignments, discovery, trial; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Intel re settlement; meeting with D. Harvey re privilege log issues; multiple emails with team re depositions; conference with D. Harvey re Michael Devine deposition preparation; email D. Harvey re task list and CaseMap; conference with D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re Steve Jobs document research; email	3.50	
10/18/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Load files from CD on to internal computer drive and send link to A. Shaver. Input all final deposition transcripts and exhibits onto TextMap per D. Harvey's instructions. Revise deposition tracking chart. Create binder for B. Glackin with material from class certification filing. Find any letters regarding testimony of Steve Jobs for D. Harvey.	4.00	
10/18/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare to defend Brandon Marshall in his deposition; prepare to defend Ed Leamer in his deposition.	2.50	
10/18/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting with D. Harvey and K. Dermody; team call re potential Intel settlement.	1.00	
10/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; research privilege log issues; conference with K. Dermody, B Glackin re discovery issues; conference with co-counsel re settlement strategy; conference with Michael Devine re	7.20	
10/18/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Create new database accounts and assist users to database organization and navigation.	1.50	
10/18/12	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation.	8.50	
10/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with Emily Henn re custodians; emails with James Dallal re same; finalize Lee Rubin letter and serve; review D. Harvey's task list; emails with team re reporting; draft letter to David Kiernan re depositions and proof of service; emails re same; confer with D. Harvey re search terms; review James Dallal's emails re custodians.	2.80	
10/18/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; plaintiff Brandon Marshall deposition preparation.	8.00	
10/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend call with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove, Eric Cramer re Ed Leamer deposition; review defense expert report re wage regression analysis vulnerabilities and confer with B. Glackin re same; confer with B. Glackin re expert work and Saveri cost contribution; confer with D. Harvey re documents and personal email searches.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/19/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Look into fixing deposition movie DVDs that have time/date stamp that overlap with subtitles per D. Harvey's request. Contact court reporter service and work with videographer. Locate three deponent DVDs with Records. Update production log with latest Google CD. Create a copy and send to litigation vendor. Update deposition log with information about final transcripts and exhibits per D. Harvey's request. Update Danielle Lambert and Jeffrey Vijungco rough transcripts with the final versions and add all exhibits. Add exhibits to TextMap for all merit depositions. Move all boxes for plaintiff depositions into war room and organize per D. Harvey's request. Print documents for James Dallal needed for document review.	6.00	
10/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund; telephone conference with Ed Leamer; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re cost fund contribution.	0.90	
10/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare to defend Ed Leamer in his deposition; confer with K. Dermody re potential expert vulnerabilities; team call re Ed Leamer; review Brandon Marshall documents; office conference with E. Fastiff re case strategy, class certification motion; review report.	4.90	
10/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for plaintiff depositions; research interrogatory responses; research privilege log responses; review documents and manage document review; team conference re expert deposition.	6.50	
10/19/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.30	
10/19/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice document production.	8.00	
10/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.30	
10/21/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Brandon Marshall	8.80	
10/21/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Brandon Marshall and Michael Devine depositions.	3.50	
10/22/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re deposition scheduling.	0.10	
10/22/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log with Google production. Research last bates number produced on Mark Fichtner and have Litigation Support bates stamp three documents starting off with the next number per A. Shaver's instructions. Create six letters to send to defense counsel. Produce documents. Organize incoming documents on the internal computer drive. Update TextMap with all new transcripts and exhibits for Danielle Lambert and Jeffrey Vijungco. Organize war room according to D. Harvey's instructions.	4.40	
10/22/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Brandon Marshall deposition.	9.70	
10/22/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memo to team re Brandon Marshall deposition; telephone conference with D. Harvey re Brandon Marshall deposition.	0.90	
10/22/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel to and from Seattle, WA; conference with Michael Devine regarding	11.20	
10/22/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Assign bates numbering, redact documents manually and prepare outgoing production.	4.20	
10/22/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/22/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and produce Mark Fichtner documents and draft cover letter for same; create pending deposition chart and schedule meet and confer with same; create custodian chart and conference with James Dallal re same.	2.30	
10/22/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice document production.	7.70	
10/22/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on documents.	0.30	
10/23/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with re re ; email with B. Glackin re plaintiff depositions.	0.30	
10/23/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather documents for D. Harvey for Michael Devine deposition preparation, organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Analyze Michael Devine's resume and compare to interrogatory responses for accuracy and report to D. Harvey. Organize Michael Devine interrogatories for D. Harvey. Contact litigation vendor about Google production and upload Mark Fichtner production.	3.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/23/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Brandon Marshall, Mike Devine; office conference with E. Fastiff re same; review Ed Leamer report.	1.50	
10/23/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Michael Devine re review documents; conference with team re case status and pending discovery issues; correspond with defense counsel. Confer with K. Dermody re Devine Deposition.	8.70	
10/23/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/23/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare and conference with David Kiernan re custodians and depositions; conference call with Apple and James Dallal re same; revise custodian and deposition charts and circulate; prepare Mike Devine for deposition.	4.90	
10/23/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Lucas post-Department of Justice document production.	7.50	
10/23/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on documents.	0.50	
10/24/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re Michael Devine deposition; emails with A. Shaver re deposition issues; email Frank Hinman re Ed Leamer.	0.80	
10/24/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save incoming documents to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
10/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and defend Michael Devine deposition. Confer with K. Dermody re Michael Devine deposition.	11.10	
10/24/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/24/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with James Dallal re custodians; conference call with Intel re same; review Google custodian documents; conference call with Lee Rubin re same; emails with team re status update on Google.	3.00	
10/24/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	7.70	
10/24/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on documents.	0.30	
10/25/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Search Accurint, search database, and internet for contact information for fired Google recruiter Stephanie Buran.	0.40	
10/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re depositions, documents; edit letter to defendants re supplemental searches; email with N. Barrows re witness; meeting with Eric Cramer, B. Glackin, Lisa Leebove re deposition preparation and emails re same; email with D. Harvey re Michael Devine.	2.00	
10/25/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and documents on the internal computer drive. Upload transcript of Mark Fichtner deposition to the internal computer drive and produce documents to defense counsel per A. Shaver's request.	1.50	
10/25/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Ed Leamer for his deposition.	6.40	
10/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft summary of Michael Devine deposition; research, draft, and serve letters re electronically stored information search terms; manage document review; review documents; meeting with K. Dermody, A. Shaver re discovery.	7.20	
10/25/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/25/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for deposition of Ed Leamer; conference call with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove re discovery tasks; draft and serve deposition notices on Google; emails with D. Harvey re search terms and re Daniel Stover deposition logistics; emails with defendants re confirming deposition dates; draft 30(b)(6) notice to Intel.	4.60	
10/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	6.80	
10/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey regarding documents.	1.20	
10/26/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Research waiver of attorney-client privilege and work product privilege for Defendants' documents.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/26/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming documents and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update deposition log with new dates for defense counsel deponents. Prepare document production from Microsoft to litigation vendor. Update production log with this version. Work with Litigation Support to play DVDs with subtitles not covering up the time and date stamp per D. Harvey's instructions. Load Mark Fichtner deposition and transcript into TextMap and save files to the internal computer drive.	2.00	
10/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend Ed Leamer deposition.	11.70	
10/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research privilege log issues; review correspondence; conference with defense counsel re plaintiff subpoenas; review and revise draft deposition notices; conference re expert depositions; conference with client re subpoenas; conference with plaintiff re deposition.	6.50	
10/26/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/26/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise 30(b)(6) notice to Intel and circulate; emails with team re Pixar deposition dates.	0.50	
10/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document review.	7.50	
10/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey regarding document review.	0.50	
10/26/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research opposing expert Kevin Murphy.	0.30	
10/27/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Google documents; email with L. Cisneros re privilege log challenge/research assignment re Apple.	0.30	
10/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/28/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Legal research concerning work product doctrine and attorney-client privilege.	3.50	
10/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with client and co-counsel re	8.50	
10/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re possible retention and expert issues; email with D. Harvey re Michael Devine deposition and issues; telephone call with D. Harvey re Michael Devine deposition; email with D. Harvey re privilege logs; confer with B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock retention; email James Dallal re Intel depositions; memo to team re internal equity discovery.	1.80	
10/29/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming documents on the internal computer drive. Log in incoming production and send to litigation vendor. Find range of bates numbers plaintiffs produced for Daniel Stover for D. Harvey.	1.00	
10/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re legal standard for relevance redactions.	1.10	
10/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memoranda to lawyers and economists re Ed Leamer deposition; office conference with D. Harvey re expert work.	1.30	
10/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re discovery; review correspondence.	1.50	
10/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Adobe document cited in Ed Leamer report; memorandum re same; memorandum to Joseph Saveri requesting contemporaneous time and expense.	0.50	
10/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody and Kevin Hallock; telephone conference with K. Dermody re same; telephone conference with A. Shaver re witnesses.	1.10	
10/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Defend Daniel Stover deposition, prepare for same, conference with client re Glackin re expert; meeting with B. Glackin re discovery.	12.50	
10/29/12	KRUSE, JOY	Research and respond to A. Shaver email regarding Mark Fichtner;	10.00	
10/29/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate texts and articles authored by Kevin Murphy, for J. Zhu.	0.60	
10/29/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with James Dallal; call with Mark Fichtner relissue; attend deposition of Daniel Stover; email Emily Henn re Pixar dates; pull documents for post-Ed Leamer analysis and review B. Glackin emails on same.	6.00	
10/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	7.70	
10/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.30	
10/29/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find scholarly articles written by opposing expert, Kevin Murphy.	4.50	
10/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Dan Purcell re Lucas; email with D. Harvey re discovery of defendant witnesses; email with team re Lucas-Disney deal and review media re same; meeting with Lisa Leebove, A. Shaver and Lee Rubin re discovery; meeting with Lisa Leebove and A. Shaver re same; email with T. Desouza re Ed Leamer transcript; email D. Harvey re Adobe/Intuit production; prepare for Google meet and confer.	3.00	
10/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research into Comcast case going to Supreme Court for J. Forderer. Organize incoming documents on the internal computer database. Work with litigation vendor to have recent Intuit production placed in database per D. Harvey's instructions. Locate transcript for K. Dermody and A. Shaver.	3.50	
10/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re Daubert standard, class certification and regression analysis.	5.50	
10/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; telephone conference with research re admissibility of multiple regression analysis; office conference with J. Forderer re same.	7.40	
10/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re outstanding discovery tasks; conference with Adobe and Intuit counsel re discovery issues; correspond with Pixar counsel re document production issues; research upcoming depositions; revise and draft correspondence re privilege logs.	3.50	
10/30/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Coordinate CaseMap meeting with reviewers.	0.40	
10/30/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate texts on multiple regression analysis, for B. Glackin.	0.50	
10/30/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
10/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with James Dallal; conference with Lee Rubin, K. Dermody and Lisa Leebove; review Apple potential custodian documents; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re task list; email Emily Henn re dates.	6.10	
10/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Judgment document production.	7.90	
10/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.10	
10/30/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find scholarly articles written by opposing expert, Kevin Murphy.	1.70	
10/31/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Locate articles and books for expert examination.	1.30	
10/31/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming documents and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Create list for D. Harvey to go out in a letter to Intel. Load the transcript and exhibits of Siddharth Hariharan to TextMap and send Calendar errata deadlines to keep track of when to respond. Review the deposition transcript of Edward Learner for typos per B. Glackin's instructions. Put together binder for B. Glackin and D. Harvey on articles regarding Kevin Murphy. Search Pacer for case numbers for two relevant cases and find expert reports.	4.40	
10/31/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re Daubert standard, class certification and regression analysis.	1.00	
10/31/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise correspondence re privilege logs; conference with Pixar's counsel re search terms; conference with co-counsel re Sharon Coker deposition; review legal research re waiving attorney client privilege.	4.50	
10/31/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/31/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Mark Fichtner deposition transcript for errata.	4.00	
10/31/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	8.00	
10/31/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find expert reports, depositions, and declarations of opposing expert, Kevin Murphy.	5.50	
11/01/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re correction to Ed Leamer report; edit letter to Intel re log.	0.50	
11/01/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming documents on the internal computer drive. Put together two binders for B. Glackin for an expert. Gather all class certification documents and place in a binder. Create Excel chart of all custodians by defendant by searching correspondence folder on internal computer drive per D. Harvey's request. Put together exhibits for letter going out on behalf of Siddharth Hariharan per D. Harvey's request. Organize documents and save on internal computer drive. Continue reading deposition of Edward Leamer per B. Glackin's instructions and look for typos.	5.40	
11/01/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Deposition of Sharon Coker.	9.20	
11/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re depositions; meeting with D. Harvey re reply brief planning; review Kevin Murphy materials; confer with K. Dermody and draft errata letter re Ed Leamer report; draft memorandum of excerpts re Ed Leamer report.	5.10	
11/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer transcript.	1.00	
11/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re depositions; research class certification expert issues; research reply brief; research Kevin Murphy background.	4.10	
11/01/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
11/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	7.50	
11/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.30	
11/01/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find scholarly articles of expert, Ed Leamer.	0.30	
11/02/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create custodian list for D. Harvey. Organize incoming documents and correspondence on internal computer drive. Continue reading deposition of Edward Leamer for B. Glackin for typos.	3.00	
11/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and write memorandum re Daubert standard, class certification and regression analysis.	6.80	
11/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Ed Leamer curriculum vitae for his articles on sensitivity and review.	0.40	
11/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Kevin Murphy literature; draft letter to Donn Pickett; office conference with D. Harvey re deposition and discovery issues.	3.90	
11/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with third party re subpoena, research and prepare for same; manage document review; review documents; research privilege log issues.	6.50	
11/02/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Call with Sujal Shah re custodians; email James Dallal re same and draft follow-up letter to Lee Rubin.	1.50	
11/02/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice document production.	7.60	
11/02/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.20	
11/02/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Telephone call with D. Harvey regarding scheduling.	0.20	
11/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research experts and and	2.70	
11/02/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles by opposing expert, Kevin Murphy.	1.30	
11/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with T. Desouza re custodians.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/05/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Research attorney-client privilege challenges and prepare memorandum.	6.00	
11/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Google privilege log letter and email D. Harvey re same; email D. Harvey re drafting requests for production of documents; email with D. Harvey re depositions; edit letter to Google re documents; review Ed Leamer deposition transcript.	3.50	
11/05/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence and documents on the internal computer drive. Finish custodian list for D. Harvey. Collect privilege logs and certain documents for J. Forderer. Add document to CaseMap for D. Harvey. Load deposition transcripts and exhibits of Michael Devine and Brandon Marshall to the internal computer drive and to TextMap. Double check bates numbers from privilege logs on letter J. Forderer is sending out.	3.50	
11/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Apple and Google re privilege logs.	7.50	
11/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise letters re privilege log issues and email K. Dermody re same; research class certification standards, conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same; research deposition schedule, conference with A. Shaver re same; draft document requests, revise letter re same; supervise document review, review documents.	6.20	
11/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey and update deposition chart; draft follow-up letter to Christina Braun and conference with James Dallal re same; email Sujal Shah re Intel custodians; review D. Harvey letter re personal emails; serve letter to Lee Rubin.	3.00	
11/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	7.90	
11/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.10	
11/06/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re document custodians.	0.10	
11/06/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Locate all documents containing the name Pamela Harbridge for upcoming deposition - examine CaseMap then Relativity. After search, coordinate with Litigation Support to conduct search to have fuller analysis of multiple databases per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.60	
11/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re depositions.	0.40	
11/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Comcast oral argument re pending motion for class certification.	0.50	
11/06/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Find documents for use with deposition.	6.00	
11/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise draft discovery requests; manage document review; review documents; conference with co-counsel re depositions; revise letter re privilege log challenges; prepare for Pam Zissimos deposition.	7.50	
11/06/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Assist with document collection.	0.50	
11/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey re depositions; create past deposition charts; review emails re additional requests for production; email Kramm re upcoming depositions; call David Kiernan re custodians; email Emily Henn re custodians and calendar response dates; meet and confer with D. Harvey and Intel re privilege log issues and custodians.	2.80	
11/06/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Conference call and meeting to discuss case.	0.30	
11/06/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	7.70	
11/07/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Exchange emails with D. Harvey and K. Dermody concerning Department of Justice notes of Steve Jobs' interviews.	0.20	
11/07/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and respond to D. Harvey's question regarding discovery letter to defendant.	0.20	
11/07/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Contact Veritext per D. Harvey's instructions. Proofread bates numbers for letter per J. Forderer's instructions. Add documents to CaseMap, and organize privilege logs in the internal computer drive.	2.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Apple, Intuit and LucasFilm re privilege logs.	6.00	
11/07/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Legal research re regression.	1.20	
11/07/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research regression analysis; review Kevin Murphy literature.	0.90	
11/07/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research regressions; telephone conference with	0.80	
11/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with third party recipient of subpoena, Dashwire; conference with opposing counsel re privilege log challenges; review and revise draft letters re discovery issues; manage document review, review documents; prepare for Pamela Zissimos deposition.	5.50	
11/07/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Apple privilege log; edit letters to Apple, Pixar, Intuit; review L. Cisneros' research re Steve Jobs notes.	1.00	
11/08/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Call Veritext for deposition transcript per D. Harvey's instructions. Put together two binders for D. Harvey with exhibits and certain documents chosen by D. Harvey. Create an index. Search documents on Relativity for J. Forderer. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Add documents to CaseMap. Load deposition transcripts and exhibits of Daniel Stover to the internal computer drive and to TextMap. Calendar errata deadlines for them as well.	5.00	
11/08/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letters to LucasFilm, Pixar and Adobe re privilege logs.	7.30	
11/08/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Revise plaintiffs' privilege logs.	0.80	
11/08/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with R. Heimann and D. Harvey re depositions.	0.50	
11/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft correspondence re Intel discovery issues; review and revised correspondence re privilege log challenges, research same, conference with J. Forderer re same; manage document review; review documents; prepare for Pamela Zissimos deposition.	7.10	
11/08/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Pixar letter and email Emily Henn re custodians; email team re bi-weekly call; emails with D. Harvey re merits depositions.	0.50	
11/08/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	8.00	
11/09/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re discovery call.	0.10	
11/09/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all incoming documents and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Finish index for two binders for D. Harvey and add 6 documents. Call Kramm and Veritext about transcripts. Add documents in CaseMap that were coded as hot into the fact list per J. Forderer's instructions. Search documents in Relativity for certain bates numbers for J. Forderer. Update production log with recent Google production and send to litigation vendor.	5.00	
11/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letter to Adobe re privilege logs; conference with Peter Julian re same.	4.70	
11/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet with D. Harvey re CaseMap and organize documents on CaseMap.	0.70	
11/09/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Ed Leamer's publications on sensitivity.	0.30	
11/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re depositions.	0.70	
11/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise correspondence re discovery issues; conference with defense counsel re confidentiality issues; conference with co-counsel re case management; manage document review; review documents; meeting with B. Glackin re depositions.	3.50	
11/09/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Ed Catmull).	2.30	
11/09/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/09/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Pamela Zissimos deposition.	5.50	
11/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re privilege log issues; email with B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock; edit letter to Adobe re privilege log; email D. Harvey re Michael Devine; edit Lucas letter re discovery; communicate with D. Harvey re defendants' certification materials.	1.50	
11/12/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for D. Harvey. Pull exhibits off litigation vendor website, put together binder, and create 8 copies of each. Double check contents, create box, and give to D. Harvey. Double check all facts and documents in CaseMap to ensure all documents coded as hot are in both places. Add missing ones and fill in the copy to person in each applicable email per J. Forderer's instructions.	6.50	
11/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft letters to Adobe and LucasFilm re privilege logs.	0.80	
11/12/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, label and describe hot documents in CaseMap.	4.90	
11/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Pamela Zissimos deposition; draft and revise correspondence re discovery issues; draft and serve deposition notice; review documents; manage document review.	7.20	
11/12/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Ed Catmull).	3.70	
11/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	3.70	
11/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice production.	3.00	
11/12/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Prepare internal equity search memo.	1.00	
11/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Case management. Email team re motion to strike and review same; email D. Harvey and J. Forderer re confidentiality designations; email with B. Glackin re defendants' extra page violations and response to same.	1.00	
11/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Create binders for J. Forderer containing opposition brief, Susan Welch declaration, and Kevin Murphy report. Locate case management conference transcripts for J. Forderer. Search for a particular quote he needed. Search through Edward Learner deposition transcript for key words. Prepare documents for K. Dermody and make a binder for B. Glackin containing specified documents they requested of defendant filing. Create un redacted binders of filing for D. Harvey.	6.70	
11/13/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' responses to class action brief and defendants' motion to strike for response to same.	2.50	
11/13/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft administrative motion to strike defendants' motion to strike expert report.	2.70	
11/13/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft declaration and proposed order sealing plaintiff confidential documents.	3.20	
11/13/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft responses to defendants' motion for an evidentiary hearing.	3.00	
11/13/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review defendants' opposition papers for response.	5.30	_
11/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Take Pamela Zissimos deposition, prepare for same; conference with team re response to class certification opposition materials, review same.	10.50	
11/13/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Ed Catmull).	4.60	
11/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Weekly document review conference call; edit coding sheet and circulate; confer with D. Harvey re witness litigation holds; conference with Lisa Leebove re reviewing attorney; request research on LinkedIn profiles; review class certification opposition brief; conference with James Dallal re Bruce Chizen deposition; draft deposition notice for LCHB witnesses; confer with B. Glackin re depositions and re administrative motion to strike.	5.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/13/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case management transcripts for J. Forderer.	0.50	
11/13/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice production.	7.70	
11/13/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.30	
11/14/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search of Lexis for Westlaw cases cited in brief.	0.60	
11/14/12	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Create binders of deposition of Arnnon Geshuri and Lori McAdams including all exhibits and Word indices per D. Harvey.	2.00	
11/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification strategy. Review defendants' certification opposition and Murphy report; emails to team re same; conference with D. Harvey re plaintiff issues; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re case management, class strategy; conference with D. Harvey re plaintiffs' third request for production of documents; email with E. Fastiff re case management and document review; conference with A. Shaver re	4.00	
11/14/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Create binders of redacted and un redacted documents of opposition to class certification filing for team. Put together index for all cases cited in opposition brief. Create list of each exhibit filed under seal.	6.10	
11/14/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read supporting declarations and briefs for defendants' opposition to class action motion for response to same.	3.70	
11/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft response to administrative motion for evidentiary hearing.	2.50	
11/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Manage documents on Egnyte Cloud web site.	0.50	
11/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Manage, sort and describe hot documents on CaseMap.	2.00	
11/14/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and draft declaration and order re plaintiff confidentiality for motion to seal.	2.40	
11/14/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review defendants' opposition papers and confer with K. Dermody; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri and Lisa Leebove re assignments; office conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver; draft/revise administrative briefs.	7.30	
11/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review class certification materials, research reply brief; conference with defendants re motion to strike and other issues; conference with team re class certification strategy; conference with named plaintiff received in the strike and other issues; manage document review; review motion to seal materials.	7.20	
11/14/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition; review defendants' opposition to motion for class certification.	3.90	
11/14/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/14/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Case law research for motion to strike; email with B. Glackin re same; draft same; review T. Desouza deposition chart; review defendants' motions to strike Ed Leamer report; team emails re conference scheduling; meet and confer with Michael Tubach and Frank Hinman; edit administrative motion; draft declaration and proposed order for same.	8.50	
11/14/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citations re opposition to class certification for review.	2.30	
11/14/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice production.	7.50	
11/14/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to D. Harvey on document review.	0.50	
11/15/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification reply planning. Edits to plaintiffs' administrative motion re motion to strike; multiple conferences with team re same; email B. Glackin re unredacted brief; team meeting with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re case assignments and discovery; meeting with D. Harvey to review plaintiffs' documents filed by defendants with opposition to determine if confidentiality designation should be maintained; email with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re deposition scheduling; conference with LCHB and Saveri Law Firm re defendants' opposition (0.80); many conversations with B. Glackin re Kevin Murphy and Ed Leamer expert work; review Kevin Murphy article.	6.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/15/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all incoming documents and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer database. Organize binders for K. Dermody and D. Harvey for meet and confer discovery conference. Double check collection of privilege logs for meet and confer discovery conference. Draft a proof of service and deposition notice for Dr. Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin.	5.80	
11/15/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel conference call; read Kevin Murphy declaration re class certification opposition.	2.70	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Manage, sort and describe hot documents on CaseMap.	1.30	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, K. Dermody, E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re class certification reply brief; followup re same.	1.60	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition by reviewing expert reports.	1.10	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and draft opposition to defendants' administrative motion for evidentiary hearing.	0.80	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review, research and redact plaintiff information in defendants' filing.	2.80	
11/15/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Telephone calls and emails with Justina Sessions re LucasFilm privilege logs.	0.70	
11/15/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	LCHB conference re class certification strategy.	1.00	
11/15/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman and Michael Tubach; revise, supervise filing of administrative motion re Daubert motion; deal with issue of filed document.	11.30	
11/15/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research reply to class certification; research discovery issues; conference with defendants re motion to strike and briefing schedule; conference with team and co-counsel re reply strategy: conference with defendants re responses to third set of document requests; conference with clients re briefs.	11.50	
11/15/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Ed Catmull).	4.90	
11/15/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain articles cited in Kevin Murphy's expert report, for J. Zhu.	1.00	
11/15/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Amend e-filing; draft motion and proposed order; research electronic court filing rules; team emails re same.	3.00	
11/15/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Call with David Kiernan; follow-up with D. Harvey re Intel; follow-up with Cristina Brown re Apple; locate additional cites for administrative motion; edit and revise same and e-file same; draft status documents for binder on discovery meet and confer tomorrow.	7.00	
11/15/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of Google post-Department of Justice production.	7.20	
11/15/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on document review.	0.80	
11/15/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles by	2.30	
11/15/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles cited by opposing exert, Kevin Murphy.	2.70	
11/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage discovery. Meet and confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, defendants re privilege logs, witnesses, documents and plaintiffs' request for production of documents; email with B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock; review John Keker letter and email with D. Harvey re privilege documents; review related e-Bay filing information; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re plaintiffs' request for production of documents and edit letter re same; edit plaintiffs' opposition to defendants' motion for evidentiary log; prepare for meet and confer, review defendants' discovery letters; email with D. Harvey re Intel documents; email with D. Harvey re Lucas and Pixar privilege logs; emails with A. Shaver re corrected administrative motion; meeting with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re class certification issues and strategy; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, J. Forderer re Murphy/experts; email with E. Fastiff re document review issues.	6.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/16/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare chambers copies for Judge Lucy Koh per J. Forderer's instructions. Draft letter for court and get envelope ready per standing orders. Find all LinkedIn profiles on two lists for A. Shaver, create folder on internal computer drive to store them. Create copies of documents highlighted and put electronic copies on internal computer drive for J. Forderer. Create folder for defense to upload documents on Cloud Egnyte per D. Harvey's instructions. Search Christina Brown exhibits for keywords per J. Forderer's instructions. Organize incoming production and update privilege logs with new Pixar logs that came in.	5.50	
11/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft and file opposition to defendants' motion for evidentiary hearing.	2.20	
11/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft declaration re motion to seal for plaintiffs' confidential information.	4.90	
11/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition by reviewing expert materials.	1.40	
11/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for B. Glackin re new materials in reply expert reports.	0.20	
11/16/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, B. Glackin and experts re defendants' expert report.	1.00	
11/16/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, J. Forderer, Ed Leamer and Tubach and additional defense counsel; review/revise opposition to motion for evidentiary hearing; prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition.	7.30	
11/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research reply brief; conference with defendants re discovery issues, draft and review correspondence re same; draft summary of discovery issues, research same; conference with LCHB team and experts re expert issues; review documents and manage document review.	9.50	
11/16/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition.	4.20	
11/16/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research legislative history of Civil Local Rule 7.3, for A. Shaver.	0.60	
11/16/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
11/16/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with B. Glackin re docket; edit and then e-file motion; review amended Exhibit A; direct chambers copies of filings; review letter from Apple re custodians and emails with D. Harvey re same; review D. Harvey's discovery outline; emails with Emily Henn re custodians and depositions; telephone conference with Brandon Marshall; telephone conference with Mark Fichtner; email D. Harvey and J. Forderer re same.	5.50	
11/16/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	7.50	
11/16/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on document review.	0.50	
11/16/12	ZHU, JULIE	Research scholarly articles by .	2.50	
11/16/12	ZHU, JULIE	Summarize new cases brought against eBay and Intuit by the Department of Justice and the California Attorney General.	0.30	
11/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email to D. Harvey re Kevin Murphy documents.	0.20	
11/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief in support of class certification; review defendants' opposition materials; review confidential information for redactions, review and revise declaration and proposed order re same.	10.50	
11/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email LCHB team, Joe Saveri re Pixar call re settlement; edit administrative motion re sealing and email D. Harvey re same; emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re motion to strike; review defendants' opposition to plaintiffs' administrative motion and email team re same.	2.50	
11/19/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare chambers copy of Friday's filing for Judge Lucy Koh in San Jose per J. Forderer's instructions. Download Google production, burn on a CD and send to TERIS for uploading per D. Harvey's instructions. Prepare original and redacted documents based off Adobe letter for D. Harvey. Call Rosalie Kramm to discuss reporting. Prepare documents for J. Forderer from opposition to class certification.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/19/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read draft class certification reply introduction; telephone conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re Pixar settlement strategy.	0.30	
11/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft declaration re motion to seal and redact plaintiff documents; file declaration.	13.00	
11/19/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re expert reply briefs and their comments.	0.50	
11/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	7.80	
11/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise sealing documents; review motion to strike; review defendants' expert report; conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re reply issues and expert issues; conference with defendants' counsel re discovery issues, review correspondence; manage document review and review documents.	10.90	
11/19/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review D. Harvey's class certification reply outline; review defendants' opposition brief assertions re named plaintiffs; annotate deposition of Brandon Marshall; conference with J. Forderer and D. Harvey re under seal filing; review correspondence from defendants; call with Mark Fichtner re errata; conference call with Lee Rubin and D. Harvey re custodians.	3.30	
11/19/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity search.	8.00	
11/19/12	ZHU, JULIE	Print scholarly articles written by for expert preparation.	0.30	
11/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Pixar, Joe Saveri, D. Harvey re settlement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re Disney acquisition of Lucas; email with A. Shaver re Google witnesses; confer with D. Harvey re motion to strike; email Joe Saveri re Pixar exposure analysis and develop same.	2.80	
11/20/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare chambers copies for docket entries 240 and 241 per J. Forderer's instructions. Draft letter, prepare envelope, and contact courier service to go to San Jose. Create binder with all case citations from the motion to strike the report of Edward E. Leamer per D. Harvey's instructions. Use Lexis to pull all cases. Figure out which documents from the newest Intel production are new and which ones are the redacted versions per D. Harvey's instructions.	3.50	
11/20/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit introduction to class action reply brief; read Kevin Murphy declaration.	1.70	
11/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Create summary re team meeting on Kevin Murphy.	1.50	
11/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with Ed Leamer, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Kevin Murphy report.	4.50	
11/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re reply to expert reports.	1.20	
11/20/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review defendants' expert report to prepare for Kevin Murphy's deposition.	1.00	
11/20/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with, Ed Leamer and plaintiffs' counsel to discuss reply brief, reply report and Kevin Murphy deposition.	4.90	
11/20/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	1.20	
11/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Ed Leamer and team re expert work; conference with defense counsel re outstanding discovery tasks; review documents and manage document review.	8.10	
11/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with experts and co-counsel re Kevin Murphy report; call with Mark Fichtner re discovery meeting on Friday; annotate Brandon Marshall deposition transcript; email K. Dermody, R. Geman re disaggregation cases.	7.20	
11/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: cold call hiring data search.	6.80	
11/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails re reporting documents and summarizing results.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Court order and email with team re same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same; email team re motion to strike and work on same.	1.00	
11/21/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Work with Litigation Support on Intel production to differentiate between redacted and new documents for D. Harvey. Organize original and redacted versions of documents on internal computer drive for D. Harvey. Go through hot documents on CaseMap and recipients to each email per J. Forderer's instructions.	4.50	
11/21/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Deborah Conrad deposition.	8.20	
11/21/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	6.50	
11/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and annotate Daniel Stover deposition; emails with team re motion to strike; conference with K. Dermody re Google custodians and research additional custodians; draft letter to Lee Rubin re same.	4.00	
11/21/12	YAMAT, CYRUS	Review document production disc.	1.00	
11/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: cold call hiring data search.	7.80	
11/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting documents and summarizing results.	0.20	
11/22/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: cold call hiring data search.	6.70	
11/22/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting documents and summarizing results.	0.30	
11/23/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: cold call hiring data search.	2.40	
11/23/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting documents and summarizing results.	0.10	
11/24/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply to class certification motion.	6.50	
11/25/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin and Kevin Hallock re call.	0.10	
11/25/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply to class certification motion.	10.50	
11/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: cold call hiring data search.	1.00	
11/26/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with B. Glackin, L. Leebove, Joe Saveri, Kevin Hallock re compensation analysis; telephone conference with B. Glackin re same; emails with E. Fastiff, D. Harvey re reply brief; email with B. Glackin re Adobe; email with A. Shaver re	2.30	
11/26/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Pull redacted and unredacted versions of Intel documents for D. Harvey. Load new Pixar production to file-transfer protocol site and produce to with new Intel documents and send to litigation vendor per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize motion for class certification folder to make sure all un redacted filings are present.	5.50	
11/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition by reviewing expert materials.	3.10	
11/26/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review letter re privilege logs from Apple, Adobe and Intuit.	0.80	
11/26/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy; telephone conference with K. Dermody, J. Saveri, L. Leebove and Kevin Hallock.	9.40	
11/26/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief; conference with co-counsel re opposition to motion to strike; conference with expert team re Kevin Hallock.	9.50	
11/26/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/26/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and annotate depositions of Neil Hariharan and Mark Fichtner; draft and process deposition notices for Bruce Chizen and Ed Catmull; follow-up on custodians with Apple, Intel and Adobe; serve Mark Fichtner errata sheet; conference with D. Harvey re reply brief tasks.	4.90	
11/26/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re class certification for D. Harvey's review.	1.00	
11/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: competitive compensation search.	7.30	
11/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails reporting documents and summarizing results.	0.50	
11/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey re document review.	0.20	
11/27/12	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Search for information re	0.50	
11/27/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Ed Leamer rebuttal draft; confer with B. Glackin re same; meeting with LCHB team re opposition declarant issues; telephone conference with Ed Leamer, Joe Saveri, Eric Cramer, B. Glackin A. Shaver, D. Harvey re expert analysis; email Joe Saveri re Pixar settlement status; email A. Shaver re Adobe defendants; email with D. Harvey re reply evidentiary record.	3.50	
11/27/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Team meeting and call; read draft Ed Leamer reply declaration.	1.00	
11/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meeting with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, B. Glackin, A. Shaver and experts re class certification reply.	2.50	
11/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition by reviewing expert materials and other cases that Kevin Murphy testified in.	1.30	
11/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Privilege log review and meeting with D. Harvey re defendant privilege log issues.	1.50	
11/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re new evidence in reply brief.	0.50	
11/27/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Adobe declaration and Donna Morris deposition for contradictions.	2.30	
11/27/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy; confer with LCHB team re discovery.	10.40	
11/27/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply and associated filings; conference with team and experts; conference with defendants re discovery issues, draft correspondence re same; confer with LCHB team re discovery.	10.50	
11/27/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and B. Glackin re James Dallal proposed deponents and background research for same; conference with B. Glackin, K. Dermody and D. Harvey re declarant issues and response; conference call with co-counsel and experts re expert reply report and review same; annotate Siddharth Hariharan deposition transcript.	7.50	
11/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: competitive compensation search.	6.80	
11/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email reporting documents and summarizing results.	1.20	
11/28/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defense declarants and related evidence; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re evidence and experts; review evidence chart re same; edit letter to defendants re improper declarants and email team re same.	4.00	
11/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research re reliability of employee declarations.	1.50	
11/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Adobe declaration and Donna Morris deposition for contradictions.	3.10	
11/28/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review documents and transcripts for information on number of recruiters for defendants.	1.10	
11/28/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	11.80	
11/28/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification reply brief.	11.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/28/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft letter to defense counsel re declarants; emails re same and edits to same; review Adobe declarations and annotate Jeff Vijunco deposition; create evidentiary rebuttal chart; email with K. Dermody re case management assignment; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Case Management Conference statement and start drafting same; review D. Harvey's revised reply outline.	8.50	
11/28/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re class certification for D. Harvey review.	1.80	
11/28/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re class certification for attorney review.	0.10	
11/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: internal equity; recruiting staff; Steve Jobs.	5.10	
11/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails regarding document review.	0.30	
11/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo to J. Forderer on recruiting staff size and contribution to hires.	1.50	
11/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo update to D. Harvey on internal equity.	1.10	
11/28/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find articles by Kevin Murphy and neoclassical model.	1.30	
11/28/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find 'compensation' book for Kevin Hallock.	0.70	
11/29/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Lisa Leebove re Pixar strategy; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Kevin Murphy deposition questions and Ed Leamer analysis; review Ed Leamer compensation analysis.	2.00	
11/29/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Edit binder indices for defendants' opposition to plaintiffs' motion for class certification per D. Harvey's instructions. Send new Lucasfilm production to Teris and update production log. Calculate how many documents each defendant has produced since the last case management conference for A. Shaver.	4.10	
11/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and review documents for Kevin Murphy deposition and brief.	3.70	
11/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research on defendants' recruiter figures for reply brief.	0.80	
11/29/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Google letter re privilege logs and draft section of case management statement.	0.70	
11/29/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	8.30	
11/29/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply to class certification.	11.10	
11/29/12	RATNER, DALE	Search for documents for deposition preparation and for evidence in response to defendants' motion to deny class certification.	7.50	
11/29/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft Case Management Conference statement; conference call with Intel re custodians; email follow-up on same and research documents for same; pull documents for B. Glackin and annotate; review evidentiary chart; organize named plaintiff rebuttal.	6.50	
11/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review and research.	4.80	
11/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo and updates to D. Harvey for reply brief.	1.00	
11/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo to B. Glackin for deposition preparation.	3.00	
11/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo updates to J. Forderer.	0.20	
11/30/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Kevin Murphy deposition outline and emails with B. Glackin and team re Kevin Murphy deposition, evidence.	2.00	
11/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and documents on the internal computer drive. Pull documents for the deposition of Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin and place on a folder on the internal computer drive. Highlight documents on an Intuit privilege log per J. Forderer's instructions.	2.00	
11/30/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition transcripts in war room per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with Intuit counsel re privilege logs.	1.50	
11/30/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and review documents to prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition and reply brief.	4.80	
11/30/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	6.50	
11/30/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification reply brief and opposition to motion to strike.	6.50	
11/30/12	MONROE, DREW	Discuss task list with T. Desouza and J. Forderer regarding deposition of Kevin Murphy.	0.60	
11/30/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
11/30/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with co-counsel re deposition notices; emails with team re Case Management Conference statement; review documents pulled by reviewing attorneys for Kevin Murphy deposition; draft named plaintiff section for class certification reply brief.	3.50	
11/30/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Kevin Murphy deposition preparation materials.	0.30	
11/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review and research: deposition preparation and reply brief research.	8.80	
11/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo and updates to D. Harvey for reply brief.	0.20	
11/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo to B. Glackin for deposition preparation.	3.50	
11/30/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find scholarly articles for Kevin Murphy's deposition.	1.30	
12/01/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin re Kevin Murphy deposition.	0.10	
12/01/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and review of documents for Kevin Murphy deposition and reply brief.	6.50	
12/01/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	7.30	
12/01/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief.	9.50	
12/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review and research: deposition preparation and reply brief research.	1.00	
12/01/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email research memo to B. Glackin and D. Harvey for deposition and reply brief.	2.00	
12/02/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Memo to R. Heimann, B. Glackin re Kevin Murphy deposition; email Joe Saveri re Pixar settlement strategy; edit Case Management Conference statement and emails with A. Shaver, D. Harvey, Josh Davis re same.	1.50	
12/02/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research and review of documents for Kevin Murphy deposition and reply brief.	9.00	
12/02/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	9.70	
12/02/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief; email with K. Dermody re Case Management strategy.	7.90	
12/02/12	MONROE, DREW	Pull documents from case database, save to internal hard drive and organize for J. Forderer and B. Glackin for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	8.00	
12/02/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with D. Harvey re plaintiff depositions and brief tasks; revise Case Management Conference statement and confer with K. Dermody re same.	0.80	
12/03/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with E. Fastiff, Joe Saveri re Pixar; email to team and Daniel Purcell re settlement; email B. Glackin re Kevin Murphy deposition; edit draft Case Management Conference statement.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/03/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence to the internal computer drive. Find three documents for A. Shaver to send to Econ One. Prepare unredacted copy of the Kevin Murphy report for J. Forderer. Find all resume exhibits for Daniel Stover for D. Harvey and email him a word searchable transcript of Daniel Stover's deposition. Organize deposition transcripts in the war room per D. Harvey's instructions. Update production log with today's Google and Intuit productions and send to litigation vendor. Update TextMap with transcripts of Pamela Zissimos and Deborah Conrad.	3.10	
12/03/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Prepare for Kevin Murphy deposition and attend Kevin Murphy deposition.	12.20	
12/03/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Depose Kevin Murphy; prepare for same; office conference with J. Forderer and D. Harvey re same.	12.10	
12/03/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification reply brief.	10.20	
12/03/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise Case Management Conference statement per K. Dermody instruction and circulate to defendants; case law research on Rule 26(a) and (e); draft evidentiary objections section for brief; review plaintiff depositions and pull cites on class representative adequacy.	7.20	
12/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review and research.	5.80	
12/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates to D. Harvey for document review.	0.20	
12/03/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo to D. Harvey for reply brief evidence.	2.00	
12/04/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re reply brief; review draft insert/evidence re named plaintiffs for reply and email A. Shaver re same.	0.80	
12/04/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare documents pertaining to Edward Leamer for J. Forderer. Find complaints filed by the U.S. Department of Justice and California State Attorney General filed against eBay for D. Harvey. Create new folder on the internal computer drive for these cases. Prepare documents from litigation vendor's website for D. Harvey.	2.00	
12/04/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Kevin Murphy deposition transcript for comment on same.	1.10	
12/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Draft motion to seal and related documents for reply brief.	1.20	
12/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for reply brief.	2.00	
12/04/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review transcript of Kevin Murphy deposition and identify key sections.	5.30	
12/04/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Letter to Frank Hinman re interview notes; draft reply papers; research same.	9.30	
12/04/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise class certification brief; review draft expert report.	12.20	
12/04/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Obtain qualitative research texts for J. Zhu.	0.60	
12/04/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
12/04/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Email with K. Dermody re edits to reply section; Review defendant correspondence; revise Case Management Conference statement; draft letter to Google; review Kevin Murphy deposition and report; draft aggregation insert for reply brief and case law research for same.	7.00	
12/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review.	7.80	
12/04/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates to D. Harvey.	0.20	
12/04/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find books, scholarly articles on qualitative research methods.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/05/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class reply brief management. Edit and revise Case Management Conference statement; confer with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer/Kevin Murphy inserts; confer with A. Shaver re multiple edits; meeting with D. Harvey re assignments/discovery; meet with B. Glackin re reply brief and expert report; review revised Ed Leamer report; emails with D. Harvey re superiority argument; emails with A. Shaver re Google objections to Case Management Conference statement.	3.50	
12/05/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence to the internal computer drive. Watch deposition of Edward Leamer to verify certain transcribed phrases per J. Forderer's instructions. Prepare a supplemental production of documents for plaintiff Daniel Stover for D. Harvey. Work with Litigation Support to put together the production, draft a letter to defense counsel, and update the production log. Manage files on Cloud Egnyte database per J. Forderer's instructions.	3.50	
12/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Research for reply brief.	1.30	
12/05/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Ed Leamer deposition transcript for errata.	4.80	
12/05/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply papers and confer with K. Dermody re same; draft case management conference statement.	10.60	
12/05/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise class certification reply brief; review and revise case management statement; meeting with K. Dermody re discovery and reply; review draft reply expert report, conference with economist and team re same.	9.20	
12/05/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Redact individual images and text files while preparing outgoing document production.	3.00	
12/05/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and coding.	7.50	
12/05/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Lee Rubin re Case Management Conference statement; meet and confer with defendants re same; edit and revise same; confer with B. Glackin re data insert; confer with K. Dermody and e-file Case Management Conference statement; research case law for same.	11.50	
12/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.40	
12/05/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo and updates to D. Harvey.	0.60	
12/06/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage class reply and settlement strategy. Review/edit reply brief and email with B. Glackin re same; confer with B. Glackin re revisions; email Eric Cramer re Ed Leamer work; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Lisa Leebove re Pixar and Lucas settlement strategy, and call to Dan Purcell re same; email Pixar/Lucas re settlement call and telephone conference with Emily Henn re same; emails with Joe Saveri, Emily Henn re call; email with D. Harvey re plaintiff production; emails with team re Google supplemental privilege log; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Case Management Conference filing; review/edit supplemental expert report.	7.50	
12/06/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Prepare chambers copy per D. Harvey's instructions. Create letter, label, and PDF of court document to send via email. Process incoming productions from Adobe and Intuit and send to litigation vendor. Work with litigation vendor to get updates on recent productions and appropriate labeling. Edit plaintiff production letter for D. Harvey and relabel CD. Listen to parts of the deposition of Edward Leamer to verify audio per J. Forderer's instructions. Print out Intuit 012 and certain other documents for J. Forderer. Contact Kramm Court Reporting to find out delivery of electronic transcript for deposition of Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin. Pull documents cited in plaintiffs' reply brief and create a folder on the internal computer drive to store the documents.	4.00	
12/06/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re class certification briefing.	0.30	
12/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Meet and confer with Intuit re privilege logs.	0.50	
12/06/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Ed Leamer deposition transcript for errata.	3.50	
12/06/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply papers; confer with K. Dermody re same.	7.70	
12/06/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise class certification reply brief; manage document review; email with K. Dermody re plaintiffs; review documents; meet and confer with defendants' counsel re privilege log issues and other discovery issues.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/06/12	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation support: Update data disks.	0.20	
12/06/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/06/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with D. Harvey and Lee Rubin; review documents on importance of cold calling; review revised brief.	3.00	
12/06/12	ZHU, JULIE	Find books on qualitative research for expert work.	0.30	
12/07/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Google privilege log issues; email with team re reply edits and review same; conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re reply and supplemental expert report; review revised expert report.	4.80	
12/07/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull all documents for the reply brief, organize folders for them on the internal computer drive and prepare for D. Harvey. Create draft of the declaration for D. Harvey. Update production log. Organize incoming documents on the internal computer drive. Update TextMap with the deposition transcript of Deborah Conrad. Organize exhibits and deposition transcripts of Kevin Murphy on the internal computer drive.	3.00	
12/07/12	FORDERER, JOSEPH	Review Ed Leamer deposition transcript and analyze for errata.	3.50	
12/07/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply papers, confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re same.	9.30	
12/07/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise reply brief in support of class certification; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same; confer with K. Dermody re privilege issues.	11.50	
12/07/12	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research discovery rules on expert interview notes, for B. Glackin.	0.60	
12/07/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft section of reply brief on significance of cold calling; emails with team re organization of brief and filing logistics.	3.00	
12/07/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare reply re class certification for filing.	0.40	
12/08/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re reply brief issues and employee data examples.	0.50	
12/08/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply papers, email with K. Dermody re same.	8.90	
12/08/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise class certification reply brief, email with K. Dermody re employee data.	8.70	
12/08/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Case law research for brief; draft additions to same; review defendant correspondence; draft motion to seal and declaration in support; edit D. Harvey declaration; create case filing map.	4.50	
12/09/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit reply and related documents; emails with team re strategy issues and Ed Leamer report.	6.00	
12/09/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check brief for reply to motion to strike. Verify which documents have been added. Pull all exhibits and create folder on the internal computer drive. Prepare all exhibits for D. Harvey. Prepare Kevin Murphy deposition transcripts and exhibits per D. Harvey's instructions.	7.50	
12/09/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply papers.	8.50	
12/09/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise reply in support of class certification, review expert report re same.	11.50	
12/09/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit reply brief; legal cite check for same; supervise paralegal fact check.	6.50	
12/09/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification reply motion for filing.	5.50	
12/10/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification reply filing edits/conferences/strategy work.	6.50	
12/10/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare for reply brief filing with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, A. Shaver, and D. Harvey. Go over fact checking with A. Shaver, verify all exhibits, prepare printed out versions of everything under seal. Prepare exhibit cover pages and rename folder on the internal computer drive. Read brief to verify exhibit cites and work with A. Shaver to prepare copies for court.	9.50	
12/10/12	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit reply brief.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/10/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize class certification reply; direct filing of same.	13.40	
12/10/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise class certification brief and supporting materials, filing of same.	14.50	
12/10/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/10/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit, revise and e-file class certification reply and supporting papers.	15.00	
12/10/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification reply brief for filing.	5.00	
12/10/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	1.90	
12/10/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update regarding document review.	0.10	
12/10/12	ZHU, JULIE	Read over Brandon Marshall's deposition transcript for errors.	1.00	
12/10/12	ZHU, JULIE	Scan materials and send to expert.	1.00	
12/11/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re filing, experts.	0.30	
12/11/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copy, clerk copy, and conformed copy for reply in support of class certification and opposition to motion to strike. Prepare binders with all publicly filed information and create an index. Affix labels to all under seal information. Work with courier to prepare documents for San Jose and have everything approved by D. Harvey. Prepare back up materials to go to defendants by working with Litigation Support. Create two binders for D. Harvey with reply brief, expert report, and another binder with the declaration of D. Harvey and all the declarations. Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Upload recent Google production to the Cloud Egnyte database.	6.50	
12/11/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review deposition transcripts for errata; review reply papers.	6.80	
12/11/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise lodging of documents; conference with experts re production of backup material; conference with team re next steps; manage document review; review documents.	7.00	
12/11/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/11/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Follow-up emails re filing.	1.00	
12/11/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification reply motion for service.	3.40	
12/11/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Brandon Marshall's deposition transcript.	6.20	
12/12/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with team re next steps.	1.40	
12/12/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with B. Glackin regarding case assignment.	0.20	
12/12/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re next steps; email D. Harvey re subsequent authority; review letter re deposition; conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Econ One issue.	1.50	
12/12/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Check for errors on deposition transcript of Edward Leamer for B. Glackin. Update spreadsheet with errors found. Produce electronic version of reply back up materials to defense counsel. Work with Litigation Support to send files securely and quickly per D. Harvey's instructions. Gather documents for filing and create copies per D. Harvey's instructions. Print condensed copies of the deposition transcripts of Michael Devine and Siddharth Hariharan for D. Harvey. Organize recent defense objections and responses to plaintiffs' third request for the production of documents. Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer.	5.50	
12/12/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	LCHB Team meeting; telephone conference with prepare Brandon Marshall errata; review Ed Leamer transcript; office conference with R. Heimann re depositions; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove.	5.50	
12/12/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Joseph Saveri re hearing issues and class certification.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/12/12	GRANT, ANTHONY	Archive and delivery of electronic discovery material for use with Ed Leamer reply materials.	4.00	
12/12/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and attend LCHB, Saveri planning meetings; manage document review; review documents; research and draft correction letter re expert report, file and serve same; supervise production of backup material.	7.20	
12/12/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review plaintiffs' reply re motion for class certification for comment on same and deposition preparation.	3.70	
12/12/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/12/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Follow-up on depositions and custodians; confer with L. Cisneros re case needs; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re discovery issues; review letter to Court; send errata to Lisa Leebove.	4.00	
12/12/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Brandon Marshall deposition errata.	0.20	
12/12/12	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings re class certification reply.	0.20	
12/12/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Brandon Marshall deposition transcript.	0.60	
12/12/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Siddharth Hariharan's deposition transcript for typos, follow up.	6.00	
12/13/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Review media re certification filing; edit letter re depositions and custodians; email with Joe Saveri re Intel deposition; email with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer discovery; telephone conference with Pixar/Lucas re settlement; telephone conference with J. Saveri re same; draft response re same and email with team re same.	2.00	
12/13/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare copy to court per D. Harvey's instructions. Work on errata for Edward Leamer. Update Excel spreadsheet with all corrections, then create a Word document per B. Glackin's instructions. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Put together a binder of 7 amended answers to plaintiffs' complaint for D. Harvey.	2.20	
12/13/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on deposition errata; draft letter to Frank Hinman; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri.	3.20	
12/13/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents.	3.50	
12/13/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review reply materials re class certification for deposition preparation.	3.10	
12/13/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/13/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft discovery letter to defense counsel; prepare for discovery meeting with co-counsel; telephone conference with Intel re custodians; review Intuit documents.	2.50	
12/13/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	3.50	
12/13/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Brandon Marshall's deposition transcript re fact testimony.	1.00	
12/13/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Siddharth Hariharan's deposition transcript re fact testimony.	6.00	
12/14/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with D. Harvey regarding case assignment.	0.20	
12/14/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re assignments; email with Joe Saveri re Intel deposition; edit letter to Intel re deposition.	0.30	
12/14/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare latest privilege logs for D. Harvey with most recent letters to the logs for all 7 defendants. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Contact Veritext for B. Glackin to turn in errata sheet of Dr. Edward Leamer. Find all 11 names for the defendants' declarations in opposition to class certification and send to L. Cisneros. Organize Brandon Marshall documents for J. Zhu. Create proof of service for errata sheets for D. Harvey.	4.90	
12/14/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review; serve errata to Ed Leamer deposition.	0.60	
12/14/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review plaintiff depositions and draft errata sheets; review draft order of proof; manage document review; review documents.	6.20	
12/14/12	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Continued review of reply materials re class certification for deposition preparation and follow up.	3.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/14/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/14/12	ZHU, JULIE	Review Brandon Marshall's deposition transcript re fact testimony.	5.50	
12/15/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	1.50	
12/15/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update regarding document review.	0.30	
12/16/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Chocolate antitrust certification decision and possible subsequent authority filing; review certification opinion; email D. Harvey re Apple privilege log issues.	1.50	
12/16/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review recent authority, summarize same, email with K. Dermody re same; review and summarize privilege log disputes.	2.50	
12/17/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin re work; emails with A. Shaver re Adobe meet and confer and search terms; emails with Pixar/Lucas and Joe Saveri re settlement call.	0.50	
12/17/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize errata sheets for Brandon Marshall and Daniel Stover on the internal computer drive. Email Veritext with them per B. Glackin's instructions. Create binder of all cases cited in defendants' opposition to class certification brief per B. Glackin's instructions. Find all cases from plaintiffs' opening and reply brief for B. Glackin.	4.00	
12/17/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize Brandon Marshall errata; supervise vendor issues.	1.20	
12/17/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Michael Devine deposition, create errata; conference with J. Zhu re Siddharth Hariharan deposition, revise errata, research same; conference with Google and Intuit counsel re privilege log and custodian issues, research same; manage document review; review documents.	5.50	
12/17/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
12/17/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Adobe search terms letter and email team re same; conference call with Lee Rubin and D. Harvey re custodians and privilege log; emails re same; prepare analysis of Intuit witnesses.	2.30	
12/17/12	ZHU, JULIE	Brandon Marshall errata.	3.30	
12/17/12	ZHU, JULIE	Siddharth Hariharan errata.	2.00	
12/18/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Review case documents.	2.50	
12/18/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Review sample jury instructions, and draft tentative order of proof for case.	3.50	
12/18/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Write instructions for research project for Litigation Support and consult with paralegal.	0.30	
12/18/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails/call with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer discovery; confer with B. Glackin re document review; telephone conference with Deborah Garza, Emily Henn, Dan Purcell, Joe Saveri re settlement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; email team re same.	1.50	
12/18/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Check Edward Leamer deposition transcript for corrections per B. Glackin's instructions. Finish binder with cases cited from plaintiffs' opening and reply briefs for B. Glackin. Organize complaints for D. Harvey and update class member list for contact telephone number.	2.50	
12/18/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman re Ed Leamer deposition; memorandum to team re same; office conference with D. Harvey re document review; telephone conference with K. Dermody re document review.	1.10	
12/18/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; review vendor work.	4.50	
12/18/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
12/18/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with David Kiernan re search terms; emails with team re eBay witness.	0.30	
12/19/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with paralegal regarding assignment.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/19/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer and defendants' request for second deposition; email team re Google documents.	0.50	
12/19/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on finding LinkedIn profiles for L. Cisneros. Create an Excel chart with certain information, pull all profiles, and organize per her directions. Create an electronic copy on the internal computer drive. Work on search term project for D. Harvey. Find all letters which show defendants committing to run search terms then upload all those tables to an Excel spreadsheet and add citations.	6.30	
12/19/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Frank Hinman.	0.30	
12/19/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with defense counsel re discovery issues, research same; research potential depositions; manage document review; review documents; review draft order of proof.	5.50	
12/19/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
12/19/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re Intuit deponents; emails to team re same; review letter from Lee Rubin re custodians and email K. Dermody re same.	1.30	
12/19/12	ZHU, JULIE	Extract production search terms from PDF to Excel.	2.00	
12/20/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Send update to partners regarding case assignment.	0.10	
12/20/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with L. Cisneros re CaseMap and other assignments; email D. Harvey re Stephanie Buran; emails with A. Shaver re Google discovery; emails with team re Intel depositions.	1.00	
12/20/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Complete final list of search terms per defendant for D. Harvey. Work with J. Zhu to format spreadsheet and combine defendants into one chart. Organize internal computer drive for case filings per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.60	
12/20/12	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and send letter to Frank Hinman.	0.60	
12/20/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Adobe counsel re discovery issues; manage document review; review documents; review correspondence re Dr. Edward Leamer; research order of proof issues.	5.50	
12/20/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/20/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with David Kiernan, Peter Julian and D. Harvey; review Google custodian proposal and draft response to same; emails with team re same; draft response to Adobe search terms proposal.	6.00	
12/20/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	8.00	
12/20/12	ZHU, JULIE	Consolidate defendants' search terms into one Excel file.	6.00	
12/21/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re work; review/respond to materials re Google recruiters and search terms, and email with A. Shaver re strategy.	1.00	
12/21/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on internal computer drive. Review final Excel spreadsheet of search terms made for D. Harvey. Send hard copy documents to Records. Organize depositions in the war room.	2.30	
12/21/12	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise discovery correspondence; review and revise search terms; review documents; manage document review; conference with D. Ratner and J. Zaul re document review.	4.50	
12/21/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/21/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft letter to Google re search terms; email with K. Dermody re Google; emails with team re letter and edit same; draft proposed response to Adobe on search terms.	2.00	
12/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel.	7.70	
12/21/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates regarding document review.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/25/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	3.50	
12/26/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock meeting, Econ One work.	0.20	
12/26/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.20	
12/26/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	2.30	
12/26/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.20	
12/27/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Prepare new Adobe production for Teris and update production log.	0.60	
12/27/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
12/27/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	3.00	
12/28/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production log with Adobe production.	0.60	
12/28/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
12/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	7.70	
12/28/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.30	
12/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	1.00	
12/29/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
12/30/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	3.00	
12/31/12	CISNEROS, LISA	Review case-related correspondence for follow up.	0.30	
12/31/12	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re Google document review and Laszlo Bock deposition preparation; review/edit Adobe search terms and email A. Shaver re same.	0.80	
12/31/12	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.30	
12/31/12	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	4.30	
12/31/12	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re Laszlo Bock deposition document review; emails with TERIS and K. Dermody re same; review documents sent by reviewing attorneys; email team re Adobe search terms.	2.00	
12/31/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit.	5.30	
12/31/12	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.20	
01/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further review of case documents.	1.40	
01/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock meeting and work.	0.20	
01/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive. Find and organize all documents in CaseMap that mention Eric Schmidt, Bill Campbell, and Ed Catmull per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize documents received from Teris per A. Shaver's instructions.	4.00	
01/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re class certification hearing.	0.40	
01/02/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Compile documents from metadata search.	4.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/02/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/02/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review transcript of Arnnon Geshuri deposition; review Google documents from reviewing attorneys; review Lori McAdams' deposition outline; serve Adobe search term letter; review correspondence with defendants.	2.50	
01/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google block cleanup.	1.00	
01/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss with D. Harvey clawback assignment and review related correspondence.	0.30	
01/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Locate and review Cartwright Act jury instructions, and further revise order of proof.	0.30	
01/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with A. Shaver and D. Harvey regarding case work and assignments.	0.70	
01/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review document email.	0.20	
01/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review of case documents.	0.80	
01/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review privilege log correspondence and discovery information; status update re depositions; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock; email D. Harvey re Michael Devine.	2.00	
01/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Examine correspondence to find any letters referring to clawback request by Lucasfilm and Pixar for D. Harvey. Find the exchange and send to L. Cisneros. Send Google production to Teris. Save correspondence to the internal computer drive. Find Adobe and Intel privilege logs referring to clawback requests for D. Harvey and L. Cisneros.	3.50	
01/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; meet with A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re discovery tasks; email with K. Dermody re Kevin Hallock; research privilege log issues; correspond with clients and email K. Dermody re same; conference with potential witness; research privilege log issues.	7.20	
01/03/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/03/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Laszlo Bock documents; conference with D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re upcoming tasks.	9.50	
01/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google block cleanup.	7.70	
01/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.30	
01/04/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up with D. Harvey and A. Shaver regarding order of proof.	0.10	
01/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Stephanie Buran meeting.	0.10	
01/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search correspondence for Bill Campbell references for D. Harvey. Search correspondence for all letters mentioning privilege logs in clawback requests. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production on production log.	3.00	
01/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents; manage document review; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; email K. Dermody re ; research privilege log issues, conference with defense counsel re same.	2.50	
01/04/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Respond to emails re document review.	0.20	
01/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google block cleanup.	7.30	
01/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist A. Shaver with document review.	2.00	
01/05/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery correspondence for follow up.	0.30	
01/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review documents for Laszlo Bock deposition.	7.90	
01/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google Laszlo Bock cleanup.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review documents for Laszlo Bock deposition.	5.50	
01/07/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review.	7.60	
01/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for meeting with Prof. Kevin Hallock and meeting with Prof. Hallock, B. Glackin, D. Harvey and Lisa Leebove re expert analysis; conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re privilege logs and motion to compel for Google; review Kevin Hallock compensation publication.	6.50	
01/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents for A. Shaver on Relativity. Create binders of depositions and exhibits for D. Harvey. Organize incoming correspondence on the internal computer drive.	5.00	
01/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive.	0.30	
01/07/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review Mayer Brown email privilege logs.	0.20	
01/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Kevin Hallock; office conference with D. Harvey, K. Dermody and A. Shaver re same.	4.10	
01/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Kevin Hallock and team; manage document review; review documents; prepare for depositions; research motion to compel re privilege log entries.	8.80	
01/07/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/07/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Laszlo Bock documents; draft Laszlo Bock deposition outline; conference with team and Kevin Hallock; conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re privilege log issues; conference call with Eric Evans re same.	8.20	
01/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google/Laszlo Bock cleanup.	8.00	
01/07/13	ZHU, JULIE	Find articles about deponents.	2.00	
01/07/13	ZHU, JULIE	Google board of directors chart.	0.20	
01/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review.	3.00	
01/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with A. Shaver regarding deposition and with D. Harvey regarding order of proof.	0.10	
01/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re Laszlo Bock deposition; review Laszlo Bock hot documents; confer with D. Harvey re Laszlo Bock privilege log and Laszlo Bock exhibits.	4.00	
01/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents for A. Shaver, finish deposition binder of Pamela Zissimos for D. Harvey, and organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.50	
01/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research motion to compel; manage document review; review documents; prepare for upcoming depositions.	6.50	
01/08/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition.	2.10	
01/08/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.50	
01/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare deposition outline for Laszlo Bock; meet and confer with Google re request to postpone same.	8.40	
01/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google/Laszlo Bock cleanup.	7.30	
01/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.70	
01/08/13	ZHU, JULIE	Collect articles of deponents.	0.50	
01/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey re motion to compel and shortened time; confer with B. Glackin re defendants' request to file more papers; email Christina Brown re Case Management Conference statement; review email from Kevin Hallock re deposition questions and email Kevin Hallock re same; email with D. Harvey re Laszlo Bock.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather documents from the privilege logs of Laszlo Bock, Shona Brown, and Eric Schmidt that have documents mentioning Paul Otellini or Bill Campbell for D. Harvey. Identify documents that were previously redacted and create electronic and hard copy production. Create binder of Ed Leamer reply report for B. Glackin. Gather and organize all transcripts for case.	5.50	
01/09/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Kevin Murphy transcript for comment re same.	3.10	
01/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft response to Eric Evans re supplementation; oral argument preparation; review proposed supplementation.	1.80	
01/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with Joseph Saveri re argument planning.	0.50	
01/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; telephone conference with A. Shaver, D. Harvey and Eric Evans; review draft case management conference statement; oral argument planning.	1.40	
01/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re argument planning.	0.30	
01/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; review and revise case management conference statement; research motion to compel; conference with Intel counsel re depositions; prepare for class certification hearing.	8.50	
01/09/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition.	4.30	
01/09/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/09/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re Case Management Conference statement; draft Case Management Conference statement; telephone conference with Intel re discovery and draft follow-up email; telephone conference with Google re stipulation and follow-up emails with team; clean up deposition calendar; review Rule 26 witness correspondence and prepare for further meet and confers.	5.50	
01/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google Laszlo Bock cleanup.	7.70	
01/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.20	
01/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft response to administrative motion.	6.60	
01/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with B. Glackin regarding motion assignment.	0.20	
01/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit Case Management Conference statement and multiple emails with team re same, defendants' revisions; email Kevin Hallock re depositions; multiple emails with LCHB team re regressions and defendants' new data.	1.80	
01/10/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery correspondence; read defendants' motion re supplementing class certification motion record to comment on same.	0.50	
01/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re responding to defendants' administrative motion; review same.	1.70	
01/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument.	1.10	
01/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise case management conference statement, conference with defendants re same, file same; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition, review documents re same; manage document review; research motion to compel.	11.50	
01/10/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition.	3.20	
01/10/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/10/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email all defendants to schedule discovery calls; internal emails re agendas for same.	0.70	
01/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Laszlo Bock, Shona Brown, Ed Catmull.	7.50	
01/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/10/13	ZHU, JULIE	Calculation of percent changes in salary.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work with D. Harvey and B. Glackin to draft plaintiffs' opposition to defendants' administrative motion.	9.00	
01/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit opposition to administrative motion and research re same; emails with LCHB team re same; review media re sealing issues; confer with D. Harvey re privilege issues.	2.50	
01/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Create remaining binders for hearing next Thursday per B. Glackin's instructions. Shepardize a case for B. Glackin and pull another case for him. Update production log with new Apple production and send to litigation vendor. Create indices for binders Services brings up and place in the war room. Send D. Harvey an updated deposition list.	4.00	
01/11/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read plaintiffs' expert deposition subpoenas and document requests to comment on same.	0.30	
01/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument preparation.	6.90	
01/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research motion to compel; confer with K. Dermody re privilege issues; research and draft opposition to defendants' administrative motion.	6.50	
01/11/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition.	1.80	
01/11/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Update deposition calendar; send calendar emails for meet and confers.	0.50	
01/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Shona Brown, Ed Catmull. Bill Campbell.	7.70	
01/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.30	
01/11/13	ZHU, JULIE	Find Competition Law360 article about case.	0.20	
01/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit opposition to administrative motion and multiple emails re same.	1.00	
01/12/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read and email edits to opposition to defendants' administrative motion re class action.	0.30	
01/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Argument preparation; revise administrative motion response.	4.50	
01/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft motion to seal and related documents.	0.80	
01/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and respond to draft of plaintiffs' response to defendants' administrative motion to supplement the record.	0.60	
01/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review instructions in connection with motion to seal; follow up with D. Harvey, K. Dermody and B. Glackin.	0.50	
01/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey, L. Cisneros re opposition to administrative motion.	0.30	
01/13/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read and email edits to opposition to defendants' administrative motion re class action.	0.40	
01/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Ed Catmull deposition; research and revise opposition to defendants' administrative motion.	10.50	
01/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize motion to seal, prepare motion for e-filing and lodging with the Court.	2.70	
01/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Apple revised disclosures; email with T. Desouza re preparation for certification hearing; edit opposition to administrative motion and email with D. Harvey re same; review Ed Leamer declaration; email with D. Harvey re plaintiffs and hearing; prepare questions for hearing.	3.00	
01/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binder for deposition of Edward Catmull for R. Heimann per D. Harvey's instructions. Create proof of service for L. Cisneros. Search for the words Pixar or Ed Catmull in four depositions for D. Harvey and proceed to highlight and tag where they come up. Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Create four deposition binders for D. Harvey with their exhibits.	9.00	
01/14/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit opposition to defendants' administrative motion re class action.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/14/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Conference with K. Dermody re Human Resources deposition re compensation setting.	0.20	
01/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Class certification argument preparation.	1.20	
01/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Further preparation of oral argument.	5.90	
01/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for argument on class certification motion; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition; file opposition to motion; research and draft motion to compel.	13.50	
01/14/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Ed Catmull).	6.70	
01/14/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review administrative motion response.	0.50	
01/14/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/14/13	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Help T. Desouza organize binders.	1.30	
01/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet and confer with Lucasfilm and prepare for same; prepare for meet and confer with Pixar and Adobe; emails with team re moot court and logistics for same.	2.30	
01/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Bill Campbell.	7.40	
01/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit and revise motion to compel and multiple emails with D. Harvey re same; email with D. Harvey re defendants' request to refrain from filing unsealed documents; review Court's sealing order and email team re same; draft proposed mock questions for class certification hearing preparation and edit same.	6.00	
01/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Search litigation vendor's website for documents produced by Google to see if Intuit had produced them as well under Bill Campbell for D. Harvey. Organize documents needed for class certification hearing for B. Glackin. Finish binder for K. Dermody for class certification hearing. Create binder for R. Heimann for supplemental documents for Ed Catmull deposition. Finish filling in deposition chart for A. Shaver.	6.00	
01/15/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read sealing order.	0.30	
01/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument.	10.90	
01/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for class certification hearing; review documents; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition; draft and revise motion to compel and associated documents.	16.20	
01/15/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition preparation.	2.70	
01/15/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/15/13	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Create multiple binder indices to help T. Desouza.	1.70	
01/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet and confers with Apple and Pixar and prepare for same; prepare for moot court and draft questions re same; conference call with Joe Saveri Law Firm re Apple discovery and with D. Harvey re same.	2.80	
01/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Shona Brown.	7.70	
01/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.30	
01/15/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research history of Disney's acquisition of Lucasfilm and Pixar.	2.30	
01/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist B. Glackin and D. Harvey with preparing for hearing.	0.30	
01/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with drafting motion to compel and motion to seal documents, and filing; file both motions and the motion to shorten time.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with review and response to defendants' notice of errata.	1.00	
01/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin re certification argument; multiple emails and conference with B. Glackin and A. Shaver re deposition witnesses; edit motion to compel and related documents; draft proposed opposition to errata and email L. Cisneros re same: telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re assignments; travel to and from Los Gatos and meet with (with D. Harvey and A. Shaver) and conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; meeting with B. Glackin re certification argument (moot) and review notes/questions re same; conference with B. Glackin re sealing order and email team re same; review defendants' demonstratives; telephone conference with A. Shaver and B. Glackin re Apple deponents and Rule 26 disclosures.	6.50	
01/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare motion to compel filing for D. Harvey. Review declaration and verify number of documents. Prepare all exhibits electronically and in paper format. Create four sets of documents to go to the Court. Create index for B. Glackin for cases needed during the class certification hearing. Prepare motion to compel binder. Organize all binders and information and sort in the war room. Update the production log with new Adobe production and prepare for class certification hearing.	9.20	
01/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument and moot with K. Dermody, D. Harvey; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re same; review defendant demonstratives.	10.50	
01/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Interview potential witness, travel re same; revise motion to compel and associated documents, file same; prepare for class certification hearing and moot with K. Dermody, B. Glackin.	10.20	
01/16/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition preparation.	4.70	
01/16/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.30	
01/16/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Create evidentiary objections chart; proof read motion to compel; meet with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, conference call with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re Apple custodian agreements.	6.20	
01/16/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare citations re class certification filings for B. Glackin review.	1.80	
01/16/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Shona Brown.	7.00	
01/16/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel to and from court and discuss hearing with B. Glackin, A. Shaver, D. Harvey; review demonstrative exhibits and conferences with Emily Johnson re same; meeting with Michael Devine re hearing; attend hearing: review Kevin Hallock responses re deposition outline and email Kevin Hallock re same; email A. Shaver re Michael Tubach and email James Dallal re same.	9.00	
01/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare for class certification hearing. Attend court hearing to help attorneys with documents for hearing.	9.00	
01/17/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read order re sealing; read discovery correspondence.	1.20	
01/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for, attend, and return from oral argument on class certification.	9.50	
01/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Class certification hearing, travel re same, preparation re same, conference re same.	11.50	
01/17/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition preparation.	6.00	
01/17/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/17/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend class certification hearing and Case Management Conference in San Jose' prepare documents for same.	9.30	
01/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Edward Catmull deposition preparation.	2.70	
01/17/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Shona Brown, Eric Schmidt.	7.80	
01/17/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Judge Koh's January 15, 2013 sealing order and online instructions; consult with co-counsel, D. Harvey, K. Dermody, B. Glackin and support staff regarding compliance.	3.20	
01/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re Adobe/Intuit settlement offer and email LCHB team re same; email D. Harvey re unseal/injunctive documents; review media re hearing.	0.50	
01/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production log with new productions. Create an exhibit chart to show all bates ranges of documents used. Contact court reporter for a transcript. Organize documents from class certification hearing in the war room.	3.00	
01/18/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with R. Heimann, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re class action hearing; conference with R. Heimann, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Ed Catmull deposition.	1.30	
01/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conferences with R. Heimann and E. Fastiff re hearing; office conference with D. Harvey re sealing; assist R. Heimann in preparation for Ed Catmull deposition.	5.50	
01/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Meet and confer with Apple and Google re discovery issues; manage document review; review documents; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition.	8.20	
01/18/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/18/13	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Help T. Desouza with binder project.	3.40	
01/18/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Eric Schmidt.	6.00	
01/18/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/18/13	ZHU, JULIE	Circulate press releases.	0.20	
01/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re settlement positions with Adobe and Intuit; email to B. Glackin re same; emails with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re calls with plaintiffs re settlement; review expert analysis re exposure and prepare proposed settlement positions.	1.00	
01/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients re potential settlements, emails with K. Dermody re same.	1.50	
01/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Eric Schmidt/Intuit rebatch.	1.30	
01/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.70	
01/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for filing unsealed plaintiffs' class certification motion, consolidated reply and related papers pursuant to the Court's January 15, 2013 order.	4.00	
01/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re settlement discussions with plaintiffs.	0.20	
01/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with clients re , emails with K. Dermody re same.	1.50	
01/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for filing unsealed plaintiffs' class certification motion, consolidated reply and related papers pursuant to the Court's January 15, 2013 order.	10.00	
01/21/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Emails re sealing and conference with D. Harvey re response.	0.20	
01/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re sealing issues and other discovery issues; conference with clients re potential settlements; conference with class members re questions; conference with L. Cisneros re sealing procedures.	7.20	
01/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize documents for e-filing.	3.00	
01/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Hold conference call with Pixar counsel and D. Harvey regarding redactions to exhibits.	0.10	
01/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Supervise and assist with e-filing to comply with Judge Koh's January 15, 2013 order.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Pull relevant documents mentioning Shona Brown, Eric Schmidt, or Bill Campbell from CaseMap for D. Harvey. Send latest Intel production to litigation vendor. Finish binder spines for deposition transcripts and double check all exhibits are present. Contact court reporter for transcript on motion for class certification hearing last week. Add documents to CaseMap for D. Harvey and code as hot.	3.70	
01/22/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read sealing briefing and declarations.	0.70	
01/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re case status; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re case status; telephone conference with Bob Mittelstaedt.	1.50	
01/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; conference with defendants re sealing issues; file documents in compliance with Court's sealing order; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition.	8.20	
01/22/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition preparation.	2.70	
01/22/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Schedule call with Kevin Hallock; calendar deposition dates; edit D. Harvey's order on motions to seal; edit Ed Catmull deposition outline; email B. Glackin re Joseph Saveri Law Firm deposition coverage; draft Stephanie Buran memo and circulate; emails with D. Harvey re selecting Google deponents.	4.20	
01/22/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit rebatch and Google.	7.60	
01/22/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.20	
01/23/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review filings.	0.20	
01/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Prepare index, copies, and binder for Ed Catmull deposition for D. Harvey and R. Heimann. Organize copies with a copy of the index.	4.80	
01/23/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read eBay's Rule 12 motion papers on similar government case.	1.10	
01/23/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Advise team re Human Resources compensation depositions; review labor economist suggestions.	0.50	
01/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock; office conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; office conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re Google consultations.	1.20	
01/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re discovery issues, correspond with defendants re same; manage document review; prepare for Ed Catmull deposition; conference with expert re merits report.	7.50	
01/23/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition preparation (Ed Catmull).	1.90	
01/23/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Google re search terms; conference call with Kevin Hallock; meeting with R. Heimann re Ed Catmull preparation; update deposition schedule; review Intuit and Google discovery responses and identify witnesses; conference call with Apple re depositions and follow-up on same with James Dallal; summarize meet and confer with Google history for B. Glackin.	6.40	
01/23/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	8.00	
01/23/13	ZHU, JULIE	Create Intuit Board of Directors chart.	3.00	
01/23/13	ZHU, JULIE	Deposition preparation: Ed Catmull's work history, Pixar/Lucasfilm chronology.	1.00	
01/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Locate exhibit from the James Morris deposition. Send recent Adobe production to litigation vendor and update production log. Check a custodian for A. Shaver from Google's list on Relativity.	5.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with deposition of Ed Catmull, draft summary re same; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues.	9.50	
01/24/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition of Ed Catmull.	9.00	
01/24/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
01/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Court order on motion to shorten time and emails with team re same; draft discovery letters to Google and Intuit; read D. Harvey's summary of Ed Catmull deposition; review search terms from Google; emails with team re postponing depositions.	2.90	
01/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.50	
01/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/24/13	ZHU, JULIE	Update Intuit Board of Directors chart.	4.30	
01/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Organize deposition transcripts and organize war room per D. Harvey's instructions.	2.00	
01/25/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Ed Catmull deposition transcript.	1.90	
01/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with E. Fastiff and D. Harvey re assignments.	0.50	
01/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Intuit, Google, and Ed Catmull deposition.	1.10	
01/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with R. Heimann re Ed Leamer as trial expert; memorandum re same.	0.20	
01/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Bill Campbell deposition; summarize rough draft of Ed Catmull deposition; conference with defendants re discovery disputes; manage document review; review documents.	7.50	
01/25/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Search for news articles regarding executive reaction to California's ban on non-compete agreements, for J. Zhu.	0.30	
01/25/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.30	
01/25/13	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Help T. Desouza finish assembling the case binders.	0.70	
01/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re preparation for Google depositions; review Intuit hot documents and emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Intuit deposition scheduling; email D. Harvey re Laszlo Bock outline and binder; edit Google discovery letter and send; conference call with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Intuit.	3.10	
01/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.40	
01/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on document review.	0.50	
01/25/13	ZHU, JULIE	Find news articles about executives re California's ban on non-compete agreements.	1.50	
01/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Bill Campbell and Shona Brown depositions.	6.50	
01/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email James Dallal re Adobe discovery; review emails from D. Harvey to K. Dermody re discovery.	0.50	
01/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	2.50	
01/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update on document review.	0.50	
01/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re Adobe/Intuit settlement; call, email D. Harvey re Ed Catmull; multiple emails with team re discovery, depositions and experts, and review correspondence re same; email James Dallal re Apple depositions; email D. Harvey and R. Geman re deposition outline on compensation; email Frank Hinman, Joe Saveri re Taleo database; email D. Harvey re class member intake.	2.50	
01/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Bill Campbell and Shona Brown depositions.	5.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/27/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google, including search for "Do Not Call" lists from 2005 - 2009, etc.	5.00	
01/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email team re class member intake.	0.10	
01/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize key binders for D. Harvey in preparation for the deposition of Shona Brown and Bill Campbell. Pull all documents from various binders for litigation vendor web site.	9.50	
01/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with A. Shaver and Chris Marcellino re Apple experience.	1.10	
01/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re Paul Otellini deposition; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.90	
01/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with and Joseph Saveri re regression expert; review correspondence.	1.90	
01/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Bill Campbell and Shona Brown depositions; review documents; manage document review.	11.20	
01/28/13	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation for Shona Brown and Eric Schmidt.	7.50	
01/28/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Intuit documents for Bill Campbell deposition; review Shona Brown documents; telephone conference with B. Glackin and Apple class member; update deposition chart; follow-up with Pixar on deponents' schedules.	5.00	
01/28/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification research for B. Glackin review.	0.20	
01/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - search for "Do Not Call" lists from 2005-2009, etc.; Shona Brown deposition preparation review.	7.50	
01/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update on document review.	0.50	
01/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review multiple emails/letters re discovery; exchange email with team re same; edit discovery report; email Lisa Leebove re Taleo database.	3.00	
01/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition binder for Shona Brown for D. Harvey. Organize documents from previous exhibits and litigation vendor's websites. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	6.50	
01/29/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for Google Human Resources deposition.	1.10	
01/29/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Paul Otellini.	8.80	
01/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Shona Brown deposition; assist in Paul Otellini deposition; prepare for Bill Campbell deposition; review discovery status report.	10.50	
01/29/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Bill Campbell).	4.20	
01/29/13	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation for Eric Schmidt and document review.	7.30	
01/29/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft discovery status report; respond to emails re deposition scheduling.	3.00	
01/29/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Shona Brown deposition preparation document collection.	4.40	
01/29/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google, Shona Brown and Eric Schmidt deposition preparation review and general review.	8.00	
01/29/13	ZHU, JULIE	Google committees chart.	5.30	
01/29/13	ZHU, JULIE	Timeline of Shona Brown's experience at Google.	1.40	
01/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re Paul Otellini deposition; review discovery letters.	0.30	
01/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence and electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Update exhibit list with depositions of Ed Catmull and Paul Otellini. Create new binder of deposition of Ed Catmull with exhibits. Pull document re Michael Devine for D. Harvey. Update production log with Google production.	2.70	
01/30/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Shona Brown deposition; travel to and from Menlo Park.	12.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Take Shona Brown deposition, travel re same, prepare for same.	14.00	
01/30/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Bill Campbell).	5.10	
01/30/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/30/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review.	8.00	
01/31/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to discovery correspondence.	0.60	
01/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition binder for D. Harvey and R. Heimann for Bill Campbell deposition. Create index, organize exhibits numerically, and add exhibit numbers to new exhibits. Update production log with new Adobe and Intel production for D. Harvey.	5.50	
01/31/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re discovery matters; draft and circulate draft discovery status report; summarize Shona Brown deposition; prepare for Bill Campbell deposition.	8.50	
01/31/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Bill Campbell).	6.00	
01/31/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain Google financial filings for J. Zhu.	0.60	
01/31/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
01/31/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition testimony re Bill Campbell for D. Harvey review.	1.00	
01/31/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.50	
01/31/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo on document review.	0.50	
01/31/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research Bill Campbell in Google's SEC filings.	1.50	
01/31/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research Google Executive Management Group.	0.30	
02/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise discovery status report and many emails with LCHB team re same; email with team re Intuit depositions; email B. Glackin re Google hot documents; email D. Harvey re class member intake.	1.80	
02/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binders of deposition transcripts and exhibits for D. Harvey. Highlight Bill Campbell references. Update production log with new Google production. Send litigation vendor new production. PDF certain documents off litigation vendor's website and send to D. Harvey.	3.00	
02/01/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Ed Catmull and Shona Brown deposition transcripts for discovery planning.	2.40	
02/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; review correspondence; review draft response re Bill Campbell.	0.80	
02/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Intel documents and depositions re Apple.	0.70	
02/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jon Levin; review expert biographies.	1.20	
02/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise discovery status report, conference with defendants re same; prepare for Bill Campbell deposition; manage document review; review documents.	11.50	
02/01/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Bill Campbell).	7.50	
02/01/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/01/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with D. Harvey re discovery status report and edit same; respond to defendant emails re deposition scheduling; update deposition chart; review Seth Williams' history; emails with D. Harvey re Bill Campbell deposition notice.	4.00	
02/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.50	
02/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo on document review.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/01/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research Google Executive Management Group.	0.50	
02/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft correspondence for clients and class members.	0.50	
02/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Michael Tubach re expert reports and email B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re same; rule of reason evidence; email B. Glackin re statisticians.	0.50	
02/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents on the internal computer drive. Deposition preparation for D. Harvey for the deposition of Bill Campbell.	3.00	
02/04/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with R. Heimann and D. Harvey re Bill Campbell deposition.	0.30	
02/04/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review deposition scheduling; memorandum to L. Cisneros; emails with K. Dermody re expert reports.	0.40	
02/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Bill Campbell deposition; manage document review; review Intuit privilege documents; conference with clients.	8.20	
02/04/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Bill Campbell).	4.80	
02/04/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
02/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.80	
02/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on removal of Google "Do Not Calls".	0.20	
02/04/13	ZHU, JULIE	Board of Directors charts for Intuit, Google, and Apple.	0.30	
02/04/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research employment history of Bill Campbell.	2.00	
02/04/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research employment history of Steve Jobs.	1.60	
02/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery Management. Emails with L. Cisneros re Google deponents and hot documents; telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re Michael Tubach call, expert reports, rule of reason evidence, deposition discovery; edit status letters to plaintiffs and class members and email D. Harvey re same; email with D. Harvey re Bill Campbell deposition.	1.80	
02/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Add documents to CaseMap per D. Harvey's instructions. Update production log with recent Adobe, Google, and Intel productions. Provide Lucas film production to litigation vendor.	2.80	
02/05/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read class certification hearing, case management conference transcript.	0.90	
02/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research .	0.90	
02/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and A. Shaver re expert report issues; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re same.	1.30	
02/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Deposition of Bill Campbell, travel re same, prepare exhibits re same.	10.10	
02/05/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition of Bill Campbell.	8.50	
02/05/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.30	
02/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Update deposition chart and circulate; conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re expert report issue; email team to cover February depositions; follow-up with Intuit on deposition dates; conference with L. Cisneros re Judy Gilbert and Seth Williams document review.	1.90	
02/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	8.80	
02/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo for Google review updates.	0.70	
02/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet and correspond with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and A. Shaver regarding depositions.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log with new Lucasfilm productions. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	2.50	
02/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Michael Tubach and Frank Hinman; office conference with D. Harvey, A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re deposition planning; telephone conference with Chris Michelletti re possible new expert.	1.80	
02/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; conference with defendants re discovery issues; meeting with LCHB team and prepare for upcoming depositions.	6.50	
02/06/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Call and emails with Kate Zeng re deposition locations and research rules on same; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re February 2013 deposition coverage and re expert report issue and re Seth Williams and Andy Gilbert issue; direct L. Cisneros on researching last; order documents for Chuong Nguyen and Michael McNeal depositions; create rule of reason defense chart.	5.30	
02/06/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	8.00	
02/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re Econ One work; email with B. Glackin re Sergey Brin deposition; email with A. Shaver re deposition scheduling.	0.50	
02/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather documents from CaseMap per defendant for D. Harvey. Determine page count for each defendant and verify against internal computer drive.	2.00	
02/07/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Bill Campbell deposition transcript for follow up.	1.20	
02/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock; telephone conference with depositions.	0.90	
02/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft stipulation, conference with defendants' counsel re same; manage document review; review documents; prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition.	5.50	
02/07/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update case calendar to reflect newly added deposition dates.	0.50	
02/07/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/07/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Chuong Nguyen documents for deposition; emails with defendants re deposition scheduling; update deposition chart and email K. Dermody re same; conference with I. Merrifield re calendar; conference with D. Harvey and J. Zaul re Intuit document review.	6.50	
02/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.70	
02/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo for Google review updates.	0.30	
02/07/13	ZHU, JULIE	Employment history of deponents.	0.10	
02/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re status letters to plaintiffs/class; email B. Glackin re expert graduates; email with A. Shaver and B. Glackin re rule of reason evidence; review stipulation re Bill Campbell deposition evidence and email D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
02/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents from CaseMap re Apple, Google, Intel, and Intuit for D. Harvey.	1.00	
02/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with remaining the same and the same	0.80	
02/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with conference with B. Glackin re same; revise and file stipulation re supplemental briefing; manage document review; review documents; email with K. Dermody re Bill Campbell deposition; prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition.	6.20	
02/08/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Review documents.	2.00	
02/08/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/08/13	ROSTKOWSKI, TERESA	Compile and organize binders to help T. Desouza.	1.50	
02/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email with K. Dermody and read antitrust rule of reason materials; review all defendants' interrogatory responses and draft deficiency summary for team; emails re same.	4.00	
02/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google.	7.50	
02/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo for Google review updates.	0.50	
02/08/13	ZHU, JULIE	Create executive profiles of deponents.	2.00	
02/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare key documents in binder for deposition of Eric Schmidt for D. Harvey.	0.10	
02/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition, review documents re same; research and draft supplemental filing re motion to compel, review Bill Campbell deposition re same.	6.10	
02/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review interrogatory responses and draft three deficiency letters.	0.80	
02/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re Google depositions.	0.10	
02/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare key documents for deposition of Eric Schimdt for D. Harvey.	3.50	
02/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition; conference with defendants re depositions and other discovery issues; draft supplement re motion to compel; confer with K. Dermody re depositions.	4.50	
02/11/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition of Eric Schmidt.	0.70	
02/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update case calendar with new deposition information.	1.80	
02/11/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
02/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with L. Cisneros re deficiency letter; emails with defendants re deposition scheduling; update calendar for same; finish reviewing Chuong Nguyen documents and draft deposition outline for same.	4.50	
02/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Eric Schmidt priority review.	8.70	
02/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.70	
02/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents pertaining to Judy Gilbert.	3.50	
02/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Revise and draft remaining deficiency letters.	2.00	
02/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with James Dallal re team meeting; review/edit supplement to motion to compel and email D. Harvey re filing; email with D. Harvey re experts/selection; email LCHB team re deposition planning.	0.50	
02/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive. Put together deposition binder for Eric Schmidt per D. Harvey's instructions. Send out letters to certain people on class member list per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.90	
02/12/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit supplemental brief re William Campbell motion to compel.	0.20	
02/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise supplemental filing re motion to compel and emails with K. Dermody re same; correspond with defendants' counsel re depositions; prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition; manage document review, review documents.	7.20	
02/12/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Eric Schmidt).	4.70	
02/12/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Identify image links in CaseMap database.	1.00	
02/12/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Finish outline for Chuong Nguyen deposition and circulate; emails with K. Dermody, defendants re deposition logistics; schedule internal status meeting; update deposition calendar; order Brad Smith documents for B. Glackin.	3.70	
02/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Sergey Brin, Larry Page priority review.	7.30	
02/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.70	
02/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss draft letters with A. Shaver and K. Dermody.	0.10	
02/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Document review.	1.80	
02/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meetings with litigation team and co-counsel; meetings with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re discovery assignments and depositions.	2.50	
02/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery management. Email with Lisa Leebove re TextMap; review defendant response re competitive justifications; team meeting with Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re discovery, experts, settlement (1.7); conference with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re assignments; edit letters to defendants re deficiencies in interrogatory responses; email with D. Harvey re Lucas privilege log; emails with D. Harvey re statistical experts; emails with LCHB team re expert discovery; meeting with D. Harvey, L. Cisneros, A. Shaver re deposition scheduling.	5.50	
02/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binder for R. Heimann for deposition of Eric Schmidt. Gather documents from prior depositions for R. Heimann. Organize binder and exhibits for deposition of Chuong Nguyen for A. Shaver. Prepare unredacted copies of filing to go to court for D. Harvey.	7.00	
02/13/13	DUGAR, KIRTI	Work on CaseMap re key documents links.	2.00	
02/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and file supplement re motion to compel; manage document review; review documents; conference with co-counsel re case strategy; prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition; draft correspondence re data issues; meetings with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re discovery.	8.50	
02/13/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Eric Schmidt).	3.60	
02/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of binders and exhibits for a deposition.	2.70	
02/13/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/13/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re deposition strategy; conference with LCHB team and Joseph Saveri Law Firm re discovery; supervise T. Desouza re deposition exhibits for Chuong Nguyen; finish preparing for deposition; edit L. Cisneros' letters on pro-competitive justifications and team emails re same.	5.30	
02/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition exhibits for T. Desouza.	0.30	
02/13/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review.	7.80	
02/13/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.10	
02/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition of Chuong Nguyen.	6.00	
02/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Continue preparation for deposition of Chuong Nguyen.	1.10	
02/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review correspondence regarding deficiency letters and related strategy discussion for follow up; update letters and recirculate to litigation team.	0.50	
02/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery management: Emails with B. Glackin, L. Cisneros re interrogatory deficiencies; email Michael Tubach re expert issues; edit letter to defendants re document review status; emails with D. Harvey re experts: conference with D. Harvey re joint statement and deposition staffing; telephone conference with Harvey; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and E. Fastiff re experts; review/edit joint statement; conference with D. Harvey, A. Shaver re Google depositions; email with A. Shaver re Chuong Nguyen deposition.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production log with Google and Apple productions and to litigation vendor. Search litigation vendor's website for documents per D. Harvey's instructions. Confirm courtesy filing to court. Add exhibits and change index to the deposition binder of Eric Schimdt for R. Heimann.	4.10	
02/14/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; read revised defendants' initial disclosures; edit supplemental discovery status report.	1.90	
02/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey, re deposition/discovery issues; review draft correspondence re interrogatories; confer with K. Dermody re expert strategy.	1.80	
02/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Steve Dykes deposition; revise and circulate draft discovery statement, conference with defendants re same; conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, manage document review; review documents; meetings with K. Dermody re discovery.	9.20	
02/14/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Eric Schmidt).	2.40	
02/14/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Track and calendar deposition information.	1.00	
02/14/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	9.50	
02/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Take deposition of Chuong Nguyen; draft email summary of same for team; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re Google depositions and confer with K. Dermody re same; order document search for Sherry Whiteley; read letter from Lee Rubin; email team re same; email James Dallal and D. Harvey re discovery report.	9.00	
02/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) and Alan Eustace priority review.	7.70	
02/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.30	
02/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research; write memorandum; correspond with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, B. Glackin and A. Shaver regarding deposition issues.	2.10	
02/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss with A. Shaver and D. Harvey deposition preparation for K. Dermody deponents.	0.30	
02/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendant correspondence re document discovery issues; review and edit status report and many calls/emails with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re same; deposition preparation; email Michael Tubach, Joe Saveri and B. Glackin re experts; email with B. Glackin and L. Cisneros re disclosures; conference with D. Harvey re discovery update; email with L. Cisneros re deposition preparation; calls/email with team re experts, Kevin Hallock.	4.00	
02/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock; email with K. Dermody re experts.	0.50	
02/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and review discovery joint report, conference with K. Dermody, defendants re same; conference with defendants re discovery issues; prepare for Steve Dykes deposition.	9.20	
02/15/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Eric Schmidt).	1.20	
02/15/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
02/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review correspondence from defendants; internal team emails; confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re discovery status report; finalize and e-file same.	4.20	
02/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Alan Eustace priority review.	7.50	
02/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.50	
02/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents to prepare for the depositions of: Steve Dykes, Sherry Whiteley, Alan Eustace, and Eric Schmidt; manage document review.	6.50	
02/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Document review for Sherry Whiteley and Michael McNeal depositions.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey, L. Cisneros re reviewing documents for deposition preparation; email D. Harvey and A. Shaver re deposition staffing.	0.50	
02/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review document to prepare for the depositions of: Steve Dykes, Sherry Whiteley, Alan Eustace, and Eric Schmidt; manage document review.	8.20	
02/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare exhibits for a deposition.	2.30	
02/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with D. Harvey re Lucasfilm deposition strategy; confer with L. Cisneros re Michael McNeal document review; review Michael McNeal documents.	0.70	
02/19/13	CARNAM, TODD	Help A. Shaver locate possible witness; assist in process of contacting same.	0.90	
02/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Document review for Michael McNeal deposition.	9.50	
02/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery and Settlement Management. Conference with A. Shaver re Google witnesses: emails/calls with B. Glackin re settlement issues; telephone conference with B. Glackin, Joe Saveri and conference with B. Glackin, Joe Saveri re same; emails with D. Harvey re motion to compel/depositions; email with A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re deposition preparation; telephone conference with B. Glackin, Michael Tubach, Frank Hinman re experts and meeting with B. Glackin re same; email with D. Harvey re new interrogatories; meeting with H. Wong re deposition.	2.80	
02/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize exhibits for the deposition of Eric Schmidt for R. Heimann. Organize new correspondence and electronic court filing notices in the internal computer drive. Check Department of Justice correspondence for bates numbers for co-counsel. Update production log with recent Google, Apple, and Pixar productions and to litigation vendor.	6.50	
02/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri, K. Dermody and Robert Mittelstaedt; telephone conference with K. Dermody, Joseph Saveri; office conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey; deposition preparation; review correspondence.	3.40	
02/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.40	
02/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Take deposition of Steve Dykes; manage document review, review documents; conference with potential expert re work; email with K. Dermody re Google; prepare for Eric Schmidt deposition.	9.50	
02/19/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition of Eric Schmidt.	0.90	
02/19/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update and organize firm records of recent case correspondence.	2.20	
02/19/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
02/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody re Google depositions; Email team re Google deposition locations and conference call with Lee Rubin re same; review Michael McNeal documents and confer with L. Cisneros re same; conference with T. Desouza and I. Merrifield re paralegal tasks; update deposition chart; confer with B. Glackin re deposition strategy; confer with T. Carnam re witness tracking.	5.90	
02/19/13	WONG, HEATHER	Exchange emails with K. Dermody re deposition on March 5, 2013; meet with K. Dermody to discuss same.	0.30	
02/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review.	8.00	
02/19/13	ZHU, JULIE	Deposition preparation for Eric Schmidt.	0.50	
02/19/13	ZHU, JULIE	Executive profile of Sherry Whiteley.	0.30	
02/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for Michael McNeal deposition.	0.70	
02/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents regarding potential deponents.	1.30	
02/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails, call with Lisa Leebove re discovery, expert issues; email with LCHB team re outstanding assignments re discovery. Case Management Conference statement; email A. Shaver re deposition scheduling issues; email with A. Shaver re follow-up; emails with Lisa Leebove, A. Shaver, B. Glackin re Steve Jobs' discovery.	1.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for A. Shaver for Michael McNeal. Organize papers for K. Dermody for the deposition of Alan Eustace. Update production log with Google, Adobe, and Pixar productions. Organize deposition binders for most recent completed files.	6.50	
02/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with deposition of Eric Schmidt, travel re same, draft and circulate summary re same.	9.50	
02/20/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition of Eric Schmidt, prepare for same.	10.00	
02/20/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent correspondence.	5.20	
02/20/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
02/20/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Michael McNeal documents and draft outline for deposition; review Court order; emails with K. Dermody re witness, deposition issues; draft message to Brad Fuellenbach; confer with D. Harvey re Eric Schmidt deposition.	5.90	
02/20/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review; search for Google recruiting practices for Microsoft and e-Bay.	7.30	
02/20/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.70	
02/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition of Michael McNeal.	5.00	
02/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Expert and Witness Management. Confer with D. Harvey re experts; telephone conference with and D. Harvey re scope of work; confer with B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock work; confer with A. Shaver re Intuit depositions; email with D. Harvey re Eric Schmidt deposition; confer with B. Glackin re Case Management Conference statement and review email to defendants re same; confer with B. Glackin re authentication issues; edit draft interrogatories and email Lisa Leebove re same; edit letter to defendants re document production deficiencies.	2.00	
02/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Setup Egnyte Cloud share for recipients for D. Harvey. Communicate with reviewers re web access. Organize deposition binders and update production log with recent Intel production and to litigation vendor.	4.50	
02/21/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Leebove; confer with K. Dermody re experts.	0.50	
02/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, and and are re damages analysis; research interrogatories re Lucasfilm revenue; review rough transcript of Eric Schmidt, draft and circulate summary re same; email with K. Dermody re Schmidt; research and draft letter to Google re discovery issues; research plaintiffs' productions; review correspondence from defendants re deposition scheduling.	8.20	
02/21/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent correspondence in the case.	3.70	
02/21/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/21/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for Michael McNeal deposition and take same; conference call with B. Glackin and Lisa Leebove re Steve Jobs' documents; emails with K. Dermody re scheduling.	8.20	
02/21/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Transfer documents to Cloud site. Support reviewer access to Cloud site.	2.50	
02/21/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review.	7.70	
02/21/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.30	
02/21/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research employment history of Bill Campbell.	0.30	
02/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review and further preparation for depositions.	3.00	
02/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding discovery deficiency letters, email with K. Dermody re same.	0.20	
02/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare summary of Michael McNeal deposition.	0.50	
02/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Research Jim Grenier and prepare draft subpoena.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Google depositions; email L. Cisneros re third party subpoenas; email Lee Rubin re Google depositions; review/edit document production deficiency letters and email L. Cisneros re same; email with D. Harvey re Charlie Grav: email with D. Harvey re plaintiff documents; confer with L. Cisneros re expert interrogatory responses; email with E. Fastiff re trial testimony.	5.50	
02/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research search term date range for D. Harvey from early 2012. Research Brad Smith for B. Glackin. Update deposition transcripts on internal computer drive. Create proof of service for D. Harvey. Data access from Cloud share website.	4.50	
02/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Brad Smith.	6.30	
02/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with and his team re damages analysis; revise letter to Google re document production issues; research document creation discovery cutoff; review documents for upcoming depositions; research deposition strategy, focusing on whether to depose certain lower-level recruiters; revise and serve interrogatory to Lucasfilm re revenue; review depositions to UCLA; research data issues for damages analysis; email with K. Dermody re discovery assignments; draft and serve letters to defendants re discovery issues.	10.20	
02/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update internal databases with new case correspondence. Send correspondence to records.	2.90	
02/22/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Internal emails re document review, depositions.	1.00	
02/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Ratner re deposition research.	0.10	
02/24/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
02/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review.	7.90	
02/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on Google review.	0.10	
02/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for depositions.	6.00	
02/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on discovery deficiency letter.	1.00	
02/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Jim Grenier subpoena and email re Charlie Gray subpoena; prepare for Google depositions; attend team meeting (partial conference call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm (1.00); rest LCHB-only re depositions, experts, documents/discovery; email with D. Harvey re Intel discovery; call to John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg; email Lee Rubin re depositions; draft agenda for team meeting; edit L. Cisneros deficiency letters re compensation/recruiting materials.	10.00	
02/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create proof of service for D. Harvey. Go through privilege logs for Shona Brown, Laszlo Bock, and Eric Schmidt and mark any entries pre April 2007. Review recently release Google privilege log and highlight any emails that have Bill Campbell for D. Harvey. Create a binder of deposition transcript and exhibits for D. Harvey for Eric Schmidt. Highlight the word 'Campbell' or 'Eustace'. Organize documents for K. Dermody and B. Glackin in preparation for depositions this week.	4.90	
02/25/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with case leader K. Dermody and team re discovery; LCHB team meeting re discovery and case strategy.	1.70	
02/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Brad Smith deposition; weekly team call.	8.90	
02/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Dr. Kevin Hallock re expert analysis, prepare for same and research same; research data and documents re internal equity and salary structure issues; confirm Sergey Brin and Larry Page depositions, research same; draft agenda for team call; research privilege log issues; review Google do not call lists; serve deposition notice for Alan Eustace; prepare for motion to compel hearing.	10.20	
02/25/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for hearing on motion to compel.	0.30	
02/25/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review deposition summary.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with all recent case correspondence.	2.20	
02/25/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	9.00	
02/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email Lee Rubin re deposition location; update deposition chart and calendar same: conference with LCHB team re discovery, call with LCHB team and Joseph Saveri Law Firm re discovery; outreach to deposition issue.	3.10	
02/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for D. Harvey review.	0.10	
02/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) review, salary data search, and "Do Not Call" agreement search.	7.50	
02/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos on Google review updates.	0.50	
02/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for deposition and follow up regarding discovery matters.	7.00	
02/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Alan Eustace deposition; edit draft Case Management Conference statement and confer with B. Glackin re same; conference with D. Harvey and Lisa Leebove re discovery hearing; emails with LCHB team re experts; email Citi re escrow agent; review draft requests for admission and discuss with B. Glackin the authenticity issues; edit Charlie Gray subpoena and confer with R. Geman re Charlie Gray deposition; edit deficiency letters re compensation/recruiting discovery and email L. Cisneros re same; email with A. Shaver re witness personnel files.	12.00	
02/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for K. Dermody and B. Glackin. Create binders, exhibits, indices. Create electronic folders of the information.	8.90	
02/26/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference statement; research Edward Colligan declaration issue; office conference with D. Harvey re discovery hearing.	0.70	
02/26/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re witness; email re subpoena of New York ex-Google employee deponent.	0.60	
02/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Brad Smith deposition; office conference with K. Dermody; office conference with L. Cisneros.	6.60	
02/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Brad Smith.	3.80	
02/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Confer with K. Dermody re hearing; argue motion to compel, travel re same, preparation re same; review documents for deposition of Alan Eustace.	12.20	
02/26/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Attend hearing re motion to compel, travel.	3.60	
02/26/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare exhibits for deposition.	6.70	
02/26/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.00	
02/26/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research address and contact information for Charlie Gray, for L. Cisneros.	0.50	
02/26/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	
02/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Update deposition chart; run searches and order Frank Wagner documents; direct reviewing attorney document review and confer with D. Harvey re same; email L. Cisneros re triage review; confer with K. Dermody re personnel files; review history on request for production 9 and emails re deficiency letter on same.	2.90	
02/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) priority review; Google - Alan Eustace - IBM search; review and print Frank Wagner review.	10.10	
02/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.90	
02/26/13	ZHU, JULIE	Executive profile of Brad D. Smith.	1.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/27/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition of Brad Smith.	9.00	
02/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with D. Harvey and travel to Palo Alto for Alan Eustace deposition; take Alan Eustace deposition; return travel to San Francisco and confer with D. Harvey re assignments; emails with team re discovery assignments; email John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg; email D. Harvey re Alan Eustace summary.	11.00	
02/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare interrogatories and requests for admission for all defendants for service. Prepare proof of service per E. Fastiff's instructions. Update production log with recent Pixar and Intuit productions. Send recent Intel production to TERIS. Prepare exhibit binder of Chuong Nguyen to add to war room. Organize documents on the internal computer drive.	5.00	
02/27/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Draft and finalize requests for admission and interrogatories.	0.40	
02/27/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Brad Smith.	8.80	
02/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with deposition of Alan Eustace, travel re same, preparation re same, draft and circulate summary re same.	9.50	
02/27/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review deposition summary; review Department of Justice brief.	0.90	
02/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Deliver documents to offices of defendants' counsel.	0.70	
02/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Draft and edit section of second amended complaint regarding employment history of new named plaintiffs.	0.70	
02/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.00	
02/27/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	12.00	
02/27/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Proof interrogatories and oversee service; emails with D. Ratner re Frank Wagner documents; draft deposition request letter to Adobe and serve; draft deficiency letter to defense counsel and serve; review Supreme Court Amgen opinion; email team re and follow-up with ; email L. Cisneros re case tasks.	3.80	
02/27/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Frank Wagner priority review.	12.00	
02/28/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	4.00	
02/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review.	4.50	
02/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for deposition; confer with K. Dermody re same.	2.50	
02/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with L. Cisneros re Pixar depositions and emails with L. Cisneros re same; review LCHB Amgen order and email with LCHB team re same; review Bill Campbell order and email with D. Harvey re same; many emails with LCHB team re Google misconduct; confer with D. Harvey re depositions; edit draft status report; confer with D. Harvey re Management Conference statement; email L. Cisneros re deposition preparation.	3.50	
02/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents on the internal computer drive and forward to Records. Organize documents for K. Dermody. Update production log with recent Intuit, Intel, Pixar, and Adobe productions. Send new productions to litigation vendor per D. Harvey's instructions. Create Intuit and Pixar deposition binders for L. Cisneros. Update spreadsheet that contains all exhibits for the case to date. Create for D. Harvey document productions and depositions in a list format that took place from February 18, 2013 to March 1, 2013.	4.90	
02/28/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Case Management Conference statement.	0.40	
02/28/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Alan Eustace and Brad Smith deposition transcripts for comment on same.	2.10	
02/28/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read argument re submission of new class certification authority for contribution to case strategy.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review summary of documents for Frank Wagner deposition, review documents re same; review rough drafts of several Adobe depositions; review and research interrogatories from defendants; correspond and conference with plaintiffs re document discovery; meet and confer with Google counsel re documents; confer with K. Dermody and draft and revise case management conference statement, conference with opposing counsel and co-counsel re same; conference with re expert analysis and confer with K. Dermody re same, research same; review depositions for discovery abuse, assemble compilation re same.	6.70	
02/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	2.20	
02/28/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	12.00	
02/28/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with D. Harvey and Paul Schreiber; write up and circulate summary of same; email with K. Dermody re Google issues; conference call with D. Harvey and Lee Rubin re discovery issues; review Frank Wagner documents from reviewing attorneys; call with Lisa Leebove re third set of interrogatories.	2.20	
02/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Assist attorney with document review.	0.30	
02/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Frank Wagner priority review.	11.00	
02/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.70	
02/28/13	ZHU, JULIE	Count objections and durations of depositions of Shona Brown, Alan Eustace, and Arnnon Geshuri for Google misconduct.	0.70	
02/28/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research Apple and Adobe feud.	6.00	
03/01/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	10.00	
03/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in drafting status report, corresponding with opposing counsel for input and filing.	3.00	
03/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for Stephanie Sheehy deposition.	2.00	
03/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery management. Many, many rounds of edits to status report; review deposition excerpts for report and confer with D. Harvey re same; confer with J. Cisneros re filing; email with Joe Saveri re Amgen and Bill Campbell documents; email with D. Harvey re depositions; review defendants' interrogatories.	5.00	
03/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders of depositions for L. Cisneros and K. Dermody of all Pixar and Intuit deponents so far. Organize documents for Google witness for R. German in New York. Update page to PDF file for D. Harvey. Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	4.30	
03/01/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit discovery status report; read Apple/Adobe feud memorandum; read discovery correspondence.	0.90	
03/01/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Emails re deposition preparation.	0.30	
03/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review submission to court re discovery update; memorandum re same. Review correspondence.	1.00	
03/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research deposition excerpts for request to limit objections, revise and conference with team and opposing counsel re same; research and revise case management statement, conference with team re same, conference with opposing counsel re same, supervise filling of same; manage deposition scheduling; draft summary of discovery issues, conference with team and opposing counsel re same.	13.70	
03/01/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review memorandum re Apple/Adobe.	0.40	
03/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of new case correspondence.	1.00	
03/01/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	12.00	
03/01/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with reviewing attorneys re Frank Wagner document review; draft chart of deposition responsibilities and confer with D. Harvey re same; emails with L. Cisneros re Stephanie Sheehy documents.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Frank Wagner priority review.	13.50	
03/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.50	
03/01/13	ZHU, JULIE	Calculate deposition times for deponents.	0.40	
03/01/13	ZHU, JULIE	Memo on Apple and Adobe Feud.	3.10	
03/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Completion of filing, preparation of documents for sealing and service for status report and motion to seal.	4.30	
03/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding exhibits for motion to seal and status report.	0.40	
03/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Preparation of declaration and statement to the court regarding service.	0.70	
03/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with L. Cisneros re filing and review unredacted service copies with L. Cisneros; review documents from Frank Wagner deposition; edit declaration re information technology issues; email team re Facebook documents; email with A. Shaver re Laszlo Bock deposition exhibits and review same.	7.00	
03/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Frank Wagner priority review.	3.00	
03/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for Stephanie Sheehy deposition, document review.	8.00	
03/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review draft filing for Bill Campbell documents and email team re same; email with D. Harvey re Google privilege log; email with team re Amgen analysis; review Frank Wagner documents.	6.50	
03/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review public accounts of Steve Jobs re recruiting and other employment and employee compensation issues.	7.50	
03/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Frank Wagner priority review and Google - Facebook document search.	6.00	
03/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.50	
03/04/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/04/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Create list of certain communication with Bill Campbell where attorneys are only copied to the correspondence or not in the chain of correspondence at all per D. Harvey.	2.10	
03/04/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	4.30	
03/04/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Meet with A. Shaver re case assignment.	0.50	
03/04/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for deposition.	10.00	
03/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery Management: Conferences with T. Desouza re Frank Wagner deposition exhibits; meet with L. Cisneros re Pixar deposition outline; email with D. Harvey and E. Fastiff re Amgen; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove, James Dallal, D. Harvey, E. Fastiff, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re discovery, experts (0.90 - Joe Saveri on for last 0.20); review/edit notice re Bill Campbell documents and confer with N. Barrows re same; review Lisa Leebove's drafts re authenticating documents and email Lisa Leebove re Amgen; comment on Kevin Hallock work; meet with L. Cisneros re Pixar deposition and exhibits; review new Frank Wagner documents; email Lisa Leebove re Case Management Conference statement	7.00	
03/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for L. Cisneros and K. Dermody. Organize documents, create electronic folder of documents, make binders, create indices. Update electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Serve courtesy copies to court of filing over the weekend per L. Cisneros' instructions.	11.70	
03/04/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel status call re discovery; research local rule re submission of new authority; edit in camera review notice; edit draft deposition notice re document authentication; read Kevin Hallock draft report/outline.	2.10	
03/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and draft summary re Amgen case, conference with team re notice of supplemental authority; review draft outline of Dr. Kevin Hallock report, conference with team re same.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/04/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review deposition transcript.	3.10	
03/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for deposition of Stephanie Sheehy.	9.40	
03/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with recent case correspondence.	2.10	
03/04/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	7.50	
03/04/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with K. Dermody, E. Fastiff, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal; e-file notice of in camera review; assist L. Cisneros with deposition preparation; serve deposition notices; review and order Omid Kordestani documents; document review; confer with K. Dermody re Frank Wagner documents; confer with T. Desouza re new Google production; check requests for production on documents supporting interrogatories; review privilege log entries for K. Dermody.	6.90	
03/04/13	WONG, HEATHER	Exchange emails with K. Dermody re deposition outline; read deposition transcript for similar witness; follow-up with L. Cisneros re deposition preparation.	3.40	
03/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google - Executive Management Group (EMG) and Omid Kordestani; Intel - Danny McKell; Pixar - search and print compensation hot documents.	7.50	
03/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memos for Google review updates.	0.50	
03/05/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/05/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Take deposition of Stephanie Sheehy; confer with K. Dermody re same.	8.00	
03/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Frank Wagner deposition; emails with H. Wong, L. Cisneros re deposition.	5.00	
03/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update all electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Prepare index, deposition transcripts, and exhibits to be sent to Professor Kevin Hallock per K. Dermody's instructions. Add exhibits to the deposition of Frank Wagner for K. Dermody. Update production log, and send new Lucasfilm production to litigation vendor.	5.00	
03/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re deposition scheduling and strategy, research and revise memo re same.	1.50	
03/05/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review deposition transcript of Paul Otellini.	3.70	
03/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.20	
03/05/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
03/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with team re depositions, Case Management Conference statement, document reviews; review Frank Wagner documents; review Relativity database for unreviewed deponent documents and email document reviewers on same.	2.00	
03/05/13	WONG, HEATHER	Meet with L. Cisneros before deposition of Stephanie Sheehy, assist L. Cisneros for same, confer with L. Cisneros after same, exchange emails with K. Dermody and L. Cisneros re same.	10.10	
03/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel - Danny McKell priority review; Google - 20130222 Google 048 priority review.	7.00	
03/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on general document review and email memo update.	0.70	
03/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Resolve issues with Relativity review.	0.30	
03/05/13	ZHU, JULIE	Read 'Steve Jobs' and find anything related to how Jobs treated employees.	3.50	
03/06/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/06/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review regarding potential witnesses.	6.00	
03/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for Frank Wagner deposition.	3.40	
03/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Frank Wagner documents and prepare for deposition; email with team re Case Management Conference statement; confer with A. Shaver re document review; edit Case Management Conference statement.	5.00	
03/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	For K. Dermody, work on preparation for the deposition of Frank Wagner. Organize exhibits. Ensure binders for Professor Kevin Hallock are complete per K. Dermody's instructions. Upload documents via file-transfer protocol to experts per B. Glackin's instructions.	6.50	
03/06/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Review materials for deposition.	0.50	
03/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Google document for deposition use; memorandum to K. Dermody re same.	0.40	
03/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with and	1.00	
03/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research data re salary guide charts; research outstanding motion to compel issues; conference with team re deposition scheduling, research same.	5.50	
03/06/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for depositions (Sergey Brin and Larry Page); review deposition transcripts.	3.80	
03/06/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for deposition of Frank Wagner.	4.20	
03/06/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Compile recent case correspondence for storage in firm databases.	0.60	
03/06/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody re Frank Wagner documents; review Frank Wagner documents for deposition; review Case Management Conference statement drafts; review L. Cisneros' summaries of Google potential witness documents and email D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re same; email Lee Rubin re privilege log redaction.	3.30	
03/06/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel - Danny McKell priority review; Google - Sergey Brin and Jonathan Rosenberg priority review.	7.30	
03/06/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on general document review and email memo update.	0.70	
03/06/13	ZHU, JULIE	Read Steve Jobs by Walter Isaacson for cross-examination material.	2.50	
03/07/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	7.00	
03/07/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	7.00	
03/07/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition of Frank Wagner.	10.00	
03/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meet with L. Cisneros re Frank Wagner deposition and travel to and from Palo Alto; take Frank Wagner deposition; emails with team re same; edit supplement to Case Management Conference statement; email with A. Shaver re Sherry Whiteley deposition.	10.50	
03/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production log for incoming Adobe and Intel productions. Adobe productions to litigation vendor. Create Intuit binders and give to K. Dermody and L. Cisneros. Google binders for R. German. Send documents to K. Dermody from Google's production. Files to data analyst per B. Glackin's instructions.	3.80	
03/07/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Review materials for deposition.	1.50	
03/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re case organization.	1.50	
03/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft report of Kevin Hallock.	0.60	
03/07/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Retrieve file-transfer protocol electronic discovery production. Transfer and conversion of documents for use with electronic discovery database.	4.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Radford survey data Intel produced; review subpoena issued to UCLA; review Google clawback request, research same, conference with opposing counsel re same; conference with document database issues, conference with vendor re same; research potential deponents, review Pat Flynn documents.	9.80	
03/07/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Confer with A. Shaver re document review issues.	1.20	
03/07/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intuit: _041480 - 041631.	2.10	
03/07/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Review case documents.	0.30	
03/07/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/07/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Update deposition chart; serve notices of depositions; confer with J. Leggett re documents; direct all document reviewers on priority review; confer with D. Harvey re same; review emails with co-counsel re Case Management Conference statement and conference with Lisa Leebove re same; conference with Lisa Leebove re document reviewers status.	4.90	
03/07/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Extract documents from an encrypted disk. Provide documents to local network location.	1.00	
03/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google, Google - Jonathan Rosenberg, Google - Executive Management Group.	7.50	
03/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on general document review and email memo update.	0.50	
03/08/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/08/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/08/13	CARNAM, TODD	Pull full LinkedIn profile for potential witness.	0.20	
03/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in preparation for Sherry Whiteley deposition, email with K. Dermody re same.	3.50	
03/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with case management statement.	0.10	
03/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Join call with potential witness	0.30	
03/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review the court's order.	0.10	
03/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery Management. Emails with team re Case Management Conference correction and edit same; emails with Justina Sessions re same; review Wang case and email Justina Sessions re same; review Lucas-related case stipulation and email with team re same; email with Lisa Leebove re Frank Wagner deposition; review Omid Kordestani documents; email Joe Saveri re Scott Cook deposition; email team re deposition order; emails with D. Harvey re Sherry Whiteley preparation; email with D. Harvey re depositions.	6.50	
03/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save correspondence to the internal computer drive. Send new productions to litigation vendor and update production log. Ensure copies of certain depositions were in war room per D. Harvey's instructions. Double check all filings are in war room. Organize certain folders in internal computer drive.	3.50	
03/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; email with K. Dermody and conference with opposing counsel re depositions; prepare for depositions.	6.60	
03/08/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review deposition summaries; prepare for deposition (Sergey Brin).	1.20	
03/08/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review: Intuit; Google High Tech.	6.70	
03/08/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with L. Cisneros re Alex Lintner deposition; review deposition transcripts for Omid Kordestani deposition on Monday; emails with K. Dermody re same; confer with K. Dermody re deposition logistics; order Mason Stubblefield documents for deposition; conference with L. Cisneros and D. Harvey re Management Conference statement and Wang decision; email B. Glackin re Chris Galy documents.	5.00	
03/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intel - Danny McKell; Intuit - Mason Stubblefield; Google - Jonathan Rosenberg.	7.30	
03/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on general document review and email memo update.	0.70	
03/08/13	ZHU, JULIE	Profile of Pat Flynn.	0.70	
03/08/13	ZHU, JULIE	Read Steve Jobs by Walter Isaacson for examination questions.	1.30	
03/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Omid Kordestani documents; emails with team re Google - Facebook issues; email Lee Rubin re privilege issues; email D. Harvey re defendants' documents for interrogatories and outstanding defendant documents; review/edit letters from D. Harvey to defendants re outstanding documents; email to B. Glackin re Tim Cook deposition.	5.50	
03/09/13	SWENSON, YUN	Email re Sherry Whiteley deposition preparation project.	0.10	
03/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Omid Kordestani documents; confer with Y. Swenson re deposition exhibits; meet with D. Harvey re assignments/depositions; email Lisa Leebove re authentication depositions and review notices; prepare Omid Kordestani outline and prepare for deposition.	7.00	
03/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Meeting with K. Dermody re deposition preparation; prepare for depositions of Larry Page, Sergey Brin, and Jonathan Rosenberg.	9.20	
03/10/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Google documents for Omid Kordestani deposition; review team emails re amended Case Management Conference statement; review unredacted documents from Lee Rubin and respond re deficiencies re same.	1.70	
03/10/13	SWENSON, YUN	Create Sherry Whiteley deposition preparation folders for K. Dermody.	4.00	
03/11/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	7.50	
03/11/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with litigation team re discovery.	1.50	
03/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare subpoena for Patrick Flynn.	0.60	
03/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Run searches regarding Alex Lintner and review resulting documents; correspondence with K. Dermody regarding such.	4.90	
03/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Omid Kordestani deposition and travel to and from Palo Alto for same; attend team call re discovery, depositions, experts; prepare for Intuit depositions; review draft supplemental disclosures; email with R. Heimann re Intuit document and request for admission.	11.50	
03/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binder for R. Heimann for the deposition of Sergey Brin and Larry Page. Organize binder for D. Harvey for the deposition of Jonathan Rosenberg. Update production log and to litigation vendor. Organize list of all depositions to date for D. Harvey.	5.50	
03/11/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Emails with L. Cisneros re deposition of Charlie Gray.	0.20	
03/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; telephone conference with Ed Leamer; review correspondence; telephone conference with K. Dermody, Joseph Saveri team re discovery.	2.30	
03/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition; team call with K. Dermody, Joseph Saveri.	3.50	
03/11/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Convert, archive, and transfer of files through file-transfer protocol website.	7.00	
03/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Sergey Brin, Larry Page, and Jonathan Rosenberg depositions; draft supplemental initial disclosures; conference with co-counsel; correspond with defendants re discovery issues.	9.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/11/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition, email with K. Dermody re Intuit.	3.20	
03/11/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review: Google High Tech.	7.40	
03/11/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Assign bates stamp and prepare outgoing document production.	2.00	
03/11/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate current contact information for Patrick Flynn, for L. Cisneros.	0.50	
03/11/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Assist with Omid Kordestani deposition in Palo Alto; conference call with LCHB team, Joseph Saveri Law Firm re discovery and case management issues.	10.50	
03/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Google; search for Google collaborations with other defendants; search for Omid Kordestani within Apple, Intel, Intuit; search for email from Arnnon Geshuri-Eric Schmidt and Eric Schmidt-Steve Jobs.	7.50	
03/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on general document review and email memo update.	0.50	
03/11/13	ZHU, JULIE	Create Board of Directors chart.	0.30	
03/12/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	7.50	
03/12/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with K. Dermody re Frank Wagner deposition.	0.30	
03/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare and coordinate subpoena for Patrick Flynn.	0.40	
03/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for Sherry Whiteley deposition.	5.00	
03/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with B. Glackin re contention interrogatories and review same; review and email Kevin Hallock re draft report; email Lisa Leebove re authentication depositions; confer with D. Harvey re depositions; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re same; email team re defendant collaborations; review Intuit documents for depositions; conference with Joel Rosenblatt re case; email Google re productions; confer with L. Cisneros re Frank Wagner.	6.50	
03/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for Jonathan Rosenberg for D. Harvey. Update correspondence to internal computer database. Update production log. Productions to litigation vendor.	10.00	
03/12/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Emails re Charlie Gray materials.	0.20	
03/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re draft report.	7.90	
03/12/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Prepare online video.	4.00	
03/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Jonathan Rosenberg deposition; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; prepare for case management conference; conference with UCLA counsel re subpoena.	12.50	
03/12/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for depositions (Sergey Brin/Larry Page).	3.00	
03/12/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Conference call with D. Harvey re case updates/review.	0.30	
03/12/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	7.50	
03/12/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for D. Harvey.	4.20	
03/12/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	2.30	
03/12/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and deposition preparation.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Work with T. Desouza on Kevin Hallock chart; draft and serve Dana Batali deposition notice and order documents for same; review progress of document reviewers; respond to team emails; read Pixar prior deposition transcripts for expert work.	4.00	
03/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Lucas priority review; Intuit "Do Not Call" list search.	7.40	
03/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo updates on document review.	0.30	
03/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Team conference call re document review.	0.30	
03/13/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/13/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Intel and Google documents.	8.00	
03/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct further document review and prepare for Sherry Whiteley deposition.	3.00	
03/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare and coordinate service of subpoena on Patrick Flynn.	1.00	
03/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Manage experts and discovery. Telephone conference with B. Glackin and Joe Saveri re experts; confer with B. Glackin re expert strategy; telephone conference with B. Glackin, Joe Saveri and Robert Mittelstaedt re interrogatories and expert reports; telephone conference with John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg; confer with B. Glackin re experts and Sheryl Sandberg; prepare for Sherry Whiteley deposition and review documents; travel to and from San Jose for Case Management Conference; meeting with Google re redacted documents and conference with leads re experts; attend Case Management Conference; many emails with team re discovery issues.	13.00	
03/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for Sherry Whiteley for K. Dermody. Update production log, productions to Teris, and update correspondence to electronic database.	10.00	
03/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and attend case management conference.	7.80	
03/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt, Michael Tubach, Joseph Saveri and K. Dermody.	1.20	
03/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Take deposition of Jonathan Rosenberg, travel re same.	8.50	
03/13/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Sergey Brin).	2.70	
03/13/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	7.60	
03/13/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Seth Williams.	1.30	
03/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.70	
03/13/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/13/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare materials for Case Management Conference; attend Case Management Conference in San Jose; order John Kirkman documents for deposition; respond to document reviewer questions; email Peter Barile re privilege log review and respond to questions on same; read Lori McAdams deposition transcript.	9.00	
03/13/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: Intuit - search for salary range and structure data; Lucas priority review; search for non-Intuit Sherry Whiteley documents.	7.30	
03/13/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails memo updates.	0.70	
03/13/13	ZHU, JULIE	Board of directors chart and preparation for Jon Rosenberg deposition.	0.50	
03/14/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/14/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Travel to and assist with Sherry Whiteley deposition with K. Dermody.	9.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Sherry Whiteley deposition and travel to and from Palo Alto for same; take Sherry Whiteley deposition; confer with D. Harvey re amended disclosures and edit same; emails with team re document production; edit joint discovery statement; prepare for Mason Stubblefield.	12.50	
03/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition.	5.90	
03/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and produce supplemental initial disclosures; prepare for Sergey Brin and Larry Page depositions; correspond with defendants; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues.	9.50	
03/14/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Sergey Brin).	0.90	
03/14/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	6.60	
03/14/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
03/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Order John Kirkman documents from Teris; review Dana Batali documents and review prior Pixar transcripts; emails with team re scheduling and discovery issues; email Pixar re Greg Brandeau; serve deposition notices and confer with court reporters.	5.10	
03/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Google review.	7.70	
03/14/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review email memo updates.	0.30	
03/14/13	ZHU, JULIE	Generate exhibits for deposition.	0.30	
03/15/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/15/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Assist in deposition preparation per K. Dermody.	0.20	
03/15/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with document review for Mason Stubblefield deposition.	0.80	
03/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Coordinate deposition schedule, prepare and send notices of deposition.	2.00	
03/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft and send email to opposing counsel regarding deficient document production.	0.20	
03/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review transcript, draft and circulate summary of Sherry Whiteley deposition.	0.60	
03/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email team re deposition issues and discovery report; email with A. Shaver re privilege logs; prepare for Mason Stubblefield deposition.	6.50	
03/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for A. Shaver and K. Dermody. Help D. Harvey with updated production count for Case Management Conference statement. Update production log and to litigation vendor.	6.00	
03/15/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Review and draft deposition preparation memo.	1.50	
03/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition. Prepare for Tim Cook deposition. Review/revise discovery update.	6.50	
03/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for depositions; conference with defendants re discovery issues; revise and file joint discovery status report.	9.20	
03/15/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	7.70	
03/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist A. Shaver with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Dana Batali.	3.10	
03/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of exhibits for a deposition.	3.00	
03/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
03/15/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Download document productions to server.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/15/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft Dana Batali deposition outline; review documents for same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re document review assignments; read Pixar transcripts; review discovery statement and edit same; telephone conference with K. Dermody re Greg Brandeau and Pixar; review hot documents from reviewing attorneys; email with K. Dermody re privilege logs; supervise deposition exhibits for Dana Batali.	4.90	
03/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Google review.	7.70	
03/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review email memo updates.	0.30	
03/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist K. Dermody's preparation for Mason Stubblefield's deposition.	4.00	
03/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Mason Stubblefield deposition.	5.00	
03/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential trial witnesses; conference with defense counsel and correspond with co-counsel re depositions issues.	1.50	
03/16/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Complete document review for K. Dermody for Mason Stubblefield deposition.	2.00	
03/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Intuit re Mason Stubblefield deposition; email with L. Cisneros and T. Desouza re preparation issues.	1.00	
03/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for K. Dermody and B. Glackin. Organize document blowbacks from Eric Evans per D. Harvey's instructions.	7.00	
03/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition; prepare for Tim Cook deposition.	8.00	
03/18/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/18/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation for Scott Cook deposition.	0.20	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend LCHB litigation team meeting.	0.50	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Organize case-related documents for deposition.	0.20	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review background regarding Alex Lintner.	0.50	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review case correspondence from R. Geman re privilege.	0.30	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review court orders re discovery issue.	0.40	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review defendants' interrogatory responses.	0.30	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review objections to Charlie Gray subpoena for deposition and the production of documents; consult with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and R. Geman regarding response and draft; send response to Charlie Gray's counsel.	1.00	
03/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Speak with opposing counsel and address deposition scheduling in consultation with K. Dermody, A. Shaver and B. Glackin.	0.50	
03/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Tim Cook deposition; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock, B. Glackin re expert report; telephone conference with B. Glackin re same; email with D. Harvey re Google documents; email B. Glackin re Apple interrogatories; email Joe Saveri re; LCHB team meeting re discovery.	5.00	
03/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for D. Harvey and R. Heimann or Sergey Brin. Update production log and new productions to Teris. Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	7.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/18/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Emails re Charlie Gray subpoena responses and objections; draft language in response; emails with L. Cisneros re privilege objection.	0.40	
03/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy deposition; prepare for Tim Cook deposition; telephone conference with Christina Brown re verifications; telephone conference with David Kiernan; confer with K. Dermody and Kevin Hallock.	5.30	
03/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re depositions and other discovery issues, draft correspondence re same; conference with expert re damages issues; email K. Dermody re Google documents and review documents; manage document review.	8.50	
03/18/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Sergey Brin).	3.00	
03/18/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	7.70	
03/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Sergey Brin.	4.00	
03/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	3.10	
03/18/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Download document production and copy to server.	0.60	
03/18/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Update select documents from file sharing drive.	0.50	
03/18/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
03/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft Dana Batali deposition outline and review documents for same; travel to Seattle for same.	8.50	
03/18/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Google review.	8.00	
03/18/13	ZHU, JULIE	Research Apple's SEC filings.	1.30	
03/19/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/19/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review of Google documents.	8.00	
03/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Deposition preparation.	1.30	
03/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss deposition exhibits with T. Desouza.	0.20	
03/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for exhibits.	1.50	
03/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Intuit documents and prepare for depositions; email with Intuit re redacted documents; review team write-ups re depositions and email team re same/follow-up; email with A. Shaver re Pixar witnesses.	6.00	
03/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for B. Glackin. Coordinate with Teris to get Scott Cook documents for K. Dermody. Organize documents for the deposition of Mason Stubblefield for K. Dermody. Update production log, communicate with litigation vendor re recent Pixar productions.	6.00	
03/19/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Document review for Google deposition.	1.60	
03/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Chris Galy and Tim Cook depositions.	7.90	
03/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with Sergey Brin deposition, prepare for same, travel re same.	10.20	
03/19/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition of Sergey Brin.	10.00	
03/19/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google High Tech.	2.00	
03/19/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intuit.	5.80	
03/19/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for a deposition.	3.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/19/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.10	
03/19/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Upload documents to file sharing server.	0.70	
03/19/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Take Dana Batali deposition; emails with team re Scott Cook document order; return travel from Seattle; draft Dana Batali deposition summary; review scheduling with court reporter; review Ed Catmull deposition transcript for Pixar follow up.	10.50	
03/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Google review.	7.30	
03/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo update on document review.	0.70	
03/20/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/20/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Coordinate Charlie Gray deposition and service of amended subpoena.	0.70	
03/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss document review with K. Dermody and review documents for Scott Cook deposition preparation.	5.70	
03/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Legal research regarding defense attorney interference with deposition examination.	0.70	
03/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for Alex Lintner deposition and discuss with A. Shaver.	2.00	
03/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review documents for Intuit depositions; meeting with D. Harvey and Intuit/Adobe counsel re redacted documents and review same; confer with B. Glackin re Chris Galy deposition; email with Intuit re Mason Stubblefield; email Joseph Saveri re Saveri contribution to litigation fund and call to Joseph Saveri re Intuit; telephone conference with A. Shaver and Emily Henn re Pixar witnesses.	6.50	
03/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition binder and exhibits for D. Harvey and B. Glackin for Tim Cook and Larry Page. Update production log and communicate with litigation vendor. Update correspondence on the internal computer drive. Create binder of transcript and exhibits for Sherry Whiteley for L. Cisneros. Organize Chris Galy's exhibits for L. Cisneros.	5.50	
03/20/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Sergey Brin deposition transcript for feedback on same.	2.20	
03/20/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and take deposition of Chris Galy; prepare for deposition of Tim Cook.	8.40	
03/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Adobe and Intuit documents for non-responsiveness review; conference with defendants' counsel re discovery issues; prepare for Tim Cook deposition; manage document review.	8.20	
03/20/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Larry Page).	3.00	
03/20/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Apple.	7.80	
03/20/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/20/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review John Kirkman documents and Stephanie Sheehy deposition; confer with L. Cisneros re same; conference with Emily Henn and K. Dermody re Greg Brandeau and John Kirkman; review hot documents from document review team; review deposition summaries from B. Glackin and James Dallal.	3.50	
03/20/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Google, Apple, Lucas, Tim Cook supplement.	7.30	
03/20/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo updates on document review.	0.70	
03/20/13	ZHU, JULIE	Executive profile of deponent Scott D. Cook.	0.80	
03/21/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/21/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review for Alex Lintner deposition.	6.00	
03/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Intuit depositions and review documents; edit discovery report; email team re deposition questions.	4.00	
03/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for K. Dermody. Pull exhibits, organize, and give to K. Dermody. Update production log with Adobe and Intel productions and send to litigation vendor. Finish Tim Cook deposition preparation for B. Glackin. Pull documents for R. Heimann for deposition of Larry Page.	5.80	
03/21/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Document review; deposition preparation.	2.40	
03/21/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and take deposition of Tim Cook.	8.00	
03/21/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Assist with preparation, conversion and load electronic discovery prosecution.	6.00	
03/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel for Tim Cook deposition, prepare for same, assist with same; prepare for Larry Page deposition.	8.20	
03/21/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for deposition (Larry Page).	3.00	
03/21/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Apple.	7.70	
03/21/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Scott Cook.	6.10	
03/21/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
03/21/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/21/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with Emily Henn and counsel of record re John Kirkman deposition; review deposition transcript of Frank Wagner and Alan Eustace for Laszlo Bock deposition; email K. Dermody and D. Harvey re same; draft insert for discovery report on Google production deficiencies.	4.10	
03/21/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup - Apple.	7.90	
03/22/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/22/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition of Scott Cook.	5.50	
03/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Coordinate depositions, including prepare deposition notices.	0.30	
03/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel round trip to Scott Cook deposition (Palo Alto) and prepare for same; take same; review/edit status report and many emails to team re same; many emails with D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove re discovery issues, editing report.	10.00	
03/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for L. Cisneros. Update correspondence to the internal computer folder. Update production log and to litigation vendor. Pull documents for K. Dermody and L. Cisneros.	6.00	
03/22/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Review depositions for Charlie Gray preparation.	0.50	
03/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re contention interrogatories; prepare for Alex Lintner deposition.	0.60	
03/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt and Lisa Leebove.	0.40	
03/22/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Analysis of database for use with electronic discovery.	6.00	
03/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with Larry Page deposition, travel re same, prepare for same; supervise filing of discovery status report, conference with K. Dermody, co-counsel and defense counsel re same.	10.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/22/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Deposition of Larry Page.	8.00	
03/22/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Apple.	7.70	
03/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Alex Lintner.	6.30	
03/22/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review discovery report and emails re same; review letter from Google re production; update deposition calendar; review Laszlo Bock documents.	3.80	
03/22/13	ZHU, JULIE	Larry Page background research.	0.70	
03/23/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft outline for deposition of Alex Lintner.	2.00	
03/23/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents in preparation for deposition of Alex Lintner.	5.00	
03/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to B. Glackin re contention interrogatories.	0.20	
03/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for Laszlo Bock deposition; review transcripts of Alan Eustace, Frank Wagner and Sergey Brin re Laszlo Bock.	4.50	
03/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Document review regarding Alex Lintner deposition.	4.50	
03/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further document review; consult with K. Dermody and B. Glackin; revise Alex Lintner deposition outline.	7.00	
03/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery review for last assignments - multiple emails to team re same and closing out evidence.	2.50	
03/24/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Alex Lintner.	8.50	
03/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup - Apple and Intel.	8.00	
03/25/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/25/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Make further revisions to the outline for Alex Lintner deposition.	0.30	
03/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review correspondence and address case management matters and follow up.	1.00	
03/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Take deposition of Alex Lintner.	5.00	
03/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Write and circulate Alex Lintner deposition summary.	0.60	
03/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend team call re discovery, jury preparation work, costs; email team re Kevin Hallock follow-up work; conference with Joseph Saveri re and telephone conference with and Joseph Saveri re re jury focus group.	7.50	
03/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Alex Lintner.	6.10	
03/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Skylar.	0.10	
03/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Skylar; office conference with D. Harvey re deposition planning, contention interrogatory responses.	2.10	
03/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, co-counsel re case status; research privilege log issues, conference with co-counsel re same; conference with defendants' counsel re deposition scheduling and other discovery issues; manage document review.	8.20	
03/25/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intel.	7.40	
03/25/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Locate sound for document under review.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Compile newly produced documents for litigation vendor.	0.90	
03/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Organize recently filed documents.	1.00	
03/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.10	
03/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, Joseph Saveri Law Firm re case issues; draft Laszlo Bock deposition outline; review documents for same; review chart of Kevin Hallock depositions.	7.40	
03/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Determine remaining unreviewed defendant document count.	0.10	
03/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup - Intel.	7.40	
03/26/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/26/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Assist I. Merrifield with deposition preparation.	0.70	
03/26/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding Case Management Conference.	0.40	
03/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review supplemental discovery responses.	1.00	
03/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review documents; prepare for depositions; confer with A. Shaver re Bock; confer with R. Geman re New York Google deposition; email with Julien re stipulation; email John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg; confer with B. Glackin re expert costs and co-counsel.	7.50	
03/26/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Document review; communication with I. Merrifield.	1.50	
03/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re time and expense contribution; office conference with K. Dermody re same and discovery responses; office conference with D. Harvey re discovery responses.	1.50	
03/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft supplemental initial disclosures, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; manage document review; review Laszlo Bock deposition outline, conference with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re same; review UCLA production; review privilege log materials.	7.20	
03/26/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review summaries and depositions.	0.40	
03/26/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intel.	7.80	
03/26/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist A. Shaver with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Laszlo Bock.	7.70	
03/26/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey on Laszlo Bock outline; revise same; supervise paralegal exhibit work for same.	2.30	
03/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup - Intel.	7.50	
03/27/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/27/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/27/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparations for deposition of Charlie Gray.	2.00	
03/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review transcripts/documents for Stubblefield/Intuit depositions; confer with L. Cisneros re reviewing interrogatory responses; email co-counsel re authenticity stipulation; edit disclosures and email D. Harvey re same; review Comcast decision and confer with B. Glackin re same; review notice of supplemental decision and conference with co-counsel re same.	9.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/27/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Sergey Brin and Larry Page depositions for comment on same.	3.60	
03/27/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Deposition preparation; oversee getting exhibits.	1.00	
03/27/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Comcast decision; office conference with K. Dermody re same; office conference with K. Dermody re time and cost contribution of class counsel; email with Joseph Saveri re same.	1.20	
03/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with Laszlo Bock deposition, travel re same.	9.10	
03/27/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intel.	7.80	
03/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist R. Geman with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Charlie Gray.	6.00	
03/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.70	
03/27/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
03/27/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to and from Palo Alto; take deposition of Laszlo Bock.	9.10	
03/27/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup - Intel.	7.50	
03/27/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Google 'Do Not Call' list search and emails.	0.50	
03/28/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/28/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with discovery tasks including preparation for Charlie Gray, Mason Stubblefield depositions, review of interrogatory responses, address additional related queries from K. Dermody and B. Glackin.	5.00	
03/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg and conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; prepare for Mason Stubblefield deposition; review/edit stipulation re authentic documents and confer with B. Glackin re same; review/edit discovery report; email Lee Rubin re Sheryl Sandberg deposition; confer with L. Cisneros re amended interrogatory responses; review Sheryl Sandberg subpoena.	10.00	
03/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log, send originals to Records, work with Relativity to make sure everything is organized per D. Harvey's instructions. Save correspondence to the internal computer drive. Create deposition notices for D. Harvey.	5.30	
03/28/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read emailed deposition summaries.	0.50	
03/28/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Finalize outline.	3.90	
03/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise stipulation re authenticity/admissibility. Office conferences with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re case management.	0.50	
03/28/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with electronic discovery materials.	4.00	
03/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend George Lucas deposition, travel re same; draft and serve subpoena re Sheryl Sandberg; manage document review; prepare for Robert DeMartini deposition; research Comcast decision, conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same.	11.50	
03/28/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review Comcast decision.	1.10	
03/28/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Google.	2.10	
03/28/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intel.	5.50	
03/28/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Review of document to be produced for D. Harvey.	0.20	
03/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Charlie Gray.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	4.10	
03/28/13	RATNER, DALE	Deposition preparation for Charlie Gray and document review/tagging.	8.00	
03/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Assist reviewers with PDF production with Relativity.	0.70	
03/28/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Intel.	7.30	
03/29/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
03/29/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
03/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist K. Dermody at Mason Stubblefield deposition.	5.00	
03/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for/attend Mason Stubblefield deposition; confer with L. Cisneros re same and follow-up assignments; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re George Lucas depositions; telephone conference with B. Glackin and Joseph Saveri re scheduling; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re scheduling; edit joint discovery statement and confer with D. Harvey re privilege log issues; edit stipulation re schedule and email Court re schedule; email Robert Mittelstaedt, Michael Tubach re Case Management Conference; confer with B. Glackin re Apple interrogatory verifications; call to Lisa Leebove re George Lucas deposition; email R. Geman re Google deposition.	9.50	
03/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence on the internal computer drive. Update production log and new Google production to litigation vendor. Organize Intel privilege logs per D. Harvey's instructions. Update spreadsheet with recent final exhibits. Compare witness list with all interrogatory responses and disclosures for B. Glackin.	6.00	
03/29/13	GEMAN, RACHEL	Take deposition of Charlie Gray; email K. Dermody re same and privilege issues; email D. Harvey re information on relevant deposition pages for motion to compel privilege issues.	5.00	
03/29/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re discovery update. Telephone conference with Tina Sessions re David Anderman deposition. Correspondence with Michael Tubach re Apple interrogatory responses; telephone conference with K. Dermody re same. Review list of witnesses disclosed by defendants.	3.40	
03/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft discovery status report, confer with K. Dermody, file same; conference with defendants re discovery issues; prepare for Robert DeMartini deposition; research privilege log issues, draft and serve letter re same; manage document review.	8.20	
03/29/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.00	
03/29/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	5.00	
03/29/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Intel.	8.00	
03/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re discovery assignments, Kevin Hallock documents; email Michael Tubach re schedule; emails with team re scheduling; conference with Kevin Hallock re Intuit depositions and emails with D. Harvey re deposition exhibits, stipulation; email D. Harvey and A. Shaver re plaintiffs' witnesses.	2.00	
03/31/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Robert DeMartini deposition.	0.20	
03/31/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Robert DeMartini deposition.	5.50	
04/01/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/01/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend litigation team call with co-counsel.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg deposition; conference/emails with D. Harvey re Apple subpoena and deposition preparation; email with D. Harvey re InYourFace book Google site; email with D. Harvey re Robert DeMartini deposition; email with B. Glackin re assignments; email Michael Tubach re scheduling; review last week's deposition summaries and email LCHB team re same.	4.00	
04/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Update production log and resend Google production to litigation vendor. Create list and electronic folders of deposition transcripts and exhibits to date per K. Dermody's instructions to be sent to Professor Kevin Hallock. Have Services start making the binders to be sent out.	4.50	
04/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm.	0.80	
04/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Deposition of Robert DeMartini, travel re same.	13.50	
04/01/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	2.80	
04/01/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Apple.	5.00	
04/01/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/01/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference calls with grant compare project.	2.00	
04/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant cleanup - Intel.	7.80	
04/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update on document review.	0.20	
04/01/13	ZHU, JULIE	eBay memo re Intuit issues.	4.50	
04/01/13	ZHU, JULIE	Executive profiles of Pat Flynn and Robert DeMartini in preparation of depositions.	1.00	
04/02/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	10.00	
04/02/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and respond to case correspondence.	0.40	
04/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls with Beatriz Meija re Shervl Sandberg; email Beatriz Meija re schedule; review media reports re Sheryl Sandberg; emails/call with A. Shaver re deposition; meeting/emails with D. Harvey re Facebook documents; confer with B. Glackin re Sheryl Sandberg, D. Harvey and R. Heimann re Sheryl Sandberg possible declaration; email D. Harvey re Intel documents.	3.00	
04/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binders and exhibits for Kevin Hallock per D. Harvey's instructions. Finalize binders, create list of documents being sent out and letter. Pull any documents from Google relating to salary information for D. Harvey. Update production log.	4.40	
04/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; meeting with K. Dermody and research issues re Sheryl Sandberg deposition; prepare for Patrick Flynn deposition, review documents re same; email K. Dermody re Intel; conference with Paul Schreiber re subpoena; conference with co-counsel re responses to subpoena.	13.10	
04/02/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Conference with K. Dermody re Sheryl Sandberg.	0.30	
04/02/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of exhibits for a deposition.	0.90	
04/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	4.10	
04/02/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review; deposition preparation of Patrick Flynn.	8.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/02/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email Joseph Saveri Law Firm re amended interrogatory redlines and confer with J. Zaul re same; calls with K. Dermody; review Google subpoena.	1.50	
04/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup Department of Justice - Intel.	2.20	
04/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo on document review.	0.60	
04/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Pat Flynn document review for deposition preparation.	1.50	
04/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review of defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	3.70	
04/03/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/03/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re collaboration evidence; edit memo for Kevin Hallock; review Google salary raises; email to Joseph Saveri, B. Glackin, R. Heimann re mediators; email D. Harvey re Patrick Flynn deposition; email L. Cisneros re discovery report; review memo for Kevin Hallock and edit same; emails with Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg, motion schedule; confer with A. Shaver re, Sheryl Sandberg.	4.50	
04/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for D. Harvey for Patrick Flynn. Prepare binder for K. Dermody per D. Harvey's instructions. Update exhibit used spreadsheet. Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	3.50	
04/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and take deposition of Patrick Flynn, draft summary re same, email K. Dermody re same; organize fact discovery; manage document review; correspond with defense counsel re discovery issues.	9.50	
04/03/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	1.00	
04/03/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Project for D. Harvey to find all contracts between defendants.	6.80	
04/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of binders of key documents for an expert witness.	0.20	
04/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	3.90	
04/03/13	RATNER, DALE	Retrieval and organization of contracts re 'pro-competitive/defendant complications' justification among defendants.	8.00	
04/03/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Calls with conference with K. Dermody re same; emails re Sheryl Sandberg motion; review case email.	2.00	
04/04/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/04/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re UCLA document production; confer with A. Shaver re and A. Shaver re deposition; edit and revise draft discovery report and email defense counsel re same; confer with B. Glackin re interrogatories; email Beatriz Mejia re meet and confer; email A. Shaver re Sheryl Sandberg motion; confer with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock transcripts; multiple emails with team re Alternative Dispute Resolution and email Robert Mittelstaedt re same.	2.50	
04/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Send documents to D. Harvey from Intel. Send other requested documents. Create defendant agreement binders for K. Dermody.	0.30	
04/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel to New York City for Paul Schreiber deposition preparation; research discovery issues, correspond with K. Dermody and defendants' counsel re same; research interrogatory responses.	8.50	
04/04/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of binders of key documents for expert witness.	6.70	
04/04/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/04/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with and K. Dermody; emails with Google re same; confer with K. Dermody re Sheryl Sandberg motion to quash; review J. Zaul memo on interrogatory responses and emails re same with attorneys.	2.00	
04/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo re defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	3.00	
04/04/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review of defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	5.00	
04/05/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.50	
04/05/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with filling of discovery status report and edits to same.	1.00	
04/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Renewed class certification management. Review class certification order and many emails with team re same; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with Phil Johnson and B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with B. Glackin, Lisa Leebove, Phil Johnson, Ed Leamer re same; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock, B. Glackin and Lisa Leebove re same; draft revised case management schedule; conference with B. Glackin and Robert Mittelstaedt re Alternative Dispute Resolution and schedule; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove, James Dallal, B. Glackin re schedule; telephone conference with D. Harvey re Paul Schreiber deposition/documents; edit draft discovery report and confer with L. Cisneros re same; email T. Desouza re collaboration binders.	8.50	
04/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binders to send to Kevin Hallock per K. Dermody's instructions. Work on agreement binders for K. Dermody. Update internal computer drive with deposition transcripts. Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	4.50	
04/05/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read class certification order for comment on same.	2.00	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conferences with K. Dermody re order; telephone conferences with K. Dermody, Lisa Leebove and James Dallal.	2.20	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review class certification order.	1.50	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey.	0.60	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, Kevin Hallock re report.	0.80	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, and Ed Leamer; preparation.	1.10	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, re report.	0.60	
04/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, Robert Mittelstaedt re Alternative Dispute Resolution.	0.30	
04/05/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with electronic discovery documents.	2.00	
04/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Paul Schreiber re deposition; research discovery issues; manage document review; review class certification order, conference with team re same; review discovery report, revise and supervise filing of same.	11.50	
04/05/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of binders of key documents for an expert witness.	5.80	
04/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.90	
04/05/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Judge Koh order on class certification and emails with team re same.	2.00	
04/05/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Update database. Load new documents into Summation database.	3.50	
04/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo evaluating defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review of defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	5.00	
04/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Table of defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	1.00	
04/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re deposition; email Joe Saveri re schedule and conference call; email Robert Mittelstaedt re schedule; email Google re Inyourfacebook missing documents.	1.00	
04/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Defend deposition of Paul Schreiber, conference with K. Dermody, Paul Schreiber re same; travel back to San Francisco.	14.00	
04/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with Robert Mittelstaedt re schedule; telephone conference with Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey re order and schedule; edit schedule and email Robert Mittelstaedt re same; telephone conferences with B. Glackin re schedule.	3.50	
04/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel back to San Francisco from Paul Schreiber deposition; conference with co-counsel regarding case management issues.	4.50	
04/08/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/08/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Supplemental interrogatory responses project and email with K. Dermody.	0.10	
04/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with D. Harvey and A. Shaver and travel to and from court; meeting with team re hearing and conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re schedule; confer with D. Harvey re contention interrogatories; confer with D. Harvey re sealing motions; telephone conference with A. Shaver and Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg deposition and confer with A. Shaver re opposition to same; email L. Cisneros re interrogatory responses; attend Case Management Conference and conference with Lee Rubin re Google; telephone conference with R. Heimann re brief; email Ed Leamer, Kevin Hallock re schedule; email R. Heimann, team re certification analysis; email D. Harvey re Google training document; email E. Cabraser re Comcast.	7.50	
04/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Update production log and send new productions to litigation vendor. Clean and organize the war room per D. Harvey's instructions. Update bates spreadsheet with all exhibits from case for depositions. Create chart with new dates for case and send to Calendar per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.50	
04/08/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read class certification and Case Management Conference order.	1.00	
04/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Confer with K. Dermody and A. Shaver, attend case management conference, travel re same, prepare re same; review discovery responses and email with K. Dermody re Google; conference with defendants re discovery disputes; summarize Paul Schreiber deposition.	9.50	
04/08/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review court order and email with K. Dermody re same.	1.30	
04/08/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intuit.	7.80	
04/08/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	3.60	
04/08/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody and D. Harvey, and attend Case Management Conference in San Jose; meet and confer with K. Dermody, Sheryl Sandberg counsel and prepare for same.	5.90	
04/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup Department of Justice - Google.	6.90	
04/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: UCLA expert witness, Edward Leamer.	1.00	
04/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update on document review.	0.10	
04/09/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/09/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/09/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review deposition transcripts and exhibits, and consult with A. Shaver and K. Dermody re follow up on Intuit.	1.80	
04/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with D. Harvey, B. Glackin, Kevin Hallock re expert report; emails with L. Cisneros re Intuit pay ranges; email with A. Shaver re defendants' pay ranges; review notice re administrative motion for sealing and confer with D. Harvey re same; conference with team re salary evidence.	2.50	
04/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Take intake telephone call and report to D. Harvey. Create agreement binder for Google and Intel per K. Dermody's instructions. Update internal computer drive with deposition exhibits and transcripts per A. Shaver's instructions. Work with Help Desk to fix PDF issue with litigation vendor. Clean and organize war room per D. Harvey's instructions.	6.30	
04/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise discovery responses, conference with co-counsel re same; manage document review; review documents; organize war room and evidence binders; confer with K. Dermody, Kevin Hallock.	7.50	
04/09/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review for Intuit.	5.80	
04/09/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Project for A. Shaver to find all pay documents for Pixar.	1.00	
04/09/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with assembly of binders of key case documents.	0.50	
04/09/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	3.30	
04/09/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/09/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research on defendant pay ranges and correspondence on same with K. Dermody, and Joseph Saveri Law Firm; confer with K. Dermody re same; review J. Zaul memo and confer with him on revision.	3.50	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Conference call with D. Harvey re review work.	0.20	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: UCLA expert witness, Edward Leamer.	2.30	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email update on Pixar salary range.	0.50	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo on defendant supplemental responses to interrogatories.	1.00	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review Renee James deposition transcript for key words.	1.00	
04/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search and review for Pixar salary range.	3.00	
04/10/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/10/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend LCHB team meeting re compensation structures.	1.00	
04/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Correspondence with J. Zaul re review assignment.	0.30	
04/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re Pixar witnesses, Google collaborations, case strategy; email with Ed Leamer, B. Glackin, Phil Johnson re expert call; review Apple letter re pay ranges and email team re same; telephone conference with Beatriz Mejia re subpoena/deposition; email with A. Shaver re Pixar documents; edit contention interrogatory responses; email with T. Desouza re Kevin Hallock materials; email Robert Mittelstaedt re mediation; review collaboration documents.	4.90	
04/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Team call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re case strategy.	1.60	
04/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update exhibits and depositions to Kevin Hallock per K. Dermody's instructions. Create index, and finalize binders. Research dates of civil investigative demands for D. Harvey.	5.50	
04/10/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read unredacted class certification order, comments on same.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/10/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with the production of documents regarding Apple-Google recruiting emails.	6.00	
04/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise discovery responses; manage document review; conference with LCHB, co-counsel re next steps; review deposition testimony; research recent decisions re Comcast and Amgen.	6.50	
04/10/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist K. Dermody with preparation of binders of key documents to send to an expert witness.	0.70	
04/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.90	
04/10/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/10/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm; conference with D. Harvey, L. Cisneros and K. Dermody re assignments; review Pixar salary range documents and email Pixar re same; review Greg Brandeau documents and emails with K. Dermody re same; review J. Zaul memo on interrogatories.	2.80	
04/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: UCLA expert witness, Edward Leamer.	5.70	
04/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email on Pixar salary range search.	0.30	
04/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo on UCLA expert witness, Edward Leamer.	2.00	
04/10/13	ZHU, JULIE	Create The War for Talent memo.	4.50	
04/10/13	ZHU, JULIE	Update Board of Directors chart.	0.30	
04/11/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/11/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend expert call.	0.80	
04/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class certification order.	1.00	
04/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Pixar salary-related documents.	1.00	
04/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Kevin Hallock re status; confer with T. Desouza re depositions; email team re Sheryl Sandberg; telephone conference with Ed Learner, with Ed Learner, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros, Joe Saveri re expert analysis; edit discovery report and emails with D. Harvey re same; call to R. Heimann re Sheryl Sandberg testimony preservation; email Beatriz Mejia/John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg; email	3.00	
04/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Update deposition transcripts on the internal computer drive and update production log. Burn files from a thumb drive to the internal computer drive for D. Harvey. Finalize exhibit binders to go to Professor Kevin Hallock and draft letter to go with it. Contact Veritext to obtain Paul Schreiber deposition transcript and exhibits per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.90	
04/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification issues; manage document review; review documents; draft discovery report, conference with defendants re same.	2.40	
04/11/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.30	
04/11/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with on salary range documents; emails with Pixar re same; review Stephanie Sheehy deposition transcript.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Assist reviewers with Relativity.	0.50	
04/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review: defendant roundup Department of Justice - Intel.	3.50	
04/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo on Intel document review.	0.50	
04/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Memo on UCLA expert witness, Edward Leamer, review.	3.00	
04/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Print UCLA documents.	0.50	
04/12/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	7.00	
04/12/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparing and filing discovery status report; confer with K. Dermody re pay range discovery.	5.00	
04/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Many revisions to discovery report and contention interrogatory responses; telephone conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re interrogatories; telephone conference with Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same (partial 1.0); email Lisa Leebove re Apple position; email with L. Cisneros re Pixar and Intuit responses; email with A. Shaver re Intuit documents; telephone conference with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re pay range discovery; email Selim re Google documents; telephone conferences with Sheryl Sandberg's counsel re deposition.	5.00	
04/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update productions and correspondence to the internal computer drive. Research links for various productions and letters for D. Harvey and A. Shaver. Update production log and send recent Lucasfilm, Pixar, and Google productions to litigation vendor. Update deposition binders made for the war room. Organize the exhibits from the Paul Schreiber deposition from the Veritext website for D. Harvey.	4.20	
04/12/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read George Lucas deposition transcript for comment on same.	1.20	
04/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re responses to contention interrogatories; telephone conference with D. Harvey re responses to contention interrogatories; telephone conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re responses to contention interrogatories; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re contention interrogatories and Saveri contribution to cost fund. Review/revise contention interrogatory responses.	3.80	
04/12/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Download and capture videos. Conversion and preparation of videos for use with presentation.	6.00	
04/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise discovery responses, conference with team and co-counsel re same; revise discovery status report, conference with K. Dermody, co-counsel re same, conference with opposing counsel re same; supervise filing of discovery status report; research salary guides - documents produced and gaps.	10.50	
04/12/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Begin new project for D. Harvey to find compensation data.	1.00	
04/12/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	5.80	
04/12/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Review new project instructions.	1.00	
04/12/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	5.50	
04/12/13	RATNER, DALE	Finish review of all documents.	1.50	
04/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re discovery report; call Lisa Leebove re same; draft insert for same; review defendant changes to same.	4.00	
04/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Develop saved searches for salary structure for all defendants and review method for team.	0.70	
04/12/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email memo on document review.	0.30	
04/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email LCHB team re Sheryl Sandberg meet and confer; email L. Cisneros re status report follow up.	0.50	
04/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re case management issues; prepare for case management conference.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/15/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/15/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend team meeting.	1.00	
04/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare and e-file transcript request form.	0.30	
04/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Discovery and class strategy management. Review order re discovery and email team re same; team call with B. Glackin, A. Shaver, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal re discovery; draft outline for Sheryl Sandberg interview and email with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re same; email/call Kevin Hallock re status; confer with T. Desouza re Sheryl Sandberg documents and review same; review Intuit pay information and confer with A. Shaver re same; confer with D. Harvey re contracts; confer with B. Glackin re class certification brief and assignments.	4.50	
04/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search all exhibits for any mention of Sheryl Sandberg for K. Dermody. Print and send her copies of all the exhibits. Update production log and send newest Apple production to Teris.	2.00	
04/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with Saveri Law Firm; telephone conference with D. Harvey; office conference with K. Dermody.	1.10	
04/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend co-counsel call; research supplemental class certification brief; manage document review; email K. Dermody re Sheryl Sandberg.	3.50	
04/15/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/15/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
04/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with LCHB, Joseph Saveri Law Firm re discovery; call with Kate Zeng re Intuit data; call with K. Dermody re same; email pay range documents to Kevin Hallock.	1.40	
04/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Plan team salary range search; respond to team emails and questions on search.	1.00	
04/15/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Telephone call with D. Harvey on salary range search.	0.10	
04/16/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/16/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with A. Shaver regarding Pixar salary ranges.	0.20	
04/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Candace Jackman re Sheryl Sandberg deposition; email with Candace Jackman re same; email with A. Shaver re draft Sandberg declaration; email with D. Harvey re document review, experts; edit/revise Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	1.50	
04/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Update production log. Organize newest Apple production for D. Harvey. Research certain Bill Campbell documents for K. Dermody and L. Cisneros. Organize war room per D. Harvey's instructions. Update deposition binders. Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	3.80	
04/16/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Review database. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	3.00	
04/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research supplemental class certification motion; manage document review; meeting with Zarl re same.	5.60	
04/16/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/16/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/16/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with L. Cisneros re Pixar pay range issue.	0.20	
04/16/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: defendant salary range - Adobe and Apple.	7.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/16/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey on document organization project.	0.20	
04/16/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Team planning for salary range search; respond to team emails and questions on search.	0.50	
04/17/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/17/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work with A. Shaver and K. Dermody on discovery disputes with Pixar, draft and send correspondence.	2.00	
04/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review draft outline of brief and emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same; edit draft discovery report; email Sheryl Sandberg counsel re discovery report; email D. Harvey re coding; emails with A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re Intuit and Pixar documents and review same.	3.50	
04/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log with newest Google production and to litigation vendor. Create new production binder. Send Litigation Support the links for all deposition transcripts so they can be loaded to TextMap per D. Harvey's instructions. Prepare updated deposition binder to Professor Kevin Hallock per K. Dermody's instructions. Continue to organize war room per D. Harvey's instructions.	6.30	
04/17/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Review database. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	3.00	
04/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; research and draft supplemental class certification motion and email with K. Dermody re same; draft coding sheet for deposition review.	6.50	
04/17/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/17/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.80	
04/17/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/17/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft Intuit portion of discovery statement; confer with K. Dermody re same; call with Kate Zeng re same.	0.50	
04/17/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Create document organization template; respond to team emails and questions on search.	0.50	
04/17/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: defendant salary range - Intel.	7.50	
04/18/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/18/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with discovery dispute concerning Pixar and document review; confer with K. Dermody re same.	2.50	
04/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer/Lease, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove re expert analysis; telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros, Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove, James Dallal re class brief, assignments; email with Sheryl Sandberg counsel re Sheryl Sandberg deposition/declaration; email T. Desouza re pay range assignment; email A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re Pixar documents; email team re Intuit depositions.	5.00	
04/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update transcripts and exhibits to the internal computer drive. Create transcript binders for K. Dermody. Review unredacted and redacted contract binders for D. Harvey and mark differences for his review. Update production log. Create binder of selected transcripts per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.50	
04/18/13	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation Support: Review CaseMap database; meet with A. Grant re loading of transcripts and linking of exhibits in TextMap.	1.00	
04/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team calls with experts, co-counsel; team meeting.	1.90	
04/18/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Database review. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re class certification work; attend co-lead counsel conference; research class certification issues; manage document review; manage deposition review.	5.50	
04/18/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
04/18/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with LCHB, Joseph Saveri Law Firm re discovery; confer with K. Dermody, L. Cisneros re Pixar pay range; conference with Kate Zeng re same.	1.20	
04/18/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: defendant salary range - Intel.	8.00	
04/18/13	ZHU, JULIE	The War for Talent and eBay memo.	0.30	
04/19/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/19/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with discovery status report.	1.00	
04/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Many revisions to joint discovery report and emails re same; conference with team re Intuit pay ranges; email team re mediation; review Intuit pay materials; edit emails to Pixar re documents.	4.50	
04/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log with new Apple production. Locate documents for A. Shaver. Check page counts for Intel and Intuit for D. Harvey. Create deposition binders for K. Dermody.	1.00	
04/19/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Database review. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	6.00	
04/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review documents; manage transcript review; draft and revise discovery report, confer with K. Dermody, research same, conference with defendants re same; review transcripts.	8.50	
04/19/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/19/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	3.70	
04/19/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
04/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet and confer with Intuit on pay range data; confer with K. Dermody on same; review Intuit documents for status report; review L. Cisneros and Pixar correspondence.	1.00	
04/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: Defendant salary range - Intel.	3.70	
04/19/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for Pixar salary ranges; email on Pixar salary ranges.	1.80	
04/19/13	ZHU, JULIE	Review transcript of Paul Schreiber for key words.	0.60	
04/20/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and tag Laszlo Bock and Michael McNeal deposition transcripts for class certification write-up.	1.90	
04/20/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: Defendant salary range - Intel.	2.50	
04/22/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/22/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare chart for deposition transcript reviews.	0.20	
04/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research Intuit documents for A. Shaver based on deposition exhibits. Update correspondence on the internal computer drive. Create chart for coding depositions for D. Harvey.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/22/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Database review. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	6.00	
04/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Manage document review; review transcripts for class certification issues; conference with defense counsel re discovery issues; review Google redactions.	2.50	
04/22/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	4.10	
04/22/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review.	8.00	
04/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft memo on Michael McNeal and Laszlo Bock compensation testimony for D. Harvey and K. Dermody; emails with Intuit re redacted document.	1.50	
04/22/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: defendant salary range - Intel.	7.70	
04/22/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates on review status.	0.20	
04/22/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey re review assignment.	0.10	
04/22/13	ZHU, JULIE	Paul Schreiber deposition errata and review testimony re same.	3.50	
04/23/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/23/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Expert/Class strategy management. Review Ed Leamer analysis, and analysis. Kevin Hallock outline and emails with team re same; telephone conference with James Dallal re Apple data and call to Pixar meet and confer.	4.00	
04/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive. Update production log with page counts for Intel, Google, and Apple. Update production binder.	1.00	
04/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Chris Galy deposition transcript.	1.60	
04/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri.	0.90	
04/23/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Compile exigent and link documents in transcript database.	6.00	
04/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review expert analysis, research and draft summary re same, draft memo re next steps and circulate to team; conference with re research progress and strategy going forward.	3.50	
04/23/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/23/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make binders of deposition transcripts and exhibits.	1.10	
04/23/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.90	
04/23/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with B. Glackin re compensation testimony memos; email K. Dermody re Intuit pay range production.	0.30	
04/23/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review: defendant salary range: Intel and Lucas.	8.00	
04/23/13	ZHU, JULIE	Review testimony and draft Paul Schreiber errata.	3.30	
04/24/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/24/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents related to Pixar salary ranges; consult with A. Shaver and K. Dermody, and send related correspondence to opposing counsel.	7.50	
04/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re Apple job titles/ranges; telephone conference with experts and team re data analysis; conference with Joe Saveri, Lisa Leebove, B. Glackin re same; confer with B. Glackin re assignments; email L. Cisneros re Pixar; email re Apple codes.	3.00	
04/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive. Produce new production to litigation vendor. Upload files to the internal computer drive and send to L. Cisneros. Pull several documents for L. Cisneros and send exhibits as well.	1.50	
04/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert work; draft memo re testimony of Chris Galy re class certification.	2.90	
04/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft expert materials; team call with experts; review class certification order; confer with K. Dermody re class certification assignments; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same; memo re same.	3.10	
04/24/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Database review. Link deposition exhibits to transcript database.	6.00	
04/24/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/24/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.40	
04/24/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and Excel entry for expert.	8.00	
04/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re assignments for class certification brief; review draft Pixar email and confer with L. Cisneros re same.	0.50	
04/24/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant Lucas salary range.	8.00	
04/25/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/25/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Compensation discovery management. Meeting with B. Glackin re experts; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re Apple data and compensation materials; emails with James Dallal re Intuit; telephone conference with L. Cisneros, A. Shaver and Pixar re Pixar production and review materials re same; telephone conference with L. Cisneros, Beatriz Mejia and Candace Jackman re Sheryl Sandberg declaration and email counsel re subpoena; email T. Desouza re compensation certifications; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re mediators and email team re same.	5.00	
04/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive. Update production log and pull production data for A. Shaver.	1.50	
04/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft renewed class certification motion.	8.40	
04/25/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review draft declaration - Sheryl Sandberg.	0.30	
04/25/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make binders of deposition transcripts.	2.10	
04/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.90	
04/25/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review; data for experts.	8.00	
04/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft shell status report; emails with K. Dermody, team re content for same; conference call with Pixar re salary range data; review emails on same.	0.90	
04/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant Lucas salary range; defendant internal equity search.	7.70	
04/25/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails to team on search assignments and instructions.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/26/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	9.00	
04/26/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation of discovery status report.	1.00	
04/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Intuit depositions and prepare notes to team re same; review all defendants' declarations re discovery compliance and email team re same; edit and revise (many revisions) discovery report; email Joe Saveri re mediators; edit letter to Joe Saveri re case management and cost contributions; email Sheryl Sandberg counsel re status/subpoena; email re call; calls with James Dallal re discovery report and review same.	4.50	
04/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence on internal computer drive. Update production log with Pixar production. Document management for K. Dermody. Organize recent documents that were electronically filed for K. Dermody.	2.10	
04/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft request to Joseph Saveri for cost fund contribution and confer with K. Dermody re same.	1.70	
04/26/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Database review. Link electronic discovery in transcript database.	4.00	
04/26/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/26/13	RATNER, DALE	Document review and tagging.	8.00	
04/26/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant internal equity search.	8.00	
04/26/13	ZHU, JULIE	Paul Schreiber deposition errata and review of documents.	4.00	
04/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review depositions for class certification brief, draft summaries re same.	4.50	
04/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief.	8.50	
04/29/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/29/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend team meeting.	1.00	
04/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Discuss with D. Harvey next steps for Pixar production.	0.20	
04/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Intuit documents.	1.50	
04/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Pixar production.	2.00	
04/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email team re discovery close outs; attend conference call (partial) with Ed Leamer, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove, Joe Saveri (partial) and review Ed Leamer/ analysis; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re analysis.	2.00	
04/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Save electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Pull selected deposition transcripts and exhibits and put in Zip files to send via email for D. Harvey. Create deposition excerpts in preparation for the supplemental motion for class certification per D. Harvey's instructions. Update production log and send newest Pixar production to litigation vendor.	5.00	
04/29/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team conference calls; team conference call with experts; review draft expert work; memorandum re same.	4.30	
04/29/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Link electronic discovery to transcript database.	6.00	
04/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification brief, conference with co-counsel re same, conference with experts re same; confer with L. Cisneros re Pixar.	12.20	
04/29/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review expert report.	0.60	
04/29/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/29/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.80	
04/29/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Assist reviewers. Transfer documents to Egnyte Cloud share site.	1.50	
04/29/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant internal equity search.	10.00	
04/29/13	ZHU, JULIE	Paul Schreiber deposition errata and document review.	4.00	
04/30/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
04/30/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
04/30/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft sections of class certification brief.	3.00	
04/30/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents and deposition transcripts for class certification brief.	4.00	
04/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Kevin Hallock revised draft outline/report and telephone conference with Kevin Hallock, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re report; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re experts; email Sheryl Sandberg counsel re declaration; email L. Cisneros re Pixar documents.	4.00	
04/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify all deposition exhibits are on the internal computer drive and sort correctly per deposition. Pull referred to exhibits and lodge in the correct folders per D. Harvey's instructions. Update production log and ensure newest production is loaded immediately per L. Cisneros' instructions.	5.50	
04/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference calls with and D. Harvey; memorandum to counsel re same.	3.40	
04/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody and Kevin Hallock; draft plan for class certification motion and Ed Leamer report; office conference with D. Harvey; telephone conference with K. Dermody.	2.90	
04/30/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Compile exigent and link documents transcript database.	7.00	
04/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification brief; calls with K. Dermody, B. Glackin and experts.	9.50	
04/30/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
04/30/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make binders of deposition transcripts and exhibits used.	3.30	
04/30/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
04/30/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Develop search and review protocol for impact search and talent competitors search.	2.00	
04/30/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant impact and defendant talent competitors documents.	9.80	
04/30/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails with D. Harvey to discuss work assignment.	0.20	
04/30/13	ZHU, JULIE	Pixar financial information research.	0.60	
05/01/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
05/01/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review in preparation for depositions.	6.50	
05/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to query from K. Dermody regarding salary structure evidence, Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	0.40	
05/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with B. Glackin, Lisa Leebove re experts; email L. Cisneros and Sheryl Sandberg counsel re declaration; email Joe Saveri re mediators; telephone conference with team re expert analysis and emails re same.	1.20	

inception Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From То 05/04/15

Timekeeper: all

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log with new Pixar production and to litigation vendor. Create binders for the deposition of Paul Schreiber and for all exhibits plaintiffs' used per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize excerpts for D. Harvey.	1.20	
05/01/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read expert class certification analysis for comment on same.	1.80	
05/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri, D. Harvey and K. Dermody re experts; telephone conference with Leamer; review outstanding invoices; draft cost fund letter to co-counsel.	2.10	
05/01/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Link deposition exhibits into transcript database. Database review.	4.00	
05/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief.	10.20	
05/01/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
05/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make and assemble binders of deposition transcripts, important documents.	4.50	
05/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.20	
05/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Create and assign search and review protocol for hot technical talent class certification documents, TERIS/Relativity search.	3.50	
05/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of defendant impact, defendant talent competitors, and hot technical talent class certification documents.	5.00	
05/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Highlight, tab and organize printed hot documents.	3.50	
05/02/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
05/02/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research for B. Glackin regarding discovery responses.	1.20	
05/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further document review and analysis for class certification.	4.50	
05/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to K. Dermody's inquiry regarding document productions, draft discovery correspondence, attend meet and confer and follow up with team.	2.50	
05/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email L. Cisneros re Pixar documents; email James Dallal re Intel documents; telephone conference with Sheryl Sandberg counsel re declaration and interview; email team re same; email D. Harvey re Mason Stubblefield deposition; edit letter to defendants re interrogatories; edit Kevin Hallock report; email L. Cisneros re Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	3.00	
05/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate deposition excepts for supplemental class certification briefing per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize binders with all deposition exhibits. Confer with I. Merrifield in preparation for the filing.	3.50	
05/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft correspondence to Joseph Saveri and Robert Mittelstaedt. Draft outline of expert report questions. Review outstanding expert invoices. Review discovery responses.	3.50	
05/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification motion.	8.20	
05/02/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
05/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare and organize binders with all exhibits introduced in depositions.	3.20	
05/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
05/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Compile and organize hot documents.	6.50	
05/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of hot technical talent class certification documents.	5.50	
05/03/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/03/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft portions of brief.	1.00	
05/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further document review, analysis, and consultations with experts.	5.00	
05/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email team re salary range production; email James Dallal re Sheryl Sandberg deposition/discovery report; email B. Glackin re case management conference statement; email B. Glackin re Sheryl Sandberg declaration; review Adobe sharing analysis and email B. Glackin re same; email team re Sheryl Sandberg declaration; email with D. Harvey re Google - Facebook.	2.00	
05/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Confer with K. Dermody and telephone conference with John Dwyer re Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	0.30	
05/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Joseph Saveri re Saveri firm cost fund contribution; telephone conference with Lisa LeeBove re whereabouts of Joseph Saveri; manage vendor invoices.	0.40	
05/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re draft report.	0.90	
05/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt; correspondence to same re contention interrogatory responses; memorandum to team re same.	0.70	
05/03/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Transfer electronic data via file-transfer protocol server.	2.00	
05/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft class certification brief.	8.20	
05/03/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
05/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of excerpts of deposition transcripts for an important case filing.	6.70	
05/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Create and assign protocol for additional defendant-specific searches and for technical talent class certification.	2.50	
05/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review of hot technical talent class certification documents and additional searches for technical talent class certification keywords.	7.00	
05/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Highlight, tab and analyze hot documents.	2.50	
05/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification brief.	9.50	
05/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Judge Koh's orders, current class certification brief, Amgen and court applications of the decision for certification filing.	3.50	
05/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re Sheryl Sandberg, Kevin Hallock.	0.20	
05/06/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	8.00	
05/06/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct further legal research and revise brief.	2.70	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research regarding case management issues.	1.70	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with	0.30	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with paralegals, other support staff and D. Harvey regarding preparation of case filing.	1.50	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with team re class certification assignments.	1.20	
05/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel and further documents regarding salary ranges, and forward to expert.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with team re brief and Kevin Hallock, and emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; emails with L. Cisneros re Pixar documents; email with B. Glackin re Sheryl Sandberg; edit brief; email L. Cisneros re Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	7.00	
05/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull excerpts for D. Harvey for supplemental motion for class certification exhibits. Confer with L. Cisneros and I. Merrifield for filling this week.	3.20	
05/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence with Robert Mittelstaedt; memorandum to team re draft case management conference statement.	0.70	
05/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re brief reports; telephone conference with Mittelstaedt.	0.90	
05/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft Ed Leamer work; team call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm; telephone conference with email with K. Dermody re Hallock; office conference with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock draft; review Kevin Hallock draft; send correspondence to Robert Mittelstaedt; telephone conference with Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg and email K. Dermody re same.	6.10	
05/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification motion.	14.20	
05/06/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
05/06/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of deposition transcripts for an important case filing.	6.70	
05/06/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document search and review additional searches for technical talent class certification.	3.00	
05/06/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review, highlight and analyze deposition exhibits for technical class certification hot documents.	7.00	
05/07/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	10.50	
05/07/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	11.00	
05/07/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation of supplemental motion for class certification.	8.00	
05/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit Kevin Hallock report and emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; review revised Sheryl Sandberg declaration and email team re same; email with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re brief; email with team re case management conference statement; edit case management conference statement; email Lisa Leebove re salary range analysis.	6.50	
05/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize current list of deposition excerpts and prepare new copies per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize recent Apple production and update production log. Research bates numbers for certain Google salary documents for D. Harvey. Update electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive.	3.50	
05/07/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review discovery status report.	0.10	
05/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft correspondence to Joseph Saveri, Linda Nussbaum and Eric Cramer. Draft and revise case management conference statement; telephone conferences with Robert Mittelstaedt re case management conference statement. Review Kevin Hallock report; review/revise class certification brief; review Ed Leamer report; correspondence with Joseph Saveri Law Firm.	9.40	
05/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification brief.	12.50	
05/07/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.80	
05/07/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with preparation of deposition transcript excerpts for a major filing.	6.40	
05/07/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Download video files, and set-up file sharing folders for reviewers.	1.50	
05/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo and prepare exhibit folder index on technical class certification hot documents from deposition exhibits.	2.50	
05/07/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review, highlight and analyze deposition exhibits for technical class certification hot documents.	9.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/08/13	AMBROSIO, JOHN	Document review.	9.00	
05/08/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with supplemental motion for class certification and related documents.	12.00	
05/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with L. Cisneros re Pixar and Intuit documents; emails with team re Case Management Conference positions and edit same; email James Dallal re Adobe analysis; edit Kevin Hallock report and emails to team re same; review Ed Leamer draft and email B. Glackin re same; email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Sheryl Sandberg declaration and review same.	5.00	
05/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather exhibits in preparation for the supplemental motion for class certification. Fact check the expert report of Professor Kevin Hallock.	3.80	
05/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft insert re Ed Leamer analysis in brief.	1.40	
05/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Multiple telephone calls re case management conference statement; review/revise case management conference statement; supervise filing of same; telephone conferences with Ed Leamer and Dermody re same.	5.50	
05/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re case management conference statement; memorandum re same.	0.40	
05/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft supplemental class certification brief.	13.20	
05/08/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	7.30	
05/08/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	11.20	
05/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Confirm expert report cites within class period; outline and index findings; edit spreadsheet.	7.50	
05/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Prepare technical class certification issues hot document compilation.	1.50	
05/09/13	CALSON, KRISTIN	Document review.	8.00	
05/09/13	CARNAM, TODD	Cite check brief for D. Harvey.	1.20	
05/09/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Continue assisting with supplemental motion for class certification and related documents.	12.00	
05/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Sheryl Sandberg declaration and email Beatriz Mejia re same; review/edit Kevin Hallock and telephone conferences with Kevin Hallock re report; many emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re brief and experts; email Lisa Leebove re Ed Leamer analysis and salary ranges; email Lee Rubin re mediator; email Joe Saveri re same.	6.50	
05/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check, pull excerpts, pull exhibits, create declarations, and prepare documents for the supplemental motion for class certification.	13.00	
05/09/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit supplemental class certification brief.	1.10	
05/09/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research mediators.	0.70	
05/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on class certification filing.	11.10	
05/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and edit class certification brief.	17.00	
05/09/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review expert report for comment on same.	1.40	
05/09/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	4.30	
05/09/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	14.20	
05/09/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Create supplemental production binder and organize case notes.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Confirm expert report documents within class period; outline and index findings; edit spreadsheet.	3.00	
05/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Prepare technical class certification issues hot document compilation.	5.00	
05/10/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Gather job titles of deponents from depositions to enter into declaration per L. Cisneros.	2.10	
05/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize supplemental motion for class certification and supporting papers and execute filing.	15.00	
05/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Kevin Hallock report; review and email B. Glackin re Ed Leamer; edit brief and email team re same; many emails to Lisa Leebove, James Dallal re discovery report; emails with Joe Saveri, Lee Rubin re mediator.	15.00	
05/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Help with supplemental motion for class certification filing. Fact check the brief and pull documents for D. Harvey. Create declarations, and organize exhibits.	11.00	
05/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Class certification filings.	9.90	
05/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research class certification brief, expert reports, supporting documents, conference with team re same, supervising filing and service re same.	16.20	
05/10/13	LEGGETT, JAMES	Document review.	6.80	
05/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	10.20	
05/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification brief for filing.	9.30	
05/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review, organize and compile remaining electronic and hard copy class certification hot documents.	7.00	
05/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for additional class certification hot documents.	1.00	
05/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re filing.	0.10	
05/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assist with High Tech Cold Calling filing.	5.00	
05/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	3.80	
05/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg.	0.10	
05/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize service copies for the court for supplemental motion for class certification filing.	9.50	
05/12/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	9.30	
05/12/13	MONROE, DREW	Help T. Desouza and I. Merrifield organize and prepare declarations and corresponding exhibits for L. Cisneros and D. Harvey.	8.00	
05/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg.	0.10	
05/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize High Tech filing with D. Harvey. Check all for redacted documents. Ensure service. Work with Litigation Support to send exhibits to defense counsel for D. Harvey.	4.00	
05/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm.	0.50	
05/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise filing of courtesy copies to Court; supervise preparation of backup expert work and service of same; conference with opposing counsel re service of exhibits, manage service of same; prepare for case management conference.	5.40	
05/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of deposition excerpts and exhibits for filling of supplemental motion for class certification.	4.60	
05/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
05/13/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Produce password protected document production via third-party data transfer service.	0.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/13/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Organize and edit class certification hot document notes.	0.50	
05/14/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Telephone call with K., Dermody regarding Sheryl Sandberg statement.	0.20	
05/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with team re experts; meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re discovery and case management conference, experts; telephone conference with Beatriz Mejia, L. Cisneros re Sheryl Sandberg; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re expert deposition.	2.50	
05/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Coordinate sending back up materials for expert reports to defense counsel. Verify all back up materials for D. Harvey. Work with to obtain all the back up reports.	1.50	
05/14/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, B. Glackin and L. Cisneros re class certification submission and discovery responses (partial attendance).	0.40	
05/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting.	1.10	
05/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with	0.40	
05/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for case management conference; conference with experts; conference with team re next steps and strategy.	3.50	
05/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel round trip to San Jose for case management conference and attend same; conference with David Rotman's office re mediation and email team re same; conference with Lee Rubin re mediation; calls with Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg declaration.	5.80	
05/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Discount management for D. Harvey.	1.00	
05/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare disk for D. Harvey.	0.50	
05/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Case management conference with Judge Koh, travel.	4.90	
05/15/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Review transcript exhibit database.	5.00	
05/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend case management conference, travel re same, preparation re same.	6.50	
05/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.10	
05/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend case management conference, travel.	4.90	
05/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg and review media re same; emails with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer report; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re mediators and email Lee Rubin re same; email team re mediation; calls with Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg declaration; emails with Beatriz Mejia re interview; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re mediators.	2.50	
05/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull all deposition cites from all motions citing to deposition excerpts of Edward Leamer and Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin.	2.10	
05/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research deposition videos of Edward Leamer and Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin.	0.50	
05/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update production log and verify entries.	1.20	
05/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Upload correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.80	_
05/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft errata letter re Ed Leamer report.	0.50	
05/16/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Link transcripts and exhibits in transcript database.	6.00	
05/16/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review recent order.	0.90	
05/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation and filing of discovery status report and revisions to same.	2.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with L. Cisneros, defense counsel re draft discovery report; email with James Dallal re Pixar production; communicate with Sheryl Sandberg counsel re executed declaration and discovery report; edit draft discovery report; conference with LCHB team re mediators and email Joe Saveri re same; email Bruce Simon re mediator experiences.	2.50	
05/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with and Ed Leamer; telephone conference with K. Dermody.	0.70	
05/17/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Link exhibits to transcripts in transcript database.	6.00	
05/17/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.80	
05/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer deposition; email Joel Rosenblatt re status; review Munoz case and email team re same; conference with Joe Saveri re mediators and email Lee Rubin re same; email Kevin Hallock re deposition.	2.00	
05/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive.	1.50	
05/20/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist T. Desouza with document management.	2.00	
05/20/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with recent case correspondence.	2.80	
05/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Lee Rubin re mediator and email team re same; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re deposition and email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
05/21/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with recent case correspondence.	2.10	
05/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls with Lee Rubin re mediators; edit filing re mediators and confer with L. Cisneros re same; calls to Joseph Saveri Law Firm re mediators; email Karen Kukla re scheduling; emails with B. Glackin re Kevin Hallock deposition.	2.50	
05/22/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis and attention to collection of further deposition transcripts and deposition exhibits for use with transcript database.	3.00	
05/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.40	
05/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review and respond to email; review docket filings and case management order for follow up assignment.	0.60	
05/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re interrogatory no. 25; email Karen Kukla re mediation scheduling; email Lisa Leebove re filings; review Kevin Hallock materials for deposition.	3.00	
05/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Organize filings on the internal computer drive in the correct way and email them out to the group.	2.50	
05/23/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.40	
05/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Read supplemental class certification brief for follow-up.	0.60	
05/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise interrogatory response and emails with team re same; edit discovery report and emails with team re same; review material re agreement dates.	3.00	
05/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create new production binder per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.60	
05/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create proof of service for D. Harvey.	0.60	
05/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update and send service list to A. Shaver.	0.50	
05/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise discovery responses, research same, conference with team re same; review and revise discovery statement, supervise filing of same, conference with co-counsel and opposing counsel re same.	6.50	
05/24/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.00	
05/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email service list to David Rotman; emails with team re interrogatory 15.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Case management. Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re discovery, expert depositions, summary judgment motions, mediation, case management; confer with A. Shaver re interrogatory response; emails with D. Harvey re discovery report.	1.50	
05/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Condense Edward Leamer and Kevin Murphy deposition cites in Word document per B. Glackin's instructions.	2.00	
05/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room with transcripts from D. Harvey and create new deposition binder for Sergey Brin per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize Intel's deposition folder on the internal computer drive.	0.90	
05/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare expert depositions of Edward Leamer and Kevin Murphy for K. Dermody.	0.20	
05/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
05/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re case planning; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re same; telephone conference with Eric Cramer re expert preparation.	2.10	
05/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team and co-counsel re discovery responses, dispositive motions, and expert depositions, research and prepare for same.	2.50	
05/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update binders of agreements and contracts between defendants.	0.90	
05/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.30	
05/28/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re interrogatory 16 exhibit review project.	0.20	
05/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Lisa Leebove re Kevin Hallock deposition; email team re mediation.	0.30	
05/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Medline and email team re same.	0.50	
05/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list of all the exhibits used in Google, Intuit, and Pixar depositions for D. Harvey and A. Shaver. Verify exhibits.	1.90	
05/29/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Frank Hinman; correspondence to J. Saveri re cost fund; errata letter to Frank Hinman re Ed Leamer.	1.50	
05/29/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Link deposition exhibits to transcripts in TextMap transcript database.	3.00	
05/29/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
05/29/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with K. Dermody re statement; review exhibits for response to interrogatory 16.	3.10	
05/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email A. Shaver, D. Harvey re mediation preparation.	0.20	
05/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update contracts binder in the war room. Create additional binder of the deposition of Patrick Flynn for the war room with transcript and exhibits together.	1.00	
05/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notice to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
05/30/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.80	
05/30/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review exhibits for response to interrogatory 16; emails with James Dallal re same.	1.00	
05/31/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email team re mediation; call with Kevin Hallock re deposition.	0.50	
05/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Talk with court reporter about a master exhibit list for A. Shaver. Update the master exhibit list for A. Shaver by examining all exhibits from the internal computer drive and transcripts. Verify everything is accounted for. Talk with A. Grant about TextMap database re search for exhibits.	3.90	
05/31/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with David Kiernan.	0.20	
05/31/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Completion of transcript database linking. in TextMap transcript database.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/31/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update binders of agreements and contracts between defendants.	2.00	
05/31/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.30	
06/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Consult with K. Dermody regarding preparation for expert testimony.	0.40	
06/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Kevin Hallock re deposition preparation; email team re same; confer with L. Cisneros re Hallock; email T. Desouza re Kevin Hallock preparation assignment; email R. Mukherji re research on Kevin Hallock publications; review Kevin Hallock curriculum vitae for follow-up.	2.00	
06/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition.	6.00	
06/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review pay treatise by Kevin Hallock for deposition.	2.70	
06/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create CD of deposition excerpts for B. Glackin.	0.60	
06/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create Kevin Hallock deposition preparation materials for D. Harvey. Research expert report of Kevin Hallock and create binders for K. Dermody. Go through footnotes and pull everything not given to K. Dermody for D. Harvey. Create binders of the brief, expert reports, and exhibits for D. Harvey. Create binders for scholarly articles used by Kevin Hallock in his expert report for D. Harvey.	5.00	
06/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer and Kevin Murphy deposition transcripts to prepare excerpts for Ed Leamer deposition.	3.30	
06/03/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Prepare for and assist with CaseMap access for reviewers.	2.00	
06/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with expert re deposition issues; prepare mediation materials; conference with plaintiffs re expert depositions.	4.50	
06/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist T. Desouza with the assembly of binders of important case documents for mediator.	6.70	
06/03/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Import synchronized deposition videos and create designation clips.	2.30	
06/03/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain economic literature for K. Dermody.	0.50	
06/03/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Call with D. Harvey re articles; collect Kevin Hallock articles; call with Mark Fichtner re interrogatory 16 responses; review Stacy Abrams article.	2.30	
06/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition.	5.00	
06/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize binders for Kevin Hallock deposition preparation. Create indices for scholarly articles and give to D. Harvey and L. Cisneros. Finalize binder with multiple Excel and PDF files. Produce documents to the mediator per D. Harvey's instructions.	2.80	
06/04/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer and Kevin Murphy deposition transcripts to prepare excerpts for Ed Leamer deposition; review Kevin Hallock report to prepare mock examination.	4.30	
06/04/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Assist with the creation of deposition transcript videos.	4.00	
06/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise supplemental interrogatory responses; review materials for expert deposition.	2.50	
06/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist T. Desouza with the assembly of binders of important case documents for mediator.	5.20	
06/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
06/04/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Create designation clips and export as a freestanding video file.	2.50	
06/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Kevin Hallock articles and provide notes to K. Dermody regarding article and pay book.	5.00	
06/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review pay book by Kevin Hallock.	2.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition and meet with Kevin Hallock re same.	9.50	
06/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Call Paul Schreiber to work on errata sheet for D. Harvey. Ensure all corrections were made and document was signed.	1.50	
06/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Go over list of exhibits for all seven defendants and determine parties present in each exhibit for A. Shaver.	3.50	
06/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare several documents for D. Harvey for deposition preparation with Kevin Hallock.	0.30	
06/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Kevin Hallock report; draft mock examination; conduct mock examination of Kevin Hallock to prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition.	4.10	
06/05/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Assist with the electronic delivery of electronic discovery via file-transfer protocol transfer.	3.00	
06/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Kevin Hallock re deposition, research issues re same.	8.70	
06/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist T. Desouza with the assembly of binders of important case documents for mediator.	5.10	
06/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
06/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review exhibits re agreements for interrogatory response; emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same.	2.50	
06/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for and meet with Kevin Hallock re deposition; confer with D. Harvey re same; review interrogatory 16 responses; call to Lee Rubin re mediation.	9.00	
06/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on exhibit chart for interrogatory response for A. Shaver. Enter exhibits re which defendants collaborated, then go through chart and confirm bates numbering.	2.60	
06/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Ed Leamer for deposition; review draft response to interrogatory number 16; office conference with A. Shaver re same.	6.00	
06/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Kevin Hallock and team re deposition, research same and prepare for same; research and revise discovery responses; conference with defendants' counsel re deposition errata and other discovery issues.	9.50	
06/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare full list of deposition exhibits for interrogatory responses; finalize interrogatory response text.	2.80	
06/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for deposition; meetings with Kevin Hallock re same; defend deposition; meet with Kevin Hallock and D. Harvey re deposition.	11.50	
06/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize boxes for mediator, finalize cover letter, and confirm service for D. Harvey.	0.60	
06/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish Excel chart for A. Shaver: check against all bates referenced documents and highlight. Create list of all duplicate exhibits across multiple deponents.	2.40	
06/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Provide documents for K. Dermody and D. Harvey.	0.80	
06/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise response to interrogatory number 16.	0.60	
06/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with deposition defense of Prof. Kevin Hallock, conference with team re same.	11.20	
06/07/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise response to interrogatory 16; emails with team re same; review deposition exhibit list from T. Desouza for same.	2.70	
06/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Karen Kukla re mediation; draft memo to LCHB team re Kevin Hallock deposition; email team re plaintiff attendance at mediation.	1.00	
06/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with Ed Leamer, D. Harvey re deposition; meeting with Ed Leamer and Eric Cramer re deposition; meeting with B. Glackin and Joe Saveri re case management; email with D. Harvey re mediation; confer with B. Glackin re case management, Ed Leamer deposition.	2.50	
06/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Professor Ed Leamer for deposition; meeting with Joseph Saveri and K. Dermody re case management.	5.80	
06/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Prof. Ed Leamer and team re deposition.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re ; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Ed Leamer deposition; review Kevin Hallock rough deposition transcript.	2.00	
06/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull Judge Koh order for A. Shaver.	0.20	
06/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend deposition of Prof. Ed Leamer.	9.50	
06/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist at deposition of Edward Leamer, prepare for same, conference with team re same; email re same.	10.10	
06/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	2.10	
06/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email J. Fanucchi re expert bills; meeting with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re assignments, reply brief, mediation; call to Joe Saveri re case management (with B. Glackin and D. Harvey); emails with Kevin Hallock re case; emails with D. Harvey re	2.50	
06/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binders in the war room for D. Harvey.	0.40	
06/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents for D. Harvey for mediation.	0.60	
06/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare excel chart for B. Glackin to circulate to High Tech team.	0.20	
06/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
06/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvev re deposition of Ed Leamer; meeting with Lisa Leebove re case management; meeting with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re	3.60	
06/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team and co-counsel re ; research and draft mediation brief.	3.50	
06/12/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
06/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re mediation/clients; telephone conference with re same; review David Rotman letter and email D. Harvey re ; review data re ; review data re	1.50	
06/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm binders for war room per D. Harvey's instructions: create indices.	2.00	
06/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize internal computer drive per B. Glackin's instructions.	0.30	
06/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research dates for D. Harvey for entry of the Department of Justice to investigate defendants as well as dates of stipulations to enter final judgment.	0.20	
06/13/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Transcript database review. Analysis of transcript database items.	1.00	
06/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research expert damages analysis, conference with K. Dermody, consulting economists re same; review and research interrogatory responses and impact on damages calculations.	4.50	
06/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make additional copies of supplemental class certification brief and all associated documents.	5.10	
06/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room for D. Harvey.	1.00	
06/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify contents for the declaration of L. Cisneros binders with exhibits for war room for D. Harvey.	1.30	
06/14/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Organize supplemental class certification brief and all associated documents for mediation experts.	1.80	
06/14/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.30	
06/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email B. Glackin re verification; facilitate mediation logistics for Mark Fichtner.	0.20	
06/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email ; email D. Harvey re mediation brief.	0.20	
06/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email emails to B. Glackin and D. Harvey re mediation brief and damages work.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft mediation brief, email with K. Dermody re same.	9.20	
06/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Participate in team call, emails re same.	0.70	
06/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin re interrogatory 16; email with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer re deposition; team call re status; call with Joe Saveri re Intel.	1.30	
06/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.20	
06/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
06/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team conference call.	0.50	
06/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise mediation statement.	2.50	
06/17/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
06/17/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with LCHB team, Joseph Saveri Law Firm; create and send and pharmaceutical class case; emails re expert work.	1.30	
06/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; email ; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; email ; edit mediation brief and emails to D. Harvey re same and supporting documents.	3.00	
06/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft mediation brief.	0.50	
06/18/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Meet with B. Glackin regarding research for case.	0.50	
06/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.60	
06/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize mediation statement and confer with D. Harvey re same; calls with Joe Saveri re Kevin Hallock deposition transcript with instructions re reading same; telephone conference with	3.00	
06/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research case for D. Harvey.	0.10	
06/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Confer with K. Dermody re mediation; draft, revise, and serve mediation statement.	3.50	
06/19/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain statistic texts for B. Glackin.	0.40	
06/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Call and email plaintiffs re team emails with K. Dermody re Intel settlement position.	0.30	
06/20/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Email plaintiffs re	0.10	
06/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review slides from Apple trial for application/impact here.	0.30	
06/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re videographer; telephone conference with	0.40	
06/21/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Confer with K. Dermody and manage cost fund; review incoming correspondence; telephone conference with K. Dermody re	1.00	
06/21/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.80	
06/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re opposition and Kathryn Shaw report.	0.30	
06/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' opposition and telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros, A. Shaver, James Dallal re same and reply outline.	1.50	
06/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re class certification briefing.	0.40	
06/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Read opposition brief; conference call with team re same; follow up re same.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with research regarding expert Kathryn Shaw.	1.00	
06/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Class certification reply management. Read Kevin Murphy report and exhibits; review opposition brief and make detailed notes for reply; review Kathryn Shaw cites; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re depositions; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove re reply brief; emails with L. Cisneros re Kathryn Shaw expert history; email with A. Shaver re Kathryn Shaw articles; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re reply assignments; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re status; research re Kathryn Shaw background.	6.00	
06/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders with defendants' opposition to supplemental motion for class certification per D. Harvey's instructions.	3.50	
06/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	1.00	
06/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with opposing counsel and experts re class certification opposition, research and draft reply brief.	7.50	
06/24/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare and assemble binders of defendants' reply to the supplemental motion for class certification.	6.70	
06/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with D. Harvey re reply brief; emails with K. Dermody re Kathryn Shaw reports; call and email plaintiffs re	0.60	
06/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with research regarding expert Kathryn Shaw.	2.00	
06/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to D. Harvey's query to assist with mediation.	0.30	
06/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Kathryn Shaw report for call with Kevin Hallock and telephone conference with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, and Kevin Hallock re Kathryn Shaw; email with D. Harvey re mediation preparation; email with B. Glackin re mediation statement; email David Kiernan re deposition; email Joe Saveri re staffing.	2.00	
06/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assemble binders with defendants' opposition to class certification.	1.00	
06/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Compare sources used in Kathryn Shaw report v. sources used in Kevin Hallock report for D. Harvey.	0.80	
06/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate 30-40 academic articles for A. Shaver.	0.80	
06/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, and Dr. Kevin Hallock re expert analysis; supervise receipt of backup data, conference with consultants re same; prepare for mediation.	4.20	
06/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare and assemble binders and related materials of defendants' reply to the supplemental motion for class certification	2.10	
06/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
06/25/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain other expert reports filed by Kathryn Shaw, for L. Cisneros.	0.80	
06/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research Kathryn Shaw articles and assign same to L. Cisneros and D. Harvey; conference call with Kevin Hallock, K. Dermody and D. Harvey; confer with T. Desouza re serving verifications; call with Mark Fichtner re	3.00	
06/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with research regarding expert Kathryn Shaw.	2.50	
06/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research regarding statistical modeling.	2.00	
06/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend mediation; conference with clients re emails with team re reply follow-ups.	8.50	
06/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Compare Kathryn Shaw and Kevin Hallock report documents and create a list in Word for D. Harvey.	1.70	
06/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find certain cases for B. Glackin for mediation.	0.20	
06/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare proof of service and serve verifications on defendants per A. Shaver's instructions.	1.10	
06/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mediation.	8.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend mediation, conference with team and named plaintiffs re same; research and draft reply outline in support of class certification.	14.80	
06/26/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research economic issues and write memo in preparation for Kevin Murphy deposition.	3.00	
06/26/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
06/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Dr. Kathryn Shaw articles for K. Dermody; serve verifications for interrogatories.	2.50	
06/27/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, co-counsel and experts.	1.00	
06/27/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey regarding reply brief.	0.30	
06/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver, D. Harvey re Kathryn Shaw preparation; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Kevin Murphy; email with Kevin Hallock re Kathryn Shaw deposition; email B. Glackin re reply.	1.00	
06/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create deposition notices for Kevin Murphy and Kathryn Shaw as well as a proof of service. Work with Kramm Court Reporting to schedule a court reporter and videographer per B. Glackin's instructions.	1.20	
06/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish chart per D. Harvey's edits comparing Kevin Hallock and Kathryn Shaw reports.	1.80	
06/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate academic articles for A. Shaver.	0.30	
06/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all briefing, expert reports, declarations, and exhibits to be sent to Peter Barile per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.70	
06/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive and update binders with the documents.	0.20	
06/27/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Analysis of electronic discovery production. Prepare and transfer electronic discovery production through uploading to file transfer protocol server.	3.00	
06/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise reply outline in support of class certification, conference with team and co-counsel re same; research and draft brief re same.	7.50	
06/27/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Conference call with expert and legal team re economic research.	1.30	
06/27/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research economic issues and write memo in preparation for Kevin Murphy deposition.	5.00	
06/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
06/27/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Upload documents to online file sharing site to be sent to experts.	1.50	
06/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with research regarding expert Kathryn Shaw.	3.00	
06/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend team call re reply brief; email re same.	1.20	
06/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kathryn Shaw deposition; emails with team re mediation; review/respond to Kevin Hallock emails re Kathryn Shaw preparation; telephone conference with team re mediation; telephone conference with team re mediation; telephone call re assignments and reply brief.	8.50	
06/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate all Kathryn Shaw publications pulled by librarians for L. Cisneros.	0.40	
06/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare certain documents for L. Cisneros.	0.20	
06/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Produce supplemental class certification filings per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
06/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents for K. Dermody from the expert report of Kathryn Shaw and Kevin Hallock.	2.50	
06/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research docket and expert report for B. Glackin for expert work in another case.	0.60	
06/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research reply brief re class certification, conference with team and experts re same.	7.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/28/13	JUDGE, LEAH	Research related to proving impact for purposes of class certification per D. Harvey.	3.30	
06/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Organize deposition exhibits cited in the Kathryn Shaw report for K. Dermody.	3.10	
06/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.30	
06/28/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain various texts, for N. Menard economic review.	0.60	
06/28/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles and publications by Kathryn Shaw, for A. Shaver.	2.00	
06/28/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call re reply brief.	1.00	
06/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Kevin Hallock re report; prepare for Kathryn Shaw deposition.	6.00	
06/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of class certification.	9.20	
06/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Kevin Murphy deposition preparation.	6.70	
06/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of class certification; prepare for Dr. Kathryn Shaw deposition.	11.50	
06/30/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Dr. Kathryn Shaw articles for K. Dermody.	1.50	
07/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review of Kathryn Shaw articles and provide memorandum and notes to K. Dermody.	8.00	
07/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kathryn Shaw deposition; read articles and review documents; organize exhibits; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re report and draft rebuttal; confer with D. Harvey re Hallock deposition corrections; telephone conference with and email team re same.	12.00	
07/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Coordinate work for deposition preparation for K. Dermody and B. Glackin.	1.00	
07/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents for the internal computer drive.	1.00	
07/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	8.20	
07/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief; prepare for Dr. Kathryn Shaw deposition.	8.50	
07/01/13	JUDGE, LEAH	Research required evidentiary proof of common impact for class certification purposes, per D. Harvey.	4.50	
07/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of exhibits for the deposition of Kathryn Shaw.	4.10	
07/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
07/01/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain articles by Robert Slavin, for B. Glackin.	0.20	
07/01/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Finish reviewing Kathryn Shaw articles and conference with T. Desouza to provide to K. Dermody; review deposition testimony for excerpts on use of salary ranges and create memo on same for K. Dermody.	6.00	
07/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Analyze, highlight and organize internal equity documents.	3.50	
07/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft supplemental internal equity memo.	0.50	
07/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates to D. Harvey.	0.10	
07/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey to discuss findings.	0.10	
07/01/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for and review additional internal equity documents.	3.80	
07/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with organizing exhibits for Kathryn Shaw deposition.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kathryn Shaw deposition and draft outline re same; read Kathryn Shaw articles; review deposition exhibits; emails with Lisa Leebove, L. Cisneros, A. Shaver re salary range analysis.	16.00	
07/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deposition preparation for D. Harvey. Create exhibits, index, and organize everything.	2.00	
07/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on chart for D. Harvey using opposition class certification brief and Edward Leamer deposition transcript.	1.00	
07/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on deposition exhibit chart for K. Dermody for Kathryn Shaw deposition.	3.10	
07/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy.	6.80	
07/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief; prepare for Dr. Kathryn Shaw deposition.	11.50	
07/02/13	JUDGE, LEAH	Research required evidentiary proof of common impact for class certification purposes, for D. Harvey.	6.80	
07/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of documents for the deposition of Kathryn Shaw.	9.90	
07/02/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate scholarly articles for B. Glackin.	0.20	
07/02/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review designations of witnesses for Kathrvn Shaw deposition; help identify exhibits of Kathryn Shaw articles for same; review K. Dermody emails on pull deposition exhibits on list of salary ranges.	2.30	
07/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Calls with D. Harvey to discuss search results.	0.20	
07/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Design searches for and review additional internal equity documents.	7.00	
07/02/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email updates and hot documents to D. Harvey.	0.80	
07/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further assistance for Kathryn Shaw deposition.	2.00	
07/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for/take Kathryn Shaw deposition: confer with D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team re same; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same, email (email) confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same, email (email) confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team re same; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team re same; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team re same; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team re same; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; draft memo to team r	9.50	
07/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare for the deposition of Kevin Murphy for B. Glackin. Put together a binder, make copies, create index/labels, and organize everything on the internal computer drive. Scan in selected pages from books.	4.30	
07/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on chart for D. Harvey that lists side by side cites of Edward Leamer in the opposition brief with his deposition testimony.	2.00	
07/03/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read B. Glackin's Kevin Murphy deposition outline for comment on same.	0.30	
07/03/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Kevin Murphy; office conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re Kathryn Shaw deposition.	6.70	
07/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with Dr. Kathryn Shaw deposition, prepare re same, conference with K. Dermody and team re same, research same, draft summary re same; research salary range information and economic analysis.	13.50	
07/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist with the preparation of documents for the deposition of Kevin Murphy.	6.70	
07/03/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research Kathryn Shaw articles for use in deposition; pull helpful evidence for K. Dermody; review same from I. Merrifield; review K. Dermody's summary of Kathryn Shaw deposition.	1.90	
07/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Compile, review, highlight and organize compensation structure documents.	5.60	
07/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo on compensation structure implementation.	1.00	
07/03/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Email electronic copies and deliver hard copies of memo, documents and updates to D. Harvey and A. Shaver.	0.30	
07/04/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review correspondence from K. Dermody regarding	0.20	
07/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with team re kevin Murphy deposition outline and comment on same.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist on reply brief in support of supplemental motion for class certification; emails with K. Dermody re Intuit and Pixar pay ranges.	8.00	
07/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with D. Harvey re Kevin Murphy deposition; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re reply brief; multiple emails with L. Cisneros re Pixar and Intuit; review inserts to brief.	2.50	
07/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Kevin Murphy.	7.30	
07/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Assist with Dr. Kevin Murphy deposition; research and draft reply brief, conference with team re same.	11.50	
07/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Make chart for D. Harvey comparing citations of expert witness deposition testimony.	6.30	
07/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo on compensation decisions; email results and PDF files re same to D. Harvey.	2.50	
07/05/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search for, review and organize documents on compensation decision.	5.50	
07/06/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist on reply brief in support of supplemental motion for class certification.	8.00	
07/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Kathryn Shaw deposition transcript and draft memo re same; emails with team re certification reply; review/edit draft reply brief; team call re reply brief; email emai	8.50	
07/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re reply brief and expert reports; review drafts of same; telephone calls with Josh Davis and Joseph Saveri.	2.50	
07/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief, conference with team re same.	10.50	
07/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull evidence for reply brief; conference call with all attorneys re reply brief and expert reports.	2.90	
07/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Emily Henn, Joe Saveri re report and email comments re same; email D. Harvey and A. Shaver re plaintiff update; email Lisa Leebove re Kathryn Shaw follow up.	5.50	
07/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief, email with K. Dermody re plaintiffs.	9.50	
07/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Draft memo to team re Ed Leamer; telephone conference with Pixar, Joe Saveri re Joe Saveri re same; memo to LCHB re Leamer; email Emily Henn re same; review Joshua Davis redline and memo re Ed Leamer report and email team re same; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri Law Firm, LCHB re Ed Leamer; email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg declaration filing; telephone conference with LCHB, Joseph Saveri Law Firm, Ed Leamer, re report; telephone conference with Emily Henn re	6.00	
07/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a chart for D. Harvey that lists all the expert work of Kevin Murphy with a column about class certification and what side Kevin Murphy was on. Examine Kevin Murphy's expert report to obtain a list off all prior work for the past four years. Research if the report was about class certification and what side Kevin Murphy represented.	5.50	
07/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various documents from the docket per B. Glackin's request.	0.30	
07/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Kevin Murphy deposition transcript; team calls with/about experts; draft reply brief.	9.10	
07/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief.	10.50	
07/08/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.70	
07/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Locate evidence for reply brief; emails with D. Harvey re same.	5.00	
07/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo on compensation structure implementation.	0.50	
07/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails and calls relating to compensation structure implementation.	0.20	
07/08/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search and review defendants' deposition transcripts for testimony on preemptive compensation increases.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review notes re Joseph Saveri re same; email Emily Henn re review draft reply brief and emails with LCHB team re same; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri, review draft reply brief and emails with LCHB team re same; telephone conference with LCHB, Joseph Saveri Law Firm re assignments; email Karen Kukla re David Rotman Hallock re call.	4.00	
07/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm quality of audio deposition recordings of video depositions for D. Harvey. Check to see if certain video deposition disks were with Records Department.	0.50	
07/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm transcripts to Records Department.	0.10	
07/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to create chart for D. Harvey listing Kevin Murphy's prior work. Research dockets.	4.50	
07/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Produce depositions to Peter Barile per D. Harvey's request via Egnyte.	0.20	
07/09/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Kevin Murphy section of brief; read Kevin Murphy transcript; read draft Ed Leamer report.	0.80	
07/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply brief.	6.90	
07/09/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with analysis of database.	1.50	
07/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief, confer with K. Dermody re same; email with K. Dermody re plaintiffs.	11.20	
07/09/13	JUDGE, LEAH	Research the Bazemore case and cases where classes are certified when regression analysis includes job title for D. Harvey.	2.00	
07/09/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Review and prepare documents associated with the reply brief for class certification.	4.10	
07/09/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
07/09/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey and Dan Stover, Mike Devine re email citation to Lisa Leebove re same.	2.20	
07/09/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Uploaded documents to file sharing site to be viewed by experts.	1.50	
07/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo on compensation structure implementation; emails, calls and meeting with D. Harvey relating to above project.	1.50	
07/09/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search and review defendants' deposition transcripts for testimony on preemptive compensation increases.	6.50	
07/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Pixar, Joseph Saveri re Judge Koh re same; call with Joseph Saveri re Pixar; review comment on edits to brief; emails with team re Ed Leamer report and telephone conference with Ed Leamer and team re same; review Kevin Hallock deposition and telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re same; edit errata per Kevin Hallock and email re same; review notice issues; emails re salary range analyses.	9.50	
07/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull exhibits for supplemental reply brief for class certification for A. Shaver.	4.10	
07/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Start a draft of an errata for Kevin Hallock per D. Harvey's instructions and provide to K. Dermody.	0.30	
07/10/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit reply brief.	0.80	
07/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft brief; draft questions for Ed Leamer report; confer with K. Dermody re with Frank Hinman.	8.60	
07/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply brief.	11.50	
07/10/13	JUDGE, LEAH	Research the Bazemore case and cases where classes are certified when regression analysis that includes job title for D. Harvey.	6.00	
07/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Review and prepare documents associated with the reply brief for class certification.	5.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/10/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Assign paralegal help for filing; emails with T. Desouza re exhibits; confer with J. Zaul re evidence support; pull cites for brief.	1.70	
07/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft memo on compensation structure implementation; emails and calls with D. Harvey relating to above project.	1.30	
07/10/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search and review defendants' deposition transcripts for testimony on preemptive compensation increases.	6.70	
07/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Ed Leamer report and conferences with B. Glackin re same: edit reply brief and conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same: calls with Pixar. Joseph Saveri re and edit same; email : emails with Joseph Saveri re	10.50	
07/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on reply class certification filing for A. Shaver and D. Harvey. Pull all exhibits and fact check the brief. Help create declaration and table of abbreviations.	5.50	
07/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise brief and expert report; confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re same.	11.40	
07/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise reply brief; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same.	2.20	
07/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise reply brief; confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re same.	12.20	
07/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare documents associated with reply class certification brief.	8.10	
07/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	0.60	
07/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare A. Shaver declaration and motion to file under seal and proposed order; pull evidentiary citations; revise citations in brief; create filing map; work with paralegals on brief exhibits; emails with Lisa Leebove re Intel evidence; review evidence from J. Zaul.	8.50	
07/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Draft email memo on centralized decision-making for stock equity and bonus compensation; emails relating to aforementioned project.	0.50	
07/11/13	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Search and review for centralized decision-making for stock equity and bonus compensation.	3.50	
07/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review and edit revised brief and multiple conferences with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re same; review/edit Ed Leamer report and confer with B. Glackin re same; review/edit administrative sealing motion and documents and confer with A. Shaver re same; review Joseph Saveri re Pixar: telephone conference with Pixar. Joseph Saveri re Kukla re David Rotman update.	11.00	
07/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and file reply papers re class certification, multiple conferences with K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	9.20	
07/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft, finalize, and file reply brief and supporting papers, multiple conferences with K. Dermody, B. Glackin.	12.50	
07/12/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare documents associated with reply class certification brief.	7.80	
07/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Finalize all papers re supplemental reply brief for e-filing, confer with K. Dermody re finalizing.	10.50	
07/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re supplemental class certification reply.	0.70	
07/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email David Rotman re; review court order re settlement and email LCHB team re same and follow-up.	1.00	
07/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Dr. Ed Leamer deposition transcript, supervise service filing.	4.50	
07/14/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare and send chambers copies for reply class certification brief.	5.00	
07/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email/call re press inquiries and claims administrators re settlement; edit draft statement re settlement talks and email with team re same; emails with Joseph Saveri Law Firm re Pixar approval.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copy for D. Harvey. Create labels, box covers, fasten exhibits, and confirm service. Save all electronic court filing notices to include with filing.	3.50	
07/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise service filing; review and research settlement issues, and status reports re same.	3.50	
07/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Prepare chambers copies for reply class certification brief.	4.90	
07/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft two statements on mediation status and settlement impact; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same.	0.90	
07/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email George Riley re meet and confer; emails with team re same; email with D. Harvey re press calls and return same.	0.50	
07/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Produce expert backup materials to Christina Brown for D. Harvey.	0.40	
07/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Address errata issues re Ed Leamer deposition. Organize case materials, correspondence.	1.00	
07/16/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.40	
07/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Team conference call and meeting regarding strategy.	1.00	
07/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting with co-counsel re preliminary approval; updates to court.	1.10	
07/17/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Litigation Support: Review discovery database.	1.00	
07/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend group call; research summary judgment issues; research class settlement issues.	2.50	
07/17/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with attorney team re mediation status report; conference call with co-counsel re same; conference with D. Harvey, K. Dermody, B. Glackin and L. Cisneros re next steps in case.	2.00	
07/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Liquid Crystal Display settlements history re approval strategy here.	0.20	
07/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review recent decision interpreting Comcast and Amgen.	0.20	
07/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re ; email claims administrators re settlement.	0.30	
07/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential affirmative summary judgment motion, conference with potential expert re same.	2.50	
07/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.00	
07/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Finalize and circulate joint statement on mediation talks.	0.30	
07/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare timeline re In Re TFT-LCD partial settlements for application/strategy here.	3.00	
07/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls with , Joseph Saveri re ; confer with D. Harvey re ; confer with A. Shaver re edits to joint mediation filing; emails with defendants and team re meet and confer.	2.50	
07/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize supplemental reply class certification filing for the war room.	0.60	
07/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
07/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
07/19/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' objections to plaintiffs' reply brief motion for comment on same.	0.20	
07/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research impact of settlement on litigation class.	1.50	
07/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails with defendants re joint report on mediation; finalize filing on same; review emails from K. Dermody re review defendants' filings on administrative motion to file under seal; conference with Lisa Leebove re claims and notice process; conference with Rust Consulting re claims bid; confer with K. Dermody re settlement process questions.	4.10	
07/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to LCHB team re defendants' sur-reply filing.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, George Riley re meet and confer; email with sealing issues.	1.00	
07/22/13	CARNAM, TODD	Locate case law related to settlement approvals being granted in the absence of class certification.	2.20	
07/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and provide feedback on status statement.	0.70	
07/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Team call.	1.00	
07/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials re and telephone conference with Joseph Saveri and telephone conference with A. Shaver and reclaims process and email with A. Shaver re same; review defendants' objections to evidence and email with team re same; review draft letter to defendants re same; email with A. Shaver re Pixar claims process; respond to emails re claims issues.	3.00	
07/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Check whether a certain passage from the deposition of Kevin Murphy was redacted for B. Glackin with defendants' motion to seal.	0.40	
07/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare supplemental reply brief filing for class certification for attorney.	0.60	
07/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review deposition filings re sealing issue.	0.60	
07/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Transcript order form per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.30	
07/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to internal computer drive.	1.50	
07/22/13	GUPTA, NEHA	Research on class certification standards for settlement v. litigation for D. Harvey.	6.00	
07/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft administrative motion re improper sur-reply; research pending class settlement issues.	9.50	
07/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Correspond with claims administrators re estimates for notice and claims processing; emails with K. Dermody re related questions: read Joe Saveri draft report to court and emails with LCHB attorney team re same; conference call with K. Dermody and re class allocation formula; email Lisa Leebove re same.	2.30	
07/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit administrative motion, declaration and <u>order: emails/calls</u> with <u>D. Harvev re same: confer with D. Harvev re settlement prief: telephone conference with David Rotman re call to gradient conference with David Rotman re c</u>	2.00	
07/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check brief for D. Harvey, pull and prepare exhibits, and prepare chambers copy for the Judge per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.30	
07/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise administrative motion; telephone conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.90	
07/23/13	GUPTA, NEHA	Research on class certification standards for settlement v. litigation for D. Harvey.	4.00	
07/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Confer with K. Dermody, research, draft, revise, and file administrative motion re sur-reply; research settlement issues, call with K. Dermody and revise statement responding to Court's order.	11.50	
07/23/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.80	
07/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit motion to strike and review team emails on same; review Friday's filings for follow-up.	0.50	
07/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls with Doe Saveri to fill in re same; emails to team re same; meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvev re brief for court; meet and confer with defendants re same; review re potential re potential ; review materials re	5.00	
07/24/13	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation Support: Call from D. Harvey re database; calls to vendor re database format.	1.00	
07/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with K. Dermody, defendants re briefs.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise statement re impact of settlement; attend in-person meet and confer re same; research summary judgment strategy.	6.50	
07/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Many edits to Pixar settlement documents; edits to plaintiffs' brief re settlement impact and email with team re same; emails and call with Emily Henn re settlement filings; review defendants' revised brief and email team re same; telephone conferences with Robert Van Nest re certification schedule; call with Joe Saveri re Robert Van Nest rejoining case; email LCHB team re new Google counsel; email with Robert Van Nest re defendants' request for schedule change; many calls with and emails updating Joe Saveri; revise	9.50	
07/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research document and page totals for all defendant and plaintiff productions for D. Harvey. Research deposition count.	1.50	
07/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review brief re impact of settlements on class certification.	0.40	
07/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement and summary judgment issues, revise draft brief re same.	8.50	
07/25/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Expert witness preparation; research background of Einer Elhauge.	0.80	
07/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Lucas/Pixar settlement documents; telephone conference with multiple calls with and Joe Saveri re and edit ; many edits to court filing re meaning of settlement; calls with Robert Mittelstaedt re settlement class and telephone conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re class definition; email Reuters re question on court filing; confer with S. Fineman re settlements; emails with LCHB team re claims issues.	8.50	
07/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review errata of Kevin Murphy to compare to cites in the brief for D. Harvey.	1.20	
07/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise brief re impact of class certification motion of settlement; telephone conference with K. Dermody and Joseph Saveri reference.	0.50	
07/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise statement re impact of settlements on pending motion for class certification, conference with team re same, conference with opposing counsel re same, supervising filing of same; conference with consulting economists re damages analysis; research damages analysis re settlement discussions.	12.20	
07/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Heffler Claims Group re claims administration; email with follow-up questions.	0.70	
07/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit and calls with re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re ame; emails with Intuit, team re executed memorandum of understanding; many emails with LCHB re email with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re described and calls with the same research and calls with the	4.00	
07/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise Lucas/Pixar settlement agreement and emails with team re same; calls with Joe Saveri and position and email LCHB team re same.	6.00	
07/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on motion for preliminary approval.	0.30	
07/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with David Kiernan re Intuit settlement and multiple emails with LCHB, Lisa Leebove re settlement issues; telephone conference with process of the pro	2.50	
07/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Contact court reporter and fill out form for transcript.	0.30	
07/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate the deposition transcript of Eric Schmidt and request court reporter attach errata per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.50	
07/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
07/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with named plaintiffs re ; research settlement issues; review draft	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/29/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference calls with Boston Financial and Epiq re claims administration bids; emails with Rust Consulting and Gilardi re details of same.	1.70	
07/30/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend litigation team meeting.	1.00	
07/30/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Correspond with K. Dermody and D. Harvey regarding motion for preliminary approval.	0.40	
07/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with David Kiernan re Judge Koh letter; email Emily Henn re status; respond to Reuters re Intuit; emails with team re settlement documents and edits to same; team meeting.	1.50	
07/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive and deposition transcripts to Records.	0.30	
07/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft joint case management statement; research settlement issues, conference with named plaintiffs re revise and file letter to Court re settlement with Intuit; team meeting.	4.50	
07/31/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft motion for preliminary approval and submit to K. Dermody for review.	2.50	
07/31/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails re settlement issues, claims process; telephone conference with David Rotman re same; email with D. Harvey re Case Management Conference edits.	1.00	
07/31/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research claims damages analyses on named plaintiffs' damages; research and revise case management statement and conferwith K. Dermody re same, conference with team and opposing counsel re same; conference with named plaintiffs re	6.50	
08/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with finalizing case management statement.	0.40	
08/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re settlement issues and Case Management Conference statement.	0.50	
08/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather details for class certification hearing next week and assist D. Harvey re same.	0.20	
08/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research document production statistics for D. Harvey.	0.70	
08/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential plans of allocation, conference with certification hearing, prepare for same; review and research case management statement, conference with settling and non-settling defendants re same, supervise filing re same.	7.50	
08/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised Pixar agreement and email LCHB team re same; emails with B. Glackin re class certification hearing; telephone conference with conference with team re agreements.	4.00	
08/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents for class certification hearing for D. Harvey.	1.70	
08/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
08/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference call with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re LucasFilm/Pixar settlement.	0.80	
08/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re draft settlement agreement, research same; conference with procedures.	2.50	
08/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise Pixar settlement agreement and emails with team re same.	3.00	
08/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise plan of allocation and email team re same; edit revised Pixar agreement.	2.00	
08/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders for class certification hearing for D. Harvey. Create two binders with requested documents for B. Glackin.	2.70	
08/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for class certification.	1.50	
08/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Researched proposed plans of allocation and preliminary approval; prepare for class certification hearing.	5.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
08/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with D. Harvey re plan of allocation; review team emails on hearing and expert preparation.	0.50	
08/05/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
08/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Kevin Hallock re pre-hearing meeting; review allocation charts for settlements and email team re same; email with Emily Henn re Pixar settlement.	1.00	
08/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents for the class certification hearing for D. Harvey.	3.00	
08/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull various documents for B. Glackin for class certification hearing.	0.50	
08/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for class certification argument, confer with D. Harvey re same.	8.30	
08/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research proposed settlement allocation plans, conference with certification hearing, conference with B. Glackin re same.	5.50	
08/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Gilardi re claims process bid.	0.30	
08/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re preparation, review Kevin Hallock material in preparation for meeting with Kevin Hallock; attend hearing preparation session with B. Glackin, Ed Leamer, D. Harvey, Joe Saveri; confer with B. Glackin re lines of inquiry/moot court.	4.50	
08/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binders and documents for the class certification hearing for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	4.00	
08/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting to prepare for class certification argument; confer with K. Dermody re mock questions.	3.00	
08/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for class certification hearing, conference with experts and team re same.	6.50	
08/07/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.00	
08/08/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend hearing on class certification; travel.	5.00	
08/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for, travel to and from, and attend class certification hearing; meetings with B. Glackin, conference with experts, LCHB team re same; meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros re same; meeting with Kevin Hallock re hearing/prepare Kevin Hallock for same.	14.00	
08/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Attend class certification hearing in San Jose, make sure all boxes were transported to and from venue, and organize transport, and set up for attorneys.	6.00	
08/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and argue motion for class certification.	10.20	
08/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for class certification hearing with experts, travel and attend same, conference with team and plaintiffs re same.	10.50	
08/08/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Analyze contents of production hard drive and update index.	0.70	
08/08/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to and from San Jose; attend hearing on class certification, meetings re same.	7.50	
08/08/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	0.70	
08/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re defendants' related case filing and review the District Court Circuit opinion; email Emily Henn re agreement.	1.00	
08/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management.	1.00	
08/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Draft email to Pixar and Intuit re plan of allocation issues and email team re same; email Emily Henn re documentation.	0.80	
08/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise Intuit settlement agreement and update Joe Saveri re same; email team re assignments; email	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit settlement agreement for Intuit and update Joe Saveri re same; meeting with media, D. Harvey re status.	1.50	
08/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull order on motion to seal and defendants' redacted version of plaintiffs' brief for supplemental motion for class certification for D. Harvey.	0.40	
08/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Organize claims administration proposals; review same; emails with Lisa Leebove re same.	0.60	
08/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Pixar settlement agreement and memorandum, and draft Intuit settlement agreement.	2.50	
08/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Ed Leamer analysis re plan of allocation and email Joe Saveri re same; email with D. Harvey re media.	0.30	
08/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Contact court reporter for copy of class certification hearing transcript for L. Cisneros.	0.20	
08/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search for a Google production containing specific emails for D. Harvey.	0.50	
08/13/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Document database assistance.	0.80	
08/13/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review claims administrator bids and draft review sheet.	0.50	
08/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Kevin Hallock re work; review Ed Leamer analysis re plan of allocation formulas; telephone conference with Pixar, Intuit, Joe Saveri re settlements; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; review Duane Reade case and email team re same.	4.50	
08/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find Google production with specific emails for D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with re allocation plans, research same.	0.80	
08/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Lisa Leebove re estimates; email administrators re same.	0.30	
08/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review summary judgment order in Titanium case for planning in High Tech Cold Calling; confer with B. Glackin re settlement documents.	1.00	
08/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management for D. Harvey.	0.50	
08/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents off the docket for D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/15/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Freight Rail Antitrust case decision for application here.	1.00	
08/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re settlement papers.	0.20	
08/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend call with K. Dermody re settlement work.	1.00	
08/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Research preliminary approval motions in other antitrust litigation and report back to K. Dermody.	2.00	
08/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit Pixar preliminary approval order and email team re same; emails with Emily Henn re status; email with team call re claims and settlement status.	2.50	
08/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Process transcript request.	0.10	
08/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit notice and email team re same; meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re merits expert work and strateov: email email Joe Saveri re	2.50	
08/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re merits experts.	0.40	
08/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review class certification hearing transcript; conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re expert strategy and schedule; correspond with potential expert re summary judgment issues, research same.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re telephone conference with Joe Saveri and telephone conference with Joe Saveri a	2.50	
08/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize internal computer drive.	0.30	
08/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review settlement papers; correspond with potential merits expert, research strategy re same.	2.50	
08/20/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Boston Financial bid and email team re same.	0.20	
08/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Pixar and Intuit re agreements; call with Joe Saveri re same: confer with D. Harvev re Ed Leamer data questions; email LCHB team re Shaver re claims bids.	2.00	
08/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Produce document database to co-counsel.	0.30	
08/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research prejudgment interest issues; research merits strategy and correspond with potential expert.	1.20	
08/21/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review claims bids and email summary of same to team recommending Boston Financial, Rust, or Heffler based on bids.	0.30	
08/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials regarding class titles and titles excluded from class: email Emilv Henn and David Kiernan re class list and call to David Kiernan re same; telephone conference with circulate; review Sears decision and emails with team re same; email Joseph Saveri Law Firm re open issues.	3.00	
08/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Seventh Circuit decision in the Sears case for application here.	0.30	
08/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
08/22/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Import Relativity database from external hard drive.	0.50	
08/22/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm re claims bids; email claims administrators.	0.50	
08/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to D. Harvey information re expert Einer Elhauge; telephone conference with Emily Henn re David Kiernan re same; emails with team re merits reports; email D. Harvey re motions to seal and email team re same; email Adobe/Apple/Google/Intel re mediation scheduling and email B. Glackin/D. Harvey re same; emails with D. Harvey re stipulation on supplemental authority; email Emily Henn/David Kiernan re	3.00	
08/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Email with K. Dermody and draft and file notice of supplemental authority, correspond with defense counsel re same; email with K. Dermody re potential merits expert; review under seal filings in response to Court's message.	2.50	
08/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research summary judgment and expert issues; correspond with potential merits expert.	2.50	
08/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research summary judgment issues; research advancement of litigation expenses, draft section of preliminary approval motion re same.	3.50	
08/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
08/27/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re litigation for D. Harvey review.	0.50	
08/28/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re merits and expert strategy, research same.	1.20	
08/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create errata for Ed Leamer deposition per D. Harvey.	0.80	
08/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and review recent supplemental authority re class certification, prepare and file notice re same, conference with opposing counsel re same; conference with opposing counsel re deposition corrections.	3.40	
09/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re expert work and settlement documents; emails with LCHB team re outstanding projects.	1.00	
09/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copies to send to San Jose District Court for D. Harvey.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
09/03/13	DUGAR, KIRTI	Litigation Support: Meet with E. Ocampo re converting database from Relativity to Concordance; call with Teris re missing metadata.	0.50	
09/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research summary judgment issues and related merits issues; confer with K. Dermody re experts; research potential merits experts and correspond re same.	3.50	
09/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit revised settlement documents: calls with Lisa Leebove, D. Harvev re settlement issues; edit Pixar settlement agreement: email with Joe Saveri re and update Joe Saveri re same; conference call with Joseph Saveri Law Firm and LCHB team re settlements.	4.50	
09/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research defendants' interrogatory responses, and create binder for D. Harvey. Locate the competitive impact statements from the Department of Justice for D. Harvey.	3.50	
09/04/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, Joseph Saveri and Lisa Leebove re settlement papers.	0.60	
09/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research summary judgment and merits expert issues; research potential experts and correspond with same; telephone call with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, co-counsel re settlement.	4.50	
09/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Taves re class certification order; review Intuit and Pixar edits to settlement documents and email Emily Henn and David Kiernan re same; confer with D. Harvey re experts.	1.50	
09/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research class certification order for mention of the case Wang v. Chinese Daily News for D. Harvey.	1.00	
09/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research merits strategy; correspond and conference with potential experts, conference with K. Dermody re same.	4.60	
09/05/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
09/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with team re Pixar/Intuit issues; telephone conference with Pixar read and Matthew Marx retainer; calls with Pixar and Intuit re settlement issues; review Matthew Marx background information.	3.50	
09/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room for D. Harvey. Document management.	1.00	
09/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re experts.	0.70	
09/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, conference with same; conference with co-counsel re merits strategy; research summary judgment and trial strategy.	7.30	
09/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review edits to notice and email Emily Henn re same.	0.40	
09/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents on the internal computer drive.	1.00	
09/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and conference with potential experts, draft summary re same; conference with team re merits strategy and potential experts; research merits issues.	4.40	
09/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Draft claim form and email team re same; review claim forms in other Northern District of California class cases; email ; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re expert work; edit notice and email team re same; email defendants re notice edits.	2.00	
09/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find and email D. Harvey and B. Glackin several documents per their request. Update files to the internal computer drive.	1.00	
09/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts, research same; research preliminary approval motion, revise same.	2.60	
09/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit and review claim form and email team re same and settlement documents.	0.80	
09/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binder with expert reports for D. Harvey.	0.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with potential experts, research merits strategy.	1.70	
09/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate retention agreement for Prof. Alan Manning for D. Harvey. Document management.	0.80	
09/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Calendar with all recent deadlines.	0.50	
09/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Matthew Marx and	1.80	6
09/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts, and conference with attorney team re same; research merits plan and expert responsibilities.	4.20	
09/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate all expert retention agreements for D. Harvey.	0.70	
09/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare errata of Edward Leamer per D. Harvey. Contact court reporter for errata.	2.70	
09/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts; research motion for preliminary approval, conference with co-counsel re same; draft and serve errata sheet for Dr. Ed Leamer deposition.	2.70	
09/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to defendants' Daubert motions.	9.60	
09/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with B. Glackin re merits experts; emails with and David Kiernan re received; review revised agreements and order and call with D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove and Joe Saveri re same; edit order and email Lisa Leebove re same; draft termination provision.	3.00	
09/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm preliminary approval assignment for D. Harvey.	0.40	
09/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize and update internal computer drive.	0.50	
09/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review invoices, cost fund information. Make proposal to co-counsel re cost fund contribution. Office conference with K. Dermody, E. Fastiff and S. Fineman re preliminary approval.	1.10	
09/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re experts.	0.30	
09/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and edit motion for preliminary approval; conference with settling defendants re outstanding issues: conference with K. Dermody, co-counsel re settlement issues and settlement documentation; correspond with clients re	5.50	
09/16/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Continue updating database.	5.00	
09/16/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Update Relativity database.	7.00	
09/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls/emails with Intuit/Pixar, D. Harvey re settlement edits; email declaration; review Joe Saveri declaration; calls with Lisa Leebove re settlement issues; email with D. Harvey re communications re settlements; telephone conference with settlement; telephone conference with settlement; confer with A. Shaver re job titles.	5.50	
09/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management.	0.50	
09/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate protective order for A. Shaver for expert.	0.30	
09/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various briefs and internal computer drive documents for D. Harvey.	1.60	
09/17/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Joseph Saveri's declaration in support of preliminary approval; emails to K. Dermody re same.	0.30	
09/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review notice forms; office conference with K. Dermody re same. telephone conference with experts. Team call re settlement documentation. Review declaration of K. Dermody and Joseph Saveri.	2.70	
09/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and edit motion for preliminary settlement approval; conference with clients re conference with settling defendants re outstanding issues.	9.70	
09/17/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody re job title issue for Pixar and Intuit; emails with re same.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple calls/emails with LCHB team re Intuit and Pixar agreement edits and related settlement edits; email David Kiernan/Emily Henn re outstanding issues; edit settlement documents; call with Emily Henn re settlement issues; call with D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove re open issues (0.30); review	6.00	
09/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Calculate and confirm the total number of depositions and total number of plaintiffs' supplemental interrogatory responses. Identify docket number where plaintiffs' declarations are mentioned.	1.40	
09/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Calculate numbers for A. Shaver for the upcoming filing on motion for preliminary approval.	0.80	
09/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find exhibits for D. Harvey for the declaration going with the motion for preliminary approval.	1.90	
09/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.70	
09/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft of preliminary approval brief; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.10	
09/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise papers re preliminary approval of settlements, conference with settling defendants re same, conference with co-counsel re same, research law re same.	7.10	
09/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with D. Harvey re job title issue for Pixar and Intuit; emails and conference call with send summary to K. Dermody; conference with Emily Henn and David Kiernan re same.	1.70	
09/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement approval filings for D. Harvey review.	0.10	
09/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case citations re settlement approval motions.	0.30	
09/19/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in preparing motion to seal, declaration and other materials for preliminary approval motion, and organizing plan for filing.	3.50	
09/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re sealing class title information; many emails with Pixar, Intuit re settlement issues; telephone conference with D. Harvey re settlement issues; telephone conference with Pixar. Intuit, p. D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove re settlement; edit Joe Saveri settlement declaration; email re jury consulting; review Lasen case and emails with team re supplemental authority.	4.00	
09/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on filing for motion for preliminary approval for D. Harvey and K. Dermody. Prepare exhibits.	7.00	
09/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Jeffrey A. Suhre class certification decision as possible supplemental authority.	1.40	
09/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and review documents re motion for preliminary approval; conference with co-counsel re motion for preliminary approval, conference with settling defendants re same.	14.50	
09/19/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with D. Harvey re job title exhibits; review emails from re same; edit motion to file under seal from L. Cisneros; edit motion to file statement of recent decision from James Dallal.	2.50	
09/20/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in preparing motion to seal, declaration and other materials for preliminary approval motion.	2.70	
09/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Many edits to settlement documents; calls with resettlement filing; calls with David Kiernan re	6.00	
09/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Check the declaration of Joseph Saveri for all exhibits. Prepare exhibits for other declarations. Revise the proof of service.	3.50	
09/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copies for Judge Koh for D. Harvey.	1.40	
09/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
09/20/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re Saveri firm cost fund contribution and expert work; telephone conference with James Dallal re same; memorandum to team re same.	1.30	
09/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise service of courtesy copies of supplemental authority; review and revise motion for preliminary approval and related documents, conference with co-counsel re same, conference with settling defendants re same.	14.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with finalizing filing motion for preliminary approval and related papers.	5.20	
09/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize Pixar and Intuit agreements and related documents: many calls/email with D. Harvey and David Kiernan; emails with David Kiernan and Emily Henn on filing; email related to the control of the co	6.50	
09/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer emails from D. Harvey regarding filing.	0.20	
09/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval and related documents, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with settling defendants re same, supervise filing of same.	4.20	
09/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with LCHB team re strategy.	0.10	
09/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare service copies for filing for D. Harvey.	7.00	
09/23/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding proposed order and proof of service.	0.30	
09/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review hearing transcript re summary judgment page limits and email with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Case Management Conference on page limits: email with team re Matthew Marx retainer; telephone conference with media re settlements; call to generate the conference with media resettlements; call to generate the conference with media resettlements.	1.50	
09/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare paper copies for filing for D. Harvey. Coordinate with messenger to deliver copies.	3.20	
09/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
09/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
09/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise paper filing of preliminary approval papers; research issues re upcoming case management conference, conference with team and co-counsel re same; research page limitation issue re potential motions for summary judgment; conference with experts and team.	7.20	
09/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare motion for leave to file notice of supplemental authority, consult with D. Harvey and K. Dermody, and communicate with Christina Brown.	0.80	
09/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Cathode Ray Tube's order; confer with LCHB team re supplemental authority; review draft for filing and emails with L. Cisneros and D. Harvey re contacting defendants; edit Case Management Conference statement and email D. Harvey re same; email John Keker re data meet and confer.	2.50	
09/24/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Compile a list of expert reports and dates of each for D. Harvey. Compile a list off the most recent defendant interrogatory responses regarding collaborations for D. Harvey.	1.00	
09/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review case management conference statement; review Cathode Ray Tube's order; memorandum re same; office conference with D. Harvey re case management conference statement and summary judgment briefing.	1.90	
09/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with experts, prepare materials for same; draft and revise case management conference statement; organize merits materials; research summary judgment issues.	6.30	
09/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Northern District of California order on legal standard and emails with team re same; meet with Thomas Sidener from Boston Financial re claims bid.	0.50	
09/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist D. Harvey in with named plaintiffs.	0.40	
09/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up with T. Desouza regarding tasks to complete re filing of administrative motion.	0.20	
09/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Case Management Conference statement edits and confer with D. Harvey re same; email with Lisa Leebove re data case law; email with D. Harvey re plaintiff status communications; email with Emily Henn re Class Action Fairness Act notice.	1.50	
09/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copies for D. Harvey, confirm messenger to San Jose District Court, and confirm delivery.	1.10	
09/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.90	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise retention agreement for Dr. Matthew Marx, conference with co-counsel re same: confer with K. Dermody re case management; research and draft case management statement; conference with clients re and non-settling defendants re case management statement.	8.20	
09/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit draft Case Management Conference statement and emails with D. Harvey re same; emails with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx expert retainer; telephone conference with Emily Henn re Pixar data and email team re same; review data orders for Case Management Conference statement and email D. Harvey re same.	2.50	
09/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate for D. Harvey case documents.	0.30	
09/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Negotiate with settling and non-settling defendants re case management statement, confer with K. Dermody re same; research same, revise same; conference with experts re merits reports, research facts re same.	10.20	
09/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Michael Devine documents; email B. Glackin re Matthew Marx retainer; telephone conference with Emily Henn re data production issues.	0.50	
09/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a binder with expert reports for D. Harvey for Prof. Alan Manning. Create a cover letter to go with the binder.	1.50	
09/27/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund.	0.40	
09/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Daniel Purcell re meet and confer on class data for notice.	0.10	
09/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Daniel Purcell re meet and confer; email with B. Glackin re Matthew Marx report.	0.30	
09/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review sealing order and email LCHB team re same; email with team re new settlement hearing; emails with team re	1.00	
09/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Dan Purcell, Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey re settlement data; emails re same.	0.30	
09/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders with motion for preliminary approval and statements of recent decision for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	1.80	
09/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re case management conference, preliminary approval hearing & progress an expert reports. Manage cost fund; memorandum to Joseph Saveri re same.	0.70	
09/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with client; retain and correspond with expert re potential collaboration arguments, research same; conference re class certification and preliminary approval motion; meet and confer re data.	3.50	
10/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work with T. Desouza on compliance with the court's order regarding defendants' renewed motions to seal.	1.00	
10/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re experts and vendors.	0.30	
10/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on getting documents ready to comply with order on motion to seal for L. Cisneros. Gather documents and make redactions.	4.00	
10/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Matt Marx; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri; telephone conference with Rosalie Kramm; Manage cost fund and email with K. Dermody re same.	1.70	
10/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with expert re collaboration issues, draft summary re same; research expert issues and circulate summaries of draft assignments.	4.20	
10/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for motion to seal compliance.	1.00	
10/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to prepare documents for compliance with motion to seal, prepare for L. Cisneros to review.	2.50	
10/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
10/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft Dr. Alan Manning report, team call re Dr. Manning, review/revise outline of Dr. Matthew Marx report, team call with Dr. Edward Leamer.	3.80	
10/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re merit reports, research same, draft summary of issues and circulate same to co-counsel.	4.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/03/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review documents for compliance with motion to seal.	0.50	
10/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock report.	0.10	
10/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
10/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts, research and draft summaries re same; research summary judgment issues; review Dr. Alan Manning's book re monopsony power; email with K. Dermody re expert.	4.30	
10/04/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work with T. Desouza re filing and consult with Christina Brown.	1.50	
10/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Kevin Hallock report and meet with D. Harvey re report; telephone conference with D. Harvey and Kevin Hallock re merits report.	3.00	
10/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fix documents for compliance with order on motions to seal for L. Cisneros. Check redactions.	1.80	
10/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate interrogatory responses, answers to complaint, and disclosures for D. Harvey.	0.40	
10/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, Kevin Hallock re expert analysis and report; research merits issues for summary judgement; review discovery responses.	5.20	
10/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with D. Harvey regarding Monday's filing.	0.10	
10/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review filings re scheduling orders and email team re same; call to Daniel Purcell re mediator; read Kevin Hallock revised report and telephone conference with D. Harvey re same.	2.50	
10/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Provide L. Cisneros multiple documents for filing redacted copies today.	0.10	
10/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research Dr. Kevin Hallock report, conference with K. Dermody, team re same; conference with Dr. Matthew Marx re report, research same; review court's orders re sealing motions, conference with L. Cisneros re same; supervise compliance with sealing orders.	6.60	
10/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with L. Cisneros re data production issues; edit Kevin Hallock report and email D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
10/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research briefs for class certification and experts reports and highlight any areas regarding "big bang," for D. Harvey. Pull all cites from these highlighted versions from Concordance and previous productions to send to Prof. Alan Manning.	5.10	
10/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review evidence regarding expert issues and questions; email with K. Dermody re Hallock report; conference with Matthew Marx; conference with B. Glackin re expert reports and strategy; review discovery responses and answers, draft summary re same.	4.70	
10/08/13	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Litigation Support: Assist database user with review access.	0.70	
10/08/13	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Provide support to users of Summation database.	2.00	
10/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock report; email team re ; email re same.	0.60	
10/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with E. Ocampo re document management per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.50	
10/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check the draft of Kevin Hallock's report per D. Harvey's instructions. Find deposition testimony that Lucasfilm used market data for salary comparisons.	2.00	
10/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish binder with additional documents for D. Harvey. Create index, and organize binder. Draft cover letter.	2.50	
10/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
10/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review draft Dr. Kevin Hallock report and email with K. Dermody re same; conference with T. Desouza re new document system; conference with Dr. Ed Leamer and team re report; research Intel documents re internal equity and other issues.	6.20	
10/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with re report; telephone conference with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock report; email Kevin Hallock re report.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices from the internal computer drive.	0.80	
10/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Dr. Kevin Hallock re report, conference with K. Dermody re same.	0.80	
10/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re	0.10	
10/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various documents for D. Harvey.	0.20	
10/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review facts and testimony re collaborations and knowledge of anti-solicit agreements by those engaged in collaboration; review interrogatory responses re collaborations.	7.20	
10/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to D. Harvey and Kevin Hallock re revised report and review same.	2.00	
10/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review comments from Intuit and Pixar and revise settlement documents: email Joe Saveri re same; edit Ed Leamer declaration and email with B. Glackin re same; email team redeclaration; emails with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock revisions and supporting documents.	3.50	
10/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re draft report and emails with D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
10/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer report and expert work; review Kevin Hallock report and edits same and emails with Kevin Hallock, D. Harvey re same.	5.50	
10/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Check Alan Manning documents for D. Harvey.	0.20	
10/14/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
10/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re experts.	0.50	
10/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; telephone conference with street, telephone conference with Joseph Saveri.	1.10	
10/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re Ed Leamer.	0.60	
10/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with B. Glackin, Ed Leamer and with Alan Manning re merits report, conference with attorney team re same; correspond with Matthew Marx re merits report; correspond with Alan Manning re merits report; review discovery responses.	2.50	
10/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review draft Case Management Conference statement and emails with team re same; confer with B. Glackin re case management and experts; email Kevin Hallock re report; edit insert to Kevin Hallock report; review Ed Leamer draft.	2.50	
10/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Coordinate with E. Ocampo re Concordance database. Produce database to James Dallal at Joseph Saveri Law Firm.	0.40	
10/15/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull all deposition cites in certain paragraphs for D. Harvey to verify date ranges.	1.20	
10/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review proposed supplemental case management filing, conference with co-counsel and defendants' counsel re same; review draft expert report; review discovery responses.	3.80	
10/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.50	
10/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Kevin Hallock revised report and supporting figures; confer with D. Harvey re same; emails with team re notice data from non-settling defendants and telephone conference with Justina Sessions, Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey re same; confer with B. Glackin re preliminary approval hearing; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re hearing strategy; prepare for preliminary approval hearing.	6.50	
10/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders for K. Dermody and D. Harvey in preparation for motion for preliminary approval hearing on Monday. Organize case law binder for K. Dermody, and motion for preliminary approval binder for both of them.	2.00	
10/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review defense draft case management conference submission.	0.60	
10/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft of Ed Leamer report; team call with and Ed Leamer re same.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with B. Glackin, Ed Leamer and team re expert analysis, research same; research and review documents re Kevin Hallock analysis; review discovery responses re Matthew Marx analysis; telephone conference with K. Dermody, Lisa Leebove, Justina Sessions re data.	4.40	
10/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review settlement certification standard where litigation is not certified; prepare for preliminary approval hearing; meeting with Joe Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re case; review/edit draft Alan Manning report and confer with B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with Justina Sessions, Lisa Leebove, D. Harvey re settlement data; email Kevin Hallock re report and review possible new exhibits to same; review Joseph Saveri Law Firm research for social security numbers; email team re new Intel counsel.	6.00	
10/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meeting with E. Ocampo on Concordance. Research Intel documents for D. Harvey that correspond to a certain deposition exhibit.	5.00	
10/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
10/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for preliminary approval hearing with K. Dermody and Joseph Saveri. Review/revise Alan Manning report draft, confer with K. Dermody re same.	3.10	
10/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, defendants re case management conference and pending motion for preliminary approval, research same; conference with co-counsel re preparing for Monday Case Management Conference and hearing; conference with Matthew Marx re expert analysis, research summary re same; review discovery responses and deposition testimony re collaboration issues.	8.20	
10/17/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Search and identify Concordance database documents.	2.00	
10/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for settlement hearing and Case Management Conference; review defendants' court filing and email re response to defendants' filing re data; confer with D. Harvey re response; research cases where class member data produced; review revised Kevin Hallock report and telephone conference with Kevin Hallock and D. Harvey re same; review/edit Matthew Marx report.	4.50	
10/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft response to non-settling defendants unauthorized filing; conference with experts re ongoing analysis; review discovery responses; confer with K. Dermody and Kevin Hallock re report.	8.40	
10/18/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate District Court case that certified a settlement class in Hydrogen Peroxide, for D. Harvey.	0.40	
10/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit revised response to defendants' filing re data; multiple revisions and review case law re same.	2.50	
10/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise response to defendants' unauthorized filing.	2.20	
10/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for settlement hearing; review class certification filings for possible Rule 23 discussions.	3.00	
10/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	File response to defendants' unauthorized filing.	0.70	
10/21/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Travel to and from, and attend preliminary approval hearing and case management conference.	5.00	
10/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for hearing; travel to same; attend same; meeting with D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re hearing and next steps.	9.50	
10/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders for D. Harvey and K. Dermody for hearing. Edit, print, and combine other documents for D. Harvey in preparation for hearing.	1.00	
10/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders with recent filing as chambers copy for Judge Koh per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.80	
10/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents from supplemental brief for class certification for B. Glackin and create two binders to send to experts, Alan Manning and Matthew Marx. Create cover letters.	2.70	
10/21/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Case management conference and preliminary approval hearing; prepare for same; travel to and from same.	8.80	
10/21/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend hearing re motion for preliminary approval and case management conference, travel re same, prepare for same and research relevant issues.	8.40	
10/21/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to and from San Jose for hearing; preliminary approval hearing.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	File transcript request.	0.10	
10/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare transcript request.	0.10	
10/22/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Research local rules to respond to query from B. Glackin.	0.20	
10/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Jacqueline Mottek re Heffler Claims Group declarants; edit settlement documents and email team re same; meeting with B. Glackin re notice.	3.00	
10/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binders of selected documents and send as PDFs to D. Harvey.	1.60	
10/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binder with documents regarding Google's compensation policy for Matthew Marx.	1.40	
10/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull cited documents from multiple briefs for D. Harvey. Locate documents for Prof. Matthew Marx and send via email for D. Harvey.	1.00	
10/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
10/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re experts, case management conference. Review Rule 26 case law re expert disclosures.	1.00	
10/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re class notice; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri.	0.80	
10/22/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Joseph Saveri's revisions to Alan Manning report.	0.90	
10/22/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re merits reports; review deposition testimony; review discovery responses; review collaboration contract documents, draft summary re same.	9.20	
10/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm records with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
10/23/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with revised settlement documents.	0.30	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assist D. Harvey re Alan Manning documents.	0.20	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Email B. Glackin a statement of recent decision filed by plaintiffs and find out the docket number of the order.	0.20	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find the job history of Deborah Conrad of Intel for D. Harvey.	0.30	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish scanning all contracts selected by D. Harvey from defendants' binders. Upload to the FileShare system and send to Prof. Matthew Marx for review.	1.60	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Go through Concordance database and tag documents.	0.30	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Look through all deposition transcripts and exhibits for certain documents for D. Harvey.	0.80	
10/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive and confirm date of completion of recent Case Management Conference transcript by court reporter.	0.20	
10/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft Ed Leamer report.	3.40	
10/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review evidence re claimed collaborations, confer with co-counsel re same; conference with experts re merits reports, conference with co-counsel re same; research discovery record re internal equity and pay for performance.	3.60	
10/23/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research re expert testimony rules re reasonable basis and confer with B. Glackin re same.	2.00	
10/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to K. Dermody's query regarding notice of appearance.	0.20	
10/24/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class certification decision.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials for Kevin Hallock; emails with Heffler Claims Group re filing; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re settlement issue; emails/calls with LCHB team re class certification order; email Kevin Hallock re order; edit and revise claim form, notice, order and emails with Pixar and Intuit re same (many rounds); draft notice re supplemental filing and confer with L. Cisneros re same; review escrow agreement and email Joe Saveri re same; edit Heffler declaration.	4.00	
10/24/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read class certification order for comment on same.	0.50	
10/24/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review draft escrow agreement and schedule for comment on same.	0.40	
10/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert reports (Alan Manning, et al.).	5.10	
10/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Skim class certification order; telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re same; circulate to experts.	1.10	
10/24/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research factual issues re expert reports; review expert reports, conference with experts; review revised preliminary approval filings.	4.60	
10/24/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research case law on expert report rules and write summary of same for B. Glackin; confer with B. Glackin re Alan Manning report.	1.90	
10/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize and e-file notice of filing revised settlement documents.	1.60	
10/25/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with D. Harvey and B. Glackin regarding Alan Manning report and weekend work.	0.30	
10/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with numerous media outlets re class certification order and review order; conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re certification order; emails with Kevin Hallock re order and merits report; emails with Pixar and Intuit re Heffler declaration; multiple edits to Heffler declaration and telephone conferences with Heffler re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re giving Heffler declaration to other defendants; email Heffler declaration to John Keker; review escrow materials and email Joe Saveri re same; email Mitchell re escrow; edit claim form and confer with L. Cisneros re same; email Lisa Leebove re notice; email David Rotman re edit Kevin Hallock report in light of certification order; email with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer report.	7.00	
10/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare expert reports for filing on Monday. Fact check multiple expert reports for D. Harvey and A. Shaver. Pull all documents into separate folders for review. Find multiple missing bates numbers for A. Shaver. Use Concordance to key word search for other documents.	6.00	
10/25/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Finish reading class certification order; review and edit Alan Manning report.	1.80	
10/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft expert reports; review documents cited by Ed Leamer; read class certification order; meeting with K. Dermody re order.	6.60	
10/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research draft expert reports, conference with experts and co-counsel re same; research discovery record; research and revise preliminary approval filings; meeting with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re class certification.	7.50	
10/25/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Search and tag documents from Concordance database.	1.00	
10/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Finalize Alan Manning report; pull cites for same; fix formatting; cite check same.	5.00	
10/25/13	SWENSON, YUN	Cite check Alan Manning expert report.	4.40	
10/25/13	SWENSON, YUN	Expert report editing project; meet with T. Desouza re same.	0.40	
10/26/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on expert reports.	9.00	
10/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit Kevin Hallock report and calls/email with Kevin Hallock; edit Matthew Marx report and review Omid Kordestani deposition re same; emails with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx deposition; edit Alan Manning report and emails with L. Cisneros and B. Glackin re edits; edit Ed Leamer report and emails with B. Glackin re same; respond to inquiries from class members re class certification order; email with David Rotman re	11.00	
10/26/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review draft expert reports, research facts re same, conference with team re same.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/26/13	SWENSON, YUN	Fact check Matthew Marx expert report.	2.00	
10/26/13	SWENSON, YUN	Locate and share exhibits with expert Alan Manning. Pull dockets and exhibits for L. Cisneros.	1.00	
10/27/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on expert reports.	13.00	
10/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize Kevin Hallock report (edit, cite check); email team re same; edit Matthew Marx, Alan Manning, Ed Leamer reports and emails with team re same; many emails to team re same.	7.00	
10/27/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert reports (Ed Leamer; Alan Manning).	10.80	
10/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research draft expert reports, conference with team re same.	4.50	
10/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of expert reports.	10.30	
10/27/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull cites for Alan Manning report; input cite changes to same.	2.00	
10/27/13	SWENSON, YUN	Fact check Matthew Marx expert report and assist in other expert report editing tasks; email to/from L. Cisneros re same.	5.00	
10/28/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on expert reports, follow-up on assignments from K. Dermody.	9.00	
10/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Matthew Marx report; review/edit Alan Manning report; review/edit Ed Leamer report; calls with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer analysis; calls with L. Cisneros re Matthew Marx and Alan Manning edits; respond to class member calls re case status; email court re Pennsylvania order and notice; confer with B. Glackin re expert management and emails with B. Glackin re expert deposition preparation.	4.00	
10/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create chambers copies of Friday's filing to go to Judge Koh for D. Harvey and L. Cisneros.	0.80	
10/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Handle intake of calls for people interested in joining the class action suit after the Judge certified the class per K. Dermody's instructions. Organize everyone in an Excel spreadsheet.	0.90	
10/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Produce final expert report of Kevin Hallock per K. Dermody's instructions.	0.30	
10/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Proofread copy of the expert report of Matthew Marx for L. Cisneros. Confirm materials relied upon list containing everything sent to Matthew Marx. Track down various citations and double check citations for L. Cisneros.	3.00	
10/28/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
10/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review/revision of expert reports; confer with K. Dermody re experts.	4.90	
10/28/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert reports; telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	5.30	
10/28/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of expert reports.	3.30	
10/28/13	SWENSON, YUN	Update emails in electronic file system.	0.50	
10/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Call with Christina Brown and follow up with D. Harvey re court request.	0.30	
10/29/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding expert reports, court clerk's requests, and notice of filing to comply with the Court's October 22, 2013 order.	0.80	
10/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with L. Cisneros re court request and Matthew Marx report; email B. Glackin re case management.	0.30	
10/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize internal computer drive with recent filings.	0.50	
10/29/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.70	
10/29/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.20	
10/30/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Intel's filing and provide analysis to team.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Kevin Hallock re deposition preparation; confer with B. Glackin re expert depositions; email LCHB team re expert assignments; emails with LCHB team re handling class member intakes/protocol; review court order re preliminary approval/notice/claim form and email LCHB team re same; review transcript re preliminary hearing for calendar.	2.50	
10/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create new spreadsheet with all recent contacts instructions. Add information per his instructions.	1.50	
10/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Request form for October 21, 2013 hearing transcript.	0.10	
10/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
10/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Coordinate expert deposition scheduling with experts and Tina Sessions.	0.90	
10/30/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re data issues; review order granting preliminary approval, research included job codes, conference with re same.	2.60	
10/30/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
10/31/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Merits experts and 23(f) management. Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re experts and 23(f) briefing; email David Kiernan re data for notice; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re assignments; email with D. Harvey, Lisa Leebove re data question; review David Rotman message and email team re issues.	3.50	
10/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research hearing transcripts re Judge Koh's preferences on Daubert briefs for B. Glackin.	1.70	
10/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research publications listed in the resume of Matthew Marx and find articles relied upon in his expert report. Organize these materials for D. Harvey.	2.70	
10/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
10/31/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert deposition planning meeting with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros.	0.80	
10/31/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organize scheduling of expert depositions and confer with K. Dermody.	0.20	
10/31/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with LCHB team re expert depositions and 23(f); conference with opposing counsel re data production for class and settlement notice; conference with experts re deposition preparation; confer with K. Dermody re 23(f) and expert work.	3.40	
10/31/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.50	
10/31/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with B. Glackin, K. Dermody and D. Harvey re expert depositions and 23(f).	0.80	
11/01/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review the court's edits to notice documents and circulate comparisons to team.	0.50	
11/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re David Rotman materials; review Joe Saveri email re notice and email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re issues with Joe Saveri's idea; email team re final approval schedule; emails with D. Harvey re Alan Manning deposition; confer with D. Harvey re report schedule and preparation; email with D. Harvey re job code data.	1.50	
11/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research media coverage and government testimony listed in the curriculum vitae of Matthew Marx for D. Harvey.	1.70	
11/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
11/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re deposition scheduling, conference with experts re same; review settlement and class notice procedures and deadlines; research and draft mediation brief; research and review Matthew Marx publications; confer with K. Dermody re expert reports, mediation.	3.20	
11/01/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.50	
11/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Kevin Hallock re deposition; email to D. Harvey re experts.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Karen Kukla re mediation; confer with D. Harvey re plaintiffs and mediation; review David Kiernan email and email Joe Saveri re escrow; email Joseph Saveri Law Firm re call to discuss assignments (0.10); meeting with D. Harvey re expert work and preparation; review Alan Manning information for preparation work.	2.00	
11/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents for the upcoming mediation per D. Harvey's instructions. Draft a cover letter for the mediator's office.	1.40	
11/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research articles mentioned in the resume of Matthew Marx for D. Harvey. Organize materials.	2.50	
11/04/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage invoices and cost fund.	0.20	
11/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft mediation brief; confer with K. Dermody re mediation; conference and correspond with experts re depositions; conference with opposing counsel re depositions; research Matthew Marx publications.	4.20	
11/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.90	
11/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri Law Firm, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re escrow and notice (0.20) and confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re expert preparation/depositions, Rule 23(f) petition and emails to B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same and preparation; review deposition notices for document requests.	2.00	
11/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize mediation materials for D. Harvey.	1.50	
11/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research names from the recent round of initial disclosures that defendants stated had relationships with other companies for pro-competitive reasons. Create a spreadsheet for D. Harvey with these names, job titles of the individuals, and the time period they worked.	2.50	
11/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search documents for D. Harvey.	0.30	
11/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list.	0.60	
11/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Alan Manning re depositions; deposition scheduling; telephone conference with Dan Purcell re attendance of Kevin Murphy. Legal research re banning disruptive non-parties from deposition; telephone conference with K. Dermody re same. Review Alan Manning publications. Office conference with J. Elias re 23(f) petition timing. Telephone conference with re data.	4.60	
11/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri, K. Dermody, D. Harvey re notice plan; office conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re same.	0.50	
11/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft mediation brief; correspond with plaintiffs re mediation; conference with Matthew Marx re deposition and preparation re same; conference with co-counsel re revisions to class notice; confer with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same.	4.80	
11/06/13	CARNAM, TODD	Research various articles for T. Desouza on expert deposition preparation assignment.	0.30	
11/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Edit initial disclosures spreadsheet for D. Harvey.	1.30	
11/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate for D. Harvey various documents in preparation for expert depositions next week.	0.30	
11/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize articles, bates documents, and deposition testimony from the expert report of Alan Manning for B. Glackin. Organize on the internal computer drive per B. Glackin's instructions.	4.60	
11/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organize for call with Joseph Saveri re expert deposition issues.	0.20	
11/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review "Monopsony in Motion" by Alan Manning for deposition preparation.	0.60	
11/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re deposition defenses; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.70	
11/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise mediation brief; research/preparation for Matthew Marx deposition; conference with B. Glackin re settlement history and deposition strategy; research jury instructions re joint and several liability, conference with J. Mayer-Cantu re same.	8.10	
11/06/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update/organize firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/06/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain articles cited in expert report of Alan Manning, for T. Desouza.	1.00	
11/06/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support: Search documents' identification and export images in PDF format.	0.50	
11/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with Citibank, David Kiernan, B. Glackin re settlement fund escrow issues; email Joe Saveri re same; telephone conference with David Rotman and Joe Saveri re mediation and call to Joe Saveri re same (0.50); emails to David Rotman's assistant re mediation issues; edit mediation brief; email with Citibank, Joe Saveri re Qualified Settlement Fund (QSF).	2.00	
11/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to pull deposition testimony from the expert report of Alan Manning. Organize the testimony into a folder on the internal computer drive. Organize all bates numbered documents for B. Glackin. Confirm all articles, bates numbered documents, and correct deposition testimony are in the internal computer drive.	3.50	
11/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find electronic court filing notices and organize on the internal computer drive.	0.40	
11/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and arrange signatures for escrow certificate.	0.80	
11/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for expert depositions and conference with D. Harvey re reports.	1.70	
11/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody and Joseph Saveri re Rule 23(f) petition response.	0.30	
11/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review expert reports, conference with B. Glackin re same; prepare for defense of expert witnesses, correspond with Matthew Marx re same; research rule of reason legal standards and potential arguments by defendants.	5.40	
11/07/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research in preparation for expert testimony.	0.10	
11/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review 23(f) petition and email B. Glackin re same; edit mediation brief; edit escrow agreement; email D. Harvey re class data production; email D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock deposition preparation.	4.00	
11/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Get multiple notice of appearance forms ready along with multiple service lists to be filed with the Ninth Circuit per D. Harvey's instructions. Format documents to match what defendants' filed.	2.60	
11/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Print various documents for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	0.30	
11/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Put together a complete set of defendants' appeal brief filing for D. Harvey. Break down documents on the internal computer drive to organize them. Create index.	2.50	
11/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review 23(f) petition and email K. Dermody re same; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re same; draft response to same. Finalize incumbency certificate. Review "Monopsony in Motion" for deposition preparation.	9.70	
11/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise mediation brief; conference with Matthew Marx re deposition; research expert admission standards; research potential defendant summary judgment arguments; review defendants' 23(f) petition, conference with B. Glackin re same, research same; email with K. Dermody re data, Hallock deposition.	3.80	
11/08/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.40	
11/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email David Kiernan re escrow.	0.10	
11/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Intuit re escrow agreement and edit same; review/edit revised mediation brief and emails with D. Harvey re same; email to D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Adobe job title issues; email Karen Kukla re mediation.	1.50	
11/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various documents for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	0.30	
11/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binders with all the documents cited in the expert report of Alan Manning for B. Glackin. Create index. Confirm exhibits.	2.80	
11/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare exhibits for mediation brief filing for D. Harvey.	1.30	
11/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft section of Rule 23(f) opposition; review mediation brief.	4.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise mediation brief and email K. Dermody re same, research same; prepare for expert depositions, review publications re same; correspond with opposing counsel re data pull for class notice, conference with team re same; research and draft answer to Rule 23(f) petition.	4.60	
11/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assemble documents for the supplemental excerpts of record.	2.50	
11/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.90	
11/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare monopsony treatise excerpts for B. Glackin review.	0.40	
11/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Alan Manning/Kevin Hallock depositions; emails with David Kiernan, Citibank re escrow agreement and revise same; telephone conference with Citibank re escrow; confer with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx deposition strategy; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re 23(f) draft; emails with J. Selbin and E. Cabraser re 23(f) and certification strategy issues; emails with D. Harvey re mediation brief finalizing.	6.00	
11/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list of everyone mentioned in interrogatory responses by defendants' but not included in the disclosure list put together for D. Harvey. Catalogue specific wording based off each interrogatory response in a spreadsheet.	3.00	
11/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather materials for B. Glackin for deposition preparation for Alan Manning.	0.30	
11/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize the files from the supplemental class certification filing and the reply class certification filing for D. Harvey.	1.70	
11/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update disclosures chart by defendant for D. Harvey. Sort interrogatory responses per D. Harvey's instructions.	2.00	
11/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum re deposition preparation of Ed Leamer and ; review response to same.	0.30	
11/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise 23(f) opposition; emails with K. Dermody re same.	1.10	
11/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Josh Davis re Rule 23(f) opposition.	0.40	
11/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to 23(f) petition; conference and retain appellate service vendor re answer to petition; research procedures re answer to petition; revise and serve mediation brief and email K. Dermody re same.	7.50	
11/12/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research related litigation for expert depositions.	1.20	
11/12/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Deposition preparation project for Hallock deposition.	0.50	
11/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with D. Harvey regarding Monday filing plans.	0.20	
11/13/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Research requirements for record excerpts, and review materials for inclusion.	3.50	
11/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Deposition preparation with Alan Manning, B. Glackin, Joe Saveri (partial) (4.5); prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition; prepare and deliver mock cross for Alan Manning; prepare mock cross for Matthew Marx; telephone conference with David Rotman re mediation and email LCHB team re same; review/edit Rule 23(f) opposition and email team re same; emails with J. Selbin, E. Cabraser re 23(f) issues and amici; emails with Joe Saveri re amici; email team re class notice; emails with D. Harvey re record excerpts; email Kevin Hallock re preparation; review Washer briefing for 23(f) response; email Citibank re escrow.	9.00	
11/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Alan Manning for deposition.	7.50	
11/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for deposition of Matthew Marx, draft outline re same, review publications, review report; conference with Alan Manning and prepare for deposition, conference with B. Glackin and Joe Saveri re same; conference with K. Dermody re Marx cross.	10.20	
11/13/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of supplemental excerpts of record.	5.70	
11/13/13	SELBIN, JONATHAN	Multiple emails with K. Dermody re Rule 23(f) appeal strategy.	0.40	
11/13/13	WU, LESLIE	Enter information from defendants' responses into an Excel spreadsheet.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/14/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Assist with Alan Manning deposition defense (partial attendance) and confer with B. Glackin and Alan Manning re testimony; do mock cross with Matthew Marx and discuss Matthew Marx deposition with Joe Saveri and D. Harvey (1.50); emails with LCHB team re chamber amicus brief; email chamber re consent to file.	10.50	
11/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend Alan Manning deposition.	10.90	
11/14/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Matthew Marx, K. Dermody, and co-counsel re deposition, review and research materials re same.	11.50	
11/14/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of supplemental excerpts of record.	6.20	
11/14/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Kevin Hallock materials to assist with preparation issue.	0.60	
11/15/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with response to defendants' petition for permission to appeal the class certification order; review Ninth Circuit filing requirements, and develop plan regarding supplemental record excerpts.	4.50	
11/15/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition; confer with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx deposition; multiple emails with LCHB team re Rule 23(f) opposition edits, record; email James Dallal confirming that lead counsel previously consented to amici's filing; emails with B. Glackin re Alan Manning; review amici brief re 23(f).	4.00	
11/15/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Defend Prof. Matthew Marx deposition, prepare for same, conference with team re same and circulate summary re same.	10.20	
11/15/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of supplemental excerpts of record.	5.60	
11/15/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Kevin Hallock materials for deposition preparation; review and edit 23(f) petition.	1.40	
11/15/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Rule 23 petitions for B. Glackin.	1.00	
11/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Edit response to petition for permission to appeal class certification order.	4.50	
11/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Kevin Hallock deposition and meeting with Kevin Hallock, A. Shaver, D. Harvey re same; edit Rule 23(f) opposition brief and emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	8.00	
11/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise draft 23(f) response.	4.90	
11/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Prof. Kevin Hallock and team re deposition, research and prepare for same; review and revise 23(f) answer.	8.20	
11/16/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and Kevin Hallock to prepare for deposition; prepare materials for same.	4.50	
11/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Research petition for permission to appeal, draft language for response and answer questions from B. Glackin and K. Dermody.	2.50	
11/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with Kevin Hallock, D. Harvey re deposition and defend same; email LCHB team re 23(f) and edit same; review Costco orders re related 23(f) issues; email LCHB team re Kevin Hallock deposition issues and Ed Leamer preparation.	11.00	
11/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Further review/revise 23(f) opposition.	0.60	
11/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Ed Leamer for deposition.	6.20	
11/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and assist with deposition defense of Dr. Kevin Hallock, conference with team re same; review and revise answer to 23(f) petition.	10.50	
11/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in finalizing response to petition for permission to appeal, supplemental record excerpts, motion to seal and other related materials, and oversee filing.	4.50	
11/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Modify supplemental records of excerpts, outline table of contents, and provide instructions to paralegal regarding review.	1.00	
11/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on plaintiffs' response to petition for permission to appeal class certification order - review record citations.	2.50	
11/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re 23(f) filing; confer with D. Harvey re mediation documents; email T. Desouza re mediation binder and preparation for mediation; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Ed Leamer deposition; email Kevin Hallock re deposition.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find and send D. Harvey various documents for appeal brief.	0.30	
11/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	For K. Dermody, organize materials for mediation. Prepare index.	1.00	
11/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend deposition of Ed Leamer.	9.20	
11/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review, revise, and supervise filing of 23(f) answer and related documents; attend deposition of Dr. Ed Leamer; conference with class representatives re mediation, correspond re same; confer with K. Dermody re mediation.	8.90	
11/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Assist L. Cisneros with the preparation of supplemental excerpts of record.	2.40	
11/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with plaintiffs and attend mediation; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re depositions and mediation; email Joe Saveri re; email Lisa Leebove re notice.	6.00	
11/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list with recent emails requesting to join the class.	0.40	
11/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive. Update deposition transcript with recent expert depositions from last week.	0.50	
11/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Attend mediation. Meet with clients.	5.80	
11/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer rough draft deposition transcript for confidentiality designations; memorandum to court report re same. Office conference with E. Fastiff re mediation.	1.80	
11/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend mediation, extended conference with plaintiffs re , conference with co-counsel re same, prepare for same.	7.10	
11/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Karen Kukla re mediation: email with D. Harvey re damages estimates; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re settlement proposal; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re mediation and plaintiffs; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Adobe titles; review	1.00	
11/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all exhibits from the link sent over by D. Harvey for the deposition of Matthew Marx and create a binder with the condensed transcript.	1.20	
11/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition transcripts and exhibits on the internal computer drive.	0.30	
11/20/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft notice; research	1.20	
11/20/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.80	
11/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Intel re inchael Devine questions. ; email LCHB team re same; email with D. Harvey re	0.50	
11/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize binders in the war room.	0.40	
11/21/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare correspondence and deposition notices for Records.	0.10	
11/21/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; memorandum to team re same.	0.60	
11/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Robert Van Nest re mediation; telephone conference with Michael Tubach/Christina Brown re Heffler and email team re same; email with Michael Tubach re Heffler; review revised notice.	1.00	
11/22/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update deposition exhibits and transcript of Prof. Alan Manning to the internal computer drive and organize the documents on the internal computer drive.	0.30	
11/22/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.60	
11/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email to D. Harvey re Intel class list and review/respond to Intel email re same; email Joe Saveri re mediation.	0.50	
11/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re mediation issues.	0.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/25/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email David Kiernan re Adobe titles; email with team/defendants re 23(f) reply; email with E. Cabraser and J. Selbin re Rule 23(f) strategy; emails with Intel re senior management class members; email Kevin Hallock re transcript; email Robert Van Nest re mediation.	2.00	
11/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room with binders from D. Harvey.	0.60	
11/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research errata deadlines for all expert depositions for D. Harvey. Contact various court reporters to get final copies.	1.20	
11/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
11/25/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on Concordance per D. Harvey's instructions. Work with E. Ocampo for keyword searches and for bates numbered searches.	3.00	
11/25/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' merits expert reports; conference with team re defendants' request to file a reply; review reply in support of 23(f) petition, research responses.	3.50	
11/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Pull documents cited in defendants' expert reports.	0.90	
11/25/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.20	
11/25/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Assist paralegal searching specific documents on database.	0.50	
11/25/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Update fields for faster searching document identification.	3.00	
11/25/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review emails re experts and 23(f) for follow up.	0.40	
11/26/13	CARNAM, TODD	Pull articles written by experts for upcoming depositions.	1.60	
11/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Defense expert merits strategy and 23(f) reply management. Read defendants' expert reports from Elizabeth Becker and David Lewin; telephone conference with B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re mediation; emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re experts; email Kevin Hallock re expert reports; email B. Glackin/D. Harvey re jury consultant work; email with B. Glackin re 23(f) reply opposition; email with T. Desouza re expert report binders.	3.00	
11/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
11/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize every document cited in all six defense expert reports. Coordinate a team to do so per D. Harvey's instructions.	3.80	
11/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize expert materials onto file share site for per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
11/26/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize expert reports for K. Dermody and D. Harvey. Place in binders per their instructions.	2.00	
11/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review 23(f) response; review expert reports; conferences with K. Dermody, D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same.	8.40	
11/26/13	JONES, ALEXA	Prepare expert report documents.	0.70	
11/26/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain various texts for T. Desouza.	0.60	
11/26/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Read 23(f) briefs; review Rules of Appellate Procedure and Rutter Guide for best appellate practice; confer with B. Glackin re strategy for response; email summary of findings to B. Glackin.	3.00	
11/27/13	CARNAM, TODD	Follow-up work pulling articles and ordering books by experts to be deposed; search on Lexis for prior testimony and reports.	3.20	
11/27/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Merits Expert Management; Emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re Matthew Marx and Edward Snyder; read Edward Snyder report; email Eric Cramer re experts; email B. Glackin re mediation status; email Robert Van Nest re mediation issues and advise team re same; email David Rotman re same; telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re Elizabeth Becker report and email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; email defendants re expert transcripts/reports; email with Lisa Leebove re Heffler; telephone conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re expert strategy.	7.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull everything cited from all expert reports for D. Harvey. Create multiple folders on the internal computer drive with al the information. Coordinate with Research Department on pulling articles.	5.50	
11/27/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' expert reports, conference with team re same; assemble documents to prepare for preparation of expert reports; conference with plaintiffs' experts re defendants' expert reports; research legal standards re collaboration issues and pro-competitive justifications.	10.20	
11/27/13	JONES, MARIANA	Assist T. Desouza with cite checking.	4.90	
11/27/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Pull documents cited in defendants' expert reports.	3.10	
11/27/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles authored by David Lewin, for T. Desouza.	0.70	
11/27/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles authored by Edward Snyder, for T. Desouza.	0.60	
11/27/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles authored by Eric Talley, for T. Desouza.	0.90	
11/27/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles authored by Gillian Lester (related to Talley), for T. Desouza.	1.00	
11/27/13	SCHURMAN, HANNA	Pull citations to depositions, declarations and interviews from expert reports.	3.00	
11/27/13	WU, LESLIE	Research the expert report of Eric Talley to find the deposition transcript citations; create an index of the pincites used.	4.30	
11/28/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Kevin Hallock re Elizabeth Becker report; email Joe Saveri/Lisa Leebove re Heffler notice; email D. Harvey re Michael Devine question.	0.30	
11/29/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to B. Glackin, D. Harvey re expert depositions.	0.10	
11/29/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research defendants' expert merit reports, conference with plaintiffs' experts re same.	8.50	
11/30/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin re Elizabeth Becker deposition.	0.10	
12/01/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Lauren Stiroh, Eric Talley and Kevin Murphy reports in preparation for rebuttals; email with Kevin Hallock re rebuttal themes and review Kevin Hallock memo re same; email B. Glackin re deposition schedule.	4.00	
12/01/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research defendants' expert reports, conference with team re same, conference with Dr. Matthew Marx re same; research and supervise issues re document database, conference with team re same, conference with vendor re same.	4.50	
12/02/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Research expert testimony for background information per B. Glackin.	3.40	
12/02/13	CARNAM, TODD	Further follow-up re articles ordered in preparation for expert witness depositions.	0.80	
12/02/13	CARNAM, TODD	Organize and forward to T. Desouza articles recently located.	0.10	
12/02/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize deposition notices and handle service of the same.	0.50	
12/02/13	DERMODY, KELLY	re Elizabeth Becker project; email LCHB team re meeting; email with B. Glackin, Robert Van Nest re mediation; review draft letter re expert reports and email team re same; confer with B. Glackin re same and rebuttals; email with T. Desouza re Elizabeth Becker documents; email with David Kiernan re revised notice; email with D. Harvey/B. Glackin re Edward Snyder and Matthew Marx strategy; review/comment on draft Ed Leamer rebuttal and emails with B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Eric Cramer, Ed Leamer, Joe Saveri re Leamer reply report.	3.50	
12/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create deposition notices and a proof of service for all the experts per B. Glackin's instructions.	0.50	
12/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull all cites from six expert reports for D. Harvey and B. Glackin. Organize everything on the internal computer drive for access.	6.00	
12/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Collect materials for Lauren Stiroh deposition preparation. Letter to defendants re experts; team call re Ed Leamer report.	2.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Lauren Stiroh research; telephone conference with Alan Manning; review draft Ed Leamer report sections; confer with K. Dermody re experts.	2.30	
12/02/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re expert deposition strategy and expert reply reports; research summary judgment legal standards.	2.50	
12/02/13	JONES, MARIANA	Assist T. Desouza with cite checking reports.	4.80	
12/02/13	JONES, MARIANA	Assist T. Desouza with creating charts that reflect bate numbers used in reports.	0.70	
12/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Research documents cited in defendants' expert reports.	2.60	
12/02/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.10	
12/02/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support: Assist in locating tagged documents and making available for reviewers.	8.00	
12/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Locate documents for expert deposition preparation.	1.40	
12/02/13	WU, LESLIE	Locate the cited deposition transcripts through the expert report of David Lewin.	1.00	
12/02/13	WU, LESLIE	Locate the cited deposition transcripts through the expert report of Lauren Stiroh.	3.00	
12/03/13	BEHRMANN, DAWN	Emails regarding potential deposition exhibits. Review folders with potential exhibits on P:/ drive.	0.20	
12/03/13	CARNAM, TODD	Continue following up on requested articles and books in advance of upcoming expert depositions.	0.30	
12/03/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Elizabeth Becker deposition and telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re same; review edits to revised notice and conference with Lisa Leebove re same; telephone conference with Lisa Leebove, David Kiernan, Emily Henn re same; telephone conference with David Kiernan re Adobe titles; confer with T. Desouza re Elizabeth Becker documents; review Kevin Hallock testimony re recruiting issues and email team re Edward Snyder comment re same.	5.00	
12/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Contact Rosalie Kramm to set up court reporters for all expert depositions per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
12/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue work on pulling cites from six expert reports for D. Harvey, B. Glackin, and K. Dermody. Organize binders from the expert report of Eric Talley to D. Harvey. Prepare for K. Dermody binders of documents from the expert report of Elizabeth Becker. Organize documents from the expert report of Lauren Stiroh. Create indices.	6.30	
12/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
12/03/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Dr. Matthew Marx re reply report; Conference with Dr. Alan Manning re reply report, research same; supervise preparation for expert depositions.	3.50	
12/03/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	0.90	
12/03/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Assist in locating tagged documents and make available for reviewers.	5.00	
12/03/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Conference with paralegal re mass tagging in Concordance.	0.50	
12/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Locate documents for expert deposition preparation.	0.40	
12/04/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for depositions and emails with Kevin Hallock re same; review revised class notice and emails with Pixar, Intuit re same and with Lisa Leebove re same; email Robert Van Nest re mediation; email with D. Harvey re Edward Snyder deposition, Matthew Marx report; email B. Glackin re Kevin Murphy deposition; email David Kiernan re Elizabeth Becker depositions.	4.00	
12/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents from all six expert reports and organize into binders. Locate missing documents from the expert report of Edward Snyder for co-counsel per D. Harvey's instructions. Organize documents into binders for B. Glackin. Create lists of what supporting materials cannot be found.	4.50	
12/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work with E. Ocampo and K. Dugar to research missing bates images for D. Harvey.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/04/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research for Lauren Stiroh deposition.	4.00	
12/04/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Travel to New York City for deposition preparation; prepare for deposition of Dr. Edward Snyder and Dr. Eric Talley; research Marx and Manning rebuttal reports; research case management statement; email K. Dermody re Snyder.	14.10	
12/04/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	0.80	
12/04/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Assist in locating tagged documents and make available for reviewers.	2.00	
12/04/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Research missing defense documents in the backup drive.	1.00	
12/05/13	BEHRMANN, DAWN	Create index for binder. Meet with D. Harvey. Emails with J. Taylor and T. Desouza regarding exhibits. Create binder. Organize exhibit folders. Arrange for weekend depositions.	1.50	
12/05/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Create a list of documents not found pertaining to expert Lauren J. Stiroh per T. Desouza.	1.10	
12/05/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with expert work.	0.50	
12/05/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re Elizabeth Becker and David Lewin depositions; email re jury consultant work; email with B. Glackin re Layn Phillips mediation; email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Case Management Conference statement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Adobe; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Robert Mittelstaedt re same; emails with Emily Henn re revised notice; email with	2.80	
12/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize binders of Lauren Stiroh for B. Glackin.	1.50	
12/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents from the expert report of David Lewin and send to co-counsel per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.00	
12/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate Intel documents from the expert report of Edward Snyder for D. Harvey.	1.50	
12/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate more documents from the expert report of Edward Snyder for co-counsel per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.50	
12/05/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Per K. Dermody organize war room, document management.	0.60	
12/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Dr. Lauren Stiroh deposition.	5.60	
12/05/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for deposition of Dr. Edward Snyder and Dr. Eric Talley; research Matthew Marx and Alan Manning rebuttal reports; research case management statement.	14.60	
12/05/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Locate native documents from Concordance and update to P:/ drive.	0.70	
12/05/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull Apple evidence for D. Harvey.	0.20	
12/06/13	BEHRMANN, DAWN	Organize exhibits, add to binder. Update index with new exhibits. Email to T. Desouza regarding interrogatory responses.	0.40	
12/06/13	BEHRMANN, DAWN	Telephone call with D. Harvey, J. Taylor and T. Desouza. Meet with J. Taylor regarding exhibits. Locate articles for D. Harvey. Update binder index.	1.00	
12/06/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Elizabeth Becker deposition and email Kevin Hallock re same; call multiple lawyers outside the case to investigate Elizabeth Becker's prior expert work; emails with D. Harvey re expert preparation; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re mediation; edit order re notice; review Ed Leamer memo and email team re same; emails with T. Desouza re Elizabeth Becker documents/exhibits.	4.00	
12/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Conference call with D. Harvey and J. Taylor re depositions. Work with J. Taylor to provide documents for D. Harvey.	0.80	
12/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm all court reporting services for D. Harvey and B. Glackin.	0.60	
12/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate plaintiffs' counsel for K. Dermody from cases listed in the expert report of Elizabeth Becker. Organize documents for K. Dermody.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research Concordance for specific documents for D. Harvey.	1.20	
12/06/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review the expert reports of Alan Manning and Matthew Marx and identify materials not in the expert report of the Eric Talley report.	2.00	
12/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Dr. Lauren Stiroh deposition.	6.60	
12/06/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for deposition of Dr. Edward Snyder and Dr. Eric Talley; research Matthew Marx and Alan Manning rebuttal reports.	16.30	
12/06/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.10	
12/06/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain articles for T. Desouza.	0.60	
12/06/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate Encyclopedia of Statistics for B. Glackin.	0.30	
12/06/13	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Assist in utilizing the external access for document review.	1.00	
12/06/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull deposition testimony for D. Harvey; review class certification order and Alan Manning report for Dr. Eric Talley deposition preparation; review Dr. Talley outline.	1.50	
12/06/13	TAYLOR, JAMES	Team meeting regarding upcoming depositions; call with D.` Harvey and T. Desouza.	0.30	
12/07/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with expert work.	0.40	
12/07/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re defendants' late supplements; email James Dallal re Kevin Murphy deposition; email D. Harvey re Edward Snyder; confer with B. Glackin re experts.	0.50	
12/07/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for and assist with Dr. Edward Snyder deposition, circulate summary re same; prepare for Dr. Eric Talley deposition.	17.10	
12/08/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Elizabeth Becker deposition preparation; email re Elizabeth Becker questions.	6.00	
12/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for deposition of Lauren Stiroh.	12.20	
12/08/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare and take Dr. Eric Talley deposition, draft and circulate summary re same.	13.20	
12/09/13	CARNAM, TODD	Search for and pull certain articles cited in expert report.	0.60	
12/09/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft case management statement and make edits per K. Dermody's request.	0.50	
12/09/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Elizabeth Becker report for assisting deposition of same and conference with K. Dermody re same.	1.00	
12/09/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with B. Glackin re Lauren Stiroh strategy/deposition; prepare for Elizabeth Becker deposition; edit draft Case Management Conference statement; create Elizabeth Becker outline; email with L. Cisneros re Elizabeth Becker deposition; email with re Elizabeth Becker and telephone conference with re Elizabeth Becker deposition and expert response.	14.00	
12/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize Edward Leamer reports for B. Glackin's deposition of Lauren Stiroh.	0.50	
12/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize exhibits for the deposition of Elizabeth Becker for K. Dermody. Create labels for exhibits and organize in folders.	1.00	
12/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research various expert articles and documents per D. Harvey request.	0.20	
12/09/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work with Research Department to locate articles from the expert report of Elizabeth Becker per K. Dermody's instructions.	0.70	
12/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Take deposition of Lauren Stiroh.	9.30	
12/09/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re expert.	0.20	
12/09/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Dr. Matthew Marx and Dr. Alan Manning rebuttal report, correspond with each re same; research case management statement, conference with team re same, call with B. Glackin re expert.	5.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/09/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate expert articles for T. Desouza.	0.50	
12/09/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody and L. Cisneros re Case Management Conference statement.	0.20	
12/10/13	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Conduct research regarding technical engineer salaries per K. Dermody.	0.90	
12/10/13	CARNAM, TODD	Research engineer compensation at Adobe, Apple, Google, Intel.	1.20	
12/10/13	CARNAM, TODD	Research expert work in prior litigation.	0.30	
12/10/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist K. Dermody with deposition of Elizabeth Becker.	6.00	
12/10/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for/take Elizabeth Becker deposition; email team re same; review David Lewin report for David Lewin deposition; confer with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer; confer with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx report; emails with D. Harvey re Adobe titles; emails with team re David Lewin issues; edit Alan Manning report; edit draft Case Management Conference statement; email Emily Henn re Case Management Conference statement edits; emails with	13.00	
12/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list of the documents sent to Alan Manning and Matthew Marx per D. Harvey's instructions. Send documents to Matthew Marx per D. Harvey's request.	0.60	
12/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize various documents for the deposition of Elizabeth Becker for L. Cisneros and K. Dermody.	0.30	
12/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room with binders from depositions.	0.50	
12/10/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Calls with K. Dermody re experts; work on expert report; conference with A. Shaver re project.	6.50	
12/10/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Dr. Matthew Marx and Dr. Alan Manning rebuttal reports, conference and correspond with each and with attorney team re same; research great	5.40	
12/10/13	JONES, ALEXA	Research information about the salaries of engineers at technology companies.	1.20	
12/10/13	JONES, ALEXA	Search for court order from previous case excluding defense expert testimony; order case filing from the Court where defense expert appeared.	1.10	
12/10/13	MENARD, NICOLAS	Market research on compensation.	1.80	
12/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Conduct research on the case history of expert witness Elizabeth Becker.	1.50	
12/10/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.80	
12/10/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research published salary information for engineers at Adobe, Apple, Google, Intel, for K. Dermody.	1.10	
12/10/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Case Management Conference statement and circulate to defendants; emails with B. Glackin re assignment.	0.30	
12/11/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with expert reports.	3.00	
12/11/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Matthew Marx and Ed Leamer reports and calls/emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same: attend David Lewin deposition and conference with Joe Saveri re same; conference with Joe Saveri. James Dallal re and telephone conference with great and telephone conference with great and telephone email team re statement and emails with team re same; email with Karen Kukla re mediation documents; email with Lisa Leebove re notice letter; email with B. Glackin re cost fund.	12.00	
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various documents for D. Harvey and Matthew Marx in preparation for the rebuttal expert reports.	0.50	
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meet with A. Shaver re search for certain bates numbered documents.	0.70	
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition exhibits to the internal computer drive and send hard copies to Records.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize new materials in the war room.	0.30	
12/11/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research corresponding docket numbers for hearing transcripts for A. Shaver.	0.20	
12/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and send expert reports; conference with K. Dermody re same.	15.20	
12/11/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Dr. Matthew Marx rebuttal report, conference with K. Dermody, Dr. Marx re same; review and revise draft case management statement; review and research Dr. Ed Leamer rebuttal report; finalize and supervise service of rebuttal expert reports.	15.20	
12/11/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.40	
12/11/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Multiple revisions to Case Management Conference statement and emails with defendants re same; prepare for filing; review Ed Leamer report, pull cites for same and edit same.	9.00	
12/12/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with David Rotman re status.	0.10	
12/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize materials from the mediator's office per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.50	
12/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents off the Concordance database.	0.40	
12/12/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
12/12/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re rebuttal reports; review and revise case management statement; review, research, and finalize rebuttal Matthew Marx report and rebuttal Ed Leamer report, conference with team re same, serve same.	15.50	
12/13/13	CARNAM, TODD	Research articles and order books cited to in expert report.	2.00	
12/13/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Matthew Marx and Ed Leamer depositions.	0.10	
12/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create deposition binder of Edward Snyder materials for D. Harvey.	0.90	
12/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents cited in the rebuttal expert report of Matthew Marx for D. Harvey.	2.50	
12/13/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
12/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition scheduling, conference with K. Dermody re same. Correspondence to Joseph Saveri re cost fund. Review outstanding invoices.	1.80	
12/13/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, Dr. Matthew Marx re deposition; assemble and serve backup data for Dr. Ed Leamer and Dr. Marx; conference with defense counsel re coordinating depositions; conference with B. Glackin re summary judgment strategy, research same.	3.50	
12/16/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research regarding named plaintiff and confer with D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	2.70	
12/16/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Merits reply, deposition strategy management. Email D. Harvey re Matthew Marx rebuttal/deposition; review media re plaintiff; email B. Glackin re Ed Leamer deposition and Case Management Conference; email re Kevin Hallock bill; review draft letter re Edward Snyder documents and email D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Tina Sessions re notice; telephone conference with Gregory Stone re Intel questions and answers for notice; review Intel draft communication re notice and edit same and email with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re conference with B. Glackin re expert reports and striking opinions; research service awards for plaintiffs; email David Kiernan/Emily Henn re notice; email Heffler re notice; review order re notice; draft memo re Elizabeth Becker issues.	6.00	
12/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to locate documents from the expert report of Matthew Marx for D. Harvey. Organize in a binder.	3.80	
12/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish binder of deposition testimony and exhibits for Edward Snyder for war room.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research case management transcript where Judge Koh discussed her trial calendar/preferences for B. Glackin.	0.50	
12/16/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive and organize internal computer drive. Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
12/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Joseph Saveri re missing Saveri firm cost fund contributions.	0.50	
12/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Ed Leamer deposition, email K. Dermody re same. Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re cost fund. Review trial schedule with Dr. Alan Manning. Office conference with D. Harvey re expert testimony and Daubert motions.	2.20	
12/16/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re trial strategy, research same; review rough Dr. Eric Talley transcript; conference with B. Glackin and research potential Daubert motions; review and revise draft communications summary from Intel counsel; research effect of deceased class representative.	6.50	
12/16/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.20	
12/16/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Review email correspondence re Daubert and supplemental briefs and article for follow up.	0.40	
12/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with notice preparation.	0.80	
12/17/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research regarding deceased named plaintiff and confer with D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	2.30	
12/17/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Google communication to employees and edit same; review defendants' revised notice and edit same; email with Lisa Leebove re notice issues and telephone conference with Joe Saveri re notice; telephone conference with defendants re notice issues and prepare edited notice for defendants; prepare for Case Management Conference; email Emily Henn and David Kiernan re	3.00	
12/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition materials on Lauren Stiroh.	1.00	
12/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize expert reports for Edward Leamer for B. Glackin and locate various documents for D. Harvey.	1.00	
12/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research court filing for L. Cisneros. Assist with any work needed for the hearing with the court this week.	1.00	
12/17/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	War room meeting with B. Glackin and A. McDaniel to discuss trial preparation document management.	0.50	
12/17/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Research issues regarding ; research opt-out form issues; prepare for case management conference; research potential Daubert motions.	4.50	
12/17/13	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research treatise regarding perfecting claims for L. Cisneros.	0.70	
12/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research related to named plaintiff and share results and consult with D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	1.70	
12/18/13	CISNEROS, LISA	Further research regarding named plaintiff and consultation with D. Harvey regarding case law.	0.60	
12/18/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for Case Management Conference and travel to same; attend same; email team and David Kiernan rereview revised notice and email Gregory Stone re same; call with Joe Saveri re notice; email Lisa Leebove re Herrier schedule; conference with L. Cisneros re named plaintiff research.	6.00	
12/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate and organize mediation materials for war room per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.70	
12/18/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents for case management conference for D. Harvey. Ensure order from case management conference was in the Calendar and all deadlines were listed. Organize expert reports by Edward Leamer for B. Glackin and arrange in a binder. Create index. Organize various documents for the hearing for K. Dermody.	3.30	
12/18/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Ed Leamer for deposition.	6.30	
12/18/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend case management conference, travel re same, prepare re same; prepare for Dr. Ed Leamer deposition, conference with B. Glackin re same; research opt-out form issue.	7.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/18/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.50	
12/18/13	SHAVER, ANNE	Research Federal Judicial Center notice samples for K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	0.20	
12/19/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin re Ed Leamer deposition; review revised notice; review media re plaintiff.	0.50	
12/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create the deposition binder for Eric Talley for D. Harvey.	0.20	
12/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Process transcript order form for December 18, 2013 hearing for D. Harvey. Email court reporter.	0.30	
12/19/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
12/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend Ed Leamer deposition. Office conference with D. Harvey, email K. Dermody re same.	9.20	
12/19/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with B. Glackin re Dr. Ed Leamer deposition; research potential Daubert motions; research potential motion to compel Intel documents.	2.40	
12/19/13	JONES, ALEXA	Research archived court order pertaining to defense expert from old case.	0.80	
12/19/13	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	0.80	
12/20/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re cost fund contribution; review Elizabeth Becker information re Daubert motion.	0.50	
12/20/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents to send to Peter Barile per B. Glackin's instructions.	0.30	
12/21/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit and revise new notice and email team re same; email defendants re revised notice; email Emily Henn and David Kiernan re notice revisions.	2.50	
12/22/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' revised notice and edit same; emails with team re same and defendants re same.	2.00	
12/23/13	CARNAM, TODD	Locate opinion from Delaware court related to defense expert.	0.40	
12/23/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re expert reports and motions; email with B. Glackin re Lauren Stiroh sur-reply; email with B. Glackin re cost fund management; edit and revise notice and telephone conference with Gregory Stone re same; edit letter for filing and email D. Harvey re same; email Lisa Leebove re Intel communication re settlement and review same and conference with Gregory Stone re same; email David Kiernan and Emily Henn re notice.	3.50	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create deposition binders for Eric Talley, Elizabeth Becker, and David Lewin for D. Harvey.	2.00	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Ensure all deadlines listed in the last case management order are in the Calendar.	0.20	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate all the "materials considered" lists from defense expert reports and organize for D. Harvey.	0.50	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare for D. Harvey various documents for filing revised notice today. Organize courtesy copy of the filing to go to San Jose.	1.60	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research response time of Ninth Circuit to 23(f) petition in another case for possible application here for K. Dermody, D. Harvey.	0.60	
12/23/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
12/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team and Joseph Saveri Law Firm re possible Daubert motions.	0.40	
12/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence from Christina Brown re experts.	0.30	
12/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re expert reports and Daubert motions.	0.60	
12/23/13	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft class notice, correspond with team re same; draft statement to court and letter to court re class notice disputes; conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re Daubert and summary judgment issues, review correspondence with defendants re same, research same.	5.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/24/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Intel; telephone conference with Joe Saveri, Jim Hunt re re Intel; review order excluding Elizabeth Becker opinion in another case.	0.70	
12/26/13	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with defendants, B. Glackin, Joe Saveri re expert rebuttal; email with Gregory Stone, Jacqueline Mottek, Lisa Leebove re Heffler/notice.	0.70	
12/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re Daubert briefing.	0.40	
12/26/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, Joe Saveri, defendants re Lauren Stiroh sur-reply.	0.50	
12/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update mediation schedule in the Calendar.	0.20	
12/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition materials for David Lewin and Kevin Murphy.	0.20	
12/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish deposition binders for Kevin Murphy and David Lewin.	1.30	
12/31/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list with recent message left for the case.	1.00	
01/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' proposed Lauren Stiroh rebuttal and email with B. Glackin re same.	1.00	
01/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review proposed Lauren Stiroh sur-rebuttal.	1.70	
01/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm defendants' errata deadlines and email court reporter.	0.20	
01/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update calendar.	0.10	
01/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list with new contacts from online forms or voicemail. Interview class members. Gather their information and send it to the claims administrator.	4.00	
01/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update deposition materials for Elizabeth Becker and Eric Talley on internal computer drive.	0.20	
01/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class notice issues, conference with claims administrator re same; research potential Daubert motions.	5.40	
01/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Jim Hunt re Intel ; email Karen Kukla re David Rotman schedule; email David Kiernan re notice.	0.20	
01/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to respond to calls from class members. Forward information over to the claims administrator as people call. Update Excel chart with all the new information.	3.50	
01/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate for D. Harvey various documents and books from the rebuttal report of Matthew Marx.	0.20	
01/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents in the war room.	0.60	
01/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research status of transcript from the court reporter for D. Harvey.	0.20	
01/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
01/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential Daubert motions; research potential summary judgment defenses; correspond with class representative re ; correspond with claims administrator; supervise communications with class members re claims process.	4.20	
01/03/14	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	0.90	
01/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Edward Snyder documents and production issues.	0.20	
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Call Lee-Anne Shortridge to discuss timeline for recent hearing transcript for D. Harvey.	0.20	
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Email the claims administrator re potential class members.	0.10	
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate for D. Harvey various reports and other documents.	0.30	
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research from Weinstein's Book of Federal Evidence for D. Harvey.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research status of exhibits from the deposition of Edward Leamer with Veritext.	0.50	
01/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review defense rebuttal merit expert reports for reference to a declaration or interrogatory response, or to any brief and any other attorney work product for D. Harvey.	2.50	
01/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Administer cost fund. Memorandum to Joseph Saveri re missing contribution to same.	0.30	
01/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Daubert briefing.	0.50	
01/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Peter Barile draft re Daubert motions; office conference with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Peter Barile re same.	0.60	
01/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential Daubert motions, conference with B. Glackin and Pete Barile re same; research developments re summary judgment standards; review Dr. Eric Talley testimony; email with K. Dermody re Edward Snyder; review defense experts' reliance on attorney drafted material.	6.50	
01/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re notice approval; email notice to Heffler; email team re David Lewin and review response re same.	0.50	
01/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to research defendants' expert reports and flag/highlight any time they cite to a declaration or interrogatory response for D. Harvey.	0.70	
01/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research from Weinstein's Federal Evidence for D. Harvey.	0.40	
01/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft Daubert motion.	0.50	
01/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential Daubert motions, conference with B. Glackin re same; email with K. Dermody re notice; research summary judgment defenses.	2.50	
01/07/14	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with copies of recent case correspondence.	1.40	
01/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research, review co-counsel's arguments and write draft Daubert motion concerning defendants' six expert witnesses.	8.00	
01/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey regarding draft Daubert motion.	0.60	
01/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Telephone call with James Dallal regarding draft Daubert motion.	0.30	
01/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Gregory Stone re notice; email Justina Sessions re mediation.	0.20	
01/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Daubert motion drafts, meetings with D. Harvey, L. Cisneros re same.	1.70	
01/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Daubert motion, review and revise drafts, conference with team re same.	6.80	
01/08/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding potential affirmative summary judgment motion.	0.40	
01/09/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Cite check Daubert motion brief per D. Harvey.	2.50	
01/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct review for K. Dermody and B. Glackin and respond to their queries regarding Elizabeth Becker and Lauren Stiroh deposition.	1.00	
01/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft declaration in support of Daubert motion, draft motion to seal and supporting declaration, draft proposed orders, assist with editing the Daubert motion, and assist with final preparation and execution of filing.	6.00	
01/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review and edit plaintiffs' Daubert motion and emails and telephone conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; review Elizabeth Becker report and testimony re impact; emails with L. Cisneros re Elizabeth Becker opinions; telephone conference with Justina Sessions re mediation and email team re same; email media re summary judgment filings; review team emails re summary judgment strategy.	3.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on Daubert filings for D. Harvey and L. Cisneros. Fact check briefs, pull and organize all exhibits, create declarations and other court related documents. Prepare exhibits for D. Harvey to forward to defense counsel.	10.50	
01/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise Daubert motion and confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re same; supervise finalization and filing of same. Review incoming motions.	6.10	
01/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and finalize Daubert motion and related papers, conference with team ream re same, supervise filing and service re same; review defendants' summary judgment and Daubert filings, conference with team re same.	13.20	
01/09/14	MERRIFIELD, IAN	Update firm databases with recent case correspondence.	1.10	
01/09/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain cases for T. Desouza.	0.30	
01/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citations for attorney review.	0.20	
01/10/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist T. Desouza with compiling and organizing pleadings for attorney review.	2.10	
01/10/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Review, organize incoming pleadings.	3.30	
01/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding filing of Daubert motion, including proposed orders and courtesy copies.	0.40	
01/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare materials to Heffler for settlement administration, and correspond with settlement administrator.	1.50	
01/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Gregory Stone and Joe Saveri re notice; telephone conference with Jacqueline Mottek and Melissa Baldwin re notice; emails with L. Cisneros and Heffler re settlement documents; emails with D. Harvey re class title information; email defendants re notice and website issues; telephone conference with Emily Henn re Lucas; email T. Desouza re defense summary judgment motions.	1.50	
01/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare hard copy chambers filing to go to San Jose by noon for D. Harvey. Ensure the conformed copy is done.	4.50	
01/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update all electronic court filing notices on the internal computer drive. Organize all motions for D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	1.60	
01/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review motions for summary judgment; Daubert briefs; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	3.60	
01/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' summary judgment and Daubert filings, conference with B. Glackin re same, research same; supervise courtesy copies of Daubert motion; conference with consultant, claims administrator, and defense counsel re notice procedures and issues.	6.70	
01/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re mediation; email team re David Lewin supplemental questions.	0.20	
01/13/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Compile and organize incoming pleadings and exhibits for attorney review and analysis.	3.60	
01/13/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding query by Peter Julian regarding expert reports.	0.50	
01/13/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review motions for summary judgment and Daubert motion filed by defendants.	0.30	
01/13/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Strategy meeting regarding motions for summary judgment and Daubert motions with B. Glackin, K. Dermody, A. Shaver, D. Harvey.	1.00	
01/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Summary judgment preparation work; review defendants' summary judgment motions and Daubert motions; meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver and L. Cisneros re summary judgment motions and assignments; email with Melissa Baldwin re notice; send retention letter to Layn Phillips; email Justina Sessions re mediation; email with Robert Van Nest re mediation.	3.00	
01/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate for A. Shaver all the motions pertaining to defendants' Daubert filings.	0.10	
01/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research re the merits report of Kevin Murphy for D. Harvey.	0.10	
01/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review and organize all defendants' motions for summary judgment and motions to strike into binders for D. Harvey. Organize the internal computer drive with all the documents. Create binders for plaintiffs' materials.	5.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list with information sent over by D. Harvey.	0.30	
01/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
01/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with LCHB team re summary judgment briefing; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.20	
01/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review summary judgment filings.	0.80	
01/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research defendants' summary judament and Daubert motions. draft summary re same, conference with LCHB team re same: conference with named plaintiffs re under seal submissions.	8.40	
01/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, L. Cisneros and B. Glackin re summary judgment oppositions; review summary judgment motions.	2.00	
01/14/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Compile and organize summary judgment pleadings and exhibits for attorney review and analysis.	1.10	
01/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Ninth Circuit order regarding Rule 23(f) petition, Ninth Circuit rules and confer with D. Harvey.	0.70	
01/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Ninth Circuit order and email team re same; confer with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re same; email Robert Van Nest re mediation and telephone conference with Layn Phillips' assistant re same; telephone conference with Melissa Baldwin re notice issues; email David Kiernan re notice; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Intel, Heffler, and mediation; email Heffler re Lucas instructions; email Heffler re confidential job titles: email Kevin Hallock re trial; email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re trial; email re jury work; email mediator re	3.00	
01/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish organizing materials for motions for summary judgment for D. Harvey. Create indices.	1.30	
01/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to class member calls per D. Harvey's instructions. Update the Excel spreadsheet. Email the information to the claims administrator.	1.50	
01/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
01/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.80	
01/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Joseph Saveri re briefing work; email K. Dermody and office conference with D. Harvey re briefing, 23(f) denial; organize responses to summary judgment and Daubert briefs.	2.20	
01/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Ninth Circuit order denying 23(f) petition, research same and conference with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re same; research opposition to motions for summary judgment and Daubert briefs, conference with team re same; conference with opposing counsel re class titles and class notice, conference with consulting economists re same, research same.	7.40	
01/14/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review order on 23(f) from Ninth Circuit and emails re same.	0.20	
01/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Heffler re notice issues; review Intel communication and email Intel; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Intel (0.10); email Robert Van Nest and Layn Phillips' assistant re mediation; review media re case; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re mediation submission; respond to media re case.	1.50	
01/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize motions for summary judgment and the motion to exclude on the internal computer drive.	0.10	
01/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review the summary judgment and motion to exclude briefing by defendants and pull all cases from LEXIS for D. Harvey.	1.70	
01/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member chart with new contacts and gather information via telephone or email to send to claims administrator.	1.50	
01/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive for D. Srinivasan.	0.10	
01/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review summary judgment and Daubert filing to create outline of response. memorandum to D. Srinivasan re same and assignment.	2.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research opposition to motions for summary judgment and Daubert motions; conference with team re settlement notice procedures; research potential further steps defendants may take to seek review of class certification order.	4.20	
01/15/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain statistical texts for B. Glackin.	0.30	
01/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with Heffler re notice issues; email with Lucas re job title information; email defendants re title confidentiality; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re summary judgment oppositions; email Christina Brown re Elizabeth Becker prior testimony and review same; telephone conference with	1.50	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create an updated table of jargon/abbreviations for D. Harvey.	0.30	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare PDFs for D. Harvey to include in an email for Matthew Marx.	0.20	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Process request for hearing transcript per D. Harvey.	0.20	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull and organize cases from defendants' motions to exclude and strike for D. Harvey.	2.00	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to class member intakes. Update Excel chart and send information to claims administrator per D. Harvey's instructions.	2.50	
01/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
01/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft opposition to Ed Leamer Daubert motions, confer with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re same.	6.50	
01/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Daubert motion against Matthew Marx, conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same; research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment, conference with team re same.	5.40	
01/16/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Research Daubert standards in Ninth Circuit; research legal standards for scope of expert rebuttal arguments.	5.00	
01/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment filings for D. Harvey's review.	0.40	
01/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit claims administration IVR script and email Melissa Baldwin re same; email with Heffler re claims administration.	1.00	
01/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Orgainze materials from merits reports from both sides with indices for D. Harvey.	1.50	
01/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel chart with new class members/intakes and forward information to claims administrator.	0.50	
01/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update table of abbreviations/jargon for D. Harvey.	1.10	
01/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re drafting oppositions. Draft Ed Leamer brief.	2.20	
01/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment, conference with team re same.	7.80	
01/17/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Research Daubert standards in Ninth Circuit; research legal standards for scope of expert rebuttal arguments.	5.50	
01/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re notice process; email with H. Mottershead re notice (and class response) staffing; email with Heffler re website/notice issues; email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re summary judgment opposition; conference with Emily Henn re Heffler website issues; review Intel communications and email Gregory Stone re same; telephone conference with D. Harvey re Elizabeth Becker errata.	2.00	
01/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment; conference with K. Dermody re Becker.	3.80	
01/22/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Review and respond to class member calls.	2.90	
01/22/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding settlement administration process.	0.30	
01/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with defendants, Heffler re Heffler website; email D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock errata; confer with B. Glackin re Elizabeth Becker errata, oppositions.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Check the corrections made by Kevin Hallock to his transcript for D. Harvey. Create a rough draft of the errata for D. Harvey's review and list the corrections D. Harvey.	0.60	
01/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate video depositions of defense counsel's experts and organize for D. Harvey.	0.70	
01/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meet with D. Harvey to discuss protocol for handling incoming class member calls.	0.30	
01/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review script for handling calls from class per D. Harvey. Update Excel spreadsheet. Confirm claims administrator has all the correct information. Talk with potential class members on the telephone to gather their information and answer any questions they may have. Discuss handling the volume of calls and responses with D. Harvey, H. Mottershead, C. Chan, and C. Griffith.	4.00	
01/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft opposition briefs; office conference with D. Harvey re legal research on conspiracy law.	1.50	
01/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re Elizabeth Becker errata, opposition briefs.	0.30	
01/22/14	GRIFFITH, CONNER	Class member calls.	0.50	
01/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review notice procedures and conference with team re communications with class members; research and draft deposition errata; research and draft opposition to summary judgment motions.	4.30	
01/22/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Draft section in Daubert opposition re plaintiffs' expert.	4.50	
01/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment pleading for D. Harvey's review.	0.10	
01/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to Joseph Saveri remediation; review revised Heffler claims website; email with Gregory Stone re claims website.	0.80	
01/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize redacted documents on the internal computer drive filed with defendants' motion to seal.	0.20	
01/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review Excel spreadsheet re class member intakes and contact project manager at Heffler for information on class member.	1.00	
01/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
01/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research opposition to Ed Leamer briefs; draft same.	5.80	
01/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment.	4.50	
01/23/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Research expert issue for Daubert opposition.	2.50	
01/24/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Respond to class member intakes.	1.70	
01/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review letter from Tina Sessions and email Tina Sessions re same; email D. Harvey re notice issues; review media report re case and response to reporter; email Joseph Saveri re Intel; emails with D. Harvey re Heffler website edits.	0.60	
01/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research docket and find the entries for defendants' motions to seal with our supplemental motion for class certification and reply in support of class certification. Locate missing documents and organize on the internal computer drive.	1.10	
01/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
01/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with class member intakes and call them to follow up. Forward new information to the claims administrator.	1.20	
01/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft opposition to Ed Leamer motions.	1.30	
01/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re notice procedures, review same, review and revise website, conference with claims administrator re same; research and draft opposition to summary judgment.	7.10	
01/25/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey, Joseph Saveri re claims filings.	0.10	
01/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment; correspond with class members and claims administrator re claims and website.	8.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/26/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment.	7.60	
01/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Heffler re claims information; email with Emily Henn re claims information; email Karen Kukla and Joe Saveri re telephone conference with Bloomberg re case; review/respond to class intakes; emails with D. Harvey re summary judgment opposition; email with D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock errata.	1.50	
01/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm Matthew Marx's corrections for his errata per D. Harvey's instructions. Locate his video deposition.	0.70	
01/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition exhibits, bates documents, deposition testimony, and other documents from plaintiffs' merits report for the plaintiffs' opposition filing to Daubert motions taking place next Friday.	2.50	
01/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with calls from class members. Email and call class members and forward questions for an attorney to D. Harvey. Coordinate with Heffler re intakes.	3.00	
01/27/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment; conference with class members; supervise claims process and website administration; correspond with co-counsel and conference with team re Daubert oppositions and papers ancillary to the summary judgment opposition.	9.40	
01/27/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Draft section in Daubert opposition re plaintiffs' expert.	6.50	
01/27/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Assist re cite checking assignment.	0.10	
01/28/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist with filing preparation.	3.70	
01/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Karen Kukla, Joe Saveri re mediation; confer with D. Harvey re mediation and plaintiff attendance.	0.30	
01/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare deposition exhibits, bates documents, deposition testimony, and other documents from plaintiffs' merits report for the plaintiffs' opposition filing to Daubert motions taking place next Friday.	3.50	
01/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Process incoming class member calls and update the Excel spreadsheet.	0.20	
01/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with incoming calls from class members. Email and call potential class members and forward question for an attorney to D. Harvey. Coordinate with Heffler re intakes.	2.00	
01/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research and draft opposition to Daubert motion.	9.70	
01/28/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members; supervise preparation for February 6, 2014 filing; research and draft opposition to summary judgment; review draft opposition to Daubert motion re Dr. Matthew Marx; confer with K. Dermody re mediation and plaintiffs.	8.40	
01/28/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Research documents in the database.	0.50	
01/29/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist with filing preparation.	4.40	
01/29/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Lee Rubin re Google notice issue; email with Rosenblatt re hearing; emails with Heffler re claims issues and email team re same.	0.80	
01/29/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to research plaintiffs' merits reports and confirm that all bates documents, deposition exhibits, and deposition testimony has been pulled for D. Harvey.	4.50	
01/29/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet and calls with class members. Contact claims administrator to verify class member information.	1.50	
01/29/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition.	2.10	
01/29/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment.	10.30	
01/29/14	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation support: Provide technical support to users for high tech CaseMap database.	1.50	
01/29/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; review deposition transcripts for motion for summary judgment.	2.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/29/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey re assignment.	0.30	
01/30/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assemble and prepare materials for attorney review and filing.	5.80	
01/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Lee Rubin re claims issue and email LCHB team re same; edit letter to Joe Saveri re cost fund/administration issues and confer with B. Glackin re same; email LCHB team re trial preparation; email Heffler re data.	1.00	
01/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a rough draft of the Alan Manning errata, confidential information to be designated as such, and a letter to defense counsel with this for B. Glackin.	1.50	
01/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research hearing transcripts to find certain instructions from court for D. Harvey.	2.00	
01/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research in Concordance and CaseMap for D. Harvey, pull documents mentioning gentleman's agreements and anything involving Paul Otellini and Bill Campbell in the sender and recipient lines of emails.	2.00	
01/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review privilege log filed with the motion to compel and identify documents mentioning both Paul Otellini and Bill Campbell for D. Harvey.	0.30	
01/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work with B. Troxel and C. Chan to pull documents from the expert reports for Dr. Edward Leamer.	0.70	
01/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Joseph Saveri re time keeping.	1.20	
01/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment.	10.10	
01/30/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research re summary judgment opposition.	1.20	
01/30/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Assist attorney with database review.	3.00	
01/30/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Search database for names and tag them for review.	1.50	
01/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits re opposition to motion for summary judgment.	6.00	
01/30/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of deposition transcripts, emails for opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment; email memos on review results.	5.30	
01/30/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey re assignment.	0.20	
01/31/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assemble and prepare materials for attorney review and upcoming filing.	3.20	
01/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare documents, review filings and prepare filing plan.	1.40	
01/31/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Organize Mock Trial/Jury focus work. Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, Joe Saveri, work; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Melissa Baldwin re claims work and email LCHB team re same; telephone conference with Larry Achorn re and email Joe Saveri, LCHB team re same; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler call and email Heffler re claims protocol: email with class member re claims process; email with team re media coverage and email re same; review	3.50	
01/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate bates documents and deposition testimony from plaintiffs' experts reports. Review documents that were pulled for D. Harvey.	2.70	
01/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search CaseMap, Concordance, and the internal computer drive for documents that connect Paul Otellini to the discussions about a possible Google and Facebook non-solicit agreement.	2.50	_
01/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
01/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with incoming calls from class members.	0.40	
01/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with re mock jury work (partial attendance).	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/31/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment; conference with class members; conference with claims administrator, draft and circulate summary re same; research claims re class members who worked for multiple defendants; conference with jury consultant and co-counsel re trial preparation.	11.10	
01/31/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Assist attorney with Concordance database review.	1.50	
01/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits re opposition to summary judgment for filing.	1.50	
01/31/14	YAMAT, CYRUS	Litigation Support: Provide support to reviewers on Concordance database.	2.50	
01/31/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Concordance document review.	0.60	
01/31/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of deposition transcripts, emails for opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment; email memos on review results.	4.00	
02/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition.	8.20	
02/01/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment.	10.20	
02/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition.	4.90	
02/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft mediation brief; research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment; review opposition to Daubert motions re Dr. Ed Leamer.	9.40	
02/03/14	CARNAM, TODD	Locate order on LEXIS for D. Harvey.	0.40	
02/03/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist D. Harvey with materials for filing.	3.80	
02/03/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on papers related to oppositions to motions for summary judgment.	2.00	
02/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review certain arguments in defendants' motions to confirm response in plaintiffs' opposition briefs capture issues; emails with D. Harvey re briefs; telephone conference with Larry Achorn read and email Joe Saveri re same: email Emily Henn re claims and review status report; telephone conference with reporter re case; email with team, re jury pool issues; email class member re settlement; edit mediation brief.	3.00	
02/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare mediation brief for service for D. Harvey.	0.40	
02/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review the original class certification and the supplemental motion for class certification and create an outline re evidence cited re bilateral agreement, defendants' using salary surveys, restricting wages, trying to avoid bidding wars, and seeing each other as competitors.	5.50	
02/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
02/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft oppositions to Ed Leamer briefs.	9.80	
02/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to motions for summary judgment and confer with K. Dermody re same; conference with class members; conference with claims administrator; conference with co-counsel re summary judgment strategy; revise and serve mediation brief.	11.30	
02/03/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research statistical methods and background articles for opposition.	2.50	
02/03/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research on defendants' cases; draft material for brief on the same.	4.90	
02/03/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of deposition transcripts, emails for opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment; email memos on review results.	7.50	
02/04/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist D. Harvey and L. Cisneros with assembling materials for filing.	3.20	
02/04/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and edit motion to seal.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/04/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review expert reports and identify material for sealing.	3.00	
02/04/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on motion to strike.	2.80	
02/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit opposition briefs to Ed Leamer and Matthew Marx Dauberts and defendants' summary judgment motion; emails with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re summary judgment strategy; email Beatriz Mejia re Sheryl Sandberg declaration filing; emails re cost fund; email David Rotman, Karen Kukla re mediation.	6.50	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm deposition exhibit numbers to be added to brief.	0.50	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Discuss filing plan with Services Department and ensure materials prepared for court.	0.40	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	List certain supporting documents on declaration of D. Harvey and the declaration of L. Cisneros per D. Harvey's instructions.	4.00	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents being filed with the opposition to summary judgment on the internal computer drive. Create a folder on the internal computer drive for the mediation briefs.	0.30	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare merits reports for L. Cisneros.	0.30	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research depositions of Edward Leamer for D. Harvey fact questions.	0.60	
02/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.10	
02/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition briefs.	11.10	
02/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft opposition to summary judgment; review and revise oppositions to Daubert briefs; conference with class members; conference with co-counsel re filings; supervise preparation of reports.	10.30	
02/04/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft sections for opposition to motions for summary judgment.	4.10	
02/04/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Read and edit opposition to motion for summary judgment; pull citations for same per D. Harvey.	5.00	
02/04/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Discrete assignment: distinguish cases in Daubert opposition motion.	2.00	
02/04/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of deposition transcripts, emails for opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment; email memos on review results.	8.50	
02/05/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist D. Harvey and L. Cisneros with assembling materials for filing.	10.40	
02/05/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in preparing opposition briefs and Daubert motion and supporting documents.	7.00	
02/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Eric Cramer, team re Matthew Marx brief; email D. Harvey re edits to briefs; email with D. Harvey re Heffler.	3.00	
02/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to prepare exhibits from all declarations.	11.50	
02/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on hard copy filings and finalize overnight plan.	0.10	
02/05/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Office conference with T. Desouza re finalizing brief; cite check and fact check opposition to motion to strike reply report of Dr. Edward Leamer; memo to attorneys re fact quote and source issues in brief; office conference with T. Desouza re fact checking follow up.	3.60	
02/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition briefs.	9.80	
02/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise opposition to motions for summary judgment, Daubert motions, and all supporting papers, conference with team re same, supervise finalization efforts re same.	10.50	
02/05/14	JONES, ALEXA	Fact check brief; insert exhibit numbers into declaration.	3.70	
02/05/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull fact cites for opposition to summary judgment motion and input same.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/05/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Edit opposition to motion to strike; add introduction.	3.50	
02/05/14	SWENSON, YUN	Cite check Daubert opposition brief.	2.00	
02/05/14	SWENSON, YUN	Research deposition cites cited in Daubert opposition briefs.	3.20	
02/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re opposition to Daubert motions.	11.00	
02/05/14	WASKIEWICZ, GREGORY	Confer with B. Troxel regarding cite checking.	0.20	
02/05/14	WASKIEWICZ, GREGORY	Perform citation checking.	5.70	
02/05/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Cite checking assignment.	0.10	
02/05/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review of deposition transcripts, exhibits and other documentary evidence for opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment; email memos on review results.	9.80	
02/05/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Meet with D. Harvey to discuss review for opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.50	
02/06/14	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Review and run searches in briefs to confirm cites.	0.60	
02/06/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist D. Harvey and L. Cisneros with assembling materials for filing.	7.00	
02/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation of briefs and supporting documents to execute filing.	12.00	
02/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review and edit revised/final Ed Leamer, Matthew Marx and summary judgment briefs and many conferences with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same.	6.00	
02/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents for the opposition to summary judgment and Daubert filings.	13.00	
02/06/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Assist paralegals with brief and exhibits, finalizing, cite checking.	2.60	
02/06/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Update declarations; research academic article citations; proofread Daubert motions; format exhibit list in declaration; prepare exhibits; office conference with T. Desouza; cite check brief; fact check in brief; review deposition transcripts re citations for brief.	8.50	
02/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize briefs, confer with K. Dermody re same.	6.80	
02/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise finalization of briefs; read case law and Google motion for summary judgment.	1.80	
02/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Finalize all summary judgment and Daubert opposition briefs and supporting documents, confer with K. Dermody, supervise filing and service of same.	15.20	
02/06/14	HIPPLE, CHANDRA	Assist with motion for summary judgment and Daubert opposition filings.	7.00	
02/06/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles and texts for T. Desouza.	0.30	
02/06/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding distinguishing defendants' cases.	0.20	
02/06/14	SWENSON, YUN	Filing assistance.	0.10	
02/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re opposition to Daubert motions.	7.00	
02/06/14	WU, LESLIE	Assist filing of Daubert opposition motion exhibits with H. Schurman, T. Desouza and C. Hipple.	0.80	
02/06/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Correspond re class member intake.	0.10	
02/06/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Email T. Desouza re class member intake.	0.10	
02/07/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist D. Harvey and L. Cisneros with assembling filing materials for service.	3.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize motion to seal and oversee preparation of documents and filing and provide further coordination on filing.	2.30	
02/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review docket, consult with K. Dermody and D. Harvey regarding motion to seal and file proof of service.	1.50	
02/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re mediation documents; email with L. Cisneros re Sheryl Sandberg notice; review Heffler letter and email Heffler re same; confer with D. Harvey re sealing stipulation; email with Emily Henn, David Kiernan re sealing.	1.00	
02/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare hard copy filings and finalize them overnight.	12.00	
02/07/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Assist with preparing documents for service.	0.70	
02/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise lodging and filing of paper materials; conference with defense counsel re stipulation extending time, review and revise draft stipulation; email with K. Dermody and draft correspondence to mediator re claims administrator.	7.50	
02/07/14	HIPPLE, CHANDRA	Assist with motion for summary judgment and Daubert opposition filings.	10.00	
02/07/14	SCHURMAN, HANNA	Work on Daubert opposition filing.	1.20	
02/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare opposition re Daubert motions for filing and service.	5.00	
02/07/14	WU, LESLIE	Work with T. Desouza, H. Schurman and C. Hipple on the Daubert motion filings.	10.00	
02/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with class member re status; respond to reporter re case.	0.50	
02/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit draft case management conference statement and confer with D. Harvey re same; review defendants' errata filings; telephone conference with media re case and prepare for same; review claims statistics and email Emily Henn re same; email Heffler re email notice; email B. Glackin re jury work; email with T. Desouza re Daubert brief.	1.50	
02/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create mediation binders for D. Harvey, K. Dermody, and B. Glackin.	0.50	
02/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize exhibits for plaintiffs' opposition to Daubert motions on the internal computer drive and organize other files related to that motion.	1.50	
02/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to class member calls.	0.20	
02/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	1.00	
02/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft case management conference statement and confer with K. Dermody; review defendants' errata filings; review defendants' opposition to plaintiffs' Daubert motion; research rule of reason issues given briefing to date; research mock trial preparations.	5.50	
02/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails responding to media re case status; confer with D. Harvey re filings.	0.50	
02/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents from plaintiffs' opposition to defendants' motions for summary judgments and Daubert briefs for D. Harvey.	0.20	
02/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize war room.	0.30	
02/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research docket re deposition exhibits for D. Harvey.	2.00	
02/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel chart with new intakes.	0.50	
02/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement motion, conference with K. Dermody re same; revise case management statement; research plaintiff declarations.	2.20	
02/12/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Research settlement materials.	0.80	
02/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised case management conference statement and email D. Harvey re same; email B. Glackin re case management issues; call D. Harvey re final approval assignments.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Calls with class members.	0.20	
02/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create drafts of errata sheets for Alan Manning and Edward Leamer for B. Glackin.	2.00	
02/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize plaintiffs' opposition to summary judgment for D. Harvey.	0.40	
02/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review deposition exhibits and bates documents from the summary judgment and class certification filings and start to compile a trial exhibit list for B. Glackin. Group documents by defendant and organize in chronological order within each defendant.	3.50	
02/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Ed Leamer errata review.	1.20	
02/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re trial planning; review Alan Manning errata. Review invoices and cost fund information and conference with K. Dermody; draft letter to Joseph Saveri re hours and cost fund.	3.30	
02/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement issue; research strategy and deadlines through trial; email with K. Dermody and review and revise case management conference statement, e-file same; research reply in support of our Daubert motion.	2.60	
02/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft trial exhibit list.	5.50	
02/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email responses to media questions and review filing re same; email Joe Saveri, Robert Van Nest re mediation; email Lee Rubin re call; email re mediation.	1.00	
02/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize erratas of Edward Leamer and Alan Manning for court reporters and defense counsel for B. Glackin.	0.60	
02/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare list of potential trial exhibits from all exhibits from the motion for summary judgment and class certification.	2.50	
02/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
02/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft trial exhibit list.	3.50	
02/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review revisions to the local rules for the Northern District of California and update D. Harvey re application here.	0.40	
02/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re mediation planning; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re Google notice issue and email team and Heffler re same; telephone conference with Phillips' assistant re mediation and call/email Joe Saveri re same.	1.00	
02/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize potential trial exhibit chart for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	2.00	
02/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize plaintiffs' opposition materials to the summary judgment and Daubert motions for D. Harvey.	1.00	
02/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' opposition to administrative motion; research reply in support of Daubert motion: research settlement motion; research mediation materials and prepare for mediation, conference with class representative research settlement motion; research mediation materials and prepare for mediation, conference with class representative research settlement motion; research motion; research settlement motion; resear	6.50	
02/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft trial exhibit list.	0.60	
02/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for mediation and email Joe Saveri and D. Harvey re	0.80	
02/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review , research, draft and revise answers.	3.50	
02/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend mediation and conference with LCHB team re same and follow-up work.	5.00	
02/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend mediation; research; conference with plaintiff Mark Fichtner re	7.10	
02/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re Sheryl Sandberg interview; email Lee Rubin re Google foreign workers; email Joe Saveri re settlement strategy; confer with D. Harvey re settlement motion.	0.50	
02/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders and indices for D. Harvey.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management per D. Harvey.	1.30	
02/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize deposition testimony cited in the declaration of L. Cisneros as part of plaintiffs' opposition to defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.50	
02/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.70	
02/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update potential class members Excel spreadsheet and contact claims administrator to send packets out.	1.20	
02/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft settlement brief and supporting papers; confer with K. Dermody re same; conference with claims administrator re notice issues; draft and revise email notice; review Court's order re administrative motion; conference with mediator re mediation, research and prepare for same; email with K. Dermody re Sheryl Sandberg.	4.10	
02/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re reminders; meet with R. Heimann re trial and email R. Heimann re same; email with team, and jury issues; edit class representative declaration; confer with D. Harvey re Adobe, trial preparation and Heffler; email re witness preparation; email Beatriz Meija re Sheryl Sandberg meeting; confer with L. Cisneros re assignments; email re retainer.	2.00	
02/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create last binders from plaintiffs' opposition to Daubert and summary judgment motions and place in the war room for D. Harvey.	0.20	
02/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create outline for D. Harvey listing the parties, attorneys and potential witnesses, per his specific instructions.	2.10	
02/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find various documents for D. Harvey.	0.80	
02/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive. Organize information re plaintiffs to the internal computer drive.	1.30	
02/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel sheet with class members that contacted the firm and e-mail them to answer any questions they may have. E-mail claims administrator to verify class members and send out an additional packet to a claimant.	1.60	
02/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft Pizar/Intuit settlement motion and supporting papers, conference with K. Dermody and L. Cisneros re same; conference with defendants re pretrial schedule and notice issues, draft summary and research same; research and draft reminder notices for email and postcards; research mediation and settlement issues, conference with K. Dermody re same.	6.50	
02/19/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Conference with K. Dermody re trial.	0.20	
02/19/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review case file for trial preparation.	0.90	
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize case filings re trial preparation.	2.00	
02/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with settlement brief preparation.	2.40	
02/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re call with .	0.10	
02/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Email the claims administrator to follow up on requests for potential class members. Update Excel spreadsheet with new information.	0.80	
02/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research interrogatory requests, deposition dates, and how many subpoenas were issued to the past and present plaintiff employers for D. Harvey.	1.60	
02/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update deadline chart with Judge Koh's pretrial standing order per D. Harvey's instructions. Ensure Calendar has all the deadlines in the system.	1.50	
02/20/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives re Pixar/Intuit settlement declarations and ongoing settlement discussions; research settlement motion; research jury consultant issues; research potential trial witnesses.	3.50	
02/20/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review file for trial preparation.	2.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/20/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Research re reply on Daubert motion.	1.50	
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize pleadings re trial preparation.	0.60	
02/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with D. Harvey regarding settlement brief and begin preparing supporting materials.	2.00	
02/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Email potential class members to keep them updated on their specific questions and ensure the claims administrator will respond to requests from potential class members.	0.60	
02/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize files and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.80	
02/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement brief, conference with L. Cisneros re same; conference with class representatives re status of case and settlement strategy; research trial strategy and potential witnesses.	3.40	
02/21/14	SRINIVASAN, DARSANA	Research re reply on Daubert motion; draft motion.	3.50	
02/23/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on settlement approval documents.	5.50	
02/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research regarding settlement approval standards.	1.50	
02/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on settlement approval documents.	1.00	
02/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research for D. Harvey various documents from the the documents defendants' filed with their proposed redactions.	0.80	
02/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	3.00	
02/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify all deadlines in the calendar per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.60	
02/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re pending projects.	0.40	
02/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft reply brief re Daubert.	0.50	
02/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft mediation brief and conference with mediator's office; draft statement in response to Court's order re settlement discussions; research reply in support of Daubert motion; conference with defendants re sealing requests and service, review filings re same; research jury issues.	5.70	
02/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on Pixar/Intuit settlement approval documents.	4.00	
02/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Speak with class members. Forward names to claims administrator to follow up with certain people.	0.70	
02/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	1.80	
02/25/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Pixar/Intuit settlement brief; office conference with D. Harvey about trial witness ordering.	1.60	
02/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft settlement update, conference with defense counsel re same; conference with claims administrator re notice process: revise mediation brief: review and revise draft brief, conference with B. Glackin re same;	5.50	
02/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case filings re trial preparation.	0.60	
02/26/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Revise settlement approval documents.	2.80	
02/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review defendants' merits reports and find cites to interrogatory responses for B. Glackin. Research verifications for the 2012 interrogatory response. Research correspondence re same.	1.80	
02/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
02/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update potential class member Excel spreadsheet with new information.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/26/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft reply brief re Daubert motion.	4.40	
02/26/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise reply in support of Daubert motion; conference with defense counsel re settlement update statement. draft and e-file same; conference with class representatives re research estate issues.	5.60	
02/26/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review January and February 2014 docket re fact question; confer with D. Harvey re motion.	0.40	
02/27/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Cite check plaintiffs' reply to in support of motion to exclude expert testimony.	4.50	
02/27/14	CARNAM, TODD	Attempt to track down certain Westlaw citation with incorrect quotation cited.	0.60	
02/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on Daubert reply brief.	3.00	
02/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re Intel brief; email R. Heimann re trial preparation; email Joe Saveri, Gregory Stone re Heffler and Intel letter; email with Lee Rubin re Goodle foreign workers; email Joe Saveri re same; edit plaintiffs' reply on Daubert challenge; email with D. Harvey re	3.50	
02/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check brief, gather all new exhibits, reference all exhibits submitted on the docket already, insert edits from B. Glackin, create declaration, and instruct B. Troxel on chambers copies.	3.90	
02/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
02/27/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize reply brief in support of Daubert motion.	8.60	
02/27/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Mike Devine recorrespond with estate manager re same; review derendants replies in support of summary judgment and Daubert motions; revise reply in support of Daubert motion, draft supporting documents including motion to seal, supervise e-filing of same.	6.50	
02/27/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review/edit settlement motion and supporting documents.	2.50	
02/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare reply re motion to exclude testimony for filing.	4.90	
02/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to queries regarding settlement declarations.	0.40	
02/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit and revise Pixar/Intuit settlement brief and related documents and emails/calls with L. Cisneros, B. Glackin re same; telephone conference with Adobe and email Joe Saveri re same; review Daubert/summary judgment reply briefs and email B. Glackin re same; email Joe Saveri re reminder notice.	5.00	
02/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review reply briefs. Review draft settlement brief and K. Dermody declaration.	1.30	
02/28/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft K. Dermody declaration and proposed order; emails with team re same.	2.50	
02/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	1.00	
02/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy for reply re motion to exclude testimony.	1.20	
03/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re Adobe ; email team re same; email Gregory Stone re Heffler; call to Robert Mittelstaedt re Adobe.	0.50	
03/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on Pixar/Intuit settlement documents.	5.50	
03/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with R. Heimann re trial preparation; edit attorney declarations for settlement filing and email L. Cisneros, B. Glackin re same; email team re verdict; jury pool; email Gregory Stone re Heffler; email Lee Rubin re Google foreign workers; telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re Adobe; email/call to Joe Saveri re same.	2.00	
03/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, revise Pixar/Intuit settlement declaration.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/02/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Email with K. Dermody re trial.	0.10	
03/03/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Revise Pixar/Intuit settlement brief and related papers.	2.00	
03/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit Pixar/Intuit settlement brief and emails with L. Cisneros, LCHB team re same; conference with M. Cordon and J. Fanucchi re cost reporting; meet with B. Glackin re summary judgment argument and trial issues; meet with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and R. Heimann re pretrial preparation; telephone conference with Emily Henn re Heffler; telephone conference with Gregory Stone re Heffler and notice; telephone conference with Robert Mittelstaedt re Adobe and email Joe Saveri re same; email Melissa Baldwin re Heffler issues; emails with	6.00	
03/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binder with recent round of defendants' briefing for summary judgment for D. Harvey.	0.80	
03/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with class member intakes, and call and email them to answer questions. Contact claims administrator with questions.	2.00	
03/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read reply briefs; review/revise Pixar/Intuit settlement brief; trial planning meeting with R. Heimann, K. Dermody and D. Harvey; meeting with K. Dermody re next steps.	5.60	
03/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference re trial strategy with R. Heimann, K. Dermody, and B. Glackin, prepare for same, follow up with K. Dermody, B. Glackin re same, draft and circulate summary re same.	3.50	
03/03/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Team meeting re trial preparation.	1.60	
03/03/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review trial filings in Apple v. Samsung case for related issue here.	0.10	
03/03/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with B. Glackin re pretrial communications; pull and review schedules for same.	1.00	
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re pending case deadlines for attorney review.	0.40	
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re pending hearing dates for attorney review.	0.50	
03/04/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct follow up research, and revise Pixar/Intuit settlement filing.	3.00	
03/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise brief and documents for Pixar/Intuit settlement filing and many calls/emails with L. Cisneros re same; meeting with B. Glackin re settlement documents: draft and email with Joe Saveri re same: telephone conference with Lee Rubin, Heffler re Google foreign workers; email Heffler re Intel.	6.50	
03/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list containing all the addresses of deponents who are potential trial witnesses for B. Glackin.	0.50	
03/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders for all Daubert and summary judgment filings from last week for B. Glackin.	1.20	
03/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare materials for D. Harvey re Matthew Marx Daubert briefing with supporting exhibits.	2.00	
03/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft mock jury script.	1.90	
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re settlement approval brief.	0.40	
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft settlement materials.	1.50	
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review settlement declarations.	0.30	
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with A. Shaver, defendants re pretrial schedule.	0.60	
03/04/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research settlement cases for B. Glackin.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/04/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review scheduling orders and case calendar and update entries; review Judge Koh's standing order on pretrial exchanges; conference call with B. Glackin and defendants re same; email summary of defendants' proposal on scheduling to team; edit settlement brief; edit K. Dermody declaration in support of same and proposed order in support of same; draft D. Harvey declaration in support of same; telephone calls with L. Cisneros re filing logistics and planning.	5.00	
03/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare cases re Daubert motions for D. Harvey's review.	4.00	
03/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for R. Heimann's review.	0.60	
03/04/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Call from potential class member re settlement notice.	0.10	
03/05/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on finalizing brief and related papers and oversee the filing.	8.00	
03/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize brief, declarations, order for Pixar/Intuit settlement filing: many conferences with L. Cisneros re same; conference with Joe Saveri and Layn Phillips re management conference statement.	11.00	
03/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to research deponents and find their home or business addresses for B. Glackin.	1.50	
03/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to callers and update Excel spreadsheet. Contact claims administrators to follow up on class members.	1.00	
03/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on filing for L. Cisneros. Gather all exhibits and organize everything on the internal computer drive.	2.50	
03/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft mock jury script; review materials.	7.10	
03/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft case management conference statement and draft reminder notice.	0.30	
03/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Joseph Saveri edits to Pixar/Intuit settlement brief.	0.30	
03/05/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft case management statement; emails with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; finalize D. Harvey declaration; email Joseph Saveri re stipulation with defendants; telephone calls with K. Dermody re same; review filing papers.	3.30	
03/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement motion for filing.	5.80	
03/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Coordinate service and review of courtesy copies.	0.20	
03/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding posting of filings on websites for settlement, LCHB and co-counsel.	1.30	
03/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and edit focus group script.	0.80	
03/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Supervise filing issues.	1.50	
03/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Long day working on joint case management conference filing - many rounds of edits; emails and calls with A. Shaver: email ; edit draft focus group script; email Layn Phillips re Google request; calls/email with L. Cisneros re completing settlement filing.	9.50	
03/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create chambers copies for L. Cisneros of the settlement filing. Organize binders, create index.	2.00	
03/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all bates documents referenced in the focus group script for B. Glackin.	0.60	
03/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.80	
03/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft mock jury script.	2.80	
03/06/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit joint statement; emails with defendants re same; emails and conference call with K. Dermody and Joseph Saveri re same; prepare exhibits for same and e-file same; email team re pretrial disclosures; redline jury focus group script and emails with B. Glackin re same.	12.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for R. Heimann's review.	6.00	
03/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with B. Glackin regarding filing follow up.	0.30	
03/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class settlement website to answer class member questions.	0.40	
03/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with team re jury issues; same: conference call with Joe Saveri and ; emails/calls with Joe Saveri, B. Glackin re ; email E. Fastiff re ; email E. Fastiff re ; telephone conference with Herrier re call logs; call to Gregory Stone re case management conference statement; meeting with A. Shaver re filing; email Citibank re Qualified Settlement Fund; emails with D. Harvey re focus group script.	4.00	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binders with the new filing.	0.20	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize potential trial exhibit binders with B. Troxel. Create indices.	2.00	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research home addresses of potential witnesses from the seven defendants for subpoenas for B. Glackin.	1.30	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls from class members and update the Excel spreadsheet. Email the claims administrator re information.	0.70	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
03/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
03/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft focus group verdict form; revise focus group script.	1.40	
03/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and conference with K. Dermody re same.	0.50	
03/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for R. Heimann's review.	4.00	
03/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri and Layn Phillips re	0.10	
03/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Layn Phillips re ; emails with LCHB team re same.	1.00	
03/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise focus group script.	1.30	
03/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with K. Dermody regarding filing assignment.	0.40	
03/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re and Joe Saveri re grand and conference with Joe Saveri re same; email LCHB team re review order re notice and edit proposed reminder notice; email David Kiernan re notice; email with Lee Rubin re Google request for data assistance; confer with D. Harvey re notice; email Heffler re notice schedule; meet with L. Cisneros re settlement filing assignment; email revised focus group script and edit same.	5.00	
03/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize final approval documents for D. Harvey.	2.50	
03/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize selected depositions into binders for R. Heimann.	0.50	
03/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research docket for publicly filed do not call agreement for focus group.	0.50	
03/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls to potential class members and contact the claims administrator to follow up on certain people.	2.00	
03/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re focus group script.	0.30	
03/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with re focus group script.	0.30	
03/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for summary judgment and Daubert hearings; review jury focus group script, conference with B. Glackin re same.	3.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/10/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review protective order and exhibits to jury script and emails with T. Desouza re same; review jury script from B. Glackin; review case calendar and update deadlines.	1.50	
03/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re media inquiry re named plaintiffs and email Joe Saveri re same; emails with A. Shaver re trial task list and follow-ups; email Heffler re project status; email K. Dugar re trial Litigation Support work; prepare for focus groups; email re Google.	1.00	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Contact claims administrator to get updates on potential class members. Contact potential class members to answer their questions and update Excel spreadsheet.	0.60	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize summary judgment, Daubert briefing, potential trial exhibits, and motions for final approval in the war room for D. Harvey.	0.50	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize trial binders for R. Heimann and place in the war room for his review.	1.30	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research list of documents for A. Shaver and determine whether they are on the public record or sealed by the court for the focus group discussion this weekend.	2.70	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research the Apple v. Samsung case management order and transcript for B. Glackin for application here.	0.70	
03/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re order; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re same; office conference with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re trial planning.	0.80	
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft mock exhibits for focus group.	0.30	
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise focus group script.	0.50	
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Tina Sessions re pretrial issue.	0.30	
03/11/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare demonstrative for trial.	2.00	
03/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re pretrial issues; review potential trial witnesses and exhibits, draft summary re same; confer with K. Dermody re trial tasks and research Daubert arguments; review pretrial task list; research motion for final approval of settlements.	5.60	
03/11/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Update case schedule; conference call with defendants re pretrial disclosures; email with K. Dermody re trial tasks and create task schedule for team meeting on same; create exhibits for jury focus group and edit script for same; analyze whether exhibits are correct under confidentiality order.	4.00	
03/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvev re Layn Phillips re ; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re trial preparation and focus group work; email Layn Phillips re	2.00	
03/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls from potential class members and update Excel spreadsheet.	0.60	
03/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update all the jury focus group materials for A. Shaver.	1.00	
03/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Confer with K. Dermody re focus group; review/revise mock juror discussion guides/questionnaires.	1.30	
03/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Finalize and circulate jury focus group script and exhibits for same; emails with T. Desouza re same.	0.70	
03/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend team meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, R. Heimann, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re trial preparation; email with D. Harvey re and case law re same.	2.00	
03/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate materials for B. Glackin from Lauren Stiroh's report.	0.70	
03/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review packets for the jury focus group for A. Shaver and confirm for distribution.	0.90	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Excel spreadsheet with potential class members and return calls from those who have left voicemail and emails. Contact claims administrators with people who need specific follow up.	1.50	
03/13/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Trial preparation and staffing follow up.	1.50	
03/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Trial planning meeting with LCHB team.	1.40	
03/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with LCHB team re trial strategy and pretrial tasks and plan: review materials for iury focus groups; review defendants' reply briefs in support of Daubert motions; research production.	8.10	
03/13/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Team meeting re trial preparation (partial attendance).	0.80	
03/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with LCHB attornev team re pretrial tasks and responsibilities; review focus group materials; recap from K. Dermody on	1.50	
03/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	LCHB trial team meeting.	1.40	
03/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with ; email Layn Phillips re .	0.20	
03/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research deposition cites from both Kevin Hallock reports, Matthew Marx reports and the opposition brief to summary judgment.	1.00	
03/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research motions in limine; research trial exhibits; research trial testimony; research trial witnesses; review jury focus group scripts and question guides; research order of proof; review sealing order, conference with defendants and team re same; review stipulation and order re document admissibility.	8.20	
03/14/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for trial; review potential trial consultants.	2.90	
03/14/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding trial plan and assignment.	0.20	
03/14/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with L. Cisneros and D. Harvey re stipulation on exhibit admissibility; telephone call with Cristina Brown re sealing order.	0.50	
03/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for L. Cisneros' review.	1.00	
03/15/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review model jury instructions and provide proposals to B. Glackin.	0.70	
03/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel to and from and attend juror focus groups and conference with team re same; review notes.	10.00	
03/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Focus groups work.	10.20	
03/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend jury focus groups, travel re same, review notes and summarize same.	11.20	
03/15/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to/from and attend jury focus panels in .	9.50	
03/16/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to class member inquiry.	0.10	
03/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with L. Cisneros re class member intakes.	0.20	
03/17/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Help prepare trial exhibits related to Apple, Inc. per L. Cisneros. Email with A. Jones and L. Cisneros regarding same.	2.10	
03/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend debriefing meeting on focus groups.	1.00	
03/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for compliance filing in regarding to the court's sealing order.	2.00	
03/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to class member inquiry.	0.20	
03/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on logistics planning for trial.	1.00	
03/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with Joe Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros and with LCHB team re mock trial assignments; email Joe Saveri re mock assignments; email A. Snaver re draft case management conference statement; emails with D. Harvey re class member inquiries; email L. Cisneros re trial war room; email LCHB team re settlement statistics.	3.00	
03/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock jury planning meeting.	2.80	
03/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review list of potential motions in limine.	0.20	
03/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research motions in limine: conference with defense counsel re sealing motions; research motion for final approval; conference with Mike Devine re conference with jury consultant re mock trial and focus groups.	9.20	
03/17/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	4.20	
03/17/14	JONES, ALEXA	Update trial exhibit list; add deposition authentication and other information about the documents.	3.50	
03/17/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with attorney team and jury consultants; draft case management conference statement; telephone call with defendants re sealing order and conference with D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re same; team emails re trial logistics.	5.80	
03/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare mock jury documents for B. Glackin's review.	0.50	
03/18/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Help prepare trial exhibits related to Apple, Inc. per L. Cisneros. Email with A. Jones and L. Cisneros regarding same.	2.80	
03/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparations for mock trial.	1.00	
03/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up calls to the courtroom deputy and jury commissioner.	0.10	
03/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to query regarding declaration of Sheryl Sandberg.	0.50	
03/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list and related issues.	2.00	
03/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on jury materials and confer with B. Glackin, K. Dermody and D. Harvey.	0.90	
03/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Joe Saveri, Layn Phillips re settlement; email LCHB team re Sheryl Sandberg/Kevin Hallock; email team re Robert Van Nest language for case management conference; confer with L. Cisneros re jury.	0.40	
03/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re pretrial deadlines and order re authentication; research issues re research and draft motion for final settlement approval; revise motions in limine list, conference with co-counsel resame; conference with B. Glackin re mock trial preparation.	7.60	
03/18/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	5.70	
03/18/14	JONES, ALEXA	Update trial exhibit list; add deposition authentication and other information about the documents.	3.60	
03/18/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone call with D. Harvey and defendants re stipulation and order on authenticity; revise case management conference statement and draft email to defendants re same; review emails from L. Cisneros on Jury Commissioner.	3.50	
03/19/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Help prepare trial exhibits related to Apple, Inc. and Pixar per L. Cisneros.	4.80	
03/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Meet with M. Mugrage and K. Dugar regarding litigation support for trial.	0.40	
03/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	1.50	
03/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on planning for trial.	1.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on preparations to comply with the court's sealing order.	2.50	
03/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Revise/edit draft case management conference statement and confer with A. Shaver re same; email Layn Phillips, Joe Saveri re settlement; review letter re reminder notice; email B. Glackin re mock trial work; email Lee Rubin re Google letter; review draft letter re judgment sharing agreement; email with D. Harvey re plaintiff/media; email opt-out re request; telephone conference with reporter re case status; confer with D. Harvey re trial witnesses.	2.80	
03/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meet with B. Glackin about creating demonstratives for mock trial.	0.30	
03/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research Intuit's potential trial exhibit and add information to an Excel chart with relevant information for L. Cisneros.	2.50	
03/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research the Matthew Marx and Kevin Hallock reports, pull all deposition cites into an Excel chart for B. Glackin.	1.80	
03/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
03/19/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Conference call with L. Cisneros and M. Mugrage re upcoming trial needs.	0.50	
03/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with D. Harvey and Litigation Support re mock trial.	0.50	
03/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft letter re	0.20	
03/19/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Create demonstrative for use with mock trial.	1.00	
03/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft motion for final approval; conference with claims administrator re opt-out and notice questions; meeting with B. Glackin and prepare for mock trial; review correspondence reconference with class member re potential trial testimony.	9.20	
03/19/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	7.60	
03/19/14	JONES, ALEXA	Update trial exhibit list; add deposition authentication and other information about the documents.	4.70	
03/19/14	MUGRAGE, MAJOR	Prepare presentations, exhibits and deposition video clips for mock trial.	4.00	
03/19/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Cisneros regarding trial preparation.	0.20	
03/19/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review defendants' comments to case management conference statement and revise same; review Joseph Saveri's letter on and emails with team re same; draft joint pretrial statement and read summary judgment opposition for conference statement, and emails with L. Cisneros and D. Harvey re sealing order filing; correspondence with defendants, D. Harvey, and K. Dermody re case management conference statement.	7.80	
03/20/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Help prepare trial exhibits related to Pixar and LucasFilm, Inc. per L. Cisneros.	4.60	
03/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend LCHB team meeting re trial (partial).	1.20	
03/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft proposed agenda for team meeting and update task list.	1.20	
03/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	0.50	
03/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	2.00	
03/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re settlement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; meet with R. Heimann, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver, L. Cisneros re trial preparation; email with D. Harvey re privileged document; review/edit case management conference statement; conference with Kevin Hallock re expert trial preparation; email Layn Phillips re email Joe Saveri re assignment for mock trial; call to Beringer re Sheryl Sandberg trial preparation; mock trial work.	4.50	
03/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Gather list of documents for compliance with order on motion to seal for L. Cisneros.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize potential trial exhibits based off R. Heimann's memorandum. Create index and insert date of every single document.	3.00	
03/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls of class members and update the Excel spreadsheet.	0.60	
03/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
03/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on potential trial exhibit chart for L. Cisneros.	1.20	
03/20/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert argument; office conference with D. Harvey.	1.80	
03/20/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research TrialGraphix litigation trial support; contact same.	0.30	
03/20/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re witnesses; trial preparation.	2.50	
03/20/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare materials for use with mock trial.	1.00	
03/20/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re case management statement, research same, revise same, file same; conference with team re preparing for trial and related tasks; review potential witnesses; review potential exhibits; research and draft motion for final approval.	10.20	
03/20/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation; team meeting.	6.80	
03/20/14	JONES, ALEXA	Update trial exhibit list; add deposition authentication and other information about the documents.	0.50	
03/20/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Meet with trial team re witness designations; pull claims administration declarations for D. Harvey; emails re case management conference statement and trial accommodations.	2.50	
03/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research for jury instructions.	1.60	
03/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Finalize list for filing to comply with the court's sealing order and supervise filing.	10.00	
03/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on pretrial documents.	0.30	
03/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	0.40	
03/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re produced document; email Joe Saveri re ; email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re ; email Beringer re Sheryl Sandberg interview; email inter re document production; mock trial work.	1.00	
03/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create argument binders for B. Glackin for the motion to strike and the motion to exclude.	3.00	
03/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate deposition videos needed for B. Glackin's demonstrative.	0.50	
03/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate multiple deposition transcripts for A. Shaver.	0.20	
03/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents for filing to comply with order on motion to seal and update Excel chart in the process to keep track of everything for L. Cisneros.	1.50	
03/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research Intel documents for D. Harvey.	0.60	
03/21/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert argument.	3.60	
03/21/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise opposition to motion to strike case management conference statement.	0.80	
03/21/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Shona Brown transcript for trial preparation; prepare for Daubert argument.	1.90	
03/21/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare material for use with mock trial.	3.00	
03/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re document request; research and draft final approval brief; conference with team re pretrial preparation; research and draft opposition to motion to strike; conference with experts re trial preparation.	8.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/21/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for trial.	3.20	
03/21/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Export document to PDF for review.	0.50	
03/21/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Update all files related to document identification 76579DOC17469.	1.00	
03/21/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Cisneros regarding trial planning.	0.10	
03/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert hearing.	4.50	
03/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert hearing.	6.30	
03/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Daubert and summary judgment oral argument.	4.50	
03/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding compliance filing.	0.50	
03/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	0.20	
03/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with LCHB team re case management conference, settlement and media; calls with D. Harvey re unsealed documents; respond to media intakes; trial preparation.	1.00	
03/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list of documents cited in the Matthew Marx Daubert briefing for D. Harvey.	1.00	
03/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize subsection of trial exhibits for R. Heimann. Organize in chronological order and update the index.	3.50	
03/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls to potential class members and update Excel spreadsheet.	0.50	
03/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update motion to strike and motion to exclude argument binders for B. Glackin.	1.50	
03/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert argument.	10.80	
03/24/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare for mock trial.	4.00	
03/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and prepare for oral argument on Daubert and summary judgment; confer with K. Dermody re public documents.	11.40	
03/24/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	5.70	
03/24/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit final approval brief; draft K. Dermody declaration and proposed order re same; review Bruce Chizen deposition exhibits for trial preparation.	5.00	
03/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding class member communications.	0.70	
03/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding trial.	0.40	
03/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review supplemental interrogatory responses for assignment re same.	0.70	
03/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on mock jury instructions.	3.30	
03/25/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re media, case management conference, class claims.	0.50	
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate pretrial statements for A. Shaver.	0.20	
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize conspiracy exhibits for R. Heimann. Add documents to his binder and update index.	0.90	
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails from class members for D. Harvey. Contact claims administrator with names for follow up.	1.50	
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review the conspiracy documents for R. Heimann and organize on the internal computer drive for B. Glackin.	1.10	
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update cases in D. Harvey's binder containing Matthew Marx Daubert briefing.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update the motion to exclude argument binder for B. Glackin.	1.50	
03/25/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Daubert hearing preparation.	10.10	
03/25/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare mock trial demonstratives.	2.50	
03/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for oral argument re Daubert motions and joint motion for summary judgment; conference and supervise claims administrator.	11.20	
03/25/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	5.20	
03/25/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review jury instructions from L. Cisneros; read Bruce Chizen deposition and designate deposition video clips; draft joint pretrial statement; emails with team re mock trial; review emails with claims administrator re opt-out letters.	7.00	
03/26/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Address class member inquiries.	0.40	
03/26/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to query from co-counsel regarding class certification record.	0.70	
03/26/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	0.80	
03/26/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for case management conference; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re summary judgment/Daubert arguments; review/edit Heffler declaration re compliance; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re claims issues; trial preparation: email with mediator re issues.	6.00	
03/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents for the conspiracy exhibit binder for R. Heimann.	1.00	
03/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize multiple rounds of class certification and summary judgment briefing onto the file share system for co-counsel.	0.70	
03/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare material for the summary judgment hearing.	2.50	
03/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails from potential class members and update the Excel spreadsheet with new information.	1.50	
03/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update B. Glackin's argument binder for motion to exclude in preparation for Thursday's hearing.	0.70	
03/26/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Daubert hearing.	9.80	
03/26/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare mock trial demonstratives.	3.00	
03/26/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for oral argument; correspond with Heffler re claims administration, research same.	8.40	
03/26/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	5.90	
03/26/14	NELSON, ROBERT	Meet with R. Heimann re trial strategy.	0.30	
03/26/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding Daubert hearing; legal research for the same.	0.70	
03/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Confer with team re hearing preparation.	0.60	
03/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case management statement for instruction.	0.10	
03/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend court hearing.	5.00	
03/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare for hearing and ensure team has materials for same.	1.00	
03/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class member objections and conduct research and other follow up concerning the objections.	0.80	
03/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for case management conference and meet with team re same; travel to and from hearing and attend hearing; conference with media; return class member emails; review materials re potential trial witness; edit Heffler compliance declaration.	9.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare binders for L. Cisneros and D. Harvey for the summary judgment and Daubert hearings.	1.50	
03/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Provide support in court with the trial team in San Jose for the summary judgment hearing.	5.50	
03/27/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and attend Daubert hearing.	6.90	
03/27/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Preparation for mock trial.	4.00	
03/27/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for case management conference and motions hearing, attend and argue same, travel re same, conference with team re same.	10.20	
03/27/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Trial preparation.	2.30	
03/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation - gather documents.	0.50	
03/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for attorney review.	5.00	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding class member inquiries regarding settlement.	0.70	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding trial witness review.	0.50	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and assist with settlement administrator compliance filing.	0.50	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review hearing transcript and draft letter to settlement administrator regarding the same.	0.40	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Update team regarding necessary preparation for mock trial.	0.30	
03/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	2.00	
03/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit Heffler declaration and email D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joseph Saveri re ; email LCHB team re and mock trial; email Emily Henn re claims; email with Lee Rubin re Google workers; review media reports re case in preparation for jury work; review materials re trial witnesses; prepare for mock.	6.00	
03/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management.	0.80	
03/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare documents for R. Heimann regarding all his memoranda regarding the conspiracy trial exhibit documents and selected deposition transcripts.	2.60	
03/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare for co-counsel all summary judgment briefing per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
03/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research transcript and follow up with court reporter.	0.60	
03/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
03/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Joseph Saveri re case management.	0.60	
03/28/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and file claims administrator affidavit of compliance, conference with claims administrator re same; review court's order re summary iudgment motions; research motions in limine, conference with team re same; conference with class representatives re	8.20	
03/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare potential trial exhibits for attorney review.	5.00	
03/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case calendar re pending pretrial dates for assignment and related material re Heffler affidavit.	0.40	
03/29/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Dani Lambert deposition testimony and exhibits; review/revise mock trial instruction and verdict forms.	3.50	
03/30/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Jan Van Der Voort deposition video and documents re trial witness selection project.	6.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Mark Bentley deposition testimony and exhibits; memorandum re Mark Bentley and Dani Lambert; review proposed trial exhibits.	4.60	
03/31/14	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Locate case document.	0.30	
03/31/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Research Judge Koh trial calendar per A. Shaver.	0.30	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend LCHB team trial preparation meeting (partial attendance).	1.20	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Research for jury questionnaire.	1.00	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review Jeff Vijungco deposition and documents for trial witness project.	3.50	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review task list, trial preparation schedule and update accordingly.	0.50	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	0.80	
03/31/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on preparation for mock trial.	0.40	
03/31/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review materials re witness lists/exhibits; edit draft final approval brief; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re conference with Brad Phillips re legal standard briefing schedule; telephone conference with Emily Henn re objectors. final approval; meeting with LCHB trial team re trial preparation; meet with B. Glackin re mock trial; email re mock trial.	9.50	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create a list of all the video depositions on file for L. Cisneros.	1.10	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research case management order for D. Harvey referenced by Judge Koh in her recent order on discussing objections during trial.	0.30	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research the deposition DVD of Jeffrey Vijungco for L. Cisneros.	0.40	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review selected deposition transcripts by D. Harvey from Google and identify testimony cited in class certification briefing, the opposition to summary judgment, and all plaintiff expert reports. Prepare exhibit binders made for each of the selected deponents.	2.50	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
03/31/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update the Excel spreadsheet with new potential class members and return calls and emails to them.	1.00	
03/31/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with D. Harvey re settlement and trial strategies.	0.40	
03/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial preparation.	2.70	
03/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; LCHB team meeting re selection of trial witnesses.	2.80	
03/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; office conference with K. Dermody re mock trial.	1.10	
03/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Arnnon Geshuri and Shona Brown documents for trial preparation.	3.20	
03/31/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for mock trial; review deposition transcripts and exhibits for trial disclosures; conference with LCHB team re pretrial tasks and strategy; conference with defense counsel re legal standard briefing and pretrial disclosures; conference with E. Fastiff re case.	11.10	
03/31/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for LCHB team meeting; team meeting re trial preparation.	2.20	
03/31/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to San Jose; attend jury selection in Apple v. Samsung trial to advise team re Judge Koh voir dire practices; return travel.	10.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pretrial filings for attorney review.	0.50	
04/01/14	CARNAM, TODD	Arrange for extra help in preparing trial exhibits for High-Tech Cold Calling.	0.40	
04/01/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document and deposition review, and work on trial exhibit and witness lists.	6.50	
04/01/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to class member inquiry.	0.50	
04/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re settlement; review Google witness trial exhibits; pull Omid Kordestani testimony re board investment; review Lucas documents re gentlewomen's agreement; prepare for mock trial and meet with A. Shaver re same; draft mock trial script; emails with team re recruiting evidence; confer with A. Shaver re Judge Koh voir dire during Apple-Samsung trial.	10.00	
04/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Follow up on class member calls for the class action lawsuit. Update Excel chart with new information.	2.00	
04/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize hot documents selected by R. Heimann.	2.00	
04/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research deposition videos of various deponents.	0.50	
04/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial preparation.	7.60	
04/01/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare mock trial materials.	6.00	
04/01/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for mock trial presentation; research and revise pretrial disclosures, conference with team re same; review potential trial exhibits, witnesses, and testimony.	11.20	
04/01/14	LEITNER-ZIEFF, ARIEL	Review exhibits and enter important information in the spreadsheet. Search through transcripts for relevant discussion of the exhibits. Discuss project with T. Desouza.	2.50	
04/01/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Edit and revise memorandum in support of final approval, A. Shaver declaration and proposed order for same; conference with K. Dermody re mock trial preparation; review conspiracy memo from R. Heimann; conference with L. Cisneros re trial witness review process; prepare presentation for mock trial.	9.90	
04/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft trial exhibit list.	4.50	
04/02/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Review briefs and expert reports and create a list of depositions cited therein. Cull per D. Harvey	3.70	
04/02/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Review expert reports to check that all deposition exhibits and bates stamped documents cited therein are on the exhibit list. Email with T. Desouza regarding same.	1.50	
04/02/14	CARNAM, TODD	For mock trial, calculate the net worths of various executives at Google, Apple, Lucasfilm, and Pixar, as well as (a) the percentage of their net worths, at the end of the class period, attributed to shares in their companies' stock, and (b) how that percentage would be changed by a 5% difference in their company's stock price.	3.80	
04/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document and deposition review, and work on trial exhibit and witness lists.	7.50	
04/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on planning for trial.	0.30	
04/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Layn Phillips re presentation; emails representation and prepare mock trial presentation; emails referenced re	10.30	
04/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue exhibit chart for L. Cisneros.	3.80	
04/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find documents for A. Shaver.	0.30	
04/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare mock trial materials for K. Dermody throughout the day.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/02/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Provide assistance to the High-Tech Cold Calling team with trial exhibit list and exhibit preparation.	5.50	
04/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial preparation.	0.50	
04/02/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with the design of demonstratives for use with mock trial.	7.00	
04/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re pretrial issues; research and revise disclosure lists; confer with J. Zaul re trial exhibit review; prepare presentation for mock trial, research and revise same.	8.30	
04/02/14	LEITNER-ZIEFF, ARIEL	Review trial exhibits and enter important information in the spreadsheet. Search through transcripts for relevant discussion of the exhibits. Discuss project with T. Desouza and L. Cisneros.	4.00	
04/02/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull exhibits for mock trial and develop presentation for same; emails re same with team; review co-counsel witness list; emails with team re designation categories for exhibit and witness lists; read deposition of Eric Schmidt for trial preparation.	6.00	
04/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Revise draft trial exhibit list.	6.00	
04/02/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; trial preparation review.	1.70	
04/02/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails on review project.	0.10	
04/02/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Review project call with D. Harvey.	0.20	
04/03/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Research deposition transcripts and exhibits regarding the number of recruiters, and defense witness statements re importance of cold calling and why passive sourcing of employees is better.	3.90	
04/03/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Review expert reports to make sure that all deposition exhibits and listed documents are on the trial exhibit list.	1.80	
04/03/14	CARNAM, TODD	Correspond with Hi-Tech Cold Calling paralegal team re deposition review project.	0.20	
04/03/14	CARNAM, TODD	For mock trial, calculate the net worths various executives at Google, Apple, Lucasfilm, and Pixar, as well as (a) the percentage of their net worths, at the end of the class period, attributed to shares in their companies' stock, and (b) how that percentage would be changed by a 5% difference in their company's stock price.	3.00	
04/03/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Attend mock trial team meeting.	3.00	
04/03/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document and deposition review, and work on trial exhibit and witness lists.	4.50	
04/03/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on planning for trial.	0.40	
04/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Attend jury focus group team meeting and prepare for mock trial; prepare slides to demonstratives; practice; email related issue; emails with team re trial witness list; email Layn Phillips re mediation and attend call with LLayn Phillips and Joe Saveri re same; meet with D. Harvey re plaintiff mock trial damages presentation and critique same.	12.00	
04/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize all B. Glackin's exhibits from mock trial.	2.50	
04/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare trial exhibit chart for disclosure for L. Cisneros.	3.80	
04/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search for key terms in the deposition of all Apple employees for D. Harvey.	0.50	
04/03/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Review expert reports and deposition exhibits re plaintiffs' trial exhibit list.	4.80	
04/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial preparation, meeting with team and jury consultant.	9.90	
04/03/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with the design of demonstratives for mock trial.	4.00	
04/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for mock trial presentation, research and revise same, conference with mock trial team and jury consultant re same; review exhibit and witness list, revise same.	11.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/03/14	LEITNER-ZIEFF, ARIEL	Review expert reports to identify exhibits and bates numbers. Fill in information for any exhibits that were not previously listed in the chart.	4.00	
04/03/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Respond to inquiries regarding metadata information in defendant documents.	0.50	
04/03/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Mock jury run through and meeting with street street, revise presentation and demonstratives with Litigation Support.	8.00	
04/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Revise draft exhibit list.	5.30	
04/03/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; trial preparation review.	11.00	
04/03/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails/memos on trial preparation review.	2.50	
04/04/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Review deposition exhibits and add information regarding document and regarding authentication to spreadsheet per T. Desouza.	1.80	
04/04/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review, and work on trial exhibit and witness lists.	14.00	
04/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Mock trial preparation; organize exhibits, practice presentation; conference with LCHB team re exhibit.	8.00	
04/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize trial exhibit list for L. Cisneros.	3.00	
04/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on mock trial exhibits for D. Harvey, K. Dermody, A. Shaver, and B. Glackin. Coordinate with the vendor to deliver over the weekend in San Jose.	5.00	
04/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial preparation.	4.10	
04/04/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Prepare PowerPoint presentation for use with mock trial.	5.00	
04/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Practice mock trial presentation, review and revise same, conference with team re same; conference with defendants' re pretrial disclosures, review and revise same.	12.20	
04/04/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for trial.	3.20	
04/04/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Pull documents from the database.	0.30	
04/04/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Attend mock trial rehearsal; revise presentation for same; finalize all exhibits for same; work with Litigation Support to edit deomonstratives for same; practice presentation.	8.60	
04/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Trial preparation document review.	4.00	
04/04/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; trial preparation review.	10.20	
04/04/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Emails/memos on trial preparation review.	1.30	
04/05/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review, and work on trial exhibit and witness lists.	12.00	
04/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel to and from and attend mock trial; edit closing argument and emails re same; emails with team re exhibit list; practice closing.	13.00	
04/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Coordinate Concordance searches for the trial exhibit list for L. Cisneros.	1.50	
04/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial.	9.20	
04/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for mock closing.	2.00	
04/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review production letter; memorandum re same.	0.50	
04/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend and present at mock trial day one, conference with team re same, travel re same.	11.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/05/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Modify mock trial demonstrative.	0.50	
04/05/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Run search terms and pull documents for trial exhibit list.	2.50	
04/05/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to and from for mock trial and present defense case re same; review Mark Fichtner documents for exhibit list.	11.00	
04/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct document review, supervise paralegal and litigation support staff, and work on trial exhibit list and witness lists.	9.00	
04/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Travel to and from and attend mock trial; conference with team re same; email R. Heimann re jury work; edit closing presentation.	8.60	
04/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Run metadata searches of 330 documents for L. Cisneros. Work on deposition authentication for the trial exhibit list.	4.00	
04/06/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Assist L. Cisneros and T. Desouza with trial exhibit list and exhibit documents.	4.00	
04/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Mock trial, travel.	7.40	
04/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend day two of mock trial, conference re same, travel re same.	10.80	
04/06/14	JONES, ALEXA	Organize and pull trial exhibits for internal drive.	3.90	
04/06/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support regarding database for reviewers.	1.00	
04/06/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Travel to and from for mock trial and attend same.	7.50	
04/06/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; trial preparation review.	4.00	
04/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with work on exhibit list.	4.00	
04/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Research and draft motion to compel.	5.50	
04/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on logistics for trial.	0.50	
04/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with LCHB team re jury focus research; trial preparation; review plaintiffs' trial witness list and conferences with D. Harvey re same; email with Joe Saveri and mediator real and email LCHB team re same; email with LCHB team re same;	8.50	
04/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Add exhibits to trial list for D. Harvey. Gather documents from list of documents with no sponsoring witness.	3.00	
04/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management.	0.20	
04/07/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents related to named plaintiffs on the internal computer drive for D. Harvey.	0.30	
04/07/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of electronic discovery database.	2.00	
04/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Finalize exhibit and witness lists, conference and research same, review candidate exhibits re same; conference with defendants re pretrial disclosures; confer with R. Nelson re mediation; review and revise per se and rule of reason brief.	9.20	
04/07/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review draft of motions in limine.	0.30	
04/07/14	NELSON, ROBERT	Meet with D. Harvey re mediation.	1.00	
04/07/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Organize documents from P:/ drive to flash drive.	1.50	
04/07/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with D. Harvey re witness list; confer with team re meet and confer with defendants and email defendants re same; team emails re trial planning; update trial calendar; research case law on objectors to settlements and update final approval brief with same; confer with K. Dermody re trial assignments; emails with D. Harvey and L. Cisneros re plaintiff exhibit.	5.00	
04/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review information re trial preparation.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/07/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Document review; trial preparation review.	6.50	
04/07/14	ZAUL, JONATHAN	Trial preparation memo and emails.	3.00	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct further research for motion to compel.	3.00	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft and edit motion to compel.	1.50	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft motion to seal and supporting declaration.	0.50	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare supporting declaration for motion to compel.	0.50	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review feedback edits regarding motion to compel and incorporate edits.	1.20	
04/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on planning for trial.	0.50	
04/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit motions in limine and confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvev re same; telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re mediation and email LCHB team re same: emails with and D. Harvey re motion to compel and D. Harvey re motion to compel and edit same; email with B. Glackin re Department of Justice amicus on standard; review defendants trial witness and exhibit lists for trial preparation.	9.00	
04/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Enter in new calls and emails from potential class members into Excel spreadsheet. Return calls and send information to the claims administrator to follow up.	1.80	
04/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Go through the trial exhibit list and make sure every document in the correct place on the internal computer drive for L. Cisneros.	2.00	
04/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.30	
04/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update Word document with all deadlines for the case for D. Harvey.	0.60	
04/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise per se brief. Email K. Dermody re potential amicus. Meet and confer re motions in limine and confer with K. Dermody re same.	10.30	
04/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise per se brief; research and revise motion to compel it is a confer with K. Dermody, research and revise motions in limine, conference with defendants re same; review defendants witness and exhibit lists.	9.20	
04/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Locate case law for D. Harvey's review.	0.70	
04/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize correspondence re proposed exhibits and witnesses.	0.20	
04/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize defendants' proposed exhibit list.	0.40	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with planning for trial.	0.40	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with D. Harvey, K. Dermody and B. Glackin regarding case scheduling and task list.	0.40	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Prepare proposed order.	0.10	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review draft brief in support of motion for application of per se rule and work on supporting declaration.	1.50	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review filing for finalizing.	0.10	
04/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review rules and confer with D. Harvey regarding motion to seal.	0.50	
04/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit per se brief and motions in limine; attend meet and confer re motions in limine with B. Glackin, D. Harvey. defendants; review jury deliberation of focus group 3 for trial preparation; email jury consultant re report; emails with Lee Rubin, member issues; respond to media re status.	5.50	
04/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with D. Harvey re mock trial vendor.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate video depositions from Jordan Media.	0.20	
04/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize mock trial videos and load onto the internal computer drive for B. Glackin.	0.50	
04/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to voicemail and emails from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet with the new information. Send information of potential claimants for follow up to the claims administrator when necessary.	1.80	
04/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
04/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise per se brief. Meet and confer with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, defendants re motions in limine.	6.10	
04/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, defendants re motions in limine, research same; revise and file motion to compel and supporting documents; research and revise brief supporting per se standard; review jury focus group materials and results.	11.50	
04/09/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Update final approval materials and emails with team re same; read Bluetooth case and email D. Harvey re same.	1.70	
04/10/14	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Cite check and Bluebook brief in support of per se motion.	3.90	
04/10/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Conduct legal and factual cite check of final approval of settlement brief per A. Shaver.	5.60	
04/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with planning for trial.	0.40	
04/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with preparation of brief and declaration in support of motion for application of the per se rule, as well as the motion to seal and declaration.	6.00	
04/10/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to class member inquiries regarding litigation.	0.30	
04/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise final approval brief, A. Shaver declaration and order and confer with A. Shaver re same; conferences with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re motions in limine and meet and confer issues and edit communications re meet and confer agreements; respond to class member inquiries; review/edit revised per se brief; email Layn Phillips re mediation; email Joe Saveri re same; review media re case for potential jury issues; confer with D. Harvey re meet and confer on trial witnesses.	10.50	
04/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare exhibits and documents for the motion for per se brief for D. Harvey. Prepare chambers copies for the court.	6.00	
04/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to voicemails and emails from class members and forward questions to the claims administrator per D. Harvey's instructions.	1.50	
04/10/14	GIORDANO, JESSICA	Assist T. Desouza with filings.	2.30	
04/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft, revise and finalize per se brief, stipulation re motions in limine, confer with K. Dermody re strategy.	10.70	
04/10/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Edit videos for use with mock trial.	1.00	
04/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise, finalize, and file per se brief, motions in limine notice, motion to seal, and motion for final approval of settlements; conference with K. Dermody, defendants re motions in limine issues; research trial exhibits; review mock trial video and results.	12.20	
04/10/14	JONES, ALEXA	Create exhibits to A. Shaver declaration.	0.30	
04/10/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise final approval papers; cite check same; proofread same; oversee e-file for same; review per se brief; conference with K. Dermody re motions in limine.	6.00	
04/10/14	WU, LESLIE	Organize a binder of the declaration of A. Shaver in support of plaintiffs' motion for final approval of class action settlements and exhibits.	0.40	
04/10/14	WU, LESLIE	Organize deposition transcripts of Kevin Murphy, Edward Snyder, Eric Talley and Tim Cook for filing.	0.40	
04/10/14	WU, LESLIE	Organize exhibits for the plaintiffs' memorandum of law in support of appointment of the per se standard.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/10/14	WU, LESLIE	Update the filed exhibits on system.	0.30	
04/11/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist with filing.	1.40	
04/11/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on class member inquiries.	2.00	
04/11/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on planning for trial.	0.40	
04/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re motions in limine, motion to seal; review defendants' motions in limine and email re same; email team, David Kiernan re final approval order, trial preparation.	1.50	
04/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Docket research pertaining to deposition transcripts for D. Harvey.	1.00	
04/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copies for the per se brief for D. Harvey.	1.00	
04/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
04/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' motions in limine, research same, conference with co-counsel re oppositions to same.	3.50	
04/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Call with class member Chris Birger.	0.40	
04/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding trial war room.	0.20	
04/14/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review filing for compliance with protective order and follow up with opposing counsel and court clerk.	1.00	
04/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meet and confer re pretrial statement; meet with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re pretrial assignments; confer with B. Glackin re trial issues; draft and revise trial plan and email to Joe Saveri; email with R. Heimann re trial plan; telephone conference with media on status; emails with Lee Rubin re Google; respond to class member intakes; emails with D. Harvey re Matthew Marx report; confer with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re authentication issues and call to D. Harvey re same.	4.50	
04/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare various documents to co-counsel throughout the day as requested.	0.50	
04/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull and organize documents in Concordance.	4.00	
04/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review filings from April 10, 2014 and determine if any new deposition excepts were filed for D. Harvey.	1.20	
04/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Summarize totals of all documents listed in the business stipulation spreadsheets for each defendant.	0.40	
04/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody, A. Shaver, defense counsel re pretrial disclosures and trial stipulations, research same; research pretrial statement; research motions in limine.	3.50	
04/14/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Locate documents from database.	9.00	
04/14/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare pretrial conference statement; emails with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re meet and confer today and prepare materials for same; attend conference call with K. Dermody, D. Harvey, defendants; draft summary of same for team; conference with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re authentication stipulation.	3.50	
04/15/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft motion, circulate and file.	0.80	
04/15/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review defendants' responses to plaintiffs' proposed business records stipulations.	0.70	
04/15/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on pretrial preparation, including jury instructions.	0.50	
04/15/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on trial planning.	1.40	
04/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails and calls re class member intakes, case status; telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re mediation; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; email LCHB team re mediation issues; review letter re authentication issues and email D. Harvey re same; emails with team re defendants' motions in limine and review same; emails with A. Shaver re draft pretrial statement; review filing re sealed document; email Justina Sessions re pretrial exchange; trial preparation.	2.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Compare the documents on the business stipulation lists to see if they appear in the defense merits reports for B. Glackin.	0.50	
04/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare various correspondence and documents for D. Harvey.	0.30	
04/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull and gather documents from the lists that defendants stipulated as business records for D. Harvey. Organize for his review. Work with Litigation Support and the vendor to make sure everything is flagged for review.	4.50	
04/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive. Organize documents on the internal computer drive.	0.70	
04/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review documents as to which defendants requested admissibility stipulation. Review/revise draft letter re same. Review motions in limine.	3.10	
04/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joseph Saveri re letter on documents.	0.20	
04/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review documents identified by defendants in their requests; draft and serve letter to defendants re their stipulation requests, confer with K. Dermody, meet and confer with defendants re same; correspond with class members re claims; research motions in limine opposition.	7.50	
04/15/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Locate more documents and upload for printing.	2.00	
04/15/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Send email with printing instructions.	0.20	
04/15/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Upload documents to the vendor file-transfer protocol for printing.	1.00	
04/15/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Confer with K. Dermody and draft pretrial statement; create exhibit and witness appendices thereto.	3.50	
04/16/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review defendants' responses to business records stipulation requests, organize chart and supervise paralegal work related to the chart.	4.00	
04/16/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on logistics planning for trial.	0.30	
04/16/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on notices of deposition for authenticity depositions.	0.20	
04/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit opposition to motion in limine and email team re same; emails with LCHB team re deposition notices for authenticating documents; email Kevin Hallock re trial schedule; email Emily Henn/David Kiernan re revised final approval order; telephone conference with Jaffe re CAFA notice; emails with Todd Elder re case; email re Baron story; emails with Lee Rubin, Heffler re Google; review reports re motions in limine; email with Kendall re trial witnesses.	3.00	
04/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Shaver re joint pretrial statement.	0.50	
04/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise opposition to motions in limine.	3.60	
04/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Anna Pletcher re per se brief.	0.50	
04/16/14	GRAY, DJUNA	Review documents regarding plaintiffs' business records.	2.80	
04/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review defendants' responses to requests to stipulate, research same, conference with L. Cisneros re same, correspond with LCHB team re same; correspond with class member re claims, research same, correspond with re same; review draft opposition brief to motions in limine, research and revise same; correspond with research same, correspond with research same, correspond with research same, correspond with research same; correspond with research same, correspond with research same; correspond	10.10	
04/16/14	JONES, ALEXA	Review responses to requests for business records stipulation.	2.60	
04/16/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research availability of prejudgment interest in the federal Northern District court of California, for A. Shaver.	0.40	
04/16/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with B. Glackin re pretrial statement; research on prejudgment interest; review oppositions to motions in limine; draft pretrial statement and telephone call with L. Cisneros re exhibit list for same.	5.90	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize defense stipulations re business records for L. Cisneros review.	5.50	
04/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare letter briefs for B. Glackin's review.	0.30	
04/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist B. Glackin with witness list issues.	0.30	
04/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on business records response analysis.	3.30	
04/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	2.80	
04/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with class member re case; edit revised opposition to motions in limine; meet with B. Glackin re deposition designations; emails with Joe Saveri, Layn Phillips re settlement; confer with B. Glackin re trial assignments and email LCHB team re same; email Emily Henn re trial subpoenas for Lucasfilm and Pixar; edit pretrial conference statement and email LCHB team re same; review Alan Eustace and Omid Kordestani testimony for trial examination.	7.00	
04/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check and pull exhibits from plaintiffs' opposition to defendants' joint motions in limine brief for D. Harvey.	3.00	
04/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft motion re defense witness list. Review/revise opposition to motions in limine; supervise filing of same.	4.50	
04/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and serve deposition notices for remaining defendants' top executives; research and revise opposition to motions in limine, coordinate and supervise finalization of brief and supporting papers, declarations, and exhibits; research and review defendants' responses to stipulation requests; correspond with G&E and B&M re motions in limine issues, research same; research Bill Campbell stock holdings and value; correspond with defendants re stipulation requests; conference with K. Dermody re opposition to motions in limine; conference with A. Shaver re erroneous filing, research same, supervise correction of same.	9.80	
04/17/14	JONES, ALEXA	Pull pages from deposition transcripts.	0.40	
04/17/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research cases and treatises addressing excessively long witness lists, for B. Glackin.	0.80	
04/17/14	RUDNICK, JENNIFER	Cite check opposition to defendants' joint motions in limine.	4.00	
04/17/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft administrative motion to file under seal and declaration for same; pull exhibits for same; draft declaration for opposition to motions in limine; pull exhibits for same; e-file opposition papers and motion to remove document; emails with K. Dermody re pretrial statement; emails with B. Glackin re witness list.	10.30	
04/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare opposition to motions in limine for filing.	4.00	
04/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on exhibit list.	2.00	
04/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Work on preparations for depositions.	0.30	
04/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri and Layn Phillips re mediation; multiple calls/emails with LCHB trial team, experts re settlement; email with re focus work; draft and edit memorandum of understanding and emails with Joe Saveri re same; edit revised memorandum or understanding and email Robert Van Nest re same; respond to class members re case status; respond to class intakes; emails with	3.50	
04/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review K. Dermody revisions to witness list brief; telephone conference with Christina Brown re same; coordinate schedule re depositions; office conference with D. Harvey.	0.60	
04/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re scheduling depositions; conference with class representatives re conference with Eric Cramer re settlement discussions; conference with Linda Nussbaum re settlement discussions; conference with claims administrator re class member claim issues.	4.20	
04/18/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review documents on docket; emails re settlement; emails re deposition logistics for next week; review witness list for pretrial statement.	1.70	
04/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re opposition to motions in limine.	1.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to questions re case status.	0.20	
04/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Call with , former Intel employee and class member.	0.50	
04/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding settlement inquiries from and	0.70	
04/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Research and respond to query regarding Google's motion to seal.	0.30	
04/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class member issue.	0.60	
04/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit revised memorandum of understanding; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re memorandum of understanding questions; email Joe Saveri re memorandum of understanding and call re same; edit letters to clients re emails re intakes; review revised pretrial statement and confer with D. Harvey re same; respond to intakes re class status and confer with L. Cisneros re same; email D. Harvey re draft settlement agreement; email Layn Phillips re status; email A. Shaver re pretrial statement exhibits; email	5.50	
04/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft settlement agreement; review defendants' edits to draft memo of understanding; draft and serve letters to class representatives; research document authentication requests; review and revise pretrial statement, serve defendants with draft of same.	8.20	
04/21/14	NELSON, ROBERT	Press inquiry; correspondence with K. Dermody.	0.20	
04/21/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft motion for preliminary approval; revise exhibit list for pretrial statement; emails with Anne Selin re under seal filing; e-file redacted Edward Snyder report.	8.50	
04/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibit for A. Shaver review.	0.20	
04/22/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Analyze defendants' responses to the business records stipulation requests and assist D. Harvey with response statement.	3.20	
04/22/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research regarding defendants' opposition brief.	2.00	
04/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with LCHB team re pretrial statement, per se brief and clients; review Google communication to workers; email with A. Shaver re reply settlement brief and review notice re same; email Robert Van Nest and Layn Phillips re memorandum of understanding; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest, Justina Sessions and B. Glackin re memorandum of understanding; confer with B. Glackin re memorandum of understanding and litigation deadlines; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re memorandum of understanding; draft and send letter to Robert Van Nest re memorandum of understanding revisions; confer with S. Fineman re case management/schedule; email Intel re draft communication.	4.00	
04/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assist L. Cisneros in identifying deposition exhibits and bates numbered documents in a letter to defense counsel.	1.00	
04/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research deposition logistics for everyone issued a deposition notice last week for D. Harvey.	0.50	
04/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails of class members. Forward their relevant information to the claims administrator for follow up.	2.00	
04/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Search for defendants' designations of experts for B. Glackin.	0.20	
04/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
04/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft per se reply brief; draft letter to plaintiff re confidentiality; review draft motion; meet and confer with Sarah Reynolds, Michael Tubach, Christina Brown and Tina Sessions.	9.10	
04/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Meet and confer with defendants re pretrial deadlines, business record stipulations, and witness lists, and pretrial statement; research and draft notice of settlement; review draft notice to class members re settlement; draft joint report re status of business records disputes, serve same.	9.20	
04/22/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Draft notice of update on final approval and declaration for same; emails with K. Dermody re same; review revised memorandum of understanding; draft motion for preliminary approval; draft revised pretrial statement and emails with team re stipulations for same; review correspondence on business records stipulation.	7.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pretrial filings for follow up.	0.30	
04/23/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries.	1.90	
04/23/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research regarding defendants' opposition brief and write analysis for B. Glackin.	4.50	
04/23/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Edit class communication.	0.30	
04/23/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to query from D. Harvey regarding revised notice.	0.10	
04/23/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review related case decision.	0.30	
04/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised Intel communication re and revise draft settlement agreement; review revised memorandum or understanding and email Robert Van Nest re same; edit communication to court re settlement; email A. Shaver and D. Harvey re notice and settlement approval brief; call with Joe Saveri re memorandum of understanding; review administrative motion re trial witness list; review and comment on last changes to memorandum of understanding and filing date and email Justina Sessions re same.	5.00	
04/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize for Peter Barile various documents per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
04/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize motion for attorney fees, motion for final approval, and related documents for K. Dermody.	1.50	
04/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft per se motion reply brief; review joint pretrial statement with A. Shaver; telephone conference with Mike Devine; office conference with K. Dermody re Mike Devine service award question.	5.90	
04/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with K. Dermody re process for class member inquiries, research same; research and revise joint statement re stipulation requests, conference with defendants' counsel re same; research legal issues re per se brief, conference with B. Glackin re same; draft declaration and proposed order in support of administrative motion to enforce case management order; research plan of settlement allocation; research settlement notice; review and revise draft administrative motion; draft plan of allocation, correspond with K. Dermody re same; review defendants' draft insert re joint statement, research same, conference with Christina Brown re same.	11.10	
04/24/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Cite check plaintiffs' reply in support of motion for application of the per se standard.	3.30	
04/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with reply brief in support of motion for application of the per se rule.	1.50	
04/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and respond to queries regarding settlement and queries from class members.	1.20	
04/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised memorandum of understanding and emails with John Keker re same; edit letter to court re settlement; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest to court re settlement; email court re settlement; execute memorandum of understanding and court letter for plaintiffs and emails with Robert Van Nest re same; edit/revise draft notice and motion for settlement approval and email Joe Saveri re same; confer with B. Glackin re settlement issues; emails/calls with Lee Rubin re Google communications; emails with L. Cisneros re class intakes; email Heffler re late claims; confer with A. Shaver re settlement filing; emails with Emily Henn, David Kiernan re final approval; email Layn Phillips re status; telephone conference with Emily Henn re final approval; calls with class members, media re settlement; email Citibank re escrow agent proposal.	12.50	
04/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
04/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on reply in support of motion for per se brief for B. Glackin. Fact check and make edits. Create a draft of the declaration and gather the exhibits.	3.00	
04/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finish per se reply draft.	2.40	
04/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re settlement approval.	0.20	
04/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with W. Bernstein re	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Google employee announcement.	0.30	
04/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re assignments.	0.20	
04/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with class representative regions and representatives regions and conference with class representatives regions and conference with class representatives regions and conference with Dr. Alan Manning re settlement; conference with B. Glackin re assignment.	4.80	
04/25/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries.	1.90	
04/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and handle class member and settlement inquiries.	1.70	
04/25/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Heffler, Joe Saveri re claims issues; emails/calls with media re settlement; respond to class intakes re settlement; email Gilardi re claims administrator bid; review revised settlement agreement and email John Keker re same.	2.00	
04/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Prepare chambers copy for A. Shaver.	0.50	
04/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research public filings for witness and send results to D. Harvey.	0.60	
04/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return voicemails from class members.	0.20	
04/28/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with potential class member settlement inquiries; Update chart re same.	1.10	
04/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist in review of draft proposed order.	0.20	
04/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Handle follow up regarding class member and settlement inquiries.	0.40	
04/28/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to B. Glackin's inquiry regarding court electronic notification.	0.10	
04/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with media re case status; edit notice and order and emails to Joe Saveri re same; email notice to Justina Sessions re questions on agreement; research settlement approval case law; email Heffler re invoice; email	6.00	
04/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and messages from class members.	1.50	
04/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
04/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work with Litigation Support to store emails from Outlook into a database while preserving the metadata for B. Glackin.	2.00	
04/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft records collection protocol for drafting of B. Glackin declaration; office conference with T. Desouza re same.	0.60	
04/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organize High-Tech Cold Calling records.	1.00	
04/28/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Email analysis. Preparation of email analysis.	1.00	
04/28/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Respond to all inquiries regarding exporting email files and metadata retention.	1.00	
04/29/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with potential class member settlement inquiries; Summary and report re same.	5.40	
04/29/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding settlement inquiries.	2.50	
04/29/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Jacqueline Mottek re claims issues; email with Justina Sessions re settlement agreement; prepare for hearing.	2.50	
04/30/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	4.40	
04/30/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Research settlement administrators and solicit bids.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Emily Henn and David Kiernan re hearing and preparation for same; emails with Heffler re claims statistics; email Joe Saveri re hearing (0.10); email with T. Desouza re hearing binders; emails with Garden City Group. Dahl. Gilardi re bids; telephone conference with Justina Sessions re claims administration and opt-out sealing; email with Case status; emails with L. Cisneros re administration; email with Q. Ta re cy pres; revise final approval order and opt-out list.	2.50	
04/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Email class members and forward their information to the claims administrator to follow up. Update Excel spreadsheet with new information.	1.00	
05/01/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with potential class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	4.30	
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re settlement approval.	0.20	
05/01/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding settlement administrators bids.	0.70	
05/01/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to D. Harvey's query regarding settlement approval issues.	0.50	
05/01/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review questions from settlement administrator and the settlement agreement, and consult with K. Dermody regarding the same	0.60	
05/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for, travel to and attend final settlement approval hearing; confer with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same; edit and revise settlement orders and email David Kiernan, Emily Henn re same; email LCHB re claims administrator bids; email Heffler re claims issues; call with David Kiernan, Emily Henn re hearing; conference with Robert Van Nest re hearing.	9.80	
05/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents for motion for final approval hearing for K. Dermody.	2.40	
05/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to calls from class members and follow up with claims administrator.	0.30	
05/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify calculations for class members per D. Harvey's instructions.	0.20	
05/01/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research settlement question.	0.20	
05/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Travel to, attend, and return from final approval hearing.	5.80	
05/01/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for final approval hearing and research same, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; travel and attend final approval hearing; correspond with Eric Cramer and Linda Nussbaum re Court review; research and review U.S. Department of Justice and California Attorney General filings re eBay settlements.	8.10	
05/01/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research regarding settlements.	0.80	
05/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from class member re case inquiry.	0.10	
05/01/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Email T. Desouza re call from class member.	0.10	
05/02/14	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Litigation Support: Process file for text recognition to make it a searchable PDF.	1.80	
05/02/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with potential class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	4.80	
05/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review and analyze bids, and prepare comparison chart for settlement administrator bids.	2.50	
05/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri revised orders and multiple emails to Joe Saveri re same; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re new high tech case; email Emily Henn re escrow issue; email with conference with Apple monitor re case issues.	1.50	
05/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research all exhibits from the motion for summary judgment filing mentioning Bill Campbell for D. Harvey. Track down last publicly filed deposition excerpts for Bill Campbell.	0.30	
05/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive and locate documents for B. Glackin.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update spreadsheet with new information for class members.	0.50	
05/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research settlement information and draft B. Glackin declaration; telephone conference with Apple compliance monitor.	5.70	
05/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions and comments; review reports; correspond with Berger firm and Grant & Eisenhofer firm re settlement issues.	2.50	
05/02/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Create PDF portfolio for easy searching.	1.50	
05/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits for D. Harvey's review.	3.50	
05/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research settlement information and draft declaration.	2.50	
05/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email James Dallal re edits to order.	0.10	
05/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research settlement information and draft declaration.	2.70	
05/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft declaration re class counsel work, research same; review proposed orders regarding final approval of settlement.	4.20	
05/05/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Organize settlement and case law documents per K. Dermody.	0.30	
05/05/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	3.70	
05/05/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Telephone call with Kyle Mason regarding bid for settlement administration services.	0.40	
05/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize revised final approval orders and confer with D. Harvey re same; email John Mitchell re escrow; confer with B. Glackin re records; confirm final claims/opt-out numbers; email defense counsel re settlement agreement; telephone conference with David Kiernan, Emily Henn re orders; respond to class member intakes.	3.00	
05/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research facts re declaration, conference with B. Glackin re same; review correspondence from Joe Saveri; review proposed orders re final approval of settlement, file same.	4.20	
05/05/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain orders by Judge Koh granting final approval of class action settlements, for D. Harvey.	0.60	
05/05/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review emails from class members and respond to same.	1.20	
05/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	
05/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re proposed order.	0.60	
05/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition log for D. Harvey's review.	1.60	
05/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings log for D. Harvey's review.	3.30	
05/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transcript order form for filing.	0.60	
05/06/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist with pleadings research; Report and summary re same.	3.80	
05/06/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.90	
05/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Assist with deposition tracking.	0.20	
05/06/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Further analysis of settlement administration bids, confer with K. Dermody, and follow up with bidding companies.	2.50	
05/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re settlement documents; confer with L. Cisneros re claims administrator bids.	0.50	
05/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft settlement document.	2.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise settlement document, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with B. Glackin re same, conference with A. Shaver re same, supervise paralegal research re facts re same.	3.60	
05/06/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Search email in connection with settlement assignment; telephone call with D. Harvey re same; read draft declaration.	2.00	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Organize documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Bill Campbell exhibits for D. Harvey review.	1.00	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re order.	0.50	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence log for D. Harvey's review.	1.50	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for D. Harvey's review.	0.20	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition log for D. Harvey.	0.70	
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit pleadings log for D. Harvey.	0.60	
05/06/14	WU, LESLIE	Meet with B. Troxel and C. Chan to go over the project details.	0.10	
05/06/14	WU, LESLIE	Research docket entries re settlement assignment.	0.40	
05/06/14	WU, LESLIE	Research the page count of document production re settlement assignment.	0.60	
05/07/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Assist K. Dermody with settlement assignment.	0.50	
05/07/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Assist with research for upcoming filing preparation; Report and summary re same.	2.90	
05/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research for D. Harvey on fee application procedure.	0.50	
05/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on pending settlement administration bids.	1.00	
05/07/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding class member inquiry.	0.10	
05/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review B. Glackin settlement declaration and telephone conference with B. Glackin re same; meet with B. Glackin re settlement; edit settlement document; review Dahl claims bid; respond to class member inquiries.	2.00	
05/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re B. Glackin declaration.	0.20	
05/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise settlement document.	1.20	
05/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody re settlement document.	0.20	
05/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research case history, correspondence, and other details for settlement document; review and revise same; research procedures for in camera submissions, draft notice re same; review transcript of May 1, 2013 motion hearing.	3.70	
05/07/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review B. Glackin declaration and emails with B. Glackin re same.	0.30	
05/08/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	2.90	
05/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Address class member inquiry.	0.20	
05/08/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on pending settlement administration bids and confer with K. Dermody.	0.70	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit settlement agreement and email to Joe Saveri re same; confer with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re settlement approval; review light edits on preliminary approval brief from Joe Saveri; assign fact research on brief to D. Harvey; review revised agreement from defendants and email LCHB with notes re revisions; telephone conference with Justina Sessions re settlement agreement issues; email John Mitchell re escrow; email Thomas Isaacson re first settlement opt-outs.	3.00	
05/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assemble chambers copy of a filing for D. Harvey.	0.60	
05/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research for settlement project.	0.20	
05/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and emails from class members. Update Excel spreadsheet with information as well.	0.80	
05/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review records, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; research preliminary approval issues re settlement with remaining defendants.	3.20	
05/09/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.30	
05/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri for response to edits on settlement agreement; email John Mitchell re escrow edits; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler claim form question; research settlement approval question; email D. Harvey re eBay settlement; email LCHB team re administrator bids; email Joe Saveri re bid selection; email D. Harvey re final cost accounting.	2.50	
05/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Compile a list of all the vendors used in the case for D. Harvey. Call all the vendors re final invoices.	2.70	
05/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re claims processing issues; research preliminary approval motion and settlement issues.	2.10	
05/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re draft agreement and review Joe Saveri's edits to same; email Justina Sessions re revised agreement; emails/calls with defense counsel re settlement question; call/email with D. Harvey re settlement questions.	1.50	
05/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody re Michael Devine; conference with Mike Devine; conference with Siddharth Hariharan; conference with Daniel Stover; correspond with Mark Fichtner; research class representative declarations, draft same, correspond with class representatives re research settlement and preliminary approval issues.	5.60	
05/12/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Summary and report re same.	1.20	
05/12/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with D. Harvey, A. Shaver and T. Desouza regarding class member inquiries.	0.30	
05/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with David Kiernan re settlement: telephone conference with John Keker's firm, Joe Saveri, re settlement agreement issues; telephone conference with B. Glackin. D. Harvev re settlement questions; calls with media re settlement approval; telephone conference with Lee Rubin re conference with Lee Rubin re conference with Lee Rubin re very conference with Lee Rubin re conference with Lee Rubin re very conference with Lee Rubin re very conference with D. Harvey re revised preliminary approval brief; email with Layn Phillips re mediation question; review research re settlement approval.	7.50	
05/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Calculate the total number of subpoenas issued by plaintiffs and defendants for settlement document.	0.40	
05/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Follow up with vendors to ensure all invoices are up to date for D. Harvey.	0.40	
05/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate documents for B. Glackin.	0.30	
05/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails from class members, and update Excel spreadsheet; confer with L. Cisneros re same.	1.00	
05/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
05/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Named plaintiff research; office conference with K. Dermody re same; draft letter to Mike Devine; Call Mike Devine.	3.50	
05/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey; telephone conference with K. Dermody (both re client).	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives re settlement and settlement approval status and issues; conference with K. Dermody, L. Cisneros, and A. Shaver re class inquiries and responses; respond to press inquiries; research and revise motion for preliminary approval of settlement; supervise assembly of cost information re vendors, experts, etc., conference with T. Desouza re same; conference with B. Glackin re class representative.	4.50	
05/12/14	JONES, ALEXA	Research briefing in past cases discussing settlement approval duties.	3.10	
05/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Research case law on named plaintiff objectors; confer with L. Cisneros re intakes.	1.90	
05/13/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.60	
05/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review claims administrator bids and email L. Cisneros re same; email Keker & Van Nest re claims administration and settlement terms; emails with D. Harvey re settlement questions; confer with D. Harvey re client question; emails with LCHB team, David Kiernan, Foreman, Joe Saveri re settlement questions; email with D. Harvey re eBay - Attorney General settlement; respond to Heffler questions re intakes; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re status (0.40); review eBay - Attorney General settlement papers.	5.00	
05/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer calls and voicemails from class members. Update Excel spreadsheet and direct attorney calls to D. Harvey and L. Cisneros.	2.00	
05/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find documents for D. Harvey.	0.20	
05/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Follow up on pending invoices from vendors for D. Harvey.	0.40	
05/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research mediation question for D. Harvey.	0.40	
05/13/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Mike Devine; office conferences with D. Harvey; telephone conference with Joseph Saveri and S. Fineman.	5.30	
05/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Named plaintiff research and communications with same.	8.60	
05/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Research case law for B. Glackin on attorney-client privilege; review plaintiff letter.	2.00	
05/14/14	ASHLYNN, WILLOW	Litigation Support: Organize clips from mock trial video footage for client viewing.	3.80	
05/14/14	CARNAM, TODD	Research re antitrust settlement fact question.	2.50	
05/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email D. Harvey re service award cases; review/respond to Heffler question re claims; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest and Justina Sessions re settlement issues; email Joe Saveri re same; email Kristovich re Intel; email Rosenblatt re media question.	1.50	
05/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Preview video from the mock jury and list clips to be used as excerpts per D. Harvey's instructions. Work with Litigation Support to start process of extracting and making clips. Contact the jury consultant to send over copies of the focus group deliberation video.	2.60	
05/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails from class members. Follow up with claims administrator on specific case and update the Excel spreadsheet.	1.20	
05/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
05/14/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate Ninth Circuit Court of Appeal cases re service or incentive awards for named plaintiffs, for D. Harvey.	1.10	
05/15/14	ASHLYNN, WILLOW	Litigation Support: Organize additional clips from mock trial video footage.	5.40	
05/15/14	CARNAM, TODD	Research for D. Harvey antitrust precedents.	6.20	
05/15/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with defense counsel re settlement issues: email with Lavn Phillips re conference call on revised agreement and email administrator bids. dispute; review and Heffler re data collection; emails to L. Cisneros re claims administrator bids.	2.50	
05/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate expert report for B. Glackin.	0.60	
05/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work on video from the focus groups for D. Harvey. Work with Litigation Support to create excerpts for viewing tomorrow.	3.80	
05/15/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assist with video clips from footage of mock trial for client viewing.	2.00	
05/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Siddharth Hariharan re compilation of jury focus group materials and view, review same.	3.80	
05/15/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research for settlement.	2.00	
05/15/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research availability of an expert report for B. Glackin	0.20	
05/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for D. Harvey review.	0.40	
05/16/14	ASHLYNN, WILLOW	Litigation Support: Organize clips from mock trial video footage for client review. Discussions with T. Desouza and A. Grant re same.	4.20	
05/16/14	CARNAM, TODD	Conclude research into settlement question.	0.20	
05/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re settlement documents/strategy; revise preliminary approval brief and email defense counsel re same; call with Justina Sessions, Robert Van Nest re settlement issues, and calls to Joe Saveri to update re same; telephone conference with Brad Phillips re and email re deposition to Joe Saveri; review court orders approving first settlements and email team re same: respond to media inquiries re settlement: emails with Emily Henn and David Kiernan re settlement approval; email with	5.50	
05/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Draft email to class member for D. Harvey to review.	0.10	
05/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish final clips and work with Litigation Support to ensure everything is on the internal computer drive, for client viewing.	3.00	
05/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize electronic court filing notices and correspondence on the internal computer drive.	0.60	
05/16/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify question re Kevin Hallock for K. Dermody.	0.10	
05/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Siddharth Hariharan re conference with Mark Fichtner re draft preliminary approval brief. ; confer with K. Dermody re settlement assignments; review draft preliminary approval brief.	4.10	
05/16/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Research antitrust settlement approvals in the Ninth Circuit for D. Harvey.	1.00	
05/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Daniel Girard re substitution documents.	0.10	
05/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re settlement papers and service award case law; email Brad Phillips re dispute.	0.60	
05/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with K. Dermody, D. Harvey re settlement questions.	0.50	
05/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re settlement issues, research same.	0.50	
05/19/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.90	
05/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct legal research for motion for preliminary approval, conference with D. Harvey re same.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/19/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding settlement administrator bids.	1.00	
05/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with defense counsel, Justina Sessions and Robert Van Nest re settlement agreement: edit settlement documents; leave message for Joe Saveri re call with defense counsel; email Layn Phillips re dispute; review defense revisions to agreement and email Joe Saveri re missing edits; email defense and Heffler re data issues; respond to class member inquiries; research re settlement questions; call with Joe Saveri re settlement issues (0.20); conference with D. Harvey re settlement approval.	5.80	
05/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Collect background facts for settlement brief.	2.20	
05/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research re objection letters to the court last week and determine if they are class members for D. Harvey.	0.40	
05/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls from class members and update Excel spreadsheet with new information.	1.00	
05/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research preliminary approval brief, draft same, conference with K. Dermody re same; research co-counsel cost calculations.	4.70	
05/20/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull various settlement- and incentive fees-related cases from LEXIS for D. Harvey.	0.40	
05/20/14	CHAN, CHRISTIAN	Follow up with class member settlement inquiries; Report and summary re same.	1.30	
05/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Research for motion for preliminary approval.	2.50	
05/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Draft letter brief to Layn Phillips re declarations; confer with D. Harvey re research questions; edit/revise brief, class notice and email/calls with defense counsel re same; confer with D. Harvey re plaintiff declarations; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re edits to settlement agreement; calls with defense counsel re settlement issues and email Layn Phillips re same.	9.50	
05/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize exhibits from the motion for preliminary approval brief for D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	2.70	
05/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull documents relating to orders granting service awards for L. Cisneros and D. Harvey.	0.50	
05/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and email from class members. Update Excel spreadsheet with new information.	1.10	
05/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/20/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise preliminary approval brief, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with class representatives re declarations in support of preliminary approval; correspond with class members re proposed settlement; conference with co-counsel re costs for preliminary approval papers; review revised draft settlement agreement, update preliminary approval brief re same; review and revise proposed order granting preliminary approval; conference with L. Cisneros and T. Desouza re declaration in support of preliminary approval, supervise drafting and exhibits re same.	9.10	
05/20/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research re settlement.	0.60	
05/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Conduct research for motion to seal; conference with D. Harvey.	2.50	
05/21/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review motion for preliminary approval, draft and edit K. Dermody declaration.	3.00	
05/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Calls with defense counsel re settlement issues; review/edit preliminary approval brief and settlement documents and conference with D. Harvey re same; research re settlement questions; edit K. Dermody declaration and email Joe Saveri re same; review cases re service awards; emails with Justina Sessions re settlement edits; review Phillips' ruling and email team re same; email Heffler, class member confirming notice/claim.	7.00	
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm background information for brief for L. Cisneros.	0.40	
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Edit a document for K. Dermody.	0.20	
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate bates numbers for D. Harvey.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Look up various docket numbers and find filings for D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	0.30	
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Settlement research for D. Harvey.	4.50	
05/21/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and documents to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
05/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re proposed settlement; research and revise preliminary approval brief, conference with K. Dermody re same; review and revise proposed order granting preliminary approval; review and revise settlement agreement; research sealing issue re termination provision, conference with L. Cisneros re same; review and revise draft declaration of K. Dermody; review class representative declarations; review correspondence with mediator re	5.30	
05/22/14	CARNAM, TODD	Search for certain order granting final approval of settlement for D. Harvey.	0.50	
05/22/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Draft motion to seal and related documents.	1.40	
05/22/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Edit motion to seal and supporting declaration, conference with D. Harvey.	1.20	
05/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit revised preliminary approval brief, order, K. Dermody declaration and related sealing motion and conference with D. Harvey re same; calls with Robert Van Nest and Justina Sessions re settlement issues.	9.50	
05/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Pull exhibits, draft declarations, prepare exhibits for filing, match them to declarations, fact check brief, and prepare chambers copies pertaining to the motion for preliminary approval for D. Harvey.	6.30	
05/22/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
05/22/14	FINEMAN, STEVEN	Review manner in which blow provision was addressed in the AXA case in the Northern District of California; share information with K. Dermody and D. Harvey.	0.80	
05/22/14	GEMAN, RACHEL	Emails with D. Harvey re settlement sealing question.	0.30	
05/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval and all supporting papers and related motions, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with L. Cisneros re same, conference with defense counsel re same, supervise e-filing of same.	11.50	
05/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re settlement approval brief; prepare for filing.	3.20	
05/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with S. Cassidy, Heffler re updating website re final approval; call to Michael Tubach re settlement; call to John Mitchell re escrow; respond to Heffler questions re intakes.	1.00	
05/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finish chambers' copies for motion for preliminary approval and submit to D. Harvey for review.	2.00	
05/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate stipulation between the Department of Justice and Ebay for D. Harvey.	0.30	
05/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Provide documents to the claims administrator per K. Dermody's request.	0.10	
05/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
05/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement, draft summary re same.	1.20	
05/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on class member inquiries, and confer with K. Dermody and T. Desouza.	1.20	
05/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with L. Cisneros re class telephone calls; email Heffler re class intakes.	0.20	
05/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemails from class members inquiring about the case. Forward attorney-specific calls to D. Harvey and L. Cisneros.	3.40	
05/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
05/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Heffler re billing; review/respond to Heffler re data questions; email Christina Brown re Heffler.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
05/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research settlement filings from a recent interchange case for D. Harvey.	2.50	
05/28/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and emails from class members for L. Cisneros. Update Excel spreadsheet with new information.	2.00	
05/29/14	ASHLYNN, WILLOW	Litigation Support: Online document management.	1.10	
05/29/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Handle class member inquiry.	0.60	
05/29/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management for B. Glackin.	2.40	
05/29/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and voicemails from class members for L. Cisneros. Update the Excel spreadsheet with the information.	2.20	
05/29/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.60	
05/29/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Dina Parker re plaintiff case materials; memorandum re same; office conference with T. Desouza re same.	0.50	
05/30/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Confer with T. Desouza and follow up with Heffler regarding responses to inquiries from class claimants.	0.60	
05/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Christina Brown re Class Action Fairness Act notice.	0.10	
05/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Finalize documents going to Dena Sharp for B. Glackin and send over via messenger. Draft cover letter to go with the flash drive.	1.20	
05/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemails from class members. Follow up with Heffler on a few individuals for further questions.	1.90	
05/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.50	
05/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise creation and delivery of case file materials to plaintiff's counsel.	0.30	
05/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class member re claims process and settlement; conference with defense counsel re Class Action Fairness Act notice issues.	1.30	
06/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding Heffler and class member inquiries, including	1.30	
06/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conferences with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re settlement approval issues, late claims.	1.00	
06/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and voicemails from class members and update the Excel spreadsheet with new information. Follow up with Heffler per L. Cisneros' instructions on verifying claims.	2.00	
06/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re settlement approval, objector strategy.	0.50	
06/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research class member claims issues, conference with T. Desouza re same; conference with K. Dermody re settlement approval research.	1.20	
06/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Daniel Girard re meeting.	0.10	
06/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Create binder for D. Harvey with documents relating to the interchange appeal for use here. Locate the docket for the current status of the appeal with the Second Circuit for D. Harvey.	2.50	
06/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemail from potential class members. Contact Heffler via telephone and email to discuss the status of class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet with the new incoming information.	2.20	
06/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence and electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and review filings from Interchange Fee settlement re settlement approval issues, including objections from named plaintiffs.	2.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Joe Saveri, Daniel Girard, Dena Sharp ; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same and preliminary approval; email with D. Harvey re Interchange documents and related case submissions; email Michael Tubach re preliminary approval.	3.00	
06/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Double check current status of the interchange case for important information that my be relevant for D. Harvey. Find other relevant information for D. Harvey.	1.10	
06/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research the dates of the motion for preliminary approval hearings along with their respective orders for the California Attorney General and U.S. Department of Justice case against Ebay for D. Harvey.	0.40	
06/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemails from class members. Talk with D. Harvey about how to deal with certain calls and email the claims administrator to verify if certain people are part of the class.	1.80	
06/04/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting with Dan Girard, K. Dermody, D. Harvey and Joseph Saveri; office conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey.	2.10	
06/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re preliminary approval.	0.30	
06/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research Ninth Circuit authority regarding final settlement approval; conference with objector attorneys, prepare for same, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; review filings from settlement approval and objections from Interchange case for application here.	5.60	
06/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meetings with D. Harvey re settlement approval, class intakes; conference with Daniel Girard re filing; telephone conference with Michael Tubach re settlement approval questions; telephone conference with Emily Henn re judgment and review consent notice re same; email Joe Saveri re same; review objection and email team/call D. Harvey re same; review materials submitted in Interchange antitrust approval and email David Kiernan, Michael Tubach re process.	4.00	
06/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls from class members and update the Excel spreadsheet. Forward any calls to D. Harvey where they request at attorney.	2.00	
06/05/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence; memorandum to K. Dermody re same.	0.40	
06/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with counsel re settlement; review correspondence; research filings from Interchange class action settlement for application in high tech; review brief in opposition to settlement, research same.	3.20	
06/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re judgment and review same; email Emily Henn re same; telephone conference with S. Fineman re settlement approval; email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re preliminary approval reply brief.	1.00	
06/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Put together a binder with all the cases in the objector brief for D. Harvey.	1.50	
06/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research cases relating to employee antitrust lawsuits. Find the total damages, settlement amounts, and class members for D. Harvey.	3.80	
06/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and voicemails from class members. Update Excel spreadsheet with the information.	0.70	
06/06/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
06/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re reply to objector opposition; memorandum re same to K. Dermody.	0.40	
06/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research reply to objection to preliminary approval, conference with B. Glackin re same; conference with potential class members.	4.40	
06/09/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull various Westlaw cites for D. Harvey.	0.20	
06/09/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on class member inquiries.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with Michael Tubach re reply and hearing; confer with D. Harvey re reply; emails with David Kiernan/Emily Henn re amended judgment; email Elder re hearing; review amended judgment.	1.50	
06/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confirm data re Albany nursing case in terms of damages, number of class members, and settlement amount.	0.60	
06/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find redacted versions of Edward Leamer's expert reports for B. Glackin.	0.30	
06/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls and emails from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet with their information. Contact Heffler for more information on a few class members.	2.20	
06/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices and correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.80	
06/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of motion for preliminary approval.	8.90	
06/10/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull various orders denying summary judgment on two separate dockets.	0.40	
06/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with restatus; call with Justina Sessions re mediator report and email draft re same; email Elder re judgment; confer with D. Harvey re reply briefing.	1.00	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Calculate settlement data from High-Tech Cold Calling.	0.80	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with K. Dermody re class member.	0.10	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate materials cited in the opposition brief to the settlement for D. Harvey.	0.20	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate most recent versions of Edward Leamer's reports on the docket for B. Glackin.	0.70	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Locate various documents for D. Harvey relating to orders on summary judgment.	0.20	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research expert reports on compensation issues for D. Harvey.	2.10	
06/10/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and emails from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet with new information.	0.80	
06/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of preliminary approval, conference with Econ One re same, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with T. Desouza re same, conference with N. Menard re same.	5.20	
06/10/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research related Ito itigation and data analysis for brief.	3.10	
06/11/14	CARNAM, TODD	Research the top all time settlements of claims by employees in a class action.	1.50	
06/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re reply brief and strategy; respond to Thomas re settlement.	0.50	
06/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research comparable employee settlements for D. Harvey.	4.50	
06/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and update Excel spreadsheet with new information from class members. Contact Heffler for more information on certain class members.	1.00	
06/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft reply brief in support of preliminary approval motion.	1.40	
06/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of preliminary approval, conference with and supervise research by T. Desouza and N. Menard re same, review and revise research re same.	7.60	
06/11/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research on prior litigation involving employees.	3.80	
06/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edits to reply brief and conferences with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Josh Davis re edits and review same; telephone conference with David Kiernan re brief and hearing; telephone conferences with John Mitchell re escrow and review documents re same; email Heffler re escrow; respond to class intakes.	5.50	
06/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with M. Elias re class member intakes.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Fact check the reply in support of the motion for preliminary approval for D. Harvey. Gather all supporting evidence. Format and update Exhibit A for the filing for D. Harvey.	5.00	
06/12/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return calls from class members and answer their questions.	1.00	
06/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft B. Glackin declaration for settlement.	0.80	
06/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, revise, and finalize reply brief in support of motion for preliminary approval, and all supporting papers, e-file same, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with T. Desouza re same, conference with N. Menard re same, conference with B. Troxel re same.	6.20	
06/12/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research on prior litigation for brief.	3.50	
06/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit legal citations re settlement reply brief.	1.80	
06/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with David Kiernan re filing; prepare for hearing; respond to Heffler; class intakes.	2.00	
06/13/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	0.80	
06/13/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	2.00	
06/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft/revise B. Glackin declaration.	1.60	
06/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re preliminary approval motion.	0.50	
06/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Miners re hearing issues.	0.10	
06/16/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Pull cases and put together hearing binder with index for K. Dermody.	1.10	
06/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Miners re hearing; email D. Harvey re hearing preparation; email D. Harvey re class notice.	0.30	
06/16/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Enter potential claimants' information into internal database; Forward potential claimants' information to Heffler to determine status of their entitlement to claims.	0.40	
06/16/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	3.30	
06/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage payment of invoices from cost fund.	0.10	
06/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for hearing on preliminary settlement approval, research materials for K. Dermody re same.	0.70	
06/16/14	RUDNICK, JENNIFER	Prepare preliminary approval pleadings binder.	1.80	
06/17/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review status of sclass member inquiry.	0.10	
06/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for hearing; review/respond to Attorney General email re Class Action Fairness Act; call to Sheldon Jaffe re same; confer with D. Harvey re preparation; follow-up on factual comparisons between similar settled cases and objector's cases.	4.00	
06/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assemble a binder with all the documents related to the motion for preliminary approval filings from the past two months.	1.40	
06/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with M. Elias on handling class intakes. Update the Excel spreadsheet with new information.	1.00	
06/17/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research for all cases filed in Exhibit A of the response in support of the motion for preliminary approval for D. Harvey.	2.50	
06/17/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research re preparations for preliminary approval hearing, conference with K. Dermody re same; correspond with class counsel re preparing time records for preliminary approval; conference with defense counsel re escrow agreement and notice issues; conference with Citibank re escrow agreement and issues re whether to place settlement funds in interest-bearing account, research same.	3.80	
06/17/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research on related litigation for hearing.	1.10	
06/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on various class member inquiries.	0.50	
06/18/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding	0.20	
06/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare hearing outline and practice questions; respond to media requests re hearing; research re incentive award ratios in Northern District of California cases; hearing preparation and conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re same; moot court with D. Harvey and B. Glackin.	7.00	
06/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with M. Elias re document management.	0.80	
06/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research for hearing for D. Harvey.	1.20	
06/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/18/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Work with M. Elias on returning calls from class members and update the Excel spreadsheet. Contact Joseph Mahan at Heffler with questions about specific class members.	2.70	
06/18/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	1.20	
06/18/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.70	
06/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Moot argument with K. Dermody for preliminary approval; Research on service awards.	1.60	
06/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for preliminary approval hearing, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; conference with James Dallal re his class members communications; conference with T. Desouza re communications statistics from class members; research details re government settlements in eBay case; research precedents for class member service awards and class recoveries.	10.10	
06/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re preliminary settlement approval.	0.60	
06/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re TFT-LCD class member data for B. Glackin for hearing in High-Tech Cold Calling.	0.60	
06/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for travel round trip to attend settlement approval hearing; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; respond to media inquiries re same; emails to S. Fineman, E. Cabraser re hearing; research re antitrust trials lost since 2000.	7.50	
06/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research incentive awards for all cases listed in Exhibit A of the reply in support of the motion for preliminary approval for D. Harvey.	1.70	
06/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research questions sent by D. Harvey during hearing on the motion for preliminary approval.	1.10	
06/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return voicemails and calls from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet and get in touch with Heffler for certain class members.	2.20	
06/19/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	0.50	
06/19/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	3.50	
06/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Attend preliminary approval hearing; travel to same.	5.60	
06/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for hearing regarding preliminary approval of settlement, travel re same, attend same, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same.	6.40	
06/19/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Research related litigation and other factual research for hearing.	3.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/19/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Exchange emails with team re preliminary approval hearing.	0.50	
06/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re preliminary settlement approval for K. Dermody.	1.50	
06/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re TFT-LCD class member data for B. Glackin for hearing.	2.00	
06/20/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding various class member inquiries.	0.50	
06/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re hearing, next steps; emails with E. Cabraser re potential recusal by defendants; email D. Harvey re judgment; review media reports re hearing and email S. Fineman re same.	3.00	
06/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Complete transcript order and file same. Contact court reporter.	0.50	
06/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Organize documents from settlement hearing.	0.30	
06/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemail from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet and contact Heffler with questions about class members.	4.00	
06/20/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update electronic court filing notices to the internal computer drive.	0.40	
06/20/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	0.50	
06/20/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update docket exhibits to P:/ drive and iManage.	1.00	
06/20/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re preliminary approval hearing; conference with counsel for Lucasfilm, Pixar, and Intuit re revised final order. research same, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with Court re same; conference with plaintiffs re	3.80	
06/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Sheldon Jaffe re Class Action Fairness Act notice; email Joe Saveri re same; meet with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Attorney General call and attend same; email Robert Van Nest re Attorney General call; email D. Harvey re plaintiffs/status; respond to media re hearing/settlement.	2.00	
06/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with M. Elias re class member tasks	0.50	
06/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Return telephone calls and voicemails from class members. Update the Excel spreadsheet with new information.	3.00	
06/23/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.10	
06/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with state AG's re proposed settlement; conference with plaintiffs re case status and next steps following preliminary approval hearing; research issues re potential fee request.	2.80	
06/24/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up on various class member inquiries.	0.50	
06/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re hearing and follow-up.	0.20	
06/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Assist with questions regarding class members and the claims administrator.	1.90	
06/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Talk with Lee-Anne Shortridge about questions she had about the hearing transcript request. Forward to D. Harvey for clarification.	0.20	
06/24/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.20	
06/24/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Conduct outreach to claims administrator re class members and follow up with class members regarding their status.	3.20	
06/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Court reporter re transcript questions, research same.	0.50	
06/25/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Respond to questions from class members and paralegals T. Desouza and M. Elias regarding class member inquiries, and review disputes from K. Dermody.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Confer with M. Elias re the production log and document management.	0.40	
06/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Meet with D. Harvey discussing assignment for motion filing.	0.20	
06/25/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Respond to class members emails and answer questions relating to them.	1.00	
06/25/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Create discovery logs re communications.	0.50	
06/25/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Meet with D. Harvey to discuss assignment regarding settlement.	0.10	
06/25/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Review class member chart to determine who to follow up with; email Heffler re class members.	1.20	
06/25/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update class member contact information chart for new claims administrator.	0.40	
06/25/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update correspondence to iManage and P:/ drive.	0.80	
06/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review transcript of preliminary approval hearing.	0.40	
06/25/14	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review hearing transcript.	0.40	
06/25/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Read transcript of preliminary approval hearing; Conference with team.	1.00	
06/26/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re Heffler claims disputes and email D. Harvey re same.	0.20	
06/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer various questions in calls and emails from class members. Email Joseph Mahan at Heffler with various tasks from L. Cisneros.	1.50	
06/26/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management re class members.	0.60	
06/26/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Review class member chart to determine who to follow up with; email Heffler re: potential class members.	0.60	
06/26/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with counsel for defendants re escrow agreement issues; review and research class member claims issues, draft summary re same.	1.40	
06/27/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Telephone call with the filer, and return call and email with Janet Wright.	0.70	
06/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails/calls with media re settlement hearing.	1.00	
06/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer questions relating to the settlement for class members.	0.70	
06/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Document management and correspond with the claims administrator.	0.50	
06/27/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research assignment from D. Harvey re settlement approval.	0.20	
06/27/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Conduct outreach to potential class members; update class member outreach chart; follow up with claims administrator regarding potential class members.	2.00	
06/27/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Research project for D. Harvey for settlement approval.	0.40	
06/27/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with team re potential trial strategies, research same.	1.20	
06/30/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull certain orders and send to M. Elias.	0.20	
06/30/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review class member dispute and confer with Joseph Mahan.	0.80	
06/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Citibank escrow question; review media coverage of settlement hearing.	0.50	
06/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research cases in digest binder for D. Harvey. Put into a Word document with M. Elias.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
06/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review class member intakes for D. Harvey.	0.40	
06/30/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update correspondence to the internal computer drive.	0.30	
06/30/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Research settlement issue for D. Harvey.	1.50	
06/30/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Review High-Tech Cold Calling contact chart for D. Harvey.	0.20	
06/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re proposed settlement; conference with settlement administrator re claims issues; conference with Citibank re escrow account issues, conference with defense counsel re same.	3.40	
06/30/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate order for T. Desouza.	0.20	
07/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with John Mitchell re escrow; confer with D. Harvey re settlement.	0.20	
07/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Deal with class member inquiries per L. Cisneros' instructions.	0.30	
07/01/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find certain orders from early in the case for D. Harvey.	0.20	
07/01/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Research settlement approvals for D. Harvey.	1.90	
07/01/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to claimants re settlement agreement and input/update information in internal database.	1.40	
07/01/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement approval status; e-file letter from class member in support of settlement; conference with Citibank re escrow account.	2.30	
07/02/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Review file for , confer with T. Desouza and M. Elias, and D. Harvey.	1.00	
07/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re settlement.	0.10	
07/02/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Correspond with Heffler for class member follow up.	0.20	
07/02/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Create research binder for D. Harvey.	1.50	
07/02/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update electronic court filing notifications to iManage and P:/ drive and circulate to attorneys.	0.20	
07/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement and case status.	1.20	
07/03/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer telephone calls from class members.	0.50	
07/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement status and settlement administration issues, conference with Heffler representatives re same; conference with employee re questions re class definition, settlements, potential claims.	2.70	
07/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference and correspond with class members re claims process for first round of settlements, and questions re claims process for second round.	0.60	
07/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review motion to intervene; confer with D. Harvey re same; respond to press inquiries re same.	2.00	
07/07/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to claimants re settlement agreement; Input and update information in internal database.	1.50	
07/07/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update electronic court filing notifications to P:/ drive and iManage and circulate to attorneys.	0.20	
07/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review motion to intervene; review order on motions to seal, conference with team re same, conference with Defendants' counsel re same.	1.20	
07/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review news program re case and websites re settlement and email B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same and information to class; review media reports re Lucas/Pixar; calls/email with media re motion to intervene.	3.00	
07/08/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Help M. Elias with an assignment from D. Harvey on cases filed in Exhibit A of the reply in support of the motion for preliminary approval.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/08/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Check cases cited in reply brief for D. Harvey.	1.70	
07/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re case status and questions re settlement.	0.60	
07/08/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support; Ensure user access to the database.	0.30	
07/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re call with Apple on sealing order.	0.10	
07/09/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Talk with potential class members about the case and update Excel spreadsheet.	0.30	
07/09/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Create new spreadsheet for D. Harvey of potential class members who have worked as animators.	1.20	
07/09/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update class member intake chart.	0.40	
07/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re questions re first round of settlements, and status of second round; conference with defense counsel re complying with order on motions to seal and issues re escrow agreement, research same.	2.20	
07/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email John Mitchell re escrow.	0.10	
07/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Review documents from CaseMap for D. Harvey.	1.00	
07/11/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Update class member list and return telephone calls and emails. Contact Heffler with some follow up requests. Check with D. Harvey and L. Cisneros about updating firm's website on information regarding the settlement.	1.60	
07/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Elder re unsealed documents.	0.20	
07/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Elder re unsealed documents.	0.20	
07/14/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Answer questions from class members and help M. Elias with any issues.	0.50	
07/14/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Locate and update filings to internal filing system.	2.50	
07/15/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Verify the dates complaints were filed by the Department of Justice for D. Harvey.	0.30	
07/15/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact potential class members; update class member intake chart.	1.00	
07/15/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Reorganize evidence binders with T. Desouza.	0.30	
07/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with conference with Heffler re same.	1.40	
07/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Call with Emily Henn re escrow edits; email Citibank re same; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler questions.	1.00	
07/16/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact potential class members; update class member contact spreadsheet.	2.00	
07/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re status of settlement and questions regarding particular class members; research legal issues re class distribution; conference with class members re settlement questions.	3.20	
07/17/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact potential class members re status of the case; update class member intake chart.	2.10	
07/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement distribution questions, follow-up with Heffler re certain questions and status.	1.20	
07/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised escrow and email John Mitchell; respond to Heffler issues.	0.30	
07/21/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact potential class members re: status of the case; update class member intake chart.	2.10	
07/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re status of settlement and answering questions re same; conference with claims administrator re allocation calculations and distributions procedures.	1.70	
07/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with John Mitchell re escrow.	0.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
07/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Dan Girard re status; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.30	
07/22/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Contact potential class members re status of the case; update class member intake chart.	0.10	
07/22/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Create chart of class members waiting for information.	0.90	
07/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund.	0.10	
07/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re escrow agreement, review proposed edits re same; conference with class members re settlement status and distribution procedures; conference with settlement administrator regarding allocation calculations and distribution schedule.	2.10	
07/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Heffler re claimants; email John Mitchell re escrow.	0.30	
07/23/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Respond to potential class member inquiries.	0.80	
07/23/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update intake chart with information for new potential class members.	0.90	
07/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow agreement and upload to file.	0.10	
07/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re Dan Girard call.	0.10	
07/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research cost reimbursement allocations, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with named plaintiffs re settlement approval status and case status generally.	1.40	
07/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, research same.	0.80	
07/28/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update chart of class members seeking information for D. Harvey.	0.20	
07/29/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Provide update to class members on status of the case and update class member outreach chart with new class member information.	1.90	
07/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Michael Tubach, defendants re new motion to intervene.	0.20	
07/30/14	ELIAS, MICHAEL	Update class member charts and send to D. Harvey.	1.20	
07/31/14	SWENSON, YUN	Forward case charts to B. Troxel and review same.	0.20	
08/05/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Telephone call with class member regarding the status of the settlement.	0.30	
08/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re status, Heffler issues; telephone conference with re status; email Joe Saveri re costs; email team re fake appeal.	1.20	
08/07/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails re motion to intervene and telephone call with Michael Tubach re same; conference with K. Dermody re same.	0.50	
08/08/14	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Review/research preliminary approval denial order.	2.00	
08/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review order re settlement approval and multiple calls/emails re same; email Layn Phillips re ; emails with D. Harvey re Heffler issues.	3.00	
08/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review order. Office conference with D. Harvey.	1.00	
08/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review order re motion for preliminary approval, conference with B. Glackin re same; conference with class representatives re conference with claims administrator re issues with Google foreign workers, research same.	3.20	
08/08/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding preliminary approval order.	0.30	
08/08/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Read order on preliminary approval and emails with team re same.	1.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/08/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Review of the most recent documents filed with the court.	1.00	
08/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	
08/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Brandon Marshall files for D. Harvey review.	3.00	
08/09/14	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Telephone conference with R. Lieff; correspondence with R. Lieff, K. Dermody, S. Fineman re settlement/resolution issues, strategy.	2.00	
08/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Layn Phillips ; emails with S. Fineman, E. Cabraser re order and next steps.	0.50	
08/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft summary of next steps re denial of preliminary approval.	0.70	
08/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with S. Fineman, E. Cabraser re next steps; emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	0.50	
08/11/14	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Legal research. Search for dockets and complaints.	0.50	
08/11/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding class member inquiries.	1.20	
08/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with LCHB team re next steps, case management conference statement; emails with meanils with Kevin Hallock re trial schedule; email Joe Saveri re costs; email with D. Harvey re call with Christina Brown; email R. Heimann re status.	3.00	
08/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting re case planning and trial tasks.	1.30	
08/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with D. Harvey re order and tasks.	0.30	
08/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference re order denying preliminary approval and next steps; conference with class members re status and earlier settlement; conference with Heffler re distribution issues, research same; research pending unresolved motions at time of settlement; conference with defense counsel re case schedule, outstanding motions, document authentication issues, and case management conference statement; research case management conference statement, draft same.	5.60	
08/11/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding potential appeal; legal research into collateral order doctrine.	0.30	
08/11/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin and D. Harvey re trial schedule and task list; review order.	2.50	
08/11/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Upload and review of recently filed briefings.	1.10	
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case calendar re pending trials for B. Glackin.	0.20	
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Brandon Marshell documents for D. Harvey.	1.30	
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Ninth Circuit collateral order and save to file.	0.10	
08/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email L. Cisneros re Google intake; review media re objector's comments and email team re same; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler issues; email with Kevin Hallock re trial.	1.50	
08/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Heffler re claims issues, research same; conference with L. Cisneros re class members inquires; research and draft case management statement; research undecided motions; research joint and several liability as concurrent tortfeasors.	5.10	
08/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Research re case law on appeal of preliminary approval order.	1.00	
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Brandon Marshall documents for D. Harvey review.	4.00	
08/13/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Discuss status of case and get R. Terrell-Perica added to electronic court filing notifications.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re new litigation strategy; emails with Joe Saveri re cost management and call to Joe Saveri re same; review media reports re settlement; confer with D. Harvey re Google employee caller email with S. Fineman re settlement position.	1.00	
08/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel re renewing pending motions and potential administrative motion; conference with claims administrator re compensation data; conference with team re follow-up with class member inquiries; conference with co-counsel re costs; research claims and settlement administration issues, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with Heffler re same; draft and circulate administrative motion to renew pending motions.	5.30	
08/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Research re case law on appealing order and start memo re same.	5.00	
08/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Cost management; email with B. Glackin re trial schedule; email Robert Van Nest re call; email D. Harvey re service awards.	0.50	
08/14/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Review of class member information. Input into spreadsheet cataloguing class member contact. Follow up with class members regarding the status of the case.	3.80	
08/15/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Get information for R. Terrell-Perica regarding case information.	0.30	
08/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re draft case management conference statement and edit same; email Layn Phillips re call; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re status; email/call with John Mitchell re escrow management; email Joe Saveri re administrative motion.	1.50	
08/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft case management conference statement; review and revise administrative motion re renewing pending motions; conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re settlement issues; conference with L. Cisneros re class member inquiries; conference with Heffler re a variety of administration issues; correspond with class representatives re	6.20	
08/15/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review pretrial statement and draft case management conference statement from D. Harvey; draft memo re appeal and emails with team re same.	6.00	
08/15/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Review of submissions to the case website. Input class member information into spreadsheet for follow up.	4.30	
08/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Locate Brandon Marshall court reporter information for D. Harvey.	0.10	
08/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re settlement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re same; call/email LCHB team re same and next steps; respond to class/media intakes; escrow management; telephone conference with Dan Girard and Joe Saveri re mediation; email Robert Van Nest re status; confer with D. Harvey re case management conference.	3.00	
08/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re status of settlement distribution issues, research same; research settlement strategies, conference with K. Dermody re same.	1.70	
08/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiff information for D. Harvey.	0.40	
08/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re named plaintiffs and settlement talks: letters to Joe Saveri, David Kiernan re escrow; email with John Mitchell re same; telephone conference with Lavn Phillips re Dan Girard re Layn Phillips	2.00	
08/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement administration status: conference with Heffler re settlement computations and associated issues; conference with named plaintiffs re	2.20	
08/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri, Layn Phillips re ; email John Mitchell re escrow issues; review file re pending motions and briefing.	1.00	
08/20/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement administration issues, conference with Heffler re same; conference with L. Cisneros re class member communications.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
08/20/14	TERRELL-PERICA, RACHEL	Intakes with class members.	0.50	
08/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re trial date; email D. Harvey re mock jury research; email Joe Saveri re draft case management conference statement; review/email Joe Saveri re cost issues; respond to Rosenblatt inquiry; review for Layn Phillips.	2.50	
08/21/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support: pload videos and audio to the FileShare and create links per deponents.	2.00	
08/21/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Revise uploaded data/create encryptions.	1.50	
08/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri, David Kiernan re escrow issues; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re status; review revised case management conference statement and telephone conference with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard; email with D. Harvey re jury research; review cost fund issues; email with D. Harvey re paying service awards; review jury video.	4.00	
08/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Dan Girard re administration issues, research same; review draft class member allocation calculations; revise case management statement, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with defendants' counsel re same.	6.20	
08/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.20	
08/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare time count re plaintiff's deposition videos for D. Harvey.	0.30	
08/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re case status.	0.20	
08/25/14	ZANE, ALEXANDER	Email N. Menard re inquiry re case.	0.10	
08/26/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Joe Saveri re cost disbursement; email Layn Phillips and email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	0.20	
08/27/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Robert Van Nest, team re trial date; email Joe Saveri re disbursements.	0.20	
08/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review invoice, email from Heffler.	0.10	
08/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence.	0.20	
08/29/14	CISNEROS, LISA	Follow up regarding class member inquiries and organize tracking.	4.50	
08/29/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re eBay settlement.	0.10	
08/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.20	
09/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/revise case management conference statement and confer with D. Harvey re trial, open issues, Heffler; email Joe Saveri re case management conference statement.	2.00	
09/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence with Alan Manning re trial.	0.10	
09/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise case management conference statement, conference with defense counsel re same; conference with claims administrator re distribution of settlement and cost issues; conference with class members re settlement and recovery questions.	4.20	
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence and save to file.	0.30	
09/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit revised case management conference; email with Joe Saveri re settlement discussions; review draft mandamus and recommend against joining; email with R. Heimann, S. Fineman, B. Glackin re mandamus; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re status; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re questions and status of settlement; review claims administration invoice, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with claims administrator re distribution progress, questions, and issues; conference with defendants re case management statement; review and e-file case management statement; review defendants' draft writ re order on preliminary approval.	3.60	
09/03/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review draft motion for mandamus from defendants and emails re same with team.	0.70	
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re status conference statement.	0.50	
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence.	0.50	
09/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review class check language and email Heffler; confer with B. Glackin re trial; prepare for/attend meeting with R. Heimann, S. Fineman, B. Glackin re settlement status, trial, mandamus; confer with D. Harvey re class intakes and Heffler; respond to media updates re case management conference; email Robert Van Nest re settlement; email team re stay request and recommend oppose same; telephone conference with David Kiernan re Qualified Settlement Fund and email Heffler re same.	3.00	
09/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Strategy meeting with K. Dermody, R. Heimann and S. Fineman.	0.90	
09/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re settlement issues; conference with K. Dermody re administration; conference with class members re settlement schedule and questions; conference with team re Court's scheduling order; conference with plaintiffs re trial availability; conference with defendants' counsel re trial scheduling, writ petition, and supplemental case management conference statements.	4.10	
09/04/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Input client information into Excel document for claims processing.	3.00	
09/05/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Layn Phillips re settlement; emails with Joe Saveri, Heffler re class member checks; confer with B. Glackin re per se brief assignments; respond to inquiries from class, media re mandamus; email Heffler re Qualified Settlement Fund; confer with A. Shaver re Ninth Circuit mandamus rules; email Emily Henn, Heffler re Pixar data; edit report to court on trial date and email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; review electronic court filing re class member note.	2.50	
09/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement administration; conference with plaintiffs re potential trial schedule; conference with L. Cisneros re status of business records disputes; conference with S. Tajima re case organization, class member communications, and trial preparation generally; draft supplemental case management statement; research whether defendants have ability to seek review of order denying preliminary approval.	3.40	
09/05/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Review Excel spreadsheet with contact information for High Tech Cold Calling and call class members for updated address information.	1.00	
09/05/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Search for documents requested by Elizabeth Kramer at Girard Gibbs LLP and create a cover letter.	2.00	
09/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re revisions to report on trial.	0.10	
09/08/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re statement on trial data, Heffler issues; telephone conference with Layn Phillips, Joe Saveri re settlement; confer with D. Harvey re class settlement disbursement; email R. Heimann, team re settlement status; review pretrial order and email LCHB team re same.	1.50	
09/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants' counsel re supplemental status report, revise and file same; conference with claims administrator re finalizing allocations and transfer amounts; conference with escrow re transfer amounts; draft and revise letters to escrow re fund transfers; conference with class members re settlement status questions; conference with S. Tajima re tracking class member inquiries and updated address list; correspond with counsel re trial date.	3.70	
09/08/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research for trial.	1.30	
09/08/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize, update, and print Excel spreadsheet with people who have contacted LCHB regarding High Tech Cold Calling. Track class members who must be contacted regarding distribution dates and check amounts.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case files for D. Harvey review.	0.50	
09/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence, respond.	0.30	
09/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Layn Phillips. Joe Saveri re settlement; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re per se brief; email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re media intake	0.60	
09/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re settlement issues, correspondence re same; conference with class members re settlement progress questions; conference with plaintiffs re Court's case management order and status generally; revise correspondence to escrow re funds transfer, audit calculations and amounts; confer with Kelly Dermody re plaintiff.	3.20	
09/09/14	MENARD, NICOLAS	Factual research.	0.50	
09/09/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members. Forward information to those working on case.	1.50	
09/09/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update Northern District of California order to P:/ drive, email out to High Tech Cold Calling members, calendar, and Records.	0.30	
09/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence, respond.	0.20	
09/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize and save all correspondence for the High Tech Cold Calling antitrust case to P:/ drive.	2.00	
09/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Research class member questions.	2.00	
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.30	
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence.	0.30	
09/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re per se reply brief.	0.40	
09/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise per se brief; office conference with K. Dermody re settlement.	1.90	
09/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Heffler re settlement distribution issues; conference with class members re settlement distribution questions; correspond with counsel for Intel re questions re class member exclusions, conference with K. Dermody re same; review, research, and revise reply brief in support of per se standard, conference with B. Glackin re same, conference with K. Dermody re same.	5.10	
09/11/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update High Tech Cold Calling Antitrust list of class members awaiting information.	0.70	
09/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re mediation; conferences with Joe Saveri re mediation; conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard re defendant's settlement position; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Layn Phillips re settlement; telephone conference with Citibank re escrow; confer with B. Glackin re case management; confer with media re electronic court filing.	2.50	
09/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review of per se reply brief.	0.50	
09/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research reply in support of motion re per se standard, conference with B. Glackin re same, e-file same; conference with Citibank re interest crediting and funds transfer issues, research same, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with Heffler re same; conference with class members re questions re settlement status.	3.80	
09/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Telephone call with Santa Clara County Counsel re deposition; conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re same; review per se reply brief.	1.00	
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re per se standard reply.	0.60	
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.40	
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit contact log re class member correspondence.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls to class members re case status.	0.60	
09/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review motion to relate case.	0.30	
09/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Heffler re status of Pixar data and status of allocation calculations; conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with S. Tajima re communications with class members; review document production to counsel, conference with S. Tajima re same; review motion to relate, conference with B. Glackin re same; review briefing on motion to compel, research reply in support; conference with Adobe counsel re Brandon Marshall deposition transcript.	3.40	
09/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Call back class members and those with inquiries regarding the settlement.	2.00	
09/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Prepare and send out documents requested by counsel.	3.50	
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email class members re case status.	0.40	
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for D. Harvey review.	0.30	
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.30	
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone class member re case status.	0.10	
09/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re related case, settlement issues; email with D. Harvey re motion to compel.	0.20	
09/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Heffler re status of allocation calculations and related issues; conference with S. Tajima re communications with class members; conference with class members re settlement questions; review briefing re plaintiffs' motion to compel, research reply in support of same.	3.60	
09/16/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize High Tech Cold Calling correspondence.	1.00	
09/17/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Retrieve Greenspan v. IAC complaint for D. Harvey.	0.40	
09/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with Joe Saveri re settlement, pending briefs; email with Layn Phillips re same; review edits to ; email Kevin Hallock re trial date.	1.50	
09/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re reply brief re Judgment Sharing Agreement; telephone conference with K. Dermody re settlement.	0.60	
09/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft reply in support of motion to compel defendants' ; conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Heffler re settlement allocation status and questions, review and research proposed final allocations; research confidentiality obligations re settlement discussions, correspond with defendants' counsel re same; conference with B. Glackin re trial and pretrial strategy.	6.20	
09/17/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Check in with D. Harvey on status of Heffler and claim amounts; document project.	0.50	
09/17/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize High Tech Cold Calling documents/folders on P:/ drive.	1.00	
09/17/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond and track High Tech Cold Calling inquiries. Coordinate with B. Troxel on contact list.	1.50	
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email class members re case status.	0.20	
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense filings for D. Harvey review.	1.30	
09/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Layn Phillips and Joe Saveri re settlement; confer with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re settlement motions; confer with D. Harvey re defendants' proposed per se sur-reply; confer with B. Glackin re cost fund; edit brief.	2.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund.	0.60	
09/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise reply in support of motion to compel; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	1.50	
09/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise reply brief in support of motion to compel, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with B. Glackin re same: conference with counsel for defendants' regarding conference with counsel for defendants' regarding conference with counsel for defendants' re their proposed motion for leave to file sur-reply in opposition to per se motion, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same; conference with Heffler re status of disbursements and issues re calculations; conference with class members re settlement questions; review motion for leave to file sur-reply and proposed sur-reply, conference with B. Glackin re same, research opposition to same.	9.40	
09/18/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Manage High Tech Cold Calling email intake. Update telephone numbers in main class member spreadsheet. Save emails to P:/ drive.	1.00	
09/18/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Read new class member emails, respond. Save correspondence to P:/ drive. Check in with D. Harvey on status of Heffler claim amounts.	1.00	
09/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Lavn Phillips re impasses; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re settlement; review administrative motion on sealing brief and confer with D. Harvey re same; edit revised telephone conference with Kevin Hallock re status; email Layn Phillips re re same.	1.80	
09/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re reply brief.	0.30	
09/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review reply brief in support of motion to compel.	0.30	
09/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Heffler re status of allocation calculations and distributions, research same; review, revise, and further research reply in support of motion to compel, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with B. Glackin re same; research and draft administrative motion to unseal papers re motion to compel; e-file motion to unseal and reply in support of motion to compel; conference with defendants' counsel re research opposition to defendants' administrative motion for leave to file sur-reply in opposition to the per se standard.	8.20	
09/19/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class emails to P:/ drive. Monitor inquiries. Coordinate with B. Troxel on responding.	1.00	
09/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re filing under seal.	0.40	
09/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement status.	0.30	
09/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re Kevin Hallock status.	0.20	
09/21/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft response to defendants' admin motion for leave to file sur-reply re per se standard, and response to sur-reply.	8.10	
09/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Ninth Circuit order and email with LCHB team re same; email order to Dan Girard; email proposed draft response to Ninth Circuit to Joe Saveri; edit opposition to defendants' administrative motion and review Joe Saveri edits to same; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re mandamus response and email to Joe Saveri, LCHB re same; confer with D. Harvey re media inquiry; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler check status.	2.00	
09/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft insert to opposition to administrative motion for sur-reply.	1.20	
09/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re brief; review brief opposing administrative motion.	0.40	
09/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Heffler re settlement allocation progress and issues; conference with class members re settlement questions; research, draft, and revise opposition to defendants motion for leave, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with B. Glackin re same, e-file same; review Ninth Circuit's order re defendants' writ, conference with B. Glackin re same.	7.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/22/14	TAJIMA, SERA	File and process chambers copies.	1.00	
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citations for D. Harvey review.	0.30	
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re motion to compel.	1.20	
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert report for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status letter for D. Harvey review.	0.10	
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement status, respond.	0.40	
09/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re related case issues; multiple emails with Joe Saveri re mandamus; email Dan Girard re same; confer with D. Harvey re responding to Ninth Circuit order; review defendants' response to administrative motion.	1.50	
09/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review motion to unseal.	0.30	
09/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review petition response.	0.30	
09/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize binders/documents in war room.	0.60	
09/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Prepare chambers copies for Judge Koh.	0.50	
09/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Prepare electronic court filing notice to be sent out to High Tech Cold Calling group. Upload to P:/ drive.	0.50	
09/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update electronic court filing notices and forward to High Tech Cold Calling group and Records. Respond to emails from class members regarding claims. Save correspondence to P:/ drive.	2.00	
09/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re per se briefing.	0.50	
09/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement status, respond.	0.30	
09/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from class member re settlement status.	0.10	
09/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re mandamus and settlement.	0.10	
09/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re writ petition response.	0.20	
09/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re status of calculations and checks to class members; conference with class members re questions on settlement and other issues; research and draft response to defendants' petition for writ of mandamus.	2.20	
09/24/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize High Tech Cold Calling binders in war room. Trial preparation work.	3.00	
09/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare appellate filings for D. Harvey review.	0.10	
09/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for D. Harvey review.	0.40	
09/25/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Call/email Joe Saveri re mandamus; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler issues.	0.20	
09/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re data issue, draft summary re same; conference with counsel for Lucasfilm re data issue; conference with class members re settlement status questions.	1.40	
09/25/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Check in with D. Harvey and B. Glackin on news from Heffler Claims Group. Respond to class member inquiries. Leave a voicemail update for Ricardo Hawkins.	1.00	
09/25/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Trial preparation work.	1.00	
09/25/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Upload electronic court filing to P:/ drive and forward to High Tech Cold Calling group.	0.50	
09/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for D. Harvey review.	0.40	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
09/26/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Call with Joe Saveri re status; conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin re mandamus response and review same; email mandamus arguments to Joe Saveri; email Dan Girard re status.	2.00	
09/26/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise opposition to writ; office conference with D. Harvey.	0.50	
09/26/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with K. Dermody re response to writ of mandamus, conference with B. Glackin re same, research same, revise same.	3.20	
09/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence and save to file.	0.30	
09/29/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re mandamus; email Joe Saveri re same; email B. Glackin re same.	0.30	
09/29/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Manage case calendaring for many motions.	1.00	
09/29/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Manage correspondence, save to P:/ drive and respond to class members.	2.00	
09/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review scheduling orders re revised case calendar.	0.20	
09/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard re mandamus; edit letter to Robert Van Nest re same; email with Robert Van Nest re timing; confer with D. Harvey re Robert Van Nest letter and mandamus.	1.50	
09/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review, revise, and serve correspondence to defendants re petition for writ of mandamus; conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with counsel for Lucasfilm re data issues.	2.20	
09/30/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update High Tech Cold Calling class member correspondence in P:/ drive, update class members awaiting updates list, check addresses on main class member contact IManage document. Forward information to D. Harvey and B. Troxel.	1.00	
09/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email class member re case status.	0.20	
09/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Brandon Marshall documents for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
09/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call to class member re case status.	0.20	
10/01/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised mandamus opposition and telephone conference with Joshua Davis re same; emails with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same; review draft motion to dismiss and email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	1.80	
10/02/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with S. Fineman, J. Selbin, M. Sobol re motion to dismiss strategy and conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re status, mandamus and email Layn Phillips re review Layn Phillips' proposal and email Joe Saveri re same; confer with B. Glackin re settlement status; email mandamus and confer with D. Harvey re same; email Joe Saveri re motion to dismiss.	3.00	
10/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research response to writ petition; conference with defendants' counsel re response to letter re jurisdiction over writ petition; review defendants' correspondence, conference with B. Glackin re same; conference with counsel for Lucasfilm re data issues; conference with class members re questions re settlement status.	2.10	
10/02/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review letter from Robert Van Nest re petition for writ and draft response from D. Harvey re same.	0.30	
10/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email class member re case status.	0.20	
10/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	
10/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Joe Saveri re Layn Phillips' proposal, mandamus and motion to dismiss; email Layn Phillips re proposal; email Dan Girard re check-in; edit revised mandamus and email Joe Saveri re same; confer with B. Glackin re mandamus.	2.00	
10/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with counsel for Pixar and Lucasfilm re data issues; research response to writ petition, review edits re same.	1.70	
10/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Dan Girard re status and email Joe Saveri re same.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/06/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Call with Dean Harvey re litigation support project.	0.50	
10/06/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support: copy email collections, indexed for searching.	3.00	
10/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for D. Harvey's review.	0.60	
10/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence.	0.20	
10/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with class member re case status.	0.20	
10/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised brief and confer with D. Harvey re same; email with B. Glackin re same.	0.80	
10/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise response to writ petition; conference with class members re status of settlement distribution.	1.20	
10/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	
10/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence.	0.40	
10/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re status of settlement distribution; correspond with counsel for Lucasfilm re status of data issues.	0.60	
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email class members re case status.	0.50	
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re late claims for class member.	0.30	
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with class member re case status.	0.20	
10/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Layn Phillips' message re settlement and email Joe Saveri re same; conference with team re same.	0.30	
10/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Edit response to writ petition.	0.50	
10/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with settlement administrator re distribution and data issues; conference with Lucasfilm counsel re data issues; conference with class members re settlement distribution status, conference with S. Tajima re same; review and revise response to petition, conference with B. Glackin re same, research contract interpretation under California law; correspond with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re settlement discussions.	4.50	
10/09/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation Support: Export search results and send data path to Dean Harvey.	2.00	
10/09/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member emails to correspondence folder in P:/ drive.	0.50	
10/09/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update list of class members to contact.	1.00	
10/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re settlement response; conference with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re mandamus opposition and edit same; telephone conference with Layn Phillips re settlement.	1.50	
10/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody re settlement.	0.30	
10/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft writ opposition.	0.40	
10/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement distribution status and progress, conference with S. Tajima re same; review and revise response to writ petition; Conference with K. Dermody.	1.20	
10/10/14	MAYER-CANTU, JEROME	Review filing requirements for petition for writ of mandamus.	0.50	
10/10/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Litigation support: Index collections and create new search parameters.	1.00	
10/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Joshua Davis' edits to mandamus and email D. Harvey re same.	0.30	
10/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review revisions to the response to writ petition, research same, conference with Josh Davis re same.	1.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with Joe Saveri re settlement issues and call with Dan Girard re same; edit mandamus and confer with D. Harvey re same; review Dan Girard's draft opposition and email Joe Saveri re same; draft response to Robert Van Nest re mandamus and email Joe Saveri re same; confer with D. Harvey re filing and case research.	3.00	
10/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise response to writ petition, conference with K. Dermody re same; draft and revise correspondence to defense counsel re settlement agreement, conference with K. Dermody re same; review draft response from Michael Devine's counsel, conference with K, Dermody re same; conference with claims administrator re status of settlement distribution; research procedural requirements for writ response, conference with J. Mayer-Cantu re same.	7.80	
10/13/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Create binder for J. Mayer-Cantu for 9th circuit petition research.	1.00	
10/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare mandamus response for filing.	4.00	
10/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit mandamus opposition and confer with D. Harvey re same; conference with Dan Girard re mandamus and settlement and review Dan Girard's draft opposition; conference with media re filing.	2.00	
10/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise response to petition, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with J. Mayer-Cantu re same, conference with B. Troxel re same, supervise e-filing and service of same; review Dan Girard's response to petition.	4.60	
10/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare mandamus response for filing and service.	2.30	
10/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conferences with Joe Saveri re settlement issues; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard re settlement issues; edit for Layn Phillips and email Layn Phillips re same; confer with S. Fineman re Ninth Circuit filing and settlement; calls with media re Ninth Circuit filing; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler payments.	2.00	
10/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update contact list and respond to inquiries.	1.00	
10/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re case status.	0.20	
10/16/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re distribution process, conference with claims administrator re same.	0.30	
10/16/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to High Tech class member inquiries.	0.50	
10/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to request for amicus and email with B. Glackin, D. Harvey and Morrison Foerster lawyer re same.	0.20	
10/20/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries about claim dates and amounts.	0.50	
10/21/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members regarding inquiries.	0.50	
10/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with claims administrator re settlement distribution, research same.	1.20	
10/22/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding inquiries involving settlement.	0.50	
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence re settlement status.	0.20	
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence and save to file.	0.70	
10/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administrator re settlement procedure; conference with class members re settlement amounts and status, conference with S. Tajima	1.40	
10/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Verify class members on Heffler Claims Group's new list of calculated check amounts. Call class members to notify them of their amount.	4.00	
10/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re claim status.	0.30	
10/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls to class members re claim status.	1.20	
10/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with LCHB team re Heffler checks and calls.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
10/24/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members with questions regarding claims.	2.00	
10/27/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with class representatives re case and settlement status.	1.30	
10/27/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Verify class member status and respond to inquiries regarding the settlement.	1.50	
10/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	
10/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review claim status re class member.	0.10	
10/28/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives re status of settlement distributions and questions re same; conference with class members re questions re settlement and case status, supervise S. Tajima and B. Troxel re responses to same.	2.60	
10/28/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries regarding settlement.	1.00	
10/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re case status, respond.	0.40	
10/29/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review intake from class member.	0.30	
10/29/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member's voicemails and emails.	3.00	
10/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re claim status, respond.	0.30	
10/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Dan Girard brief and telephone conference with Dan Girard re same; email Joe Saveri, B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same.	1.00	
10/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review amicus briefs and defendants' reply, research potential opposition to motion for leave to file amicus briefs.	2.20	
10/30/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Locate documents off PACER for D. Harvey.	0.50	
10/30/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	3.00	
10/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence, respond.	0.30	
10/31/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Dan Girard re brief; call to Joe Saveri re brief; confer with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re opposition brief (re mandamus amici); confer with D. Harvey re Heffler and email Emily Henn and David Kiernan re same.	1.00	
10/31/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, supervise responses re same; conference with Heffler re questions concerning distributions to class members who worked for more than one Defendant during the class period, draft summary re same, conference with K. Dermody re same; research issues re petition.	3.60	
10/31/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	2.00	
10/31/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with D. Harvey about Heffler checks.	0.50	
10/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re case status.	0.20	
10/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls with class members re case status.	0.50	
11/02/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft oppositions to motions for leave to file amicus briefs.	10.10	
11/03/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise Ninth Circuit brief and confer with D. Harvey re same; review Josh Davis' edits to same; confer with D. Harvey re Judgment Sharing Agreement dispute.	2.50	
11/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review response to motion for leave to file amicus briefs; office conference with D. Harvey re same.	0.80	
11/03/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise opposition to motion for leave, conference with K. Dermody re same, conference with B. Glackin re same, conference with Josh Davis re same; supervise preparation of under seal versions, research rules re same; draft and revise notice of filing under seal; e-file opposition brief.	6.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/03/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	3.00	
11/03/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and verify addresses.	1.50	
11/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare ninth circuit filing.	1.50	
11/04/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Pre-trial management: Confer with D. Harvey re pre-trial conference and upcoming assignments; meet with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, A. Shaver re pre-trial conference, witnesses, case management conference statement; review filings re same.	2.50	
11/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	LCHB Team meeting re pre-trial work.	1.40	
11/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft summary of all pretrial deadlines, tasks, and issues; conference with opposing counsel re pretrial tasks; conference with K. Dermody, B. Glackin, and A. Shaver re pretrial strategy and writ petition issues.	4.20	
11/04/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Verify class member status and contact those with inquiries to confirm.	2.00	
11/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence re case status.	0.20	
11/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls with class members re case status.	0.40	
11/05/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement distribution questions; conference with counsel for Defendants re outstanding pre-trial issues, research same; draft and circulate case management statement.	4.20	
11/05/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Review emails and check class member status. Respond to inquiries.	1.00	
11/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/edit case management conference statement; confer with D. Harvey re same; emails with A. Shaver re Ninth Circuit panels.	0.80	
11/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re document authentication dispute.	0.80	
11/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with claims administration re settlement distribution; conference with class members re settlement questions; draft and revise case management statement, correspond with Defendants re same; research document admissibility issues, conference with B. Glackin re same, review correspondence from Intel re same.	4.20	
11/06/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Check class member status and respond to inquiries.	2.00	
11/06/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond by telephone to class member inquiries.	2.00	
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case filings re redacted Intel exhibit for D. Harvey.	0.80	
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement.	0.20	
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from class members re case status.	0.20	
11/07/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re Heffler mailing.	0.10	
11/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Bob Van Nest re document issues.	0.40	
11/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Intel counsel re business records dispute, prepare for same; conference with Google counsel re business records dispute and case management conference statement, conference with B. Glackin re same; review and research business records requests and information; review witness lists; Confer with K. Dermody re Heffler.	3.20	
11/07/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries	1.00	
11/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition testimony for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
11/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review e-mails from class members re case status.	0.20	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' edits to case management conference statement and edit same; confer with D. Harvey re open issues.	1.00	
11/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research business record disputes, conference with Apple counsel re same; review, revise, and research case management statement, conference with K. Dermody, defense counsel re same; conference with claims administrator re settlement distribution; conference with class members re settlement questions, conference with and supervise S. Tajima re same.	3.10	
11/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize correspondence regarding witness lists, witnesses.	3.00	
11/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	4.00	
11/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement status.	0.20	
11/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re defense witness list for D. Harvey.	0.30	
11/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re further edits to case management conference statement; edit same; confer with D. Harvey re late claims; edit High-Tech Cold Calling web page.	1.00	
11/11/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and circulate case management statement, confer with K. Dermody; research, draft, and revise joint statement on business record disputes; research and draft letter re revised witness lists; conference with class members re settlement status; conference with claims administrator re settlement distribution.	5.20	
11/11/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review witness list notes from March 2014; review witness list from D. Harvey for developing same.	0.30	
11/11/14	TAJIMA, SERA	For D. Harvey, organize of all correspondence regarding stipulated documents and witness lists.	3.00	
11/11/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries. Check status.	3.00	
11/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re document authentication issues; prepare for case management conference and possible arguments on pending motions; edit final revised case management conference statement; conference with LCHB team re revised witness list.	3.00	
11/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise case management statement, conference with defendants re same, e-file same; revise correspondence re witness list, research same, conference with team re same; revise joint statement re business record disputes, research same, conference with team re same.	4.10	
11/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Emails re witness list, review case management conference statement and Ninth Circuit calendar.	1.00	
11/12/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries regarding settlement checks.	3.00	
11/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Heffler letter re supplemental payment and confer with D. Harvey re same; emails re business records issues.	0.50	
11/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise joint statement re business records, circulate to Defendants' counsel; conference with individual Defendant counsel re document admission issues, draft summaries re same; review late-claim rejection letter; conference with class members re settlement questions.	6.30	
11/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Research supplemental authority rules for Ninth Circuit.	0.20	
11/13/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and check status.	4.00	
11/13/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Search for documents for filing.	3.00	
11/14/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with opposing counsel re document admissibility issues.	0.70	
11/14/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Search for documents for hearing preparation.	2.00	
11/14/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member correspondence to P:/ drive.	1.00	
11/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re exhibits in public record for D. Harvey.	0.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
11/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review business records dispute issues and motion in limine briefing in preparation for questions at case management conference; meet with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re case management conference; multiple conferences with D. Harvey re joint statement on business records and edit same; review Mark Fichtner document identified by Intel for authentication; prepare for hearing.	3.00	
11/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with various defense counsel re business record disputes; review and revise draft stipulation, conference with defense counsel re same, conference with K. Dermody re same; draft and revise notice to court re business record dispute; conference with K. Dermody and A. Shaver re case management conference, prepare for same, research same; conference with defense counsel re filings and draft joint statement, review and revise same.	5.60	
11/17/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re case management conference; review case management conference statement; review motions in limine; review per se briefing.	2.00	
11/17/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize case management conference documents, including pending motions and exhibits, create indices for D. Harvey and K. Dermody.	3.00	
11/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Heffler letter re late claims and confer with D. Harvey re same; email Beringer re trial and Sheryl Sandberg testimony; review Judge Koh order re case management conference and pretrial conference and email with LCHB team re same.	1.00	
11/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for case management conference, including reviewing briefs re: motion to compel, motion for application of per se standard, motions to exclude expert testimony, and motion to unseal; conference with opposing counsel re discovery issues, correspond with opposing counsel re same; review and research document designations and conference with opposing counsel re same; conference with claims administrator re communicating with class members who submitted late claims.	7.10	
11/18/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review correspondence with defendants; prepare for case management conference.	3.00	
11/18/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize additional documents for D. Harvey's binder regarding opposition to expert witness testimony.	2.00	
11/18/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries regarding class member status and settlement checks.	2.50	
11/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re court orders on supplemental briefing; review orders re briefs.	0.50	
11/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review court order re motion to seal and other issues, research whether sur-sur reply regarding per se standard is necessary, conference with B. Glackin re same, draft and circulate summary re same.	1.80	
11/19/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review electronic court filings.	0.20	
11/19/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize Ninth Circuit filings on electronic database.	2.50	
11/20/14	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Litigation support: Export documents from Summation database.	1.00	
11/20/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Locate and assemble documents for D. Harvey.	1.00	
11/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re Heffler checks, settlement closure; confer with B. Glackin re cost fund reconciliations.	0.50	
11/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re per se filing; emails re same; review schedule for trial preparation and confer with D. Harvey re same; schedule assignments for trial preparation.	1.00	
11/24/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft notice re leave to file supplemental brief.	0.70	
11/24/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Locate and organize retention agreements for D. Harvey.	1.50	
11/24/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with Heffler Claims Group regarding a client's address change and settlement issues.	0.50	
11/25/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members for case update.	2.00	
11/28/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with D. Harvey re Ninth Circuit briefing.	0.10	
12/01/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries re settlement; contact Heffler Claims Group regarding checks.	1.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re claim status.	0.20	
12/02/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members inquiries.	1.50	
12/02/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with Heffler Claims Group regarding check issues.	0.50	
12/06/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Layn Phillips re settlement.	0.10	
12/08/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement distribution questions, prepare for same, conference with S. Tajima re same; conference with opposing counsel re discovery stipulation, conference with B. Glackin re same, draft and revise same.	2.30	
12/09/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re trial preparation, assignments; emails re same; email with D. Harvey re data question.	0.50	
12/09/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re claims issues, conference with Heffler re same, conference with K. Dermody re same; conference with Google counsel re data production issues in connection with settlement; conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re depo summaries for trial; conference with J. Zaul re depo summary task.	3.20	
12/09/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	3.50	
12/10/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Layn Phillips re proposal; telephone conference with Dan Girard re proposal and next steps; telephone conference with Joe Saveri to fill in re conference with Dan Girard and next steps; review cost fund accounting; confer with D. Harvey re revised settlement agreement and named plaintiff discussions.	1.50	
12/10/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class representatives re agreement; conference with A. Shaver re attachments to settlement agreement; conference with class members re settlement administration questions; conference with counsel for Google re data production issues; conference with counsel for Apple re stipulation concerning business records.	4.60	
12/10/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Review emails re settlement; conference with D. Harvey re settlement agreement and update exhibits to same; review cost files and call with J. Fanucchi re same.	4.00	
12/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize documents for Dean Harvey.	1.00	
12/10/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and provide updates.	3.00	
12/11/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email with Dan Girard re mediator's and email B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same and projects; email Layn Phillips re plaintiffs' position.	0.20	
12/12/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re settlement timing/papers; revise settlement agreement, notice; confer with A. Shaver re cost fund and notice; confer with D. Harvey re preliminary approval; email Joe Saveri re draft revised settlement agreement; email Joe Saveri re cost reimbursement; telephone conference with Joe Saveri re settlement agreement and edit same; email Robert Van Nest re agreement; confer with A. Shaver re Gilardi retention; confer with D. Harvey re records stipulation.	6.50	
12/12/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Defense counsel re finalizing stipulation re document admissibility, review and revise same; conference with class members re settlement questions.	2.30	
12/12/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Update proposed notice; review costs with K. Dermody.	0.50	
12/13/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with A. Shaver, D. Harvey re settlement assignments.	0.10	
12/13/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval, research same.	1.60	
12/13/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise and update motion for preliminary approval; revise and update notice.	2.00	
12/14/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise preliminary approval brief and notice; emails with A. Shaver and D. Harvey re same; email Joe Saveri re drafts; confer with D. Harvey re declaration drafting; review Northern District of California 2014 antitrust results.	4.50	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/15/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re clerk's notice and settlement follow-up.	0.20	
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Shaver re cost fund.	0.20	
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey and A. Shaver re cost submission.	0.20	
12/15/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Calculate costs; conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re same.	0.70	
12/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Research documents on P:/ drive.	1.00	
12/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries regarding settlement checks and remaining settlement status.	2.00	
12/16/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review IPOD trial information for High-Tech Cold Calling settlement papers; emails with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re same.	0.50	
12/16/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Track class member , who worked for Intel and update current address.	1.00	
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re claim status, respond.	0.30	
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with class member re case status.	0.10	
12/17/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email defendants re settlement agreement; email Joe Saveri re draft brief; revise brief to include IPod trial facts; edit draft class representative declaration; confer with B. Glackin re IPod trial issues and relationship to High-Tech Cold Calling.	1.50	
12/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, supervise efforts to respond to class members re same.	2.20	
12/17/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to all class members and update D. Harvey on correspondence regarding class members.	2.50	
12/18/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Judge Koh's order in Blue Diamond case re expert issues to vet any issues in High-Tech Cold Calling; emails with B. Glackin re same; confer with E. Cabraser re settlement approval.	1.00	
12/18/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re claims and settlement distribution questions.	1.10	
12/18/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding status of first settlement and potential for future settlement checks.	4.00	
12/19/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' redlined agreement and confer with Joe Saveri re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Robert Van Nest re same; edit revised agreement and email Joe Saveri re same; email Dan Girard re schedule; email with B. Glackin re Google hearing/settlement timing.	3.50	
12/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re claims issues; review draft settlement agreement.	0.70	
12/19/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	2.00	
12/19/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Update correspondence to P:/ drive 2014 correspondence folders.	2.00	
12/20/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised agreement and email Joe Saveri re same; send revised agreement to defense counsel with settlement communication; email D. Harvey and B. Glackin re assignments and updated cost information.	1.00	
12/21/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Joe Saveri re edits to brief.	0.10	
12/22/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Review revised agreement and emails with Joe Saveri, defendants re same.	0.60	
12/22/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise documents in support of preliminary approval.	1.20	
12/22/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	2.00	
12/23/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit/revise settlement agreement and confer with Joe Saveri re same; edit brief and email same to defendants; edit K. Dermody declaration and email with D. Harvey re same; confer with D. Harvey re draft order; emails with defendants re agreement edits; emails with Dan Girard re agreement.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
12/23/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft proposed order granting motion for preliminary approval.	0.80	
12/23/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Check class member status and respond to inquiries.	2.00	
12/24/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Dan Girard, Joe Saveri re settlement documents; prepare revised notice for Dan Girard; emails with Robert Van Nest re settlement documents and timing.	0.80	
12/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review cost numbers.	0.40	
12/29/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple rounds of editing/revising settlement agreement; confer with Joe Saveri re same; telephone conference with Joe Saveri and Dan Girard re agreement; emails with Robert Van Nest, Justina Sessions re notice, agreement, draft brief; confer with D. Harvey re final cost reconciliation; edit order, K. Dermody declaration; email with D. Harvey re Ninth Circuit hearing calendar.	7.00	
12/29/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise notice; review preliminary approval hearing transcript.	0.60	
12/30/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Call with Dan Girard, Joe Saveri re agreement and revise same; multiple emails with Robert Van Nest, Justina Sessions re agreement, notice, brief and revisions; work on settlement documents.	5.00	
12/30/14	SHAVER, ANNE	Revise proposed order and K. Dermody declaration.	0.50	
12/31/14	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple rounds of edits on agreement and emails with Joe Saveri, Dan Girard, Robert Van Nest re same; confer with Robert Van Nest re Dan Girard; emails with Justina Sessions re revised notice; conference with LCHB team re next steps.	2.00	
01/02/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri and defendants re plaintiffs' brief; review defendants' proposed edits and revise same and email to Joe Saveri; emails with Justina Sessions re notice; email Dan Girard re timing.	2.00	
01/04/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Joe Saveri edits to brief; revise and send draft brief to Dan Girard; emails with Joe Saveri re settlement approval schedule; confer with D. Harvey re Heffler and Gilardi data issues.	1.00	
01/05/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Telephone conference with Justina Sessions re status of finalizing documents and emails to Joe Saveri, Dan Girard re same; confer with D. Harvey re notice administration and data production.	1.00	
01/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review revisions to draft motion for preliminary approval; conference with Heffler re data production to Gilardi; conference with Gilardi re process for receiving data production and preparing to mail notices; follow-up with Google's counsel re data production errors.	1.80	
01/05/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Email with D. Harvey and K. Dermody re claims administration deadlines and data.	0.30	
01/06/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review Dan Girard comments on brief and email Dan Girard re same; telephone conference with Justina Sessions re settlement issues/schedule; confer with D. Harvey re plaintiff documents and revise same; email Joe Saveri re Dan Girard's comments; emails with Robert Van Nest re schedule for calling court; review potential filing.	1.50	
01/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, follow-up with Heffler re same; conference with class representatives re	1.20	
01/07/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize settlement agreement and exhibits/notice; emails with Dan Girard re edits and final documents; edit preliminary approval brief and K. Dermody declaration; confer with D. Harvey re filing, plaintiff declarations, and administrative motion; review administrative motion for sealing and confer with D. Harvey re same; telephone conference with Robert Van Nest re final agreement and call to court with Robert Van Nest; draft communication to court re settlement and email with Robert Van Nest re same; revise for court; email Joe Saveri re court communication; email with Justina Sessions re Ninth Circuit process; review draft joinder brief by Girard; confer with A. Shaver re upcoming assignments.	7.00	
01/07/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, review, and revise motion in support of preliminary approval and supporting papers, conference with K. Dermody re same; research and draft papers in support of preliminary approval; conference with class representatives re settlement status and preliminary approval procedure.	5.10	
01/07/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Review Girard change to notice and joinder motion.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/08/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with defendants re Ninth Circuit proceeding; emails with Justina Sessions, Dan Girard re executed settlement agreement; review Chambers message and draft response to same; emails with Robert Van Nest re draft message to court; email court re hearing date; confer with D. Harvey re Intel intake on settlement/Heffler.	1.50	
01/08/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Heffler re settlement administration; correspond with Google counsel re data questions; revise motion for preliminary approval and supporting papers; review executed settlement agreement.	3.10	
01/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re settlement status.	0.10	
01/09/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review defendants' draft settlement papers and revise same; call/email with Justina Sessions re same; confer with D. Harvey re same; email with Intel employee re claims and confer with D. Harvey re same; meet with B. Glackin re status.	1.50	
01/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise preliminary approval motion and supporting papers; conference with class members re settlement administration questions and research same; conference with K. Dermody re possible Google issue; correspond with Heffler re data production and claims administration issues.	3.40	
01/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member list.	0.20	
01/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re settlement status.	0.50	
01/12/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Joe Saveri re defendants' approval brief; telephone conference with Dan Girard re telephone conference with Justina Sessions re and hearing date; email with Joe Saveri re hearing date; email with Joe Saveri and Justina Sessions re plaintiffs' brief, K. Dermody declaration and proposed order; emails with Kendall re status; revise brief and K. Dermody declaration; email Kevin Hallock re settlement; review message re hearing date.	4.00	
01/12/15	RUDNICK, JENNIFER	Cite check declaration in support of preliminary approval brief. Check cites to declaration in preliminary approval brief.	0.80	
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re case status.	0.20	
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re settlement motion.	3.00	
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re settlement motion.	0.10	
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with class member re case status.	0.10	
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Upload settlement agreement and save to file.	0.10	
01/13/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with defense counsel re Ninth Circuit notice; respond to multiple calls/emails from clients/media re filing; emails with Justina Sessions re draft order and edit same; email with Dan Girard re draft order and review Dan Girard's proposed edits; revise order for filing and email Justina Sessions re same.	3.00	
01/13/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Update proposed order for preliminary approval.	1.00	
01/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member re inquiries; update class memeber addresses and database re same.	4.00	
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re settlement hearing.	0.10	
01/14/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to multiple calls/emails from class members, media re settlement; email with Kevin Hallock re settlement and trial schedule; review final K. Dermody declaration; email with D. Harvey re plaintiff declarations; review revised brief and confer with D. Harvey re same: confer with D. Harvey re revised order; email Justina Sessions re brief; email with defendants, Dan Girard re email Justina Sessions re revised order.	3.00	
01/14/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members; research, review, and revise motion for preliminary approval and supporting papers, prepare for filling.	3.60	
01/14/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/14/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Upload all documents for preliminary approval filing on Thursday, January 15, 2015; organize documents.	2.00	
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re case status.	0.30	
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare preliminary settlement motion for filing.	0.50	
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with class member re case status.	0.20	
01/15/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Finalize settlement filing; calls and emails with co-counsel, clients, media re same.	3.00	
01/15/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; revise and finalize settlement papers and supporting documents, e-file same, supervise hard copy courtesy copies re same.	6.20	
01/15/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Review proposed order with D. Harvey.	0.20	
01/15/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Assemble documents for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	2.00	
01/15/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	4.00	
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re settlement status.	0.30	
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re settlement motion.	3.40	
01/16/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with D. Harvey, B. Glackin re trial projects; email with Justina Sessions re same; edit/revise draft stipulation re pretrial dates: review Dan Girard joinder brief and email with team re same; respond to calls/email from class, media re settlement; emails with re settlement and jury work; edit website re case status.	3.00	
01/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re preliminary approval filings.	0.30	
01/16/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise and review courtesy copies and under seal filings; review Girard joinder; research and draft stipulation and proposed order vacating trial and pretrial dates; research pretrial schedule, tasks, and preparation.	3.20	
01/16/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members regarding settlement status.	3.00	
01/16/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Finalize documents for motion for preliminary class action settlement.	2.00	
01/17/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review press re settlement and emails to team re same.	1.00	
01/20/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions.	1.40	
01/20/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and follow up with claims administrator.	3.00	
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re case status.	0.30	
01/21/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Defense counsel re stipulated proposed order vacating trial date; conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with B. Glackin re pretrial planning.	1.60	
01/21/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	6.00	
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re case status.	0.30	
01/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer invoice information; email correspondence to Joseph Saveri re same.	0.20	
01/22/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Defense counsel re stipulation and proposed order, conference with Dan Girard re same, finalize and e-file same; conference with class members re settlement questions.	1.80	
01/22/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and verify addresses.	1.50	
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re stipulation.	0.30	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
01/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	2.00	
01/26/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries regarding settlement and claims.	1.00	
01/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail from class members re case status.	0.10	
01/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re inquiry by non-class member re case.	0.60	
01/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members, Heffler, and opposing counsel re settlement administration and claims issues, research same, draft correspondence re same, conference with B. Glackin re same, conference with S. Tajima and B. Troxel re same.	2.10	
01/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and coordinate with D. Harvey on making sure correspondence is up-to-date.	2.00	
01/28/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement administration questions, research same; correspond with re preparing for preliminary approval.	2.20	
01/28/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Locate documents for D. Harvey.	0.50	
01/28/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries regarding the settlement.	3.00	
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class members re case status.	0.20	
01/29/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re: motion to dismiss 9th Circuit petition.	0.20	
01/29/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Gilardi re preparing for settlement administration, research same; conference with Defense counsel re dismissal of writ petition, review drafts and revisions re same.	1.60	
01/29/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	2.00	
01/29/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update high tech employee lawsuit correspondence on database.	1.00	
01/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re class member inquiry.	0.20	
01/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class member re settlement questions, research same, correspond with re same; review draft notice of dismissal and correspond with Defense counsel re same.	0.80	
02/02/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	4.50	
02/03/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with opposing counsel and Heffler re settlement administration questions, research same.	1.20	
02/03/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Coordinate with Heffler Claims Group re class member inquiry.	0.50	
02/03/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries.	4.00	
02/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Heffler and Google counsel re Google's supplemental dataset; conference with Apple counsel re compliance with order on motion to unseal.	2.20	
02/04/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries regarding class member status.	0.50	
02/04/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Verify processing of tax forms for questions with Heffler.	1.00	
02/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research issue re service award payments, correspond with J. Fannuchi, Heffler, and class representatives	0.40	
02/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members and class representatives re complying with order on motion to unseal, correspond with defense counsel re same.	0.60	
02/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members and claims administrator re settlement questions.	0.60	
02/09/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with class members on the telephone regarding the status of the settlement.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/09/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update High Tech correspondence with class members to database.	2.00	
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with class member re case status.	0.20	
02/10/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to class member inquiries; emails to D. Harvey re: same.	0.20	
02/10/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members and claims admin re settlement questions, supervise and review follow-up re same.	1.60	
02/10/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with class members about settlement; follow up with Heffler.	4.00	
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re case status.	0.10	
02/11/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to class member inquiries; emails to D. Harvey re: same.	0.20	
02/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond and conference with class members re settlement questions, supervise and review same.	1.30	
02/11/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Go through emails regarding high tech employee lawsuit and let D. Harvey know about issues.	3.50	
02/11/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with class members about the settlement.	1.00	
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re settlement status.	0.10	
02/12/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to class member inquiries; emails to D. Harvey re: same.	0.20	
02/12/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Heffler re Google foreign worker exclusion issues, research same.	1.30	
02/12/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members to explain settlement status.	1.00	
02/12/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email class members re settlement.	1.00	
02/13/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to class member inquiries; emails to D. Harvey re: same.	0.20	
02/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference and correspond with class members re settlement questions, supervise same; conference with Heffler re class member follow-up questions and replacement check requests; conference with class members re foreign worker exclusion issues; correspond with Goggle counsel re foreign worker exclusion issues.	2.80	
02/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Check class member status of individuals for D. Harvey so he can reply to inquiries.	1.00	
02/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email class members regarding settlement.	1.50	
02/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Speak with class members re settlement.	2.00	
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from class member re case status.	0.10	
02/16/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with defense counsel, Heffler, and class members re foreign worker exclusion issue, research same; conference with class members re settlement questions.	1.20	
02/16/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	2.00	
02/17/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class member re settlement questions, correspond with class member re same.	0.70	
02/17/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	2.00	
02/18/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with class members re settlement questions, supervise same.	0.60	
02/18/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	3.00	
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement order for review.	0.10	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference and correspond with class members re settlement questions, supervise same.	1.30	
02/19/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members by phone and email, research questions.	1.00	
02/20/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, supervise same; conference with Google counsel re foreign class member issues, correspond with re same.	1.20	
02/20/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class member re settlement; update their address on the class member list.	0.30	
02/20/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email class members regarding their class member status and contact information; research issues.	2.50	
02/23/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re: Google data question; meet and confer with Rubin re: same; email Heffler re: class member questions; email with court re: same; confer with D. Harvey re: Heffler oversight; respond to class member inquiries.	3.00	
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re preliminary approval hearing; office conference with K. Dermody re same.	0.80	
02/23/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Google counsel re foreign worker exclusion issues, conference with team re preparation for preliminary approval hearing, review and revise materials re same.	2.60	
02/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email class members re settlement questions.	2.00	
02/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize preliminary approval documents for D. Harvey, prepare indices.	1.50	
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence re claim status.	0.20	
02/24/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with class members re settlement questions, supervise and review same; conference with Heffler re administration issues, correspond with Heffler re same, research same; conference with questions; review preliminary approval hearing prep materials, revise same.	3.40	
02/24/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	1.00	
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for D. Harvey review.	0.40	
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from class member re case status.	0.10	
02/25/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re: Google data question; email with class member re: Heffler follow-up.	0.20	
02/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Follow-up with Joseph Saveri re contributing to Leamer bills.	0.20	
02/25/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and supervise correspondence with class members re settlement questions; conference with Google counsel re foreign worker exclusion issues, draft summary re same.	1.20	
02/25/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding the settlement.	3.00	
02/25/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member correspondence to database.	1.50	
02/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re settlement status.	0.10	
02/26/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with Saveri re: settlement hearing and case management; confer with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re: same; review and respond to court inquiry re order; respond to press and class member inquiries; confer with D. Harvey re: Heffler processing questions and follow up to class intakes; organize materials for hearing.	5.50	
02/26/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for preliminary approval hearing; correspond with co-counsel re unreimbursed costs and total loadstar; supervise correspondence, and correspond, with class members re settlement questions; correspond with Google counsel re foreign worker exclusion issue.	2.10	
02/26/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	3.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
02/26/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update email correspondence to database.	2.00	
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hearing transcripts for attorney review.	0.20	
02/27/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for settlement hearing; meetings with D. Harvey re: same; phone calls with Van Nest and Saveri re: hearing; draft hearing outline and notes; respond to press inquiries.	6.50	
02/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond and conference with class members re settlement questions, supervise and review same; prepare for preliminary approval hearing, research same, conference with K. Dermody re same; correspond with claims administrator re foreign worker exclusion questions.	2.40	
02/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Research class member status and let Dean Harvey know.	0.20	
02/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding the settlement.	2.00	
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re settlement status.	0.20	
02/28/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to media inquiries re: hearing.	0.20	
03/01/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails to J. Saveri re: case management and settlement.	0.20	
03/02/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Prepare for and attend settlement hearing; travel to and from same; confer with media re: hearing; respond to class member inquiries re: media accounts and settlement; confer with B. Glackin, A. Shaver re: next steps and settlement approval; review and edit revised notice; confer with D. Harvey re: same.	7.00	
03/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Preliminary approval hearing.	3.80	
03/02/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for preliminary approval hearing, conference with co-counsel re same, travel re same, conference and correspond with Plaintiffs re same.	6.50	
03/02/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise notice and conference with Defense counsel re same.	0.40	
03/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Edit class notice based on court's feedback.	0.40	
03/02/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Prepare for and attend hearing in San Jose on preliminary approval.	7.50	
03/02/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members re settlement.	2.50	
03/03/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review settlement order and respond to press inquiries; class member inquiries re: same; alert escrow agent re: order; email Gilardi re: order; confer with D. Harvey re: clients.	3.00	
03/03/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with plaintiffs re preliminary settlement approval and schedule for approval process; conference with class members re settlement questions, research same; correspond with Heffler re foreign worker issues; correspond with Google re escrow agreement; conference with Intel counsel re Intel class member issues and questions, correspond with class member re same.	2.10	
03/03/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members, contact Heffler.	1.00	
03/04/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to press inquiries and class members re: settlement order.	2.50	
03/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions; conference with Defense counsel re escrow agreement and data transfer questions; correspond with Google counsel re foreign worker issue.	2.30	
03/04/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members re settlement.	0.50	
03/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel, Heffler, and Gilardi re preparing for notice pursuant to settlement; research class member data security issues, conference with Heffler re same; conference with class members re settlement questions, research same, conference with Heffler re same.	2.20	
03/05/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries regarding settlement .	4.00	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/06/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re: potential objector; emails with D. Harvey re: same.	0.50	
03/06/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Work on settlement issues.	3.50	
03/06/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	0.50	
03/09/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Multiple emails with team re: Heffler data transfer and class member intakes.	0.50	
03/09/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Check class member status and addresses. Respond to class members. Update Dean Harvey.	1.50	
03/11/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Edit escrow; email Mitchell re: escrow; email Saveri re: Heffler demand for money to transfer data; confer with D. Harvey re: Gilardi website questions and emails re: same.	1.00	
03/11/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries from class members.	4.00	
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call re case status.	0.10	
03/12/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Mitchell, Brown re: escrow.	0.30	
03/13/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey, Mitchell re: escrow; review escrow; email with class members re: status of case.	0.50	
03/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defense counsel and Citibank re escrow agreement, review same; supervise conferences with class members re settlement questions.	0.80	
03/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to all inquiries.	2.00	
03/16/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with team re: edits to webpage and review of same.	0.30	
03/17/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding the settlement.	1.00	
03/18/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review data and respond to administrator, questions from defense counsel.	0.30	
03/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend conference call regarding class member data transfer, prepare for same; supervise and revise responses to class member inquiries re settlement status.	0.60	
03/19/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members.	2.50	
03/20/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with D. Harvey re: claims administration data security and file transfer.	0.20	
03/20/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members regarding status of settlement and address update.	1.00	
03/23/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise correspondence with class members re settlement questions; correspond with Heffler and Gilardi re class member data transfer.	0.60	
03/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding the settlement.	2.00	
03/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member correspondence to database.	2.00	
03/24/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails and phone calls with D. Harvey re: data issues; review emails from Gilardi re: same.	0.30	
03/24/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Supervise conferences and correspondence with class members re settlement questions; conference with Gilardi re class member data transfer issues; review and revise phone script for class member inquiries to Gilardi.	1.20	
03/24/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members. Email Joseph Mahan at Heffler Claims group regarding W-2 tax forms.	3.00	
03/25/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re: class member inquiries; review and respond to same.	0.50	
03/25/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Gilardi re notice procedures and class member data issues; review and revise telephone script re class member inquiries to Gilardi; conference with class members re settlement questions.	0.80	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
03/25/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email and call class members.	2.00	
03/26/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review draft notice to class members; conference with class members re settlement questions; supervise and revise creation of export list of updated addresses; conference with Gilardi re notice, phone message script, and data issues.	1.60	
03/26/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Create new class member address updates list.	1.00	
03/26/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members.	2.50	
03/26/15	THOMPSON, CHIOMA	Review address entries for D. Harvey.	1.00	
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citation for B. Glackin review.	0.20	
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member contact list.	0.20	
03/27/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re: class objection; emails with D. Harvey re: notice of final layout (review same).	0.60	
03/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review notice revisions; correspond with Gilardi re address updates; conference with class member re settlement questions; conference with S. Tajima re class member questions, supervise communications re same.	1.10	
03/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Email and phone class members and follow-up with Dean Harvey.	2.00	
03/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member email correspondence to database.	1.00	
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member notification index.	0.20	
03/30/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review objection letter and email of media re: same; confer with D. Harvey re: objector's reconsideration and letter to court re same.	0.80	
03/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class member re settlement question; conference with Gilardi and Defense counsel re phone script and final notice.	0.70	
03/30/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members. Email Joseph Mahan at Heffler Claims Group regarding 1099 form.	1.00	
03/30/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call vendor about invoice not received. Send follow-up e-mail with book keeper.	0.50	
03/30/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member correspondence.	1.00	
03/31/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Edit database.	0.50	
04/01/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Confer with D. Harvey re: filings/assignments; review class member intakes.	0.50	
04/01/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Class member communications. Email Joseph Mahan at Heffler Claims Group.	0.50	
04/01/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update high tech correspondence folder 2015 on database.	1.50	
04/02/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Emails with Hallock re status; phone call with media re approval schedule; review Brown email on Apple communication and suggest edits to same.	1.50	
04/02/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member address list; correspondence on database.	0.20	
04/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to class member re claim status.	0.20	
04/03/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members regarding settlement.	1.00	
04/06/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to class member inquiry.	0.10	
04/06/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call/email class members.	0.50	
04/07/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to class calls; emails with D. Harvey re Gilardi; settlement work.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/07/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with Gilardi re settlement administration protocol moving forward now that they are up and running, supervise implementation re same.	0.40	
04/07/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Contact Kenneth Jue at Gilardi with updated high tech employee antitrust address list. Calls with class members.	1.00	
04/07/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize folder in database. Locate records for Brendan P. Glackin declaration.	0.50	
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re records for D. Harvey.	0.40	
04/08/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to inquiries from class, Gilardi.	0.50	
04/08/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member and send Kenneth Jue at Gilardi the address updates list.	1.00	
04/09/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Respond to inquiries from class.	0.50	
04/09/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members. Confirm with Kenneth Jue at Gilardi that all addresses have been updated.	2.00	
04/09/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Search correspondence for contacts with class member. Search updated class member list for contact information and send to Kelly Dermody.	0.50	
04/10/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re settlement approval projects; respond to class member inquires.	1.00	
04/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Dermody and D. Harvey re final approval papers.	0.50	
04/10/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement motion, conference with K. Dermody and B. Glackin re same.	0.70	
04/10/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Follow up on K. Dermody's e-mail. Check class member status.	0.30	
04/10/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Follow up with Joseph Mahan on class member's tax documents. Speak with class members. Forward requests for 1099 to Heffler Claims Group. Save correspondence to database and organize.	3.00	
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call re class member inquiry.	0.10	
04/11/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review/respond to class member intake.	0.20	
04/13/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Conference with Sera Tajima re class member intakes and respond to same; conference with D. Harvey re Gilardi.	0.50	
04/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with class members re settlement questions, review correspondence re same, follow-up with Gilardi and S. Tajima re same.	0.70	
04/13/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class members.	1.50	
04/14/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to inquiries.	0.50	
04/14/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update and organize database.	1.00	
04/15/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Call class members back. Contact Heffler Claims Group regarding tax forms.	1.20	
04/15/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize case filings to appropriate location on database.	2.00	
04/16/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update correspondence on database.	1.70	
04/16/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Verify that tax forms have been received by class members.	2.00	
04/17/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Email re class member inquiry.	0.10	
04/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for attorney review.	0.20	
04/20/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Look up class member status and respond. Update address on file and forward to Kenneth Jue at Gilardi.	0.60	

Report created on 05/07/2015 03:11:49 PM From inception Timekeeper: all To 05/04/15

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code
04/21/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class memebers and notify Gilardi.	2.00	
04/22/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Follow up with class member re settlement.	0.50	
04/22/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Update class member correspondence on database.	0.60	
04/23/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research settlement motion, conference with team re same.	0.70	
04/23/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Organize documents for D. Harvey project.	1.50	
04/24/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Work with team. Extract requested information from files.	0.50	
04/24/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Review objections and exclusions, emails with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re same; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey re settlement approval projects.	1.00	
04/24/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research plaintiff service awards, conference with team re same.	1.20	
04/24/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Extract emails address and match with names in the list.	3.50	
04/24/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Add in missing class member emails to list of contacts.	0.50	
04/24/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Assemble Motion binder and create index.	1.00	
04/24/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Create list of all class members who have contacted the firm for audit.	3.00	
04/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft motion for service awards, and supporting documents re same.	2.10	
04/27/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and update contact list.	1.50	
04/28/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research motion for fees, costs, and service awards. (partial write-off for fees work)	0.70	
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for B. Glackin review.	0.20	
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re settlement for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
04/29/15	SCHOTT, JOSHUA	Organized invoices and costs documents for filing case costs filing.	4.70	
04/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and draft request for costs and for plaintiff service awards; conference with L. Nussbaum re co-counsel incurred costs.	1.60	
04/30/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Respond to class member inquiries and send address updates to Gilardi & Co.	1.50	
05/01/15	SCHOTT, JOSHUA	Organized costs documents and invoices for filing the costs brief to the court.	1.70	
05/01/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Explain settlement to class member and update address list.	1.00	
05/04/15	DERMODY, KELLY	Email Gilardi re settlement statistics, review same and email LCHB re same.	0.30	
05/04/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Save correspondence to P:/ drive.	0.50	
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for D. Harvey review.	0.20	
		Total Hours	23,499.40	